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MARY JANE JONES 

Top Honor Students Named 
At Valley High School 

Cindy Fulbright, Karen Clinton, 
Karen Ramsey, Candy Jones and 
Coach Robert Phelps. 

Valley Track Team Takes 
First Place Win at State 
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Miss Melody Wynn Cruse is 
valedictorian, with a four-year 
average of 95.31. and Miss Mary 
Jane Jones is salutatorian with a 
scholastic average of 91.32 of the 
Class of 1983 of Valley High 
School. 

Miss Cruse is the 18-yearold 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Tommy 
Cruse of Turkey. 

She participated in Future 
Homemakers of America for four 
years. in basketball two years, in 
tennis one year, in choir two 
years. in one-act play one year. 
She was in Pep Squad three 
years, on the annual staff three 
years. and has won numerous 
scholastic awards, including the 
music award her freshman and 
sophomore years; the typing and 
music awards her junior year, 
and the English. typing, history. 
and home economics awards her 
senior year. She was the 1982-83 

Quitaque Senior 
Citizens Receive 
Official Charter 

The Senior Citizen Organiza-
tion of Quitaque has received its 
charter. The organization can 
now accept memberships and 
donations in any amount. 

Mrs. R. E. (Margie) Boyles is 
chairman of the Fund Raising 
Committee. Anyone wishing to 
make a donation may contact her 
or Lolla Belle Harmon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Ross 
recently gave $3000.00 to the 
organization toward the pur-
chase of a Senior Citizens Build-
ing. 

The organization recently had 
a Game Night and all proceeds 
will go into this fund. 

The organization has taken the 
care of Rest Haven Cemetery 
this summer for a project. 
Anyone wishing to help with this 
project may call Bud Bailey. 
president. James May or Dick 
Taylor. 

homecoming queen, and was 
selected Most Beautiful and Most 
Likely to Succeed. She was 
co-editor of the annual. 

Her favorite food is Mexican 
food. Her favorite movie is "The 
Champ." Her favorite song is 
"When It's Over," and her pet 
peeve is narrow-minded and 
self-righteous people. Her hob 
bies are listening to music, 
sewing and being with friends. 

Melody's future plans are to 
attend West Texas State Univer-
sity in Canyon, beginning with 
the fall term, where she plans to 
major in computer science. 

Miss Jones is the 18-year-old 
daughter of M. C. and Ann Jones. 
She participated in four years of 
basketball, track and FHA. She 
was a cheerleader one year and a 
member of the Pep Squad for 
three years. She participated in 
drama two years. 

She received honors in book-
keeping her senior year, and in 
mathematics her junior and 
senior years. Her senior year, 
she was elected Most Athletic 
and Best All Around Girl. She is 
interested in all sports and guys 
with blonde hair and perfect 
teeth. 

Her favorite movie is "Toot-
sie." Her favorite song is "No. 
406," her favorite foods are 
blackeyed peas and cornbread. 
Her hobbies include jigsaw puz-
zles. crossword puzzles, and 
watching television. 

Her future plans have not been 
determined, but she plans to 
attend college. 

TURKEY SENIOR CITIZENS 

PLAN CHICKEN SUPPER 

Turkey Senior Citizens met 
Tuesday night. May 3. for their 
regular salad supper. It was 
decided to have a fried chicken 
supper at the next meeting, 
which will be the night of May 17. 

Several said they would bring 
chicken, and the others are to 

TWENTY-NINE SENIORS TO 

GRADUATE FROM 

VALLEY HIGH SCHOOL 

There are twenty-nine seniors 
in the Valley High School gradua-
tion class this year. 

The commencement exercises 
will be held Sunday evening. 
May 22. at eight o'clock in the 
High School Auditorium. 

The businesspeople of Turkey 
and Quitaque are sponsoring the 
senior pages this year. 

Booster Club 
To Meet Monday 

The last Booster Club meeting 
of the school year at Valley will 
be held Monday, May 16. at 8:00 
p.m. This is a very important 
meeting and everyone is urged to 
be present. Plans are being made 
to elect officers for the ensuing 
year. 

Make plans to be present 
Monday night! 

Bob Wills 
Foundation To 
Meet May 16 

Jim Majors has announced 
that there will be a meeting of 
the Bob Wills Foundation Mon-
day, May 16, at 8:00 p.m. in the 
Bob Wills Cafeteria. It is a very 
important meeting, and Majors 
would like for all committee 
chairmen to be present. 
	—o 	 

Softball Tourney 
Being Re-Scheduled 

The Mixed Softball Tourna-
ment scheduled for this weekend 
has been postponed until a future 
date. 

Lions To Sell 
Mops and Brooms 

Turkey Lions have announced 
the Mop and Broom Sale for 
Saturday. May 21, at Mullin 
Motor Co. All Lions are asked to 
help with the sale. 

They also would like for you to 
buy mops, brooms and other 
household items they always 
have. Part of the proceeds stays 
here and is used for a good cause. 
and the remainder is used for the 
blind. 

PETS TO BE VACCINATED 

FOR RABIES WEDNESDAY 

Wednesday. May 18. is the 
time to have your cats and dogs 
vaccinated for rabies, it has been 
announced. Dr. David Fuston of 
Childress will he in Turkey from 
9:30 a.m. until 12:00 noon. 

bring other foods to go with it. 
Those present enjoyed table 

games and singing. 

THEY DID IT! The Valley 
girls track team went to State 
UIL competition last weekend 
with the intention to win, and 
win they did. This was the 
FIRST EVER for Valley in any 
athletic competition since the 
school has been in existence. 
There were eight teams in final 
competition. 

The girls 400 meter relay team 
took first place after a team had 
beaten them by .10 of a second, 
and they were proved ineligible 
for the win. The time was 50.9 
seconds. 

Coach Robert Phelps was the 
one who started girls track 
competition, according to Athle-
tic Director Ted Giddens. He 
coached junior high basketball 
and also coached the girls in 
track for approximately two 
years. then when he began in 

Turkey Swim 
Club To Meet 

The Turkey Swim Club will 
hold a general meeting Thurs-
day. May 19, at 8:00 p.m. in the 
Bob Wills Cafeteria. If you are a 
member of the Turkey Swim-
ming Pool organization, it is 
urgent that you attend this 
meeting. it has been announced. 

The future of your pool de-
pends on it. according to those in 
charge. 

—o 	 
Visitors in the home of Mr. and 

Mrs. Paul A. Ramsey Sunday 
were Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy D. 
Stone, San Angelo: Mrs. Ricky 
Mullin. Turkey, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Jimmy Stone of Silverton. The 
group took lunch out to Hawkins 
Lake and report a real good time. 

earnest with girls track, he has 
taken someone to State UIL 
Competition every year for the 
past six years. 

Coach Phelps deserves to win, 
quotes Coach Giddens. He has 
worked hard over the years, and 
this year was no exception. This 
editor watched the girls a short 
time on two occasions this past 
year and wants to commend 
Coach Phelps on his strategy. He 
never raised his voice in anger. 
BUT he encouraged them to 
"Come On In." and the girls just 
ran their hearts out for Coach 
Phelps. That is what athletic 
competition is all about. It is 
teaching them to win by hard 
work and true sportsmanship. It 
is the beginning of character 
which will be expressed in later 
life. Coach Phelps has done this 
over the years. 

Congratulations, 	Coach 
Phelps. and the Valley Lady 
Patriot 400 meter relay team 
from the Valley Tribune and area 
fans! 

Notice to Parents 
Of Pre-Schoolers 

Children who will be five 
before September 1, 1983 are 
eligible to enroll in kindergarten 
at Valley School. 

Pre-enrollment will be May 20, 
1983 from 9:00 to 11:00 a.m. A 
health record and a birth certifi-
cate must accompany the child 
and the health record must be 
current. 

If you have a child who will be 
in kindergarten and have not 
been contacted, please contact 
the school. Turkey parents. call 
423-1348: Quitaque parents, call 
455-1411. 

Thank you. J. L. Maupin 
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Patricia Scharlene Haney 

THANKS EXPRESSED FOR 

ORDERLY BOB WILLS 

DAY CELEBRATION 

The following letter was re 
ceived by Mayor Leroy Stone. 
and we regret that they did not 
give their address. The postmark 
slipped and only the bottom part 
showed, so we do not know 
where it was mailed, but it is 
greatly appreciated. 

5-5 83 
Dear Sirs: 

We've attended the Turkey 
Bob Wills Celebration for the last 
six to eight years. All efforts to 
keep it as orderly as possible are 
greatly appreciated. The "no 
drinks" within the performing 
circle helps a lot. 

Just keep trying to have as 
well-behaved and manageable 
crowd as possible. Your efforts 
are greatly appreciated and 
admired. 

Sincerely, 
The Wayne Patton family 
and different guests we 
bring each year. 

Mr. and Mrs. Keith Green met 
her mother, Mrs. Robert Chain 

	
Mr. and Mrs. Mel Carter of 

blias of Plains, and her aunt and 
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and Sunday in Quitaque visiting 

Brownfield. in Lubbock Sunday 
	

his parents. Mr. and Mrs. Ralph 
afternoon w here they all had 
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supper together and enjoyed a 
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here ten day. 
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Tommy Morris 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Haney of 
Afton announce the engagement 
of their daughter, Patricia Schar-
lene, to Tommy Herb Morris, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Wendell Morris 
of Flomot. 

The wedding is set for Satur-
day, July 16, 1983. at the United 
Methodist Church in Matador. 

All friends and relatives are 
invited to attend. 

0 	 

Senior Breakfast 
Planned Sunday 

Just a reminder to the senior 
class of 1983 of Valley High: The 
First Baptist Church of Quitaque 
is having a breakfast for you 
Sunday morning. It will be in the 
home of Rusty and Janice 
Henson at 8:30 a.m. 

Please allow this opportunity 
to congratulate you with this 
meal and a personalized gift. 

See you Sunday! 

THugsDAY,M' 

MRS. M. F. 
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The girls track team which 
was a state winner in the 400 
meter relay at the State UIL 
Meet in Austin this past week-
end, was guest of the Turkey 
Lions at their meeting Tuesday 
at noon. Also guests along with 
the girls were Coach Robert 
Phelps and Superintendent Wil-
burn Leeper. 

Boss Lion Roy Patterson called 
the meeting to order. Jim Majors 
led the Pledge to the Flag, and 
Melvin Clinton gave the invoca 
tion. Brett Parsley's name was 
drawn for the pot of gold, but he 
was not present to receive it. 

The Mop and Broom Sale was 
announced for Saturday, May 21, 
at 8:00 a.m. at Mullin Motor Co. 
All Lions were asked to help with 
the sale. 

A delicious steak dinner was 
cooked by Colleen Stone and 
Marie Hurst and served to Lion 
Sweetheart Melody Cruse and 
her guest, Elaine Adams, Mrs. 
Roy Patterson, guest of Lion 
Patterson, Jim Majors, guest of 
Lion Stone, thirteen members 
and the following members of the 
track team: Candy Jones, Karen 
Clinton, Cindy Fulbright, Karen 
Ramsey and alternate, D'Anna 
Smith. 

The club would like to thank 
the Methodist Church for letting 
them have their meeting there, 
as there was a problem with the 
gas at the Bob Wills Cafeteria. 

A Volunteer Salvation Army 
Service Unit has been establish-
ed in Turkey, Doug Rains, Field 
Representative from Lubbock, 
announced to the Tribune. 

Rev. Roy Patterson is chair-
man, Homer Hawkins is treasur 
er, and the following are also 
members of the committee: 
Wayne Loury, Rev. W. L. 
Armstrong, Rev. Melvin Clinton, 
Mayor Leroy Stone and Jerry 
Landry. Rev. Patterson is also 
the Welfare Secretary, Rains 
announced. 

This was made possible with a 
grant of $200 from State Head-
quarters in Dallas, it was report-
ed. In the future, funds needed 
will be raised locally, as has 
been done in the past. 

The Salvation Army works 
cooperatively with other agen-
cies to meet the human needs of 
the community. Services include 
emergency aid for stranded 
travelers; aid to prisoners and 
their families; disaster relief; 
camping program for underpriv-
ileged boys; alcoholic rehabilita-
tion; assistance for the needy at 
Christmas, and help for the 
elderly. 

Persons on the committee are 
all volunteers who give of their 
time and compassion to provide 
the services of the Salvation 
Army. Help is given immediately 
when it is needed, Mr. Rains 
said. 

Mrs. Mary Lyon spent Moth -

er's Day weekend in Silverton 
visiting her son, J. W. and wife . 

 They took Mrs. Lyon to the 
cemetery there to visit the grave 
of her late husband, Will Lyon. 

Turkey Has 
Salvation Army 
Volunteer Unit 

Girls Track 
Team Is 
Guest of Lions 

In the recent wedding story, 
taken from the Amarillo Daily 
News, two of the names were 
printed wrong. The flower girls 
were Michelle Elders and Court-
ney Boyles (not Courtney Gearn, 
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Arnold of Tuba, at the El Camino 
and all had lunch together. They 
visited in Dot's home that 
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"Talk not of wasted affec- 
tion; affection never was 
wasted." 	Longfellow 
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CITY DRUG 
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All Your Prescriptions Filled With 

Pure Fresh Drugs Exactly As Your 

Doctor Has Prescribed. 

Prescription Files Kept Up To Date 
For Family Insurance and Tax Purposes. 

Call 806-423-1126 or 423-1079 

Six Days a Week 	7:30 a.m.-6:00 p.m .  
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TO THE GRADUATES 

OF 1983 

Once upon a time a mighty 
King condemned one of his lowly 
subyects to die. The wretch 
proposed and the King agreed to 

call off the execution if, within a 
year. the condemned could teach 
the King's horse to fl). 

"Why postpone the nevi 
table" a friend asked the 
wretch. 

it's not inevitable," he re 
plied. "The odds are 4 to I in my 

favor: i I) the King might die. 
I might die: 131 the horse might 
die:14) I might leach the horse to 

fly." 
Jesus said. "All things are 

possible to him that belies eth. - 
 A person w ho aims at nothing 

has a target he can't miss. Set an 
attainable goal. When you reach 
it, set another goal, higher. Many 

people flounder on the ship of life 

because they never chart a 
course. Make money the by pro-
duct. not the goal. Drink at the 
fountain of knowledge, don't just 

gargle. 
It's all right for you girls to be 

fortune-hunters. if you marry a 
man who's a fortune in himself. 
Marry kindness, ambition, cour 

age •  determination. diligence, 
intelligence. honesty, good man 

ners. sympathy, integrity. enthu-
siasm—and you have married a 
fortune. And remember, it takes 

two to make a marriage a 
success •  but only one to make it a 
failure. "Kissin don't last but 

good cookin do." 
Don't ever let anybody sell you 

the idea that chastity is out of 
date. Chastity will never be out 
of date. Your children will want 

their mother to be as pure as you 
want your mother to be. If we 
lose our morality we will be 
enslaved, and vice versa. Free-
dom and morality are one ball of 
wax. The great Thomas Jeffer 
son said: "Yes, we did produce a 
near perfect Republic. But will 

they keep it'? Or will they, in the 
enjoyment of plenty, lose the 

memory of Freedom'? Material 
abundance without character is 
the surest way to destruction." 

Remember •  freedom while 
God-given, does not perpetuate 
itself. There is only one great 
Giver—and that is God. not 

Government. Government can 
give you nothing but what it 
takes from somebody else. A 
government big enough to give 
you everything you want is big 

enough to take everything 
you've got, including your free-
dom. Government is not a 
creator, but a parasite. Govern 
ment can be a good friend, or 
your worst enemy. Government 
must be studied, understood, 
participated in. and controlled by 

the people, else it may become 
not the referee it is supposed to 
be. but a tyrant. Demand that 
your government lease you 

alone. as long as you are not 
harming your fellow man. 

You should be rewarded accor 
ding to your ability and your 
effort •  not your needs. Prepare 
to pay your own debts. but not 
the debts of parasites. Go the 
extra mile to help him who would 
help himself, but give nothing to 
the leech who would live off the 
diligence of others. If you're 
determined to milk all possible 

pleasure out of life, buy your own 
cow, don't milk somebody else's 
through the fence. 

Remember, you cannot streng-
then the weak by weakening the 
strong. America represents the 

last hope of mankind. during our 

time, to be free. The enslaved of 
the world look to America. We 

may yet have the morality and 
the courage to free them from 

Community tyranny. But if we 
lose our freedom •  who will free 
us? If the lamp of freedom is 

blow n out in America. t he world 
is ell be throw n into darkness. 

Es cry person can excel in 

something. Develop your God• 
given talents to their highest 
pinnacle. Do not accept medio-

crity. In the final analysis. 
neither your government nor 
your parents are responsible for 

you-- you are responsible for 
yourself. Belies t• in your God. in 
your country, and in yourself. 

and in that order. Repeat con-
stantly to yourself: "It all de-
pends on me." 

There are two kinds of people: 
those who lift and those who 
lean. Some dedicate their lives to 
lifting their own character and 

fortunes and in making the world 
a better place because they are in 

it. The leaners. on the other 

hand, are parasites who live off 
the achievement of others. Be a 
driver, not a hitchhiker. 

Recently a woman told me that 
my daughter, age 22, had more 
"character" than almost any 
person her age she had ever 
known. This brought a tear to my 

eye. This I had rather have heard 
than that she is the most 
beautiful, the best dancer •  sing-

er. writer. painter, athlete or 
anything else. This is the su-
preme compliment. For charac-
ter is the only thing we earn on 
earth which we can take with us 

when we die. Reputation is what 
you're supposed to be; character 
is what you are. Reputation is 
what your obituary says. Charac-
ter is what your angels say. 

You can't help it if you're ugly 
at 18. But if you're not beautiful 
at 80, it's your own fault. You 

can't help it if you were able 
neither to earn nor to inherit 
much in worldly goods. But 
character is a victory, not a gift. 
If you lack it. blame not your 

parents nor society, blame your-
self. 

Confucius said: "To know what 
is right and not do it is the worst 
of cowardice." 

The morning after Charles 
Lindbergh flew the Atlantic 
non-stop from New York to 
Paris. an associate of Charles 

Kettering rushed into the re-
search expert's laboratory in 
Dayton. Ohio, shouting: "He did 
it all by himself!" Kettering 
looked up from his work momen-

tarily and remarked quietly: 
"When he flies it with a commit-
tee •  let me know." The great 
accomplishments of history have 
been wrought by individuals, not 

by the mass. Learn to sing solo. 
Anybody can sing when every-
body is singing. 

Thomas Carlyle said: "The 

great law of culture is: Let each 
become all that he was created 
capable of being." 

Society 	advances 	mainly 
through those who're unafraid to 
be different. "The strongest man 
on earth is the man who stands 
most alone." Dare to be a Daniel. 

Dare to be "square." Be a 
sovereign individual. not just a 
member of the mob. Be the 
"chicken" with the guts to say no 

to the crowd when the crowd's 
wrong. 

The completely happy person 
who has no problems is either 
without sanity or conscience. 
Trouble is the common denomin-
ator of living. Clouds bring 

life-giving rainstorms are a ne- 

SANDI LIPSCOMB 

EIGHTH GRADE HONOR 

STUDENTS NAMED HERE 

Kirk Saul is valedictorian of 
the Valley Eighth Grade Class 
with a scholastic average of 
98.10. He is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Saul of Quitaque. 

Sandi Lipscomb, daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs. James Lipscomb of 
Turkey, is the class salutatorian 
with an average of 94.57. 

Other eighth grade students 
who have averages of 90 or above 

are Joe Morrison. Gary Brannon. 
Jeff Fuston and Delma Martinez. 

WITH THE SICK 

Harmon spent a few days in 
Hall County Memorial Hospital 
in Memphis but has returned to 
his home. 

Mary Martin was taken to 
Lockney General Hospital on 

Friday where she was treated for 
pneumonia. 

• 
Mrs. Clema Johnson accom 

panied Mrs. Smith Guest to 
Lubbock Monday for a checkup 
with her doctor. 

• 
Mrs. Floye McCracken return-

ed to her home Thursday after 
spending several days in Silver-
ton visiting her daughter and 
husband. Mr. and Mrs. Alvie 

Francis. Mrs. McCracken recent-
ly had knee surgery and she 
visited in Silverton while recup-
erating. 

• 

Mrs. Vaughn Hall is home from 
Lockney General Hospital and 
reportedly is improving. 

• 
Mrs. Buddy Morris is home 

from Lockney General Hospital 

cessary part of life. Learn to face 

life as it is, and as it can be. 
One of your most precious 

possessions is time. It's criminal 

to waste it. You'll never live this 
moment again. Cato confessed 
that the fault which he felt the 
greatest need to repent was 
spending an hour unprofitably. 

Life is an opportunity, a skill to 
be developed, a victory to be 
won. Every passing second is a 
grain of gold—won or lost. The 
poet said: "Of all sad words of 
tongue or pen. the saddest are 
these: 'It might have been'!" It 
might have been if we had so 
willed it. 

—Tom Anderson 
Farm and Ranch 

KIRK SAUL 

May Is 
Mental Health 
Month in Texas 

May is Mental Health Month in 
Texas. During this month the 

Mental Health Association of 
Texas conducts its annual Bell-

ringer Campaign to raise funds 
for public health education and 
community services. 

The MHA is a voluntary 
citizens organization which oper-

ates entirely on private contribu-
tions such as those raised in the 
Bellringer campaign. 

The Mental Health Association 
depends almost entirely on vol-
unteer manpower to carry out its 
work. A small staff of six persons 
is employed by the MHA in 
Texas to provide professional 
assistance to the volunteer ef-
forts of the association. This cost 
effective policy allows the MHA 

to make the maximum use of 
each dollar donated. 

and improving. 
• 

Mrs. Coye Payne spent several 

days in Lockney General Hospi-
tal. She is home and reported to 
be improving. 

• 

Mrs. T. J. Reeves of Plainview 

was taken back to Central Plains 
Hospital in Plainview Monday of 
last week where she remains for 
care. Her son. Alex, and his wife 

have returned home from Tuc-
son, Arizona, where they spent 
the winter. Alex is not well. His 
son. Charles, recently had by-

pass arterial surgery. He is home 
and reported doing well. 

PAGE FIVE 

Cancer Memorials 
Turn Losses 
Into Victories 

When cancer takes the life of 
someone close to us, a relative or 
friend, the loss is painful. How 

ever, many thoughtful persons in 

Rriscoe County are turning los 
ses into victories by making 

memorial contributions in mem 
ory of a loved one lost to 
cancer—a living Memorial. 

"A gift today may spare others 

tomorrow." explained Mrs. Peg-
gy Fleming. Memorial Commit-
tee Chairman for the Briscoe 
Unit of the American Cancer 
Society, a national health agency 

fighting cancer through pro-

grams of research, education and 
service. "The Society seeks in 
this three-folk way to fulfill one 
of mankind's greatest hopes—the 
ultimate triumph over cancer. 

Each memorial contribution 
brings the moment of final 
victory closer." 

All contributors receive ac-
knowledgement of their gifts and 

families of those honored receive 

a handsome memorial card. The 
memorial card does not state the 
amount of the gift. In Silverton 

and Quitaque, contributions are 
received by Mrs. Peggy Fleming, 
Box 98, Silverton, Texas 79257. 

Visitors in the Cecil Price 
home for lunch on Mother's Day 
were Mr. and Mrs. A. C. Price, 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Edd Price and 
Karla, Amarillo; Mrs. Hoppy 
Trent and Kim and Mrs. Eddie 

Trent, Memphis. 
Afternoon visitors were Mr. 

and Mrs. Bruce Price, Mr. and 
Mrs. Horace Hunter. Quitaque; 
Mrs. Earnest Wayne Barbee, 

Clarendon; Mrs. Barry Shaeffer, 
Skellytown; Mrs. Ewayne Bar-
bee and two children, Clarendon. 

Saturday visitors were Mr. 
and Mrs. Preston (Buddy) Price 

of Childress. 
Mrs. Howard Landry of Amar 

illo called her mother Sunday to 

wish her a happy day. but she 
had received an injury recently 

and was unable to ride at present 
so couldn't come to see her 
mother. 

_____0— 	 

Lottie Owens drove to Silver-
ton after Sunday School and 

attended church services with 
her son an 1 wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Dwain Henderson, and grand-
sons, Wayne and Zane. She and 
the Hendersons were guests for 
lunch with Mrs. 011ie McMinn, 
and her daughter and husband, 
Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Watkins of 
Canyon, and their daughters, 

Anita and Melanie Watkins, both 
of Amarillo. 

Other visitors were Mr. and 
Mrs. Travis McMinn and grand-

daughter, Crista, of Lubbock. 
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YOU DID IT! AN WE'RE " 

BURL WAYNE ROBISON 

Burl Wayne Robison is the 
17-year-old son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Burl Robison. 

He participated in FFA for 
four years. He received the 
honor of being chosen as Friend-
liest his sophomore and junior 
years, and was chosen as Class 
Favorite his senior year. He has 
been a class officer for the past 
three years. 

His favorite foods include 
steak, Mexican food and seafood. 
He enjoys being with friends, 
reading, partying, and Bob Wills 
Day. His favorite movie is "48 
Hours" and his favorite song is 
"Stranger in my House." His pet 
peeve is cigarette smoke. 

He plans to attend Angelo 
State University to major in 
computer science. 

RANDY CLAUD FUSTON 

Randy Claud Fuston is the 
17-year-old son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Thomas Fuston of Turkey. He 
participated in basketball four 
years, football three years, Stu-
dent Council three years, FFA 
four years, drama two years and 
choir one year. 

He received the math award 
two years, the history and drama 
awards his senior year. He was 
president of Student Council, 
received All District in basket-
ball and was chosen as Best All 
Around Boy his senior year. 

His hobbies include skiing and 
playing basketball. His favorite 
song is "You Are," his favorite 
food is millionaire pie, and his 
favorite movie is "Galaxina." His 
pet peeve is people who boast. 

He plans to attend West Texas 
State University to major in 
ore-dentistry 

JO ANNE CAGLE PURCELL 

Jo Anne Cagle Purcell is the 
17-year-old daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Lonnie Wayne Cagle of 
Flomot. Her husband is Randy 
Purcell, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Weldon Purcell of Quitaque. 

She has participated in Pep 
Squad four years, has been a 
member of FHA four years, and 
was in track for one year. Her 
future plans are to have a happy 
marriage and someday raise a 
family. 

Her hobbies are listening to 
music, swimming, having fun and 
spending time with her husband. 
Her favorite foods are refried 
beans and tortillas. Her favorite 
song is "Twilight Zone." Her 
favorite movie is "First Blood." 
Her pet peeve is people who are 
prejudiced against mixed races! 

MAX WILLIAM MEYER 

Max William Meyer is the son 
of Mr. and Mrs. Billy Meyer of 
Turkey. He was in FFA all four 
years. As a freshman he was on 
the Senior Farm Skill Team 
which placed second at District. 
As a senior he served as sentinel, 
was a Lone Star Farmer, and 
went to the Ag Mechanics 
Contest. 

He served as class president 
his freshman year and as vice-
president as a junior. He was 
Class Favorite his freshman and 
junior years. His favorite song is 
"San Antonio Nights." 

CONNIE PIGG 

Connie Pigg is the 17-year-old 
daughter of Benny Pigg of 
Wilcox, Arizona and is the niece 
of Mr. and Mrs. John Pigg of 
Quitaque. She has participated -in 
volleyball two years, track and 
tennis two years, FFA four 
years. FHA three years and was 
president of FHA her junior 
year. At Valley she was Class 
Favorite her senior year. 

The movie she liked best was 
"First Blood." The song she 
enjoys most is "Dixieland De-
light." She enjoys coconut cream 
pie and talking on the phone. Her 
pet peeve is pink. 

DOUGLAS WAY! 

Douglas Wayne 
18-year-old son of 
David Sethi( of T1 
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city inthe fall. 

TIM McWILLIAMS 

Tim McWilliams is the 18-y6ar-
old son of Mr. and Mrs. McWil-
liams of Quitaque. 

He participated in FFA four 
years. He was in Chapter Con-
ducting and was on the Farm 
Skill Team during his junior and 
senior years. 

His future plans include at-
tending college, although he has 
not yet decided what he would 
like to major in. 

His hobbies are water and 
snow skiing. 

His favorites are the song. 
"Little Old Fashioned Karma," 
the movie, "48 Hours," steak and 
potatoes. His pet peeve is loud 
people. 

ANGELA BETH CLAY 

Angela Beth Clay is the 
18-year-old daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Bobby Clay of Flomot. 

She participated in basketball 
four years, track three years, 
FHA four years, Pep Squad 
three years and was a cheerlead-
er one year. 

She was chosen as Miss VHS 
during her senior year. 

Her favorites include Chinese 
food, the song, "Dixieland De-
light," and the movie, "Officer 
and a Gentleman." 

Her hobbies are watching the 
soaps and suntanning. 

Her future plans are to attend 
college, although she has yet to 
decide on a major. 

VERLAN BRETT CHEATHAM 

Verlan Brett Cheatham is the 
18-year-old son of Mr. and Mrs. 
W. W. Cheatham. He received 
All District and All South Plains 
honors in football and All District 
and All Regional honors in 
basketball his senior year. He 
also was named Mr. VHS, Most 
Handsome, and FHA Beau his 
senior year. 

He enjoys water skiing and 
being with his friends. His 
favorite food is lobster. His 
favorite movie is "48 Hours" and 
his favorite song is "There's a 
Stranger in my House." His pet 
peeve is snobby people. 

His future plan is to go to 
Saudi Arabia to work, then 
coming back to Texas and going 
to college. 

Peery & Dugan Oil Co. 
Ferguson Insurance 

City of Turkey 
Three Brothers Station 

CAROLYN SCOGGINS 

Carolyn Scoggins is the 18- 
year-old daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Willie Scoggins of Quitaque. 
She participated in track one 
year. Pep Squad four years and 
FHA four years. 

Her hobbies are reading, lis-
tening to music, and being with 
friends. 

Her favorites include Mexican 
food; the song, "I Made It 
Through the Rain;" the movie, 
"Spring Break." 

Her future plans are to attend 
Clarendon College. 

Her pet peeve is bloated 
heads! 

TRAVIS CARNES 
Travis Carnes is the 18-year-

old son of Mr. and Mrs. Gerald 
Carnes of Turkey. He participa-
ted in FFA four years, ag 
mechanics in Amarillo, where he 
placed fourth, and received the 
electrical award his senior year. 

His favorite foods are fried 
chicken, fried potatoes and pizza. 
His favorite song is "Waltz 
Across Texas." His favorite 
movie was "The Cowboys," with 
John Wayne. 

His hobbies are listening to 
music and being with friends. His 
pet peeve is Bill Sarpalius. His 
future plans are to go to work. 

Peoples State Bank 
City Drug 

Lacy Dry Goods 
Turkey Automotive 

Seigler Funeral Home 

C & L Food 
Memphis Compress 

Turkey Farmers Coop Gin 
Mullin Motor Company 

Hawkins Ins. & Furniture 



the phone. 

Caprock Gin Co. 
City of Quitaque 

The Valley Tribune 
Conner Insurance Agency 

First National Bank 

Valley Translator System 
Farmers Coop Gin 
Valley Farm Store 
Brunson Supply 

Farley's Flowers Et Variety 
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IF 1 )1 )1 1.1. AS W AYNE SETLIFF 

Douglas Wayne Setliff is the 
18-yearold son of Mr. and Mrs. 
David Setliff of Turkey. He has 
participated in FFA for four 
years. one-act play for three 
years. football one year. tennis 
one year. and annual staff three 
years. His hobbies are fishing, 
hunting and skiing. His favorite 
food is steak, his favorite movie 
is "First Blood. -  and his pet 
peeve is false people. He was 
photography editor of the an-
nual. 

Doug's future plans are to 
attend West Texas State Univer. 
sity in the fall. 

CINDY JENKINS 

Cindy Jenkins, 18. is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Terry 
Otis of Jacksboro and Windell 
Ingram of Fort Worth. She is 
married to Joel Jenkins of 
Jacksboro. who is currently 
working at Caprock Canyons 
State Park. 

She was a member of FHA 
three years and HERO for one 
year. Her hobbies include horse 
riding and hiking. Her favorites 
include the movie, "E.T.," the 
song. "Dixieland Delight," and 
spaghetti. Her pet peeve is 
people who think they know it 
all. 

ELAINE ADAMS 

Mary Elaine Adams, 18-year-
old daughter of Mr. and Mrs. J. 
A. Adams of Turkey, has partici-
pated in basketball four years, 
tennis one year, FHA four years. 
annual staff three years. She has 
been a class officer four years, a 
cheerleader three years. in Pep 
.Squad one year and in choir two 
years. 

She received the typing award 
her junior year, and in her senior 
year was chosen as FFA Sweet-
heart. Her favorite food is 
seafood; movie is "Tootsie;" song 
is "When It's Over." Her hobbies 
include going to the lake, dan-
cing, and riding around with 
friends. Her pet peeve is hypo-
critical people, and the toilet 
tissue rolled the wrong way. 

She plans to attend West 
Texas State University in the fall 
In main, in nursing . 

JEFFREY TODD MILLS 

Jeffrey Todd Mills. 18-year-old 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Don Mills of 
Turkey, has participated in FFA 
four years, football two years 
and track three years. 

His future plans include going 
to Amarillo College to receive an 
Associate Degree in computer 
information systems. 

His hobbiei are horseback 
riding, motorcycle riding. swim-
ming, and fishing. 

His favorite foods are seafood, 
spaghetti and pizza. 

His favorite song is "You and 
I," and his favorite movie is 
"Firefox." His pet peeve is 
"people who think they are 
better than others." 

TF.RESE GLOVER 

Terese Glover is the 18-year 
old daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Marshall Glover of Turkey. 

She has been a member of the 
Pep Squad three years. the FHA 
for two years and the annual 
staff two years. 

Her future plans are to work a 
year and then go to a school that 
teaches court reporting. 

Her hobbies are gardening, 
drawing, being with animals, and 
riding horses. 

Her favorite foods are steak, 
gravy, fried potatoes and iced 
tea. 

Her favorite song is "Dixieland 
Delight." and her favorite movie 
is "E.T." 

Her pet peeve is people who 
say one thing and do another. 

■ 

STACY PRICE 

Stacy Price is the 18-year-old 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Hubert Price 
of Turkey. He lettered three 
years in football. His junior year 
he made All District, All South 
Plains, and during his senior year 
he made All District Linebacker 
and All South Plains Linebacker. 
He was Pep Squad Hero and 
received the Robert Johnson 
Memorial Award. 

His hobbies are water and 
snow skiing. 

His favorites include steak and 
potatoes, the song, "Close En, 
ough to Perfect." 

His pet peeve is people who 
bum. 

His future plans are to go to 
college. 

Rice's Dry Goods 
Gulf Oil Products 

Panhandle Compress 
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Kathy's Beauty Shop 

;ANIS 

is  the l' - ' - 
 nd NIrs Geri 

r. He Part'''P' 
Air /IV's' 4  
arilk„ where he 

KI received th' 
 is senioryeIr  , 

)0d5 are 
'ices and Rma 

ig   
gis  tavern! 

.o.bnys:
with  

e Honing t) 

it friends' lb. '  
ISar141h6' His  

to work. 

eSS 
)p Gin 

panY 

liture 

COL%Pi MORRISON 

Colvin Morrison is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Murry Wayne 
Morrison. He participated in 
football, basketball, track and 
number sense while in high 
school. Favorite movie is "Tron," 
favorite food is Mexican food, 
favorite song is "Der Kommisar." 
His pet peeve is "People who 
tickle other people. -  His future 
plans are to go to college and. if 
possible, graduate from college.  

1.1. PE REYNA 

Lupe Reyna is the 18-year-old 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
Reyna. He participated in too , 

 ball one year, basketball two 
years. and track one year. He 
was a member of FFA for two 
years. 

His favorite foods include 
seafood and hamburgers.  

RANDY DON LACY 

Randy Don Lacy is the 18- 
year-old son of Mr. and Mrs. J. 
W. Lacy. He participated in 
football four years and in track 
two years. He enjoys water 
skiing and being with his friends. 

His favorite food is seafood; 
the movie he likes best is "48 
Hours;" the song he enjoys most 
is "American Made." His pet 
peeve is people who try to be 
something they're not. 

His future plans are to attend 
Clarendon College in the fall of 
1983. 

TRUDY TAYLOR 

Trudy Taylor is the 18-year-old 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Taylor of Quitaque. She partici-
pated in basketball one year, 
annual staff one year. FHA four 
years, Pep Squad four years, and 
was elected class secretary her 
sophomore and junior years. Her 
favorite foods are steak, Mexican 
food, soul food and pizza. Her 
favorite songs are "The People 
Next Door" and "Raid." Her 
favorite movie is "E.T." Her 
hobbies are listening to music, 
dancing, watching the soaps, and 
hanging around with friends. Her 
pet peeve is prejudiced people. 

Her future plans are to attend 
college in the fall. 
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MIZE PHARMACY 
Come In 

and Let Us Demonstrate Our 

SATELLITE DISH 
102 S. Main 

LOCKNEY, TEXAS 

Phone 652-2435 

CI Friday and Saturday Shoppers! /P- 

REWARD YOURSELF 
WITH THESE MOD BUYS ! 

Specials for May 13-14 

CLUB STEAK 	lb. $2.89 Assorted Cuts 
PORK CHOPS lb. $1.59 

Fresh Ground 
HAMBURGER MEAT lb. $1.19 ARM ROAST lb. $1.79 

Blade Cut 
CHUCK ROAST 	lb. $1.49 

Wright's Sliced Slab 
BACON lb. $1.39 

TV SALE ITEMS 
Assorted Flavors Kraft 18 oz. 	Kraft Stack Pak 
BARBEQUE SAUCE 	

1 lb. pkg. 
59c AMERICAN CHEESE 	$1.89 

Secret Roll-on 1.5 oz. 
Reg. $2.21 
DEODORANT $1.59 

Shurfine 6'/z oz. can 
Chunk Style Oil or Water Pak 
TUNA 	 ea. 	69c 

18 oz. Reg. $3.12 Scope 
MOUTHWASH $2.19 

CS or WK 303 can 
OUR DARLING CORN 2 for 79c 

Nabisco 16 oz. pkg. 
FIG NEWTON ea. $1.49 

6 pak 12 oz. cans 
PEPSI-COLA 	 $1.69 

CANTALOUPES lb. 49c Large Head California 
LETTUCE 	 ea. 	69c 

Texas 5# cello bag 
GRAPEFRUIT $1.09 CELERY HEARTS 	ea. 	$1.19 

	 C&L FOOD 
MEMBER STORE VI rAFFILIATa 

PROCTOR ELECTRONICS 
T.V. - Radio Repair 

Quitaque, Texas 	455-1445 

Worship Services at 
FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 

Quitaque, Texas 
"1)1) 
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THURSDAY, MAY 12, 1983 
Lord's Acre 
Sunday To 
Be Observed 

Rev. W. L. Armstrong has 
announced that Sunday will be 
Lord's Acre Day at Turkey 
United Methodist Church. He 
has previously sent out cards for  

those to sign who wish to take 
part in the Lord's Acre projects 
this year. It was used last year 
and was very successful, it was 
reported, so he urges all who are 
interested to participate again 
this year. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jay Eudy of 
Plainview and their daughter, 

Lee Proctor 
Wins McDonough 
Scholarship 

Lee Proctor, freshman radio-
television production major at 
Amarillo College, was recently 
awarded the first Jerome C. 
McDonough Scholarship at the 
.pring Honors Convocation. The 
..eholarship honors the founder of 
the Amarillo College radio-tele-
vision department, who passed 
away in the fall of 1982. 

The McDonough Award is 
given by the faculty and staff of 
the Department of Radio-Tele-
vision to the radio-TV student 
who most exhibits those qualities 
which Mr. McDonough possessed 
and instilled in his students: 
professionalism, dedication, dili-
gence. and outstanding perfor 
mance. 

Proctor is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Lowell Proctor of Turkey. 
He is currently employed by the 
college's cable station and has 
worked for KAMR-TV in Amaril-
lo. 

Jill Roberts of Levelland, spent 
Mother's Day with Mrs. M. T. 
Blume and attended services at 
the Turkey United Methodist 
Church. 

Local Lady 
Receives Trophy 
At Childress 

Mr. and Mrs. Al Ramsey 
attended the Annual West Texas 
Utilities picnic in Childress Sat-
urday. The affair was held in the 
Childress Park with many area 
companies in attendance. 

There are a number of games 
played each year, including 
horseshoe pitching. 

One of the contests is a Liars 
Contest, and according to the 
local WTU manager, Jesse Tur-
ner, someone in his office won 
the Liars Contest. 

Guess who! 

Visitors in the A. C. Barrett 
home were their children, Mr. 
and Mrs. Clovis Hill, Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Moring and son, 
Tyson, Amarillo, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Millard McNabb, Seminole. 

The three ladies brought lunch 
and the occasion was to celebrate 
Mother's Day and a birthday 
dinner for Mr. Barrett. He will be 
86 years young on May 16. The 
guests brought gifts for Mother's 
Day and birthday gifts and Mrs. 
Barrett says they have beautiful 
flowers all over the place. One of 
the bouquets was roses and other 
flowers in a big bouquet from the 
garden of Mrs. A. B. Ramsey. 

The Glynn Barretts visited in 
the afternoon. Ma Barrett says 
Judy wanted to cook lunch for 
her mother and she did. 
	0 	 

Rev. and Mrs. Melvin Clinton, 
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Ramsey and 
Mr. and Mrs. Wilburn Leeper all 
went by Southwest Airlines to 
the State Track Meet in Austin 
this past weekend. 

Rev. and Mrs. W. L. Arm-
strong spent a few days at 
Whitney last week working on 
their property there and had 
time to do some fishing, catching 
a large number of bass and crap-
pie, according to reports. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Mullin had a 
nice Mother's Day weekend with 
their three children and their 
families. They went to Brown-
field Saturday and visited their 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Rick 
Elmore and girls; then that night 
they came back by way of 
Petersburg and had supper with 
their son, Mr. and Mrs. Bunky 
Mullin, Jim and Leslie, at the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Marvin 
Shurbet, the parents of their 
daughter-in-law. Then after 
church on Sunday their son, Rod 
and Marcel Mullin and children. 
took them out to eat. 

Charlene Bailey Rothwell 

Mrs. Rothwell To 
Receive Degree at 
Wayland University 

The graduating class of 1983 at 
Wayland Baptist University in-
cludes Charlene Bailey Rothwell 
of Quitaque, who will be awarded 
the bachelor of arts degree in 
elementary education. She is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. James 
Bailey. 

Wayland's 73rd Spring Com-
mencement will be held there 
Saturday, May 14, beginning at 
10:00 a.m. in Harral Memorial 
Auditorium. A total of 249 
persons are candidates for de-
grees on the bachelor's and 
master's levels. 

Degrees for December and 
May graduates will officially be 
conferred upon those persons 
during Saturday's ceremonies. 
Candidates for August gradua-
tion will receive their diplomas 
upon completion of their course 
of study, although they will also 
participate in Saturday's activi-
ties. 

Wayland Baptist University is 
a coeducational institution of 
higher learning which will begin 
its 75th year of operation in 
June. 

— —0 

Rev. and Mrs. W. L. Arm-
strong and Mr. and Mrs. Bert 
Degas visited in Memphis at the 
Hall County Hospital with Mrs. 
U. F. Coker, sr., Paul Meacham 
and Mrs. Janie Majors. 

David Black of Dallas, a 
student at Texas Tech Univer-
sity, Lubbock, was a guest of 
Paula Helms in the home of her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Joe Edd 
Helms, Sunday, May 8. 

Paula and David attended the 
First Baptist Church in Flomot 
Sunday morning. They spent the 
afternoon looking around the 
farm, and also enjoyed horseback 
riding at the Bobby Clay home. 
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...JUST WHEN YOU WILL USE IT MOST! 
Here's an opportunity to buy a gas grill at a big savings . . and have the whole summer ahead to enjoy it. That's 
a real bargain! You will make the most of our great West Texas evenings and weekends cooking outdoors. Gas 
grills give food that wonderful outdoor flavor without the mess of charcoal or the bother of LP tanks. And, while 
you are having a hot time in the backyard, your kitchen stays cool. The money you save by buying now will put 
a lot of hamburgers and steaks on that grill. Now's the time to move up to gas grill cooking while prices are down. 
Prices in this ad reflect corrections from those listed in Energas statement enclosure on gas grills 
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Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Jay Miller 

Courteous Service 
OZEAN'S SERVICE 

PHONE 455-1361 	1  
HEADS & HEELS 

KATY ROBISON, OWNER 

Barbara Mayfield, Operator 

Open Tues. Fri. 9 a.m.-'tit  
Saturday 9 a.m.-1 p.m. 

Late Appointments Accepted 
Walk-ins Welcomed 

FOR MEN & WOMEN 

455-1292 

,REDKEN 
RETAIL CENTER 

CONGRATULATIONS 
to 

GIRLS TRACK TEAM 
and 

COACH PHELPS 
on 

WINNING AT AUSTIN! 

Wedding vows were exchan- 
ged in a double ring ceremony 
Saturday. April 9, at 4:00 p.m. at 
the First Baptist Church in 

o  ,,,lor between Sharla Jo 
and Tommy Jay Miller. 

Rev. Gary Hillyard, pastor, per-
formed the ceremony. 

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ted Green of 
Matador and the groom is the son 
of Mrs. Betty Miller of Lubbock. 

Escorted to the altar by her 
father, the bride wore a voile 
gown appliqued with white dais-
ies. The full sleeves and the neck 
were edged with polyester ruf-
fling. Her cap and chapel length 
veil were of nylon illusion 
appliqued with white daisies. She 
carried a bouquet of silk pink 
rosebuds and burgundy crocus 
with pink and burgundy stream-
ers. 

Baskets of Ilawaiian Scher-

fleras and pink roses on pedes-
tals flanked the altar. Each of the 
baskets was tied with satin 
burgundy bows. Family pews 
were marked with satin bur-
gundy bows. 

Mrs. Melissa Martin of Mata-
dor presented traditional wed-
ding music and accompanied 
Jimmy Morris of Matador and 
Belinda Simpson of Paducah, as 
they sang "Let It Be Me." "You 
and I" and "There Is Love." 

Mrs. Sherry Paschal, sister of 
the bride of Matador, served as 
matron of honor. Bridesmatrons 
were Mrs. Tanya Muller of 
Lubbock and Mrs. Jackie Green 
of Matador. 

The bride's attendants wore 
identical formal length gowns of 
pink polyester. They carried, 
bouquets of silk pink rosebuds 
and burgundy crocus with pink 
and burgundy streamers. 

Keith Paschal of Matador 
served as best man. Groomsmen 
were Bryan Sweeney and Greg 
Worley, both of Paducah. 

Serving as ushers were Rickey 
and David Green, brothers of the 
bride, both of Matador, Terry 
Miller, brother of the groom, of 
Paducah, and Warren Multer of 
Lubbock. 

Linda Payne, cousin of the 
bride, of Quitaque, registered 
the guests. 

Special guests attending the 
wedding were the bride's grand-
mothers, Mrs. J. C. Green, sr. of 
Matador and Mrs. Roy Edwards 
of Turkey. 

Following the ceremony, a 
reception was held in the fellow-
ship hall of the church. The 
bride's table was covered with a 
pink cloth draped with a white 
lace overlay and featured a 
three-tiered wedding cake decor-
ated with pink sweetheart roses. 
The top tier of the cake featured 
the traditional miniature bride 
and groom. The wedding cake 
was made by Mrs. Debbie 
Buckelew of Matador and was 
served by Mrs. Debbie Shannon 
of Roaring Springs. Mrs. Connie 
Hurt of Floydada served pink 
fruit punch from a crystal punch 
bowl which was set on a large 
silver tray. White tapers in silver 
and crystal candelabra, sur-
rounded with pink and burgundy 
flowers, centered the table. 

White napkins with the inscrip-
tion, "Tom and Sharla - April 9, 
1983," were used to complete the 
table. 

Mrs. Kay Miller of Paducah 
served at the groom's table 
which featured a German choco-
late cake. The table was covered 
with a burgundy cloth draped 
with a white lace cloth. A basket 
of silk pink and burgundy flowers 
and brass candelabra with white 
tapers completed his table. Sil-
ver appointments were used at 
each table. 

Those serving in the housepar-
ty were aunts of the bride. Mrs. 
Phil Green and Mrs. Jack Green, 
both of Matador, Mrs. Allen 
Brummett and Mrs. Lonnie 
Payne, both of Quitaque, and 
Mrs. Dwight Ramsey of Silver-
ton. 

After a short wedding trip, the 
couple are at home in Paducah 
where the groom is employed by 
McWilliams Construction Co. 

Green-Miller Marriage Vows 
Exchanged Recently At Matador 
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/Bank of Turkey, TI.S.11 
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ELAINE. KATHY 

WEDNESDAY THROUGH FRIDAY 

KATHY'S BEAUTY SHOP 

110 	III kl Ill O.1.NCY OF' TVA \ 

now taking applications for RN's, IA N's and 
nurses aides for local area. 8  -  S Mon. - Fri. Good 
salary and fringe benefits. Call 817-937-6031 or 
6491. 	 46-31 
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V. F.1 ESDA1 SENIOR CITIZEN'S DAY SPECIAL 

Anyone our 55 years of age may bring this coupon and get a 
shampoo and hair set without backcombing for $5.00. 

By Appointment Only 

KATHY'S BE  \  t f Y SHOP 

Our Flowers Say It Best 
Shop At 

FARLEY'S FLOWERS 
& VARIETY 

Wendell, Roberta, Johnnie, Debbie 
QUITAQUE, TEXAS 

455-1410 

For All Your Flower & Variety Needs 

A & B CONSTRUCTION 

ROOFING — REMODELING — REPAIRS 

Electrical Contracting. Free Estimates 
Call Collect: 423-1184 Mike Berry or 

259-2995 Kirk Anderson 

SDAy NIA I 983  
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DR. 0. R. McINTOSH 
Optometrist 

South Main Street 	 Phone 9833460 
FLOYDADA. TEXAS 

• 
• 
• 
• 
• 
• 

	

Licensed Insured 	 • 
CERTIFIED GRAZON DEALER 	 • 

• 

	

Mesquite. Pear. Juniper and 	Cedar 	 • 

	

Wheat Spraying 	 • 

	

Glean, Banvel. 2-4-D's 	 • 

	

Call Alvie Francis 	 •• 
806-847-2523 	 • 

• 

• • • • • • • 
• 
• 
• 
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FRANCIS AERIAL SPRAYING 

CONNER INSURANCE AGENCY 
YOUR INDEPENDENT AGENT FOR 

LIFE - HEALTH - 
MEDICARE SUPPLEMENTS 

We Represent Several Companies To Provide You With 

Options To Fit Your Needs 

Box 418 
Phone 455-1100 	 Quitaque, Texas 

E E E.E. E. 1E EA. E. E. WEE E %ILE 

PAGE TWELVE THE VALLEY TRIBUNE THURSDAY, MAY 12, 1983 

BUY. SELL, MADE OR RENT THROUGH THE 

CLASSIFIED ADS 
FOR SALE 

MUST SELL: 1982 CHEVRO-
let, short, wide, pickup, 22,000 
miles. Call 455 - 1193 day, or 
455-1154 night. 47-tfc 

FOR SALE OR TRADE: IHC b- 
row bed planter, double disc 
openers, diamond bar mount 
with gauge wheel. Call 455-1165. 

48-2tp 

FOR SALE: 1976 CHEVROLET 
Laguna, one owner, 73,400 miles. 
Price 51500.00. Call 423-1378. 

46-tfc 

MASONARY 	PRODUCTS, 
Sand, Gravel, Cement, Paints, 
Lumber, Hardware. Let us re-
model your home or business. 
Turn-key contract work. Foger-
son Lumber & Supply, Silverton, 
823-2021. 46-tfc 

SHOP NOW FOR GRADUA-
tion: 14k Gold Chains, Charms, 
Earrings, Add-a-Beads, Nugents. 
Karol's Gold, Quitaque. Karol 
Pigg, 455-1473. 48-2tc 

FOR SALE: 2 BEDROOM House 
on Bell St., Tappan cookstove, 
refrigerator, maple rocking 
chair, two recliners, stereo and 
stereo table, chest, Whirlpool 
washer and dryer, two ceiling 
fans still in boxes. Call 423-1330 
til 7:00 then 423-1317 and Sun-
days. 48-2tc 

IC= 
FARM BUREAU INSURANCE 
COMPANY: For insurance of all 
lines, call Tommy Edwards, [8061 
455-1129 or 823-2189. 33-tfc 

ROOFER: COMMERCIAL AND 
Residential, free estimates. Rich-
ard C. Carroll, Plainview. Texas. 
('all 806-296-6227. 45-4tp 

SINGER SEWING MACHINES, 
Vacuum Cleaners, Smith Corona 
Typewriters, Adding Machines, 
Kirby Sales and Service. Buy 
here, service here. Call in 
Quitaque, 455-1101, or call 423- 
1155 in Turkey. Call 259-2716 in 
Memphis. Office located at 620 
Noel in Memphis. Here every 
two weeks on Thursdays. 28-tic 

HEADS & HEELS: Pickup sta-
tion for laundry and dry cleaning. 
Thursday pickup and delivery for 
Tulia Steam laundry. Call 455-
1292 for information. 28-tic 

LOCKSMITH. LOCKS OPEN-
ed. Lock. repaired. Keys made 
for locks that have no keys. 
Duplicate keys made. Deadbolts 
installs., 24-hour mobile service 
throughout area. Don Probasco. 
Pro-Lock Shop, 983-3834. 15 
Milt, south of Sils erton, High-
. MIN 207 36Ite 

liMANIA FARM MUTUAL 
Aid Association: Reasonable. 
sound property insurance. If you 
want to save, contact Mrs. 
Orville Lee, Flomot. Call 806-469- 
5370. 23-dc 

UNDERGROUND PLASTIC IR- 
igation Water and Gas Pipe 
Installed. Backhoe Service, Irri- 
gation Leaks and Repairs. 823- 
2,431, Silverton Metal Works. 

44-tfc 

LOCKNEY MEAT CO. USDA 
Inspected. Kill days Monday 
through Friday. Custom proces- 
sing. Wholesale and Retail 
Meats. Halves and Quarters Cut, 
Wrapped, Frozen and Fully 
Guaranteed. Sam & Kelly For- 
tenberry, owners and managers. 
Phone 652-3305, corner of U. S. 
70 and Farm Road 378 South. 

15-tfc 

WE ARE A DEALER FOR 
Sanitas Wallpaper. Prompt dr 
livery. Sample books available. 
Fogerson Lumber & Supply, 
Silverton, Phone 823-2021. 29-tic 

TO GIVE AWAY 

TO GIVE AWAY: THREE FE- 
male half German Shepherd 
puppies. Call Scotty or Sherri 
Setliff, 455-1190 or 455-1431. 

48-ltp 

LOST AND 
FOUND 

PLEASE RETURN: MY MILK 
Glass Cups that I loaned to 
someone. They match my punch 
bowl. I will appreciate this very 
much. Call Amelia Kitchens, 847-
2269. 48-1 tc 

A COAT, SIZE 3 MISSES, WAS 
found. Owner may have same by 
identifying and paying for this ad 
at the Valley Tribune. 48- It 

PUBLIC NOTICES 

NOTICE OF SALE 

OF CITY LOTS 

The City of Turkey will accept 
sealed bids on the following 
property until June 9, 1983 at 
5:00 p.m. Bids will be opened at 
7:00 p.m. June 9, 1983. Persons 
bidding on property and getting 
it, will be responsible for a deed 
costing $50.00 and 59.00 record-
ing fee. The city reserves the 
right to reject any and all bids. 

Lots 1, 2, 9 & 10 BIk 15 
Bellview Addition 

Lots 7 & 11 Blk 1 Turkey 
Heights 

Lots 14 & 16 Blk 3 Lacy 
Lot 16 Blk 2 Lacy 
Lots 15 & 16 BIk 2 Original 

Town 
Lot 13 & N 10' of Lot 14 Blk I 

South Side 
Lots I & 10 BIk I Threet 
All Blk 5 College 
Lot 2 Blk 16 Bellview 

City of Turkey 
Ruth Fuston 
City Secretary 

47-5tc 

•••• ■ ••••••  • ••• 004 I • • r • o • 
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AEROBICS IS HERE FOR THE 
Summer! Starting May 23 at 7:00 
Tuesdays and Thursdays for six 
weeks. 525 per person. Contact 
Sherri Setliff, 455-1190 or 455-
1431. 48-2tp 

HOME FOR SALE: THREE 
bedroom, 2 baths, den with 
fireplace, carpeted, 3 lots. Mike 
House, 423-1112, Turkey. 38-tfc 

HOME FOR SALE: 3 BED-
room, Pt. bath, double garage, 
steel siding, 2140 total sq. ft. Call 
423-1492, Turkey. 47-4tp 

HOUSE FOR SALE: CALL 806- 
469-5215. 	 47-4tc 

THELMA LOVING'S five-room 
house with extra large living 
room. Has central cooling and 
heating, carport, double garage 
with three-room apartment and 
storage room. On corner lot 
south of Baptist Church. Call 
Jimmy Davidson in Quitaque or 
Vivian Tiffin in Silver-ton. 41-tic 

We want to thank everyone for 
everything that was done for us 
in the passing of our loved one. 
Thanks for the flowers, visits, 
cards, telephone calls, for the 
good food that was served to us 
at the Community Center after 
the funeral, and especially, for 
your prayers. May God bless 
each of you. 

The family of 
Mrs. M. F. Jenkins 
Mr. and Mrs. James Kimbell 

and family 
Mr. and Mrs. C. B. Kimbell 
Ike Smith and family 
Mrs. Fern Kimbell 

and family 

I would like to say "thank you" 
to everyone who remembered 
me during my recent stay in the 
hospital. I appreciate every act of 
kindness: the gifts, visits and 
cards. A special thanks to Jean 
Cathey for sitting with my sister 
during my surgery. I will be 
recuperating at the home of my 
sister in Olton for several weeks. 
God bless all of you. 

Susie Rivas 

I wish to express my thanks to 
everyone who remembered me in 
any way while I was in the 
hospital and since my return 
home. for all the food, flowers, 
gifts. telephone calls and the 
many, many cards I received. 
May God's blessings be with each 
of you. 

Sabra Setliff 

We would like to thank all of 
you for the many expressions of 
sympathy during the illness and 
loss of our loved one. Thank you 
for the visits, calls, flowers, food, 
cards, and especially your pray-
ers. Thank you for just being 
there willing to do whatever you 
could to help. 

May God bless all of you. 
The Elmer Cruse family 

To our dear friends and neigh-
bors, a big thank you for your 
visits, flowers, phone calls, cards, 
the good food and most of all for 
your prayers during my stay in 
the hospital and since I've been 
home 

Oleing and Mary Hogue 

Mr. and Mrs. Jim Mayfield 
were delightfully surprised when 
an usher at the First United 
Methodist Church called them 
out Sunday morning and said 
they had visitors to see them. It 
was their son. Gene, and his 
entire family: Mr. and Mrs. Gene 
Mayfield of Levelland; Mr. and 
Mrs. Jerry Bear and son, Shane, 
Lubbock; Mr. and Mrs. Stan 
Mayfield, Canyon; Mr. and Mrs. 
Steve Mayfield, Amarillo. 

The group all attended church 
together. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Bradley of 
Dalhart spent Saturday in Quita-
que visiting Mr. and Mrs. Dick 
Taylor. On Sunday, the couples 
drove to Lockney and visited 
their mother, Mrs. J. T. Bradley, 
at the Lockney Care Center. 

The couples were to be met by 
the C. C. Moss family of Anson 
and Mrs. Leslie Beard of San 
Angelo, but a sister of Mr. Moss 
died on Saturday and they were 
unable to come. 

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Taylor 
drove to Lockney Tuesday and 
visited the Care Center and had 
barbecued hamburgers there. 
This is "Visit a Nursing Home" 
month. 

Guests in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Edd Helms for Mother's 
Day dinner were Mrs. W. E. 
Helms of Quitaque, Mr. and Mrs. 
Art Green of Flomot, David 
Black and Paula Helms of Texas 
Tech University, Karla Meyer of 
Pampa, and Kenneth and Robbie 
Helms of the home. 

Afternoon visitors were Ser-
itha and Hoss Hamilton of 
Amarillo. 

Mrs. Velma Jones of Quitaque 
and sister, Mrs. Hallie Bailey of 
Childress, drove to Fort Worth 
to visit the ladies' brother and 
wife. Mr. and Mrs. Ray Wooley 
on Monday of last week. They 
returned to their respective 
homes Friday. Mr. Wooley had 
recently received a fall from a 
ladder in attempting to clean out 
the gutters on his house roof. His 
foot slipped through and he fell, 
crushing a heel. 
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