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First Med Grand 
Opening Held 
Wednesday, 
November 13 

1996 III-DISTRICT CHAMPIONS 

FIRST MED NOW OPEN—Brenda Rivard, L.V.N. (from left), Charles 
Stephenson, P.A., and Tonya Walker, Medical Assistant are pictured. 

Cross Plains High School 
Buffaloes Bi-District 
Champions 

By VANDA KING 
Editor 

By GREG TURNER 

Mike Waters, President of Hen-
drick Medical Center in Abilene, 
welcomed guests outside the new 
First Med office at 416-B Main Street 
last Wednesday. He recognized R.T. 
and Yvonne Pccvy for their efforts in 
providing the office space for the new 
rural health center and Keith Law-
rence as the president of the Cross 
Plains Chamber of Commerce. 
Charles Stephenson, P.A. for the 
clinic was also introduced. 

The Chamber of Commerce pro-
vided a ribbon cutting ceremony for 
the occasion. Members of the 
Chamber were present, along with 
local citizens, to view the new facility 
and wish First Med their best. Over 
250 people attended the celebration. 

T.G. Hendrick was a big hit with the 

game offensively and defensively 
they could come away with another 
gold football this week. 

Again, I salute the town for the 
supptirt you give to the Vint pro-
grams and the young athletes that 
participate. I encourage each of you 
to show your support by attending the 
game in Breckenridge which begins 
at 7:30 p.m. See you there!! 

began moving the ball from the Long-
horn 46 yard line, and 10 plays and 46 
yards later Scan Jones pushed over 
forathe TD of 1 yard. The extra point 
tail- Later in the 2nd quarter the 
sari, Desput together another drive, 
this time starting on their own 14 yard 
linc. A big play in that drive came 
when Quarterback Jarad Richards 
threw to Joseph Turner for a 32 yard 
gain. With .30 seconds remaining in 
the half, again QB Richards passed 
this ti to to Dusty Hargrove for the 
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kindergarten class from Cross Plains 
Elementary. The students came to see 
First Flight which was on display 
during the grand opening. The stu-
dents were fascinated by the emer-
gency helicopter. They liked the big 
bear hugs T.G. was handing out, too. 

Dwayne Miller, M.D. and David 
Long, M.D. serve as the co-medical 
directors for First Med. Charles Ste-
phenson, P.A. along with Brenda 
Rivard, L.V.N. and Tonya Walker, 
Medical Assistant, will render medi-
cal services including immuniza-
tions, sports and school physicals, 
and general health services for all 
ages. Office hours are Monday thru 
Friday from 8:00 a.m. until 5:00 p.in. 

Refreshments were enjoyed by 
guests as they viewed the beautiful 
new rural health clinic. First Mcd is 
sure to be a great asset to the com-
munity. Welcome to Cross Plains! 
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The Cross Plains offense rushed the 
ball 50 times for 177 yards. Running 
Back Jody Fortune handled the ball 
30 of 50 times for 115 yards, and was 
hit hard numerous times by the 
Longhorns. Sean Jones ran the hall 9 
times for 29 yards and I TD. Fortune 
has been one of the work horses in the 
backfield and I am pretty sure this 
game pm h in over 1,000 yards for the 
year. Fortune will be the first to say it 
is due to the blocking linemen who 
open up many holes. 

QB Richar4ls was 8 kw 12 in the 
passing department for 133 yards. 
Turner led the receiving with 2 re-
ceptions for 50 yards. Hargrove 
closely followed with 4 receptions 
totaling 49 yards and one was a TD. 

This week the Buffaloes advance to 
the Area Playoff game in Brecken-
ridge. This game will he a stepping 
stone for the Bulls  as they will play 
the Munday Moguls. Munday is now 
ranked 4th in the state and will he a 
tough competitor for Cross Plains. If 
the Buffaloes put together a good 

The Cross Plains Buffaloes again 
shut-out their opponents, the Bronte 
Longhorns, and won the title of Bi-
District Champions. Cross Plains 
now advances to the second round of 
the State Football Playoffs. The last 
time the Buffs won Bi-Distriet was in 
1988 against Wall. That year the 
Buffaloes were Runner-Up in Dis-
trict and proceeded to the playoffs, 

Last Friday as the stands began to 
fill, you could feel the excitement and 
enthusiasm of each person present. A 
huge crowd of Buffalo fans expressed 
great spirit throughout the contest. 

The 1st quarter of the game ended 
up scoreless, although the Buffaloes 
dominated -- snapping the ball 20 
times on offense and only allowing 
the Longhorns I first down. The 
Buffaloes drove the ball to the 1 yard 
line but were unable to score. 

The 2nd quarter started with Cross 
Plains in control of the hall, The Buffs 

defe eonly allowing the Longhorns 
3 fi downs and 69 yards rushing. 
The Longhorns ended the night with 
only 106 yards total offense. The 
defense was inspired by the efforts of 
Hugo Mauricio with 7 tackles, 5 as-
sists, 1 recovered fumble, and 1 sack. 
Also playing tough on defense were 
Kevin Nickerson with 5 tackles and 
Justin Hopkins 4 tackles and 7 assists. 

Library Bake 
Sale Weds, 
Nov. 27 

Join Us For A 
Caravan To 
Breckenridge 

Attention Band 
Boosters, Parents, 
Grandparents, Aunts, 
Uncles, Cousins & 
Friends 

Lucille and James Oscar Koenig at 
Koenigs Family Store have gra-
ciously volunteered to help us with 
our fund-raiser. In order to keep the 
kids from having to sell door-to-
door, but still provide a quality 
product, they are giving the band a 
percentage of all the Watkins Prod-
ucts sold. 

Just come by or call the store for 
your products which include vanilla, 
spices, black pepper, cleaning prod-
ucts, and many more. 
Go by and pick up a catalog or 

watch for the monthly special cata-
log we will be sending with the hand 
kids next week. 

Christmas 
Village Slated 
For D-c. 5, 6 & 7 

itik• 

caravan is being organized to 
travel to the Cross Plains vs. Mundat  
Ipotball game. Plans arc to begin 

yping up and being decorated at 5:30 
\titan. in from of the school. The 
caravan will leave for the ball game 

5!45. Conte out and help us Stip-
/port the Buffaloes!! Project P 

Village just ke 
better. AdditiO ses have 

Think Wednesday, November 27. 
Think Library. 
Think of all the yummy Thanks-

giving desserts and good things you 
can find at. the Bake Sale, like 
cookies, cakes, pies, candy, breads, 
etc. 

Anyone wishing to .contribuic 
items to sell, may bring them to the 
library Tuesday afternoon, Novem-
ber 26 before 5 p.m., or as early as 
possible on Wednesday morning. 

n I ice. 
Apen all three evenings will he 
ligginhothams "Christmas In the 

'505" tour, live nativity and bakery. 
Charlie Brown's kid's window per-
Ibrmances will be stages twice on 
Thursday and Saturday nights and 
once at 8:00 p.m. on Friday. Citizens 
State Bank will he hosting an art 
exhih 	y artist, Bonnie Rec White. 
I lobbies and collections will again 
be featured at the Library. 

New this year, will be a "Health 
Fair" conducted by Columbia One 
Source at their clinic on North Main 
St. 

Christmas lights and decorations 
depicting the '50s will be numerous 
throughout the city. Invite your 
friends to join you in downtown 
Cross Plains all three evenings and 
get into the Christmas spirit. Thcrc 
will be no admission charges. 

announced plans to set up shop in the 
illaee this year. 
AuractionS will officially open in 

downtown Cross Plains on Thursday 
evening, December 5, at 6:00 p.m. 
and will re-open on Friday and Sat-
urday, December 6 and 7, from 6:00 
to 9M0 p.m. Santa Claus and his 
helpers (Kiwanis' club members) 
will arrive on Friday evening with 
goodies for the children. Prizes w ill 
be awarded by merchants. The 
Chamber Of commerce will provide 
musical entertainment. 

The Senior Citizens will sponsor a 
cake walk on Friday evening at thc. 
Senior Center and west Texas Utili-
ties and the Cross Plains Review will 
each hold open house. A Christmas 
cancellation will be offered by the 

Homes & 
Businesses 
Judged For 
Christmas 
Decoration 

ing thsperiod of Deceinhor 8-
, homesand businesses in the 

Cross Plains Community will, be 
viewed by out-of-town judges to 
determine winners of Me Best 
Decorated - Horne/Busin.for akIL 
Christmas. Project Pride 	withp̀ro- 
vide 25 Buffalo Bucks to the winner 
of the Best Decorated Home with the 
Chamber of Commerce awatdintt 25-
Buffalo Bucks to the owner al the. 
Best Decorated Business. 

Criteria used for selecting the 1st, 
2nd and 3rd places in the tv sepa-
rate categories are as follow ,.: 

I. Originality 
2. Keeping the Theme of Christ-

mas 
3. Time and effort involved 
4. Overall effect 
5. Visibility 
Individuals and businesses wishing 

to be considered for these awards 
should call 725-6623, giving your 
name and address. 

First place winners in 1995, Joe 
Holland's home and 36 West Motel 
will not be eligible to win awards this 
year. 

Early Out 
Tuesday, 
Nov. 26 

Mediplex Open House 
A Great Success 

School will dismiss at 2:30 pin. 
Tuesday, November 26 for the 
Thanksgiving holiday. Buses will 
run at 2:30. Classes will resume on 
Monday, December 2. 

Colonial Oaks 
Services 

Linda Patrick, R.N. and Branch 
Manager, Deidra Switzer, R.N. and 
Case Manager, Rhonda McCorkle, 
Medical Secretary, Marsha Turney, 
Medical Secretary, Cindy Payne, 
L.V.N., Donnie Dillard, L.V.N., and 
Lovey Nichols, Office L.V.N. ap-
preciated everyone who attended. 

Church of Christ will conduct wor-
ship services at Colonial Oaks Nurs-
ing Home on Sunday, November 
24, commencing at 3:30 p.m. 

The local branch of Mediplex Home 
Health Care Company celebrated 
National Homc Health Care month 
with an open house last Wednesday. 
Refreshments were served from a 
beautifully decorated table with a fall 
theme. Blood pressure readings were 
offered to guests. 

Cross Plains Bra,. h employees, 
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Misdemeanor Minutes 
Amy Noe, $25 fine $162 court 

costs, 6 months probation for 
deferred judgment, 
In the matter of Troy Richburg, 

David W. Thedford allowed to 
withdraw as surety. 

Darlene Smith, theft of property 
by check dismissed due to 
restitution having been made. 
David Leon Tuggle, assault 

charge dismissed at request of 
victim. 
Probations discharged: Hale 

Allison Gray, Danile Shannon 
Harris, Kenneth Albert Harris III, 
Casey Gene Moore, Lora Mosley. 

Civil Filings 
Divorces filed: 
Austin, Kay & Bobby L., and in 

the Interest of minor child. 
Asher, Mamie Joann & A.D. 
Lawson, Rosemary & Scott. 

Civil Minutes 
Antonia Rosales Gutierrez and 

Jorge & Peggy Sue Rangel vs 
Arthur Larkin, $18,500 default 
judgment for plaintiffs, 

Felony Minutes 
Ronnie Scott Claxton, motion 

dismissed to revoke probation. 

Cheryl Rahmbow 
Rites for Cheryl Lutgens 

Rahmbow were held recently in 
Terrell. Cheryl is survived by her 
husband, Robert Rahmbow of 
Terrell and a brother, Donne! 
Lutgens of Irving. She was a 1935 
graduate of Cross Plains High 
School. 

Cheryl was preceded in death by 
her parents, Al Lutgens of Cross Cut 
and Lucy Boase of Rising Star, as 
well as, her grandparents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Cap Crabb of Cross Plains. Mr. 
Crabb will be remembered as one of 
the early day individuals who de-
veloped the famous Amerada Oil 
Field between Cross Plains and 
Burkett. 

MARRIAGE LICENSE 
Becky Denise Rogers & Jason 

Edward Self of Clyde. 

CTO, Inc. 
Public Hearing 
Mon, Nov. 25 

William Cole Tillotson 
William Cole Tillotson, 84, died 

Tuesday, November 12, 1996, at his 
home. 

Services were held at 2 p.m. Friday 
in Higginbotham Funeral Home 
Chapel with the Rev. Henry Grubbs 
officiating. Burial was in Cross 
Plains Cemetery. 

Mr, Tillotson was born in Nevada, 
Iowa, and married Helen Schenk in 
1944 in Marshalltown, Iowa. He 
worked as a transmitter supervisor 
for KWWL-TV in Iowa. He was a 
member of Cross Plains Presbyte-
rian Church. 

Survivors include his wife, of 
Cross Plains; two daughters, Donna 
Burleson of Cross Plains and Colene 
Sachanowski of Big Bear Lake, 
California; one sister, Virginia 
Vining of Cherokee Village, Ar-
kansas; three grandchildren, Ruth 
Hutchins, Bill Burleson and Matt 
Burleson; and three great-grand-
children, Clinton Hutchins, Kathar-
ine Hutchins and Kyle Hutchins. 

Pallbearers were John Burleson, 
Bill Burleson, Matt Burleson, Alan 
Sachanowski, Ronnie Hutchins and 
C.G. "Tuff" Hutchins. 

deposit required to renters. There-
fore after careful consideration, 
W.C. Pringle moved to increase 
renters' deposit to 5100. James 

Neti.
ilols seconded and motion car-ri

By general consent the council 
agreed to advertise for bids for the 
installation of a new metal roof for 
the Senior Citizens Center. 

Ray Womack moved to purchase 
the SAV1N copy machine and the 
maintenance agreement to begin af-
ter the expiration of the 90-day 
warranty. Edwin Weiss seconded 
and motion carried. 

Jerry Cassle moved to pay the bills. 
Edwin Weiss seconded and motion 
carried. 

Edwin \Veiss moved to go into 
executive session. Ray Womack 
seconded and motion carried. 

Review of applicants for Police 
Chief. 

Jerry Cassle moved to return to 
open meeting. Edwin Weiss sec-
onded and motion carried. 

Janies Nichols nursed to adjourn. 
W.C. Pringle seconded and motion 
carried. 

Ray Purvis, Mayor 
Central Texas Opportunities, Inc. 

will be having a public hearing/ 
meeting to discuss their proposed 
use of community services block 
grant funds and the proposed activi- 

ties to be supported with CSBG 
Funds for the fiscal year 1997. The 
purpose of the hearing/meeting is to 
receive public input on the use of 
CSBG funds and receive input on the 
types of services that may be needed 
in the community. 

The meeting will be held on Mon- 

This was a regular meeting of the 
Cross Plains City Council. All 
members were present. Minutes of 
the previous meeting were approved 
with the following correction: It was 
stated: "Jerry Cassle moved to re- 
scind the following four ordi-
nances," however, it should have 
read, "Ray Womack moved to re-
scind the following four ordi-
nances": followed by, "Jerry Cassle 
seconded and motion carried." 

Bob Hill, City Judge, presented the 
judge's report. The council asked the 
judge to continue to give the judge's 
report in the same format as pre-
sented in October. By general con-
sent the council accepted the judges 
report as presented. 

The council discussed the litter 
problem at the school personnel and 
beginning December 1, 1996, there 
kill be a closed campus which wi ll  
not allow students to leave the school 
ground during lunch, so this should 
reduce the problem. 

Discussion was held at length 
concerning the meter deposit for 
renters. It was noted that city policy 
is to terminate service if utility is two 
months past due. It was also noted 
that if the delinquent bill is ONLY 
minimum it exceeds the current S75 

day, November 25, 1996, at the ad-
ministrative office meeting room 
located at 1200 S. Frio, Coleman, 
Texas 76834. The meeting will be-
gin at 2:30 p.m. 

The general public, elected offi-
cials, civic organization leaders, 
business representatives, and mem-
bers of the CTO Board of Directors 
arc encouraged to attend. If you have 
any questions regarding this meeting 
please contact (915) 625-4167. 

Deadlines For 
The Cross Plains Review 

Articles  Must Be In By Noon Monday 
Advertisements  Must Be In By 

5:00 p.m. Tuesday 
Your cooperation is greatly appreciated. 

CROSS PLAINS 

REVIEW 
(USPS 138-660) 

DON TABOR, PUBLISHER 
VANDA KING, EDITOR 

CROSS PLAINS, REVIEW 

XXXXX Strnaaaallanlita a a a a a Ilaaaaaa% 

On the night of November 13, 
someone tried to break into Collum's 
Restaurant. The act of taking 
something that does not belong to 
you just makes me sick. When a little 
town like Cross Plains is not safe 
from this kind of unlawfulness, then 
things are really getting bad. The 
question is was it an adult bad guy or 
a kid that should have been home in 
bed at that time of night? Parents do 
you know if your child did this act of 
wrong doing? No one likes to think 
their child or loved one would do 
this. 

The Police have been called and all 
the necessary steps have been taken 
to catch the ones responsible for this 
act. If you or a friend know some-
thing about this crime, please contact 
the Cross Plains Police Department 
or Dusty Finn at Collum's Restau-
rant. 

Don't just sit by and let the bad guys 
take over our town. 

Sincerely, 
Dusty Finn 
Owner Collum's Restaurant 

Robert Allene Davis 
Robert A]lene Davis, 94, died 

Tuesday, November 12, 1996, in a 
Merkel nursing home. 
Services were held at 2 p.m. 

Thursday in First Foursquare 
Church with the Rev. L.G. Tisdale 
officiating. Burial was in Eula 
Cemetery, directed by Elliott-Ham il 
Funeral Home, 542 Hickory. 

Mrs. Davis was born in Rowden 
and lived in the Abilene area most of 
her life. She was self-employed in 
the laundry business. She was a 
member of First Foursquare Church 
and was the widow of James Robert 
Davis, whom she married in 1925 in 
Brownfield. 

Survivors include two sons, Billy 
Davis and Bobbie Ray Davis, both of 
Tye; 13 grandchildren; and many 
great-grandchildren and great-great-
grandchildren. 

Only Two More Weeks 
To Get Your Name In 
For The Drawing 

(USPS 138-660) is published 
weekly on Thursday, for $15.00 
per year within Callahan 
County; $18.00 per year else-
where in Texas; $20.00 per 
year out of state. (No foreign 
copies except APO or like ad-
dress); by Review Publishing 
Co., 116 E. 8th St., Cross 
Plains, Texas 76443. 

I am never bored anywhere: 
being bored is an insult to 
oneself. 

*** 

—Jules Renard 

In My Father's house are 
many mansions; if it were 
not so, I would have told 
you. Igo to prepare a place 
for you. And if I go and 
prepare a place for you, I will 
come again and receive you to 
Myself; that where I am, 
there you may 6e also. john 
14:2,3 
Paid Advertising — Irma Miller 

Periodical postage paid at 
Cross Plains, Texas 76443. 
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0 	 It is just that way. ir 
III 	 M 
PI 	Life on our farm three miles east of Cross Plains became happier when we visited our new N 

N neighbors, Mr. and Mrs. Cole Tillotson. They had moved (ruin Iowa into their new home 01  

to be near their daughter, Mrs. Burleson. M 
0 	 M 
M 	My first visit was to make their acquaintance and invite them to attend our Presbyterian m 

M church in Cross Plains. The visit was so enjoyable and when I left I had their promise to N 
M attend church and become members of the Sunday school class I was teaching. They have 10 

N been loyal members since that memorable visit. 	 N 

Ill 
III 	Soon we were exchanging ideas from their experiences in a far-flung state where "Mr. 1111  

II 	
M Cole" was a noted radioand television broadcaster, wood carving anis!, hummingbird lover • 

N and best of all a "friend indeed." I ICICII was a loving friend, cook, florist and Garden Club N 

N member. They enjoyed my late husband's experience in gardening, tree planting, and a N 

N living example of what it is like to live in Texas. 	 N 

N 	Often when we were harvesting garden crops, they Cattle and watched until they could N 
ol contribute their  help.  Mr. 'Laken was helpful to  them  by setting out fain trees, rose bushes M 

 
and other yard beautifying.II 	 N 

N In the passing of Cole Tillotson, a great loss will be felt by all who knew hint, church, N 
I neighbors and friends, but I leaven will be enriched by his passing. Ile was a devout N 
N Christian, loyal to church and Sunday school, until he became ill. 	 N 

N May God bless and comfort his bereaved family and friends. 	 N 
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someone, or a team in order that 
you might split the grand prize 
cash. Several people are doing this 
so that they can help out our 
Project Graduation, but just do not 
have a $100 to do so. Any 
contributions are greatly 
appreciated. So take advantage of 
being a part of this and contact a 
senior parent now before all the 
tickets are gone, only 300 tickets 
will be sold and we are nearing that 
goal fast) You may call Sharon or 
LaVerne at 854-1165 or Bun or 
Debbie at 854-1020. Drawing will 
be December 7, during Cowboy 
Christmas. 

There are only 2 weeks left to be 
able to get your name In on an 
opportunity to win your choice of a 
1997 Jeep Cherokee or $15,000 
cash, or one of 12 other cash 
prizes. Time is running out and 
there are only a few chances left. 
For a $100 donation towards 
Baird's Project Graduation you will 
get a chance at winning your 
choice of the Grand Prize of either 
a Jeep Cherokee or $15,000 cash. 
If you feel that you cannot afford a 
$100 donation, there are many 
people going together and pooling 
their money for a chance at the 
cash. If you cannot find anyone to 
go in with you on a ticket, if you will 
contact a parent of project 
graduation and let them know that 
you would like to purchase a 1/2 of 
a ticket for $50, a 1/4 of a ticket for 
$25.00 or a 1/5 of a ticket for $20, 
we will match you up with 

POSTMASTER: Send address 
changes to Cross Plains Re-
view, P.O. Box 519, Cross 
Plains, Texas 76443. 
Telephone : 1 (817) 725-6111 
FAX: 1 (817) 725-7225 

(CHURCH SERVICE1 

10TH & 

Morning 
Evening 
Wed. Prayer 
Dr. Jim H. 

Sunday School 	 
MAIN 

O'Dell 

FIRST 

Worship 
Worship 	 

	

Service 		 
- Pastor 

BAPTIST 
CROSS 

-725-7556 Gene 

PLAINS 

• 

CHURCH 
(817) 

Greenwood 

11:00 

725-7629 
9:45 

7:00 
7:00 

a.m. 
a.m. 
p.m. 
p.m. 

- Music 

4. 

A checking 
account tells you 

how much you paid, to 
whom and on what date. 

You'll have a wealth of 
information at tax time. 

A checking account is a valuable 
asset .. . use it for all its worth. 

41•The -•• 
..15 es 

UNITED PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
9TH & AVE. D 	 CROSS PLAINS 

WORSHIP SERVICE     9:30 A.M. 
BIBLE CLASS    10:30 A.M. 

Rev. Henry Grubbs, Pastor 
Everyone Welcome 

Every Money Service 
You'll Ever Need! 

adwgirra. . CHECKING 
• CERTIFICATFS 
• SAVINGS ACCOUNTS 
• BUSINESS BANKING SERVICES 
• LOAN SERVICES/ALL KINDS 
• SAFE DEPOSIT BOXES 

YOU NAME IT! 
Member FDIC pW FORJK 

LENDER 

Living Water Ministries Fellowship 
Evangelical — Non-Denominational 

Charismatic 
Restoring And Equipping The Saints 

New Location—Highway 36 West 
Sunday Morning 10:00 a.m. 	 Thursday Ever wig 6.30 p m,  

For Information Call (817) 725-6800 
1-800-252-3629 

1 
Want To Write Your 

Erected Officials? 

Here are their addresses: 

Austin 
George Bush, Jr., Gover-

nor, Room 200, State Capitol, 
Austin, TX. 78711. 
Bill Sims, State Senator, 

District 25, P.O. Box 12068, 
Austin, TX, 78711. 

John Cook, State Represen-
tative, District 60, P.O. Box 
2910, Austin, TX. 78768-
2910. 

Washington 
Bill Clinton, President of the 

United States, The White 
House, Washington, D.C. 
20000. 

Charles Stenholm, Con-
gressman, 17th Texas District, 
1226 Longworth Office 
Building, Washington, D.C. 
20515. 
Phil Gramm, U.S. Senator, 

Room 370, Russell Building, 
Washington, D.C. 20510-
4302. 

Kay Bailey Hutchison,U.S. 
Senator, Room 703, Hart 
Building, Washington, D.C. 
20510-4301. 
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We are enjoying the pretty weather 
this fall. Hope we have a warm 
winter. 
The Quilting Club enjoyed the 

visitors who helped us quilt and 
those who come to visit us. Than 
Fore's brother and sister-in-law, Pau I 
and Juanita Harlow and Jean's sister 
Vi Harlow all from New Mexico. 
Juanita and Vi helped quilt. Billy 
Browning, also from Ncw Mexico 
came by for a while. She has been 
visiting Jean and James Alexander. 
They arc always welcome. 

Frankic and Oliver Smith are home 

from their vacation in Arkansas arid 
Missouri. They reported having a 
wonderful 

Novella Barton has had company, 
her son Cecil from Waco and a 
nephew. I lope we see her hack 
qiiilting with US soon. 

Glenda Phillips is home recovering 
from loot surgery she had in Lub-
bock. She has to stay off her foot for 
sonic time. 

Let's remember November 21st, it's 
the great "Smoke Out." It's also 
game night at Pioneer. 
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We arc all very excited! We got 
moved hack "home" and arc having 
very good attendance. Our Thanks-
giving dinner was a great success. 
\ 'any came that we had not seen for 
a long time and several came that had 
never been here before. We hope all 
will be back soon. Seemed that ev-
eryone enjoyed visiting. 

We arc glad to be hack in our own 
place. We appreciated the use of the 
Community Center during the hot 
summer. 
The beauty of nature and the out- 

side weather invites us out to ex-
plore. A nature trip is planned so that 
we may enjoy the many beautiful  
trees. 
Friday morning is bingo games 

again as \veil as card games and 
doinino games. It is good to get 
together and have fun. Come visit 
and enjoy being with friends and 
maybe make some new friends. 

Have a nice Thanksgiving and start 
getting ready for Christmas. 

BREAKTHRU 
By Bob Pipes, preacher 

Cross Plains Church of Christ 
433 N. Main At 12th 

(817) 725-6117 Bayer Motor Co. 
Cross Plains 

201 N. Main St. -:- Cross Plains, Texas 

Bus. (817) 725-6338 	 Res. (817) 725-6320 
DALE BISHOP — MANAGER-SALESMAN 

1990 Chevrolet 3/4 Ton 4x4 	 $12,500 
1991 Chevrolet S10 Pickup 	 $4,500 
1991 Ford Ranger Super Cab 	 $6,500 
1992 Chevrolet SWB 1/2 Ton 	$12,950 
1995 Buick LaSabre 	 $17,500 
1995 Chevrolet S10 Ext. Cab 	$13,995 
1994 Chevrolet Caprice 	 $14,000 
1988 Mercury Marquis 	 $6,000 
1992 Ford Crown Victoria 	 $10,500 
1989 Buick Park Avenue, 61k 	 $8,750 
1988 Ford Escort 4-door 	 $2,850 
1992 Chevrolet Astro Van 	 $12,500 

GMAC and Bank Finance available. 
We have more cars on our Comanche lot. If 
you don't see what you need, call and we 
can check over there. 27 do 

a 	 a -a -dE -a a n aanalLaLma a flan-nil 

f0 • 	MY:ITV:WC "vectnly 

yJ  

pumpkin flesh, 1 tsp. Curry powder, 
and 1/2 tsp. cumin. Bring to a boil 
with 3-14 1/2 oz. cans chicken broth, 
2 baking apples, peeled, cored and 
coarsely chopped. 1 carrot chopped, 
2 tsp. grated ginger root (or 1 Bp. 
powdered ginger). After bringing to 
a boil and reducing the heat, cover, 
and simmer for 10 to 12 minutes or til 
vegetables are tender. Cool slightly. 
Blend or process mixture, a third at a 
time, in a blender or food processor 
Ill smooth. Place pumpkin shell in a 
3 quart Casserole. If pumpkin is to be 
removed from the casserole before 
serving, line the casserole with a 
double thickness of heavy foil to help 
lift pumpkin later. Pour soup into 
shell, bake uncovered in a 375 de-
gree oven for 20 minutes. 

Meanwhile in a skillet cook 6 slices 
of bacon until crisp. Remove and 
drain bacon reserving 4 Tablespoons 
drippings in skillet. Cook 1/4 onion 
and 2 Tablespoons sugar in drip-
pings until onion is tender. Finely 
crumble bacon. Stir bacon and 1/2 
cup of croutons into the skillet. 
Sprinkle bacon mixture atop soup in 
pumpkin. Ladle soup into bowls to 
serve. Makes 8 to 10 side dish 
servings. (about 8 cups) 

Aren't the fall leaves lovely? Plus 
they're so colorful, the browns of all 
shades, and yellows, golds, yellow 
greens, bright greens, oranges, reds 
and burgundies and other colors and 
some in between hues. Just sets the 
scene for creating some Thanksgiv-
ing memories. 

As a small child about age 4 years 
we lived briefly in Fort Worth. My 
favorite fall activity at that time was 
to go down to the park and stomp 
ALL THROUGH the dried and 
drying leaves. I loved the crackly 
sensation and the beautiful crunchy 
sound the leaves made when I 
walked through them. I still love to 
walk through the crackly, crunchy, 
colored leaves these fifty some-odd 
years hence. It brings back memo-
ries and a mist of tears to my eyes for 
all those things that used to be and are 
no longer. But I'm most thankful that 
I can still walk through FALL 
LEAVES. 

We were saddened this week by the 
loss of Mr. Cole Tillotson, husband 
of Mrs. Helen Tillotson, a longtime 
member of our Garden Club. Our 
thoughts and prayers are with her and 
her family at this time. 

Every time you walk through those 
pretty, noisy, crunchy, crackling 
leaves, think of me, could be I just 
might "C" "U" THERE! 

Sabanno was Linda 
Norilla 	totiCht:d our lives 	it 
lilithOlow: and serious memories w 
w ill aka\ s 
Jere Cal law a) of Arlington \\ as 

here visiting with his father. Smoke).  
Callaway over the weekend. 

Santa Claus visited the Cotton-
wood Musical last Friday night. A 
sack of goodies were handed out to 
the children w ho visited the "jolly 
Guest" from the North Pole. With hi> 
hu>y schedule, Santa was getting an 
early start this season. 
The Cottonwood Quilting Club 

members' have finished their "Star 
Block" quilt for the Ben RiChey Boys 
Ranch Bene fit, which will K' held in 
February 1907. They will start on 
their 190'7benefit quiltsafterthe first 
of the sear. 

\lr. and Mrs. J Minty Stroud of  
Odessa were here v 	w ith his 
mother. NIrs. Isla Stroud and sister 
and Limit\ :Valium :mkt tern Brim n 
and Jason. 

kaniil 	and friends visiting vv rib 
you during the Thanksy king holi-
day'? Please call me with your ilivks 
items for the Cottonwood News 
Column. The column must be into 
the Review by Monday morning. 
December 1. Wishing everyone of 
you a very Happy Thanksgiving 
Day. Our cups runneth over with the 
many blessings God has bestowed 
upon us this past year. "'Whenever 
hands are clasped in Prayer, our 
Loving Lord is always there." 

The residents enjoyed some fine 
singing at their birthday party Tues-
day night. The Sound of Gospel 
group from Brownwood provided 
the music for us. Birthdays that were 
celebrated were Wonnie Walton, 
June Culvahouse, Myrtle Wilson, 
Myrtle Owen, Troy Tomlinson and 
Falba Shofner. Employees with 
birthday arc Becky Smith, Phyllis 
Pancake and Rena Robertson. Our 
wedding anniversaries arc Gaynelle 
Callaway, Verna Mathews, Lillie 
Alford and Joyce Cottrell. 
Falba Shofner sure looks pretty 

with her new perm. 
Minnie Swann was our winner fora 

free meal at Jack's Place. Thanks 
Wanda and Jack. 
Dorothy Welch from Fort Worth 

visited Leila Montgomery. 
Rolan Jones visited Troy 
Tomlinson, Hub Freeman, Callic 
Meador, Lorena Wright, Jo 
Boatright and Jake Green. 

Celia and Hubert Belew, Mable 
Halsell, Sue Neal, Misty Callaway 
and Stephanie Edington was here 
visiting everyone. 
Jan Baker from Burkett visited 

;ylvia Smith and others. Also vis- 

iting from 
Strickland. 

Jo Ann Elston from Lingleyille, 
Gloria Wagner from Stephenville 
and Reba Lane visited with Dixie 
Ingram. 

Kenneth and Nancy Felton from 
Weatherford visited Juanita 
Thornton. 

Activities during the week were: 
Monday: Bingo winners were 

Vera Bclyeu (2), Midge McCall, 
Ruby Harrell (2), Falba Shofner (2) 
and Dorothy Thomas (2). Exercise 
class. 

Tuesday: Art class. Popcorn and 
Skip-Bo games. 

Wednesday: Sing-a-long with 
Sister Ruby and Bobby Jack McCo-
wen, John and Irma Miller. 
Thursday: Bingo winners were 

Vera Belyeu (2), Dorothy Thomas, 
Genie Powell (2), Falba Shofncr, 
Minnie Swann, Sylvia Smith (2), 
Ruby Harrell and Allic Dickson. 
Skip-Bo games. 

Friday: Music with Bob Wallace. 
Sit-down-basketball. 

Sunday: Church of Christ. 
Love warms the Heart!! 

"FESTIVE FALL" 
Colorful Leaves, and Holiday 

Recipes 	 • 
Last weeks column contained a 

recipe for an appetizing but different 
roast turkey. This week I with to 
share with you my favorite fall des-
sert: HARVEST FRUIT PIE." Mix 
together and put in a pie crust 
(unbaked): 

3 Granny Smith apples, peeled and 
either finely chopped or sliced 

1 cup cranberries freshly washed 
and dc-stemmed. 

1 cup raisins (light or dark) or 1 cup 
crushed pineapple, drained 

1 cup sugar 
2/3  cup brown sugar 
1 tsp. cinnamon 
1/4 tsp. nutmeg and 3 Tablespoons 

flour 
2 Tablespoons butter, dabbed over 

fruit. Top with crust. Either cut a 
small two inch circle in the center of 
the top crust or cut 4 slits to let out 
steam. With a pastry brush or cheese 
cloth; and using either milk or melted 
butter, brush top crust evenly. Then 
sprinkle sugar and cinnamon over 
top crust. Bake at 400 degrees for 45 
minutes 	ENJOY! 

Suggested menu for Thanksgiving. 
Begin with Enticing Pumpkin Soup, 
then for your Entree', Herbed Dijon 
Turkey, apple-cranberry mold, po-
tatoes either Irish or sweet yams, 
zucchini with tomato sauce, rice 
stuffing and for dessert Harvest Fruit 
Pie. About 30 minutes before the 
meal, serve cranberry juice cocktail, 
chilled and with a twist of lemon or 
orange. After or with dessert serve 
hot coffee, if you wish to appear 
sophisticated, serve the coffee in 
demitasse cups. 

ENTICING PUMPKIN SOUP 
(a curried soup from pumpkin) 

Choose a round pumpkin with a flat 
bottom so it won't tip as you serve. 

With a large sharp knife, slice off 
the top fourth of the pumpkin and set 
aside. Scoop out seeds and stringy 
pulp. Replace top of pumpkin. Place 
pumpkin on a 15x10x1 inch baking 
pan. Bake in a 375 degree oven for 
50 to 60 minutes or until the pumpkin 
flesh can be scooped out easily. 
(Pumpkin will NOT be tender at this 
point). Cool slightly for easier han-
dling. Scoop out and reserve 
pumpkin flesh, leaving about 3/4 
inch thickness of flesh on pumpkin 
walls. Cut flesh into chunks (should 
have about 4 cups). Do not remove 
any flesh from bottom of shell. 
Discard pumpkin top. 

In a large pot combine the 4 cups 

In October a member of the Cot-
tonwood Baptist Church had a great 
idea of surprising the pastor. Rev. 
Knox Waggoner, w ith a 25th anni-
versary celebrating his 25 years of 
pastoring the church. The plans wer 
put into action, the date set and l'i-
nahied for No‘ ember 17  ‘‘ it h em-
phasis on a Thanksgi ing Day dinner 
follow ing the morning set-  \ ices. 
Unknow n to the coordinator. Norma 
Strahan, a second surprise apprecia-
tion award was given to her for her 
25th anniversary as pianist and mu-
sic director. Knox and Norma were 
presented with engraved watches 
commemorating the occasion by the 
members of the congregation. 

Guest attending the Thanksgiving 
dinner and the appreciation services 
at the Cottonwood Baptist Church on 
Sunday were Fern Lee and gouty 
Carver of Baird; Mrs. Randy shim) 
Trost, Ashley, Jami and Brandi of 
Lewisville; Mary and Pete Schulte of 
Brim nwood; Jerry Callaway of Ar-
lington; ROXann and Nichole Kru-
ger): of Eula; Jess and Hazel B ighee; 
Scott and Jacque Childress and 
Stephanie and T.W. and Colleen 
Anderson. We are all delighted and 
happy to see our pastors wife, 
Winona, was able to attend the din-
ner after her recent hip surgery in 
October. 

Lillie, Dillard, emceed the morning 
appreciation awards service. Guests 
and members of the congregation 
acknowledged how Knox and 

Attention Junior 
Livestock Show 
Association Adult 
Leaders 

	

The Callahan County Junior Live- 	Subject: Planning and begin new 
stock Show Association will meet renovation project. 

	

Saturday, November 23 at 8:30 p.m. 	Submitted by Rick J. Vestal 
at the sales arena in the county barn. 
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High Blood Pressure Risks 

Memory Loss 
Neglecting high blood pressure in midlife can result in 
memory loss in old age. "As blood pressure increases, so 
does the risk," says Lenore Launer author of the study in 
the Journal of the AMA. Hypertension is known to raise 
heart disease and stroke risk. Possible memory loss is 
another reason to control it. If you have high blood 
pressure make sure to take your medication. If you don't 
know if you have high blood pressure check with your 
doctor. 

Your better health is our concern. 

"Thanksgiving 
Celebration" 

By VICKY WORLEY NEAL DRUG 
PH. (817) 725-6424 

CROSS PLAINS, TEXAS 
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Arizona, Abilene, and Garland. 
Space doesn't allow for me to name 
names, hut our house was fulf!! 

Sister Ruby McCowen played the 
piano for us, it was just like old times. 
A big "Thank You" to everyone who 
shared good food and good fellow-
ship here at the center. Happy 
Thanksgiving everyone and God 
bless. 

Did anyone notice all the cars 
around the Senior Citizens Center 
last Thursday? We celebrated our 
Thanksgiving lunch with all the 
trimmings. Thanks to Don and 
Debbie Gosnel I along with several of 
the City Council and their spouses 
for attending. We had visitors from 

Christmas Tour 
of Homes is 
Main Topic of 
Discussion 

A social worker was visiting inmates of a penitentiary in an effort to rehabilitate, 
and noticing especially one bright-faced, honest-looking, young man who really 
seemed so out of place, she asked him, "Why were you sent here?" The prisoner 
replied, "Well,lwas accused of taking a very fine watch from the jewelry store where 
I worked. My lawyer put up a good fight -- had character witnesses .for me, 
presented evidence that I was not even at the store on the day the watch came up 
missing!" 
• "I don't understand,' said the social worker, "why did you get put into prison?" 

With somewhat reluctance, the prisoner replied, "My defense broke down when 
they found the watch in my pocket." 

That Ls pretty incriminating evidence, isn't it?" Almost as bad as getting caught 
with your hand in the cookie jar -- pretty hard to convince another you weren't going 
to snitch a cookie -- especially if you already have cookie crumbs on your face' 
Seems the best thing to do in cases like either of these is to admit wrong -- admit 
the truth -- and plead for mercy... 

But admitting wrong is one of the most difficult things to do. Everybody needs 
to be able to, however -- even learn how, if necessary -- and say "I'm sorry" and "I 
was wrong" when so. Husbands, wives, parents, children, bosses, employees, 
students, teachers, kids, grown-ups -- all of us do things wrong and make mistakes. 
and the one thing worse than making a.mistake is an unwillingness to be honest 
enough to admit it. 

Hayymuch different it would have been if Judas had been willing to repent. If only 
Sapphira had "fessed up" instead of continuing the lie. Acts 5:1-10. Jesus had a 
hard time getting Peter to say "I'm sorry" -- but what a great worker he became after 
doing so! The same is true about Paul. 
• The next time it seems easier to deny a mistake, check in your pocket and see 

if there's a "watch" there, then admit it, and grow from it by saying "I am wrong" and 
"I am sorry." 

kets for the '1 hanksgiving. season. 
We appreciate the scouts far a great 
canned food drive. 

Our guest for the evening were 
Amy Brown, Elizabeth Hunsaker, 
Kelly LaFoon and Kim Winfrey. 

Members present were Kathy 
Anderson, Sarah Brashcar, Debra 
Childers, Pam Cummings, Bobbie 
Johnston, Jody Finn, Judy Lutcr, 
Wanda Merryman, Nora Odom and 
Cathy Wood. 

Sunday Morning Bible Class ... 9 45 a.m 
Sunday Morning Worship . . . 10.45 a m 

Sunday E. ening Worship 	 6:00 p.m. 
Wed Eye.,:iing Bible Study 	 7:00 p.m. 

• lc Jesus 

Beta Sigma Phi met November 1 I, 
1996, in the home of Dora Smith 
with Nora Odom as hostess. 

Last minute details and final ar-
rangements are being made to assure 
that everything runs smoothly for 
our Christmas Tour of Homes to he 
held Saturday, December 7. Tickets 
were distributed toeach member and 
guest. Be sure to contact one of us for 
your tickets. 

we will be giving three food bas- 



CONGRATULATIONS BUFFALOES ON A GREAT SEASON 

• a. 

All athletic photos courtesy of 

Greg Turner. (4 — CROSS PLAINS REVIEW NOVEMBER 21, 1996) 

C.P. STUDENT REVIEW 

BIG BUFFS WARM UP BEFORE III-DISTRICT GAME AT COLF.NIAN 

BUFFALOES ENTER FIELD READY TO STOMP THE LONGHORNS 

Buffaloes 

INDIVIDUAL STATS 
Rushing yards—Jody Fortune 30-115; Scan 
Jones 9-29; Jarad Richards 7-28; Joseph 
Turner 2-4; Lcif Hunter 2.1 
Receiving yards—Joseph Turner 2-50; 
Dusty Hargrove 4-49; Benji Blackstock 1-24; 
Jeremy Bamctt 1-10 

Tackles Assists—Hugo Mauricio 7-5; Kevin 
Nickerson 5-0; Justin Hopkins 4-7; Scan 
Jones 4-3; Cory Switzer 3-1; Joseph Tumcr 3-
0; Porcious Potter 2-3; Mike McClure 2-2; 
Jeremy Pancake 2-1; Dusty Hargrove 1-1; 
Benji Switzer 0-1 

Events This Week 

Friday 
7:00 a.m. Buffalo Breakfast at 

Dairy Queen (everyone invited) 
3:10 p.m. Pcp Rally in Gym 

5:45 p.m. Caravan to Game (Meet 
in front of school) 

7:30 p.m. Buffaloes VS Moguls 
Area Championship Game 

State Playoff Long Sleeve T-
Shirts on Sale -- Limited number, 
first come - first serve, Cost $13.00 
each. Pick up at Citizens State 
Bank 

Winners of Football and Cow Patty Bingo Announced 

Joe E. Williams, of New Mexico, 
was named as the lucky winner of the 
Delon Sanders autographed football 
sponsored by the Cross Plains Ath-
letic Boosters. Mr. Williams name 
was drawn at halftime of the Baird 
vs. Cross Plains varsity football  

game. 
The Booster Club would like to 

express their appreciation to the 
Richeson Restaurants and Ophelia 
Merrill of Dairy Queen for providing 
the football. 

Greg Turner was the winner of the 
Cow Patty Bingo held on Saturday, 
November 9. The Booster Club 
would like to thank Joe and Jean 
McWilliams for providing "Bell" to 
make the choice of the winner. 
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OFFENSE IMPRESSIVE WHILE DEFENSE HOLDS BRONTE SCORELESS 

The Athletic Booster Club 
Wish To 

Congratulate The Buffaloes 
1996 

Bi-District Champions 

CP 12 Bronte 0 
PLAYERS 

2 - Joseph Turner 5 - Benji Blackstock 6 - Justin Hopkins 
7 - Jeremy Barnett 8 - Clint Bailey 10 - Jody Pancake 

11 - Coby Richards 15 - Matt McGowen 20 - Leif Hunter 
21 - Jarad Richards 22 - Kenny Calloway 24 - Sam Nixon 
32 - Jeremy Box 34 - Jody Fortune 44 - Kevin Nickerson 

46 - Sean Jones 50 - Hugo Mauricio 52 - Cory Switzer 
55 - Joseph Hopkins 59 - Carlton Thomas 60 - Nick Graves 
65 - Dusty Hinkle 66 - Jeremy Pancake 67 - Jaden Winfrey 

70 - Benji Switzer 73 - Porcious Potter 74 - Michael McClure 
77 - Jody Gosnell 80 - Dusty Hargrove 

86 - Kenneth Ratliff 88 - Zach Edington 

COACHES 
Cord Woerner, Mitchell Atchley, Lenny Jackson 

Bill Boyd, Mike Cavender, Mack McConal 

Area Playoff Game 
CP vs. Munday 

7:30 p.m. in 
Breckenridge 

STATE PLAYOFF 
Long sleeve T-shirts on Sale 

At Cost $13.00 Each 
Limited Supply 

1st come 1st serve 
Pickup at Citizens Slate Bank or 

City Hall 
BUFFALOES CELEBRATE VICTORY AS BI-DISTUICT CHAMPIONS 
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Girls Begin Basketball 
Season at Gorman 
The Cross Plains Lady Buffs Junior 

Varsity played their first game of the 
season at Gorman on Tuesday, No-
vember 12. Players include Dusty 
Henderson, Branch Richey, B.J. 
Reed, Shannadon Black, Brandy 
Hutton, LeaJean Wyatt, Tabby 
Clark, Jessica Childers, and Amanda 
Dillard. 

The J.V. Lady Buffs were defeated 
by the Lady Panthers with a final 
score of 23-15. Scorers for the night 
were Dillard leading with 6 points, 

Cross Plains 
Varsity Girls 
Begin Basketball 
Season 

\Vyatt with 4 points, Clark with 3 and 
Hutton with 2 points. 
On Saturday, November 16, the 

Lady Buffs traveled to Roscoe to 
face the Roscoe Plowgirls. The J.V, 
Lady Buffs lost this game also with a 
score of 43-26. 

Scorers were Richey leading with 5 
points, Dillard and Stephenson both 
with 4 points, Black, Hutton and 
Wyatt with 3 points and Beaty and 
Clark with 2 points each. NIEGAN KINBRIL & NATHANIEL swirl' 

...Region Band Tr\ outs In Abilene 

Cross Plains Jr. High 
Purple Team Season 
Starts Against May 

points, Laura Ricci 13 points, Nlindy 
Nlitchcll 4 points, Ashley Beggs 3 

points, Jolena Fleming 3 points, and 
Jaonna Harris 2 points. 

The Varsity Lady Buffs traveled to 
Roscoe on Saturday to play a tough 
defensive battle against the 

Plowgirls. Cross Plains lost 22-33. 
Scoring were Whitney Giles 8 

points, Amanda N1cGuire 6 points, 
Mindy Mitchell 5 points, Laura Ricci 
2 points and Jolena Fleming I point. 

The Lady Bulls played DeLeon on 

Tuesday 	Will travel to Leuders- 
A%occ.,  Saturday at 1:00 p.m. 

The Cross Plains Varsity girls 
played their first game against 
Gorman at Gorman on November 
12. 

Players include seniors, Crystal 
Davis, Nikki Beggs, Amanda 
McGuire, Jaonna Harris and 
Malyssa Sowell; junior Kimberly 
Ratliff; sophomores, Laura Ricci, 
Ashley Beggs, Mindy Mitchell, 
Whitney Giles and Jolcna Fleming. 

The Lady Buffs beat the Panthers 
66-49. Scorers were Malyssa Sowell 
with 26 points, Amanda McGuire 15 

Cross Plains 
Places 2 In Small 
Schools Region 
Band 

CP Freshman 
Girls Start 
Season With Win on tumary IS in Abilene, They 

competed against schools from all 
Over the Big Country including IA, 
2/1 and 	classifications such as 
Nlundav, Anson, I loliday, Iowa 
Park. Jackshoro and Wylie. 
Rand appreciates the el forts and ex-
tra time.retiired of them for a strong 
Ise rI °Finance. 

Congratulations are in order for 
Cross Plains Bandsmen Megan 
Kimmel and Nate Swift for Weir 
achievements at the Region Band 
Tryouts in Abilene at \\'t lie I ligh 
School Saturday. November 16. 
Both of these finenuesicianseanieda  
position in the Region Band \\ Inch 
Will perform at Cooper I I ighi School 

The Purple Team began the year 
with a victory against May Jr. High 
girls in May on November I1. 

The final score was 32-23. The 
girls that played on the team were 
Lacy O'Dell, Shena Thomas, 
Lindsey Barnett, Jennifer Turner, 
Sarah Nixon, Candice Bailey and 
Ashlee Hutchins. 

Racking up the points were Jen-
nifer Turner with 10 points; Candice 
Bailey 7 points; Lacy O'Dell 6 
points; Shona Thomas 5 points; and 
Lindsey Barnett 4 points. 

The purple team celebrated another 
victory in the Buffalo Dome. The 
purple team played against Brown-
wood Monday night. The final score 
was 36-7. 

Scoring for the team was Candice 
Bailey with 10 points; Jennifer 
Turner 8 points; Shena Thomas 7 
points; Sara Nixon 5 points; Lacy 
O'Dell 4 points; and Lindsey Barnett 
2 points. 

The purple team will be playing at 
Baird, Monday, November 25 at 
6:00 p.m. 

Cross Plains Jr. 
High Gold Team 
Wins First Game of 
Season 

Richardson 5 points; Nikki Bushnell 
4 points; Jodie Payne, Amber Taff 
and Vanessa Webb scoring 2 points 
each and Christy Beaty 1 point. 

On November 18, the Freshman 
girls faced Coleman and lost 41-13. 
Scoring the points were Ann 
Stephenson and Amber Taff with 4 
points each; Nikki Bushnell 3 points 
and Christy Beaty 2 points. 

The Freshman Tournament at 
Coleman on Saturday has been can-
celled by Coleman. 

The Cross Plains Freshman Girls 
began their season on November 11 
playing Brownwood at May. The 
Cross Plains Lady Buffs Freshman 
girls defeated Brownwood 26-12. 

Team members include Vanessa 
Webb, Ann Stephenson, Jodie 
Payne, Melinda Richardson, Mary 
Jo Nickerson, Stephanie Childress, 
April Potter, Amber Taff, Nikki 
Bushnell, Christy Beaty. 
Scoring points were Ann 

Stephenson with 10 points; Melinda 

PUBLIC FAX 
AT THE CROSS PLAINS REVIEW 

FAX # 1-817-725-7225 

CPISD Offers 
Gifted Education Medicaid 

On November 11, the gold team 
played May at May and won their 
game 12-8. 

Team members arc Toni Wyatt, 
Alisha Hail, Stehpanie Parker, Re-
becca Tennison, Erin Stephens, 
Jennifer Hartman, and Citanya 
Scott. Scoring points were Erin 
Stephens with 4 points, Becca 
Tennison 2 points and Jennifer 
Hartman 6 points. 

On November 18, they played 
Brownwood and defeated them 24-
14. Scoring the points were Rebecca 
Tennison with 10 points; Toni Wyatt 
4 points; Erin Stephens 4 points; 
Jennifer Hartman 2 points, 
Stephanie Parker 2 points, and 
Citanya Scott 2 points. 

They will play November 25 at 
Baird at 4:00 p.m. 

If you or your children arc Medicaid recipients age 21 or 
younger, you may be eligible for FREE DENTISTRY. 

Call Baird Family Dental Center - (915) 854-1173 

t. 

r 

Cross Plains 1SD conducts a pro-
gram for students with above aver-
age potential in academic and cre-
ative-productive thinking skills ar-
eas in K-12. This gifted education 
program is designed to challenge 
students to accelerate above and be-
yond the regular school curriculum. 

Anyone wishing to nominate a 
student for this program is encour-
aged to come by either the elemen-
tary or high school office and pick up 
a nomination form and a Parents 

Handbook for gifted education. 
Those students nominated will un-
dergo a screening process that re-
quires special testing. Parental per-
mission for this testing will be re-
quested at the time of nomination. 

Anyone wishing to know more 
about the identification process is 
also encouraged to come by the 
school offices and pick up the Parent 
Handbook. 

Parents are requested to make their 
nominations by December 1, 1996. 
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CORA SUS 

Cie Mks EXT. 	 21/1-456 

mote  	 IS4110 
Cald Ca Tdo 	 1.19 	339 
Twiny Beast & Him 	 2.0 
Vele Ddies 	 1.49119 
Turns  	 EN 	45 
inbetay &Mood & Cab 	 3.40 	3.39 
&day &eat  	 2.89 	339 
IDS 	 2A91St 
Ram Bat 	 15 	439 

HOT SUBS 
&sok & Cie 	 119 	439 

Roamed Chicken Bract Plka _-------------- 9.09 -539 

Board 
Of 	Snared In The 
Trustees Web of Texas 
Meet 	History 
Tonight 

Double Mat 	 LW 	2.00 
Add Bacon 	 50 	1.00 

DELI STYLE 

	 ) 

SCHOOL 
LUNCH MENU 

NOVEMBER 25 NOVEMBER 29 
(Subject to Change) 

BREAKFAST 
MONDAY -Cereal, toast, apple 

juice and milk. 
TUESDAY - Cinnamon rolls, 

orange juice and milk. 
WEDNESDAY - HOLIDAY 
THURSDAY - HOLIDAY 
FRIDAY -HOLIDAY 

LUNCH 
MONDAY -Corn clogs, chips, 

pork n' beans, pickle spear, orange 
sections and milk. 

TUESDAY - Pizza, salad, corn, 
Jello w/fruit and milk. 

WEDNESDAY - HOLIDAY 
THURSDAY - HOLIDAY 
FRIDAY - HOLIDAY 

BAND 
N EWS 

NOV. 22 - NOV. 28 
Nov. 23 - TMEA - District 

Band Clinic & Concert (ACU) 

Nov. 27-29 - THANKSGIV-

ING HOLIDAY"' 

k Unto 
Tsang Beast 	 139 	am 
Roe Dent 	 159 	339 
Hs•    139 	as 
&daps    119 	2.0 
Tao   159 	109 
&Sod & Crab  	 1.79 
"NA beisd beve& Mat weals miamibr sac I" need SnaJbr &A ssk. Al An 
asialsoble will par dot it Andra Ma, saes, as. ass Y *Mt 
Aire pawn, bona papa, Una .Ns. nit & page. Me spare am rape. 
Dew met mayo. isaal. spiry sett sea assay Ira amessahnoa & 
wan.. 

SALADS 
Weis Dela 	 2.09 
Tab" &east 	 3.09 
Tas - 109 
Seafood 	 329 
Subway Club 	 3.69 
Roomed Calms Bran Met 	 3.10 

DRINKS & MISCELLANEOUS 
Soft Maks &Ta 	 19 	 99 -1.07 

Pier. 
 

Dr. N, Dia Dr. ;ape, onnosaiar,7-eqs, Pad 
, Coffee 	 .ZS 

Codas-. 	 39. 	 3/1 00. - 12/3.79 

r rand basTsith-  -dots of pray, haa, kolegna.Wol, 	affingi. dr pirraa 

al Witt art skit 
"YOUR PARTY HEADQUARTERS° 

4 Pan Peaty && -------------_-- $03.93 
save 2043 thew 12 W. nada niggard 
3 Pam hey S -- 	 DOS 
isms 1042 ere 12 W. moat meant/ 
hey Phink 	 119.95
a 

 
re  1042 sibs  Rem 30 saw Jr. Debi Sanatielas er lawkag Sasidea: 

Naha in Sr* raged on • Parry They. 

10 am - 11 pm. Monday - Monday 
10 a.m -12 midnight hiday & Saturdr, 

11 tun. - 11 p.m. Sunday 

The Board of Trustees of the Cross 
Plains School District will hold their r 
regular meeting at 7:00 p.m. tonight 
at the Cross Plains High School 
Building, faculty work room. 

The following agenda will be dis-
cussed. 

1. PRAYER 
2. MINUTES 
3. OPEN FORUM 
4. "PARENT NIGHT" EXTRA-

CURRICULAR ACTIVITIES 
5. APPROVE AUDITOR FOR 

1996/97 SCHOOL YEAR 
6. APPROVE TEXTBOOK 

COMMITTEE 
7. REVIEW AEIS INDICATOR 

SYSTEM 
8. DEW BRE PROPERTY 
9. ACTION ON PERSONNEL 

RESIGNATIONS 
10. EXECUTIVE SESSION (IF 

NEEDED) 
I I. ArTION TO FOLLOW EX-

ECUTIVE SESSION (IF NEEDED) 
; 2. ADJOURN 
!.,Lk;k: Tennison, Superintendent 

AUSTIN-Just when people 
thought history is safely where it 
belongs-in the past-the Texas 
Historical Commission (THC) has 
launched into the future with the es-
tablishment of its official World 
Wide Web site. 

The THC's foray into the world of 
electronic communication promises 
to keep the attention of all who arc 
interested in Texas history-and 
even those who didn't know they 
Were. 

The web site offers a smorgasbord 
of timely historical information for 
everyone from the history bull to the 
chiold ho has a school report due: 
• the stories behind Texas' land-

mark county courthouses 
• developments in archeology 
• the state of the state's historical 

markers 
• "Texas Trivia"-those factoids 

everyone wants to know about 
Texas, including how it got its name 
• updates on special projects such 

as attic excavation of the 1686 ship-
wreck of French explorer La Salle 
• a comprehensive list of Texas 

museums and their exhibits 
• feature articles on preservation 

issues that affect all Texans. 

Planninv. a trip:' Point to die 
travel site to get a taste of Texas 
history. For example, click the icon 
fur the Texas post office mural, of 
the New Deal to discover beautiful 
images of Texas history in more than 
60 locations. Region by regions, this 
site provides little known informa-
tion on these community artworks. 
From there, the traveler can navigate 
to the slate's officail tourism site to 
learn more about events ;Ind sites of 
interest around the stale. 

A corner of the TI ICs site, called 
'Tun Stull," visits some of the more 
personal moments in history. 1 hi; 
month, the column takes a look at 

Amerca as seen from ilk: 
automobile. roadside architecture 
font the golden years of the auto-
mobile are fast disappearing, but 
there arc still some choice nostalgic 
holdouts on the trail. 

The THC's web site, or course, 
answers basic questions about the 
Texas Historical Commission--
what it does and how it can provide 
useful information and assistance to 
Texans. 
To access, point to http:// 

www.thc.state.tx.us. The rest is 
history. 

a 	-As a a aSSa IS as a a a a Sad a a 



By DEBORAH GRISWOLD 

ACU Alumnus From 
Cross Plains Honored 
At Homecoming 
Barbecue 

-1.4=Ortht4010 

HOME OF BOBBY & KIM WINFREY 
...In "Tour of Homes" December 7 

of 1998. Each academic department 
at ACU has a visiting committee of 
alumni who periodically review and 
offer guidance on improving pro-
grams. 

About 150 miles west of the Dallas/ 
Fort Worth area, ACU is affiliated 
with the churches of Christ and has 
an enrollment of 4,400 students. 
This year, U.S. News & World Re-
port ranked ACU as the No. 1 "Best 
Value" among universities in the 
western region based on academic 
quality, cost and availability of fi-
nancial aid. For information about 
ACU, call toll-free 1-800-460-6228 
or visit ACU's World-Wide Web 
home page at http://www.acu.edu. 

Keith Lawrence, a 1984 graduate 
of the Abilene Christian University 
Department of Agriculture and En-
vironment, received a Young Pro-
fessional Award at the department's 
Homecoming Reunion dinner. 

Keith is a family partner in the 
Lawrence Farm and Ranch Supply 
agricultural retail store in Cross 
Plains. He resides in Cross Plains 
with his wife, Leslie Wilson 
Lawrence, and their children, Kayla 
Denise and Riley Payton. 

Lawrence has served on the ACU 
Department of Agriculture and 
Environment's Visiting Committee 
since September 1995 and will con-
tinue to fill that position until August Bright Spot On Main 

Street in Christmas 
Tour of Homes 

GRAND OPENING AT FIRST MED—First Flight and T.O. Hendrick 
popular with local Kindergarten students and teachers. 

Troop #281 Pack 
Met Mon., Nov. 18 

Cub Scout Troop #281 held their 
monthly pack meeting on Monday, 
November 18 at the First United 
Methodist Church. 

The Tiger Cubs opened the meet-
ing with the Pledge of Allegiance. 
Following this awards were handed 
out. Those receiving awards were: 

Tiger Cubs - Tiger Cub Paws -
Scotty Johnson, Brett Wheeler, 
Markus Maxwell, Andrew Wheeler, 
Michael Curry, and Joey 
Westerman; Tiger Cub Totems -
Brett Wheeler, Andrew Wheeler, 
Michael Curry, Scotty Johnson, 
Louis Walker, Joey Westerman, and 
Markus Maxwell. 

Josh Nelson received the Scientist, 

Traveler and Compass Point pins. 
Marcus Williams received his 

Craftsman, Readyman, Naturalist, 
Scientist, Sportsman and Compass 
Point pins. 
Jonathan Nelson and William 

Meador both received their Bobcat 
Badge. 

The next pack meeting will be held 
December 16, at 6:30 p.m. This will 
be the annual Cub Scout Dinner. 
Everyone is asked to please bring a 

salad or dessert. 
The Wolf Cubs entertained us with 

a song to end our program. 
Everyone is invited to attend these 

den meetings are more than welcome 
to do so and see what lies in store for 
our youth as they climb thc ladder in 
scouting. 

TAKING A CLOSER LOOK—First Flight R.N. gives students a tour of 
the emergency helicopter. Smokeout Is Today 

Main Street in Cross Plains re-
ceived a beauty mark about 10 
months ago when Bobby and Kim 
Winfrey bought what was known in 
the twenties as the Dr. Linley House. 

Their home will be featured in the 
Beta Sigma Phi Christmas tour of 
Homes which will be held on De-
cember 7 from 5-8 p.m. 

Bobby and Kim painted the outside 
a cream yellows and forest green that 
makes a wonderful combination 
which adds the interest of color 
without being overwhelming. They 
also added a sidewalk and poured a 
drive. With the addition of planting 
bushes and flowers, the house really 
stands out as one of the most attrac-
tive on Main Street. 

The inside had a face lift, too. They 
laid new flooring in all the rooms, 
painted walls and cabinets and in-
stalled central air. The decor is clean 
and crisp with a mood of comfort and 
relaxation. 

Dr. Linley used the room that is 
now the Master Bedroom as his of-
fice. During the late 20's and early 
30's Martin and Lucy Baum Neeb 
and their four daughters lived in the 
house. 

23%) since the first year of the 
American Cancer Society's Great 
American Smokeout in 1977. 

Smokers that have quit in one of 
the past 20 Great American 
Smokeout celebrations are 
encouraged to join the American 
Cancer Society in its commitment 
to a smoke free environment. 

CC); 
1/4 	- 

„I,  

Ground Hog Day is based on a custom that people from Germany 
and Great Britain brought to America. 

Since the inception of the Great 
American Smokeout in 1977, the 
American Cancer Society has 
helped millions of smokers quit for 
good. Organizers are in search of 
these individuals who are willing to 
share their story for the 20th 
anniversary of this lifesaving 
event, November 21, 1996. By 
calling the American Cancer 
Society at 1-800-ACS-2345, ex-
smokers can share their stories of 
quitting - the crazier the better. Or 
call the ACS District Office at 692-
6446. You will become an 
honorary Great American 
Smokeout ex-smoker and may be 
asked to participate in a media 
event, assist in encouraging kids to 
never start, or to help others trying 
to quit in your community. 

This event proves to smokers if 
they can quit one day, they can 
quit for good. The smoking rate of 
American adults has dropped from 
36% to 25% (in Texas, it's down to 

Martin Neeb was the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Neeb who were early 
German settlers on Turkey Creek. 
Martin ran a feed store and was very 
active in civic affairs. He served as 
Mayor of Cross Plains for a number 
of years. 

Lucy kept her guest room which is 
now the Master Bedroom, rented 
usually to teachers. She served them 
delicious meals, family style. 

John Ford and his wife Ream 
Beeler Ford bought and lived in the 
house and later sold it to Mrs. Allen 
From Rising Star who used it as a 
rent house. 

Alan and Johnnie Bland bought 
and lived in the house before selling 
it to Bobby and Kim Winfrey. With 
all it's history and charm this is a 
must see on the tour. 

Tickets for the tour will be $5 for 
adults while children age 12 and 
under free. The price of the ticket 
will include all 5 homes and may be 
purchased at the door or from any 
Bela Sigma Phi member. Rides will 
be available for, those in need of 
transportation. Watch future issues 
of the Cross Plains Review for in-
formation about other homes on the 
tour. 

Food at Holiday 
Market at the 
Hilton 

Where Can I Get 
a Flu Shot? 

For a very special treat at the Hilton 
Holiday Market this year, Mrs. Joyce 
Berry will operate the food booth. 
Saturday morning she will have 
breakfast burritos ($1.50 each) and 
homemade sweet rolls ($1.00 each). 
For lunch she offers a choice of 
chuck wagon beans or stew with 
cornbread for $2.50 bowl. Ham and 
cheese or chicken salad sandwiches 
will be available for $2.50 each. 

The dessert will be Italian creme 
cake, German chocolate cake, as-
sorted sweets, and brownies. 

O 

t 

The Sunday plate lunch will be 
Barbecue beef, potato salad and 
greed beans with rolls for $3.50. 
There will also be sandwiches and 
assorted sweets. 

Not only can you come and enjoy 
all these delicious foods, but Joyce 
will be having a "Bake" Sale on both 
days. This would be a great oppor-
tunity to buy your Thanksgiving 
dessert. Don't forget the dates, Sat-
urday and Sunday, November 23 and 
24 at the Hilton Community Center. 
See You There! 

YEAR END 
CLEARANCE SALE 

All Cars Below Wholesale 705 East Central Comanche, Texas 

Bruton Sales 
Help is Just a Call Away. 
SAME DAY APPOINTMENTS ALWAYS AVAILABLE 

7254047  

Ph. 915-356-3455 	Fax 915-356-7177 	Mobile 817-842-7344 
1995 Ford Taurus, lilt, cruise,stero, windows, locks & dark green in color 	 $7,995 
1995 Ford Taurus, tilt, cruise, stero, windows, locks & white in color 	 $9,500 
1995 Pontiac GrandAM, loaded, 4-door, red 	 $9,500 
1991 Ford Thunderbird, red, loaded, electric scats, all the extras 	 $5,950 
1992 Jeep Comanche Pickup, automatic, stero, ONE OWNER, red in color nice, nice truck 	$6,000 
1993 Ford Taurus, beautiful car, red, and ready 	 $6,500 
1994 Chevrolet, Z-71, Extended Cab, 4-Wheel Drive, Silverado, bucket scats, windows, locks, tilt, cruise 
	 $15,900 

1993 Chevrolet Silverado, automatic windows, locks, tilt, cruise, stew, V-8 350 	 $10,900 
1993 Chevrolet Suburban, beautiful ONE OWNER, hard, loaded conversion, 4 bucket seats, wood, radar 
detector, all the extras 	 $18,500 
1992 GMC Sonoma, nice truck 	 $4,500 
1991 Mercury Cougar XR-7, loaded and beautiful 	 $6,900 
1993 Pontiac Bonneville, loaded, silver ............................... 	 $7,900 

....... ......................... $2,500 First-tiled 
OF CROSS PLAINS 
A Service of Hendrick Medical Center 

41641 Main Street 

YAppointments For: 
Acute Illness 

Chronic Illness 

Immunizations 

Sports Physicals 

Injuries 

1We Welcome: 
Medicare 

Medicaid 

Blue Cross/Blue Shield 

Bank. Cards Open when you need us most 8:00am- 5:00pm 

33-ht 

19/0 Ford Taurus, cheap car 	 
1986 Ford XLT 3/4 ton, automatic, 6.9 diesel, nice truck, ................ 	 $4,900 
1992 Ford Tempo GL, automatic, 2-door black ............................................................. ............ . ........ $4,900 
1993 Chevrolet Cavalier, 2-door automatic, hard, loaded ................ .   .......$6,900 
1995 Polaris Jet Ski 750 	 $46,95000  
1996 780 Polaris Jet Ski, warranty until August of 1997 ................................... .............. 	$5,900 
1995 Layton 29 Foot Travel Trailer, used 3 times, all options 	 t  	$11,500 
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CLASSIFIED ADS 

(817) 725-6111 

REAL ESTATE FOR SALE 

INSERTION 
DEADLINES: 

NOON 
TUESDAY 

CLASSIFIED RATES: 
$3.00 For the first 20 

words. Additional 
words 20e each. 

118 ACRES NORTHWEST OF 
CROSS PLAINS—very nice 3 bed-
room home, pool, second smaller 
house, large metal barn with office 
and shop, 3 water wells, Coastal, Tur-
key Creek, livcoak, postoak, GAME, 
owner financing, S270,000, COULD 
DIVIDE, home and 5 acres 

Allen Real Estate 
(915) 698-4600 - office 
(915) 675-0522 - home 

PUBLIC FAX 
AT THE 
CRASS 
PLAINS 
REVIEW 

NOTICE OF SEALED BIDS 
The City of Cross Plains is accepting 
scaled bids for the installation of a 
mewl roof approximately I 201 \60' to 
he installed over an existing asphalt 
fool with all gutterine, and (lashing 
provided. This roof is located at I OS 
N. Main at the Senior Citizens 
Building. Bid sheets and specifica-
tions can he requested by contacting 
City Hall, P.O. Box 129, Cross Plains, 
TX 76443 or calling (817) 725-6114. 
Deadline, 	for accepting bids will be 
5:(X) p.m. Monday, December 2,1996. 
n.3 

 

BUSINESS SERVICES ( HELP WANTED 

HELP WANTED—Part-time help, 
must bc 18, morningsand somenights; 
schedule negotiable, apply at Pizza 
Pro inside Skinny's. 32.3tc 

CARPET CLEANED 
AND SOLD 

Commercial/Residential. Free esti-
mates. Scotch Guarding Available. 
Carpet sold, repaired, installed. New 
or used. DUB MEADOR (817)725-
7720. 18-tic 

:91fc SHOP FOR CHRISTMAS—Sec 
the selections of wall hangings and 
baskets at VV'S CREATIONS lo-
cated in Crafter's Corner at Koenig's 
Family Store. GREAT PRICES! 

NEW-16' wide, 2 br. delivered and 
set-up, S152/mo., 1-800-460-3537 
5% dn., 300 mos, 11.75% APR 33-5 

GIRLING HEALTH CARE, 
INC.—Home Care Attendants 
needed in Cross Plains and sur-
rounding areas to help with house-
keeping and personal care. For more 
information call 1-800-665-4471. 33- 

REDUCED 
Doublcwide 28x70 4/2 

5361/mo 1-800-460-3537 
5% dn., 360 mos., 11% APR 33.5  

FOR SALE-6 squares of cedar 
shake shinglcs,S250 (817)725-6412. 
34-1 tc JONES 

REAL ESTATE 
97.25 ac. with extra nice 2 

bdrm. 2 bath brick home.. North 
of Cross Plainson Highway 880. 

2 bdrm. home on corner lot. 
Rental pmpenies: 2 efficiency 

apartments with garages and 1 
hdrm, home. Great Invest-
ment! 

NEW LISTING-24.92 ac. 
good fences with cross fence. 
Has some Coastal and stock 
tanks. Great place to hunt or 
raise cattle. 

NEW LISTING — Cotton-
wkxxl area; Exceptional 3 bed-
room, 2 1/2 bath on 7 acres, w/ 
large barn and corrals. Beautiful 
view, goal water. 

Super nice 3 bedroom, 2 1/2 
bath, brick home, (all electric) 
on 8.73 acres, 3 water wells, 4 
storage buildings, tractor 
shed, orchard, excellent loca-
tion, REDUCED. 

25.31 a 
ter well MOM

/arca, wa-

m°bCOrRACT 

ith older 

3 vacant ots in city limits with 
nice new home construction 
nearby. 
RestoRUNDERy country 

home located on 4 acres in Cot- 

WATER SYSTEMS 
Construction and Maintenance 

call 
Roger Crawford 

(817) 725-7219 or 725-7513. v3-ac 

WILL DO TYPING OF ANY 
KIND—Resumes, Term Papers, 
Business Letters, etc. Contact 
Deborah at The Cross Plains Review 
or call 817-725-6111 before 5 p.m. 

LIBRARY BAKE SALE 
Wednesday, November 27, 8 a.m. at 
the Cross Plains Public Library. 
Cakes, pies, cookies, candy, breads, 
etc. will be available for your 
Thankgiving sweet tooth. 34.iic 

r 
ADVERTISE 

IN THE 
CROSS PLAINS 

REVIEW 

$24,500-3 bedroom, 1 bath on Av-
enue D, new carpet, new paint, wood 
deck, roof will be replaced, owner 
finance S311,000 down, 10% interest, 
10 years, call Tootle Kelly Real Es-
tate (915) 784-5270. 

3tc 

AVON—Build Home Business! No 
Minimum Orders or Inventory Re-
quired, IND/SALES/REP, 1-800-
236-0041. 33-4tp 

FOR SALE-27 inch console TV, 
dinette set w/6 chairs, wardrobe, and 
swing set, call (817) 725-6842 or 
(817) 725-7583. 34- I tc 

FOR SALE—Older house, 3 bdrm. 
1 bath, living room, dining room, and 
kitchen, 2 large lots, 7 pecan trees, 
part of house needs some work, 2 out 
buildings, will sell for S4,000, you 
pay taxes owed, 1495 Ave. A, call 
(817) 939-6659. 33-4tc 
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MIDDLETON WATER WELL 
SERVICE 

Complete Pump Service & Sales 
24 Hour Service 

(817) 643-3701 

NOW SELLING AVON PROD-
UCTS—Call Dorothy Mosley (817) 
725-7296. 33-tfc-Jan 1 

Supplement your retirement. Let 
David Holmes rent/lease your land 
today. 100 to 500+ acres. Paying up 
to S30 per acre for good Coastal in 
Cross Plains area. Call (817) 725-
7141. 34.cow.c 

42-tic 
FOR SALE—U.C. dishwasher, ex-
ercise equipment, Singer vacuum 
cleaner, sofa with chair, call (817)725-
6524 or 725-6778. 34-1tp 

97 ACRES SW EASTLAND 
COUNTY—located off FM 569, on 
228, part cultivation, oaks, pecans, 
barns, tanks, irrigation wells, 1/2 
minerals, owner finance $66,000 
Broker (915) 263-1134. 34-2cp 

PLUMBING-35 years master 
plumber; commercial; plumbing re-
pair; new construction; water pump 
repair; call (817) 725-6731, after 6 
p.m. or before 8 a M . 30-tfc 

FOR SALE REGISTERED CHIHAUHAU 
PUPPIES FOR SALE—S150 each, 
evenings or weekends call (817) 725-
6687. 34-1 tc 

WATER CONDITIONING-NO 
SALT—Chemical free - new tech-
nology satisfaction guaranteed - call 
for free information (817) 725-6565. 

FOR ALL YOUR MARY KAY 
PRODUCTS—Call Paunieec 
Oglesby, (817) 725-6772. Complete 
product line in stock. Free delivery, 
Gift Wrapping. 32..tr. 

CARD OF THANKS 
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ORNATE BEDROOM SUIT—
with long mirror, like new, $440, call 
(817) 725-7235 after 5 p.m. 34-It. 

Card Of Thanks 
The Athletic Booster Club wouldlikc 
to express our appreciation to the la-
dies who were willing to provide cakes 
for halftime of the home football 
games this season. Peggy Brame did 
an excellent job of organizing this 
project. We also want to thank Bobby 
and Thomas Bomar for running the 
chain gang all season. We appreciate 
your dependability. 

30-tfc 

WANTED—Will do your Holiday 
Gift Wrapping, call Sharolyn Walker 
(817) 725-7739 after 3 p.m. 34-it, 

HOUSEKEEPING 	JOBS 
WANTED—For more information, 
call Melinda Hinkle at (817) 725-
6812, if no answer please leave mcs- 

MARCIEL—will have some neat 
things for your Christmas shopping 
on Friday and Saturday, after 
Thanksgiving at 701 South Main, 
including a limb chipper, 50's bed-
room suit, Singer treadle sewing 
machine, etc. 34-1t. 

MONUMENTS AND MEMORI-
ALS—Cliff Kirkham is agent for 
Riley-Gardener Monument Service 
of Hamilton, Texas for the Cross 
Plains area. Contact Cliff Kirkham 
for complete information on quality 
monuments. Call (817) 725-6500. 
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toncIONTRACT sage. 32-41, 
LOTS OF OLD ITEMS—at the 
Home Sweet Home Antique Shops 
- East Highway 36. 34-1tc 

50-tfc 4 vacant lots in new home 
construction area. 

2 bedroom fixer-upper on cor-
ner of Ave. C and 7th, also travel 
trailer. 

NEW CARPET - PAINT, 3 
Bedroom, 1 bath house on cor-
ner of 10th and Ave. F. Owner-
agent. 

LEVI STRAUSS HENLEY 
SHIRTS-100% cotton, seven col-
ors,M,L,XL, 519.99, Johnson's Dry 
Good,CrossPlains,(817)725-6211. 

T 	DRAIN & SEWEF7 

PLUMBING REPAIR 
REPAIR 

C & C ENTERPRISE
BENNY 

 

(817) 725-6200 or 
(817) 725-7545  

AVON 
REPRESENTATIVE 

Call Dee Harrell 
For All Your Avon Needs 

(817) 

725-7120 
taiwanar- 

MAC'S TRADING POST—(817) 
725-6780—on Highway 36,2 blocks 
W. of red light, gas and electric space 
heaters, cookstoves, washing ma-
chine, refrigerators, freezer, dinette 
sets, chairs, swivel chairs, phones, 
TV's, refrigerated air conditioners, 
combination hot/cold window units, 
bars, beds, chest of drawers, tractors, 
tractor equipment, tractor parts, cars, 
much more, Come Look! 33-2tc 

For Fast Results 
Look To The 
Cross Plains 

Review Classifieds 

REED CONSTRUCTION 
Remodeling, Carpentry, Portable Welding 

Rusty Reed 
(817) 725-7363 

32-1 tc-D 
U 
U 
I 

I 
I 

I 

FOR SALE—Set of golf clubs, list 
for $460, will take S180. What a good 
Christmas present! Call (817) 725-
6853 or see Ray Parrish. 34-tr. 

("/ 

▪ • IN No am mme NI 
JOHNNIE BLAND 

(817) 725-6293 

SANDRA JONES 
(817) 725-7640 

or 
DIANNE HAIL 
(817) 725-7317 

Cross Plains, Tx:1 "` 
sma6 

iersarmansairamranartxxxxxxinswirsoi 
EXPERT BODY WORK AND PAINTING 

BARRETT BODY SHOP 
CLAUDE CHAMPION, OWNER mill We Specialize In 

01FOREIGN CARS & 	915-677-2924 	214 N. LEGGETT 
)(LUXURY CARS 	 ABILENE, TX. 79603M 
s24 HR. WRECKER SERVICE 	 915-6724064 
azzaiiikazzawaincxxxxxxxxxxxxintaitassarnal 

QUAIL FOR SALE—$2.00 each, 
Rolan Jones (817) 725-7640. 27.81p 

JOHN DEERE TRACTORS 
NEW AND USED 

PEANUT EQUIPMENT 
LILLISTON-KMC 

PLANTERS-DISKS-DRILLS 
ROLLING CULTIVATORS 

CHISELS 

RISING STAR 
NURSING CENTER 
Has Vacancies Available For 

Both Male and Female 
Residents 

Private Or Semi-Private Rooms 
Are Available 

Call ‘817) 643-2691 Or Come By 
And Visit At 411 South Miller 

In Rising Star 	4641.c  

SELL OR TRADE 
CLARK TRACTOR & SUPPLY, INC. 

DELEON — (817) 893-2061 
COMANCHE — (915) 356-2593 

WHERE YOUR BUSINESS 
IS APPRECIATED 

I)ORA SMITH 
Real Estate Broker 

(817) 725-6489 

NORA ODOM 
(817) 725-6840 

BUSINESS & PROFESSIONAL 

DIRECTORY 
Fairbanks Morse Water Systems 

Complete Systems Sold And Installed 

Buddy's Plumbing 
Rising Star, Tx. 	5 "` 	(817) 643-7312 

* 237 ACS., 70 acs. cultiva-
tion, good pasture, trees, 3 
tanks, Wale( wells, GREAT 
MINTING! 
* LOVELY HOME, 1,750 

sq. ft. on 3 acs., picturesque 
setting, large trees, water well. 
* GREAT LOCATION 

Nice frame house, large corner 
lot, detached apartment, 
GREAT Bur!  

* NEW LISTING 3 bon., I 
bath, brick, woodhurning 
stove, fenced, carport, 
waterwell, George Scott Si. 
GREAT BUY!! 
* Business opporninily, 

former Buy-Bile, 1461(1111g 
equip., I I/2 Ions N. Main. 
* 14EDUCED4 brm., 2 bath, 

Formal dining, large corner 
EXTRA'S Cypress Street. 
* 4 brm., 2 bath, brick, formal 

dining, 2 car garage, on 2 lots, 
GREAT BUY!! 
* 3 brm., 2 bath, on two large 

lots, storage, carport, fenced. 
* 145 ac. Coastal, spring led 

creek, Eastland Co. 
* 246 AC., 2 brim, I bath 

house, garage, 8 equipped irri-
eation wells, orchards, barn 
and pens, mixture of cultiva-
tion, grass and light woods. 
* Tire/auto service, metal 

building, equipment, inven-
tory, 1 3/4 ac. owner I nanc i rn&. 
S25,000 

AUTOWIRE 1  Hair Country 
47e  Salon 
'4' 601 E. 9lh 

Advertise 
Your 

Business 
Here 
Call 

(817) 725-6111 
For information 

Get those troublesome wir-
ing problems fixed on your 
pickup, trailer, RV, car, 
tractor or accessories. 

Do It Once 

Do It Right! 
AUTOWIRE comes to you! 

(817) 725-6255,,r, 

Cross Plains 

Tuesday - Saturday 

Walk-ins Welcome!! 

BI-RITE AUTO (817) 725-6826 
PHONE (817) 725-7361 	 4 BLOCKS E. OF LIGHT 

CROSS PLAINS, TEXAS 76443 

BUGBUSTER S—usan J. Schaefer 
C.P.A. CARS VANS - SUBURBANS 

Pest 
Control Accounting & 

Tax 
Service 

1998 LINCOLN TOWN CAR, IN GOOD CONDITION 	 $2,750 
1985 LINCOLN CONTINENTAL, RUNS AND LOOKS GOOD 	 $1,575 
1988 FORD ESCORT, 4-DOOR 	  5995 
1985 OLDSMOBILE, 2-DOOR 	   $695 
1988 CHEVROLET 4-DR. CAPRICE, LOOKS 8 RUNS GOOD 	$1,650 
1985 LINCOLN TOWN CAR, SIGNATURE SERIES. FULLY LOADED 
	 WAS $1,950 NOW ONLY $1,750 

1984 DODGE DATONA, TURBO ENGINE, NEW RED PAINT 	 $1,350 
1983 CADILLAC FLEETWOOD, GOOD LEATHER INTERIOR, RUNS GOOD$795 
1982 CHEV. DIESEL SLIVERADO SUBURBAN, RUNS VERY GOOD, NEW BLUE 
AND WHITE PAINT, TOWING PACKAGE 	 $1,950 
1982 CHEV. MONTE CARLO, IN GOOD CONDITION 	 $895 

Prompt & Dependable 
Title & Abstract Service 
Tom Walker, Manager 

(817) 725-6740 
1-800-605-PEST 

9th & Main 
Cross Plains 

Phone: 725-6747 
TERRY HARRIS 
HC 86, BOX 65 

BAIRD, TX. 79504 

SOME FINANCING AVAILABLE IF YOU HAVE JOB 
New Tires 	Used Tires 

Advertise 
Your 

Business 
Here 
Call 

(817) 725-6111 
For information 

REGISTERED 
PROFESSIONAL 

LAND SURVEYOR 

GAS Fe DIESEL PICKUPS 
1983 FORD F-150 SUPERCAB V-8, AUTOMATIC 	 $1,750 
1984 FORD F•350 DIESEL DUALLY, IN VERY GOOD CONDITION 4-SPEED W 22 
SPEED OVER 8. UNDER DRIVE AUXILLARY NEW PAINT 	 $4,250 
1985 FORD DIESEL, DUAL REARS, FLAT BED, COLD AIR, NEW PAINT $2,950 
3 OTHER FORD DIESELS, 2 WITH NEW PAINT......................$2,750   & UP 
1985 FORD F-350, V-B, AUTOMATIC, NEW PAINT, STEEL FLAT BED 	. 52,250 

T & K TIRE 
& ALIGNMENT 

Highway 36 North 
Cross Plains, Texas 76443 

(817) 725-6223 
Tractor or Truck Tires 
Front-End Alignment 

Brakes 

JOHN D. BURLESON 
P.O. BOX 365 

CROSS PLAINS 
(817) 725-6485 

TELL US WHAT YOU WANT, WE'LL TRY TO CET IT FOR YOU 
OPEN WEDNESDAY SATURDAY 9-5 

OPEN MONDAY & TUESDAY 9-2 
CLOSED THURSDAY & FRIDAY 

WE BUY COOD CARS, PICKUPS, VANS, FTC. 34.1TC 

as 
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West Texas Utilities Company 
A Central and South West Company 

Abilene 1'915) 674-7466 San Angelo 015) 657-2731 Marla 1915)1294329 Childless (817) 937-8221 

4 

Take charge of your life! 
Find out about the New Laser PRK 

Correction for Nearsightedness! 

PRK (PhotoRefractive Keratectomy) is 
an advanced eye procedure, using an 
Excimer Laser to correct nearsightedness, 
that can reduce your dependency on glasses 
or contacts. To learn more about this 
procedure or to reserve a seat at one of our 
FREE informational seminars call: 
(915) 695-2020. 

ATTEND A FREE PRK SEMINAR 
Talk with PBX patients and meet the doctors. 

Time: 6:00 p.m., Tuesday, December 3rd 
Place: Texas Room •Maner Memorial Libraty• Cisco Junior College 

Call 695-2020 to reserve your seat today 
•In conjunction with CJC Continuing education• 

ABILENE EYE INSTITUTE 
EXCIMER 

LASER CENTER 

Robert W. Cameron, M.D. • Paul B. Thames, M.D. • Mark J. Phelan, M.D. • Kerry C. Preston, O.D. 
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HAPPY BIRTHDAY 
Internet & World 
Wide Web 
Available 
Locally 

Would you like to have access to 
Internet and NVorld Wide Web? 
Now is the time? If you have a 
computer with Windows 95 or Win-
dows 3.1 all you have to do is sigh up. 
No long distance or 800 numbers to 
call, unlimited access, and very af-
fordable rates! 

Coleman County Telecommunica-
tions Company, Inc. is doing busi-
ness as Web-Access. Net is a sub-
sidiary of Coleman County Tele-
phone Co-Op. The co-op has been in 
business in Coleman County since 
1954. They are home owned and 
operated. Web-Access Net has been 
in business since February of 1996 
and has already surpassed their 
growth expectations. They are lo-
cated at 801 Wallis Avenue, P. 0. 
Box 579, Santa Anna, Texas 76878. 
Telephone numbers are 1-800-439-
1723 or (915) 348-9295. 

Free Internet and Worldwide Web 
service has been offered to Cross 
Plains I.S.D. and the Cross Plains 
Public Library complimentary of 
Coleman County Telecommunica-
tions. 

Local agents arc Vanda King and 

Deborah Griswold at the Cross Plains 
Review, 116 East 8th Street. You 
may call (817) 725-6111 for details. 
Stop by the local office and sign a 
contract and receive your software 
during regular business hours of 9:00 
a.m. and 5:00 p.m. Monday through 
Friday. 

CJC Band & 
Wrangler Belles 
Preparing To 
Represent Texas 

The Cisco Junior College Band and 
Wrangler Belles are preparing to 
represent the State of Texas for an 
unprecedented seventh appearance 
in the Macy*s Thanksgiving Day 
Parade which will be telecast by 
NBC on Thanksgiving morning. 

The first appearance in the Macy*s 
parade was 1971. The Band and 
Belles also appeared in 1973, 1977, 
1981, 1984 and 1990. 

There will be thirty-five Belles and 
thirty-seven band members making 
the trip. A support group of one 
hundred, one people will be making 
the trip thong with the Band and 
Belles. 

Be sure to tune in to NBC on 
Thanksgiving morning and watch 
this outstanding group perform. 

NOVEMBER 23 
Mrs. Clarence Region 
Bess Coppinger 
Mary Diane Nunn 
Myrtle Wilson 
Betty (Purvis) Prall 
Russell Thomas 
Barbara Jean Walker 
Brenda Walker 
Jewel Hutchins 
Becky Coppinger 
John V. Hanke 
James Hen nesay 

NOVEMBER 22 
James Henry Nelson 
Clark Don !laugh 
Nicky Hal Harris 
Jimmy Baum 
Ophelia Merrill 
Dick Thrasher 
,Jennifer Young 

NOVEMBER 26 
Jimmy McNutt 
Margaret Jordan 
Carolyn Jean White 
Mrs. Scot Edington 
Teresa Ann Taff 
Jeanne Wagner 
Joyce Klingberg 
Marcus Walton Williams 
Kaci Duke 
Norma Coble 
Andy Anderson 

NOVEMBER 27 
Mrs. Lawrence Lee 
Dr. Weldon Newton 
Morris Belew 
Sue (Gardner) Hines 
J. B. Strength 
Mrs. Hester Sullens 
Bill Cohn 
Garry Smoot 
Paul Matthew Sowell 
Emma Lou Corley 
Dale Porter 
Darrel Chastain 

NOVEMBER 28 
Eddie Flip pin 
Joan Brown 
Mrs. Ray Fletcher 
Jody Brown 
Mrs. Kenneth McPherson 
Cady Miranda Taylor 
Drue Evans 
Mary Penninger 
Sean Alan Branham 
Perry Neal Clyatt 
Robert Lawrence 
Poneta Thate 

NOVEMBER 24 
Linda Strength 
Lee Reynolds 
Junior Hilburn 
Debbie (Cavanaugh) Waggoner 

NOVEMBER 25 
Coby Ryan Richards 
Bill Hester 
Ricky Wheeler 
Eugene Wilcoxen 
Paul Whitton, Jr. 
Leo Franke 
Connie G. Griffith 
Joan Hamrick 
Anthony Newman 
Bobbie Darlene Harris 
Tommy Freeman 
Bobbie (Harris) Dudley 
Jack Neeb 
Jonathan Blake Dunn 
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DRIVERS - FLATBED 48 stares OTR_ As-
signed new conventionals, competitive pay, 
benefits. S1,000. Sign on bonus, rider program, 
flexible time off. Call Roadrunner Trucking 1-
803-876-7784. 

DRIVERS - HERE ARE the facts! '94-'96 
KW cony. walkiru; 28-30ehni. + S40 tarp/load. 
Day 1 rider program. Min. lyr experience. Call 
Melton 24hrsf7 days 1-800-635-8669 ext CF-
9. 

Call 	newspaper-for details on how to advertise statewide. 

Local 
Resident 
Grandson 
Wins Many 
4-H Awards 

Joe Alan Martinez, son of Joe and 
Lii Martinez of Eastland and grand-
son of Sid and Sally Davis of Cross 
Plains, attended the Eastland County 
4-H Banquet October 12. The Ban-
quet was held at the Siebert El-
ementary Cafeteria in Eastland. Joe 
Alan received the Bronze Star 
award, Outstanding 4-H Member, 
100% Attendance, Record Book 
Completion, along with a 4-H T-
shirt. This is his second year in 4-H 
showing Meat Goats. 

Joe Alan is a 5th grade student at 
Siebert Elementary in Eastland and 
is active in most sports. 

Trail of 
Lights in 
Sweetwater 
Begins Nov. 
29 

Sweetwater's favorite reptile, the 
rattlesnake, will take a back seat to 
holiday lights as the city brightly 
shines each evening for the seasonal 
Trail of Lights. More than 700,000 
lights will adorn businesses and 
homes, and holiday scenes will grace 
the town. Enjoy many fun actaivities 
around town, including parades, 
holiday programs, Yuletide musical 
performances, and carriage rides. 
For further information, contact Kcn 
Becker of Jane Thoma at the 
Sweetwater Chamber of Commerce, 
P.O. Box 1148, Sweetwater, Tx. 
79556; (915) 235-5488 or 800-658-
6757. 

Collum's Restaurant 
Sunda). NON ember 24 

All You Can Eat 

Thanksgiving Dinner 
v,ith all the trimmings 

plus salad bar 

11 a.m. - 2 p.m. 
$ NES IS 11 

• 

csi I 11‘;Imay 3(1 & a 0 

8 1/2 x 11, 8 1/2 x 14, or 11 x17 
COPIES AT THE CROSS PLAINS REVIEW  

Deadlines For 
The Cross Plains Review 
Articles Must be Turned In 
Mondays By Noon (No Excep- 

tions) 

Advertisements Must Be 
In Tuesdays By 5:00 p.m. 
Your cooperation is greatly 
appreciated. 

a home now, without the downpayment most 
banks require. Complete permanent financing 
if qualified. DeGeorge Home Alliance 1-800-
343-2884. 

WOLFF TANNING BEDS. Tan at home. 
Buy direct and avel Commercial/home units 
from $199.00. Low monthly payments. Free 
color catalog. Call today 1-800-842-1305. 

ADOPTION 

ADOPTION: AFFECTION, LOVE and life-
long devotion await your newborn. Young and 
caring, we offer a bane filled with happiness, 
security and love. Legal medical expenses paid. 
Shari/Elarry 14800-385-9789. ifs illegal to be 
paid for anything beyond medicaltlegal assis-
tance. 

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITY 

AMERICAN STOCK EXCHANGE Corn-
pony seeks, master dissnlauton for computer 
software_ CD ROMS, educational, children 
software, S100k yeasty potential, 550k ph po-
tential. No selling! Investment $12,980.1-800-
675-9175. 

20/20 WITHOUT GLASSES! Safe, rapid, 
non-surgical, permanent restoration 6-8 weeks. 
Airline pilot developed. Doctor approved. Free 
information by mail 1-800-422-7320, ext. 237, 
406-961-5570, FAX406-961 -5577 . h ttp:// 
www.visionfreesiontcorn - Satisfaction guar-
anteed.. 

BARGAIN HOMES FOR pennies on theS1. 
Gov't foreclosed and repossessed properties 
being liquidated this month! For listings in 
your area, call now I I -800-338-0020 ext. 299. 

DEER HUNTER SPECIAL, Burnet County. 
25 acres of trees, deer and turkey. Golfing at 
Delaware Springs. Only 20 minutes to five 
lakes. Owner financed. 1-800-725-3699. 

HUNT NOW DUVAL, Edwards, Menard, 
Terrell and Zavala counties. Big deer and 
hogs. 100 acres or more. From S99 acre- Low 
down with terms. 1-210-340-6700. 
TIMESHARES/CAMPGROUND MEM• 
BERSHIP/resales buying' selling • renting .  

America's most successful resort resale clear-
inghouse. Accepting all resorts. Call Resort 
Property Resale International. Toll free hotline 
1-800-423-5967. 

WANT TO MAKE money? Over 80 oppor 
tunities and seminars ranging from the Inter-
net to retail franchises. Texas Statewide Fran-
chise/Business Opportunity Expo. Sat/Sun, 
Nov. 23/24, Brazos Center, Bryan/College 
Station. 1-800-653-0007. 

AN AMAZING OPPORTUNITY. Coke, 
Frito Lay, Nabisco, great local routes - excel-
lent earning potential For free info call 1-800-
321-7690. Investment required $3,500.  

FRITO LAY/HERSHEY Mae. All cash busi-
ness. Top local sites. 51,000+ weekly potential 
Minimurn investment S7,500/ immediate cash 
flow. 1-800-617-6430, Ext. 5900. 

DRIVERS WANTED 

ATTN: EXPERIENCED TRUCK driven 
drive to own! SO downf780 all miles. Owner-
ship pos sible in 18 months. Avg. 10,000+ miles/ 
month. Company driven: newer equipment 
Competitive pay/benefits. Call: New Apple 
Lines 1-800-843-8308 or 1-800-843.3384 
Madison, SD, Mon-Fri 8-5piri central. Call!  

DRIVER SS1,000SSSIGN-on bonus. Starting 
26e/270. Paid benefitabonushnore. Need: 1 
year OTR experience - age 23. CXJRobenon 
needs OTR drivers for dry vats/flatbeds for 
PFT/Roberson. Call 1-800-473-5581. EDE/ntf. 

DR1VER-CALARK INTERNATIONAL 
offers great pay, benefit and the chance to get 
home more often I Must be 22 with CDL and 
HazMat endorsement 1-888-422-5275. 

4374* Dallas Carriers • WE. 

DRIVERS WANTED EL. Powell & Sam, 
Tulsa, OK We offer late model equipment, 
good insurance, mileage pay. One year verifi-
able flat bed experience. 918-446-4447. 1-800-
444-3777. 

EDUCATION 

MONEY TO LOAN. Homeowners - we can 
help you when others will not. Purchases, refi-
nance, home improvement, morel Call AAA 
Mortgage & Financial Corporation 1-800-652--
1757. 
OVER DUE BILLS? • •Free debt manage-
ment •• reduce payments & interest, stop col-
lection calls! Confidential help!! C.C.C.Mon-

refit *bonded* toll free 1-888-455-CCCS. 
FOR SALE 

CAN'T AFFORD THE home you need? Own 

JOE ALAN MARTINEZ 

At 

DIABETIC? ARE YOU still paying for sup-
plies? Why? For information on how you can 
receive supplies at little or no cost call 1-800-
678-5733. 

MISCELLANEOUS 

BE YOUR OWN Texas PI Find a lost friend. 
Chedc someone out. It's easy and fun. Rush 
$20.00 to: Background Specialist, 83 
SaddlemountainRd.,ColoradoSprings,C080919 
or sabdS1.03and SASE more information 

REAL ESTATE 

WILD WEST RANCH South Colorado 
Rockies 89 AC - S49,900 high meadows w/ 
spectacular views of surrounding mountains 
Loaded w/wildlife. Year round access, power 
& phone. Excellent financing. Call now 719-
742-5207. Ma-ors Ranch. 

TRADE SHOW 

HAROLD IVES TRUCKING needs moti-
vated individuals to enter our training program. 
Call 1-888-270-1676 for complete informa-
tion. Experienced driven call: 1-8004142-0853. 

IF YOUR HEART is in trucking, call us. 
Covenant Transport, average 1850 miles, coast 
to coast runs. Weekend recruiters available. 
Experienced driven: 1-800-441-4394. Gradu-
ate students: 1-800-338-642.8. 

OTR DRIVERS WANTED! Experienced & 
non experienced. Free driver training, call 1-
800-333-8595, 24hrs., Stevens Transport. 

RAPID FREIGHT OF Texas, a Texas based 
carrier seeking 0Th teams & singles. 95 or 
newer conventionals. Call Chuck at 1-800-607-
5695. 

MTA SCHOOLS NEEDS motivated indi-
viduals for our truck driver training program. 
Offering high salaries and benefits. Job place-
ment assistance available. For more informa-
tion call 1-800-391-0777. 

EMPLOYMENT 

FIRE FIGHTERS WANTED: IF you have 
manual dexterity, good vision & the ability to 
use tools/equipment we want to talk to you. 
Must be physically fit, under 34 with H.S. 
diploma. Paid relocation 1-800-292-5547. 

SHIPPING CLERK: NO experience. neces-
sary. We train qualified individuals in stock/ 
shipping, cargo transportation, accounting and 
stock inventory. Under 34 preferred, H.S. di-
ploma grad. Excellent pay & benefits, travel, 
relocation, advancement. Call 1-800-292-5703. 

FINANCIAL SERVICES 

$DEBT CONSOLIDATION FREES. Cut 
monthly payments up to 30-50%. Reduce inter-
est stop collection calls. Avoid bankruptcy free 
oxtfidential help NCCS nonprofit, licensed/ 
bonded. 1-800-955-0412_ 

DRIVERS-OTR ADVANCE Distribution 
System $1,000 sign-on bonus, limited open-
ings for flatbed driven. Phone apps approved 
in 2 hours! 1-800-646-3438, Ext. 1020 owner-
operators welcome. 

DRIVERS* RUN WITH the best' Great ben-
efits* Miles' Rider program* You need 1 year 
01R experience and CDL-A • Call I -800-727- 
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