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Registration Time Nears 
For State Beeferendum 

Funeral Service Held 
For Donna K. Fisher, 18 

After more than two and 
a half months of the hum-
iliating situation in Iran, 
American people are right-
fully beginning to wonder if 
and when their country is 
going to do anything about 
bringing our hostages home. 
Concerned as we were about 
the lives of the men who are 
at the mercy of a senseless 
mob poorly controlled by 
fanatical leader, US public 
opinion rallied behind Pre-
sident Carter's calm resolve 
not to place lives of the cap-
tives in jeopardy. As a result 
of it, his personal populartiy 
poll surged and Senator 
Kennedys' stock nose dived 
in the election sampling 
polls. 

But the attitude is starting 
to change. America deeply 
resents the continued in-
human, degrading and 
physically harmful treat-
ment of the hostages, which 
appears more and more like 
an insulting answer to our 
civilized and peaceful efforts 
to work out a solution. If 
the US and the UN, and 
various diplomats, still can 
get no response, perhaps it is 
time to get tough. 

James Kilpatrick, nation-
ally syndicated columnist, 
observes that the steam has 
leaked out of the heady 
emotion that so aroused our 
people in November. Not 
many cars honk as they pass 
the Iranian embassy now. 
Horns, candles, bells, yellow 
ribbons and public demon-
strations have not relieved 
the tension. The hostages 
are still in prison. Perhaps 
it's time to issue an ulti-
matum. The Khomeine 
could possible by impressed 
if he were convinced that at 
long last US patience has 
reached its limit and it is not 
bluffing when it threatens 
drastic action. 

A suggestion is to send a 
transport plane escorted by 
heavily armed fighter planes 
and warn the Iranians that 
unless the hostages are 
brought unharmed to the 
airport and put safely 
aboard the transport, retali-
ation will be swift and 
dramatic. Kilpatrick thinks 
that if we do not have armed 
forces capable of destroying 
obvious targets in Iran, we 
have wasted more than a 
trillion dollars on defense 
appropriations in the past 
decade. - 

One of the most obvious 
targets for retaliation would 
be the oil fields on which 
Iran's economic survival de-
pends. The country's leaders 
should be made to under-
stand that they are inviting 
this disaster if they persist in 
their unhumanity. Of course 
appeasers of our country 
can be expected to object to 
such a severe ultimatum. 
And lots of people would 
fear the consequence. Who 
knows that the Iranian 
fanatics would not choose t6 
kill the captives rather than 
free them? Who knows that 
this ultimatum or any other 
would not backfire and 
leave the US with a bigger 
problem than it has now? 

The thought of possible 
consquences distresses us. 
While still regarding our-
selves the strongest country 
on earth we are painfully 
aware that we can be pushed 
around by fanatics. This is 
true partly because we 
hesitate to hold a nation 
responsible for the crimes of 
its terrorists, and partly be-
cause our prestige in the 
world has so sadly deterior-
ated. Considering the past 
few decades of our history 
we have to realize that a 
country might challenge our 
ability or our intention to 
back up an ultimatum. In 
our hearts we know that US 
is not what it used to be. 

We like to remember the 
legendary message sent by 
Teddy Roosevelt to a North 
African Chief who was 
holding an American soldier 
for ransom. Teddy said 
"Perdicaris alive or Raizuli 
dead," and sent a warship to 
pick up our man. When the 
boat arrived the man was 
waiting, unharmed. Some 

Cattlemen will have an 
opportunity in the next few 
weeks to vote for a unique 
self-help program that can 
assure them a better future, 
according to J.D. Sartwelle 
and O.J. Barron, state 
chairmen of the Texas 
Beeferendum. Sartwelle is a 
rancher at Sealy, Texas, and 
Barron a rancher-feeder at 
Spur, Texas. 

Beeferendum is a cattle in-
dustry effort to win ap-
proval of a uniform collect-
ion plan for beef research, 
consumer information, pro-
motion and foreign market 
development. 

Registration will begin 
next week, Jan. 28, at the 
county ASCS office and 
continue through Feb. 6. 
Then, cattlemen who regis-
ter may vote Feb. 19-22 at 
the ASCS office. 

"The need for a self-help 
program by cattlemen never 
was greater," says Sar-
twelle. "Self-appointed 
critics of our industry are 
charging that beef causes 
cancer, that beef causes 
heart disease, that beef 
prices are a consumer rip-
off. Cattlemen don't believe 
these unproven charges but 
many people do. And the 
result is a gradual erosion of 
demand for beef. 

"If a majority of cattle-
men voting approve the pro-
gram," he continues, "20 
cents out of each $100 of 

College English 
Course Available 
At Muenster High 

An opportunity to earn 
college credits in English is 
available during the remain-
der of this school year at 
Muenster High School. 

Tom Fluker, MHS coun-
selor, announced this week 
that the Freshman course 
will be taught in the public 
school library by Dr. Ona 
Wright, head of the English 
Department of Cooke 
County College. 

The course is open to this 
year's high school seniors 
and graduates of former 
years. Upon completion the 
student will receive three 
semester hours of credit 
which can be transferred to 
any accredited college. 

Fluker said that the course 
is especially attractive to 
students who want to get a 
head start on next year's 
college work and it has ad-
ded value as an introduction 
to the college level of study. 

Classes are scheduled each 
Monday night, 6 to 9:15, 
and the first class, with re-
gistration, will be held on 
February 4. The cost is $49 
for tuition and $19.58 for 
books. 

More information is avail-
able by calling Muenster 
High School or Cooke 
County College. 

ten years later American 
sailors were arrested and 
marched through the streets 

of Tampico. 	President 
Wilson retaliated by shelling 
and seizing the Mexican port 
of Vera Cruz. Still later 
Pancho Villa raided a town 
in New Mexico, and Wilson 
answered by sending 
General Pershing with 1200 
cavalrymen to Mexico to 
destroy the bandits forces. 
Those old timers demanded 
and got respect, and they did 
not hesitate to hit the enemy 
in his own country. 

It's quite a contrast to our 
policy in Korea and Vietnam 
where we failed to hit vul-
nerable targets across the 
line and lost a couple of 
wars in the end. 

With a record like that, 
plus tolerating Communist 
expansion in Cuba and 
Latin America and the 
African countries, plus the 

Panama giveaway and 
Taiwan betrayal, plus foot-
dragging in our military 
buildup while Russia was 

going strong...with all these 
factors working we should 
not be surprised about 
erosion of world respect. So, 

how confident can we be 
that our ultimatum really 
has clout? Obviously the 
solution to our problem still 
is not in sight. 

value added to an animal 
will be used to: 

• Fight anti-beef propa-
ganda 

• Promote the nutritional 
value of beef 

• Combat beef substitutes 
• Counter extremes in the 

cattle cycle 
• Increase demand for 

beef." 

"This is a cattlemen's 
program all the way," adds 
Barron. "Cattlemen 
developed it, cattlemen will 
finance it and cattlemen will 
run it--through a Beef Board 

comprised of 60 cattlemen. 
Members of the Beef Board 
will be selected by existing 
cattlemen's organizations 
and Texas will be entitled to 
six members. 

increasing markets for beef 
and increasing profits for 
cattlemen. It deserves the 
support of all cattlemen who 
favor a self-help, free enter-
prise approach to solving 
our problems." 

"This program is volun-
tary in that any cattlemen 
not wishing to participate 
can get a prompt refund." 
concludes Barron. "It's a 
positive program aimed at 

Farmers should be keep-
ing a close check on small 
grains for greenbug infestat-
ions, advises Neil Tibbets, 
county agent with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser-
vice, Texas A&M University 
System. 

Greenbugs are aphids 
which feed on small grains 
by extracting plant juices. 
This may cause plants to 
turn yellow and then brown. 
Heavy infestations can even 
kill plants, says Tibbets. 

When checking fields, 
look for light yellow spots 

Historical Marker 
A historical marker for 

the city of Muenster has just 
been received according to a 
report this week from Mrs. 
Bill Reed of Gainesville, 
chairman of the Cooke 
County Historical Commiss-
ion. Plans are under way to 
have the dedication as a part 
of Germanfest. 

Arbor Day Program 
Offers Fruit Trees 

The National Arbor Day 
Foundation is offering free 
fruit trees as part of its 1980 
campaign to encourage tree 
planting. 

The Arbor Day Foundat-
ion, a nonprofit organizat-
ion, is working to improve 
the quality of life in comm-
unities throughout the coun-
try by encouraging tree plan-
ting. The Foundation will 
give three fruit trees to new 
members contributing SIO 
or more. Each tree will be 3 
to 4 feet tall. All trees will be 
ready for planting and will 
be sent postage paid. 

The Foundation says that 
if the trees are planted ac-
cording to the enclosed in-
structions they will provide 
years of enjoyment and will 
add to the Foundation's 
goal of a greener America. 
And they will bring fruit to 
the table year after year. 

To become a member of 
the Foundation and to re-

ceive the three free fruit 
trees, a contribution of SIB 
or more should be sent to 
the National Arbor Day 
Foundation, Arbor Lodge 
100, Nebraska City, NE 
68410. The donation should 
be sent along with a choice 
of any three of the following 
trees. Any combination or 
as many of any one variety 
may be specified. 

Apples - Red Delicious, 
Yellow Delicious, Stayman 
Winesap, Red Rome 
Beauty, Red Jonathan. 

Peaches - Belle of Georg-
ia, Elberta, J.H. Hale, 
Golden Jubilee, Hale-
Haven. 

Cherries - Montmorency, 
Early Richmond. 

Apricots - Moorpark, 
Early Golden. 

Pears - Barlett, Kieffer. 
Plumbs - Damson, Bur-

bank 

K of C's Sponsor 
Pro-Life Event 

Muenster Knights of Col-
umbus joined other mem-
bers from all over the state 
last Sunday in a special pro-
gram supporting the nation-
wide Pro-Life campaign. 
The occasion was the seven-
th anniversary of the Sup-
reme Court decision legal-
izing abortion. 

Stating that the ruling has 
legalized the murder of more 
than eight million unborn 
children, Father Denis 
Soerries referred to it as a 
violation of the law of God 
and the country and urged a 
widespread appeal for legis-
lation to have the ruling re-
versed. 

During the 9 a.m. services 
at Sacred Heart Church, 
District Deputy Eddie Fleit-
man read a special liturgy 
while Grand Knight Wayne 

Klement and Deputy Grand 
Knight Harold Flusche and 
their families presented a red 
rose symbolic of the pro-life 

campaign. Also, the KCs 
presented some 1250 small 
replicas of roses at First 
Baptist and Sacred Heart 
services. 

After the 9 o'clock mass 
at Sacred Heart about 75 
KCs and guests had break-
fast at the KC Hall. 

and examine them closely 
for greenbugs. This tiny pest 
will be about 1/6 of an inch 
in size. They are pale on the 
underside of leaves. In cold 
weather they may be on the 
ground or even as much as 
one inch below the ground 
line around the plant's 
crown. 

Small grains 3 to 6 inches 
tall can withstand populat-
ions of up to 100 greenbugs 
per foot of drill row. If pop-
ulations are high, begin 
treatment, recommends 
Tibbets. 

Among effective insecti-
cides are methyl parathion, 
parathion, dimethoate and 
Di-Syston. Check the insect-
icide label for grazing re-
strictions before using, re-
minds Tibbets. 

Senator Ron Clower (D-
Garland) announced today 
that, effective January 1, 
1980, the new Notary Public 
law, which was approved by 
the people of Texas in the 
November election, is now 
officially part of the State 
Constitution. 

Clower, who introduced 
the bill into the Texas Senate 
last year, said "the new law 
will bring about some nec-
essary changes in the ap-
pointment and commissions 
of notaries public, while 
making the application pro- 

NT Library System 
Offers Selection 
Of Books by Mail 
The Books By Mail Ser-

vice of the Northeast Texas 
Library System announces a 
new Fall Supplement. The 
list of 100 newly released 
titles, including current best 
sellers, romances, westerns 
and books for children, is 
currently being mailed to re-
sidents of Northeast Texas 
who qualify for this service. 

Over 1000 titles in paper-
back on subjects ranging 
from biography to home-
crafts are offered through 
Books By Mail. A selection 
of Large Print books is also 
available. 

Books By Mail serves re-
sidents in counties where 
there is no local library ser-
vice and upon request to 
anyone who is homebound 
due to a physical handicap, 
lack of transportation, or re-
sidency in a nursing home. 
This service is made possible 
by state and federal funds 
through the Northeast Texas 
Library System. 

If you qualify for this ser-
vice or would like more in-
formation, contact Books 
By Mail, Northeast Texas 
Library System, 1954 Com-
merce, Dallas, TX. 7520 I . 

Muenster's Sacred Heart 
Church was crowded to cap-
acity Wednesday morning at 
10 a.m. for the funeral of 
Donna Kay Fisher, 18, with 
her uncle Father Harry 
Fisher of Pilot Point offic-
iating and Father Denis 
Soerries concelebrating at 
the Mass of Christian Burial 
and also delivering the fun-
eral sermon. 

Other participants were 
the Sacred Heart High 
School choir, Ruth Walter-
scheid and Rita Sicking in 
scriptural readings, Father 
Stephen Eckart in prayers 
after mass preceding depart- 

Increases in average earn-
ings covered by social secur-
ity the past year have trig-
gered an increase in the re-
tirement test annual exempt 
amount for people receiving 
social security benefits, Gus 
Jones, social security district 
manager in Sherman said re-
cently. 

The retirement test annual 
exempt amount is the 
amount of earnings a per-
son can have and still receive 
all benefits for the year. 

For people under 65, the 
1980 annual exempt amount 
will be $3,720. The 1979 
amount was $3,480. 

For people 65 or over the 
1980 annual exempt amount 
is $5,000. The 1979 amount 
was $4,500. 

A person whose 1980 
earnings go over the annual 
exempt amount generally 
has SI in benefits withheld 
for each $2 of earnings 
above the exempt amount. 

Another figure increased 
is the amount of annual ear-
nings required to received 
social security credits. A 
person needs credit for a cer-
tain amount of work to be 
eligible for social security 
benefits. This credit is meas-
ured in "quarters of cover-
age." A person can receive 

cess more efficient." 
"Under the old system," 

Clower explained, "an app-
lication for notary public 
was filed with the County 
Clerk, who would then send 
it to the Secretary of State. 
There it would be processed 
and returned to the Sec-
retary of State. There it 
would be processed and re-
turned to the County Clerk 
and, finally, back to the ap-
plicant. The new law elim-
inates the County Clerk 
from the process so that ap-
plications are filed directly 
with the Secretary of State. 
This saves postage and han-
dling to and from the 
County Clerk's office as 
well as the need for the staff 
persons to handle applicat-
ions at the County level." 

Senator Clower also 
stated "that instead of re-
newing their commission 
every two years, notaries 
public will only need to re-
apply every four years." 
Clower further commented 
"that this will provide the 
Secretary of State with ad-
dress changes and more up-
dated files on the notaries 
public throughout the 

The SHH Alumni-spon-
sored Valentine Dance held 
top attention at the January 
13 Alumni meeting in the 
SHHS Library. Peggy 
Grewing, general chairman, 
reported on details and pro-
gress. The date is February 
16. Committee chairmen 
were also appointed. 

Members discussed the 
Alumni-sponsored volley-
ball tournaments and sche-
duled two all day Sunday 
events on February 24 and 
March 2; with admission 
$1.50 per player and .75 for 
spectators. 

The December 22 Exes 
Football game was reported. 
A social followed the game 

ure to the cemetery, and 
Former Pastor Father 
Placidus Eckart. 

Burial was directed by 
Nick Miller Funeral Home. 
Pallbearers 	were 	Steve 
Taylor, 	Danny 	Fisher, 
Richard Fisher, Carl Pagel, 
Greg Wilde and Danny 
Walterscheid. Rosary for 
her was recited Tuesday at 4 
and 8 p.m. in the chapel of 
Miller Funeral Home. 

Donna Kay, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Fisher 
died at 11 p.m. Sunday, Jan-
uary 20, in Muenster Mem-
orial Hospital shortly after 
sustaining a gunshot wound 

up to 4 "quarters of cover-
age" in a year. 

In 1980, a person receives 
credit for 1 "quarter of cov-
erage" for each $290 of ear-
nings, up to a maximum of 4 
if annual earnings are $1,160 
or more. The 1979 measure 
was $260. 

More information about 
social security credits and 
about the retirement test can 
be obtained at the Sherman 
social security office. Free 
leaflets are available that 
give more detail about both 
of these subjects. The office 
is located at 810 North 
Travis, and the phone num-
ber is 893-4654. 

Jerry Lewis Asks 
For Re-election to 
Commissioner Job 

Jerry Lewis, now serving 
in his first term as com-
missioner of Precinct 3, has 
authorized the Enterprise to 
announce this week that his 
is a candidate for re-election 
subject to action of the 
Democratic Primary. 

Mr. Lewis will make a 
formal statement to precinct 
voters in a later issue of the 
Enterprise. 

State." 
"Also under the new 

law," Clower said, "the jur-
isdiction of each notary 
public becomes statewide. 
Previously, a notary could 
perform his or her duties 
only within the county in 
which they were appoint-
ed." 

Senator Clower remark-
ed, "I am very pleased that 
in November of 1979 the 
people of Texas went to the 
polls and overwhelmingly 
approved the Notary Public 
Act. By removing the step of 
applying with the County 
Clerk's office, this measure 
will cut cost, time, and 
duplication to the advantage 
of the taxpayers in this 
State." 

Clower mentioned "that 
the Act does not invalidate 
those commissions of 
notaries appointed under the 
old system before January I. 
They will just need to re-
apply with the Secretary of 
State upon the expiration of 
their present term." He fur-
ther indicated "that the new 
system regarding notaries 
public is much more prac-
tical in today's world." 

and sandwiches and other 
refreshments were served to 
about 80. 

Slightly Cooler 
Temperatures have been 

lower but not severe during 
the past week, and moisture 
meanwhile has been skimpy. 
Low and high readings have 
been recorded as follows by 
Steve Moster. Jan. 17, 39 
and 62; Jan. 18, 36 and 70; 
Jan. 19, 50 and 60; Jan. 20, 
43 and 45; Jan. 21, 41 and 
47; Jan. 22, 40 and 60; Jan. 
23; 28 and 60. 

Also rain recordings were 
.01 on the 20th, 1.15 on the 
21st and .13 on the 22nd. 
The month's total is 1.32. 

in front of her home on 
Fourth Street. 

Eugene Luttmer, 18, was 
arrested Monday as a sus-
pect, arraigned before 
Justice of the Peace Tommy 
Crawford, and released on a 
$10,000 bond. He remains 
free while an investigation is 
being conducted by Police 
Chief David Province, who 
said that the filing of formal 
charges may be delayed as 
much as a week or ten days. 
An autopsy report on the 
cause of death is also pend-
ing. 

Donna Fisher was born in 
Gainesville on March 22, 
1961. She was a 1979 grad-
uate of Muenster High 
School and a student of 
Cooke County College. 

Survivors are her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Earl Fisher; 
four brothers, Robert and 
Allen of Arlington, Gary of 
Mesquite and Glenn of the 
home; five sisters, Joan 
Demshock of Lutherville, 
Md., Doris Kooy of Ken-
wick, Wash., Judy Fisher of 
Arlington, Janice Hellman 
of Muenster and Mary 
Fisher of the home; and a 
grandmother, Mrs. Rose 
Evers of Canyon. 

Anti-Shock Device 
Demonstrated to 
Hospital Personnel 

A new item of equipment 
available in Cooke County 
ambulance service was dem-
onstrated last Friday to doc-
tors, nurses and administrat-
ive personnel of Muenster 
Memorial Hospital. 

It is the Medical Anti-
Shock Trouser (MAST), 
which makes more blood 
available to a patient's head 
and vital organs by displac-
ing some of the blood in tim 
legs and lower abdomen. 
This is made possible by 
placing the device on the 
lower part of the patient's 
body and inflating. It is used 
in case of shock or low 
blood pressure. 

The unit was installed as 
standard equipment in each 
of the county's three am-
bulances. Demonstration of 
using it and removing from 
the patient was given at the 
hospital by Joe Gray, para-
medic, and Joe Goodin, 
administrator of the am-
bulance service. 

Envelopes for 
Germanfest Arrive 

The Chamber of Com-
merce has announced that 
the Germanfest envelopes 
are now available in letter 
size and the smaller window 
statement envelope and may 
be obtained from Bertha 
Hamric or Monica Hess. 
The design, similar to last 
year's, differs in that the 
emblem and print are in 
orange and brown. Anyone 
needing the envelopes may 
pick them up at Hamric's or 
phone Monica Hess at 759-
4254. 

Course Available 
On Resuscitation 

A program on the basis of 
cardio-pulmonary resuscit-
ation, (CPR), is available 
here if a sufficient number 
of persons wish to take it. 
Sponsored jointly by Muen-
ster Memorial Hospital and 
the hospital auxiliary, it is 
an 8 hour course ending in 
presentation of a certificate. 
Instructions are to be given 
by personnel of the county 
ambulance service. 

Jo Ann Walterscheid of 
the hospital nursing staff 
said that any person who 
wishes to learn about re-
storing breathing in an 
emergency is a prospect for 
the course. It can be a lay 
person as well as members 
of the medical profession. 

Anyone interested is in-
vited to notify the hospital, 
Ph. 2271, from 8 to 5, or call 
Harriet Pagel, Ph. 4303 af-
ter 5:30. The number of calls 
will determine if a class will 
be organized. And if so an 
organizational meeting will 
determine where and when 
the classes will be held. 

Greenbug Season is Near 

Social Security Increases 
Limit on Exempt Earnings 

Notary Public Law Now 
Part of State Constitution 

SH Alumni Plans V'Ball Tournament 
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Garage 

General Auto Repair 

Air Conditioner Service 

311 Division St. 

Phone 759-4521 

DAVENPORT 
CHIROPRACTICCHIR OPRACTIC CLINIC 

301 E. Broadway 
665.3521, Gainesville 

If no answer call 
665-2452  
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CX WITH A RUGGED AGITATOR FOR 
HEAVILY SOILED LOADS PLUS A GENTLE 

AGITATOR FOR SMALL LIGHTLY SOILED LOADS! 

SETELCITAMNG 
FILTER RING 

BLEACH & TARIM 
SOFTENER 
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• Uses up to 24% less water SAVE $40 per lill than its own low level 
setting 
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Otts Furniture 
115 South Commerce 

 

665-6661 

   

60 TI M' 
IN ANC 

GMC WIDE SIDE MODELS 

Full line of 8 or V8 engines Available, 

Come In for a Test Delve. 

• Tune Up 	• Winterization 

• Brake & Exhaust Work 

• Alr Conditioning Service 

• Any Other Mechanical Work 

Hoedebeck GMC 
759 - 4366, Muenster 

13‘ 
Dial 

759.2833 

 

Store Hours: Mon. - Fri. 9.6, Sat 9 Closed Sunday 

Muenster Pharmacy 
Bob Pets, Registered Pharmacist 

Medical Center Bldg. 

■•■ 

SAVE 
On Farm and Ranch Supplies 

Baler 
Wire & Twine 

Feed 
Fertilizer 

Oil, Grease 

Tires 
Grain Bins 

Check Our Prices 
Before You Buy 
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Looking Ahead 
by 

Dr. George S. Benson 	EDUCATION  
'NATIONAL   PROG  

PROGRAM 

President 	 Searcy, Arkansas # 1kill  

Accent On Health 

meets the eye. One view is 
that Clements is waiting until 
right before the general elec-
tion in November to give 
Republican challengers an 
advantage over incumbent 
Democrats in the Legisla-
ture. However, Clements has 
recently angered rural Demo-
crats and he may be afraid of 
losing Senate confirmation 
of some of his new ap-
pointees. The Senate may 
vote to confirm in any ses-
sion meeting longer than ten 
days. 

Hunger Strike 

A Central Texas farmer 
continued his hunger strike 
outside the governor's office 
last week to symbolize his 
disillusionment with Clem-
ents' agricultural policy. 

Charlie Fitts of Milam 
County vowed be would stay 
at Clements door until he 
can personally apologize to 
Clements' 1978 opponent, 
former Attorney General 
John Hill, for voting for 
Clements. 

Fitts was irritated by the 
dismissal of the Texas farm-
ers' liaison in Washington 
DC, and for Clements' fail-
ure to keep campaign prom-
ises to farmers. 

Clements v. White? 

Attorney General Mark 
White says the Texas De-
partment of Human Re-
sources can build its planned 
$40 million office building 
and the governor says it 
can't. 

Clements vetoed the proj-
ect in June 1979, but White 
said then that the governor 
lacked the power of veto in 
that issue. Clements then 
raised 31 questions of il-
legality in the project. 

White came back again 
last week and ruled down the 
governor's objections. Clem-
ents has threatened to take 
the issue to the Texas Su-
preme Court. 

Teacher Pay Hikes 

House Speaker Bill Clay-
ton said the Texas Legisla-
ture will be inviting unioni-
zation of the state's public 
school teachers if they don't 
receive a bigger pay raise in 
the 1981 session. 

Teachers received a 5.1 
percent pay increase last 
spring at Clements recom-
mendation. They had wanted 
a 7 percent hike. 

Clayton said he will fight 
unionization and make the 
pay raises a priority issue. 

Presidential Polk 

President Jimmy Carter 
and former Texas governor 
John Connally have moved 
out front in their parties in 
this state, a recent poll 
showed. 

The Texas Monthly maga-
zine poll showed Carter lead-
ing Ted Kennedy 52.7 per-
cent to 20.6 percent among 
Democrats. California Gov. 
Jerry Brown registered 5.9 
percent in the poll. 

Carter led Kennedy in vir-
tually all areas of the state 
and other categories, except 
among Mexican-Americans 
and Blacks where Kennedy 
led by some 15 points. 

Republican Connally with 
35 percent had a nice lead 
over Ronald Reagan's 26.6 
percent. Fellow Texan 
George Bush received 12.1 
percent approval and Tenn. 
Sen. Howard Baker got 5.7 
percent. 

	

Like 	the 	Democratic 
front-runner, Connally led 
his party in all areas of the 
state, with Reagan showing 
a lead among blacks and 
senior citizens. 

AG Opinion 

In a legal opinion last 
week. Attorney General 
White ruled the sale con-
tract of rock may be voided 
where a county commission-
er receives royalties on the 
sale of the rock to a com-
pany which in turn sells it to 
the county.  

people, but to the government 
and its inits bureaucracy. Therefore, 
the government and its 
bureaucracy are in fact the real 
and only owners of the 
property, 

Monopoly 
Some socialist-minded people 

argue that the right of private 
property leads to monopoly, to a 
concentration of property in the 

hands of the few, with the 
people as a whole being vic-
timized by the few. However, 
this is not true in our Republic 
because the government by the 
people deals with monopoly 
through means of laws. 

The solution to monopoly 
offered by the socialists and 
communists, who cry out 
concerning monopoly in a 
private enterprise system, is to 
establish one gigantic monopoly 
— the monopoly called the 
socialist government. Under 
communism, this monopoly is 
called the dictatorship of the 
proletariat. Socialism and 
communism concentrate all 
economic power, all 
educational endeavors, 
banking, communication, 

agriculture, production and 
distribution in the hands of the 
government and its planning 
commissions, It is more than 
strange that any Americans 
should think that politicians, in 
any country, can be trusted 
with such power over the lives 
of us all. 

A View of Human Nature 
Communism and socialism 

insist that man's nature is 
shaped by the economic 
system. They believe that man 
is greedy and grasping; that 
there is war and poverty, 
because of the economic system 
which is based on the private 
ownership of the 'means of 
production and distribution. 
They insist that if the economic 
system is changed to socialism, 

the nature of man will likewise 
be changed. 

What If They Are Wrong? 
The Communists have been 

the ones who have established 
socialism on the largest scale. 
Furthermore, to the extent that 
a country has socialism, to that 
extent it must concentrate 
power of all types in the hands 
of the government. What if they 
are wrong about human 
nature? In such a case they 
have placed economic, 
political, social, educational, 
communicational, tran-
sportational, agricultural, 
military, and every other 
source and type of power in the 
hands of a dictatorship who 
would then use that power for 
its own selfish purposes. 

What if there is in some men 
the lust for power? And what if 
the persons who control that 
power have ill-will in their 
hearts? Or what if the ruler is so 
arrogant that he thinks that he 
alone knows what is good for the 
people, and that for their own 
good they must be made to bow 
to his will? The very fact that he 
has the power can be in-
terpreted by him as proof that 
history has ordained that he use 
that power to deal with society 
as he sees fit. Why else had 
history conferred on him this 
power? Furthermore, it takes a 
man with a hard nature and a 
fixed will to be a dictator. 

Independence 	is 	the 
greatest gift parents can help 
their children obtain, accor-
ding to Mrs. Ilene Miller, 
family life education 
specialist with the Texas 
Agricultural Extension Ser-
vice, The Texas A&M Uni-
versity System. 

The labels and inspec-
tion marks on the meat 
and meat products you 
buy in Texas are not 
there by some whim of a 
grocery store chain or 
meat producer. 

They tell a story and 
are required by the 
Texas Meat and Poultry 
Inspection Act. The Act, 
administered by the 
Bureau of Veterinary 
Public Health of the 
Texas Department of 
Health. shows that 
wholesome products are 
being provided. 

"Most people really 
aren't aware of the value 
of labels on meat pro-
ducts," said F. V. 
McCasland, D.V.M., 
Chief of the Bureau of 
Veterinary Public 
Health. "The purpose of 
the labeling re-
quirements is to provide 
the consumer with 
truthful information. 
There are five categories 
we are concerned with 
on labels." 

1. Name of the pro-
duct: The product name 
must be the common or 
usual one, and must 
truthfully describe or 
represent the product. If 

y ; (duct contains in-
gredients not normally 

expected by the con-
sumer, the product name 
must say so. For example, 
frankfurters may contain 
up to three and one-half 
percent cereal provided 
the name is qualified 
with "cereal added." 

Names which include 
terms identifying two or 
more of the ingredients 
must show the predomi-
nant ingredient first. 
Therefore, a product 
identified as beef and 
pork sausage must con-
tain more beef than pork. 
One exception to this 
would be pork and beans, 
which has so little pork 
that is doesn't fall under 
the meat inspection laws. 

2. Statement of ingre-
dients: Products pro-
duced from two or more 
ingredients must have 
the ingredients listed by 
their usual names in 
descending order of 
predominance. "These 
ingredient statements 
are very important to 
persons with food 
allergies or other special 
•lietary problems," said 
Dr. McCasland. 

3. Quantity of con-
tents: The contents must 
be described in terms 
which are not misleading 
or false. Pictures, draw-
ings or other graphics 
must not be misleading. 
For example, if four  

pieces of meat or four 
servings are shown on 
the label, the package 
must contain that 
number. Devices such as 
false bottoms or in-
complete fills which 
would be misleading may 
not be used. 

4. Establishment's 
name and address: The 
name and address of the 
producing firm or the 
firm for which the pro-
duct was produced must 
be part of the label. 

5. Special instruc-
tions: Any necessary 
handling or serving in-
structions such as "Keep 
Refrigerated" 	or 
"Perishable" must be in-
cluded in a conspicuous 
location. 

Equally important as 
the label is the state in-
spection mark. The mark 
is in the shape of an 
outline of the State of 
Texas and bears a 
number identifying the 
specific producing plant. 

"Meat inspection and 
meat grading are con-
fused by many people," 
said Dr. McCasland. 
"They are two com-
pletely separate pro-
cesses and serve two 
completely separate pur-
poses. Meat inspection 

relates to cleanness and 
wholesomeness. Grading 
relates to the quality of 
the meat, either poor. 
good, better or best qual-
ity. Tenderness is the 
major quality looked at 
here. USDA standard, 
good, choice, prime, etc., 
are the most commonly 
used grades and are 
applied by the United 
States Department of 
Agriculture." 

Dr. McCasland said 
that in Texas each year 
the meat and poultry in-
spection program in-
spects more than 815 
million pounds of meat at 
a cost of a bout seven-
tenths of a cent per 

Texas Department of Health 
Raymond T. Moore, M.D., 

Commissioner 

pound. About 800 
diseased animals and 
195.000 diseased poultry 
are detected and con-
demned. Over a half-
million pounds of un-
wholesome meat pro-
ducts and 175,000 
diseased parts are con-
demned annually. 

"In the absence of the 
inspection program. 
these diseased and 
unwholesome meats 
would presumably have 
reached the Texas con-
sumer," Dr. McCasland 
said. "These meats could 
have produced many 
diseases, including 
tuberculosis, trichinosis, 

staph infections and 
botulism." 

Dr. McCasland ex-
plained that one beef car-
ca ss infected with 
cysticercosis or 
tapeworm cysts, has the 
potential of causing 
tapeworm infection in 
some 480 humans. . 

The Cooperative Meet 
Inspection Division of the 
Texas Department of 
Health has 275 plant in-
spectors. plus 26 super-
visory personnel and 19 
veterinarians involved in 
the inspection and label-
ing process. Six addi- 
tional 	compliance 
officers 	keep 
surveillance over meat 
products as they move in 
areas not under routine 
inspection. Personnel of 
the Meat Inspection Pro-
gram inspect animals 
throughout the 
slaughtering process. 
The whole carcass, or 
any part of it, is 
eliminated if found to be 
unfit for human con-
sumption. Strict sanita-
tion of the slaughtering 
facility itself is also 
enforced. 

Laboratory analyses 
are used to assist the in-
plant inspector in deter-
mining that proper label-
ing, handling and pro-
ceasing procedures are 
being used 

  

STATE CAPITAL HIGHLIGHTS 
By Lyndell Williams 

TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION 

AUSTIN—Texans are go-
ing to have to wait at least 
until August, maybe later, to 
watch their Legislature de-
bate tax relief, initiative and 
referendum, and wiretapping  

.. and possibly a few other 
issues thrown in a la carte. 

Governor Bill Clements 
last week announced he will 
wait until next fall to call his 
promised special session. 

Clements wants to spend a 
state surplus for tax relief in 
the special session. but, he 
said no one really knows 
right now how much surplus 
will be available. 

The governor has esti-
mated there will be some 
5600-5700 million he can 
turn hack to taxpayers, but 
State Comptroller Bob Bul-
lock recently predicted a 
biennial surplus of only 5124 
million. Clements said he is 
putting the issue on the back 
burner until he and Bullock 
get a clearer picture. 

Others say there is more 
to the postponement than 

THE RIGHT OF PRIVATE 
PROPERTY 

Any civilized society, in order 
to prosper and to be free, must 
uphold the right of private 
property. However, private 
property is not only a np,ht but 
It is essential to general well 
being. A fundamental char-
acteristic of private property 
is the owner's right to 
dispose of the property. In a 
socialistic society where sup-
posedly the people own the 
means of production and 
distribution, the right of 
disposal belongs not to the 
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TEXAS PECAN PIE 

Crust: 

Now You Can Drive 
in Style and 
take Advantage 
of Better than ever 

Fuel Economy... 

4 

Looking for a new car? If you decide that its time to modern-
ize your driving style and take advantage of the increased 
mileage of today's new models...we can help you finance it! 
Our car loan will have you behind the wheel of just the car 
you wanted before you know it. Get conviently budgeted 

payments too... We have an interest in you and we have an in-
terest in your driving safety, economy, and comfort. 

Ml. roll; Muenster 
State Bank 

759 2257 	Member FDIC 

 

Prices 
Slashed 
Again 

the Band Box 
109 S. Commerce, Gainesville, 665-2201 

9 a.m. til 5:30 p.m. 

Wednesday Night Special 

All You Can Eat 
Fried or Boiled 

Shrimp..$6 95  
With salad bar and baked potato 

or French fries 

STEAKS ... SEAFOOD... 
CHICKEN ... BARBECUE 

Rohmer's Restaurant 
Emil and Agnes Rohmer. Muenster 

Closed on Sunday 

BEAUTIFUL - NEW- EXCITING 
KITCHEN COUNTERTOPS 

Ready to install in just a matter of days, choose your color, 
measure your old counter top, and in no time at all your 
beautiful new GlamourTop kitchen countertop will be ready 
to install. 
Not only beautiful, but GlamourTop kitchen counter tops are 
inexpensive, the average kitchen is less than $200.00. Ask 
our sales people, they'll be glad to answer any questions 
you may have. 

JOE B. WALTER LUMBER CO. INC. 
W. Hwy. 82, Gainesville, 665-5577 

1 
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Mr. and Mrs. Joe Galloway of Wichita Falls have an-
nounced the engagement and wedding plans of their 
daughter, Mary Ellen to Robert August Baumer, Jr. of 
Wichita Falls, son of Mr. and Mrs. Robert Baumer of 
Scotland, Texas. The couple has chosen May 24 for their 
wedding day, and the ceremony will be held in Sacred 
Heart Church of Wichita Falls. The bride-elect is a junior 
at Midwestern State University. The future groom is a 
graduate of Windthorst High School and is a partner in 
Baumer and Sons Construction. They will reside in 
Wichita Falls. The bride-elect is a granddaughter of Mrs. 
John A. Fisher of Muenster. 

Find It Fast in the Enterprise 

   

DIAMONDS 

   

  

SEEDS JEWELERS 
Says "We will mount your diamonds, 

Repair your watch or clock, 
Engrave your Engravables... 

Right in our Store" 
307 N. Grand Village, Gainesville 

  

       

  

A&A TRAVELWORLD, Inc. 
1 

121 NI Grand Ave., Gainesville, TX, Across from Torn Thumb 

(817)665-4181 	(817)665-1794 

Experience. Knowledge. Courtesy. Service 
Announcing a full range of services for the 
novice or professional traveler, whether 
vacation or business. National or Inter-
national. We write airline tickets for all 
Carriers. Hotel, Car rentals and Steamship 

NO CHARGE to the traveler for our services. 

  

       

Society to Honor 
50 Year Members 

On April 13 
St. Anne's Society mem-

bers made plans to honor 50 
year members at a breakfast 
in the Community Center on 
April 13, following the 7 
a.m. Mass that Sunday in 
Sacred Heart Church. 

Mrs. Denis Walterscheid, 
president, led the business 
meeting. Mrs. Harold 
Knabe gave minutes and 
Mrs. Leo Henscheid gave 
the annual treasurer's 
report, and emphasized that 
dues are now payable. 

Get-Well Cards were sent 
to Mrs. Arnold Knabe and 
Mrs. Sue Wider, Thank 
You Cards were received 
from the Benedictine Nuns, 
Lu Vogel and Elizabeth 
Mollenkopf. 

Members discussed the 
NCCW meeting scheduled 
for the Community Center 
on January 17. They also 
made plans to assist St. 
Joseph's Society in its Ger-
man fest Booth. 

Marie Henscheid read 
"Take Time" and "All 
Things Bright and Beauti-
ful." Mrs. Joe Hoenig won 
the door prize. Twenty five 
members attended with one 
guest, Sister Barbara Bern-
auer. 

A social hour followed 
with St. Josephs Society. 

St. Richard's 
Villa News 

St. Richard's Villa was a 
happy, busy place during the 
holidays, with programs and 
cards provided by clubs and 
organizations. Families and 
friends of residents brought 
"goodies" of all descript-
ions...cakes, cookies, can-
dy, gifts, flowers, etc. 

The beautifully decorated 
pine Christmas tree was 
sparkling with lights, tinsel 
and miniature Santas and 
popcorn strung by residents 
as they helped Activity Dir-
ector Shelly Kneupper with 
decorations. 

The Knights of Columbus 
came on December 19 with 
gifts for each resident and 
sang carols after Santa and 
helpers distributed gifts. 

The special noon meal on 
Christmas Day, chicken and 
dressing and home made hot 
yeast rolls with all the trim-
mings — was served to resid-
ents and guests. Another 
feast day was on January 1 
when the menu featured 
baked ham and blackeyed 
peas for the traditional 
"Good Luck for the New 
Year's."  

1 1/3 C all-purpose flour 
1/2 tsp salt 
2/3 C shortening 
3 T water 

News of the Sick 
Samuel Fleitman, the 10 

year old son of Mr. and 
Mrs. J.D. Fleitman is a pat-
ient at Muenster Memorial 
Hospital, where he is being 
treated for a broken leg, suf-
fered at play at home after 
school Tuesday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Fette 
of Waco were guests of his 
relatives in Muenster Sun-
day. 

Hospital Notes 
The following patients 

were dismissed during the 
past week at Muenster Mem-
orial Hospital. 

Tuesday, Jan. 15: Carrie 
Roberg, Muenster; John 
Griffith and Manuel John-
son, Gainesville; Tim Cash, 
Sanger. 

Wednesday, Jan. 16: Al-
bert Edwards, Nocona; Mrs. 
Doyle Gates and baby boy, 
Forestburg; Mrs. Silvina 
Cano, Dallas; Mrs. Lettie 
Frazier, Joliet Illinois. 

Thursday, Jan. 17: Joe 
Williams, Muenster; Jane 
Singletary, Lake Charles, 
La., Carl Singletary, Sul-
phur, La., Hal Peterson, 
Filer, Idaho; Ora Thurman, 
Forestburg; Mrs. Paul 
Downam, Gainesville. 

Friday, Jan. 18: Mrs. Roy 
Oldham, Marietta, Okla. 

Saturday, Jan. 19: Al 
Vogel, Muenster; Leo Hoe-
debeck, Gainesville. 

Sunday, Jan. 20: Shawna 
Hellman, Lindsay; Mrs. 
Lena Brown, Springtown. 

Monday, Jan. 21: Mrs. 
Ferd Luttmer and Jim En-
dres, Muenster; Bill Pollard, 
Martin McGilvary, Jammie 
Rains, Lawrence Flowers 
and Sakina Bradley, Gaines-
ville; Mrs. Howard Mackey 
and baby girl, Whitesboro; 
Connie Landreneaux, 
Bowie. 

Gainesville 
Ford Tractors 
Jim Zimmerer 

665-6741, Gainesville 

Valentine Dance 
Plans Are Shaping 

The Valentine Dance 
Committee is promising a 
gala affair and plans are well 
under way for the second 
annual event, says Peggy 
Grewing, general chairman. 
The date is Saturday, Feb-
ruary 16, 9 til 1:00 and the 
band is "Hard Times;" and 
the place is the Sacred Heart 
Community Center. Beer 
and set-ups will be available. 

Advance tickets, at $3.50 
per person are available at 
Modern Floors and Fabrics, 
H&W Kountry Korner, or 
Peggy Grewing. 

Committee members in-
clude Peggy Crewing chair-
man, reservations and de-
corating; Alvin Hartman 
tickets and bar; Julie Bayer 
publicity; Janet Voth ad-
missions; Monica Hartman, 
beer tickets. 

There will be Valentine 
decor, table snacks and a 
Valentine door prize. To be 
assured tables and reservat-
ions call Peggy Grewing 
early. The dance is spon-
sored by the Sacred Heart 
Alumni. 

N 	 

Save Money! 
Save Time! 

Prescription Is our 

Middle Nome. 

Shop the 
Drive-in window 

f or all your prescriptions 

and drug needs. 
WATTS 

Prescription Shop 
302 N. Grand, Gainesville 

Attend Re-openion of 
Wichita Falls School 

On Monday, January 14, 
Lesli Perkins, accompanied 
by her mother, Mrs. Anne 
Perkins and grandmother 
Mrs. Joy Dickerson of 
Nocona, joined Lesli's cou-
sins Lance and Jennifer 
Dickerson in Wichita Falls. 
They went especially to at-
tend the Flag Raising cere-
mony for the re-opening of 
Ben Milam School in Wichi-
ta Falls, where the Dicker-
son children are students. 

The Ben Milam School 
was almost totally destroyed 
by the April 10 tornado. 
During its reconstruction, 
students attended nearby 
Cunningham School. Cunn-
ingham students attended 
morning classes and Ben 
Milam students attended af-
ternoon classes from 12:30 
to 5:30 p.m. 

The Flag which previously 
flew over the nation's 
capital was raised by Boy 
Scouts of Ben Milam. 
Speeches by the school prin-
cipal and school board 
members preceded the cere-
mony and the National An-
them followed, played by 
the Barwise Junior High 
Band. Students, kindergar-
ten through sixth grade 
sang "America" and 
"Texas, Our Texas." Then 
visitors were invited to tour 
the beautiful almost new 
school. 

Mix flour and salt together, add shortening and cut into flour 
with fork or pastry blender. Add water and mix gently with 
fork in stirring motion. Gather pastry into a ball and place in 
pie tin With tips of fingers, spread pastry along bottom and 

sides of pie tin, shaping with a high, fluted edge. Makes one 
9-inch pie shell 

Filling: 

1 1/2 C brown sugar, firmly packed 
1 /2 C granulated sugar 
1 /4 C water 
2 T all-purpose flour 
1/2 tsp salt 
2 eggs 
1/2 C evaporated milk 
1 1 /2 C pecan halves 
3/4 tsp vanilla 

Combine first five ingredients in small bowl and mix well 
Beat in eggs, one at a time Add evaporated milk and mix 
well Stir in pecan halves and vanilla Mix well and turn into 
unbaked 9-inch pie shell Cook in preheated 400 degrees F 

oven for 10 minutes Reduce heat to 350 degrees F and cook 
an additional 35-40 minutes, or until filling is puffed in 

center and is well browned Let pie cool before cutting 
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AFTER INVENTORY 

CLEARANCE 
4 DOOR LIMITED 

1980 Buick Skylark REG. $6995.00 	 $649500  
5500 MILES STILL IN FACTORY WARRANTY 

1979 Trans AM REG. $7395.00 	  86895" 

MODEL 41•BUCKET SEATS 

1978 Grand Prix 	S 0 L D 
301, 2BBL V8 BONNEVILLE 

1978 Pontiac Sta. Wagon Reg. $5195.00. 54595" 
2 DOOR 

1977 Pontiac Bonneville Reg. $2995.00 	52495" 
301, 2BBL. V8 

1977 Pontiac Grand Prix REG. 94395.00. 53995" 
4 SPEED, 2DOOR, V6 

1976 Gremlin V6 REG. 91995.00 	 5 1695" 
4 DOOR LIMITED 

1976 Buick REG. $2995.00 	  52495" 
4 DOOR LESABRE LOCAL CAR ONE OWNER 

1975 Buick REG. $2895.00 	  s239500 

4 DOOR LIMITED 

1975 Buick REG. $2995.00 	  $249500  
2 DOOR CLEAN CAR 

1975 Chev. Nova REG. $2895.00 	 52495" 
4 DOOR NINETY EIGHT 

1973 Olds REG. 9995.00 	  $69500 
4 CYLINDER 4 SPEED RUNABOUT GAS SAVER 

1973 Ford Pinto REG. $1295.00 	  5 1095" 
4 DOOR ELECTRA 225 SOLID WORKCAR 

1972 Buick REG. $995.00 

SRS, AIR LIFT BACK 

1976 Toyota Corolla REG. $3695.00 

PICKUPS 

518 TON 350-4 BBL PB, PS, AUTO-AIR 

S 

 0 L D  
1978 GMC Sierra 	 
150, 5/6 TON, 400, 4-BBL, PB, PS, AUTO, AIR AUX. TANK 

1977 Ford REG. 92995.00 	  52495" 
'/. TON 4 DOOR CREW CAB LOADED 

1977 Chev. Silverado REG. S5195.00 	$479500 
'4 TON 350 4 BBL. AUTO 

1976 G MC Sierra REG. $2995.00 	 $249500  
518 TON V8 AUTO AIR 

1976 Ford Ranger XLT REG. 92995.00 	 52495" 
". TON SUBURBAN 

1974 GMC REG. $1495.00 

V8 AUTO AIR 

1976 Ford Ranchero REG. $2895.00 	 
4 SPEED V8, 4 WHEEL DRIVE, AIR 

1969 International Scout REG.S2495.00 . 51895" 
4 WHEEL DRIVE 

1974 Willys Jeep REG. 92195.00 	 '1950" 

Brown Motor Co. 
1608 W. Hwy., 82, Gainesville, 665-559' 

$79500 

	 S339500 

	  $99500 

'2195" 

AMBER WAVES--Texas farmers may have sown the 
largest wheat planting in Texas since 1949 but poor field 
conditions will most likely force production significantly 
below 1979 levels, according to Agriculture Commissioner 
Reagan V. Brown. 

For many families, inher-
itance brings not only inter-
generational transmission of 
wealth but also misunder-
standing and conflict, says a 

family life education special-
ist, Diane Welch, with the 
Texas Agricultural Exten-
sion Service, The Texas 
A&M University System. 

Values up to 

11/2 price on 

Boots, Shirts, 
Hats and Jackets 

ike and 
harlie's 

A Complete Collection of Western Gear 
901 E. Hwy. 82, Gainesville, 665 - 7337 

9 a.m. til 6 p.m. 
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Try Our 
Professional 
Laundry and 
Dry Cleaning 

Service 
Since 1941 

AGIN IE 

CLEANERS 
401 N. Grand 
Gainesville 
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CHICKEN Jerry's. FISH 
:,§ 	1700 1-35 North, Gainesville, 665-2042 

GOLDEN KRISPY 

CHICKEN A 

GOLDEN KRISPY 

FISH 
11:00 a.m - 9:00 p.m. Sun. thru Thurs. 
11:00 a.m. - 10:00 p.m. Fri. and Sat. 

Choice Beef 
From Our Feedlot 

By the Cut or the 
Whole or Half Carcass 

CENTER CUT 

Pork Chops 	LB $129 

WHOLE 

Pork Loin 	LB $ 1 "  

Pork Roast 	LB 99c 
Country Sausage 	LB 99c 

H&W Meat Co. 

6TH ANNUAL 

SIMMENTAL SALE 

GI SATURDAY riri, 
FEBRUARY 2, 1980 

12:00 P.M. 
PYBAS RANCH 

Selling 

60 BULLS 100 BRED FEMALES 
FEMALES FROM PYBAS RANCH PRIVATE HERD RAISED ON RANCH 

ALL DUE TO CALVE MARCH AND APRIL 

YOUNG COWS 3 TO 7 YEARS 1/2's & 	— HEREFORD BASE 

at the 
GAINESVILLE LIVESTOCK MARKET, INC. 

1920 Refinery Road 
	

Cecil Ward, Auctioneer 
Gainesville, Texas 	817-665-4367 

J.E. & BARBARA PYBAS 
Star Route, Gainesville, Texas 76240 

817-665-9646 
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Homemakers Club Meeting Program Features Cheese Wheat Planting Up in Texas 
But Production Forecast Down 

"Cheese, Please" was the 
theme of the program 
presented by Mrs. Sharon 
Walterscheid for members 
of the Bluebonnet Extension 
Homemakers Club on 
January 8. Mrs. Walter-
scheid was also hostess in 
her home for the 7:30 p.m. 
meeting. 

She discussed various 
cheeses and provided a 
tasting bee for members. 
Refreshments were Broccoli 
cheese soup, Quiche 
Loraine, a Cheese ball, a 
selection of cheeses and 
cheese cake. 

During the business meet- 

Germanfest Chairmen 
There will be a meeting 

for all chairmen associated 
with Germanfest on Mon-
day, January 28, at 7:30 
p.m. in the TP&L Meeting 
Room. 

"She slipped and 
broke WHAT?" 

Someone's fall on your pre-
mises can break you. Dam-
age suits too frequently run 
to $100,000 and more for 
personal injury or death. 
Bring your liability insur-
ance up to realistic levels 
with FMW Agency. 

FMW 
INSURANCE AGENCY 

PH. 759-2257  

ing Mrs. Jo Ann Pagel gave 
the inspiration. Members 
discussed participation in 
Germanfest and voted to 
sponsor a booth. Mrs. 
Marilyn Luke and Mrs. Bet-
ty kose Walterscheid accep-
ted' co-chairmanship. Mem-
bers were reminded to bring 
prizes for the Rest Home 

March 7.9 Booked 

Hundreds 	of 	Future 
Farmers of America will 
converge in Fort Worth, 
March 7, opening day of the 
1980 Southwest Farm Show. 

These youthful FFA 
members from across Texas 
will be competing for hun-
dreds of dollars of prizes 
during their annual state-
wide Champion Tractor 
Mechanics Contest. 

The Farm Show, which is 
free and open to the public, 
will be held March 7, 8 and 
9, with the opening sche-
duled for 10:00 a.m., Fri-
day, March 7. 

In addition to the free 
Farm Show, there will be a 
Natural Fibers Fashion Re-
view on Saturday, March 8, 
at 4:00 p.m. • 

This event; also free, will 
be held in the Convention 
Center Theater. 

Championship tractor 
pulling is scheduled for 
Thursday, Friday, Saturday, 
and Sunday nights, March 
6, 7, 8 and 9. 

Tickets are required for 
the pulls and can be ordered 

Valentine party to be held 
February 12. 

Eighteen members atten-
ded and welcomed one new 
member, Mrs. Rita Russell. 

The February meeting will 
be the Valentine party at St. 
Richard's Villa on February 
12 at 7:30 p.m. Mrs. Jo Ann 
Pagel will be chairman. 

For SW Farm Show 
by writing Championship 
Tractor Pull, Box 938, Fort 
Worth, Texas, 76101 or by 
calling (817) 338-1122. 

According to R.B. Allen, 
Executive Vice President, 
Southwest Hardware and 
Implement Association, 
sponsors of the big Farm 
Show, the 1980 mammoth 
exhibition will be the largest 
in its nine-year history. 

All exhibit spaces in the 
Convention Center have 
been reserved, and thous-
ands of square feet of addit-
ional space will be filled on 
outdoor parking lots, he 
said. 

"Anyone thinking about 
buying new farm and ranch 
equipment or supplies 
should see this show," he 
concluded. 

Texas A&M 
medical school 
trains rural doctors 

COLLEGE STATION —

Texas A&M University's Col-

lege of Medicine, the state's 
newest, is designed to produce 
"primary care' doctors — fami-

ly, internal and general practi-
tioners — for nonurban areas of 

Texas, where medical help has 
lagged in past years. 

About 60 percent of Texas 
A&M's first medical school 
graduates are expected to enter 

such practice, but it will be 1981 

before the first M.D. degrees 
are issued here. 

Texas A&M .s medical stu-

dents, who are younger and 
score higher scholastically than 
the national average, receive 

two years of predominantly 

classroom training at College 
Station followed by two years of 

clinical training in Temple at 
Veterans Administration and 
Scott and White hospitals.  

AUSTIN--Gains in cash 

receipts, which have out-
stripped all other competing 
states, are likely to boost the 

national ranking of Texas' 
farmers and ranchers, Agri-

culture Commissioner 
Reagan V. Brown recently 

reported. 
For the first nine months of 

1979, Texas (currently ranked 

third) registered substantially 
greater improvement in farm 
cash receipts than either first-
ranked California or the No.2 

state, Iowa. said Brown. 
"Cash receipts were up 18 

percent in Texas, compared to 

a 13-percent increase for Iowa 

and only a five-percent rise for 
California," he said. "During 
1979, Texas recorded 

excellent crops of cotton, 

V. heat, grain sorghum. 
peanuts and pecans. When 

marketings of crops and 
livestock for the entire year 

are tabulated, it is likely we 

will overtake the No. 2 

position." 

AUSITN—Despite the tact 
that Texas farmers have 

planted their largest wheat 
crop since 1949. field 

conditions indicate that pro-
duction will be down in the 

state from last year, 
Agriculture Commissioner 
Reagan V. Brown has 

reported. 

A Texas Crop and 
Livestock Reporting Service 

survey indicates that 

6.800,000 acres have been 
planted. 

"The acreage is 17 percent 

more than last year: however. 
based on conditions in the 

fields on December I, pro-
duction is expected to be 

significantly lower, down to 
88 million bushels," Brown 

said 

Germination on dryland 
seedings was slow due to lack 

of moisture in August and 
September. High Plains 
wheat fields were providing 
only fair grazing for cattle on 
December I. Early snow 

storms damaged some of the 

Plains crop. 
Production in 1979 from 

5.8 million acres reached 138 

million bushels. 
Conditions in Texas are 

The business meeting held 
by the Hood Community 
Improvement Club on 
January 14 included plans 
for a barbecue supper to be 
served to club members at 
the next meeting. Dominoes 
and games of 42 will follow. 
The party will be held in the 
Hood Club building on Feb-
ruary 11 at 7:30 p.m. A box 
of Valentine candy will be a 
special prize. 

J.T. Barker conducted the 

AUSTIN—During the first 

II months of 1979, Texas 
commercial slaughtering 
plants produced 3,393 million 
pounds of red meat, a figure 
some seven percent below the 
same period in 1978, 
Agriculture Commissioner 
Reagan B. Brown has report-

ed. 
Cattle slaughter was down 

13 percent below a se., .to, ,  

For the January-September 

period, Texas farm and ranch 

cash receipts totaled $6.34 
billion, compared to $6.68 

billion for Iowa and $7.23 
billion for California. Brown 
noted that for the nation as a 

whole, farm cash receipts 
were up 14 percent to $85.59 

billion. 
However, he also pointed 

out that during this same 
time, farm and ranch produc-

tion expenses rose an 
estimated 16 percent, led by a 

45-percent average increase in 
fuel prices. In the I2-month 
period ending October 15, 
1979, for instance, ' Texas 
farmers and ranchers saw 

prices for on-farm delivered 
diesel fuel shoot up 36 cents a 

gallon. with gasoline prices 
following a similar pattern. 
Further price increases have 

come about since then. 

"In spite of the fact that 
Texas farmers and ranchers 
are doing a tremendous job of  

comparable to those 111 uthrr 

wheat-growing states, with 
the U. S. production 
forecasted to be 1.57 billion 
bushels, 3 percent less than 
that in 1979. 

According to preliminary 
surveys by the Reporting 
Service, counties in the 

Northern High Plains have 
increased acreage from 2.7 
million to 3.1. The Black-
lands area also has a 

substantial increase, from 
660,000 acres in 1979 to 
1,060,000 for the 1980 

harvest. 
Other regions showing 

increases are the Northern 
Low Plains with 760,000 acres 
contrasted to 710,000 in 1979; 

Southern Low Plains, moving 
from 680,000 acres to 830,000: 

South Central Texas, 115,000 
acres in 1979 and 127,000 
acres for 1980. 

Acreage reductions are 

forecast for the Southern 
High Plains, 260,000 acres in 

1979 down to 240,000 for 
1980; Cross Timbers, 380,000 
to 370,000, and the Edwards 
Plateau, 175,000 to 160,000. 

All other regions account 
for 153,000 acres planted for 
the 1980 season as contrasted 
to 120,000 for 1979 

business 	meeting; 	Joe 
Lewter offered the opening 
prayer and Mrs. Mary 
Evelyn Hermes gave the sec-
retary treasurer's report. 

Members decided to have 
no domino tournament this 
year and discussed entering 
the Community Improve-
ment Contest. 

Mrs. Lanny Lewter and 
Mrs. C.A. Morris served 
cake and iced tea to club 
members present. 

and calf slaughter slid 44 
percent below 1978 totals for 

the eleven-month period, 

Brown said. 
The Texas Crop and Live-

stock Reporting Service 

figures show increases in hog 
slaughter, up 25 percent at 

1,214,900 head, and in sheep 
and lambs, up 19 percent at 
867.900 head 

roducing and selling. 
.nflation continues to severely 
rode net profits," Brown 

added .  

NOTICE is hereby 
given that an appli-
cation has been filed 
with the Texas Alco-
holic Beverage Com-
mission for a Gener-
al Class B Whole-
saler's Permit for a 
business described 
as follows: 

Clyde D. Fisher, Inc. 
Clyde D. Fisher Beer 

Distributor 
305 N. Maple St. 
Muenster, Texas 

Officers: Clyde D. 
Fisher, President; 
Pauline R. Fisher, 
Secretary Treasurer; 
Chuck Fisher, Vice 
President. 

Hood Club Plans Barbecue Supper 

Meat Output Down in Texas 

Gains in Agricultural Cash Receipts May Boost 
Texas Farmers, Ranchers into No. 2 U.S. Position 



SHURFINE 

Cottage Cheese 	 to 89' 

DRUGS, 
PS. 11.49, 2.5 OL, REG. SCENT 

Sure 	  
RS '139, 13 OZ., DORA DRY 

Arrid Roll On 	  
P10.1.69 i.5 v., QUICK DRY 

Bon Roll On 

925 

129 

4155 

SHURFLNE l6 •L 

Peaches 	 

  

Service * Courtesy * Price 

Hofbauer's 
Food & Locker Service 

AFFILIATED 

  

  

  

  

  

ON 
	N OW ow ! 

tiful,Fine '  • 

Porcelain China Mat a, 

No.,. can .c..11ect hflUld.i 	 ol &ay through 

this exel..luve cilet 	 ov.31. a 5.13,Tenf place "s p.,,,  
• v.v.. ,  

1,1330:n. 	 meaW 	 o,."c&''  

■■••■■■■47,, I •  

THIS WEEK'S FEATURE ITEM 

DLSH 
DESSERT 	EACH 

Apples 74 mi 

DAIRY 
PRESTON  1011 FAT 

Milk 	
 

ow  $169 

PRODUC 
WASHINGTON DELICIOUS 0000 

Apples 
Bell Peppers 	  
Sw. Potatoes 
Tomatoes 
CAUFORIILA 

Lettuce 	 
Potatoes 
Cauliflower 	 
Carrots 	 
Onion Plants 
Onion Sets 
Cabbage Plants 

Seed Potatoes 	 
100 LB. Bag 

SHURE)* IO OL 

Broccoli Spears 
re 

 i &co Dinner 	 
VAN DE QUIPS 16 Ot 

Kabobs 	  
PEPPRIDGE FARM 17 OL, S LOBO 
GM o. .r moo 

Layer Cake 	  

MEATS 
ta' 1 09  

La  $119 

 sA 

0 

Pork Roast 	 
Pork Steak 	 

	.7" 	
1?:0 

I Li 

.49' 
31LL 

$100 

	  2013 
4189 

m. 994 

.59 4  

	713 44 

	55 4  
89' 
1179 

959 

Fryers 	 

Club Steak 	  

Bacon 
Franks, Shurfine 12 oz. 	 

TYSON MIXED 

Fryer Parts 
TYSON. WHOLE so, CUT-UP 

SHURFRESH, ASST. 5AI1MS, lima 2 

5111.1161N0 25 00 

Spinach 
FRANCO AKRON IS 01. 

Spaghetti 	  
JEL10 3 OZ. 

Gelatin 	  
PINATA s 1/4 02. 

Tortilla Chips 	 
D0010016 OL 

Liquid Brown Sugar 	 
Mr KING 119 . 

Crackers 
0045 CRUST 

Flour 5 LB. 	  
Is 00 BOX 

Post Toasties 	  
02.1M 

Cheerios 	  
HEI la 41400. MAINS 

Baby Food 	 5 - '1° 
CAMPRI1 K. 3:4 02 

Chicken Alphabet Soup 	37' 
RAID 0 7 02. SOUD, TOND LASITNO 

Insect Killer 	  $199 
JUMBO 
	 69' 

Prices Effective 
thru 

Wed. Jan. 30 

SWIFT PREMIUM 5 Oi 

Vienna Sausage 
FOR LASAGNA 715 OL 

Hamburger Helper 
SHuRPHE 5 IS 

Sugar 
WILLIAMS ib OZ JUST ADD SW 

Chili Making 
tears a er 

Corn 	 

	49' 
$129 

99 4  
139 

594 

2 - 89' 
69' 

99' 
79 4  

3 _ $100 

2 - 89' 

THRIFT KING IBS OZ. 

Cake Mixes 
REG. 05, RUSH RIC. OR CHUNKY 

Peanut Butter Cups 	 
DIMON TT 01 

 Salad Dressing 	 
DAWN 52 OZ 

Dish Detergent 	 
SHURFINE 6.5 OZ. 

Tuna 

89' 

	 43' 
794 

994 

9109 

39 4  
59' 

4 - 900 

3 - sP)  

Game Hens 	 2,04, 1 2" 
SHURFINI 

Canned Ham 	 
MOINE 

Lunch Meat, 6 oz. 
Chuck Roast 	 
Sirloin Steak 	 

t 549 

594 
to $139 

$ 239 

TYSON m 01 CORIIUH 

MOINE 3 19 . 

Shortening 	  
DEL 01030317 01 

Corn, CS OR MK 

MG 05 HIRSITEN 

Almond Bars, 6 pock 	 

Ketchup 	 89' 
139 

HUNTS 32 02. 

DETERGENT 

Tide 84 oz. 
ofniLlo mans, 9.2 

4149 

3 _ $100 

925 

4199 
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Home for Christmas 
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Report your News 
to the 

ENTERPRISE 
759-4311 
Box 190 

Births 
Mr. and Mrs. Howard 

Mackey are parents of a 
daughter, Jenifer Ranette, 
born in Muenster Memorial 
Hospital on Friday, January 
18, 1980 at 9:34 a.m. weigh-
ing 7 lb. 61/2 oz. She is a 
sister for Rusty and J.R. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Michael 

Hofbauer announce the bir-
th of their son, Jacob Mar-
shall Hofbauer in Clay 
County Memorial Hospital 
of Henrietta, on Tuesday, 
January 22, 1980, at 3 p.m. 
weighing 8 lb. 1/2 oz. The  

grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. John Gaston of Illinois 
Bend, Mrs. Norma J. Dowd 
and Denis Hofbauer of 
Muenster. The great-grand-
parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Mike Schilling and Mr. and 
Mrs. Clem Hofbauer, all of 
Muenster, and Mrs. Emily 
Snapp and Mrs. C.L. 
Gaston both of Nocona. 
Jacob is a baby brother for 
John Michael. 

Alfred Bayer 
Guests of Mr. and Mrs. 

Alfred Bayer for a week of 
Christmas vacationing were 
their sons, Mel Bayer and 
Leon Bayer of Brewster, 
Washington and Larry 
Bayer of Baton Rouge, La. 
They were joined on Christ- 
mas Day by Mary Bayer of 

Fort Worth and Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Bayer and family 
of Denton. Leon Bayer, af-
ter working in Washington 
for a year has returned to 
Muenster. Mel Bayer has re- 

turned to Brewster and 
Larry Bayer has returned to 
Baton Rouge after their 
week of vacation. 

Tony Heitman 
Christmas dinner and 

supper and all day reunion-
ing were hosted by Mr. and 
Mrs. Tony Fleitman on Dec-
ember 25. Their guests were 
Mrs. Anna Jostwerner, An-
drew Fleitman, Mr. and 
Mrs. Eugene Fleitman and 
Tony and Lacrisha of 
Muenster, Mr. and Mrs. 
Paul Hermes and Weldon 

and Charles of Lindsay, Mr. 
and Mrs. Patrick Fleitman 
of Nocona, joining Virginia, 
Theresa, Alfred, Melvin, 
Donnie, Agnes, Nancy, 
Susan, David and Karla of 
the home. 

On New Year's Day, the 
same group was joined by 
Mrs. Jenny Schilling of St. 
Richard's Villa for a family 
party. 

Theo Miller 
The W.J. Millers hosted 

two family gatherings in ob- 
servance of Christmas. On 
Sunday, December 23 their 
guests were their children 
and 	grandchildren, 	the 
Robert Millers and Julie and 

Melissa of Muenster; the 
Terry Millers and Shawn 
and Chad of The Colony; 
the Alan Millers and Eric 
and the Jack Flusches and 
Greg all of Muenster, 
joining Mark Miller of the 
home. 

	

On 	Christmas 	Day 
Therese and Billy Joe hosted 
members of the Theo Miller 
family. Attending the 
covered dish dinner and all 
day gathering were the Stan 
Yostens and Paul Yostens of 
Fort Worth; the Herbie 
Miller family, the Tommy 
Felderhoff Sr. family, the 
Ervin Henscheid family and 
the W.J. Miller family all of 
Muenster; and the Ted 
Miller family of Sherman. 

The Randy Bayer family of 
Grapevine was unable to at-
tend. 

Mrs. Bonnie Hess 
Mrs. Bonnie Hess enjoyed 

having her family together 
for a Christmas reunion. At-
tending were Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Hess and family; Mark 
Hess and Bob Hess ail of 
Muenster; Mr. and Mrs. 
Denis Hess and family of 
North Richland Hills; Mr. 
and Mrs. Dave Hess and 
family of Lewisville; Steve 
Hess of Irving; Larry Hess 
of Denton; Frances Hess of 
Dallas; also Liz Thompson 
of Irving; Randy Whitehead 
of Lewisville. 

Very interesting for the 

family was seeing Frances 
Hess on TV, with the Dallas 
Cowboys Cheerleaders. 

Part of the picture was 
filmed at Scottish Rite 
Hospital where she is a reg-
istered nurse. Frances was 
shown moving a boy patient 
in a wheeicnair and was also 
in the group circled around 
the cheerleaders as they dan-
ced for the children. 

Dick Coins 
The Richard (Dick) Cain 

family celebrated Christmas 
early when they all were 
together for a covered dish 
meal in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. J.C. Christian in Lew-
isville on  December  23, to 
enable Mrs. Eula Grace 
Cain to be at St. Richard's 
Villa on Christmas Day. 

A gift exchange followed 
the noon meal. Attending 
were the Bill McCollums 
and Kelley and Tracey of 
Dallas; Mrs. Cain and the 
Wendell Richeys and Craig, 
Robynn, Todd, Stephanie 
and Melanie all of Muen-
ster, Nick and Neil Walter-
scheid and Brenda Hens-
cheid all of Muenster; the 
Chris Cains and Christin 
and Cory and the Dickie 
Cains and Troy, Scott and 
Shawna, and Tami and her 
husband Lynn all of Lake 
Murray Village, Ardmore. 

Also the Biff Whites; De 
Ann and Cody Trachta of 
Giddings; the Gene Hart-
mans, Jeanne, Pam and 
Doug of Denton. 

Ed Cler 
Mr. and Mrs. Ed Cler 

were surprised on Christmas 
Day with a visit from their 
son and family Mr. and 
Mrs. Gary Cler and Keith, 
Michael and Steven of 
Snohomish, Washington on 
their first trip to Muenster 
since 1975. 

They arrived on Decem-
ber 22, stayed with his sister 
and family, Debbie and Eric 
Randolph in Thackerville, 
Okla. and came to surprise 
his parents on December 25. 

Joining them were the 
Eric Randolphs and Melissa 
and Julie Wyatt; the Leon 
Fuhrmanns and family of 
Myra; the Tommy Young-
bloods and family of Spring-
town; the Mark Clers of 
Muenster and Jim, Doug 
and Tony Cler of Muenster. 
Christi and Jerry Bob Cash 
who visited her parents last 
Thanksgiving were unable to 
attend. 

The children and grand-
children of the Ed Clers 
were together again to see 
the New Year in at the fam-
ily home. Together they ob-
served the Mark Clers' wed-
ding anniversary, Jim Cler's 
birthday and Debbie Rand-
olph's birthday. The Gary 
Cler family left here on 
January 6, encountering 
snow and ice only after near-
ing Washington State, luck-
ily missing bad weather that 
was all around them, 

YOU CAN 

BANK 
ON IT! 

This early in the new 
year nearly everyone is 
still ticking off 
resolutions for 1980. One 
of the most common is to 
resolve to save. There are 
two crucial elements to this 
resolution. One is to get 
started. The second is to 
keep doing it after you 
start . 

How much you save is 
your decision, but everyone 
should make a real effort to 
save between five and ten 
percent of their income. 
This is a good practice to 
following financial planning 
whether you have a specific 
goal such as education) or 
just want the financial 
security created by such a 
savings plan. 

The best time to start is 
when you receive your next 
pay check. Determine the 
percentage you want to 
save . . . then open a 
savings account. Now, 
when you set up your 
budget for the year for 
week or month) include 
your savings. You'll be 
surprised how quickly 
saving can become an 
automatic habit and one of 
the most profitable  .  you 
can BANK on it! 

Muenster 
State Bank 

Washington Delicious Golden 

Muenster, Texas 
Member FDIC 



SALE SALE SALE 
is having 

a SALE 

right now 

Velour tops Transfers 
Satin Jackets Caps 

& much more 
Come and look around! 

:f v <ia4g4, 4 :a.z. .1,,:seA
tt 

i 

Beautiful new creations of 
The Flower Wedding Line 

by Regency 

ALSO... 
Thank you Cards...Shower & Party Invitations... 
Bridal Accessories...Wedding Memory Albums... 

Golden and Silver Wedding Invitations... 
Napkins...Place Cards...Birth Announcements 

FREE... 
I year subscription to Muenster Enterprise 

with order of wedding invitations 

Come In And See Our Samples 

MUENSTER 	  

ENTERPRISE INC. ,  

114:%ffifekle" 
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In TCIL District Tourney 

In the Hornets' game with Aubrey, Todd Richey 
shoots for 2. Also in the action are Floyd Felderhoff, 
Mark Felderhoff and Phil Wolf. -Janie Hartman Photo 

Muenster High teams 
were three time losers in 
their games at Pilot Point 
last week. While Hornettes 
and junior varsity continued 
their losing streaks, the Hor-
nets dropped out of content-
ion in their I4-A schedule. 

A combination of their 
own misfortune and a hot 
performance by the Bearcats 
explains what happened to 
the Hornets. Don Frazier, 
who has been a key man all 
season, was eliminated with 
a twisted knee early in the 
first quarter, resulting in a 
shake-up of game plan as 
well as a critical shortage of 
man power. The other fact-
or was a good exhibition of 
speed by the host team. 
Scores by quarters, with 
Pilot Point leading all the 
way, were 16-8, 37-22, 50-32 
and 66-53. Phil Wolf led 
MHS with 20 points (10 in 

. the fourth period) and Floyd 

Felderhoff was next with 14. 
Mark Felderhoff added 7 
and Ricky Winn and Todd 
Richey each 6. 

Junior Varsity girls were 
in contention for half of 
their game, trailing by coun-
ts of 8-6 and 12-10. But after 
that they went ice cold while 
Pilot Point continued its 
slightly better previous pace. 
Scores were 17-12 and 22-13 
ending the third and fourth. 
Sandy Wimmer made 8 for 
MHS and Renee Wimmer 5. 

The Hornettes, winless to 
date in 14-A were simply 
over-run by the Pilot Point 
gals, who are in the running 
for district honors. Scores 
by periods were 21-3, 42-11, 
61-16 and 80-27. Point 
makers for MHS were Wan-
da Schneider 8, Stephanie 
Richey 8, Renee Wilde 4, 
Kyla Hale 3, Judy Walter-
scheid 2. 

MHS Hornettes hold a st 
at half time in their game 
help them win. 

Muenster Juniors 
Junior High and Junior 

Varsity boys of Muenster 
Public School lost both ends 
of their double header with 
Aubrey's kids on the MHS 
court Monday night. 

The junior high team, 
made up mostly of seventh 
graders, had their usual pro-
blem of competing with 
mostly eighth graders who 
enjoyed a clear advantage 
and came out as a 27-14 win. 
David Winn, Ronnie Fisher 
and Cory Klement scored 8, 
4 and 2 respectively. 

Next game was equally 
one sided as Aubrey rolled 
on by scores of 7-0, 21-7, 29-
19 and 53-25. Kevin Feld-
erhoff made 7 for MHS, 
Wayne Carroll added 6, 
Steven Fisher 4, Michael 
Lewis 4 and Stanley Living-
ston 4.  

rategy huddle with Coach Nix 
with Aubrey. But it failed to 

-Janie Hartman Photo 

SH Teams Play 
Basketball teams of Sac-

red Heart High will close out 
their district season Friday 
and Saturday in a TCIL dis-
trict tournament hosted by 
Alamo High of Amarillo. 

The outcome will deter-
mine official standings of 
the loop. Until now the sea-
son had decided only who 
will play whom in the open-
ing games. Standings in the 
boys division are Christ the 
King 4-0, Sacred Heart 2-2, 
Notre Dame 2-2 and Alamo 
0-4. It means that starting 
opponents will he Christ the 
King and Alamo and Sacred 
Heart and Notre Dame. 

In the girls division the 
standings are Alamo 3-1, 
Christ the King 3-1, Notre 
Dame 2-2, Sacred Heart 0-4. 
The two top teams will flip a 
coin in deciding first game 
opponents. 

Closing out the regular 
season, the SH teams played 
Notre Dame there Wednes-
day and here Saturday, and 
both teams did better at 
Wichita Falls. The Tigers 
won 57-48 and the Tigerettes 
were leading when disaster 
hit them in the last period. 

The SH girls, after lagging 
behind 10-4 and 17-16 in the 
first and second, moved to a 
27-26 lead at the third. But 
their success did not last. 
Rhonda Endres and Virginia 
Bartush fouled out and Toni 
Hoedebeck went out with a 
sprained ankle. After that 
the ND gals took charge and 
gained to their 45-35 win. 
Scorers for SH were Toni 
Hoedebeck 10, Christy Feld-
erhoff 7, Carol Walterscheid 
6, Ginger Fleitman 6, Rhon-
da Endres 4, Sheltie Walter-
scheid 2. 

Toni Hoedebeck was still 
out of the lineup for the Sat-
urday game as the visitors 
gained by scores of 16-8, 26-
13 and 33-16 in three 
periods. Finally SH got or-
ganized in the fourth, but 
the rally was too little and 
too late. They trimmed the 
margin by 8 points as the 
score ended at 41-32. Tiger-
ette scores were made by 
Shellie 	Walterscheid 	6, 
Carol 	Walterscheid 	7, 
Christi Felderhoff 6, Virgin. 
ia Bartush 4, Ginger Heit-
man 2, Rhonda Endres 2, 
Donna Hess I, Nancy Sick-
ing I. 

The Tigers gained for 
three periods in their game 
at Wichita, leading by scores 
of 11-9, 29-19 and 44-28. 
During the fourth the 
Knights closed the gap to 57-
48 as SH reserves had a lot 
of the action. Mel Walter- 

scheid led the Tiger scoring 
with 20; Kirk Mollenkopf, 
Monte Endres and Kenny 
Hartman each had 9; Craig 
Walterscheid had 8 and 
Brian Bindel 2. 

At Wichita, Sacred Heart 
controlled the action, 
especially the rebounds, 
but the situation changed 
when the Knights came to 
Muenster. The visitors im-
proved on the floor and at 
the boards and played neck 
and neck with SH all the 

Aubrey Hi Sweeps 
Hard times continued for 

Muenster High basketball 
teams when Aubrey came to 
town last Thursday night. 
The Hornets, who made a 
good start in the district run, 
had a miserable night and 
dropped to a standing of 3-
2. Hornettes did a good job 
for three quarters but weak-
ened in the fourth, whereas 
Hornets TVs were simply 
outclassed by their visitors. 

Double troubles haunted 
the varsity boys for the 
second consecutive time. 
Don Frazier's injury, sus-
tained the previous game, 
kept him out of the lineup. 
And to make matters worse 
the team was under pressure 
of foul trouble since early in 
the game. Eventually four 
starters, Winn, Wolf and the 
two Felderhoffs fouled out 
and the Hornets finished the 
game with four reserves on 
the floor. Nevertheless their  

way. After a SH lead of 9-7 
at the first quarter and a ND 
lead of 20-16 at the half, the 
score was tied at 32 ending 
the third. Then came a 
fourth period see saw in 
which ND was ahead 44-43 at 
the buzzer. Tiger scorers 
were Kenny Hartman 9, Mel 
Walterscheid 8, Monte End-
res 7, Kirk Mollenkopf 5, 
Gene Fuhrmann 5 (plus an 
extra good defensive job), 
Mark Nasche 4, Craig 
Walterscheid 4. 

Series with MHS 
scoring progress was fair, as 
they trailed by counts of 15- 
10, 32-25, 49-36 and 69-60. 
The scorers were Floyd Feld- 
erhoff 14, Mark Felderhoff 
12, Todd Richey 11, Phil 
Wolf 10, Ricky Winn 6, 
Larry Fleitman 4, Scott 
Marquardt 3. 

The Hornettes were tied 
15-15 at the half and trailed 
21-19 at the third and fin-
ished at the short end of 29-
24. Their point makers were 
Carla Walterscheid 8, Wan-
da Schneider 6, Stephanie 
Richey 5, Sherri Hess 3, 
Kyla Hale 2. 

Junior varsity boys were 
outscored in all periods but 
the last as the counts were 
12-6, 30-16, 38-20 and 48-
32. Their scorers were Kevin 
Felderhoff 8, Gary Klement 
6, Wayne Carroll 6, Tony 
Otto 4, Glenn Fisher 4, Billy 
Grewing 2, Wylie Lewis Jr. 
2. 

Pilot Point Beats Three MHS Teams 

YVffl Walterscheid adds 2 in Sacred Heart's game with 
Christ the King as Brian Bindel, 40, is set for a rebound. 

-Janie Hartman Photo 

* * * * * * * * * * * * 

SPORTS 

Toni Hoedebeck tries for two in the Tigerettes game 
with Christ the King while Sheltie Walterscheid gets set 
for a rebound. -Janie Hartman Photo 

GOOD "USED" DEALS 
2 Good Used Practice Pianos 

* Story & Clark Console... $395
00  

* Koehler & Campbell Upright... $35000 

 * 
	* One large used Chord Organ...S1 9500 

roue 	 00* 
**Several good used Electric Guitars CHOICE 

s 
• ••
7c
• * 

qrt500 AuNPD 
...0(  * Several good used Band Instruments..."L 

See these and other super buys such as: 

41(  * New Kimball Spinet Piano... FOR ONLY
S89500  

ir * New Kimball Fun Machine... NOW ONLY 
$89500 A... 

* Financing Available 

Jhe MuJilue Shoppe 
Mastercharge 	 Visa 

105 N. Dixon, Gainesville, 817-665-0391 
Terry & Debbie Fowler, Owners 	 ...sr 	ru.ii 

YOUR COMPLETE DISCOUNT MUSIC STORE * * * * * * * * * * * * 

BROADWAY 

D4B 
MUS ■01.1f 
SolOPRE 



LOOK REALLY NEAT 

WITH OUR 

J).t, 

MILLER'S 
CLEANERS 

Call 665-3201 

W. Wye sins Grew Urn. 

329 N. Commerce 

T 8, L SHOES 

Ladies' Dress 
and Casual 

Save up to 50% on 
Ladies' Tall & Lo Boots 

202 North Dixon, Gainesville 685-6081 

The finest in Insulation 
and Storm Windows 

't I 4 

F 

well worth 
investing in... 

VININSsait> 

Community 
Lumber Co. 

Muenster 759-2248 

THE CENTER 

Garden Center 
Bulletin 

For you wood cutters, we have a 
large stock of bars, chains and 
sprockets to fit any size or brand of saw 
plus we can sharpen and repair any 
saw that needs it. We also have STIHL, 
ECHO and McCULLOCH chain saws to 
fit any need or budget. Come by the 
Garden Center for all your chain saw or 
gardening needs. 

It's time to plan dormant oil spraying 
of Fruit and Pecan trees for overwinter-
ing insects. Also check your evergreen 
EUONYMOUS shrubs for those small 
white scale insects that can cover the 
leaves and stems and cause death to 
the plant. These should be sprayed with 
dormant oil also. We have the oil in 
stock or if you prefer we will spray for 
you. Just give us a call at 759-2766. 

It's also fruit tree planting time. We 
have just received a large shipment of 
Fruit, Pecan, Walnut and some Shade 
trees. These should be planted as soon 
as possible to allow good root growth 
thru the winter 

Muenster Garden Center 
502 N. Main 
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MHS Wins 2 of 3 at Callisburg SCHOOL NEWS 

r(j 
to 

e, 

Tuesday was one of the 
better nights in Muenster 
High's basketball schedule. 
Returning from Callisburg 
the teams had a pair of wins 
out of their three game pro-
gram. Junior varsity girls 
and varsity boys won 25-20 
and 67-47 respectively and 
the varsity girls lost 56-16. 
As a result the Hornets now 
have a 3-3 standing in the 
14-A race and the Hornettes 
remain winless. 

Varsity boys had it their 
way from the start, includ-
ing the satisfaction of a 
minimum of foul trouble. 
After stepping out to a 17-12 
first quarter lead, they kept 
improving it for counts of 
32-18, 49-34 and 67-47. 
Todd Richey was the leading 
Hornet scorer with 18. 
Floyd Felderhoff made 16, 
Phil Wolf 11, Ricky Winn 7, 
Gary Klement 6, Kevin Feld-
erhoff 6 and Mark Felder-
hoff 3. 

JV girls started slow, trail-
ing 4-1 and 13-5 at the first 
and second but took charge 
in the second half. Ending 
the third they were near even 
with 16-15, then went on to 
a 25-20 win. Scores were 
made by Sherri Hess 8, 
Renee Wimmer 8, Sandy 
Wimmer 5 and Mary Winn 
4. 

The Hornettes game was 
no contest, as indicated by 
only 4 points out of 22 free 
throws. Meanwhile Callis-
burg went on and on in its 
56-16 run-away. MHS  

scorers 	were 	Stephanie 
Richey 6, Wanda Schneider 
4, Carla Walterscheid 2, 
Judy Walterscheid 2, Peggy 
Winn 2. 

The season's final show-
down will begin next week in 
a tournament style schedule. 
The Hornets first opponent 
will be named after Thurs-
day's game with Sanger. 
MHS girls will play their fir-
st tournament game Mon-
day, the 28th at 7:30 at Lin-
dsay. 

Because of the varsity 
girls game, junior high and 
junior varsity boys games at 
Sanger are postponed to 
Tuesday night. 

Teacher shortage 

AUSTIN, Texas (Sul.) —
Teachers are in short supply 
in Texas, says the director of 
placement in The University 
of Texas College of Educa-
tion. 

Dr. William Bennie at-
tributes the shortage to a 
number of factors the "job 
scare" in education several 
years ago when an oversupply 
of teachers caused students to 
go into other fields, the 
declining enrollment in educa-
tion because of continuing low 
pay for teachers, and the 
movement into Texas of more 
families 

He says the calls his office 
IS receiving now is not for 
next year's staff but for more 
teaching personnel im-
mediately 

Honor Roll For Jr. 

High, 2nd Quarter 
The Junior High honor 

roll for the second quarter 
has been announced as 
follows: 8th grade, Susan 
Walterscheid, Anne Felder-
hoff, Gus Reiter; 7th grade 
Sondra Hess, Connie Bayer. 

Honorable mention: 8th 
grade Jeannene Voth, Nicky 
Hess, Mark Hesse, Neil 
Hesse, Shannon Fleitman, 
Duane Haverkamp, Lorene 
Bartel, Rita Pels, Sara Stof-
fels; 7th grade Rose Feld-
erhoff, Le Ann Mollenkopf, 
Sandy Taylor, Kyle Walter-
scheid. 

College Representatives 
On Monday, January 28, 

College recruiters will visit 
SH HS to speak to the 
Juniors and Seniors about 
their respective schools. 
Each speaker has expressed 
an interest and willingness to 
meet with parents during 
their visit. The schedule is as 
follows: 9 to 10:30 repre-
sentatives from Midwestern 
University of Wichita Falls; 
10:30 to 11:30 representat-
ives from East Texas State 
University of Commerce; 
2:30 to 3:30 counselors from 
Cooke County College. All 
juniors and seniors of SHHS 
and parents and recent 
alumni are invited to attend 
these presentations, which 
will be held in the Sacred 
Heart Library. 

Baptism Anniversary 
Observed By SHS 
Kindergarteners 

Sacred Heart Kindergar-
ten children celebrated the 
anniversaries of their bap-
tism with a special Liturgical 
worship in the Convent 
Chapel on Thursday, Jan-
uary 24 with Father Denis 
Soerries as celebrant of the 
Mass. 

Dana Hess, Scott and 
Melanie Wilde, Chad Sim-
mons, Leah Walterscheid, 
Helmuth Koelzer, Jason 
Frost and Bernice Bartel ob-
served December or January 
baptismal anniversaries. 

For the entrance hymn 
they sang "Sing of the Glory 
of the Lord." After the first 
reading by their teacher, 
Sister Genevieve, they 
responded with the hymn 
"His Love is Everlasting." 
The reading of the Gospel 
and the homily by Father 
Denis preceded simple 
renewal of baptismal pro-
mises. 

After the song "He Called 
Me" each of the above 
eight children was called by 
name as a reminder that 

God called each one to be 
His adopted child through 

baptism. As each child re-
sponded he received a white 
crocheted star as a reminder 
of the duty to live as God's 
children. 

Symbols used in the ad-
ministration of the 
sacrament of baptism were 
presented at Offertory. 
Misty Vogel carried a lighted 
candle. Kristi Bierschenk 
carried the white garment. 
Lisa Schilling carried the 
water. This water was 
brought from the River 
Jordan by Sister Genevieve 
when she traveled in the 
Holy Land in 1972. 

The Eucharistic gifts were 
presented by Cheramie 
Moster, Kristen Klement, 
Cindy Schilling and Vickie 
Bayer. 

The children sang "This 
Loving Heart of Mine" at 
Offertory and "Children, 
Hear Lord Jesus Calling" 
for Communion. The Mass 
ended with the hymn "This 
Little Light of Mine." 

Forestburg Class 
Hears Earl Fisher 

On Tuesday, Jan. 15, the 
Forestburg Senior Con-
sumer Education class wel-
comed Earl Fisher of the 
Muenster State Bank to lead 
a discussion on Consumer 
Banking. Mr. Fisher 
presented information on 
the history of banking, 
checking accounts, con-
sumer credit and careers in 
banking. 

The class will complete 
Personal Checking Account 
kits as an introduction to 
their next unit which will be 
Understanding Income 
Taxes '79. In this unit, each 
student will be able to com-
plete his own tax 1040 or 
1040A form based on eligib-
ility requirements. The class 
thanks Muenster State Bank 
and Mr. Fisher for devoting 
time to the class. 

M. Grewing Heads 
MHS Annual Staff 

Mark Grewing heads the 
Muenster Hornet Annual 
Staff as editor. Others 
chosen on January 17 were 
Claudia Flusche as business 
manager, Beverly Truben-
bach in charge of Copy, Jo 
Ann Gibson in charge of 
Lay-Out, and Brent Mc-
Elreath in charge of Activit-
ies. 

Mark has served on the 
annual staff for the past 
three years; Claudia has 
served one year; Bev has 
been on the staff for four 
years; Jo Ann for two years 
and Brent is serving for his 
first year. 

Members of the Annual 
Staff made the selections on 
merit. Mrs. Nancy 
Perryman is the Advisor. 
Their goal is to complete the 
Annual during the '79-80 
school year. 

Honor Students 
Two Muenster students 

are included on the Dean's 
List of the Fall Semester just 
announced at Southwestern 
Oklahoma State University. 
They are Judy Krahl and 
Christopher Schilling. 
Requirement for the honor 
is a grade point average of at 
least 3, a minimum load of 
at least 15 hours and no 
grade lower than C. 

Forestburg FHA 
Sets Goal for MOD 

Forestburg FHA's regular 
meeting on January 9 feat-
ured a talk on teenage preg-
nancy by Kay McClure of 
Life Planning Health Ser-
vices and a film entitled 
"Woman Child." 

In observance of the an-
nual March of Dimes Cam-
paign, the chapter has 
adopted a goal of $100 for 
birth defects. 

The entire chapter plans 
to attend the area FHA 
meeting in Abilene on the 
weekend of March 7-9 when 
Leann Hays will be the 
chapter candidate for area 
officer. 

News of 4-H 
The Muenster Commun-

ity 4-H Club meeting on 
January 15 was attended by 
18 members, one adult lead-
er and Extension Agent Lin-
da Moody. 

John Zimmerer presided. 
Members discussed the 
following projects: Photo-
graphy II, Livestock, Dairy 
Judging and Clothing. 

Linda Moody talked 
about conserving energy; 
also about various ways to 
heat and cool a home. 

Amy Davidson is reporter 
for the Muenster Commun-
ity 4-H Club. 

PTO Meeting Hears 
Talk on Nutrition 
Mrs. Doris West of the 

Fort Worth Education Ser-
vice Center, Region XI 
spoke to members of the 
Muenster PTO during their 
regular meeting on January 
21 at 7:30 p.m. She dis-
cussed Nutrition and urged 
them to use nutrition kits 
available from her office, 
for future meetings and 
study. 

Anticipating coming even-
ts which they will sponsor at 
Muenster Public School, 
members of the Muenster 
PTO set the date of the an-
nual Arts and Crafts Show 
for March 4, during Public 
School Week. Also set were 
the Junior High Banquet for 
April 22 and the All Awards 
Banquet for May 5. 

Blue Jays News 
The second grade Blue 

Jays held the January 7 
meeting in the Baptist Church 
Taking part was Vice Pres-
ident Tony Grewing in the 
absence of President Donnie 
Boydstun. Also taking part 
were Erin Perkins secretary, 
David Rohmer treasurer, 
Jeff Hellman and Billy Cov-
ington, who led the Blue Jay 
Wish and Pledge to the Flag, 
respectively, and Jimmy 
Herr sentry and Joe Wein-
zapfel reporter. Troy Berres 
and Troy Pagel served 
chocolate chip cookies and 
fruit punch. 

The boys began their 
"Blue Jay Trail to Happi-
ness" by learning two camp 
songs taught by Meredith 
McDaniel. The room was 
left clean and tidy by the 
clean-up committee of 
Michael Abney, Stephen 
Koelzer and Jason Walters-
cheid. 

Friday, January II was 
Blue Jean Day. 

Jr. Olympics 
The Student Council 

sponsored Junior Olympics 
Day, beginning at 1:30, with 
all classes participating. 
Winners were determined by 
total number of points ac-
cumulated. Games were 
penny drop, football in a 
basket, pencil on a string, 
and free throw, with all 
members of the classes 
taking part. Then 8 boys and 
8 girls from each class part-
icipated in cheerio on a 
toothpick, balloon pop, and 
thread in order named, 
sophomores, juniors, 
seniors, freshmen. 

- -- 
Thursday, January 17 was 

Senior Day. All seniors were 
allowed to wear blue jeans. 

Friday, January  25 is Fray 
Day - counting for points 
for Super Class. On Fray 
Day everyone wears sun-
glasses. 

- -- 

Annual 
Senior pictures and pic-

tures of groups and clubs 
were made for the Annual 
on January 8. The next day 
the class of 1980 group pic-
ture was made. 

Civics Class 
Many students of the 

Civics Class attended the 
Gainesville City Council 
meeting on January 15, 
where they viewed proced-
ures. 

SH School Menus 
Jan. 28 - Feb. 1 

Mon. Fried Ham, mashed 
potatoes, corn, whipped 
dessert, bread, milk. 
Tues. Spaghetti and Meat, 
green beans, apple sauce, 
hot rolls, butter, milk. 
Wed. Railroad Pies, com-
bination salad, corn bread, 
pears, butter, syrup, milk. 
Thurs. Fried Chicken, rice, 
gravy, peas, cranberry 
sauce, bread, milk. 
Fri. Toasted Cheese Sand-
wiches, tomato soup, ap-
ples, celery sticks, milk. 

Joint-Assembly 
Sacred Heart High School 

attended a joint-assembly 
with Muenster Public High 
School in the MHS Auditor-
ium on Wednesday, January 
23. The speaker was a for-
mer member of the Unifi-
cation Church. 

COR S.1 

• 
COP1 S.1 

If you need copies fast... 

One or a hundred... 

We can furnish Quick, 
Clear Copies from 

almost any original. 

MUENSTER 

ENTERPRISE 
INC. 

117 E. First, 759-4311 

Restaurant & Tavern 

Features homemade pizza, 
Steaks and your favorite 

beer and wine. 	/ 
.7 . 

Friday Nights 

Catfish Special 	■ ec, 
Includes. Baked potato or french fries, salad 	l .si  

ALL YOU CAN EAT $395•‘..044(.1,  

p.m. Sun•Thur.,40."- ?.■ „te A, 
CLOSED MONDAYS e.),•0 

 ,
.,.‘4 ,:■̀ " 

Kitchen closes et 10 p. 	

,(s t,,,  
ti,x,  6k..) ,,krte clay 

L5.22 E Division. Muenster. . ....,(<7 ,,,,
,1/4, 	

A 
.y..v.  , 1.  
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 COMPLETE 

FUNERAL 

SERVICE 

Nick Miller 
Funeral Home 

- 54-1.112 

Gainesville's only 

pharmacy with a 
druggist on duty 

at 7:30 a.m. 

Open 7:30 a.m to 8 p.m. 

Watts Bros. 
Pharmacy 

Gainesville 

11/2 Price 

Department Store in Gainesville 

Announcing the good news? 

Wedding line 
Invitations 

Over 400 samples of outstanding engraved 
and thermographed wedding invitations, 
announcements, novelty cards, person-
alized napkins, matches and accessories for 
any occasion. 

More and more brides arc finding they can 
have the luxury look they love and still 
keep on the sunny side of their bridal 
budgets with exquisite Regency station-
ery. It features the three lettering styles 
below and Heliograving.' -an amazingly 
rich, raised lettering with all the good taste 
and distinction of the finest crafts-
manship-yet costs so little. See our ex-
citing selection of contemporary and tradi-
tional type faces and papers one, perfect 
for you! *Hehograving- not to be confused 
with engraving 

Abbot Alfred Visits 
Abbot Alfred Hoenig of 

Corpus Christi Abbey 
visited in Muenster Tuesday 
through Friday of last week 
with his brothers and sister, 
members of the Hoenig re-
lationship. One day he ac-
companied Mr. and Mrs Joe 
Vogel and Mrs. T. Vogel to 
Rhineland where they visited 
another sister and her hus-
band, Mr. and Mrs. Leo 
Fetsch. 

Busch Breweries 
Sell 46.2 Million 
Barrels in 1979 

Anheuser-Busch, Inc., the 
world's leading brewer, sold 
46.2 million barrels of beer 
in 1979, another all-time 
record for any brewer in a 
single year, it was announ-
ced today by August A. 
Busch III, chairman and 
president of Anheuser-
Busch Companies. Inc. 

The 1979 barrelage repre-
ents approximately 26.6 

per cent of estimated total 
brewing industry sales in the 
U.S. (including imports), 
compared with 1978 barrel-
age representing ap-
proximately 24.7 per cent of 
:otal industry sales. Anheu-
ser-Busch sales in 1979 re-
flect an increase of 4.6 
million barrels, or 11.0 per 
.tent, over the company's 
1978 beer sales volume of 
41.6 million barrels. 

Mr. Busch said that the 
1979 record barrelage "un-
derscores the momentum 
and fundamental strength 
with which Anheuser-Busch 
enters the 1980s, and re-
affirms our commitment to • producing only superior 
quality, naturally brewed 
beers. 

"Our 1979 sales results 
and those of preceding years 
reflect solid, steady growth 
and the strength of the in-
dustry's most balanced pro-
duct line," he added. 

"Through 1979, Anheu-
ser-Busch has led the brew-
ing industry in sales for 
23 consecutive years. That is 
a remarkable testimony to 
the quality of our products, 
to the dedication of our em-
ployees and to our 950 inde-
pendent wholesalers nation-
wide," Mr. Busch said, ad-
ding: "There is no doubt 
that we will continue to lead 
the industry in the years 
ahead." 

Mr. Busch said that in 
1979 production at the com-
pany's ten breweries was at 
an all-time high. In fact, 
third quarter sales in 1979 
were capacity-constrained. 
"Our employees established 
more than 300 production 
records during the year and 
capacity utilization during 
that time was virtually 100 
per cent," he said. 

Anheuser-Busch is the 
brewer of Budweiser, Mich-
elob, Natural Light, 
Michelob Light and Busch 
beers. 

Tips on Avoiding 

Freeze Damage to 

Landscape Plants 

Homeowners can take 
certain steps to reduce or 
prevent freeze damage to 
landscape plants, says Neil 
Tibbets, county agent with 
the Texas Agricultural Ex-
tension Service, Texas A&M 
University System. 

To reduce the likelihood 
of freeze damage, especially 
to evergreen plants, be sure 
to mulch root areas to pre-
vent low soil temperature. 
This allows continued up-
take of moisture and less 
chance of dehydration. Do 
not allow soil to become ex-
cessively dry. Water 
thoroughly before a freeze 
but do not water while 
ground is frozen. 

Tibbets suggests covering 
choice plants with large 
cardboard containers or by 
wrapping them with 
polyethylene film. If film is 
used, be sure to remove 
whenever direct sunlight hits 
it, as extremely high temper-
atures can develop and cause 
more damage to the plant 
than that caused by the cold. 

Do no be over-anxious to 
remove plants that appear to 
have been killed by a freeze, 
adds Tibbets. Often 
damaged plants will send 
out new shoots from the 
roots. Unless they are bud-
ded or grafted plants, new 
growth will be the same as 
the original plants. 

Careful pruning to en-
courage compact growth 
will produce an attractive 
plant. Be sure to remove 
dead or damaged wood by 
pruning to good, sound 
tissue. However, wait until 
new growth starts before 
pruning so you can deter-
mine the extent of injury, 
advises Tibbets. Pruning too 
soon can result in removing 
too much uninjured wood or 
having to repeat the pruning 
operation because not all 
dead tissue was removed. 

Bonds 

The Odds Against You ... Want to guess your 
chances of having a car accident this year? One in 
a hundred, or one in fifty? ... Both answers are 
far too optimistic. The fact is that one in every frac 
American drivers is involved in an automobile ac-
cident every year .  .  . It the day to day driving 
that gets you, too. Three out of every four crashes 
that result in deaths occur within 25 miles horn 
home. Moral wear your seatbelt. all the time 

Read it and Weep! This year America will send 
S60 billion overseas to buy foreign oil. Over half 
of all the oil toe use goes for transportation. Were 
petroleum junkies, and we may become the first 
people in history to drive ourselves to the poor-
house . Just driving at the speed limit would be 
a big help: the average car gets 20 percent better 
fuel economy at 55 instead of 70 

111VEirray 
CLEARANCE 

Broken Sizes 
Winter Robes, 

Gowns 
and Pajamas 

Children's Wear 
sportswear, robes, gowns, knit suits 

1/2 of 1/2 price 
Shop all Depts. for Markdowns 

Chich 

HOW HIGH 
IS YOUR 
E... nisi 

 

The AssericonEccromc System. 
Vile shoal d locos stare °bait t. 

fiN 

12.75% °""''' Corporate 

r 	U S Government 
Guoranteed 

10.25% $5,000 

Minimum 

Isdsrei Income Tor Fro• 

Featuring 
3 groups of lettenng styles: 

Regular Lettering-the results are lovely, cor-
rect and ever popular with budget-minded pur-
chasers. 
Photo Lettering-an advanced electronic 
photo-lettering technique. Permits elegant 
toned script lettering and fine line detail. 
Genuine Copperplate Engraving-the ulti-
mate in graphic arts quality Each plate is 
meticulously hand-crafted to give your an-
nouncements unquestionable dignity, prestige 
and social correctness 

One to two weeks delivery! 

MUENSTER 	  

ENTERPRISE INC. 
759-4311 

Don't forget that the time for the 
German Fun Run is closer than you 
think. Dan Hamric and Harold 
Flusche recommend that all you 
runners start getting in shape! 

Watch for the 

Hungry Hippo II  
Coming to Muenster 

9.00% 

Irv: Edward D. Jones G. Co. 
For Complete petal's Mote or Call 

mo-seers wow Yon Won Exchange,. 

CNUCI CARNIVAL' 
I Est Stole Bonk Bldg - e i S E Col.( orneo - Prn 305 

817 , 665 - 0351 - Games v o le Teyos 76240 

iolniooulonnwiMmnownoo015.0oyonehondosno4/W 
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City Of Muenster - Treasurer's Report 
Period beginning October 1, 	1978 
and ending September 30, 	1979 

GENERAL FUND 
Receipts: 
1978 taxes 	  $48,238.01 
Delinquent taxes  	553.63 
Penalties  	216.33 
Building permits  	120.00 
Tennis Court  	17.00 
Fines  	14,625.00 
Licenses  	475.00 
City Sales tax  	93,005.94 
Garbage Dept.  	34,534.27 
Return checks collected  	156.50 
Wrecker Fees collected  	344.50 
Tax certificates  	9.70 
Swim pool  	3.055.70 
Franchise tax  	23,154.19 
Refund from Hwy.Dept.  	26,451.94 
Mowing  	89.00 
Royalties  	312.15 
Mixed drink tax  	967.78 
Solicitors permit  	15.00 
Dog Pound  	22.80 
Accounts Receivable  	390.00 
Insurance  	201.72 
Miscellaneous  	7,562.96 
Social Security  	3,473.87 

Total Receipts 	  $257,992.9 

Expenditures: 
Police Dept.  	50,366.02 
Fire Dept.  	4,365.00 
Street Dept.  	45,858.41 
Health & Sanitation  	1,227.32 
Park Dept.  	5,573.25 
Swim Pool  	5,818.56 
Administration  	23,204.83 
Garbage Dept.  	50,275.97 
Brush Control  	5,363.13 
Wrecker fees  	674.00 
Library contribution  	3,100.00 
Return checks  	156.50 
Transfer to W & S Fd.  	5,000.00 
Accounts Receivable  	575.00 
Miscellaneous  	20,542.95 
Utility Adjustment  	17,187.04 
Social Security  	3,473.87 
Unemployment Ins.  	194.89 

	

Total Expenditures  	242,956.74 

Balance October 1, 	1978  	$ 26,778.03 
Add: Total Receipts 	 257,992.99 
Total cash available  	284,771.02 
Less: 	Total expenditures 	 242,956.74 
Balance September 30, 	1979  	41,814.28 

REVENUE SHARING FUND 
Receipts: 
Government checks  	$11,989.00 

Total Receipts 	  $ 	11,989.00 

Expenditures: 
Public Transportation  	27,006.72 

Total expenditures  	27,006.72 

Balance October 1, 	1978 	  $ 	15,594.50 
Add: 	Total Receipts 	 11,989.00 
Total Cash available  	27,583.50 
Less: Total Expenditures 	 27,006.72 
Balance September 30, 	1979 	 576.78 

WATER AND SEWER REVENUE FUND 

Receipts: 
Social Security 	  $ 	1,580.64 
Water and Sewer Sales  	103,972.20 
Insurance  	67.24 
Return checks collected  	304.91 
Water permits  	525.00 
Sewer permits  	300.00 
Transfer from Gen. Fund  	5,000.00 
Miscellaneous  	1,177.25 

Total Receipts  	112,927.24 

Expenditures: 
Social Security  	1,580.64 
Insurance  	67.24 
Water Maintenance  	43,806.14 
Billing  	872.69 
New Construction  	1,398.00 
Return checks  	304.91 
Administration  	9.793.25 
Certificate of Deposit  	12,000.00 
Transfer  	7,325.00 
Miscellaneous  	1,525.03 
Disposal  	21,463.50 
Sewer New Construction  	888.90 
Sewer extension refunds  	1,025.00 
Sewer maintenance  	2,840.63 
Unemployment Ins.  	67.12 

Total Expenditures  	104,958.05 

Balance October 	1, 	1978 	 s 	7,940.77 
Add: 	Total Receipts 	 112.927.24 
Total cash Available  	120.868.01 
Less: Total expenditures 	 104.958.05 
Balance September 30, 	1979  	15,909.96 

INDEBTEDNESS 

Street Improvement Bonds, 	1962 	 38,000.00 
Less payment 	 5,000.00 

Net Outstanding  	33,000.00 

Water and Sewer Revenue Bonds, 	1962 -.0,000.00 
Less payment  	3,000.00 
Less Int.&Red. Fund  	5,505.00 
Less Reserve Fund 	 7,200.00 	15.705.00 

Net Outstanding  	78,293.00 
Total Indebtedness 	   111,29. 1.00 _ 	_ 	_ 

Submitted 	by Mrs. 	Celine Dittruvtli, 	City S.-cu,-Nary 



THE IN LOOK OUTLET 

FABRIC SALE! 
Our Complete 

NOW 50% off 
Of Our Regular Low Prices 

DRESSES and Misses 6 to 16 
Sizes 3 to 13 

Wide assortment 2 for $10 or $7 each 
Special group 2 for $8 or $5 each 

The Inlook Outlet 
212 E. California St., 688.8351, Gainesville 

Store Hours 9 to 5, Monday thru Saturday 

Inventory 
of Fabrics 

master charge 

NOT 
AIR 

C010' 
AIR 

BURN WOOD/SAVE ENERGY/SAVE MONEY 

ThirecNIOGRATE 8  

• Fireplace Furnace Inserts 
• Free-Standing Fireplace/Stoves 

Featuring patented stainless steel tubular heat 
exchanger design for high heat output & efficiency. 

• 'Enough to heat a house.' 	• U.L. tested and listed. 
• Works in a power outage. 	• Easy installation. 
• Full-view 'picture window' doors. • Burn wood, coal or paper. 

\ 

Contact: 

TED 
HENSCHEID 

HOT 
AIR 

COLO 
AIR 

THE NU-U HEALTH CLUB 

PreJenti 

Tanning Rooms 
For tA• first two* rn w• or• of loring 
cam.•.once of "or round tonn, 

Available for 
Men and Women 

.2 Moyle% pools 2 hours el sun 
• Sofitt. ea way to ton 

health
, 

 y look All year 
• In•Apenstv• 
• Srnooth Aosn ton Flo blistering 
• Ton all ovor ortvot• booty 

o•ohntoton• 
•Cool 	 •rspironon 

Tanned is In! 

	

5.. Is ass Iwo le M • tomber 	1/..0 11.1r1 
CM to enjoy N. Maim; mow. CO Mar I. 
were details, 

NU-U HEALTH CLUB, INC. 
81,01111 

Wildflower Calendar Sales 
Aid Native Plant Crusade 
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Make-Ahead Meals To Please The Family 
A wildflower poster cal-

endar which lives long after 
the year is exhausted is now 
in its seventh edition and is 
growing in popularity each 
season. 

The calendar's increasing 
popularity is a good thing 
for the originator--Carroll 
Abbott of Kerrville, the 
state's only fulltime wild-
flower seed and plant 
collector. 

Sales of the calendars help 
fund Abbot's crusade to 
save the native plants of 
Texas by getting folks to  

grow wildflowers in their 
homescapes, in city and 
state pa.sks and on school 
grounds. 

The 	big 	calendar 
measurets nearly two by 
three feet in full color and is 
bordered with 22 individual 
portraits of the most 
popular Texas wildflowers. 
A tranquil

--
landscape with 

windmill and country cabin 
decorates the center. 

The "Beautiful, Beautiful 
Texas" calendar never dies, 
Abbott saK because the in-
dividual poitraits are useful  

later for framing and de-
coupage work. And the 
centerpiece often is 
laminated between plastic 
sheets for a place mat. 

The calendar also serves 
as an educational tool. An 
accurate description is given 
for each plant, along with its 
botanical name. Many 
teachers use it as a class-
room aid. 

The calendar is available 
by mail for 53.90 each, 
which includes sales tax and 
postage, from Green 
Horizons, 500 Thompson, 
Kerrville TX 79028. 

Homemakers Hear 
Landscaping Talk 

A program of Landscap-
ing by Mrs. Henderson of 
Woolfolk Nursery was pre-
sented to the Hood Extens-
ion Homemakers Club on 
January 16 at 1:30 p.m. in 
the Community Club Build-
ing. Mrs. Henderson 
discussed planning and 
planting of lawns, gardens, 
flower beds, trees and 
shrubs. 

Lawane Pyrot was host-
ess. Members discussed the 
district meeting in Gaines-
ville; also an all day meeting 
on March 27 with a lun-
cheon included at the Com-
munity Center. 

The next meeting of the 
Hood Extension Home-
makers Club will be on Feb-
ruary 20 in the club build-
ing, with a program on 
Family First Aid. 

Jimmie Lyn Harris of 
NTSU, Denton, was a guest 
of her grandmother. Mrs. 
Harold Walterscheid, Fri-
day through Sunday. 

Dinner Doldrums? Here's a 
trio of hearty, one-dish meals 
guaranteed to collect family 
praise, All offer make-ahead 
convenience, a reprieve for 
the food budget, and terrific 
homemade flavor. 

Pairing cheese and meat adds 
to the gusto of these savory 
casseroles from the Kraft 
Kitchens. Combining these 
protein partners, is a good 
way to vary your everyday 
menus. It's also a good way 
to stretch a small amount of 
meat. For example, Meatball 
Casserole uses eight ounces of 
process cheese spread to ex-
tend a half-pound of ground 
beef into six servings. 

Natural and processed cheeses 
are excellent protein alterna-
tives. Cheese has no waste 
and doesn't shrink in cooking, 
so every pound purchased can 
be eaten. 

Cheese is also versatile. It's a 
good accompaniment for al-
most all vegetables. Broccoli, 
cauliflower, and tomatoes are 
some familiar combinations. 
Though not so common, 
cheese and cabbage is also 
a delicious duo, as this recipe 
for Hearty Cabbage Casserole 
illustrates. 

Mixing several types of cheese 
is another palate pleaser. For 
example, mozzarella, grated 
parmesan, and cottage cheese 
are tastily teamed in Marve-
lous Mostaccioli. This recipe 
is also adaptable. It micro-
cooks in less than 15 minutes 
and it freezes well. Complete 
make-ahead directions are in-
cluded for this main dish and 
the others which can be made 
oven-ready "the day before" 
and refrigerated overnight. 

Meatball Casserole 

1/2 lb. ground beef 
1/2 cup cracker crumbs 

1 egg 
1/4 cup chopped onion 
1/4 teaspoon salt 

Oil 
2 cups cooked rice 

Dash of pepper 
1 8-oz. jar Cheez Whiz 

pasteurized process 
cheese spread 

An indication of the 
growing popularity of the 
American Cancer Society's 
Memorial Program was 
given today- by Horace 
Lesley, of.,fthe Society's 
Cooke Unit. J.? ' 

"The 	'growth- ,of 
Memorial giving is due to a 
keener public appreciation 
of the fact that more tools 
are needed in the fight 
against cancer, Mr. Lesley 
said. 

He pointed out that re-
search against the disease 
has progressed so rapidly 
that there has not been 
enough money available to 
follow-up on the many new 
leads which have been un- 

1 10-oz. pkg. frozen 
chopped broccoli, 
thawed, drained 

1 cup chopped tomato 
1/4 teaspoon basil 

1 tablespoon Parkay 
margarine, melted 

Combine meat, 1/4 cup crack-
er crumbs, egg, onion and 
salt; mix lightly. Form into 
12 meatballs; brown in oil. 
Combine rice and pepper; 
place in bottom of 1-1/2 qt. 
casserole. Cover with meat-
balls. Combine process cheese 
spread, broccoli, tomato and 
basil. Pour over rice and 
meatballs. Top with remaining 
cracker crumbs tossed with 
margarine. Bake at 350°, 
30 minutes. 
4 to 6 servings 

To make ahead • Follow recipe 
directions, omitting cracker 
crumb topping. Cover and 
refrigerate overnight. Add 
cracker crumb topping and 
bake, uncovered, at 350°, 
45 minutes. 

Hearty Cabbage Casserole 

8 cups chopped cabbage 
1-1/2 cups onion rings 

4 rye bread slices, cubed 
1 lb. pork sausage links, 

cooked, drained 
2 tablespoons Parkay 

margarine 
2 tablespoons flour 

1/8 teaspoon pepper 
1/2 cup milk 

Velveeta pasteurized 
process cheese 
spread 

Parboil cabbage and onions 
7 minutes; drain. Make a white 
sauce with margarine, flour, 
milk and pepper. Add 1/2 lb. 
process cheese spread, cubed; 
stir until sauce is smooth. 
Layer half of cabbage mix-
lure, bread and sausage in 
1-1/2 , quart casserole. Repeat 
layers of cabbage mixture and 
bread; top with sauce. Let 
stand 5 minutes before bak-
ing. Top with remaining sau-
sage. Bake at 350°, 30 
minutes. Top with additional 
process cheese spread slices; 
continue baking until melted. 
6 to 8 servings 

covered in recent months. 
"Research against cancer 

has widened tremendously, 
and most scientists now be-
lieve that the disease will be 
conquered before many 
mote years have passed," he 
slated." 

NU. Lesley said that the 
Memorial contributions 
received by the Cooke Unit 
of the American Cancer 
Society are made not only as 
remembrances of those who 
have died of cancer, but fre-
quently in honor of happier 
events, such as birthdays 
and anniversaries. 

"Some contributors," he 
said, "have established the 
habit of making Memorial 
gifts at regular intervals 
during the year." 

Every Memorial con-
tribution is acknowledged 
with a dignified card naming 
the person in whose memory 
or honor the gift is made. 
This card is sent to the per-
son designated by the con-
tributor. The card does not 
state the amount of the gift. 

Report your News 
to the 

ENTERPRISE 
759-4311 
Box 190 

Public Notice 
Texas Power & Light Company, in accordance 

with provisions of the Public Utility Regulatory 

Act of Texas, hereby gives notice Of the Com-

pany's intent to implement new schedules of 

electric service rates in areas served by the 

Company, effective February 8, 1980, or as soon 

thereafter as permitted by law. 

The rate schedules will result in a 15.35 per 

cent increase in the gross revenues of Texas 

Power & Light Company. 

A complete copy of the new rate schedules is 

on file with the Public Utility Commission at 

Austin, Texas, and With each affected munici-

pality, and is available for inspection' in each of 

the Company's public business offices. 

TEXAS POWER & LIGHT COMPANY 
A lax-paytng. invoslotownod oloctrIc lsfflfty 

6-HOUR SALE 
SUN DAY 

All Merchandise Will Be 

4 0 % to 5 0 % 
OFF 

January 27, 1980 
12:00 p.m. till 6:00 p.m. 

We will be closed all day Saturday 
in preparation for this sale 

plassie Furniture 

Viollections 
2003 E. H Vvy. 82, Gainesville, 665-7323 

Memorials Aid in Cancer Campaign 

To make ahead: Follow recipe 
directions. Cover and refriger-
ate overnight. Uncover and 
bake at 350°, 45 minutes. 

Marvelous Mostaccioli 

1/2 lb. Italian sausage 
1/2 cup chopped onion 

1 16-oz. can tomatoes 
1 6-oz. can tomato paste 

1/3 cup water 
1 teaspoon oregano 

leaves 
1/4 teaspoon pepper 

8 ozs. mostaccioli 
noodles, cooked, 
drained 

3 cups (12 ozs.) shredded 
Casino natural low 
moisture part-skim 
mozzarella cheese 

1-1/2 cups cottage cheese 
1 teaspoon marjoram 

leaves 
1/4 cup (1 oz.) Kraft 

grated parmesan 
cheese 

Brown meat , add onion . 

Mrs. Doyle Hess Is 
Mrs. Doyle Hess was the 

shower honoree Sunday, 
January 6 when three host-
esses, Mmes. Joyce Mon-
day, Pat Wimmer and Patty 
Hess entertained at the 
TP&L Building. 

Corsages were given to the 
honoree and the future 
grandmother, Mrs. Kate 

Cook until onions are tender; 
drain. Stir in tomatoes, toma-
to paste, water and seasonings. 
Cover; simmer 30 minutes. 
Combine cottage cheese and 
marjoram. Layer half of noo-
dles, meat sauce and mozzar-
ella in an 11.3/4 x 7.112-inch 
baking dish; spread with 
cottage cheese mixture. Re-
peat layers of noodles, meat 
sauce and mozzarella cheese. 
Sprinkle with parmesan 
cheese. Bake at 350°, 30 
minutes. 
6 to 8 servings 

To make ahead: Follow recipe 
directionS Cover and refriger-
ate overnight or freeze. When 
frozen, thaw before baking. 
Uncover and bake at 350°, 
50 minutes. 

Microwave directions: Assem-
ble according to recipe direc-
tions. Microcook uncovered 
on high for 12 to 14 minutes 
or until center is bubbly. 
Rotate dish one-half turn 
after 6 minutes. 

Honored at Shower 
Wilson. The paternal grand-
mother, Mrs. Caroline Hess 
was unable to attend. 

About 35 guests were pre-
sent. After gifts were dis-
played, refreshments of cake 
and punch were served. •iber 
cake was baked by Charlotte 
Dangelmayr in the shape of 
a baby buggy and decorated 
in traditional pink and blue. 
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WE BUY & SELL stamps. coins. 

antiques...What do you have??? R. 
E. "Bob" Wallace. Wallace Anti-
ques, Stamps and Coins, 306 E. 
Highway 82 Nocona, Texas. Open 
7 days, 825-4827. 10-1 

ELIMINATE EXCESS WATER 
with Aqua Ban Diuretic tablets 
from the Discount Pharmacy. 
Muenster. 10-1 

Modern Floors and Fabrics has 
renewal stickers for car license 

plates. 46-tf 

Yes! We are still in the cleaning 
and pressing business. NICK and 
ADELINA MILLER. 10-tf 

FOR TALE 
FOR SALE: 	queen 3 

wheel bicycle. Excellent condition. 
Odeha Detten, 759-2818. 	10-2p 

WHEAT SPRAYING. Call Dia-
mond's Flying Service, Gary Dia-
mond. 665-1556 or 665-3572, 
Gainesville. 9-4p 

FOR SALE: 20%40 FT. BARN to 
be moved, and 3 METAL RABBIT 
HUTCHES. Call 736-2371 after 5 
p in. 10-tf 

TACKED COMFORTS for sale. 
Dacron batting. Full size and queen 
size. For added comfort. For a cozy 
winter. Lined with terry cloth for 
easy laundering. See to appreciate. 
Mrs. Herb Fella. Myra, 736-2371 

9 t! 

YEAR END fr, 

SALE 
KIRBY r, 

Vacuum Cleaners 
f $139.00 & up 

SINGER 	if, 

t Sewing Machines 
j 	$99.50 & up 	Yi 

Sales & Service rri 
835 E. Calif., 865.9112 j 

PROTECT YOU and your house 
while you sleep. Smoke alarms 
available at Community Lumber 
Company. 37-tf 

TANKS .  Septic tanks, stock 
tanks, grain tanks, water tanks, 
Will install. Bayer Concrete. Phone 
759-4244. Muenster. 

HAY FOR SALE 
Kansas & S. Dakota 

alfalfa. Call 665-4698 
or 668-8066. 

6-tf 

INSULATE for comfort and 
economy. Community Lumber Co. 
Muenster. 52-If 

PRE FINISHED 
PANELING 

in stock at 
Community Lumber Co. 

Hudson 
Stock Tanks 

Round 2 ft. to 8 ft. 
Oblong 2 x 4 ft. 

up to 3 x 8 ft 

In Stock 

Wil-O-Mac 
Gainesville 

CO,s,RETE WORK: Any kind 
of a concrete job, or furnish ready 
mix concrete. Bayer Concrete. 28-tf 

REDUCE SAFE and fast with 
GOBESE TABLETS and E-VAP 
"water pills;" Muenster Pharmacy. 

6-6p. 

WRANGLERS 

Shoes - Boots 
Work Dress Western 

Nocona Boots 

FOR SALE: 1972 OW Pick-up, 
Rex Simmons, Ph. 759-4301 after 
5:30 p.m. 8-If 

LIVING ROOM DIVAN and 
Chair for sale. Call 759-4113 after 5 
p.m. 8-if 

We sell and install 
propane tanks and 

equipment 

SCHILLING 
Propane Service 

7592505 P.O. Box 532 
Muenster. Texas 76252 

en: 
TRACTORS 
For sale or lease 

Agriculture and 
Induatry 

CASE POWER 
AND EQUIPMENT 

Albert Zirnrnerer 
865-4314 

Calves for Sale. 150 to 250 lb. 768- 
2778 	 44-t f 

EARKIInstallotICRI 

OuslIRMARE. 1  

DALE'S 
CARPET 

SHOP 
CARPET TILE 

LINOLEUM 

319N Commerce 

OalnamIlle, 

PI10. 885-2208 

FOR SALE: Western Flyer Boy's 
Bicycle, maroon, excellent condit-
ion, Bobby Hartman, 759-4225 a -
ter 5 p.m. 6-if 

FOR SALE: Cemetery Monu-
ments, all sizes. Reasonably priced. 
See 1. P. Flusche or phone 759-2205 
or 759.2203. 4811 

See 
Tony's Seed 

& Feed 

for 
Seed Wheat 

and 
Seed Oats 

Select & 
Certified 

501 

Chain 
Saws 

Stihl, McCulloch 

and Echo 
Repairs and sharpening 

on ALL brands 

Muenster 
Garden Center 

48.0 

MOBILE HOME for rent, 2 bed-
room, fully furnished, a block from 
school on N. Walnut. Ph. 759-
2268, Jerome Pagel. 16-tf 

NOW LEASING 

U-Store and Lock 
Mini Storage 

759-4212 
514 E. lat. SL, Muenster 

Call 

Dan Luke 
759-2522 

FOR 

FINA GAS 
FINA OIL 

FOR REnT 

I WAN 
NOW TAKING applications for 

the custodian position at Forest-
burg Independent School District. 
Contact Mr. H.K. hind, Superin-
tendent by letter, Box 415, Forest-
burg, 76239 or phone 817-964-2323 
or come by the Superintendent's of-
fice. 10-4 

$356.00 WEEKLY guaranteed. 
Work 2 hours daily at home. Not a 
rip-off. Free brochure and appli 
cation. ED 1402 Greencove, Gar-
land, Texas 75040. 1tf 

Metal Sales, Inc. 
On Highway 82 

wen of Gainesville 

TED  
WANTED: Director of Nurses, 

R.N. preferred, for a health care 
facility. Excellent benefits, paid 
vacation. Frontier Manor, 1907 
Refinery Rd., Gainesville, Tex. 
76240, 665-0386. 9-2 

WANTED: LYNs, full time and 
part time, for a health care facility. 
Excellent benefits. Frontier Manor, 
1907 Refinery Rd., Gainesville, 
Tex. 76240, 665-0386. 9-2 

Office Help 
Wanted 

Endres Motor Co 
759-2244 

Sewing Machine Repairs 
All makes & models. In our store or 
in your home. 
Gehrig Sewing Center, 759-4112 

12-tf 

PLUMBING 
Instalbstion & Repel, 

Residential & Commerical 
FIXTURES, SUPPLIES 
McDonald Water Pumps 

Robert Russell Plumbing 
759-4155 
Muenster 

31-If 

CUSTOM FARMING: Disking, 
chiseling, tilling and applying 
anhydrous. Also Rome Plowing old 
fields or pastures, preparing land 
for bermuda grass. J.H. Bayer. 
759-2924 3-If 

"SPECIAL" 
"CARPET CLEANING" 

SAVE ONE THIRD 

JANUARY SPECIAL 

SPARKLE CLEANING 
SERVICE 

865-6501, Gainesville 

9-2 

Inquire of our services when in 
need of, automobile, farm 
machinery, commercial or personal 
loans. Or, checking amounts, 
Saving Accounts, Safe Deposit 
Boxes. Travelers Checks, Cae-
lion and Exchange, Drive-in Service 
and 24 hour depository. 

MUENSTER STATE BANK 
A full Service Bank, 
Member F.D.I.C. 

Buy, Sell, Rent, Trade, 
Enterprise Classified 

FOR SALE: 3-Bedroom House 
For Sale, Muenster Near Schools 
(2141 361-8052 (call after 5:00 p.m. 
during weekdays) 10-If 

ARNOLD HEAD 
Office (817) 668-7716 
Home (817) 668-8803 

301 N. Grand, Gainesville 
29- 

NEW HOMES 2, 3, and 4 bed-
rooms. Priced $30.000 to $55,000. 
95 percent financing available. Shag 
target, fireplace, ash cabinets. 
Frazier A Rodgers Construction 
Co.. 665-5343, 1209 N. Grand, 
Gainesville. 

The Jaycees Need YOU! 
Contact any member to 
join. 

Bob's 
Auto Service 

A/C Service 

Auto Transmission Serv. 

Engine Overhaul 

Car & Truck Elec. Serv. 

Radiator Repair 

R. D. Walterscheld 
759.4474 

37-tf 

PAINTING 
Interior or Exterior 

Accoustic ceiling blowing 

Wallpaper hanging 

Staining Spray painting barns 
and fences 

Ronnie Fleas Painting Co. 

Ronnie Hess, 759-4864 
Allen Truebenbach, 759-4522 

38-tf 

Dozer Service 
Call or See 

Frank Hess 
759-4249 

DON'T BE 
STUCK-UP 

on Wallpaper. 

I will hang wallpaper its new 
homes or remodeled. Call Rita 
Russell, 759.4155 after 7 p.m. 

27-tf 

G & H Backhoe 

& Dump Truck Service 

Herman Crewing, 
Bernard Hesse 

Sewer Systems 

Oil Field & Industrial Work 

Ph. 759-4130 or 759-4304 
Mobil Ph. 759-4812 

Automotive Machine 

Shop Service 
grind salves - bore blocks 
grind crankshafts - custom 

engine building 
Schmkilkoter 

Automotive Inc. 
835 N Grand Ave 

Gainesville 668-7241 

50 Acres, 230 Acres, 
150 Acres, 411 Acres 

DON FLUSCHE 
Real Estate Broker 

FOR SALE IN MUENSTER 
BY OWNER 

3 bedroom house, horse barn, 
hay barn, and 31/2 acres. 

excellent facilities. 
Call 759-2259 or 759-2512054f i 

633 Acres 
Wooded & Rough 
North of Muenster 

on good road 
Pi iced Very Low 

Financing available 
DON FLUSCHE 

Real Estate Broker 
759-2832 

4-tf 

FOR SALE 

Muenster 
Electric 

COMPLETE 

Call 759-2581 
or see 

Flo Walterscheid 
2 

IN STOCK 
Electrical - Plumbing 
Paneling - Roofing 

Hardware - Water Pumps 
Heating - Air•conditioning 
We can recommend an installer 

Muenster Building Center 
Muenster, Ter 759-2232 

CALL CAROLYN WALTER-
SCHEID FOR MARY KAY COS-
METICS, 759-4128. 

	

GLASS: Plate, window, auto- 	J. R. Hooker 

	

mobile, furniture tops, mirrors. 	Men's & Boys' Store 
Complete glass service. We handle 207 N. Commerce, Gainesville 
Insurance claims. Gainesville Glass 
Shop, 665-3321,311 N. Chestnut. 

374 

2 tracts of land located about 6 759-2832 	 34-tf 
miles northeast of Muenster. 186 
acres at $675 and 100 acres at 5600. 
Town & County Real Estate. 1209 
M. Grand. Gainesville, 665-0419 or 
665-2641 24-tf 

Classified Ads, 759.4311 

Sr 

SERVICE ) 

USED 
TELEPHONE 

POLES 
For Sale at 

COMMUNITY 

LUMBER COMPANY 
43-If 

CERAMIC TILE. New and old 
installation. For estimate call Ted 
Henscheid, 759-4280. Muenster. Si! 

FIREWOOD for sale by Muenster 
Jaycees, call Jerry Reed after 6 
p.m. at 759-4598 or Dave Fette at 
759-4311 or 2894. 51-tf 

REGISTERED ANGUS BULLS 
FOR SALE 

665-5639 
'A 

Tomi Sue Hess 
759.2588 

Joni Sturm 
759.2724 

Are 	servicing 	Jan 

Cain's MARY KAY 

CUSTOMERS. Please 

call for re-orders, free 

facials and delivery 3211 

For Home Delivery of 
Fort Worth Star Telegram 
or Dallas Morning News 
Call Bill Tidwell collect 

458-7828, Bs. 546. Sanger. lb-if 

Trailer Parts 
and Supplies 

Structural Steel 

and Pipe 

Complete Line 
of Bolts and 

Miscellaneous 
Hardware 

OSBORNE HAWKINS 

presents the 

tu_9:=7' 
Will buy, sell, trade 

or appraise all types 

of real estate 

(REAL ESTATE) 

Attention Farmers & Ranchers 
Free Removal of Fresh Dead 
or Disabled Horses and Cows 

Call Collect 817-665-0763 
Call as soon as possible for prompt service 

24 hour service 	 7 days a week 

Gainesville Stock Removal Co. 
2 	east of Gainesville on Highway 82 

New modem facilities ... Clean sanitary trucks 

New Kirby 
VACUUM 

CLEANERS 
, 09 W. Calif., 665-254 

Hudgins 
Gainesville 

Carpets, Vinyl, Tile 
Custom Drapes 
Wall Coverings 

Carpet (leaning 
Fabrics, Notion, 

and Patterns 

Modern Floors 
& Fabrics 

206 N. Main 759.2848 

GARY'S 
FINA STATION 

Beer, Ice, Diesel, 
Tire Repairs, 

Mechanical Work 

759-2982 
5 1. 10 

REALISTIC 

40 WATT 
AUTO SOUND 

POWER 
27 BOOSTER , 95  

Radio Mat* 
DEALER 

Gainesville Shopping Center 

HELP WANTED 
Part Time Waitress. 

Must be 18 years of age. 
Apply in person at The Cen- 

ter Rertamant & Tavern. 
10-tf 

.- • 

Gift Hewn 
Slid Plants 

for all 
, Occasions. 

1.. Wrapping and 
."` 	delivery avail. 

RessonAbl, pm," 

Muenster 
Garden Center 

759.2788 

KINDIGER'S 
GARAGE 

Autos, Trucks, Tractors 
Gasoline or Diesel 

Reasonable Rates on 

Tuneup, Overhaul, 
Oil Change & Lube, 

Transmission Service, 
Brake Work, Welding 

Joe Kindiger 
On Rosston - Leo Road 

768.2786 
50t f 

W.C. Electric 
Specializing in Oil Field 

Electric equipment 
Single phase, three phase & phase converters 

W.C. Muller 	759.4517 
Mobile phone 665-8561 Unit 416 

Home phone 726-3613 

HELP WANTED 
We need experienced help for immediate em-

ployment in the best equipped factory in the 

North Texas area. 

Paid Holidays, Paid Vacations 
Hospitalization, Profit Sharing 

JR. ELITE 
Dress Manufacturing Co. 

120 N Sycamore, Muenster 

Permanent and 
Full Time Help 

Wanted 
Russell Newman Mfg. Co. 

Saint Jo, Texas 

Apply Monday through Friday 
8 a.m. to 2:30 p.m. 

HI I 

FRiGiDuRE 

SALES 
and 

SERVICE 
Billy Bob Phillips 

Formerly with 
Personality Furniture 

PHILLIPS SALES CO. 
301 W. Broadway 

868-8833, Gainesville 

STORM WINDOWS 
Made in Our Factory 

All types of 
glass repair. 

FREE Estimates 

Energy Efficient 
Home Products 

503 Summit, Ave 
Gainesville, 817-665-9738 

9-1 ■ 	 

FINE DIAMONDS 

WATCHES, JEWELRY 

WATCH REPAIR 

KOESLER JEWELRY 
Muenster 

N  

SEWING MACHINES 

VACUUM CLEANERS 

STEREOS, TAPES 

Records 6 Accessories 

SALES 6 SERVICE 
ALL MAKES 

Hudgins 
209 W. Calif., Gainesville 

Phone 885-2542 
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Let the Sunshine In! 

Greenhouse Windows 
Inquire at 

Muenster Building Center 
817 759.2232 

Political 
Announcements 

For Representative 
Dist. 17, U.S. Congress 

CHARLES W. STENHOLM 
(Re-Election) 

Pol Ad pd. Carte,enholm 

For Judge 
235th Judicial District 

LARRY B. SULLIVANT 
(Re-Election) 

Pal Ad pd hr Larry Sulipant 

For Judge 
16th Judicial District 
W.C. (BILL) BOYD 

(Re-Election) 
Psi Ad pd br W c Boyd 

For County Sheriff 
BILL PRATT 
(Re-Election) 

Poi At pd by Bdi Nati 

For Commissioner 
Precinct 3 

JERRY LEWIS 
(Re-Election) 

Pol. Ad. r4. by Jena teals 

Real estate expert 
predicts a scarcity 
of mortgage money 

COLLEGE STATION —

Recent fluctuations in the 
prune interest rate. the rate 
!milks charge their hest custom-
ers. xi ill scud shuck waves 

through the Texas home mort-
gage rates, predicts a Texas 
A&M University real estate ex-

pert. 

Dr. Jack Friedman. head of 
the Research Division of the 
Texas Real Estate Research 
Center at Texas A&M, said 
mortgage funds in Texas will no 
doubt heroine scarce and that 
could cause a slowdown in both 
new home construction and the 
resale of existing homes state-
wide. 

The present prime rate, corn-

Mned with an already tight 
money policy, will surely cause 
a scarcity of mortgage money 
from supply and demand stand-
points. added the expert. 

Texas Ports Reporting Dramatic 
Increases in Exports of Cotton 

At ;SI 1N--Coiton, once the 
undisputed king of traffic 

from Texas Gulf Coast pons, 

may be in the process of 
regaining its crown, accord-
ing to Agriculture Commis-
sioner Reagan V. Brown, with 

port authorities reporting 

recent dramatic increases in 
export activity there as the 
highest waterborne move-
ment from the state in almost 
10 years. 

"Large movements of 

cotton to the People's 

RCpUblIC of (. 11 Ina arc 

accounting for the bulk of 

export increases from Texas 
ports." Brown explained. This 
has been bolstered by the fact 

that cotton shippers have 
been switching in recent 
months from minibridge 

movement via the West Coast 
ports to the Gulf port facilities 
due to container shortages 
and West Coast port 

congestion." 

The bulk of the cotton 
going out of the Gulf Coast 

inventory Clearance 

Sate 
now in progreJJ 

&ery1hin Reduced 

2 blocks north of courthouse Gainesville, Tx. 78240 

103 West Broadway 
	

Vic Schneider, Mgr. 

g4Lngs 

e0/71. 97.0/11 "  

665-6762 

GET GOING EARLY 
Winter is the time to get your 

lawn and garden equipment 

ready for use in spring. 

Cold Weilthel, condensation and lack of use can serlouely hamper the porlor• 
rnerice of your engine. Be ready for the season ahead by bringing your awn 
and garden equipment to us now runup or rne1 0,  oaeMeui. we have  fre.tenir, 

 Veined mechanics using origins! Briggs Stratton parts. to work irefully 
and unhurriedly in restoring power 
and performance to your engine"feu" . 

 When Spring arrives Mere will No 
eedless welling or delay for 	arr . no n 

using your overact equipment . 

0:033:1311ED)  
Our trained mechanics use 

special tools and genuine re-

placement parts to put your 

equipment into running op-

eration. 

GAINESVILLE MAGNETO 
SERVICE 

411 W groodyvoy 
	

665.625 1  

Muenster Milling Company, Inc. 
'The Feed People-Serving The North Texas Area Since 1947" 
• Liquid Feed • Dry Feed • Veterinary Supplies • Wire-Twine 

"Specializing In High Quality Dairy Feed" 
-vs. say Ocala" 

• Drying & Storage Facilities Available 

817-759-2287 Muenster, Taus 

U
M  

Quality 
Feeds 

ANNOUNCING 
THE NEW 

21/2-YEAR $100 
MONEY MARKET 

CERTIFICATE FROM 
FIRST TEXAS SAVINGS. 
TIE DOWN TODAY'S HIGH RATES FOR 2 1/2 YEARS. 

10.400 
11.1 

(Effective January 1-31, 1980) 

AND NOW FIRST TEXAS SAVINGS HAS 
NEW 3-MONTH CERTIFICATE OF DEPOSIT RATES: 

Annual Rate Minimum Term Minimum Deposit Annual Yield 
6.00% 	3 months 	$50.00 	 6.18 0  

• Secured by assets in excess of 1.6 billion dollars. 
• Statewide convenience of over 60 offices. 

Annual yield reflects interest earned on principal and accumulated interest tor a full year 
Federal regulations require a substantial interest penalty on early withdrawal of principal on these t erhficates This is a 

limited nitre and ma, he wnhdsmS n iiilhhu I prior not!". 

WHEN IT COMES TO MAKING MONEY GROW, 
WE HAVE A GREEN THUMB. 

Rate 

Yield 

Fl EXAS 

Home Office—Dallas, Texas 

Savings Association 
Region Office: 

400 North Travis St . 
Sherman (75090) 

893-8191 

Muenster Office: 
501 E. Division 

759-2283 Member FSLIC 

FABRIC 
SALE 

50% 
OFF 

One Rack 
i1 per yard 

"Come and See What's 
New for Spring" 

Modern Floors & Fabrics 
759.2848 	 Muenster 

One-Armed Gandy Dancer 

ports. primarily !tom i he 

bumper 5,7 million bale Texas 

crop, is being exported break- 
hulk instead of by containers. 

Port of Galveston's 
expected shipment of more 
than two million hales by the 

end of the year puts the 
annual total there up sharply 
over 1978 while Corpus 

Christi officials report that 
their movement of more than 
150,000 bales in 1979 is three 
times that of a year ago. 

Figures available from Port 
of Houston authorities show' 
nearly 491.000 bales shipped 

out through August, 1979, an 
increase of 38 percent over the 
same period a year earlier . 

kii441 II IMMILA 

JL
—
' MIMI! 

111111111.iii 
Pm 

Cotton exports from Texas port facilities have reached 
their highest levels in nearly 10 years, according to 
Agriculture Commissioner Reagan V. Brown. Large 
movements of cotton to the People's Republic of China 
account for the bulk of the Texas exports which have been 
bolstered by a switch to Texas facilities due to West Coast 
container shortages and port congestion. 

A long, claw-like arm that can install 2,000 ties in an average day has taken much of the 
physical labor out of the ongoing task of maintaining the nation's railroads. Santa Fe Railway 
has installed some 5 million new ties during the past three years to ensure a smooth ride for the 
300 freight trains that speed along its tracks every day. There are about 60 million ties under 
the rails on Santa Fe's system, most of which last about 35 yew, Ties are made primarily from 
hardwoods and impregnated with a creosote solution under pressure. Wooden ties are still the 
most practical and economical, although Santa Fe has experimented with concrete ties and 
ties that have been recycled. 

Greater Demand for Texas Pork 
Boosts State's Hog Inventory 

	

AUSTIN--Latest monthly 
	

Texas Crop and Livestock 

	

hog and pig count, showing 
	

Reporting Service, to greater 

	

some 910,000 animals on 
	

demand for pork by 

	

hand in Texas. represent a 
	

consumers. 

	

seven percent increase over 
	

Breeding hogs were 4 

	

the same period a year ago. 	percent below the number of 

	

according to Agriculture 
	

December 1978. but market 

	

Commissioner Reagan V. 	hogs were up 9 percent with a 
Brown. 	 total of 780,000. 

	

Brown attributed the 
	

Commercial slaughtering 

	

mcreasc in the Dec I. 1979, 	- plants in Texas reported that 

	

inventory. completed by the 
	

by the end of November 

1.214.900 hogs had been 
slaughtered. 25 percent above 

the same period in 1978. 
Brown said that apparently. 

producers expected the 

demand for pork to continue 
to he strong in the first part of 
1980 with farrow ing during 
the September-November 
1979 quarter up 9 percent at 

98.000 head. Producers 
indicated, however, that there 
will be cutbacks in farrowings 

of 13 percent through May 

1980, according to the 
Reporting Service. 

"Agricultural 	producers. 
like everyone else in business. 

are approaching 1980 with 
some caution," Brown said. 

"Energy costs are still 
unpredictable. and possible 

increases in feed prices are 
another factor they must con-
sider.• 
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5 
SAVES 
LIVES 

equipment 
operators! 

Here's a man's ho , , t 

every step of the way ! 

Rugged, handsome, 

ready fur a rough day's 

work anytime. Easy on 

the feet. too. Stop in-

try on Pecos by Red 

Wing and be convinced ,  

LOST 
LUGGAGE 

209 N. Commerce 
Gainesville 

EFFECTIVE JANUARY 1, 1980 

NEW  
2 1/2 YEAR CERTIFICATE 

✓ Compounds interest daily. 
✓ Pays 1/4 of 1 5/ more than banks. 
,-Has a term of 2 1/2 years. 
✓ FSLIC insured to $40,000. 
✓ Minimum deposit of only $100. 

January 
Rates 

Yields 
Annually 

10.40% 
10.96% 

TATO til 	
Minimum 

Account 
 

Rate 	 Term 	 Deposit 

Pass Book 	5.50% = 5.65% Day to Day 	$5.00 

Certificate 	6.00% = 6.18% 90 days 	 $100 00 

Certificate 	6.50% = 6.72°/ 	1 year 	 $100.00 

Certificate 	6.75% = 6.98% 2 vi years 	$100.00 

Certificate 	7.50%= 7.79% 4 years 	 $ 100 00 

Certificate 	7.75% = 8.06% 6 years 	 $100 011 

Certificate 	8.00% = 8.33% 8 years 	 $100 00 

Money Market Certificate, 11.886%, based on U.S. Treasury. 

Bills (simple interest). Effective January 24 thru January 30. 

Minimum deposit, $10,000.00 for 6 months, yield $600.19. 

Substantial penalty for early withdraw's 

Nome OM. 
N Mason pn 1566.0318 

1020N Grand 
GaIrtasvilio.le ■ As 713240 

FSLIC FIRST • 
alit/7E5S 

and ,Zan _43,ociationreowie 

Local Convenience Numbers 
Muenster Memorial Hospital .. 759.2271 I 
Muenster City Hall 	  759-2236 I 
Muenster Fire Station 	 759.2235 I 
Muenster Police Dept. 	 759.2236 I 
Emergency Police after 5 pm 

Sat., Sun. & Holidays 	 736-2288 I 
Highway Patrol, toll call 	 665-4131 I 

or 668-7777 I 
Gainesville Sheriff's Office 	 665.3471 I 
Sacred Heart Rectory 	 759.2511 I 
First Baptist Church 	  759.2772 
Rosston Fire Dept. 	  759.2235 I  
Myra Fire Dept 	  736.2311 

or 665.3434 
Forestburg Fire Report 	 964.2200 
Muenster Telephone Co. 	 759-2251 
Muenster Enterprise 759-4311 I ====== A 

IN STEP 

MARCH OF DIMES 1980 National 
Poster Child Betsy Burch repre-
sents more than 250,000 babies 
born annually with birth defects. 
Betsy, 6. from Stone Mountain, 
Ga., was born with webbed fingers 
and a malformed right leg. She 
has had 14 operations to correct 
both problems 

665-1522 

Hairs! lists 

Is the number to 
call for a Professional 

Precision Haircut. 

CUTTERS NORTH 	1. 

Grond 	OPEN 6 DAYS A WEEK 	For oppoontrnen, 

Moro 	Mondoy-Fridoy 9AM 6PM 	soli 

Gonm,nne 	Saturday 	9AM-4PM 6651 522 

We're building today 
for tomorrow's 
opportunities. 

Texas is one of the notion's most exciting stores 
for companies looking to relocate their 
headquarters or for sires for major branch 
expansion. And, for good reason-we offer 
much that is more onroc-tive than in many 
other areas of the country. Included in that is o 
dependable supply of essential electric power 
or reasonable rotes. 

Were building electric plants today ro serve 
our present customers ... and to provide 
ample power for the business, industry, and 
people who will be moving ro our port of the 
store in years to come. And, we think that's 
important because new companies create 
new jobs and bring many other benefits that 
improve the quoins,' of life throughout our 
entire area 

TP&L feels it's important to build to assure 
dependable service today . but were also 
building for tomorrows 
opportunities. 	 rpii 

. I . EXAS POWER & LIGHT (X)MPANY 
A te,-papn, investor-owned electric uhlity 

Start the year off right with 
a new Victor Cash Register 

Now... an Electronic Cash 
Register at a Mechanical Price! 

the Victor 
511ECR 

You get 
all these 

benefits from 
this sophis- 

ticated Electronic 
Cash Register System... 

❑ itemized customer receipt 

❑ automatic tax and change computation 

❑ five control totals 

❑ automatic taxable and non-taxable sorting 

❑ locked-in detail audit tape 

fl many other standard features to provide complete 
management control 

Check Out Victor, 	$69500 
The Money Managers. Terms Available 

Frank Dustin 
Office & School Supplies 

110 N. Dixon, Gainesville 

'tr111111111 	r rit 
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Many large, migratory 

birds, such as geese, who 
mate for life, do so out of 
necessity. After migrating 
thousands of miles to their 
nesting grounds they 
don't have time to court a 
new mate each year. 

CITATION BY PUBLICATION 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

TO: Herbert Steed and Herbert 
Steed, Jr., Et Al, Defendants, 
Greeting, 

YOU (AND EACH OF YOU) 
ARE HEREBY COMMANDED to 
appear before the 235th District 
Court of Cooke 'County at the 
Courthouse thereof, in Gainesville, 
Texas by filing a written answer at 
or before 10 o'clock A.M. of the 
first Monday next after the expir-
ation of forty-two days from the 
date of the issuance of this citation, 
same being the 14th day of January 
A.D. 1980, to Plantiff's Petition 
filed in said court, on the 27th day 
of September A.D. 1979, in this 
cause, numbered 79-411 on the doc-
ket of said court and styled O.M. 
QUATTLEBAUM, Plantiff, vs. 
Herbert Steed and Herbert Steed 
Jr., et al, Defendants. 

A brief statement of the nature of 
this suit is as follows, to-wit: 

Suit to clear cloud cast on title of 
land, being all that certain lot, tract 
or parcel of land situated in the 
state of Texas, Counties of Grayson 
and Cooke, being 8 acres of land 
out of the John Morris Survey, Ab-
stract No. 724, described as 
lollows: 

BEGINNING on the North line 
of the said Morris survey at the 
Northeast corner of the 52 acre 
tract out of said Survey conveyed 
by J.B. Morris et ux to J.T. 
McLaughlin by deed recorded in 
Vol. 104, Page 609 of the Deed 
Records of Cooke County, Texas; 

THENCE South 308.81 varas; 
THENCE North 45 deg. East 

425.05 varas to the North line of 
said Survey; 

THENCE West with said line 
300.83 varas to the place of be-
ginning. 

If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after the date of 
its issuance, It shall be returned un- 
,erved. 

The officer executing this writ 
shall promptly serve the same ac-
cording to requirements of law, and 
he mandates hereof, and made due 

return as the law directs. 
Witness, Bobbie Calhoun, Clerk 

of the District Court(s) of Cooke 
County, Texas. 

Issued and given under my hand 
and the seal of said court at Gaines-
ville, Texas this the 14th day of 
January A.D. 1980. 

Bobbie Calhoun Clerk, 
District Court 
Cooke County, Texas. 
By Donna Shaver, Deputy. 
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IT HAPPENED 
40 YEARS AGO 

Jan. 19, 1940 
Muenster sewer project 

gets $25,781 grant from 
WPA. Report of Civic 
League and Garden Club 
cemetery committee shows 
$1,363.85 spent on beautifi-
cation project. Elfreda Luke 
is elected president of Young 
Ladies Sodality. Statistics 
for S.H. Parish show the 
following: total members 
1380, marriages I1, bap-
tisms 48, solemn commun-
icants 21, pupils in school 
324, in grammer grades 283, 
in high school 41. H.S. 
Wilde opens implement 
agency in Gainesville. Fun-
eral services are held in 
Gainesville for Mrs. Matt 
Pulte. Mrs. Rosa Bezner, 
86, of Lindsay, dies. 

35 YEARS AGO 
Jan. 19, 1945 

Joseph Hacker, 69, dies 
after short illness. Some 70 
young farmers will take 
physical examinations for 
military service this week. 
FMA members re-elect J.B. 
Klement president. Mayor 
J.M. Weinzapfel is guest 
speaker at Garden Club 
meeting. City council warns 
that livestock ordinance 
must be observed. Werner 
Henscheid is named presid-
ent of Holy Name Society. 
Mrs. Ben Seyler is elected 
president of St. Anne's 
Society. Joe Walter ends 
tour of duty in the army. 
Cpl. Michael Kupper of 
Lindsay is reported missing 
in action in the European 
Theatre. PFC Alphonse 
Felderhoff, twice wounded 
and twice hospitalized, is 
back in action with his 
paratroop outfit. J.M. 
Weinzapfel is elected presi-
dent of North Texas Water-
works Association. Ed Swir-
czynski is back in the states 
after seeing action in the 
South Pacific. 

30 YEARS AGO 
Jan. 20, 1950 

E.A. (Babe) Felker, 53, 
dies suddenly of heart at-
tack. Earl Walterscheid is 
hurt in oil field accident. 
FMA report shows more 
cheese but less money during 
past year. Tommy Dankes-
reiter, II, breaks right leg in 
fall. Delphene Derich-
sweiler, 10, breaks collar 
bone. Carrie Roberg is re-
covering from tonsillec-
tomy. Donald Endres gets 
Air Force discharge. Lin-
dsay Young Ladies Sodality 
elects Margaret Fleitman 
president. Scoutmaster Nick 
Miller and local group of 
adults attend annual county 
banquet for Boy Scouts 
leaders in Gainesville. 

25 YEARS AGO 
Jan. 21, 1955 

City hires engineer for 
construction of improve- 
ments to waterworks and 
sewer system. Mrs. E.E. 
Ballinger, 70, lifelong resid- 
ent of Marysville, dies. 
Brother Elmo of St. Ed- 
ward's University addresses 
300 youths and parents here 
at deanery CYC meeting. 
Muenster Lions hear district 
governor at luncheon meet- 

ing. First baby born in 
Muenster this year is James 
Wylie, son the Stan Wylies, 
who arrived at the local 
clinic Jan. 13. Mr. and Mrs. 
Nick Block observe silver 
wedding anniversary at Lin-
dsay. Mr. and Mrs. Keith 
Thompkins of Denton an-
nounce the birth of a son 
Jan. 19. Local relatives at-
tend wedding of Opal Raef 
and Leonard Walterscheid 
in St. Francis Church, Pot-
ter County. 

20 YEARS AGO 
Jan. 22, 1960 

Six charter members of 
the original 45 were present 
and received 50 year pins at 
the golden jubilee obser-
vance of the Muenster 
Knights of Columbus Coun-
cil Sunday. Lively election 
awaits Lindsay voters in the 
first balloting for town 
council officials on Jan. 26. 
Jerry Hoenig escapes injury 
when tractor turns over and 
pins him to the ground for a 
half hour until help came to 
free him. Pat Stelzer is honor 
graduate at ETSC. Joyce 
Tempel is named city secret-
ary. Scout Mothers elect 
Mrs. Herman Hartman 
president. Lu Ann Reiter 
and Theresa Fisher win 
homemaking awards. Larry 
Walterscheid and Betty 
Wamble marry. Louise 
Hermes wins homemakers 
award at Lindsay. Paul 
Fisher is among Farm 
Bureau presidents at Waco 
meeting. Work starts on new 
homes for Ed Schneider and 
Albert Schilling. Windthorst 
loses six classrooms in high 
school fire. Mrs. John Feld-
erhoff has major surgery in 
Wichita Falls. Karen Endres 
is recovering from append-
icitis operation at Gaines-
ville. 

15 YEARS AGO 
Jan. 22, 1965 

Muenster Hospital reports 
first month of profit oper- 
ation. Muenster's first 1965 
baby waited until Jan. 15 to 
arrive...is son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Tommy Herr. Jap 
Coursey, 80, dies at Saint 
Jo. John Hoberer, 84, long 
time Lindsay resident, dies. 
Mrs. Clara Mosman of 
Gainesville dies after extend- 
ed illness. Charles Knabe en- 
ters the army. Undergoing 
surgery: 	Mrs. 	G.H . 

Hellman, Joe Bernauer . 

Mrs. Norbert Knabe, and 
Mims Lewis. Fashion show 
by FHA Chapter is program 
feature for PTA. Losses in 
1964 were highest ever for 
Muenster Mutual Fire Insur-
ance Association. Muenster 
Jaycees help in campaign to 
collect poll tax payments. 
New arrivals: boys for 
Messrs. and Mmes. Joe Paul 
Fuhrmann and Cecil Neu. 

10 YEARS AGO 
Jan. 23, 1970 

Final rites are held for 
Leo J. Haverkamp, 45, who 
died in a Fort Worth hos-
pital following surgery. City 
council is asked to okay in-
crease in telephone rates. 
Scholastic census is under-
way. Muenster Mutual re-
port at 76th annual meeting 
shows one of the better years 
in the history of the assoc-
iation. Local 4-H girls win in 
county food show taking 
first in three of the four 
senior divisions and two in 
the junior division and will 
go to district. Leon Walter-
scheid is on leave before 
going to Vietnam. Local 
blood bank meets big re-
quirement in Larry Yosten's 
heart surgery. William 
Hermes is re-elected presi-
dent of Hood Community 
Club. Debbie Cler and Dan-
ny Wyatt marry. 45 FHA 
girls show fashions they 
made in style show. New 
arrivals: a boy for the Travis 
Wickliffes; a girl for the 
Dan Fleitmans. 

5 YEARS AGO 
Jan. 24, 1975 

Earth moving starts for 
new AMPI plant. 93 pints 
donated to Muenster Blood 

Muenster 

Livestock 
Auction 

SALE EVERY THURSDAY 

We offer our 
service to assist you 

in buying or selling 

of live stock. 

Bill & Mike Hamer 
Phone 759-2201 

Bank. Muenster Mutual re-
ports moderate losses for 
1974. Andrew Hacker, Ed 
Kosel of Rosebud, and Stan 
Chadwell of Myra die. Fr. 
Bede transferred from Lin-
dsay to Subiaco. Annual 
choir dinner, concert and 
dance set for Feb. 8. Hospit-
al Auxiliary begins plans for 
spring benefit and dance. 
City council proposes 
parking ban on highway in 
city for safety and orderly 
flow of traffic. Sacred Heart 
students enter speech tour-
neys in Wichita Falls and 
oratorical contest in Gaines-
ville. Damage spread by 
high winds Sunday morning. 
Hornets lead in 13-A race. 
Bill Sullivant writes first bill 
passed in 64th session. Gary 
Hess joins Beffalo Breeders. 
Reception honors Nick 
Blocks on 45th anniversary. 
Catholic State League Essay 
contest names 6 local senior 
and 6 junior winners. Albert 
Klements honored on 25th 
anniversary. SH teams win 2 
games, lose 1 at Valley 
View. Special Liturgy obser-
ves feast day of Pastor's 
patron. Arbor Day observed 
in 2 events at SHH. New 
arrival: a son for Mr. and 
Mrs. Maurus Hacker of 
Lindsay. 

Phone 759-4311, or send to 
Box 190, Muenster, 76252, to 
hare news of interest with 

out-of-town friends, rela-
tives, or former residents. 

Electrical 
Contracting 

Fixtures 
Supplies 

Residential, Commercial 
and Oil Field Wiring 

Installations, Repairs 

Call 665-2721 
Nights Call 

665-3263 or 665-4456 

Parker Electric 
112 S. Rusk, Gainesville 

YEARS AGO 
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Hospitalization 

Group Insurance 

Life 

Pension 

Wallace Inglish 
1105 Olive 

Gainesville, TX 

817-665-5863 

Bryan's 
Paint & Body Shop 

Bryan Sicking 
736.2295 

11/2 miles south 
of Myra 

...Quality work at reasonable rates 

...Fast service on all auto glass 	...Free estimates 

...Specializing in collision repair 	handle 

...All work covered by 1 year guarantee mcsivar
iamnsce 

dasto cx3A010-' 
a 	rte,  

v^ xese of rave 

Gasoline. 011. 

Supplies 

For Your 

Farm Needs 

Jimmy Lehnertz 
Gulf Distributor 

665-4562, Gainesville 

Or see local dealer 
Ferd's Gulf Station 

'DEMONSTRATOR SALE 
COME INSPECT 

HUGE! HUGE! HUGE! 
DISCOUNTS 

759-2244 Endres Motor Company Muenster 
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In 

Cooke County 

$5.00 

$9.50 
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Forestburg has itself a 
new little citizen and Rocky 
Dale Gate has himself a new 
baby brother since 5:25 p.m. 
Monday January 14th. The 
new arrivals name is Joe 
Perryman Gates—and he 
weighed in at 7 lbs. 2 ozs. at 
the Muenster Memorial 
Hospital. His parents are 
Renee (Perryman) and 
Doyle Gates of the burg. 
Grandparents are Mrs. Ceil 
Perryman of Forestburg and 
Mr. and Mrs. Guy Gates of 
Torrance, Calif. 

--- 
Mrs. Billie Poynor was 

admitted to the Muenster 
Hospital Saturday January 
19th for a few days. 

Ben Perryman is a patient 
in a Sherman Hospital since 
last week. 

Bobby Dean Johnson en-
tered the Decatur Hospital 
Wednesday January 16th 
with pneumonia. Bobby 
Dean returned home Mon-
day January 21st and is 
doing very well. 

Mrs. Vera Mae McGee re-
ports that her son-in-law 
Bud Griffin of Wichita Falls 
is now doing very well. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Danny 

Bolton and daughter of 
Nocona spent the weekend 
of January 12th with her 
grandparents Mr. and Mrs. 
Clifford Hudspeth. 

--- 
Mrs. Louise Shults at-

tended funeral services for 
Guy Ford in Gainesville on 
Sunday January 13th. The 

11111111111111111 

In All 
The World 

No one is more 
understanding or 
more qualified 
to serve you. 

late Mr. Ford was from Era. 
--- 

Funeral services were held 
in the Alvord Church of 
Christ Wednesday January 
16th for Mrs. Mary Frances 
(Caubel) Meyers of Argyle 
and burial was in the 
Rosston Cemetery. Mrs. 
Meyers was the sister of 
Mrs. Irene Harry of Rosston 
and an aunt of Mrs. Merle 
Hudspeth of Forestburg. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. E.B. Mc-

Million of Bowie spent a 
week in Hawaii—returning 
home Tuesday p.m. January 
15th. The trip to Hawaii was 
a Christmas present from 
the McMillions children. 

Myrtle McMillion visited 
with her Aunt Rachel Rey-
nolds and with the E.B. 
McMillions of Bowie from 
Thursday a.m. Jan. 17th to 
Friday p.m. Jan. 18th. 

The Forestburg Jr. High 
boys and girls were in a 
basketball tournament in 
Montague last week. The 
boys won 2nd place and the 
girls won 1st place. 

--- 
Visitors of Mrs. Louise 

Shults on Monday January 
14th were her nephew Willis 
Kelly of New Orleans, La. 
and Mrs. Dorothy Penton of 
Rosston. --- 

Mrs. Cleo Lanier and 
granddaughter Janice 
Lanier and Perryman Den-
ham attended a reception 
for Congressman Charles 
Stenholm at the Montague 
Court House Tuesday a.m. 
January 15th. After the re-
ception Mr. Denham drove 
over to Nocona to visit with 
Tony Fenoglio in a Rest 
Home there. 

Tuesday night the 15th 
found Cleo Lanier attending 
the annual banquet of the 
Cooke County REA in 
Muenster. 

--- 
Mrs. June Eldridge and 

Connie of Denton visited in 
the community the weekend 
of January 18th. 

--- 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Put-

nam of New Harp visited 
with Mr. and Mrs. Sam 
Williams and Mrs. Eunic 

Lively of Wichita Falls the 
weekend of January 18th. 

- -- 
Mrs. 	Betty 	Reynolds, 

Miss Ruth Smith and 
Howard Sockwell were hon-
ored with a birthday dinner-
party in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Clifford Hudspeth 
Friday night January 18th. 
The festive evening began at 
6 p.m. with a super delicious 
dinner, followed by a 
fellowship period during 
which the honorees were 
given their gifts, then var-
ious "sitting down" games 
were played by all present. 
Those attending were: Ruth 
Smith, Mmes. Betty Rey-
nolds, Cleo Lanier, Alice 
Shears, Vera Mae McGee, 
Rev. and Mrs. George 
Thompson, Mr. and Mrs. 
Ross Littell, Mr. and Mrs. 
Perryman Denham and the 
host and hostess. It was a 
very delightful fun-filled 
evening. --- 

Mrs. Decie Ellzey return-
ed home late Saturday p.m. 
January 19th after visiting 
with daughter and family, 
the Sam Wrights of Temple 
from Tuesday January 8th. 

--- 
Sunday a.m. January 20th 

the Forestburg United 
Methodist Youth Group en-
joyed breakfast in the 
Church Annex in connection 
with a special group song 
they sang at the morning 
worship Service. We are all 
very proud of our young 
people—and we think they 
are extra special in so many 
areas. --- 

Miss Kathy Kenas, Shirley 
McCartley and Keith Rogers 
of Denton spent Sunday af-
ternoon January 20th with 
Miss Kenas' grandparents, 
the Howard Sockwells. 

- -- 
Mrs. Delene (Greenwood) 

Langley of Dallas, she is the 
daughter of Billy Bob 
Greenwood, and Christie 
Dell Greenwood celebrated 
their birthdays Sunday Jan. 
20t h . 

Let us remember that 
Atrice Sledge celebrates a 
birthday Sunday January 
27th. 

- -- 
Monday January 21st 

must have been Forestburg 
day in Muenster, for it 
found Gladys Barclay, 
Mabel Covington, Ora 
Thurman, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bennett Reynolds, Mrs. 
Merle Hudspeth and mother 
Irene Harry of Rosston over 
there. 

Perryman Denham visited 
with Mr. and Mrs. Wayne 
Thompson of the Dye-
mound Community Monday 
p.m. January 21st. 

- -- 
Miss Veronica Edwards, 

reporter for the Forestburg 
4-H sends the following 
report: 

The 4-H had their month-
ly meeting Wednesday after-
noon January 9th. The 
meeting was called to order 
by Janice Lanier. Pledge and 
motto was recited by the 
members. Pam Edwards 
called roll and read the min-
utes. Ray Ford Pullan, 
County Agent, showed 

Report Your News 
to 

Myrt Denham 
964-2395 

slides on "How to Do a 
Method Demonstration." 
Leann Hays and Janice 
Lanier gave a method dem-
onstration to the group. Re-
freshments were served to 
the 16 members present. 

Geological Data 
Made Available 
The Geological Inform-

ation Library of Dallas, in 
response to numerous 
requests the past year for 
any geological and geophy-
sical information relating to 
the Fort Worth Basin Area 
of Texas, has compiled and 
just published an Annotated 
Bibliography of the Fort 
Worth Basin Area. It con-
tains 544 references, includ-
ing 45 unpublished master's 
and doctoral theses, indexed 
by author and subject. The 
area searched includes 51 
counties, 30 of them within 
the area bounded by the 
Bend Arch, Llano Uplift, 
Ouachita Structural Belt, 
Muenster Arch and the 
Matador Arch. Among 
these are Bosque, Clay, 
Coryelle, Dallas, Denton, 
Erath, 	Hamilton, 	Hill, 
Hood, 	Jack, 	Johnson, 
McLennan, Montague, Palo 
Pinto, Parker, Somervell, 
Tarrant, Wise and Young 
counties. 

The Bibliography is avail-
able at the Geological Infor-
mation Library of Dallas, 
GILD Publication No. 2, 
One Energy Square, 4925 
Greenville Avenue, Dallas, 
Texas 75206, for $10.00 plus 
50 cents tax and $1.50 
postage and handling. 

Help Offered to 
Cancer Patients 

By County Society 
It there is a canner patient 

in your family, you might 
want to know what facilities 
and services are available in 
your community. No doubt 
you have heard of the 
American Cancer Society 
volunteers, but have you 
ever given them a call? 

The Cooke Unit of the 
American Cancer Society 
has a Service and Rehabilit-
ation program specifically 
designed to provide inform-
ation and counseling to can-
cer patients and their famil-
ies in your neighborhood. 

This means that when you 
call, a trained volunteer will 
help you find sickroom 
equipment or rehabilitation 
assistance or will just be a 
good listener. Service volun-
teers know what the resour-
ces are and can promptly 
refer you to the one you 
need. 

Also available are supplies 
of educational materials, in-
cluding literature, films and 
exhibits. 

Mrs. Robert Blessing, 
phone 665-2505 is Service 
and Rehabilitation Chair-
man, and Frank and Elaine 
Stewart, phone 668-8297, 
are Education Chairmen. 

Visiting Bruno Flei1mans 
Kevin Cox spent last week 

with his grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bruno Fleitman. 
He came with Jerry Fleit-
man who was returning 
from a visit in Houston. On 
Thursday Mrs. Janie Cox 
and Kelly and Kris arrived to 
visit her parents and on 
Friday Frankie Cox joined 
his family here. They return-
ed to their home in Houston 
Sunday. 

Cheese Featured 
At Meeting of 

Homemakers Club 
Mrs. Bertha Pick hosted 

members of the Muenster 
Extension Homemakers 
Club on January 9 and, 
assisted by Mrs. Lucille Lut-
kenhaus, presented a pro-
gram on "Cheese, Please". 
They prepared and baked a 
Quiche Loraine, which they 
later served with Broccoli 
Cheese Soup and Frosted 
Cheese Dessert Mold to 17 
members. 

Also on the program was 
a demonstration on "Rush- 

Lehnertz Brothers 
Here for Holidays 

The home of Mrs. Agnes 
Lehnertz was busy with 
guests and visiting during 
the Christmas holidays and 
for several weeks after. 

Her sons, Claude Leh-
nertz of Spokane, 
Washington came for 
Christmas and New Years 
and Quintin Lehnertz 
(Chick) came for New 
Years. Also arriving was 
Donna Hall of Spokane. 

Another son, Floyd Leh-
nertz came from Rhode 
Island for New Years. After 
visiting here for a week, they 
all met in Tyler with their 
brother G.M. (Bub) Leh-
nertz. Together they spent a 
week in South Texas bird 
hunting. 

During the following 
week when they returned to 
Muenster, they were enter-
tained by friends and relat-
ives. On Tuesday they were 
joined by Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Lehnertz of Gainesville for 
dinner in their mother's 
home. 

Other hosts for dinners in 
their honor were Mr. and 
Mrs. Gussie Felderhoff, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bernard Haver-
kamp, Jr., Mr. and Mrs. 
Mike Stoffels and Jim and 
Therese Lehnertz whose 
daughter Cheryl of Dallas 
joined them on Saturday for 
the noon meal. 

Friday evening there was a 
fish and chicken fry at the 
VFW Hall for ISO guests 
hosted by Mike Stoffels and 

Benny Haverkamp, who 
prepared the fish, with other 
catering by Lorene Wilson 
of Gainesville. "Hard 
Times" played for dancing. 

A number of get-togethers 
with friends were held at 
The Center Restaurant and 
Tavern. 

The Lehnertz brothers 
departed Sunday, January 
20 and have phoned their 
mother since, of safe 
arrivals at home. 

Wimmer 
Diesel 

Service 
Truck and 

Tractor Repairs 

East Hwy. 82 
759-2560 

TRAPPING 
SUPPLIES 

TEX-0•FUR•CO. 

Now Open 
By the Red River Bridge 

1.35 Texas Side 
Gainesville, TX 

817-665-7601 

N-Needlework" by Mrs. 
Jeanette Peterson of Filer, 
Idaho, a house guest of Mrs. 
Pick. 

Mrs. Armella Lutken-
haus, president, conduct-
ed the business meeting. 
She was also named as dele-
gate for the district meeting 
to be held on March 27 at 
the Community Center in 
Gainesville. 

Next month's meeting will 
be on February 13 at 2 p.m. 
in the home of Mrs. Bruno 
Fleitman. 

NOTICE OF APPOINTMENT 

TO: All persons interested in the 
Estate of NONA E. BEVERS in-
cluding its creditors (if any): 

Take notice that on the 21st day 
of January, 1980, JANELLE GIL-
BREATH, Post Office Address: 
Route 3. Gainesville, Texas 76240, 
was appointed Executrix in Cause 
No. 10875, styled, Estate of NONA 
E. BEVERS, now pending on the 
docket of the County Court of 
Cooke County, Texas. 

All persons having claims against 
the above estate shall present the 
some within the time prescribed by 
law. 

SIGNED: 
JANELLE GILBREATH, 
EXECUTRIX 

Lose Weight 
Safely 

with Oex.A.Dlet Tablets 
Only BB' at 

WATTS BROTHERS 
Gainesville 

ix.... 	 ... 

Catholic 

Life Insurance 

Union 

Annuities 
(IRA) 

Cancer Fund Insurance 

Pat Knabe 
Representative 

R1.1, Box 149 
Muenster, Tex. 

759-2888 

Forestburg News  byMyrtDenham 

One year 

Two years 

United Electric Service 

Quality Wort - 	Prir 

C.M. Muller, Harold Alexander 
759-4517 nights & holidays. 637-2330 

Subscribe NOW 
to the 

Muenster Enterprise 
The best way to keep informed on 

Muenster and the surrounding area 

Published every Friday 

* * * * * * * * * * * * * 
Outside 

Cooke County 

$5.50 

$10.50 

Name 	  

Address 	  

City & State 	 Zip 	  

Mail with check or money order to 
Muenster Enterprise, P.O. Box 190, Muenster, TX 76252 

gaSUfitt 

030. 

,1 9. 



4911111...."—NOW!c 01-- 
• utiful,Fine 
Porcelain China 

rhrt o!t: 	Vdr"7,:1"7'  e. 
romp. per, oral be leantrAl at ....rectal mace ta.ti 
eta reheat NAANTA,‘. 
Metall, mt.-mama are el.. mattattler;:.tteetett 

:1•71 '  " 717, 66' V.77,",:',";!: 

THIS WEEKS FEATUREITEM 

DESSERT 89c 
EACH 

DISH 

HICKORY SMOKED FOLLY COOKED 

Smoked Hams 
SHARK 

5 - 7 Lb. hig. 	
94: PORTION 

HICKORY SMOKED FULLY COOKED LE,  $.1 09 
HALF OR WHOLE 

Butt Portion ' 7 "- "" 	L,. 95' 
Center Portion '-'""`  

I $231 
Tide UUNDRY 

DETERGENT 
With Cows 
la Ws Al 

	 84 OZ. BOX 

Hunt's Tomatoes 
WHOLE PEELED 
ON STEWED 	

39 
4  

NM 02. CAN 

Chunk Light Tuna 
CHICKEN OF THE SEA 
I. Oil or We. 

61/2 OZ. CAN 79 

CALL: 
Deb or Claude 

Klement 
for Table 

Reservations 

Purchase of 8 
Advance Tickets 

Required to 
Reserve a Table 

PACE FOURTEEN JANUARY 25, 1980 

SNAP Activities 
Blood Pressure Check 

The free Blood Pressure 
check for senior citizens will 
be available at the SNAP 
Center in the Community 
Center on Tuesday, January 
29, 3 to 5 p.m. 

THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISF 
forms. If an employer does a great savings in money an 
so, he guarantees that they time for everyone concert 
can he machine-processed al ed. 

Social Security Urges Accuracy in Making W-2 Forms 
The Social Security Ad-

ministration observed a very 
significant anniversary on 
January I, 1980, according 
to Gus Jones, district 
manager in Sherman. 

On that day the agency 
completed the first year of 
processing Forms W-2, W-
2P, and W-3. Before 1979, 
these forms were processed 
by the Internal Revenue Ser-
vice. 

The Form W-2 is an es- 

pecially important form, 
Jones said. From it the 
Social Security Administrat-
ion gets the wages to be 
credited to an employee's re-
cord. These wage credits are 
used to determine insured 
status and the amount of the 
monthly benefit to be paid 
to a worker, his dependents, 
and survivors at the time of 
retirement, death, or disabil-
ity. 

Jones said that he wanted 

to stress accurate complet-
ion of all the items on the 
form W-2 by employers or 
their tax accountants. Errors 
or ommissions can cause 
loss of wage credits for an 
employee which could result 
in smaller monthly benefits 
or possibly even loss of in-
sured rights. 

Jones stated that the Soc-
ial Security Administration 
realizes that the require-
ments for completion of the 

forms are very strict. How-
ever they assure accuracy 
and could lead to great 
savings in processing costs. 
Overall most employers in 
the area did a very good job 
of completing the 1978 
forms. 

While expressing appreci-
ation to employers for their 
cooperation in 1978 Jones 
stressed the importance of 
following instruction exactly 
in completing the 1979 

FOR GOOD, LOW COST 

FIRE and STORM 
INSURANCE 

Contact 
Muenster Farm Mutual 

Fire Insurance Association 
Edward Endres, Secretary, 759.2905, Box 37, Muenster 

Door Prize 
The monthly door prize 

feature will be included with 
the Thursday SNAP meeting 
on January 31. 

AFFILIATED Birthday Honorees 
Birthday honoree at 

SNAP last week were Rose 
Hofbauer, Leta Mc Daniel, 
Mrs. John Fleitman, Mrs. 
Matt Muller, Mrs. John 
Kupper and Joe Hoenig and 
Alphonse Hoenig all of 
Muenster and Ray Hudson 
of Myra. The birthday cake, 
decorated with yellow roses 
and green leaves, carried the 
lettering "Happy Birthday 
to Muenster Senior 
Citizens" and was sent by 
the SNAP Center of Sher-
man.  

Schedule of 
Meetings 

Children's Activity 
The Children's Activity 

Program and Story Hour is 
scheduled for this Friday, 
January 25, in the Commun-
ity Center, 10 to 11 a.m. 

JANUARY 

AMBOREE WON Clip & Save '1" 9: 

Sliced Bacon 	 99' 
LIMIT MEE 1 LB. PKGS. WITH T111$ COUPON 

Fischer's 
COUPON VOID AFTER JAN. 31, 1980 

Chuck Roast 4::r ** fe.1  49  GRAIN FED HEAVY BEEF 

Clip & Save 70° 
Follee GRAIN FED HEAVY BEEF GRAIN FED HEAVY BEEF 

$ 1 7 9 
u. 

UNIT 1 WMI IRIS COUPON 1,119 $10.00 
OR BORE A00E7101111 PURER. EllOL exis. 

Fischer's 
COUPON VOID AFTER JAN. 31, 1980 

vie 

Seven Steak 	 Seven Roast 	LB 5 1 59  
GRAIN FED HEAVY BEEF GRAIN FED HEAVY BEEF 

Arm Roast 	LB $189  Rib-Eye Steak 	LB $ 399  
Mean SEE! INIFLESS (11-1011. lq.) EXTRA LEAN FRESH 

$179 Sirloin Strips icst:.?"'" 	 u. $3 39  

Chicken Hens 	LB. 69c 
Ground Chuck 	LB . 

LEIN I TENDER BONELESS 

Stew Meat 	 LB 
5199 

Smoked Cheese 	$1 99  

Clip & Save 49 8  
1111111 TIMM 

Ketchup 	 It." 98' 
MOMS CIPIPPON 

Fischer's 
COUPON VOID AFTER JAN. 31,19BD 

GOLD CREST OR NORBEST GRADE A 

Turkeys (SELF BASTING) 10-14 LB. 79C 
Germanfest Chairmen 

A meeting for all German-
fest chairmen will be held in 
the TP&L building on Mon-
day, January 28 at 7:30 p.m. 

WITH THIS CUM 

Fischer's 
COUPON VOID AFTER JAN. 31, 1980 

Blood Pressure Check 
The free Blood Pressure 

Check for senior citizens will 
be available at the SNAP 
Center in the Community 
Center Tuesday, January 
29, 3 to 5 p.m. 

VIP ROOMS SLIT 

Sliced Bacon 	 
MOMS LITHE 

Sizzlers 
1111110 

Hindquarters 	L.49' Sausage "".."'"" 	... '1" 
EBNER WW1 UMW SLICED  

Bacon  	"4'1 '1" Sliced Bacon 	 
HSU CIOGIED 	 CIIICKEll 

Franks  	1 ;11 69' Bologna 	 

SILVER MIR till 

Sausage LOCI'" L. 95' 
• SNORFINE-Rog. Drip, Elsotrio 

COFFEE 
99° 

SNORSKESII 	 Unto, "It 
"Pg 1 "  Sli. Meats 	 Clip & Save 18' 	'2" 

51111111E111 0137 RAYONS 

Mellorine 	 ', CIL. 48' 
LIMIT TWO WITH IRIS COUPON 

Fischer's 
COUPON VOID AFTER JAN. 31, 1980 

'1" 
LI ■ It 1 I. sio.oa Or Wr. $ 	99 
Po, /2 C“poo IA UN IA .1 

111115111111111• S1111111 

Myra Improvement 
The Myra Community 

Improvement Club will meet 
on Tuesday, January 29. 

	  1 LB. CAN 
LB 99' 

IX 89' 
OSCH OATES SLICED IN I ONO* Of 

Chopped Ham 	riE s l "  

SORFRESII 1..1 or he 

Franks 	"..T. 99' 

—1 
NWT'S TOMATO 

KETCHUP OM ems SLICED 

GROUND 
HOG :c 

Bologna '.HN.r.. . ,1l l E  ..1 99' Clip & Save 75 0  
With Comm 
11111. Ad 

	 44 OZ. en. 98 
SIVIRS Lose I 	  lost. Car 

Pork Steak 	.110 
LIMIT 15 WITS IRIS COUPON 

SWIFT'S LEAN A TENDER BOSTON BUTT 

Pork Roast 	s 1108 
LB 1. 

Fischer's 
COUPON VOID AFTER JAN. 31, 1980 

SEVEN SEAS ASS, 

irayonnaise 	 "I  89' Salad Dressing 
GERHARDTS 	 MRS SMITH PUMPKIN 

Chili  	.0, 89' 	Pie 

	■It 69' 

..z sloe 

"1:  89' 

"C 59' 

"Bri  53' 

'Xi 5 1°' 

'2" 

CAN , 1" 

10.11 "  69' 

 :111 49' 

"NIL 	 , " 

11 01 111 39 

C1 0 1" 
I 9, 

	 NI 

z 
WIMP 

Pork & Beans 	 
NUTS ream 

ROM 11 ICED 

 Hamb. Dills cu 59' 
.›—HEALTH  & BEAUTY AIDS K 

Close-Up Toothpaste 

HINTS 

Tomato Paste 
MINIT S 

Fruit Cocktail 
HIRSH JACK SSTIERIOLI 

Pancake Mix 

Sauce 	 5 
COFFEE Coffee Mate CREAMER 

CARNATION 

Ropier 11.35 S 1 09 
	4 OZ. PKG. 	• 

Tomato Juice 	 'lc%  69' 

16  02. JAR 
S 1 39 LIONTCBUST 

Flour 	  
WIWI EMI tog- Sq. P.011.1

5 	99' g  

Cake Mix 	 "I  19' 

C

▪  

offee ' 1 "H'` 	52" 

SALEM 1100 II 

Cartridges '""  
01111 111111111-11.1 1121 

Tylenol Tablets 	is., '2" 
SWUM 'I" Cal 

Rayovac "' " 	 1rM 
939 

01911 
PIONEER 11ovior 	Dpriorolll 

Biscuit Mix 	  swirl 

Vienna Sausage 	.2/89' 
STA PUFF 

Fabric Softener 	GAL 51
0-5 

MISSES 111110 

Coffee 
ASSORTED ZEE JUMBO MILIEU .11.11ou.so 

Cocoa Mix ' 1' 	 
NISI um tom HMSO 

Syrup 	  
SHIJRFINE 

Shortening 
TUFT KM 

Salad Dressing 
TOT INOS CLASSIC 

Pizza 

Sandwich Bags 

ruau Napkins 	 

OSU MI. 

10 PIK 11 1 " 	Hot Cocoa Mix 
SmfMaF ClIC-011117 CHOWS or 

20 I/ '1" Vienna Fingers 

GIALLO •LA" CELL 

Towels 	63' 
11311111 

Folgers Coffee 	'I s4" 

B FRESH DAIRY SPECIALS  

utter 
SIIWIFIIESII 
CHM O.& 	1 1.1. QUARTERS 99. ....now Finn, ..... 

Butternut . 
11111511ESIIS• OR II 

Biscuits 	 
WE 10111 MIMS 

Margarine 

Rayovac  	1 1" 

.."-> FROZEN FOODS DEPT. < 
SAT. FEB. 2 
SH Community 

Center 

Music by: 

"HARD TIMES" 

MISCH UHT I-ISIOs •HT, Fill 
Ilium DISSEIT TORPORS 

.0'1 59  Noodles 
1 IL 79' 

um 49' 

"4  '1" 

95' 

',X 39' 

Cool Whip 
11111011 01110 111111101 

' 1g.  69' Oreo Cookies 
111111/111 1 la PH I 

Pie Shells 	  
SMUCKERS 

'2" Grape Jelly 	 
GUTH 1101 Wisp Slohlov 

Fish Sticks 
S PIK 19' SORTE D 

Soup Starter 
sal 

	 $0 CRTs 49' 	Trash Bags Ill 
MGM 

1111111M3IER 10110011 Pot Pies 	  49' Cascade L. 59' Beer & Set-ups 

available 
MINUTE MAID CHILLED 

Orange Juice  	  

> SPARKLING FRESH FRUITS & VEGETABLES < 

Yellow Squash 	 3 L.  100 

Cello Red Radishes 	 P.1 10' 
Cucumbers ""'"1"1  	3. '1" 
Russet Potatoes 'I" ' 	5X. 69' 

DR. PEPPER 
2 Liter No Return 	 980 
6.12 OZ. Cans 	 $129 

6.16 OZ. No Return Bottles 	$ 1 89  
6.32 OZ. Bottles 	 1 79  

SRURFRESN MT. FLAVORS 

Mellorine Admission 

$3.00 per person Unit 2 With C.**.* 	48  
II This Al 

	 'S GAL. Tickets available 

in advance from 

the Jaycees 

I LI•It Is With C 	 
IsIlls Ad 

1 	FOR 

5 S 1 00 

EX1111 FANCY GOLDEN DELICIOUS 

APPLES 
RES SMITS IN GLOSS 

Onion Plants 	3. '1 00 

NO COOLERS PLEASE 
ZIPPER SKIN 

Tangerines 
4  LBS. 	

I 0 0 

AFFILIATED 

,It, rilreg  I1  rat aritrt 
Butch and Johnny Fisher 

IIP 
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