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by Elaine Schad 
The Cooke County College 

Board of Trustees this week ap-
proved final architectural drawings 
for a new library, technology cen-
ter and for major renovation to the 
existing library. 

The college will begin the bid-
ding process by the end of this 
week, with bids scheduled to be 
opened Oct. 19. The board will 
hold a special noon meeting on 
Oct. 16 to award the bids. 

CCC's first major expansion 
project since the college was 
established in the early 1960s is a 
result of a $1.2 million bond ap-
proved by voters in May. The 
project includes construction of a 
new 13,000-square-foot library 

building at an estimated cost of 
$850,000. Conversion of the 
existing library building to house at 
least seven new general purpose 
classrooms at an estimated cost of 
$240,000. Additionally, the college 
plans construction of a new 8,500-
square-foot vocational training 
and continuing education center at 
an estimated cost of $475,000. 

The new facilities are needed for 
a burgeoning enrollment, which 
has increased by more than 50 per-
cent the last three years and has 
exhausted available classroom 
space, said CCC President Dr. 
Luther Bud Joyner. The board 
heard this week that CCC set 
another all-time record enrollment 

for the fall semester. Enrollment 
on all campuses is 3,174 students, 
an increase from 3,070 students in 
the fall of 1988. 

In another matter, the board set 
a $25 per person fee per four-
month period for use of the newly-
remodeled fitness room when it 
opens to the public in coming 
weeks. The fee will pay for super-
vision of the facility. 

The board also hired Marilyn 
Christiansen as an instructor of 
vocational nursing and Timothy 
Owens to work as a liaison between 
the college and Gainesville State 
School for the education of 
residents at GSS while they are in 
Gainesville and then as they return 
to their hometown environments. 

Cooke County College begins 
major expansion project 

Attractions and events of the 
Muenster Centennial year reflect 
creative planning, enthusiasm and 
execution of projects by all involv-
ed in carrying through to comple-
tion of the memorable time. 

A fun-filled weekend in Dallas 
is the next Centennial activity to 
be offered to local citizens. 

On Saturday, Oct. 14, main 
focus of attention will be on the 
meeting of, and attendance at the 
German Day Ball of, the Lord 
Mayor of Munster, Westfalen, 
Germany and Mayor Ted 
Henscheid of the City of 
Muenster, Texas, and their 

Good News! 
The salvation of the just is from 

the Lord; he is their refuge in time 
of distress. PSALM 37:39 

spouses. The ball will be in the 
Grand Kempinski Hotel of Dallas. 

Muenster citizens are invited to 
attend the event at which this com-
munity will be spotlighted in 
celebration of its 100 years. 

Tickets for the ball are available 
through Alvin Fuhrman at 
Muenster Telephone Corporation. 

The following day, Sunday, 
Oct. 15, Muenster citizens are urg-
ed to visit the State Fair of Texas 
where this community will be 
honored at "Muenster Day at the 
Fair." 

A special booth will be set up in 
the huge entertainment tent for 

punt. The Hornets regained 
possession with just over 3 
minutes remaining in the half. The 
"Big Red" offense proceeded to 
march 66 yards in just 6 plays to 
up the mark to 14-0, the final play 
coming on a 16-yard strike from 
Brawner to Terry Felderhoff. 

The second half opened with 
much of the same. Both teams 
played well defensively and 
neither was able to score. 

The Hornets reached the end 
zone again in the fourth period, as 
Scot Vogel powered over from the 
1. Vogel's plunge capped a 
36-yard drive set up by a Ram 
turnover. 

The only Ram score came on a 
52-yard ramble on the last play of 
the game. The play came against 
Hornet subs. "Our guys really 
wanted a shut-out," said Jump, 
"but, with a 20-point lead and 
seconds to go, we did not want to 

Muenster's use. Muenster pro-
ducts for sampling and brochures 
will be offered to interested Fair -
goers. 

There will be great German-
style entertainment at the Fair, 
promising a great way to spend an 
October Sunday. 

Locally, the Centennial quiit is 
now on display at the Old Theatre 
Mall. Tickets are available from 
all the merchants in the Mall. First 
ticket buyers were Lenny and 
Christel Vogel. Drawing for the 
prized quilt will take place in 
December of this year. 

risk getting any of our starters 
hurt." 

"Again, our defense dominated 
the game," Jump added. The 
Hornet stoppers limited the Rams 
to only 60 yards passing and 77 
yards on the ground. Middle 
linebacker Scot Vogel, again, led 
the "Big D" with 12 stops. Cor-
nerbacks Marshall Smith and 
Yancy Culp had great games with 
several key stops and an intercep-
tion apiece. 

Others singled out by Jump for 
fine defensive games were 
linebacker Troy Pagel with 9 
tackles and a sack, Donnie 
Boydstun with 7 tackles, and 
defensive tackle Jeff Hellman with 
6 stops. 

"We proved this week that we 
are not a one-dimensional team," 
said Jump. "Our bunch will do it 
with the run, the pass, good 
Please See HORNETS, Page 2 

asbestos 	hazards 	in 	school 
buildings, and implement response 
actions in a timely fashion. 

Inspection of the Muenster ISD 
school buildings was conducted by 
qualified personnel from the 
Region IX Education Service 
Center in Wichita Falls. Results 
revealed that no danger to any stu-
dent or school employee exists at 
this time. Six classrooms in the 
high school building and 5th-6th 
grade wing have 9"x9" floor tiles 
containing 1-3 percent chrysotile, 
non-friable asbestos. Muenster 
ISD is fortunate because the 
potential for asbestos fiber release 
and exposure is at a minimum. 
The inspectors have advised the 
school administration that these 
floor tiles pose no immediate 
danger to the health of students or 
staff. The tiles have been sealed 
and coated twice with EPA - 

by Elaine Schad 
The Valley View School District 

is offering a $300 reward for the 
arrest and conviction of those 
responsible for the vandalism last 
week of six of the district's eight 
school buses. 

Six windshields and three side 
windows were broken, possibly 
with a hammer or something 
similar, said Justice of the Peace 

Fundraiser 
planned for 
Finnell 

Friends of State Rep. Charles 
Finnell, of the 80th House District, 
announced plans recently for the 
Finnell Fish Fry to be held Thur-
sday evening, Oct. 19, honoring the 
veteran legislator and wife Kay. 
The fundraising event, in support 
of the 1990 re-election of Rep. Fin-
nell to the Texas House of 
Representatives, is set for 6:30 
p.m. at the Holliday School 
Cafeteria, and is open to the public 
according to Don Talley, Treasurer 
of Committee for Responsible 
Representation. The buffet-style 
meal and brief address by a 
statewide-elected official are 
scheduled in addition to musical 
entertainment with the rural flavor 
of the nine-county district. Tickets 
at $15 per person are available 
from the Committee at Box 639, 
Holliday, Texas 76366, or by 
calling (817) 586-1131, according 
to Talley. 

approved wax. This process will 
be repeated every six months to 
comply with EPA regulations. 

Charles Coffey, Muenster ISD's 
superintendent, stresses that 
Muenster ISD will comply with all 
present or future requirements of 
our state or federal regulatory 
agencies and will keep parents and 
students informed of actions 
taken to meet these requirementS. 

Qualified personnel will 
reinspect every three years to 
determine the condition of the 
floor tiles. At some time in the 
future, carpet may be placed over 
these tiles, or they may be remov-
ed by certified asbestos 
contractors. 

Muenster 	ISD's 	Asbestos 
Management Plan is available for 
inspection by the public in the Ad-
ministration Building during 
regular business hours. 

Royce Martin. Estimated damage 
was $1,600. All the buses were 
housed in the district's bus barn at 
the time, said Principal Benny 
West. 

Any information received will 
be confidential. Contact the 
Cooke County Sheriff's Depart-
ment at 665-3471, Martin at 
726-3539 or West at 726-3522. 

Hornets go to the air to secure 
• 20-8 victory over S&S Rams 

Muenster ISD complies with 
AHERA on asbestos ruling 

VV buses vandalised, 
$300 reward offered 

The Muenster Hornets defeated 
• the Sadler-Southmayd Rams 20-8 

Friday night to notch their second 
win of the year, bringing their 
record to 2-0. The Rams dropped 
to 1-1. Another good home crowd 
watched as both teams corralled 
themselves with penalties early, 
then witnessed as the Hornets ex-
ploded for 14 first half points. 

"S&S did a good job of bottling 
up our running game," said 
Coach Bill Jump. "They moved 
around a lot up front, so it took us 
a while to adjust." The Hornets 
drove their first possession deep 
into Ram territory only to be 
thwarted by a 15-yard holding 
penalty. James Hennigan, the 
Hornets' leading rusher, was 
limited to 60 yards on 20 carries. 
Mike Vogel added 48 yards on 
some tough running up the mid-
dle. "They really geared up to 
stop our wide game," said Jump, 
"but Mike, Marshall Smith and 
Scot Vogel did a good job of mov-
ing the football between the 
tackles." 

With the running game struggl-
ing, the Hornets decided to go to 
the air. "We have a lot of con-
fidence in Jerry's (Brawner) abili-
ty," replied Jump, "and we have 
a bunch of guys that can catch the 

• football, as witnessed by the fact 
that we had six guys catch passes 
in the game." 

The aerial show opened in the 
▪ second quarter as Brawner launch- 

ed a 54-yard bomb to Marshall 
Smith for the Hornets' first TD. 
Brawner toed the extra point to 
make it 7-0 Following the Hornet 
kickoff, the Rams were allowed 
only 3 plays and were forced to 

The Asbestos Hazard Emergen-
cy Response Act (AHERA, 
Public Law 99-519), signed by 
President Reagan in October 
1986, required the EPA to develop 
regulations for addressing 
asbestos problems in private and 
public schools. A year later, EPA 
published the Asbestos-Containing 
Materials in Schools Rule which 
stipulates that all public and 
private elementary and secondary 
schools Inspect for friable and non-
friable asbestos, develop asbestos 
management plans that address 

PUTTING THE FINISHING TOUCHES on the new roof of the Knights of Columbus Hall are employees of 
JAW Construction Co., Ito r, Dan Bezner, Jesse Walterscheid and Bruce Bezner. The seams on the 24-gauge 
steel roofing fit together like a ziplock bag with no exposed screws. The roof, at a cost of $10,000, sports a 
baked-on enamel finish with a 20-year rust-through guarantee. Dave Fent Photo 

October events are next for 
Muenster Centennial activities 

JAMES HENNIGAN (22) turns the corner to outrun a Ram. We can't identify the Hornet blocker on the 
ground who probably made that little bit of difference for the ball carrier. 	 Dennis Shoup Photo 



STATE CAPITAL 

HIGHLIGHTS 
By Lyndell Williams 

TEXAS PRESS ASSOCIATION 

PRESERVATION 
PLAN ON IT 

Planning on restoring a house, 
saving a landmark, reviving your 
neighborhood? 

Write: 

National Trust for Historic Preservation 
Department PA 
1785 Massachusetts Ave., N.W. 
Washington, D.C. 20036 

Announcing the Opening of: 

Gainesville 
Obstetrics - 
Gynecology 

Roane H. McLaughlin, M.D. 

1218 East California 
P.O. Box 1538 

Gainesville, Texas 76240 

By Appointment: (817) 665-6679 

Enjoy 
Better 

Hearing 
Today! 

Call 	Max ( haruand. M.A. 

665-3298 

* Hearing Tests 
* Hearing Aids 
* Repair All Makes 
* Double Life Batteries 

ummax- 
1607 Independence 

Off East Hwy 82) 

Ga Inesynle, Texas 

NOTICE OF VOTE 

ON TAX RATE 

The City of Muenster conducted a public 

hearing on a proposal to increase your property 

taxes by .0799% increase over the effective tax 

rate of .39507 percent on Sept. 18, 1989 at 

7:30 p.m. in the City Hall. 

The Muenster City Council is scheduled to vote 

on the tax rate at a public meeting to be held on 

Sept. 25, 1989 at 7:30 p.m. at City Hall. 
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Sept. 23-30 is Rural Health Week -otters to the 
Editor 

Dear Editor: 
The Muenster Jaycees have 

been given an ultimatum, either 
repair the F-84-F Thunderstreak 
jet plane which has been a major 
attraction in the Muenster Park 
since 1971 or let the Air Force 
reclaim it. 

To bring it up to Air Force stan-
dards will cost approximately 
$4500.00, and, after it is refur-
bished, it will not be an object on 
which children can play. 

The plane was repainted last 
year, but the Air Force wants it 
people-proofed. The Muenster 
Jaycees are appealing to the peo-
ple of Muenster to find out if the 
plane has enough meaning to 
residents to spend the money for 
repairs or if people would just as 
soon let the plane go back to the 
Air Force. 

Comment boxes will be placed 
in the local stores, so please take a 
few minutes to let the Jaycees 
know what you, as citizens, think 
should be done. 

Neal Flusche, 
President, 

Muenster Jaycees 

Dear Editor: 
On behalf of the children and 

adults served by the Red River 
Chapter of the Muscular 
Dystrophy Association, I would 
like to thank the citizens of North 
Texas and Southern Oklahoma 
for a job well done. 

$129,802 - a record! These 
funds were raised during the 1989 
Jerry Lewis Labor Day Telethon 
seen on KXII TV-12. 

We would like to thank the area 
media, event sponsors, our 
valuable volunteers and Pledge 
Center Coordinators who came 
together to defeat 40 muscle -
destroying diseases. 

A special "THANK YOU" to 
KXII TV-12 in both Sherman and 
Ardmore for making 1989 a 
record-breaking year. 

Over 3,000 volunteers made the 
1989 Labor Day Telethon the 
most successful Telethon in the 
Texoma area. 

To everyone that participated, 
watched the show and pledged 
their money during the show ... 
"THANK YOU, TEXOMA!" 

Sincerely, 
Jimmie Jones 

District Director 
P.S. We urge everyone to honor 

their pledge. Your help is the hope 
of MDA patients everywhere. 

AUSTIN-Capitol politics fo-
cused mainly on election cam-
paigns last week, with several 
startling revelations coming to sur-
face, including: 

■ A key lawmaker will quit the 
Legislature, considered the first 
casualty of successive media re-
ports about lobbyist contributions 
to lawmakers. 

• Texas Rangers pitcher Nolan 
Ryan has Texas Farm Bureau 
support if he'll try to strike 
out Agriculture Commissioner Jim 
Hightower. 

■ Two Democrats running for 
lieutenant governor competed for 
headlines with different ethics 
reform proposals. 

■ Attorney General Jim Mattox 
named a campaign spy he said was 
placed by the opposition's cam-
paign, and called for State Trea-
surer Ann Richards to apologize. 
She didn't. 

Schlueter to Exit 
One of Speaker Gib Lewis' 

top lieutenants, Killeen state Rep. 
Stan Schlueter, said he will not 
seek re-election and concentrate 
instead on family and business. 

Schlueter, a seven-term veteran, 
chairs the powerful Calendars 
Committee and was considered a 
top contender to be speaker some 
day. 

Recent news reports revealed 
he has taken large contributions 
from lobbyists and regularly spent 

Watson 
joins real 
estate staff 

Mrs. Margaret Watson has join-
ed the staff of North Texas Sales 
Group, as a real estate marketing 
associate for Cooke, Montague, 
Denton and Wise counties. Mrs. 
Watson completed the required 
courses at Cooke County College 
and has worked in real estate for 
one year, specializing in residen-
tial, farm, ranch and commercial 
property listings. 

She is married to George Wat-
son and they reside north of 
Callisburg where they own and 
operate a beef cattle and 
quarterhorse ranch. The Watsons 
have three daughters and four 
grandchildren. 

Don Flusche is the managing 
real estate broker of the North 
Texas Sales Group with offices in 

The Board of Directors of A.G. 
Edwards, Inc. has declared a 10 
percent stock dividend on the 
common shares of the firm. 

At the same time, the Board 
declared a quarterly cash dividend 
of 17 cents per share, to be paid on 
the old as well as the new shares. 

HORNETS 
defense, 	kicking 	game, 	or 
whatever it takes." 

Jump commended the offensive 
line, consisting of Hellman, K. 
Vogel, Bierschenk, Hudspth, Col-
well, McDaniel, and Black for 
providing the protection needed 
for Brawner to complete 8 out of 
10 passes for 144 yards. He also 
singled out Marshall Smith who 
caught 3 passes for 86 yards. 
"Marshall played great on both 
sides of the ball." Senior center 
Michael Bierschenk was also 
heralded by Coach Jump. "He 
had a great night against an 
outstanding noseguard," reported 
Jump. "That matchup was a key 

$9,000 monthly from his political 
fund, partly to lease an Austin 
residence. 

Schlueter cited real estate and 
investment setbacks due to the 
recession. He recently bought 
a $272,000 home in Austin's 
exclusive Estates of Barton Creek. 

He is considered a Capitol Hill 
insider's insider. Capitol watchers 
predict he very well could play a 
role next session as a successful 
lobbyist. 

Ethics Reform Plans 
Two candidates for lieutenant 

governor, state Sen. Chet Edwards 
and Comptroller Bob Bullock, 
released ethics reform plans last 
week. 

Edwards, who developed the 
issue last spring, wants Gov. 
Bill Clements to call a special 
session on ethics reform before the 
Nov. 7 election and he proposed 
outlawing lobby-paid vacations for 
lawmakers. The governor is in 
Africa until Sept. 25. 

Bullock, who is shrewd enough 
to sense when an issue becomes 
valid, unveiled his detailed plan, 
which includes cross-auditing po-
litical bank accounts with tax re-
turns, comparing lobbyist spend-
ing reports with actual spending 
records and punishing offenders 
with fines, expulsion and criminal 
penalties. 

Pitch to A Pitcher 
Ryan, who owns a cattle ranch 

near Alvin, mid he will wait until 
after the baseball season ends to 
decide whether he'll attempt to 
unseat Hightower. 

The Farm Bureau, largest agri-
culture group in the state, has 
vowed to oust an incumbent they 
regard as too liberal with either 
a Democrat or Republican candi-
date. 

Ryan declined to say which 
party he'd choose, but most ex-
perts agree Hightower is unbeat-
able so far in the Democratic pri-
mary. The news also signals that 
the Farm Bureau has apparently 
given up the idea of recruiting 
Walt Garrison, a former Dallas 

Muenster. Mrs. Joann Hess, of-
fice manager, invites everyone to 
come in to meet Mrs. Watson and 
get acquainted with their method 
of advertising real estate on a na-
tional level. Mrs. Watson said, 
"We need more listings to fill the 
orders for prospective buyers." 

Since the firm has been on a 
regular quarterly rate of 17 cents 
per share, this represents an in-
crease of 10 percent in the cash 
dividend. 

Both the stock and the cash 
dividends will be paid on Oct. 2, 
1989 to stockholders of record 
Sept. 8, 1989. 

Continued from Page 1 

factor in our offensive success, 
and Michael did not allow their 
noseguard to be a factor," replied 
the coach. 

This week, the Hornets open up 
their road show as they travel to 
Nocona for a 7:30 p.m. contest 
against the Indians. "Nocona has 
good size and they are hungry for 
a win," said the Hornet mentor. 
"We are determined for them not 
to be fed this week." Follow the 
Hornets as they will attempt to 
pick up victory number 3! 
Remember, support the Hornets 
in Indian Territory Friday night at 
7:30 p.m.!! 

Cowboy fullback and bullrider. 
Campaign Spying 

Attorney General Jim Mattox, 
who has yet to announce for the 
governor's race, accused Richards' 
campaign of sending a "spy" into 
his headquarters for information. 

Her campaign denied the charge, 
implied Mattox was a political 
low-life for insinuating it, and re-
fused to apologize. 

Mattox named a Mexican na-
tional, Evaristo Hernandez, as the 
Richards' volunteer who entered 
his headquarters three times claim-
ing to be a Mutton supporter. 

Mattox campaigners recognized 
Hernandez working a Richards 
campaign booth at the Mexican-
American Democrats convention. 
Mattox mid Hernandez admitted 
working for Richards for six 
weeks. 

Candidate List Grows 
Railroad Commissioner John 

Sharp officially entered the race 
for Comptroller, saying he favors 
funnelling illegal drug tax rev-
enues back to local law enforce-
ment. 

His Republican opponent, Hous. 
ton businessman Tommy Fatjo, 
immediately blasted Sharp for 
serving as Texas campaign man-
ager for presidential candidate 
Michael Dukakis of Massachusetts. 

Meanwhile, two Republicans in 
the governor's race disagreed on 
how to prevent a state income tax. 

Kent Hance seeks a constitu-
tional ban; Clayton Williams seeks 
to use veto power. While Hance 
painted Williams as soft, insid-
ers know a constitutional amend-
ment, requiring two-thirds major-
ity in each house, is probably out 
of reach at this time. 

Kay Bailey Hutchinson, a Dal-
las lawyer-businesswoman, be-
came the first Republican to an-
nounce for state treasurer. Her 
goal is to restore the state's 
AAA bond rating, and she rapped 
Democrats for leading state gov-
ernment into deficit spending. 
Her campaign co-chairs arc Roger 
Statibach and Anne Armstrong. 

To recognize the Texas Rural 
Health Association and its efforts 
to ensure continued availability of 
health care services, the Texas 
Senate in August passed a resolu-
tion designating the week of Sept. 
23-30 as "Texas Rural Health 
Week." 

"The causes of the present crisis 
in our rural health care delivery 
system are complex and not easily 
resolved; with the leadership of 
organizations like the TRHA and 
the combined efforts of all Tex-
ans, we will continue to seek 
positive and effective solutions to 
the critical situation," Sen. Carlos 
Truan said in the resolution he 
sponsored. 

The Texas Rural Health 
Association was formed in 1985 to 
advocate the improved availability 
and accessibility of health care ser-
vices to Texas' rural areas. It will 
hold its fifth annual conference 
Sept. 27-30 in Corpus Christi. 

A.G. Edwards, Inc. is a holding 
company whose primary sub-
sidiary is the St. Louis-based 
brokerage firm of A.G. Edwards 
&Sons, Inc. 

The common stock of the 
folding company is listed on the 
New York Stock Exchange 
(AGE). 

With the theme, "Rural Health 
Care - Towards the Year 2000," 
the conference will bring together 
health care professionals, ad -

ministrators, educators, 
policymakers and other communi-
ty leaders to discuss problems 
common to many communities 
and identify potential solutions. 
The conference will combine ses-
sions of general interest with 
smaller, interactive workshops 
that will explore more specific 
topics related to rural health care. 

"There are no simple solutions 
to the problems in our state's rural 
health care delivery system," Jim 
Shannon, president of the TRHA, 
said, "However, the Legislature 
creating the Center for Rural 
Health Initiatives assures that we 
can look forward to some real im-
provements." Shannon's role as 
TRHA president is one facet of his 
public relations position at Brazos 
Electric Cooperative, head-
quartered in Waco. 

"Our goal at Brazos Electric is 
not only to provide dependable, 
economical electricity, but also to 
enhance the quality of life for 
residents in our service area," said 
Richard E. McCaskill, Brazos 
Electric's executive vice president 
and general manager. "The Texas 
rural health care delivery system is 
now in very poor condition, and 
we feel it needs all the help we can 
give it." 

Currently, 52 Texas counties 
have no hospitals and 14 counties 
are without physicians. The 
number of Texas rural residents 
affected by the health care crisis 
exceeds the total populations of 

Alaska, Delaware, Nevada, Ver-
mont and Wyoming combined. 
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Long Term Care Insurance 
*Nursing Home Benefits 

*Post-Confinement Benefits 

*Home Health Care Benefits 

Th's is not a Medicare Supplement 

WALLACE INGLISH 
Registered Representative 

New York Life 
Insurance Company 

1105 Olive, P.O. Box 1477 
Gainesville, Texas 76240 

Bus (817)665-5863 
	

Res (817)768-2719 

'''' Olii361■11 
This Coupon Entitles Bearer To A 

FREE  Initial Examination 
and 

2 Screening X-Rays 
(If Indicated From the FREE Examination) 

Offer Includes a FREE 
Report of Findings 

Murray 
Chiropractic Center 

Dr. Troy Murray 
715 East California 	 Gainesville, Texas 

(817) 665-7656 

and monounsaturated. Oils from 
vegetable products such as saf-
flower and sunflower seeds, corn, 
soybeans and cottonseeds are 
polyunsaturated. Monoun-
saturated fats are found in olive, 
canola and peanut oils and certain 
plants such as avodados. 

So to make it simple, just 
remember that cholesterol and 
saturated fat are hardest on your 
heart and that monounsaturated 
and polyunsaturated are the 
easiest. 

A low-fat, low-cholesterol diet 
will help keep your heart healthy. 
You can learn more about how to 
select, prepare and serve great -
tasting, healthful foods by enroll-
ing in the mailout series in the 
County Extension Office. 

Serving People Like You Over 45 Years 

JIM 
309 N. Grand Ave. - Gainesville - 6135-4812 

SEEDS JEWELERS 
Many While-U-Wait Services 

Diamonds, Watches & Jewelry Always Priced Right 
We Offer on Premises Ring Sizing - Clock, Watch & 

Jewelry Repair & Engraving 

T.V. Troubles? 
CALL BILL WEATHEREAD 

AT BILL'S T.V. & APPLIANCES 
2101 East Highway 82, Gainesville, TX 

Qua- ar 

Sales and Seri ice 

(817)665-9550 

9 	 We Service All Makes •:.: 
[Quagar] 	 :•:. 

.s, T.V Stereos & Microwave Ovens 
L 	

 

Satellite & Antenna Systems 

• 

1 3/4" Bands 19' each 

50 ct . Flat '7.50 

3" Sq. Pots 3 for .00 

or 32 ct. Flat '9.00 

GARDEN 
MUMS 
'1.25 each or 

'12.00 dozen 41/2" Pots 

10" 
Hanging Baskets 

'6.75 each 

Whitecotton Greenhouse 
9 miles west of Saint Jo on Hwy. 59 

Montague, Texas 
	

894-6631 

Sacred Heart Alumni 
wish to thank all those 
responsible for making 
Las Vegas Night such 

a great success! 

Tom Vogel 
KGAF 

Ed Endres 
Lenny Vogel 

Muenster Drilling 
Jim Gilbreath 
Jack Frazier 

Norbert Walterscheid 
B K H 

PU M PCO 
Charles F. Bartush 

Wilbert Vogel 
82 Liquor 

Red River Liquor 
Muenster Wholesale 

Beer Dist. 
Fischer's Meat Market 
Dangelmayr Hog Farm 
Lora's Flowers & Gifts 

Bouquets & Gifts 
The Charm Shop 

Hamric's 
Hess Furniture 

Cakes by Betty Rose 
Flo's Ceramics 

Doris's Cut & Style 
The Hut 

JoEll Hellman 
Antonio's 

W F W 
Gene Hoedebeck 

John Bartush 
Gary Endres 

Larry Hennigan 
Mary Beth Bartush 

Muenster State Bank 
A Friend 

PrestigueGunite 
Prestige Racing 

Leo Hess 
Kountry Korner 

Muenster Mutual 
Jimmy Jack Biffle 
Gehrig's Hardware 

H &W Meat 
Modern Floors 

Quicksilver 
Tops &Teams 

Community Lumber 
The Center 

First Gibraltar 
Janelle L utkenhaus 

Elizabeth Mollenkopf 
Brenda Richey 

Hennigan's Auto Parts 
The Personal Touch 

Connie Klement 
My Girl Friday 

Rhonda Hartman 
Joaline Henscheid 
Tammy Wimmer 

Margie Starke 
Colynda Sicking 
Kathy Felderhoff 
Imelda Rohmer 

Miriam Caplinger 
Dorothy Mae Yosten 
Caroline Schilling 
Leoba Mollenkopf 

Regina Pels 
Clara Endres 
Donna Biffle 

Jacque Endres 
Carolyn Bayer 

Carrie Ann Walterscheid 
Karen Moster 

Elaine Schilling 
Stacie Miller 
Virgilla Herr 

Carla Truebenbach 
Doreen Taylor 
Debbie Hess 
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-771 Cut the fat — 

Be Heart Smart! 

E 

• , 	- 	• 
THE HOME of Denise and Dwayne Pagel has been honored with the "Yard of the Month" award for Sep-
tember by the Muenster Garden Club. The committee in charge cited in particular the well-tended lawn and 
beautifully blooming late summer and early fall flowers in a front flower bed. Receiving most credit for the 
award was the attractive and suitable landscaping around the pool area in the backyard overlooking the lake. A 

	

sign has been put in place in the front yard of the home, indicating the award. 	 Dave Felie Photo 

seafood, chicken, turkey and cor-
nish hen. 

Two types of fat also play an 
important role in determining 
your cholesterol level: saturated 
fat which raises the level of 
cholesterol in the blood, and un-
saturated fat which can reduce 
blood cholesterol. 

Saturated fats are found in 
animal products such as beef, 
veal, lamb, pork and ham; in but-
ter, cream and whole milk; and in 
cheeses made from cream and 
whole milk. Saturated fats are also 
found in many solid vegetable 
shortenings, in coconut oil, cocoa 
butter, palm oil and palm kernel 
oil. 

There are two types of un-
saturated fats - polyunsaturated 

Muenster 4-H Club plans 
upcoming events and projects 

reported by Jordon Bayer 
Muenster 4-H held their first 

meeting Tuesdsay, Sept. 12, at 7 
p.m. at Sacred Heart School. 
Twenty-three new members 
enrolled along with all old 
members. Everyone was welcom- 

4 ed into the club. 
The club recited the Pledge to 

the Flag, the 4-H Motto, the 4-H 
Pledge and Prayer led by their 
presidents, senior president 
Werner Becker and junior presi-
dent Michael Becker. 

All upcoming events were 
discussed including: Planning for 
the 4-H Achievement Banquet, set 
for Oct. 2; a 4-H Parent/Leader 
Rally on Monday evening, Sept. 
18 at Cooke County Electric Co-
op in Muenster at 7 p.m. (the pur-
pose of this rally is to give parents 
and leaders a better understanding 
of 4-H'ers "learning by doing" 
project work and to explain how 
parents can get involved); the 
opening meeting of the 1989-90 
4-H County Council; the 4-H 
Poster Contest honoring National 
4-H Week, also in honor of Na-
tional 4-H Week the 4-H County 
Council is sponsoring a 4-H Car-
nival on Saturday, Oct. 7, from 9 
a.m. to I p.m. on the parking lot 
of the North Texas Bank and 
Trust on Hwy. 82 in front of Wal-
Mart. 

Dairy and Livestock Judging 
-this activity began Sept. 1 1 . Check 

by Elaine Schad 
The Lindsay City Council will 

inform the Houston company 
which has the city's cable fran- 

• chile that they may seek legal ac-
tion if service is not improved 
within six weeks. 

The council, at its regular 
September meeting, discussed the 
many complaints the city is receiv-
ing because of alleged poor ser-
vice, said Mayor Don Metzler. 
"We're very unhappy with the 
cable franchise," he said. "We 
may seek legal action if that's 
what it will take." 

Wilkes-Gore Associates Cable 
Television Company of Houston 
services about 125 homes in Lind-
say. Residents have complained of 
the channels constantly going off 

T. Boone Pickens will be the 
guest speaker at a luncheon at the 
Wichita Club on Sept. 28, accor-
ding to Ralph Knighton, club 
manager. Pickens will be speaking 
in the main dining room of the 
club, located on the fifth floor of 
the Oil and Gas Building. The 
meeting is open to Wichita Club 
members and their guests. 

The event will be the first in a 
series of special luncheons to be 
held in a cooperative effort bet- 

/ ween the Wichita Club and the 

See Results! 
040" BEST 
;ow "- 

VALUES 
Call (817) 759-4311  

with Extension Office by Sept. 15, 
1989 for Dairy or Livestock 
Judging. 

Rural Youth Day - the State 
Fair of Texas, Saturday, Sept. 30. 
Free passes are available in the Ex-
tension Office. 

4-H Shooting Sports Leader-
Coach Training Workshop - Oct. 
27-29 at the Texas Lion's Camp at 
Kerrville. This workshop is 
designed especially for those 
leaders who want to learn how to 
manage a shooting sports project. 

1990 Houston Livestock Show 
Calf Scramble - 4-H calf scramble 
dates Feb. 18-25. Contact the Ex-
tension Office by Sept. 13. 

Fort Worth, Houston, San An-
tonio Livestock Shows - contact 
the Extension Office for a list of 
dates and entry information. 

Muenster 4-H Family Day -
Oct. 15, 1989, at 12:30. Each 
family is to bring two covered 
dishes for lunch. Pins and cer-
tificates will be passed out. Games 
will follow. 

Muenster 4-H Fundraiser - star-
ting Oct. 9 and ending at the 
November meeting, we will raffle 
a small TV. Prizes will be awarded 
to the top and second place seller 
of tickets. 

Sign-up sheets were out for 
refreshment committee, foods 
project and Senior Share-the-Fun. 

Recreation was led by Sherilyn 

and on, as does the pay-for-view 
channels, said Metzler. The 
weather channel has never work-
ed, he said. "We've got citizens 
calling their 800-number almost 
daily," he said. "We're hoping 
we'll get their attention. I don't 
think it would take much to fix." 

In another matter, the council 
passed an ordinance abandoning a 
section of Third Street from 
Willow to Pecan, and will issue 
quit claim deeds to the effect 
within a couple of weeks. The 
two-block-wide strip has been a 
source of controversy in recent 
months, with adjacent property 
owners disagreeing as to the 
ownership of some of the area. 
Metzler said any citizen concerned 
about the ordinance may contact 
him. 

North Texas Oil & Gas Associa-
tion (NTOGA). 

Pickens is a widely recognized 
Texas entrepreneur. Upon gradua-
tion from Oklahoma State Univer-
sity, Pickens went to work for a 
major oil company. While there, 
he encountered the slowness and 
inefficiency of a large corporate 
bureaucracy. That experience 
began to shape his business 
philosophy and practices. 

Tom Haywood, executive vice 
president of NTOGA, said, "Mr. 
Pickens' views are controversial, 
especially in regard to exploration 
strategies. However, his en-
trepreneurial successes are so 
great, I know people will want to 
hear his views." 

Pickens began Petroleum Ex-
ploration, Inc. in 1956 with 
$2,500. He now commands an em-
pire worth $2.5 billion. His con-
troversial ideas set in motion 
events that are helping to bring 
about the restructuring of cor-
porate America. 

Daring and innovative thinking 
is now the Pickens' trademark. 

Sicking. Refreshments were fur-
nished by Paul and Donna Bayer. 
The meeting was adjourned. 

For more information about 
4-1-I, contact club managers 
Evelyn and Jerry Sicking at 
759-4388 or Becky Felderhoff at 
759-4884, or the County Exten-
sion Office at 668-5412. 

(Special to The Enterprise) 

Muenster could have no better 
benefactor and friend than Teddy 
Trept of Dallas. Teddy is the 
chairman of the German Day 
Council of Dallas. 

As chairman, Teddy has 
spearheaded the recognition of 
Muenster at the German Day 
celebrations this year at the Grand 
Kempinski Hotel and at the State 
Fair. Teddy, who recently 
celebrated his 82nd birthday, 
made numerous trips to Muenster 
to coordinate the event, meeting 
with the Chamber of Commerce, 
Centennial Committee and Mayor 
Henscheid. Teddy also made, and 
paid out of his own pocket for, 
numerous telephone calls to Ger-
many to arrange for Dr. Virg 
Twenhoven, the mayor of 

The council heard a report from 
Tim Morris Engineering on the 
paving project. The city will pro-
ceed to put the project out for bids 
and hope to review them within 
the next few weeks. Depending on 
the weather, the paving may be 
postponed until the spring, 
Metzler said, but at least the city 
will have some actual cost figures 
to work with in the meantime.  

by Evelyn Yeatts, 
Counts Extension Agent 

"Cut the Fat and Cholesterol 
for Life." That's the message 
from the American Heart Associa-
tion in presenting "Food 
Festival," a statewide nutrition 
education event held last week, 
Sept. 10-16. 

The goal is to improve public 
awareness of the relationship bet-
ween high cholesterol, high -
saturated fat diets, and car-
diovascular disease. 

The County Extension Office 
will be offering in-depth informa-
tion on Heart Healthy Living in a 
mailout series currently being of-
fered. The free mailout series will 
include information on: 

- Low cholesterol meals 
- Saturated fat-polyunsaturated 

fat, what is the difference? 
- Reading food labels 
- Avoiding too much sodium 
- Adding fiber to the diet 
- Soluble or unsolube fiber 
- Recipes for heart healthy 

eating 
To receive the mailout series, 

call the County Extension office at 
668-5412. 

Cholesterol is a soft, fat-like 
substance found among the fats in 
the bloodstream. Your body gets 
cholesterol in two ways - from 
your liver and from the foods you 
eat. The cholesterol we get directly 
from foods, however, is the type 
we can control. 

Dietary cholesterol is found in 
foods from animals such as red 
meat, whole milk dairy products, 

Miinster, Westfalen, Muenster's 
namesake, to visit Muenster and 
attend the German Day Ball. 

Earlier in the year, he was in-
strumental in bringing the Dallas 
Frohsinn Singing Society to per-
form at the opening ceremony of 
the 1989 Germanfest. This 
busload, along with a busload 
from the German-American Club 
of Arlington, gave us good 
representation from Dallas for our 
1989 Germanfest. 

A great way for us to show our 
appreciation to the German com-
munity of Dallas, especially Teddy 
Trept, is to have a good group of 
people from Muenster at the Ger-
man Day Ball. Make ar-
rangements now to attend the Ball 
at the Grand Kempinski on Oct. 
14 and Muenster Day at the Fair 
on Oct. 15. While you are at the 
Ball or at the State Fair, go up to 
Teddy Trept and tell him "thank 
you" for the recognition Muenster 
is receiving. 

For more information on Ger-
man Day, call the Chamber of 
Commerce office at 759-2227 or 
Alvin Furhman at 736-2251 for 
additional information. 

T. Boone Pickens to be 
guest speaker at lunch 

Lindsay demands improved service 

Muenster has a friend 
in Dallas's Teddy Trept 



MR. and MRS. BEN FLEITMAN 
... on their wedding day, Aug. 22, 039 

Lacy honored on 6th 

Carol and Ben Fleitman Jr. an-
nounce the arrival of their son, 
Mark Joseph, on Sept. 18. He was 
born on Friday, Aug. 11, 1989 and 
weighed 9 lb. 91/2 oz. and was 22 
inches in length. Mark joins a 
brother, Matthew, age 41/2. 
Grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Damond Fuhrmann of Lindsay 
and Mr. and Mrs. Ben Fleitman 
Sr. of Muenster. Mrs. Pauline 
Block and H.S. Fuhrmann, both 
of Lindsay, are great -
grandparents. 

Richey 
Tiffany Richey, age 4, is happy 

to announce the birth of a baby 
brother, Colby Ray. He was born 
to Todd and Brenda Richey on 
Friday, Sept. 15, 1989, at 7:27 
a.m. in Denton AMI Regional 
Medical Center. He weighed 7 lb. 
5 oz. and was 20 inches in length. 
Grandparents are Red and Carol 
Henscheid and Wendell and Rita 
Richey of Muenster. Colby and 
Tiffany's great-grandparents are 
Dora Henscheid, T. Miller and 
Mimi Cain, all of Muenster, and 
Herman and Irene Richey of 
Gainesville. 

Wilde 
Shirley and Gregg Wilde are ex-

cited about the arrival of their first 
daughter, Kaitlin Nicole. She was 
born in Gainesville Memorial 
Hospital on Saturday, Sept. 16, 
1989 at 1:10 a.m. and weighed 7 
lb. 11 oz. and was 20 inches long. 
She joins two brothers, Jeffrey, 9, 
and Matthew, 6. Grandparents are 
Ray and Marcy Wilde and Evelyn 
Monday, all of Muenster. Their 
great-grandparents are Sadie 
O'Connor of Muenster and Mr. 
and Mrs. A.B. Monday of Crab 
Orchard, Tenn. 

Twins feted 
on birthday 

Brenda and Bob Thompson 
came from Fayetteville, North 
Carolina on Friday, Sept. 15, to 
celebrate Brenda's 40th birthday 
with her twin brother, Glenn Cler. 
A party was held on Sunday even-
ing at the home of their mother, 
Armella Cler. 

Family members brought a 
covered dish. Attending from 
Gainesville were Wayne and Deb-
bie and daughters, Tamie and 
Amy, and son Tony came from 
Fort Ord, California on a two-
week leave; Marcia and James and 
children, Cheryl and Jimmy; 
Charles and Alyce and children, 
Leslie and Elizabeth, all of Lind-
say; Glenn and Glenda and 
daughters, Kim and Stacie; Tim 
Cler; Kevin and Barbara Jo and 
daughter, Shalane, of Roanoke. 

Bob and Brenda left Monday 
morning from DFW Airport. 

Brenda and Glenn's actual bir-
thdate is Sept. 11. 

RICKY ENDRES 

Ricky Endres 
scores the big 4 

Ben Fleitman and Josephine 
Hellinger were married 50 years 
ago in St. Mary's Church of 
Gainesville on Aug. 22, 1939. 
Their golden wedding anniversary 
was celebrated on Sunday, Aug. 
27, at a reception hosted by their 
children in Sacred Heart Com-
munity Center meeting room. 
More than 100 friends and 

relatives attended. 
Children and their families at-

tending were Richard and Mary 
Hellinger; Christine Fleitman; 
Helen and Lloyd Prescher and 
Brett, Bart, Dianne, Debbie, Dana 
and Brian; Ann Marie Skinner 
and son Lee; Gus and Paula Fleit-
man and Randy, Jan, Melinda, 
Kerry and Kristen; Pauline and 

Germania Insurance 

Covering Texas since 1896. 

Life Insurance 
Property & Casualty Insurance 

Bob Hermes 
759-4496 
Muenster, Texas 

Floyd and Marceline Felderhoff 
announce the birth of a son, 
Justin Walter Felderhoff, on Sept. 
17, 1989 at 1:14 p.m., weighing 7 
lb. 151/2 oz. and measuring 201/2 
inches in length. in Midland 
Memorial Hospital. Grandparents 
are Celine and Walter Bartel and 
Betty and Henry Felderhoff, all of 
Muenster. The great-grandmother 
is Mrs. Margaret Truebenbach, 
also of Muenster. Floyd and 
Marceline live at 5007 San An-
tonio, Midland, TX 79707. She is 
the former Marceline Bartel. 

Felderhoff 
Garry and Stephanie Felderhoff 

of Gainesville are parents of twin 
girls. The babies were born Sept. 
19, 1989 at Wilson N. Jones 
Hospital in Sherman. Jaci Lynn 
was born at 1:30 p.m. and weigh-
ed 6 lb. 5 oz. Laci Marie was born 
at 1:31 p.m. and weighed 5 lb. 15 
oz. The babies were transferred to 
Dallas Methodist Hospital on 
Wednesday, Sept. 20. The twins 
have a sister, Mandy Jo, age 3. 
Grandparents are Wendell and 
Rita Richey of Muenster and Leo 
and Rosina Felderhoff of 
Gainesville. Great-grandparents 
are Herman and Irene Richey and 
Mrs. Richard Cain of Muenster. 

N( S 1..N1)1Z1 a, 

Quality 
Dry 

Cleaning 

• Drapery Cleaning 

• Certified Cold Storage 
• Bridal Gown Preservation 
• Repairing 
• Alterations 

Miller 
Cleaners 

329 N. Commerce 
Gainesville 

665-3301 

Fasticlic 
759-4408 

 

in Old Theatre Mall 

 

New 1990 In Stock 
1990 GMC 

Sierra Sportside Pickup TC10703 

lot 

• 	 Waal No 505020 

Reg. Price 	$13,054.00 
Brown's Discount 	934.00 

G60 Ay Good Fry GU6 Rear AaN 342 ', 993 GA 
Alum Wills; XEV 1,225/751915 Al, S. Z03 Con. 
weeny., Grp, 1SY Manuel 'Dens Pig, 94U 94 Crlm. 
son Red. De 4 Ed BEye MvP1.104 4 3 leer EFI V6, 
TR9 Au.Aery LOC YES 1.225751114 Ale S. ZVI 
Sold pain, ISO Valve Pap Decal. Eat Sporlsde 
Body, 111.15 Spodskle Body. 1,065 5.Spoed Men 
Trans. U1.46 AM.FACST.Gas-G14, ZEV P225161115 
Ale D I SB Val Pap P1A2, 47G cna1 Grney Clan 

$12,120°° 
Plus TaX,T1110 and UC011641 

1989 GMC Sierra Sportside Pickup TC10703 

Stn. No 153053 

Reg. Price 	$12,035.00 
Rebate 	 500.00 
Brown's Discount 	635.00 

510,900°° 
Plus Tea. Idle and License 

Taled Glass All, G42 Value PI, noon!, 065 
Spoosale Body, 034 Speed Gonl.Elec, 103 TM Steer 
Wheel, UA1 AD Bane, V22 DIX Frl Appear. ZEV 
P2251751115 Ale 5,262 SIB EquIprnonl, G04 later W/ 
S Alper. COO All Cond Ed, 059 Front Slab Her. LEM 
4 3 Laer cr1 V6. N67 Reny Wheels 10.46 AM FM-
SI Gas GM. REV P22515015 Ms S. XVI Sold 
Neel, 24G cool BN C0b BN, CAB Reg Val PI, 
Toll; 044 En BEye MA.el, 004 !leer Axle 306. 
Ma45 5.Speed Man Dena, 1119 AuxAmy 1phl, U37 
Dom lighler. YEV P225751915 Ms S, 253 0.5..; 
501/500151e sold 

Brown Motor Company 
Monday-Friday 8:00.6:00 

Saturday  8:00-5:00 	• 

1808 West Highway 82, Gainesville, 	817.685-5591 

WHAT SITS 
OUT BAC& RUNS 

SUMMER AND 
WINTER,AND SAVES 

YOU MONEY? 

A heat pump. And there 
are three good reasons you should 
get one. 

A HEAT PUMP COOLS'. 
HEATS AND SAVES. 

Replace your old air conditioner with a rev 
electric heat pump. It's a high efficiency air con-
ditioner in summer. While, in the winter its the most 
energy efficient heating system you can Own. On 

even the coldest days, a heat pump S.1Steln operates 
efficientlyand will pnxide all the Kaman ant neat. 

A HEAT PUMP 
CAN SAVE $130 A YEAR. 

Compared to a gasffirnace, a heat pump is 
more energy efficient And TU Electric's low rates 
make heating and cooling your home with a heat 
pump an even better value. Tests have shoran you 
can saw $130 or mom a Sear by installing 
a heat pump.• 

GET MORE INFORMATION 
)611 can . find OW MOW about 

the amazing heat pump. including 
details on rebates. from your local 
heat pump dealer. 

AMMON 
NOW AN 

• 11111111/1f1s, 5 

11111),i 	 hilr55 r. 

FITUELECTRIC 
A Commitment To Service 

,,,, ,,,,,,,,,,,,,,, 	 If,v nSI I R ,irronnithontrig mut 
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Lifestyle  	  genJleitonanJ celebrate anniverJary 

New Arrivals 

Fleitman 

Jimmy Prescher and Jay, Jeremy, 
Joey and Julie; Ben Jr. and Carol 
Fleitman and son Matthew; Betty 
Gilpin and daughters Tammy and 
Brandy; Kenny and Susan Fleit-
man and sons Russell and Phillip; 
and Charles and Beverly Fleitman. 

Granddaughters Dianne 
Prescher and Jan Fleitman presid-
ed at the guest book. 

The anniversary cake was baked 
and cut by Natalie Hess. Punch 

Sacred Heart Church is arrang-
ing to participate in the publica-
tion of a pictorial church direc-
tory. Parishioners are urged to 
participate to make available a 
wonderful record of all members. 

Each participating family will 
receive an 8x10 color family por-
trait at no cost plus a complimen-
tary directory. 

Sign-up times for appointments 
will be after Masses this Saturday 
and Sunday. 

Photographing days will be dur-
ing the weekends of Oct. 28 and 
Nov. 4. 

Catholic Daughters of America 
will be in charge of record-keeping 

Penni Hess, bride-elect of Floyd 
Haverkamp, was honored on her 
wedding day with a champagne 
bridal luncheon in the home of 
Mrs. Bill Hamer. 

Following a toast to the bride, 
lunch was served from a beautiful-
ly appointed table covered with a 
white linen eyelet cloth centered 
with a ceramic cherub epergne, 
filled with ivy and blue cor-
nflowers, standing beneath were 
ceramic dolls dressed in wedding 
attire. 

The descendants of the late 
Peter and Mary Bindel had a reu-
nion at the pavilion in the 
Muenster City Park Sunday, Sept. 
17, for noon lunch. Some 160 
family members gathered with 
their covered dishes. 

Cities 	represented 	were 
Goldthwaite, Windthorst, 
Gainesville, Pilot Point, Henriet-
ta, Grapevine, Lewisville, The 
Colony, Wichita Falls, Argyle, 
Archer City, Bedford, 
Whitesboro, Myra. 

The little children enjoyed the 

Ricky Endres celebrated his 
fourth birthday with a football 
theme birthday party. His cake 
was decorated like a football. 

Guests enjoyed watching Ricky 
open his gifts and cards. Pictures 
and home movies were made of 
the occasion. Guests were served 
cake, ice cream and other 
refreshments. 

Among those attending were 
Ricky's parents, Phil and Marlene 
Endres; his sisters, Lacy and Kel-
ly; his brother, Troy; grand-
parents, Ed and Clara Endres; 
godparents, Stan and Janet En-
dres; aunts and cousins, Sharlene 
Hartman and Shannon; Glenda 
Russell and Lisa and Amanda; 
Rhonda Hartman and Holly and 
Courtney; Laurie Flusche and 
Katie; and Luke Endres. 

- 	- 	— 

Lacy Endres, daughter of Phil 
and Marlene Endres, turned six on 
Sept. 3. She was honored with two 
parties. 

After school on Sept. 1, a sur-
prise Barbie doll cake was waiting 
for Lacy and her friends when she 
arrived home from school. The 
children enjoyed playing games 
and watching Lacy open her gifts. 
Cake, ice cream and refreshments 
were served to guests. 

Among those attending were 
classmates and friends, Holly 
Hartman, Kimberly Klement, 
Mattie Sicking, Luke Endres, Jen-
nifer Hoedebeck, Elizabeth Fette, 
and Ashley Hess; and relatives, 
Ricky, Kelly and Sandy Endres; 
Sharlene, Shannon and Dainah 
Hartman; Judy Pagel; and Lisa 
Russell. 

On Sept. 3, Lacy helped her 
mom make and decorate her birth-
day cake with pink and red roses. 
The cake was served to visitors 
along with ice cream and other 
refreshments. Pictures and home 
movies were made of the special 
occasion. 

Helping Lacy celebrate were her 
grandparents, Ed and Clara En-
dres and Maurice Pagel; aunts and 
cousins, Sharlene Hartman and 
Shannon and Dainah; Glenda 
Russell and Lisa and Amanda; 
and Judy Pagel.  

was served by daughters and 
daughters-in-law. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ben Fleitman Sr. 
still live on their farm south of 
town. He has retired from farming 
and from work at Community 
Lumber Company. 

Guests at the anniversary party 
came from Gainesville, Valley 
View, Denton, Pilot Point, 
Nocona, Oklahoma City, Okla. 
and Wagner, Oklahoma. 

and sign-ups. For further infor-
mation, please call Dorothy Fisher 
759-2751 or Lucille Lutkenhaus 
759-2962. 

This announcement was also in-
cluded in last Sunday's bulletin at 
Sacred Heart Church, in which 
Father Victor Gillespie said, in 
part, "Many people have told me 
that we need a new Parish Direc-
tory, and I agree. But this will take 
a lot of work by some people and 
the cooperation of all of you. The 
Catholic Daughters of the 
Americas have kindly agreed to 
assist the project, and I am 
grateful to them." 

park, swings, slide, etc. some 
played volleyball, tennis. Others 
played cards and visited. 

The last reunion was in 1985 
and the one before was 1981. 

There were five children of 
Peter and Mary Bindel: Frank 
Bindel and Marie Fleitman Bindel; 
Hattie Grewing and John Grew-
ing; Elizabeth Derichsweiler and 
Bill Derichsweiler; Helen 
Steinberger and Fred Steinberger; 
and Herman Bindel and Regina 
Bindel Moore. 

Attending were the bridesmaids 
Laura Hess, Mindy Klement, 
Vicki Fisher and Connie Klement. 

Special guests were the bride's 
mother, Monica Hess; her mater-
nal and paternal grandmothers, 
Marie Herr and Caroline Hess. 

The hostess gift was a dutch 
oven in the bride's selected 
cookware pattern. 

Penni and Floyd were. married 
Saturday, Sept. 9, in Sacred Heart 
Church. 

Felderhoff 

Bindel reunion held 

Bride-elect honored 
with bridal luncheon 

• 

	 Directory to be printed , 
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PROPOSITION NO. 2 
ON THE BALLOT • 

Senate Joint Resolution 5 proposes 
a constitutional amendment that 
would authorize the Texas Water 
Development Board to issue an addi-
tional $500 million of Texas water 
development bonds. The additional 
bonds are to be used as follows: 
$250 million of the bonds are to be 
used for water supply loans and 
facilities acquisition; $200 million of 
the bonds are to be used for water 
quality enhancement projects; and 
$50 million of the bonds are to be 
used for flood control. The legisla-
ture may provide that $100 million 
be used for subsidized loans and 
grants to economically distressed 
areas of the state for water and 
wastewater facilities. 

The proposed amendment will ap- 
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment to 
authorize the issuance of an addi-
tional $500 million of Texas water 
development bonds for water sup-
ply, water quality, and flood con-
trol purposes." 

PROPOSITION NO. 3 
ON THE BALLOT 

House Joint Resolution 51 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would authorize the legislature 
to provide for the issuance of gen-
eral obligation bonds to provide 
money to establish a Texas agri-
cultural fund, a rural microenter-
prise development fund, a Texas 

1' 
product development fund, and a 
Texas small business incubator fund 
in the state treasury. The Texas 
agricultural fund would be used to 
provide financial assistance to de-
velop, increase, improve, or expand 
the production, processing, market-
ing, or export of crops or products 
grown or produced in Texas by 
Texas agricultural businesses. The 
rural microenterprise development 
fund would be used to stimulate the 
creation and expansion of small busi-
nesses in rural areas. The Texas 
product development fund would be 
used to aid in the development and 
production of new or improved prod-
ucts in this state. The Texas small 
business incubator fund would be 
used to stimulate the development of 
small businesses in the State. 

The principal amount of bonds 
outstanding at one time could not 
exceed $25 million for the Texas 
agricultural fund and $5 million for 
the rural microenterprise develop- 
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"Rainbows" designed to help children deal with grief 
A child is a miniature adult with 

the same feelings of grief and 
despair for a loss as an adult, but 
with less life experience to help 
them deal with their feelings of 
grief. Sacred Heart Parish is pleas-
ed to announce that it will sponsor 
a program, Rainbows For All 
God's Children, which is designed 
to help provide the emotional 
stability that a child needs to ver-
balize his or her own feelings and 

• begin to deal with them. 
The program is open to all area 

by Evelyn Yeatts, 
County Extension Agent-H.E. 
Nearly 1,000 members of the 

Texas Extension Homemakers 
Association took part in the 
group's annual educational con-
ference in Corpus Christi, Sept. 12, 
13 and 14. Local leaders attending 
the conference were: Imogene 
Zimmerer, Liberty Belles Club; 
T.E.H.A. Chairman Mary Wam-
baugh, Callisburg Club; and 
Adeline Sicking, Muenster Exten-
sion Homemakers Club.  

children, kindergarten through 
eighth grade, who are living in 
single-parent families, step-
families, or families that are going 
through painful transitions. It 
consists of 12 sessions, divided in-
to two six-week semesters. In ad-
dition, each six week semester is 
concluded with a wrap-up session 
that includes the parents and 
children. The first semester will be 
held this Fall and the second 
semester will be in the Spring. 

During the weekly sessions the 

The conference was under the 
leadership of Threasa Leatherman 
of Weatherford, president of the 
statewide homemakers 
organization. 

The professional conference was 
held at the Corpus Christi Bayfront 
Convention Center. 

Leatherman said the association 
offers members a means to con-
tinue education through a variety 
of subject matter, provides oppor-
tunities for training and experience 
in personal development and  

children are divided into groups of 
three to five according to age and 
each group will be facilitated by a 
sensitive, caring adult. The 
facilitators are trained and provid-
ed with the materials needed to 
help these children put their feel-
ings into words, work through 
their grief, build a strong sense of 
self-esteem and begin to accept 
what has taken place in the family. 

The weekly support groups will 
begin Tuesday, October 10 at 3:45 
p.m. and will be held for six con- 

leadership, and affords group 
organization training to enhance 
and promote action in analyzing 
community affairs and public 
problems. 

Workshops were conducted in 
citizenship, health and safety, 
membership and leadership, 
family life, natural resource use 
and cultural arts. 

State recommendation will be 
carried out in these areas locally 
under the direction of the Cooke 
County Delegates - Zimmerer,  

secutive sessions. Each session will 
last approximatley 45 minutes. 
The last session which involves the 
parent and child begins at 3:45 
p.m and lasts until 6:30 p.m. The 
parents will also be required to at-
tend an orientation during the first 
week in October. 

Adults who will be facilitators 
will attend a workshop on Satur-
day, September 30. Local coor-
dinators for the Rainbows Pro-
gram are Barbara Fuhrmann, 
Jeanne Greathouse and Emily 

Wambaugh and Sicking. 
Nueces County Judge Robert 

Barnes addressed the group at the 
opening general session. 

Officers of the Extension 
Homemakers Association besides 
the president are Pat Bandelman of 
Dale, vice-president; Mary 
Abrahamson, Palacios, secretary; 
and Betty Billington, Grandview, 
treasurer. 

Klement. 
Both parent and child must 

register to participate and deadline 
for registration is October 2. 
Dates for the weekly sessions are 
October 10, 17, 24, 31 and 
November 7 and 14. For further 
information call 759-2511 or 
759-4121 and ask for any of the 
coordinators. The application 
below can be completed and 
returned to the church office in 
the convent or mailed to Sacred 
Heart Church. 

This Christian program will 
help children share their feelings  

through 	workbook 	activities, 
sharing and discussions. "1 think 
many children in our community 
could benefit from this program. 
If they are helped to go through 
the grieving process now, they will 
happier and healthier as teenagers 
and adults." comments Barbara 
Fuhrmann, director of religious 
education in Sacred Heart Parish. 

Everything will be completely 
confidential. The children are re-
quired to sign an agreement that 
they will not discuss what they 
hear outside of the discussion 
groups. 

' Annual meeting attracts 1,000 homemakers Child's Name: 	
 

Age: 

Parent's Name: 	  

Address: 
(Street) 

City: 	 Zip Code: 	  

Phone: (work) 	  (hare) 	  

Reason for joining Rainbows (brief) 	  

Child's signature: 

Parent's signature: 

PROPOSITION NO. 1 
ON THE BALLOT 

House Joint Resolution 102 pro- 
' poses a constitutional amendment 

that would increase the salary of 
members of the legislature to one-
fourth of the Governor's salary and 
increase the salary of the Lieutenant 
Governor and the Speaker of the 
House of Representatives to one-half 
of the Governor's salary. The annual 
salary of members of the legislature, 
the Lieutenant Governor, and the 
Speaker of the House of Representa-
tives is currently $7,200. Under this 
provision, the annual salary of the 
Lieutenant Governor and the Speak-
er would be $46,716, and the annual 
salary of members of the legislature 
would be $23,358, based on the Gov-
ernor's current annual salary of 
$93,432. The increase for the Speak-
er and the members of the legislature 
would take effect when the legisla-
ture convenes for its regular session 
in January 1991. The increase for 
the Lieutenant Governor would take 
effect when the term of that office 
begins in 1991. The salary increase 
for the Lieutenant Governor would 
not make members of the legislature 
ineligible to run for the office of 
Lieutenant Governor. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment to 
limit the salary of the lieutenant 
governor and the speaker of the 
house of representatives to not 
more than one-half of the gover-
nor's salary and to limit the salary 
of a member of the legislature to 
not more than one-fourth of the 
governor's salary." 

ment fund. The financial assistance 
offered by both funds could include 
loan guarantees, insurance, coinsur-
ance, loans, and indirect loans or 
purchases or acceptances of assign-
ments of loans or other obligations. 
To carry out the Texas product de-
velopment fund, the legislature 
could authorize loans, loan guaran-
tees, and equity investments, and the 
issuance of up to $26 million of gen-
eral obligation bonds for initial 
funding. To carry out the Texas 
small business incubator fund, the 
legislature could authorize loans and 
grants of money, and the issuance of 
up to $20 million of general obliga-
tion bonds for initial funding. 

Bonds authorized under this 
amendment would be paid out of the 
first money coming into the treasury 
in each fiscal year that is not other-
wise appropriated by the constitu-
tion, less any amount in any interest 
and sinking account at the end of the 
preceding fiscal year that is pledged 
to payment of the bonds or interest. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment 
authorizing the legislature to pro-
vide for the recovery and further 
development of the state's econ-
omy, with goals of increasing job 
opportunities and other benefits 
for Texas residents, through state 
financing of the development and 
production of Texas products and 
businesses." 

PROPOSITION NO. 4 
ON THE BALLOT 

House Joint Resolution 13 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would authorize the legislature, 
by general law, to exempt from ad 
valorem taxes property owned by 
nonprofit veterans organizations 
that are chartered or incorporated 
by the United States Congress. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment to 
authorize the legislature to ex-
empt property of nonprofit vet-
erans organizations from ad 
valorem taxation." 

PROPOSITION NO. 5 
ON THE BALLOT 

Senate Joint Resolution 11 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would provide an exemption 
from ad valorem taxation for goods, 
wares, merchandise, other tangible 
personal property (including air-
craft), and ores (other than oil, gas, 
and petroleum products) if the prop-
erty is acquired in or imported into 
the state and is destined to be for-
warded out of the state, regardless 
of whether the intention to forward 
the property existed when the prop-
erty was acquired or imported into 
the state, if it remains in Texas for 
175 days or less for assembly, stor-
age, manufacture, processing, or 
fabrication. The proposed amend-
ment would authorize the governing 
body of a county, municipality, 
school district, or junior college dis-
trict to prevent the exemption of this 
tangible personal property from tax-
ation by taking official action before 
April 1, 1990. A county, municipali-
ty, school district, or junior college 
district could rescind a decision to 
tax the property, in which case the 
exemption would become effective 
in the year of the rescission and the 
property could not thereafter be 
taxed. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment 
promoting economic growth, job 
creation, and fair tax treatment 
for Texans who export goods to 
other states and nations by restor-
ing and allowing, on a local option 
basis, an ad valorem tax exemp-
tion for certain personal property 
that is in Texas only temporarily 
for the purpose of assembling, 
storing, manufacturing, process-
ing or fabricating." 

PROPOSITION NO. 6 
ON THE BALLOT 

House Joint Resolution 4 proposes 
a constitutional amendment that  

would enable the legislature to pro-
vide, by general or special law, that 
members of a hospital district board 
may serve terms not to exceed four 
years. Currently, hospital district 
board members' terms are two years. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"Authorizing the members of a 
hospital district governing board 
to serve four-year terms." 

PROPOSITION NO. 7 
ON THE BALLOT 

House Joint Resolution 40 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would change the format of the 
oath of office for officeholders in 
this state. All elected and appointed 
officers would be required to take 
an oath or affirmation swearing to 
faithfully execute the duties of 
office and to preserve, protect, and 
defend the constitution and laws of 
the State and the United States. In 
addition, each elected and appointed 
officer would be required to sign a 
sworn statement that he or she had 
not paid, offered, or promised any-
thing of value for a vote or to secure 
appointment to an office, as appli-
cable. The written, sworn statement 
would be filed with the secretary of 
state. The information in the state-
ment is currently contained in the 
oaths of office taken by elected and 
appointed officials. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment to 
require that a member of the legis-
lature, the secretary of state, and 
an elected or appointed officer, 
before assuming office, sign a 
written oath stating that the mem-
ber, the secretary of state, or the 
officer did not engage in bribery 
to obtain the office." 

PROPOSITION NO. 8 
ON THE BALLOT 

Senate Joint Resolution 24 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would allow he legislature to 
authorize the issuance of up to $400 
million in general obligation bonds. 
The proceeds of the bonds could be 
used to acquire, construct, or equip 
new corrections institutions, mental 
health and mental retardation in- 
ts tnuat i oa  nnds , ayt  oa tuat nhd  riraewc t ai onnf  cos 

enforcement 
facilities and to repair and renovate 
existing facilities of those institu-
tions. The bonds would constitute a 
general obligation of the state. The 
bonds and interest on the bonds 
would be paid from the first money 
coming into the treasury that is not 
otherwise appropriated by the con-
sitution, less any amount in a sink-
ing fund at the end of the preceding 
fiscal year that is pledged to pay-
ment of the bonds or interest. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment 
authorizing the issuance of gen-
eral obligation bonds for projects 
relating to facilities of corrections 
institutions, youth corrections in-
stitutions, and mental health and 
mental retardation institutions 
and for the expansion of statewide 
law enforcement facilities." 

PROPOSITION NO. 9 
ON THE BALLOT 

House Joint Resolution 101 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would authorize the legislature 
to pass laws to organize and combine 
state agencies that perform criminal 
justice functions. The legislature 
could combine into one or more agen-
cies all agencies that have authority 
over the confinement and supervi-
sion of convicted criminals, that set 
standards for or distribute state 
funds to political subdivisions with 
authority over the confinement and 
supervision of convicted criminals, 
and that gather information about 
criminal justice administration. 
Agencies that could be combined 
would include the Texas Department 
of Corrections, the Board of Pardons 
and Paroles, and the Texas Adult 
Probation Commission. The amend-
ment would also authorize the legis-
lature to pass laws authorizing the 
appointment of members of more 
than one department of government 
to serve on the governing body. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment 
authorizing the legislature to or-
ganize and combine various state 
agencies that perform criminal 
justice functions." 

PROPOSITION NO. 10 
ON THE BALLOT 

Senate Joint Resolution 4 proposes 
a constitutional amendment that 
would authorize the legislature to 
enact laws requiring or permitting 
judges to advise juries that a de-
fendant convicted of a criminal 
offense can receive credit for good 
conduct that results in a shorter 
prison term and that eligibility for 
parole or mandatory supervision can 
also affect the length of time a con-
victed criminal serves in prison. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment 
authorizing the legislature to re-
quire or permit courts to inform 
juries about the effect of good 
conduct time and eligibility for 
parole or mandatory supervision 
on the period of incarceration 
served by a defendant convicted 
of a criminal offense." 

PROPOSITION NO. 11 
ON THE BALLOT 

House Joint Resolution 102 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would increase the per diem of 
members of the Legislature. The 
amount cf per diem allowed during 
a calendar year would be equal to 
the maximum amount allowed for 
federal income tax purposes as of 
January 1 of that same year as a 
deduction for living expenses in-
curred by a state legislator. The per 
diem of $30 would increase to $81, 
which is the current maximum living 
expense deduction. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment to 
set the amount of per diem re-
ceived by a member cf the legis-
lature at the amount allowed for 
federal income tax purposes as a 
deduction for living expenses in-
curred by a state legislator in 
connection with official business." 

PROPOSITION NO. 12 
ON THE BALLOT 

Senate Joint Resolution 53 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would authorize the legislature 
to provide for the use of the perma-
nent school fund and the income 
from the permanent school fund to 
guarantee bonds issued by the state 
for the purpose of providing loans 
or purchasing the bonds of school 
districts to acqure, construct, reno-
vate, or improve instructional facili-
ties. If the permanent school fund 
were required to make payment as 
a result of its guarantee of bonds 
issued by the state, the fund would 
have to be reimbursed immediately 
from the state treasury. The amount 
of bonds guaranteed by the perma-
nent school fund could not exceed 
$750 million unless a higher amount 
was authorized by a two-thirds vote 
of both houses of the legislature. If 
a school district were to become de-
linquent on a loan. the amount of 
the delinquency would be offset 
against other aid to which the dis-
trict was entitled. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment to 
provide for using the permanent 
school fund and its income to guar-
antee bonds issued by the state for 
the purpose of aiding school dis-
tricts." 

PROPOSITION NO. 13 
ON THE BALLOT 

House Joint Resolution 19 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would provide a bill of rights 
for crime victims. This constitutional 
amendment would give crime victims 
the right to be treated with fairness 
and respect and to be reasonably 
protected from the defendant. On his 
request, the crime victim would have 
the right to notification of court 
proceedings, the right to be present 
at all public court proceedings unless 
a court determines that the victim's 
testimony would be affected by hear-
ing other testimony, the right to 
confer with a representative of the 
prosecutor's office, the right to resti-
tution, and the right to information 
about the conviction, sentence. im-
prisonment, and release of the de-
fendant. The legislature would he 
authorized to enact laws to define 
the tern, "victim," to enforce the 
rights of crime victims, and to pro-
vide that certain public officers and 
agencies are not liable for a failure 
to protect a victim's rights. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment 

providing a bill of rights for crime 
victims." 

PROPOSITION NO. 14 
ON THE BALLOT 

Senate Joint Resolution 71 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would require the district at-
torney in Fort Bend County to be 
elected and serve terms at the same 
times as criminal district attorneys 
in the state. Currently, criminal dis-
trict attorneys are elected in guber-
natorial election years and district 
attorneys are elected in presidential 
election years. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment re-
quiring a district attorney serving 
in Fort Bend County to be elected 
and serve a term in the manner 
provided by general law for crim-
inal district attorneys." 

PROPOSITION NO. 15 
ON THE BALLOT 

House Joint Resolution 32 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would authorize the legislature, 
by general law, to permit charitable 
raffles conducted by qualified non-
profit organizations. The amend-
ment would require that the raffles 
be conducted, promoted, and admin-
istered only by members of the quali-
fied nonprofit organizations and 
that the proceeds from the sale of 
raffle tickets must be spent for the 
charitable purposes of the organiza-
tions. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment 
authorizing the legislature to per-
mit and regulate raffles conducted 
by certain nonprofit organizations 
for charitable purposes." 

PROPOSITION NO. 16 
ON THE BALLOT 

Senate Joint Resolution 34 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
allowing the legislature to pass gen-
eral laws authorizing the creation of 
hospital districts upon approval of a 
majority of the qualified voters of 
the district. The amendment would 
also permit the legislature to autho-
rize the creation of hospital districts 
by general or special law in counties 
with populations of 75,000 or less 
and to authorize the commissioners 
courts of such counties to levy ad 
valorem taxes and issue general obli-
gation bonds for the support and 
maintenance of such districts. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment 
granting to the people the right to 
decide whether to create and main-
tain hospital districts to protect 
the public well-being in a manner 
independent of the legislature." 

PROPOSITION NO. 17 
ON THE BALLOT 

House Joint Resolution 33 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would allow the legislature, by 
general law, to authorize the use of 
public money to provide local fire 
departments and other public fire-
fighting organizations loans or other 
financial assistance to purchase fire-
fighting equipment and to aid in 
complying with federal and state 
law. The legislature would also be 
allowed to authorize the use of public 
money for scholarships and grants 
to educate and train members of 
these organizations. Part of the 
money could be used for administra-
tive costs of this program. The legis-
lature would provide for the terms 
and c..nditions of all such scholar.  
ships, grants, loans, and other finan-
cial assistance. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment 
authorizing the state to provide 
scholarships, grants, loans, and 
other financial assistance to local 
fire departments and other public 
fire-fighting organizations to pur-
chase fire-fighting equipment, to 
aid in providing ne,ssary equip-
ment and facilities to comply with 
federal and state law, and to edu-
cate and train their members." 

PROPOSITION NO. 18 
ON THE BALLOT 

Senate Joint Resolution 44 pro-
poses a constitutional :intendment 
that would repeal subsection tel of 
A rticle III, Section 50-d of the con-
stitution. Article III, Section 60-d 
currently allows the Texas Water 
Development Board to issue and sell 
Texas agricultural water conserva- 

tion bonds in an amount not to ex-
ceed $200 million, if two-thirds of 
the members of each house of the 
legislature approve. Under subsec-
tion (e), this authority will expire 
in November, 1989. Repeal of sub-
section (e) by passage of this 
amendment would continue in effect 
the authority to issue and sell the 
bonds. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment to 
eliminate certain time limitations 
relating to the issuance of Texas 
agricultural water conservation 
bonds." 

PROPOSITION NO. 19 
ON THE BALLOT 

Senate Joint Resolution 59 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would allow local governments 
to invest their funds as authorized 
by the legislature. Currently, the 
constitutional prohibition against a 
grant of public money to an individ-
ual, association, or corporation or 
against becoming a stockholder in a 
corporation, association, or company 
prevents local governments from 
making some kinds of investments. 
This proposed amendment would al-
low local governments to make any 
investments authorized by the legis-
lature. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment to 
authorize local governments to in-
vest their funds as provided by 
law." 

PROPOSITION NO. 20 
ON THE BALLOT 

Senate Joint Resolution 16 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
which, if passed, would abolish the 
office of county surveyor in Cass, 
Ector. Garza, Smith, Bexar, Harris, 
and Webb Counties. A majority of 
the voters in an affected county 
must vote in favor of this proposed 
amendment before the office is 
abolished in that county. If the office 
of county surveyor is abolished in 
any of these counties, the powers, 
duties, and functions of the office 
are transferred to a county officer 
or employee designated by the com-
missioners court of the county in 
which the office is abolished. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment to 
abolish the office of county sur-
veyor in Cass. Ectnr, Garza, 
Smith, Begat., Harris, and Webb 
Counties." 

PROPOSITION NO. 21 
ON THE BALLOT 

Senate Joint Resolution 74 pro-
poses a constitutional amendment 
that would authorize the legislature 
to enact laws authorizing the Texas 
Higher Education Coordinating 
Board or its successor to provide for, 
issue, and sell an additional $75 
million in general obligation bonds 
as college savings bonds. The form, 
terms, and denominations of —the 
bonds would be prescribed by law. 
The interest rate and installments 
would be prescribed by the Texas 
Higher Education Coordinating 
Board or its successor. The maxi-
mum net effective interest rate 
would be set by law. Proceeds from 
the sale of the bonds would be cred-
ited to the Texas opportunity plan 
fund, which is used to make loans to 
students to. attend institutions of 
higher education in Texas. The 
bonds and interest on the bonds 
would be payable from the first 
money coming into the treasury in 
each fiscal year that is not already 
appropriated by the constitution, 
less the amount remaining in the 
sinking fund at the close of the prior 
fiscal year. 

The proposed amendment will ap-
pear on the ballot as follows: 

"The constitutional amendment 
providing for the ISSUall, of gen-
eral obligation bonds as college 
savings bonds to provide educa-
tional loans to students and to 
encourage the public to -use for 
a college education." 
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BRIEF EXPLANATORY STATEMENTS 
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CONSTITUTIONAL AMENDMENTS 
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ADAM BAYER 

Adam Bayer celebrated being 
six years old on Sept. 16, 1989, 
with a party the next day, Sunday, 
in Muenster City Park, from 3 un-
til 5 p.m., hosted by his parents, 
Tom and Joyce Bayer, and his 
sisters Rhonda, Cheryl and 
Jennifer. 

Decorations were in his favorite 
"Batman" theme. Games, picture 

taking and a pinata filled with 
candy, which the children enjoyed 
breaking open, added to a fun 
afternoon. 

Refreshments of a "Batman" 
birthday cake, ice cream, cup-
cakes and punch were served after 
opening of gifts. 

"Batman" 	helium-filled 
balloons were given to each little 
guest as they went home. 

Guests 	included 	Adam's 
kindergarten classmates: Shawn 
Hess, Nathan Hess, Daniel 
Rohmer, Crystal Hale, Grant 
Hartman, Ashley Klement, Kevin 
Hermes, Mitchell Endres and 
Christopher Luttmer, and cousins 
Eric Walterscheid; Michelle, Neil 
and Nicole Bayer, and their 
parents, Bill and Annette Bayer; 
and special guests, Adam's grand-
mothers, Louise Bayer and Sis 
Klement. 

27th Annual Pioneer Ball Banquet 
This Year Recognizing Muenster's 100-Year Centennial 

Saturday, October 14, 1989 
Grand Kempinski Hotel, Dallas 

15201 Dallas North Parkway at Belt Line 

Town North Concert Band - Frohsinn Singing Society 
Soldiers Choir of the German Air Force 

Dance Muir By 

Allan Reeves Big Band Orchestra 

German Zap at the state cair 
1.1nbay, October 15, 1989 
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This Message Brought To You By Muenster Telephone Corporation 
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Close to the Martin Luther King Blvd. Fair Park Entrance 

For Tickets and Information, Call 	(6`ottitliee' 
Muenster Chamber of Commerce at 759.2227 

or Alvin Fuhrman at 7592251 

No w 
for  Christmas! 
Just Arrived 

—Children's Clothing 
Shirts - Blouses 

Acid-Washed Jeans 

Fall & Winter Merchandise 

Arriving Daily! 

502 Field St. 	Gainesville 
665-7062 

FREE 
BOOKLET ON HEARING! 

Hearing loss is 
America's No. 1 

handicap. To learn 
more about help for 

hearing loss, write the 
Texas Hearing Aid 

Association, 
222 N. Riverside Dr., 

Ft. Worth, Texas 76111. 
(A non-profit organization .1 

and during Mass by Clara Hell- 
inger and she provided her own 
accompaniment for vocal 
selections. 

RECEPTION 
A reception followed at the 

Lindsay Cafetorium. Deejay was 
Jay Anderle for dance music. 

Della Rose Voth baked, 
decorated and served the bride's 
cake. Dorothy Fisher of Muenster 
made the groom's cake. 

Cake servers were Amy Fisher, 
Melissa Fisher and Loretta Reiter, 
all of Muenster, Gina Hess and 
Amanda Hellinger, both of Lind-
say, and Jessica Berend of 
Windthorst. 

Out-of-town guests included 
Margurite Van Mandet of . 
Amarillo and Tonya Quick of 
Oregon. Others came from Wind-
thorst, Gainesville, Lindsay and 
Muenster. 

Following the wedding, the cou-
ple left for a wedding trip to Col-
orado. When they return, they will 
reside in Lindsay. 

The bride is a 1989 graduate of 
Callisburg High School. The 
groom graduated from Lindsay 
School in 1984. 
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MRS. DAVID HERMES 
... nee Melissa Knapp ... 

Adam celebrates sixth 

Melissa Knapp, daughter of 
Kenneth and Pat Knapp of 
Amarillo, and David Hermes, son 
of Richard and Edna Hermes of 
Lindsay, were married on Sept. 2 
in a Nuptial Mass and double-ring 
ceremony in Blessed Sacrament 
Catholic Church of Amarillo at 2 
p.m. The groom is also a grandson 
of Joe Hoenig of Muenster and 
the late Susie Hoenig. 

The bride is a 1988 graduate of 
Tascosa High School in Amarillo 
and attended Cooke County 
College. 

The groom is a 1976 graduate of 
Lindsay High School and is a self -
employed building contractor. 

Rev. Richard Vaughn was 
celebrant of the Mass and of-
ficiated for the ceremony. The 
altar was decorated with lighted 
candles, a pair of pink and white 
floral arrangements at the sides, 
and a large floral centerpiece. The 
unity candle was placed on a 
pedestal, and decorated with pink 
and white flowers and ribbons. 

The bride was presented at the 
altar by her father. She was wear-
ing a nostalgic, elegant white wed-
ding gown of tulle over taffeta 
with a high lace collar em-
broidered with pearls, a sheer 
yoke, a gathered tulle drape over 
the shoulders, and long fitted lace 
sleeves. An overskirt of gathered 
tulle formed a puffed effect. The 
skirt swept into a short train. 

Her fingertip veil was attached 
to a brief hat embroidered with 
pearls, and her bridal bouquet was 
a cascade of pink and white 
flowers. 

ATTENDANTS 
Teri Corbin of Amarillo was her 

sister's matron of honor. Kristi 
Tillman of Vinson, Okla. and 
Karen Lang of Dalhart, both 
sisters of the bride, were 
bridesmaids. They wore pink tea -
length dresses and carried heart -
shaped pillows with pink flowers. 

ERA ISD LUNCH MENU 
Sept. 25 - 29 

Mon. - Corny Dogs, Curly Q 
French fries, sweet peas, peach 
half, party mix, milk. 

Tues. - Vegetable Beef Soup, 
grilled cheese sandwich, tossed 
salad, cake, milk. 

Wed. - Turkey, dressing, gravy, 
mashed potatoes, green beans, 
fruit salad, milk. 

Thur. - Spaghetti w/Meat 
Sauce, buttered corn, tossed 
salad, garlic toast, apple crisp, 
milk. 

Fri. - Hamburgers, cheese 
slices, trimmings, pickles, French 
fries, pinto beans, jello, milk. 

Jimmy Arendt of Aubrey, a 
friend of the groom, was best 
man. Duane Neu of Denton, a 
friend, and Kenny Hermes of 
Sanger, a cousin of the groom, 
were groomsmen. 

Dwayne Hermes of Dallas, 
groom's cousin, and Leroy 
Hermes of San Angelo, groom's 
brother, were ushers. 

A nephew of the bride, Jeremy 
Lang, was the Mass server. 

Participating in the wedding 
liturgy were Ronnie Hermes, 
groom's brother, who gave the 
Readings, and Shirley Krueger 
and Beverly Fisher who presented 
Offertory gifts at the altar. 

Wedding music included a song 
composed by Kevin Knapp, "Pro-
mises," and "Here We Are," a 
duct sang by Kathy Steven and 
Kevin Knapp and the "Our 
Father." Chris Parra was 
organist, presenting traditional 
wedding marches. 

RECEPTION 
The bride's parents hosted the 

reception following the wedding in 
the Church Parish Hall. 

Tracy Ward presided at the 
bride's book, registering 100 
guests. 

The bride's table was covered 
with a white lace cloth over deep 
pink. It held two, two-layered 
cakes with a fountain in the mid-
dle, below a connecting staircase, 
with miniatures of the bridal cou-
ple and their wedding party. 

Reception assistants were Cyn-
namen Fansher, Missy Owen and 
Kim Payne. 

A special table held the bridal 
portrait and a floral arrangement. 

A party followed the reception 
at Big Texan Inn. 

The rehearsal dinner was held at 
Big Texan Restaurant in Amarillo. 
A sack party was held on Aug. 19 
at the home of the groom's 
parents, honoring the couple. 

LINDSAY SCHOOL MENU 
Sept. 25 - 29 

Mon. - Crispito, ranch style 
beans, Mexican rice, bread, apple 
crisp, fruit, milk. 

Tues. - Spaghetti and Meat, 
okra, corn, batterbread, fruit, 
milk. 

Wed. - Enchilada Casserole, 
mixed vegetables, congealed 
salad, cornbread, applesauce, 
cake, milk. 

Thur. - Hamburgers and Trim-
mings, fries, fruit, ice cream, 
milk. 

Fri. - Sliced Turkey, potatoes, 
gravy, cranberry sauce, bread, 
fruit, green beans, milk. 

FORESTBURG MENU 
Sept. 25 - 29 

Mon. - LUNCH: Weiners and 
Cheese, creamed potatoes, 
blackeye peas, kraut, peaches, 
bread, milk. BREAKFAST: 
Cereal, juice, milk. 

Tues. - LUNCH: Pinto Beans, 
macaroni and cheese, spinach, 
cornbread, baked apples, milk. 
BREAKFAST: Donuts, juice, 
milk. 

Wed. - LUNCH: Hamburger 
Steak, rice and gravy, green 
beans, tomato and lettuce salad, 
bread, milk. BREAKFAST: 
Oatmeal, toast, juice, milk. 

Thur. - LUNCH: Barbecue 
Chicken, potato salad, ap-
plesauce, tole slaw, chocolate 
cake, bread, milk. BREAKFAST: 
Scrambled eggs, toast, juice, milk. 

Fri. - LUNCH: Tacos, crackers, 
cheese, lettuce, tomatoes, corn 
pears, milk. BREAKFAST: 
Biscuit and gravy w/sausage, 
juice, milk. 

MUENSTER SCHOOL MENU 
Sept. 25 - 29 

Mon. - Sloppy Joes, French 
fries, beans, cookies, milk. 

Tues. - Chicken Pot Pie, lettuce 
salad, fruit, rolls, milk. 

Wed. - Frito Pie, baked beans, 
Mexican salad, fruit, cake, milk. 

Thur. - BBQ Sandwich, pickles 
and onions, fruit, brownies, milk. 

Fri. - Steak Fingers, potatoes 
and gravy, corn, rolls, milk. 

SACRED HEART SCHOOL 
S.N.A.P. MENUS 

Sept. 25 - 29 
Mon. - Corny Dogs, blackeye 

peas, lettuce, jello, milk. 
Tues. - Mexican Casserole, 

ranch style beans, lettuce, 
tomatoes, cake, milk. 

Wed. - Sausage and Sauerkraut, 
potatoes, cinnamon rolls, 
peaches, milk. 

Thur. - Fish Portions, broccoli 
rice and cheese casserole, carrots, 
fruit, bread, milk. 

Fri. - Cheeseburgers w/Trimm-
ings, French fries, ice cream, milk. 

SCH•OES 
DRIVE CAREflurt 

German map 
pt•******In Texas 

Lunch Menus 	 

Margo Marie Mitchell of 
Gainesville became the bride of 
Gary August Hess of Lindsay on 
Saturday, Sept. 16, in a 5 p.m. 
Nuptial Mass in St. Peter's 
Catholic Church of Lindsay. The 
double-ring ceremony was of-
ficiated by Father Denis Soerries, 
OSB, pastor. 

Parents of the couple are Grady 
and Jean Mitchell of Gainesville, 
and Paul J. and Sissy Hess of 
Lindsay. 

The couple exchanged vows 
before the main altar which was 
decorated with carnations, 
gladioli, greenery, white bows and 
lighted candles. 

Given in marriage by her father, 
the bride was wearing a formal 
wedding gown of white satin 
designed by Mori-Lee, with lace 
sleeves, fitted to the wrists and 
puffed at the shoulders. Pearl em-
broidery created highlights in the 
full skirt and aisle-wide sweeping 
train. 

Her illusion veil was attached to 
a wreath of flowers. 

ATTENDANTS 
Tony Quick of Oregon, a friend 

of the bride, attended as maid of 
honor. Bridesmaids were Sherry 
Hess of Lindsay, groom's sister; 
Tonya Mitchell of Gainesville, 
bride's sister; Jeannie Hellinger of 
Lewisville, a friend of the bride. 
They wore matching tea-length 
New Royal blue satin dresses. 

Doug Schmitz, a friend of the 
groom, stood for him as best man. 

Groomsmen were Jeff Parsons 
of Moss Lake, Craig Hellinger of 
Lewisville, both friends of the 
groom, and Troy Huchton of 
Lindsay, cousin of the groom. 

Ushers were Tracy Huchton, 
David Fleitman and Scott 
Fuhrmann, all of Lindsay, and 
Kevin Mitchell of Gainesville. 

Mass servers were Tommy 
Huchton and Hank Huchton and 
Garrett Hellinger, all of Lindsay, 
and all cousins of the groom. 

The organ was played before 

MRS. GARY AUGUST HESS 
... nee Margo Marie Mitchell ... 

Couple united in h&c 

ring ceremony Sept. 1 6 
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GRADUATES OF 1954 from Muenster High School and Sacred Heart High School are, Ito r, front - Helen 
Jetzlesberger, Chris Hesse Cupit, Bernice Walterscheid Mollenkopf, LaQueta Cain McCullem, Edna Swir-
czynski Smith, Marilyn Miller Bayer, Hank Mages Dieter; middle - Clara Flusche Hermes, Carrie Ann Gehrig 
Walterscheid, Julia Wolf Klement, Alma Henscheid Herr, Earline Walterscheid Mages, Alice Koelzer Her-
mes, Frankie Owen Hermes, Bertha Neusch Knabe, Mary Nell Hellman Newman, Jo Ann Starke Snyder; back 
- Gene Walter, Ed Pick, Jerry Henscheid, Albert Zimmerer, Wilmer Walterscheid, James Mollenkopf and 
Willie Walterscheid. 

Beatrice "Tissey" Sandoval and 
Richard Glenn Schoech, both of 
Kingsville, were married June 24 
at St. Gertrude's Catholic Church 
of Kingsville. 

Rev. Frowin Schoech of 
• Subiaco, Ark., uncle of the 

bridegroom, officiated at the 
evening ceremony. 

The bride is the daughter of 
Estella Villanueva and Ruben San-
doval, and the bridegroom is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. M.A. 
Schoech, all of Kingsville. He is 
also the grandson of Mrs. Tillie 
Schoech of Muenster and the late 
Andy Schoech. 

Given in marriage by her 
parents, the bride wore a white 
satin gown fashioned with a bead-
ed bodice, sweetheart neckline and 
short puffed sleeves. The full skirt 
and cathedral-length train were 
accented and hemmed with satin 
bows and Venise lace. 

Maid of honor was Melinda 
Cuevas of Sarita. 

Bridesmaids 	were 	Melissa 
Dawson and Cindy Salinas, both 
of Kingsville, and Rosie Canto of 
Riviera. 

Hower girl was Trisha Foster of 
Kingsville. 

Best man was Buddy Windham 
of Kingsville. 

Groomsmen were Melvin 
Schoech of Houston and Arnold 
Schoech of San Antonio, brothers 
of the bridegroom, and Curtis 
Compton of Kingsville. 

Ring bearer was Bobby San-
doval of Kingsville, nephew of the 
bride. 

Following a reception at the 
parish hall, the couple took a wed- 
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Quicksilver 
ONE If WRAY 

If you like 
jewelry, you'll  4Oliftr love our store!  kW!  I 

Their 14 karat gold 
and silver prices are 

something to "howl at!' 
Best selection in town, tool 

Owners: 
Barbara and Wallace Inallsb 

Monday - Friday 	Saturday 
9:30-5:30 	9:30-5:00 

101 E. California 	6654223 
Gainesville 

I've put Christmas gifts 
for the "whole pack" on 

Lay-A-Way at Quicksilver! 

*  * Come in and see 	l 	i 	 a 

 I  

our latest jewelry 
arrivals! 
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You Could Receive 

ItE E  
GOOLIN 

Come By The 

	 D I One Stop 
for All the Details! 

The DI One Stop 
Convenience Store 

759.4512 	 Muenster, Texas 

You Could Be Here Today 

And Driving Tomorrow! 

Our Auto Loan 
Answers Are FAST! 

Let's face it. When you've 
made the decision to buy a new 
or used car, you'll want to 
act on it. So timing is everything 
and fast loan answers are 
important. We respond to 

important. Call or see our 
loan officer today and you 
could be driving your new 
car tomorrow. 

You know us. We know you. 

Muenster 
State Bank 

201 N. Main, Muenster, 759-2257, Member FDIC 

max Member Independent Hankers Association of Amen
" ReprewalinR1hr Halton l'Or111111111111 hank,  

Classes of '54 reunite 

AAA  TRAVEL 

"The Only Way To Travel" 

NO CHARGE FOR 
OUR SERVICES 

•All Airline Tickets 
•Worldwide Tours 
•Cruises 
•Car &Hotel Reservations 

665-4181 665-1794 
121 N. Grand Avenue 

Gainesville,Texas 

ding trip to Cancun, Mexico. 
They will reside in Kingsville 

where they are students at Texas 
A&I University. The bride is a 
sales representative for a local 
department store, and the 
bridegroom is employed with 
Dynalectron Corporation at the 
Kingsville Naval Air Station. 

MHS frosh 
elect officers 
On Tuesday, Sept. 12, the 

Muenster Public School freshmen 
class held their first class meeting 
in which they chose class officers 
and favorites. 

The officers are: Kody Trueben-
bach, president; DaLana 
Walterscheid, vice-president; Joy 
Tisdale, secretary-treasurer; and 
Marlene Hess, reporter. 

The class favorites are Lori 
Graham and Kody Truebenbach. 

Homemakers 
meet Sept. 13 

The 	Muenster 	Extension 
Homemakers met Wednesday, 
Sept. 13, in the home of Florence 
Williams with 18 members pre-
sent. Guests were Beverly Norvell 
of Gainesville and Marie Ford and 
Ann Kirk of the Ross-Point E.H. 
Club. 

The meeting was called to order 
by President Dorothy Fisher. The 
club prayer and the Pledge of 
Allegiance were recited. The in-
spiration, "Building the Bridge," 
was read by Florence Williams. 
Lucille Lutkenhaus and Armella 
Lutkenhaus gave the council 
report. 

For the lesson, Marie Ford and 
Ann Kirk assisted Lucille 
Lutkenhaus and Armella 
Lutkenhaus in teaching members 
the craft of Chicken Scratch. 

Members participated in an in-
formative flag quiz. 

Coming events are the Arts and 
Crafts Sell-O-Rama on Nov. 10-11 
and the Cultural Arts Exhibit. The 
next meeting will be held Oct. 11 
at the home of Lucille 
Lutkenhaus. 

The hostess served refreshments 
of chocolate torte and coffee. 

Baptisms 
Kieninger 

Mason Luis Kieninger was bap-
tized Sept. 2, 1989 at St. Mary's 
Catholic Church in Gainesville, 
Texas. Fr. Nicholas Fuhrmann 
baptized him after the 4 o'clock 
Mass on Saturday. Darrell Swirc-
zynski, an uncle, and Mrs. Emily 
Howard, grandmother, were his 
baptismal sponsors. 

Mason wore the baptismal 
gown and cap worn by his great -
grandmother, Hildegarde Swirc-
zynski, 70 years ago. The gown 
was handmade and the cap hand-
crocheted by his great-great -
grandmother, the late Mrs. Frank 
Trubenbach. Also, he wore a gold 
chain and cross given to him by his 
grandmother, Emily Howard. 

Attending the ceremony were 
his parents, Ludwig and Dea Kien-
inger; great-grandmother, 
Hildegarde Swirczynski; Jill 
Kralicke, a great-aunt, and son, 
Travis, from Grapevine; Darrell 
and Sharon Swirczynzki, uncle 
and aunt, also from Grapevine; 
Mr. and Mrs. O.L. Howard, 
grandmother and step -
grandfather, of Alvarado, Texas. 

Also attending were Fred and 
Deida Kieninger, uncle and aunt, 
along with their children, cousins 
Stacey and Tommy, from Lake 
Kiowa. 

After the baptism, the group 
went to a local restaurant. 

Rohmer 

Amanda Marie Rohmer was 
welcomed into the Catholic 
Church when she received the 
Sacrament of Baptism Sunday, 
September 10 during a ceremony 
in Sacred Heart Church. 

Father Victor Gillespie was the 
celebrant. Godparents were the 
baby's aunt and uncle, Alyce and 
Charlie Cler. Amanda wore a 
gown and blanket which were 
made by her great-grandma, Mrs. 
Clem Hofbauer, and worn by her 
mother, Laurie, and her grand-
mother, Mary Evelyn Hermes. 

Following the ceremony cake 
and punch were served at the 
home of Amanda's parents, Bill 
and Laurie Rohmer. Later guests 
enjoyed supper and swimming at 
Denise and Dwayne Pagel's home. 

In attendance were Amanda's 
brother Daniel; grandparents, 
William and Mary Evelyn Hermes 
and Tony and Marjorie Rohmer; 
and great-grandparents, Mrs. 
Clem Hofbauer of Muenster and 
Mr. and Mrs. Julius Hermes, Sr. 
of Lindsay. 

Also aunts, uncles and cousins 
Alyce and Charlie Cler and Leslie 
and Elizabeth; Cheryl and Royce 
Martin and Jon and Carrie; Deb-
bie Bradshaw and Byron; Denise 
and Dwayne Pagel; Pam and Ken-
neth Sidwell; Kim Rohmer and 
Nicole; Kenny and Cindy Rohmer 
and Jayna and Kalyn; Terry and 
Lisa Rohmer; and Renee and 
Adam Schneiderjon. 

Rite of 
Acceptance 
begun 9/10 

On Sunday, Sept. 10, at the 
10:30 a.m. Mass, four persons 
were accepted by Sacred Heart 
parish for preparation leading to 
the sacraments of initiation and 
full communion with the Catholic 
faith. 

They were Janice Ashley and 
her sponsor, Monica McCoy; Eric 
Weems; Geri Williams and her 
sponsor, Janie Taylor; and Bill 
Bivin and his sponsor, Angelo 
Nasche. 

They will continue with the Rite 
of Christian Initiation process 
every Sunday morning after 
dismissal at the 10:30 a.m. Mass. 
This follows an ancient tradition 
in which the catechumens were 
dismissed from Mass after the 
homily. 

The RCIA is a year-long process 
leading to the sacraments of initia-
tion at Easter and ends Pentecost 
Sunday. 

News of the 
Sick 

Mrs. Werner Becker Sr. (Rita) i 
a surgical patient at AMI Denton 
Regional Medical Center. She fel 
at her home on Wednesday after 
noon, Sept. 13, breaking her lef 
hip. Get-well cards will reach he 
addressed to Mrs. Rita Becker, 
Room 413, AMI, 4405 N. In 
terstate 35, Denton, TX 76201. 

• 

Ed Endres is a patient at 
Medical City. He had a successful 
surgery Tuesday, September 19 
and is doing well. His address is 
Medical City, 7777 Forest Lane, 
Dallas, TX. 75244. 

A combined reunion of the 
graduating class of 1954 from 
Sacred Heart and Muenster Public 
School was held on July I. The 
event marked their 35th year since 
graduation. 

The evening of festivites began 
at 5 p.m. with Holy Mass which 
was celebrated in Sacred Heart 
Church by Father Victor Gillespie. 
Offertory gifts were presented at 
the Altar by Clara Hermes and 
Willie Walterscheid. 

The group moved to the Knights 
of Colunbus Hall for an evening 
of reminiscing. It was decorated 
with red and white balloons and 
flowers. The colors were chosen 
because they are the colors of both 
schools. 

Gene Walter gave the invoca-
tion before the meal which was 
catered by the Hermes Sisters. 
Willie Walterscheid was master of 
ceremonies, assisted by Mary Nell 
Newman. A welcome was given by 
Willie and Mary Nell led a prayer 
for the four class members who 
are deceased, Albert Knabe, 
Gilbert Knabe, Ernest Bayer and 
Delbert Walterscheid. Music for 
the evening was furnished by Dan-
ny Wolf. 

Gifts were presented to winners 
in the following categories: Best 
Preserved, Jerry Henscheid and 
Chris Hesse, SHS; Gene Walter 
and Mary Nell Newman, MPS; 
Most Changed, Albert Zimmerer 
and Jo Ann Starke Snyder, SHS; 
Ed Pick and Earline Walterscheid 
Mages, MPS; Least Changed, 
Willie Walterscheid and Hank 
Mages Dieter, SHS; Gene Walter 
and Mary Nell Newman, MPS; 

Catechists are 
commissioned 

In a special ceremony at the 
10:30 a.m. Mass on Sunday, Sept. 
17, Father Sebastian formally 
commissioned parish catechists to 
share the word of God with those 
they teach. They each received a 
card reminding them of the theme 
of this year's Catechetical Sunday 
to "know and share the God of 
mercy." 

Those teaching Religion at 
Sacred Heart School are Pam 
Dangelmayr, Pre-School; Christy 
Hesse, Kindergarten; Anne Poole, 
1st; Sister Genevieve, 2nd; Ruth 
Felderhoff, 3rd; Anna Hermes, 
4th; Debbie Endres, 5th; Sister 
Monica, 6th; Sister Mary John, 
7th and 11th; Dorothy Bengfort, 
8th; Sister Carmelita, 9th; Eric 
Gray, 10th; Emily Klement, 11th; 
and Father Victor, 12th. 

Those teaching CCD classes for 
Sacred Heart Church include 
Lynn Hacker, Kindergarten; 
Dorothy Fleitman, Kingergarten; 
Carol Klement, 1st; Katie 
Hamilton, 1st; Linda Knabe, 2nd; 
Linda Vogel, 2nd; Debbie Hart-
man, 2nd; Judy Flusche, 3rd; Pat-
sy Bayer, 4th; Shirley Knabe, 4th; 
Doris Muller, 4th; Dennis and 
Kathy Hess, 5th; Laura Stoffels, 
6th; Rosina Kubis, 6th; Lupe 
Evans, 7th; Annette Anderle, 8th; 
Irene Hartman, 8th; John and 
Jeanette Reiter, 9th; Kenneth and 
Marilyn Bierschenk, 10th; Roy 
Hartman, I 1th; Janie Monday, 
1 1 th; Pam Fette and Margie 
Walterscheid, 12th. 

Fall Festival 
slated Sept. 24 

The 21st Annual St. Mary's Fall 
Festival will be Sunday, Sept. 24 
with proceeds benefiting the 
school. 

A chicken and dressing dinner 
will be served from I I a.m. to 2 
p.m. at the parish hall in 
Gainesville. Tickets are $5 for 
adults and $3 for children. 

Booths featuring a variety of 
games will be open from 11 a.m. 
to 4 p.m. on the school grounds. 
A Mini-Auction and Country 
Store is scheduled from 11 a.m. to 5 
p.m. A large auction will be close 
the festival and begins at 5 p.m. 

Grayest Hair, Albert Zimmerer 
and Anna Margaret Hacker Tem-
ple; Least Hair, Wilmer 
Walterscheid; Most children, 
Alma Henscheid Herr; Most 
grandchildren, Hank Mages 
Dieter; Youngest child, Bertha 
Neusch; Oldest child, Carrie Ann 
Gehrig Walterscheid; and Greatest 
Distance Traveled To Attend, 
Gene Walter who traveled 1800 
miles. 

The next class reunion is plann-
ed for 1994 to celebrate 40 years 
since graduation from high 
school. 

BELTONE 
Hearing Aid 

Batteries 

Always Fresh 

Shop the Drive-In Window 
for all your prescriptions 

and drug needs. 

WATTS' 
PRESCRIPTION SHOP 

302 N Grand 	Gainesville 
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and invite you to 
"An Evening in the Park" 

For Those Who Helped Serve Beer and/or Sell Tickets 
at the 1989 Muenster Germanfest. 

Saturday, Sept. 23,1989 
5:00 p.m. — ? ? ? 
Muenster City Park 

There will be fun, food, games and plenty of fellowship! 

	

Peachie Huchton 	 Glenn Hess 
Janet Fisher 	 Jeannie Hess 
Mark Lippe 	 Neal Flusche 

	

Claude Klement 	 Brenda Rigsby 
Jim Endres 	 Phil Rigsby 

	

Mike Hermes 	 Phyllis Bane 

	

Dink Hudspeth 	 Kurt Hermes 

	

Cotton Hennigan 	 Jeff Parsons 
Ruth Wells 	 Kirk Klement 

	

Cheryl Mollenkopf 	 David Flusche, Jr. 
Patty Hess 	 Donnie Lutkenhaus 

	

Jack Schoppa 	 Gilbert Kubis 
Ira Schoppa 	 Debbie Way mon 

	

Mel Walterscheid 	 Coy Muller 

	

Glenn Walterscheid 	 Brenda Ritchey 

	

Lloyd Walterscheid 	 Carla Klement 

	

Doug Hermes 	 Mari Walterscheid 
Kurt Hermes 	 Kyla Henscheid 
Jeff Parsons 	 Rose Felderhoff 
Brian Herr 	 Kim Felderhoff 

Allen Corley 	 Mary Spurgin 
Karl Barnhill 	 Don Huston 

	

Janie Monday 	 Doyle Lewis 

	

Michelle Monday 	 Carla Hennigan 

	

Diana Klement 	 Janet Hesse 
Donna Biffle 	 Steve Eckart 
Judy Biffle 	 Ken Hesse 
Tim Endres 	 Rick Sandmann 

Kris Dunstan 	 Rick Hennigan 
Neal Flusche 	 Monty Reiter 

	

Shawn Flusche 	 Steve Hennigan 

	

Ron Trubenbach 	 Janette Hellman 
Jim Biffle 	 Stephanie Williams 

	

Steve Stoffels 	 Barbara Wimmer 

	

Dale Hellman 	 Randy Wimmer 
Joe Pagel 	 Jack Flusche 

Bert Silario 	 Laura Schilling 

	

David Wimmer 	 Bubba Swirczynski 

	

Cecilia Wimmer 	 Leona Hellman 
Brenda Nix 	 Cory Klement 

	

Barbie Felderhoff 	 John Schneider 

	

Wayne Klement 	 Sonny Weed 

	

Boobie Schilling 	 David Martin 

	

Fritz Hermes 	 Joe Fenton 

	

Doug Hermes 	 Willie Walterscheid 
Jerry Reed 	 Eric Weems 

Bob Hermes 	 Dav id Patterson 

	

Margie Starke 	 Willie Wimmer 

	

Amber Grew ing 	 Mark Miller 

	

Della Hellman 	 Mike Kottwitz 

	

Tudor Klement 	 Ross Lucas 
Sug Bindel 	 Dale Martin 

	

Shirley Crewing 	 Alfred Hennigan 

	

JoEll Hellman 	 Cootie Harrison 
Darren Voth 	 Laurie Flusche 

	

Bret Walterscheid 	 Sylvia Hettinger 

	

Steve Trubenbach 	 Lana Booth 
Peanuts Walterscheid 	 Toby Booth 

Nick Hess 	 James Robinson  

	

Tim Homer 	 John Monday 	 Audie Parsons 

	

Lisa Tolmas 	 Brad Bass 	 Kim Stewart 
Ronnie Walsworth 	 Louie Gieb 	 Bill Stewart 
Sandy Walsworth 	 Tony Dudenhoeffer 	 Jennifer Trissell 

	

Jim Richards 	 Monte Haverkamp 	 Jack Richardson 

	

Leo Miller 	 Todd Richey 	 Carol Klement 

	

Robby Thomas 	 Weldon Turner 	 Mark Klement 

	

Jimmy Barnhill 	 Rodney Fleenor 	 Janet Hermes 

	

Kevin Hacker 	 Tim Walzman 	 Vicki Fisher 
Steve Henscheid 	 Gene Block 	 Ray Voth 

	

Neil Hesse 	 David Felderh of f 	 Lou Voth 

	

Tim Schneider 	 Julius Bell 	 Handsome Walterscheid 
Dennis Parkison 	 Pat Walterscheid 	 Dan Luke 
Robby Patterson 	 Shirley Endres 	 John Pagel 

Kevin Haverkamp 	 Kim Gerstberger 	 W.C. Muller 

	

Joe Hoedebeck 	 Nancy Tray ler 	 John Ronkin 

	

Shari Voth 	 Julie Beheler 	 Tim Herr 
Michael Sicking 	 Joyce Koelzer 	 Doug Herr 

Shawna Grewing 	 Kent Reiter 	 Mike Heffron 
Tommy Harrison 	 Lorene Bartel 	 Craig Walterscheid 
Jeff Gerstberger 	 Sara Myers 	 Darrell Herr 

	

Nancy Davis 	 Mike Trotman 	 Bob Hermes 

	

George Hacker 	 John Silker 	 Pat Klement 
Virgil Henscheid 	 Sandra Robinson 	 Ricky Cloud 

Wade Walterscheid 	 Anne Hodges 	 Ronnie Walterscheid 

	

TJ Walterscheid 	 Randy Robinson 	 Christy Klement 
Mike Dangelmayr 	 Kevin Hodges 	 Janet Felderhoff 

	

Way ne Carroll 	 Mike Du nson 	 Terry Walterscheid 

	

Susan Flusche 	 Greg Jacob 	 Wayne Klement 

	

Debbie Horner 	 Way ne Hutchings 

BUD 
LIGHT  

The Jaycees Give Special Thanks 
to the Muenster Wholesale Beer 
Distributors and their employees 

for their long hours during 
Germanfest '89 

4 / 

Beer 

Old, Milwauhee 

If any helper's name was accidentally omitted from the above list, 

we apologize and please come to the party. 

-■140:hrte■-• •d 1,,c.kr‘ 
ft_  Ar 	 \mil/_A4 to_ 



Tiger Head Coach John Sims 
assembled his players on the field 
after the game last Friday in 
Windthorst. He told them he was 
gratified and pleased with the ob-
vious improvement they had made 
in one week. The Windthorst Tro- 

Larry Switzer, made the first of 
several good punts under pressure. 
The punting game was one of the 
highlights for the Tigers. Switzer 
punted 7 times for a 29-yard 
average. Good hang time and pur-
suit by the Tigers kept the return 

The 2nd quarter was mostly 
defense. The Trojans had fumble 
problems while the Tigers could 
not sustain a drive. Tiger seniors 
Randy Miller, David Rohmer and 
Tony Grewing were not allowing 
very much yardage. Finally, 

FARM 
BUREAU 

INSURANCE 

Farm Bureau Insurance 
John Bartush, Agent 

Fire * Life * Auto * I.R.A. 
Are You Interested in a 

Sate, Tax-Deferred Investment? 
759-4052 	 1100 E. Division 
Hillcrest Center 	 Muenster, Texas 
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Trojans add to Tigers woes, 27-0 Sports  
  

  

    

CHRIS HESS (II), takes the handoff fromTiger quarterback, Shawn Dangelmayr and runs to the right, 
following the blocking of ryan hess(30) against the Trojans. 	 Dave Pelle Photo 

SACRED HEART HEAD COACH,JohnSims confers with his players 
during a timeout at Windthorst. No 44 is Darren Klement and on the 
right is Werner Becker, No. 71. 	 Dave Pelle Photo 

Tiger fans! 
Wear red and white! 

'89 Mustangs corralled 
for end-of-season 

Ito,undup 

Monte Schenk passed to end 
Kevin Magness for a 33-yard Tro-
jan score just before the half. 
With 0:33 seconds on the clock, 
Hoffman kicked, making the 
score 21-0 as the half ended. 

The third quarter seemed filled 
with Tiger defense again with 
good performances by Larry 
Switzer, Shawn Dangelmayr, 
Jason Endres and Darrell Mullins. 
Switzer stopped a Trojan drive on 
the Tiger 2-yard line when he 
recovered their fumble. 

Early in the fourth period, 
Windthorst had a score called 
back for a clipping penalty but im-
mediately made it again on a 
16-yard pass from Schenk to 
senior John Lindemann. Hoff-
man's kick went wide and the 
score was 27-0 where it stayed. A 
series of Trojan penalties helped 
the Tigers move to the Windthorst 
31 only to turn the ball over on 
downs. The Tigers stopped the 
Trojan second team, then drove 
the ball from their 29 to the Wind-
thorst 21 where they bogged 
down. Time ran out with Wind-
thorst in possession. The Trojans 
had 352 yards total offense against 
62 for the Tigers. 

Fans found out later that 
freshman Larry Switzer had been 
taken to Bethania Hospital in 
Wichita Falls. The possible neck 
injury turned out to be a pinched 
nerve. He was released shortly and 
returned to practice Wednesday. 
Darrell Mullins played his first 
game of the season after missing 
Era. Coach Sims expects valuable 
help from him at tackle. 

The Tigers will welcome Cister-
cian Prep of Irving for their first 
home game this Friday. Sims com-
mented that the Hawks lost eight 
seniors last year as Sacred Heart 
did, but they have a fine passer 
and he expects a tough game. The 
game starts at 7:30 p.m. on Tiger 
Field. 

Cubs fall 
to Trojans 

The Sacred Heart Junior High 
hosted Windthorst last Thursday 
on their season opening. Jason 
Hofbauer began the game, kicking 
to the Trojans. The visitors began 
their first drive on their own 
40-yard line, moving the ball to 
the Cubs 23, when Michael 
Schribner circled around the left 
end for the first touchdown of the 
night. The extra point attempt 
failed and Windthorst led 6-0. 

The Cubs began their first drive 
on their 35-yard line, runs by 
Chris Pagel, Neil Berres and 
Aaron Berres took the Cubs to the 
Trojan 47 when a few miscues 
forced a punt early in the second 
quarter. 

Windthorst threatened to score 
on their second possession moving 
to the Cubs 10-yard line, when 
Jeremy Bayer recovered a fumble 
on the 14. Sacred Heart moved the 
ball to the 22, but turned posses-
sion back to the Trojans. One play 
later Weldon Bayer recovered a 
fumble and the Cubs were again in 
control. But good turned to bad 
when the Cubs were caught in the 
end zone for a safety - Windthorst 
led 8-0. The Trojans attempted to 
score once more but time ran out. 

Sacred Heart took the opening 
second period kick-off. After 
picking up on first down, Hof-
bauer punted to the visitors. 
Windthorst started on their own 
37-yard line, moving the ball 
downfield when, with 35 seconds 
remaining in the quarter, 
Schreiber circled the left end for 6 
points. A pass from Chris 
Bachman to J.C. Langford gave 
the Trojans a 16-0 lead. 

The ball zigzagged between the 
teams as time ran out.  

7:30 p.m. on the Tiger Field. 
Wearing red and white will show 
the Tigers they are supported by 
their fans. 

*STATE TWIN* 
200F Celdornia 	Goinerville 	665 2741 

"FIELD OF DREAMS" 
FRI. SAT. 7:30 9.20 	SUN. 5,30 7:30 

MON thruT1401 7:45 PG 

"CASUALTIES OF WAR" 
DM SAT. 7:30 9:25 	SUN. 5:30 7.30 

MON Oro THUR. 7:45 P 

Adults '4.00 	Children '2.50 
ALL SEATS $2.00 S44d44 5 3°  

Thursday 745 

FORD ire 

MERCURY 

jans had just beaten them 27-0, 
but they weren't humiliated as at 
Era in their season opener. 

Sims commented again later 
that the defense showed real im-
provement. He singled out junior 
linebacker Shawn Dangelmayr for 

1 defense. Sophomore Chris Hess 
spent a lot of time in the Trojan 
backfield. Sims said, "Chris is ag-
gressive anyway, we showed him a 
few tricks to get through their line 
and he uses them." 

Tiger kicker Larry Switzer 
started the game, landing the ball 
on the Trojan 30. They returned 
quickly on big runs by Monte 
Schenk and Bradley Veitenheimer 
to the Tiger 30-yard line. There, a 
Trojan fumble was recovered by 
Sacred Heart's Chris Hess. The 
Tigers started from their own 29, 
but got nowhere. Number 88, 

average down to just under 4 
yards. Switzer was forced to run 
with the ball twice. 

Windthorst runner J.T. Hoff-
man took the first down play 48 
yards for a touchdown and then 
kicked the extra point. 

The Tigers made it to their own 
45 on the next series on 3- and 
4-yard runs by junior Ryan Hess 
and a face mask penalty against 
Windthorst, but then were forced 
to punt. Windthorst started mov-
ing again, traded fumbles with SH 
before Chad Steinberger scored 
from 29 yards out on a crossbuck. 
Hoffman kicked again and the 
score was 14-0 with 2:27 left in the 
first quarter. Tiger fans got a bit 
more excited when Chris Hess 
took the ball around right end for 
15 yards before a Ryan Hess fum-
ble ended the drive. 

Sacred Heart Cheerleaders are 
requesting that Tiger fans wear 
red and white to the football game 
Saturday night (Sept. 23). The 
Tigers are playing Cistercian at 

Coach wins contest 
Sacred Heart Football Coach 	Prizes are available at the 

John Sims scored highest in last tiebreaker sponsor of the week, 
week's Enterprise football predic- Neil's Kerr-McGee. 
tion contest with 20 correct 	Close behind the winners were 
choices out of 25 possible. The Carol Grewing, Alan Hudspeth, 
26th choice, Lakehill vs. Balch John Bartush and Duane 
Springs, was a 14-14 tie and thus Haverkamp with 19 correct 
was thrown out. choices. 

Mickey 	Haverkamp 	of 
Muenster and Bonnie Stoffels of 
Gainesville also had 20 correct 
picks. Sims, however, was only 2 
points away from the actual score 
of the tiebreaker game, Muenster 
20, S&S 8. Sims predicted 21 to 7 
to win the $10. first prize. 
Haverkamp and Stoffels were 
both nine points away from the 
tiebreaker. 

Karl 
Klement 

ROPERS SHIRTS 

69
w 

 " 11 88  
Black, Gray, 

Navy & 
Choc. 

Men's Short Sleeve 
Entire Stock 

Two-door hatchback. 5 speed, factory air 
conditioning, 2.3 1-4 cylinder engine, 
power windows and locks, tilt wheel 
speed control, AM/FM stereo cassette, 
wire wheel covers, dual mirrors and 
more. Stock e9C188. 

Factory rebate 	  
K.KFM & Hail discount 

Your Price 

100% 
COTTON 
13 MWZ 

Hwy. 82 

WRANGLERS 
Colored Jeans 

Gray, Beige, Lt. Blue & Black 

17" 	19"  
City Square, Saint Jo, TX 

Ladies Jeans 
Entire Stock 

995-2445 

1989 F-250 Pickups (Marna Price 	  
Factory Rebate 	  
KKFM & Hall Discount 	 

YOUR PRICE $11,649 
Texas Tough '89 Ford F-250 pickup. 7.5 

litre V - 8. 5 speed manual overdrive. Fac- 
tory Air Conditioning. AM-FM Stereo. 
super engine cooling, auxiliary fuel tank. „-• 

1 
Stock It 9T1164 

1989 Grand Marquis - Only 2 left in stock! 

Texas-size luxury - 5.0 litre V-8,auto- 

matte overdrive, power windows, door 	 in 

locks & seats, tilt steering, cruise con- 
trol, illuminated entry, stereo cassette 
and many more luxury features. 

Discounted over $ 5,000 
All prices are plus tax, title, license, inspection and documentary fees. 

US 287 South, Decatur • 627-1101 
Toll-free metro 430-8610 



KEVIN PARSONS, (22) drives across the goal-line for one of his three 
scores against Nocona. Quarterback, Scott Hermes, (5) signals TD in the 
backfield. 	 Gene Hermes Photo 

PATRICK CORCORAN, (86) tries hard to intercept for the Knights as 
Indian, Jerry Debord misses it. 	 Gene Hermes Photo 

HORNET 
Player 
of the 
Week 

Sponsored by the 
• Muenster 
• Quarterback Club • 
•

• 

Jerry Brawner 
er 	8/10 passes for 	OUTSTANDING 
4' 

• 

143 yards and 2TDs 

* 
4,  Offense 
• 
4 
U 

4 

• • 
• • 
U 
U 

Marshall Smith: 
7 tackles, 1 interception : 

PLAYERS 	
w/28 yd. return 	* 

Defense 

QBOlub meetsTuesday nights, 7 p m., MHS Library 
* 

Wayne's RE 
 Lost Luggage 

209 N. Commerce, Gainesville 

IN THE MUENSTER HORNET GAME AGAINST THE S&S RA MS,THE DEFENSE SWARMS 
_AROUND A PLAY. Pictured are Yancy Culp (20), James Hennigan (22), Michael Bierschenk (50), Jeff_ 

Hellman (55) and Mike Vogel (33) among others. 	 Dennis Shoup Photo 

Fina All-State honors scholastics, academics 

Decorator 
Supply Center 

Worth Point/ 

TOM THUMB•PAGE 
Food & Drug Center 

200 N. Grand 
Gainesville 

Red River 
Farm Co-op 

Standing together. 
Standing strong. 

1300 N Dixon, 	Gaineswille 

Lindsay Knights vs. Whitewright 
Friday, Sept. 22, Whitewright, there, 8:00 p.m. 

665 0256 MIZZA 
PAINTS 

    

I I 10ECalifornia Gainesville 

COOKE 
COUNTY 

APPLIANCE 
The Service People " 

414 East California 	East Highway 82 
Gainesville, Texas 	Muenster, Texas 

695.0811 	 759.4411 

Knights 	
Knights 	°P"""" 

6 	Sept. 8, Aubrey. H, 13,00 	34 
19 	Sept. 15, Nocona, T, 8,00 	0 

Sept 22, Whitewright, T, 8,00 

Sept. 29. Little Elm, T, 8:00 

• Oct. 6, Muenster' • •, 8, 7:30 

Oct. 13, Era, T, 7:30 

• Oct. 20, Petrolia • •. H, 7:30 

• Oct. 27, Alvord, T, 7:30 

• Nov. 3, Winthhorst, H, 7,30 

• Nov. 17, Valley View, T, 7,30 
•Oliiert Gems 	 • •Manalcoming 

•••ar•ntallight 

WAL-MART 
Tire and 
Auto rifl■Ml 

Center 	  

668-7122 
Or 

668-6898 

Mon.-Sat. 	E. Hwy. 82 
a.m.-6 p.m 	Gainesville 

GEO. J. 
CARROLL 

& SON 
Funeral Home 

Since 1900 

665-3455 
602 Lindsay 	Gaine s ville 

Junior High and Junior Varsity 

Sept.], Aubrey, in omn T, 7:00 

Sept. 14, Nocona, H, 6:00 

Sept. 21, Whitewright, H, 6:00 

Sept. 28, Little Elm, H, 6,00 

Oct. 5, Muenster, T, 6:00 

Oct. 12, Era,. 	H, 6:00 

Oct. 19, Pottshoro 	 7:00 

Oct. 26, Alward, H, 8:00 

Nov. 2, Pottshoro Fr. 6 00 

Nov. 16, Valley View, H, 6:00 

Lindsay Knights whip Nocona Indians 
PAGE 10 - SEPTEMBER 22, 1989 - THE MUENSTER ENTERPRISE 

The Knights took over on their 
own 25-yard line. Barnes and Par-
sons 7-yard runs went to the 39. 
Hermes passed to Lance Sand-
mann for 17 and Joel Metzler for 
35 yards to put the Knights at the 
10. A Nocona penalty and 3 yards 
by Parsons set up a_ Parsons 
touchdown run of 2 yards with 
3:33 left in the first quarter. Tracy 
attempted the extra point kick but 
it was blocked by Beverage of 
Nocona. 

There was no scoring for the 
rest of the half. It was a defensive 
battle. Scott Hermes recorded a 
47-yard punt. Joel Metzler 
recovered an Indian fumble to 
stop a drive. Nocona got a Knight 
fumble and, in the last two 
minutes, Tracy Huchton sacked 
up the Indian quarterback on the 

judged on leadership and par-
ticipation in worthwhile school 
and community activities. 

"Broadening the field for this 
prestigious award will enable any 
high school senior, male or 
female, who excels in the 
classroom, is active in his or her 
community and school, and letters 
in a UIL varsity sport to compete 
with the best in the state for the 
honor of being named to the 
team," said Ron W. Haddock, 
president and CEO of American 
Petrofina, Incorporated. Had-
dock added, "Sports teach young 
people the value of commitment, 
dedication and excellence. It is 
therefore fitting that the program 
evolve to include all UIL athletics. 
We at Fina are proud to recognize 
their superlative achievements." 

The Fina Academic All-State 
Football Team began in 1985 to 
accentuate the fact that the talent, 
dedication and enthusiasm of high 
school football players extended 
far beyond the playing field. In an 
atmosphere of negative publicity 
and education reforms to end 
athletic abuses, Fina made a com-
mitment to recognize the young 
people who excel not only in foot-
ball, but also in the classroom and 
the community, instead of giving 
all the attention to those few who 
have failed. The new Fina All-State 
Scholar-Athlete Program expands 
the program to provide eligibility 
to other scholars, male and female, 
who participate in other sports. 

Application forms are being 
sent by Fina to all high schools in 
Texas. The deadline for entries is 
Dec. 8. Sixty-four finalists will be 
named in late January and the 12 
team members will be announced 
in March. 

American Petrofina, Incor-
porated is an AMEX-listed com-
pany engaged in crude oil and 

"All-leather, 
all-weather 

sport boot. 
• Si,n. tau gra,, 

treated to repel water 
• sweat-resistant 

insole 
• Sewn-welted construction 

• Provides a heel huggin' lit 
• Cushion.crepe. wedge sole for 

comfortable loot support 

The Lindsay Knights went to 
Nocona last Friday night and out-
passed, outrushed and generally 
outplayed the Indians by a score 
of 19-0. 

Lindsay received the kickoff but 
lost yardage and had to punt. The 
Indians then drove deep into Lind-
say territory on runs by senior 
running back Marty Coffman and 
a 28-yard gain by senior Richard 
Beverage. Then, the Knights' 
defense stopped them. Lindsay 
junior David Parsons slapped 
down a Rocky Phipps pass. The 
defense, led by junior Chris 
Sanders and seniors Joel Metzler 
and Tracy Huchton, gave only 3 
yards. Nocona chose to salvage 
the opportunity with a field goal, 
but it was blocked by sophomore 
Jessey Barnes. 

Fina Oil and Chemical Com-
pany, the main operating sub-
sidiary of American Petrofina, In-
corporated, has announced the 
formation of the Fina All-State 
Scholar-Athlete Team. This pro-
gram is open to all men and 
women participating in in-
terscholastic varsity sports and 
will replace the Fina Academic 
All-State Football Team. 

The team will consist of 12 
Texas high school scholar -
athletes. Each member will receive 
a $3,000 college scholarship. Fina 
will honor the 12 members of the 
team, along with their parents and 
coaches, at a June awards banquet 
in Dallas. 

A candidate must be a high 
school senior who has participated 
in varsity athletics at the in-
terscholastic level, be in the top 10 
percent of their class, and have a 
grade average of 90 or above. 
Although they must have received 
a varsity letter, athletic ability in 
itself is not the major determinant 
in the selection process. In addi-
tion to athletics and academic 
achievement, the candidate will be 

Knight 15-yard line. 
In the third quarter, the op-

ponents traded downs. More 
defensive help came from Knights 
Marty Neu, Chad Sandmann, 
Kenny Fleitman and Matt Zim-
merer. Sophomore Fred Hughes 
handed Nocona a five-yard loss 
when he downed Phipps behind 
the line. 

A 24-yard pass in the fourth 
quarter from Hermes to Sand-
mann set up the next Lindsay 
score. Several short-and-goal at-
tempts finally resulted in a 1-yard 
TD by Parsons. The two-point try 
afterward failed. 

Nocona tried to get going again 
but an 8-yard quarterback sack by 
Knight Chris Sanders messed it up 
after Phipps had already lost 12 
yards to the Knight defense. Soon 

natural gas exploration and pro-
duction; natural gas marketing; 
petroleum products refining, 
marketing and transportation; 
and chemical manufacturing and 
marketing. Organized in 1956, it is 
a part of an international group of 
companies affiliated with 
Petrofina S.A., headquartered in 
Brussels, Belgium. 

after, Nocona defensive back 
Jerry DeBorde intercepted 
Hermes but the Indians didn't 
take advantage of the turnover. 
Beverage punted 33 yards from his 
own nine. Lindsay started at the 
Indian 42 and ran right through 
them with a sustained rushing at-
tack resulting in Kevin Parsons' 
third touchdowns with 1:41 left in 
the game. Tracy Huchton made 
this kick and the score was Lind-
say 19, Nocona O. 

David Parsons kicked off and 
Phipps went to the air again only 
to see Lindsay junior Marty Neu 
intercept it. The Knights took the 
ball and watched the clock run out 
on their first victory of 1989. 

Lindsay's schedule pits them 
against Whitewright Friday at 8 
p.m., there. 

Education 
stressed for 
hunting 

Texas Parks and Wildlife 
Department officials said Na-
tional Hunting and Fishing Day 
on Sept. 23 will be a good time for 
Texans to become more aware of 
the importance of hunter 
education. 

Hunting and Fishing Day was 
established by Congressional 
resolution in 1971 to recognize the 
sportsman's vital role in conserva-
tion. NHF organizers say hunters 
and fishermen have contributed 
more than $7 billion for conserva-
tion programs. 

Steve Hall, hunter education 
coordinator for the Parks and 
Wildlife Department, said the 
state has approximately 2,400 
hunter education instructors 
across the state to teach the 
10-hour course. Persons born 
after Sept. 2, 1971 are required by 
state law to complete the courses 
before hunting in Texas. 

Hall said interested persons 
should contact a local game 
warden, TPWD field office, or 
call toll-free 1-800-792-1112 to 
locate a volunteer instructor in 
their area. 

Irish Setter Siren 



CAR QUEST 

Muenster 7592291 
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Sacred Heart Tigers 
vs. 

Cistercian Hawks 
Saturday, Sept. 23, here, 7:30 

Tigers 
Sept. 8, Era, T, 8:00 

Sept. 15, Windthorst, T, 8:00 

Sept. 23, Cistercian, H, 7:30 	__ 	 

Sept. 29, Temple Christian, H, 7:30 	 

Oct. 6, Perrin-Whitt, H, 7:30 

'Oct. 14, Lakehill* •, H, 6:00 

Oct. 21, Liberty Christian, T, 4:00 	 

• Oct. 28, Lexington, H, 7:30 

'Nov. 4, Oakridge, T, 2:00 

• Nov. 11, Tyler Street, T, 2:00 

• Denotes District Contests • • Denotes Homecoming '89 

Muenster Hornets 
vs. 

Nocona Indians 
Bookkeeping and 

Tax Services 

Lexington vs. 

hurch on the Rock 

Irby 
the 

no 
Meat Co. 

Kountry Korner 
Hornets 

Sept. 8, Collinsville, H, 8:00 	21 	3 

Sept. 15, S & S, H, 8:00 	20 	8  

Sept. 22, Nocona, T, 7:30 

Sept. 29, Gunter, T, 8:00 

'Oct. 6, Lindsay, T, 7:30 

'Oct. 13, Valley View, H, 7:30 

'Oct. 27, Era, T, 7:30 

'Nov. 3, Petrolia, H, 7:30 

• Nov. 10, Alvord, T, 7:30 

• Nov. 17, Windthorst, H, 7:30 
• Denotes District Contests 	• 'Denotes Homecoming 19 

demerit 	 fresh 
G" 	Donuts Deily 

Homemade Barad S Pastries 

7592822 Muenster 

I d  

Mft. 

hts as 
slice  

Tie Breaker Score 
Muenster 
Building 
Center 

"Everything for 
Anything" 

Tigers 	vs. Hawks 	 

_7. 
"Dedicated to being 1, 

the Best" 

E Hwy 82. Muenster, 759 2261 
Call Toll Free 

Pram Gainesville. 736 2209 

Ith 

Cubs 	Cuhs 	Opponents 

Sept. 14, Windthorst, H, 6:00 	0 	16 

Sept. 23, Cistercian, H, 5:00 

Sept. 29, Temple Christian, H, 5:00 	  

Oct. 5, Saint Jo, H, 6:00 

Oct. 12, Collinsville, H, 6:00 

Oct. 21, Liberty Christian, T, 2:00 

Oct. 27, OPEN 

Nov. 4, Oakridge, T, 10:00 

Nov. 11, Tyler Street, T, 10:00 

Jr. Varsity and Jr. High 	
Opp High Of 

Sept. 14, S & S, T, 

Sept. 21, Nocona, H, 

Sept. 28, Gunter, H, 

Oct. 5, Lindsay, H, 

Oct. 12, Valley View, T, 

Oct. 19, Saint ..101.1r. Hi Only), H, 6:00 	 

Oct. 26, Era, H, 

Nov. 2, Petrolia, T, 

Nov. 9, Alvord, H, 

Nov. 16, Windthorst, T 

Junior Varsity Games Stan at 5:30 p.m. 
Junior High Games Start at TOO p.m. 

Tony's Seed 

and Feed 

heft 

se 

82 

ir,TX 

Be a part 
of The Enterprise 
Football Contest! 

SPONSOR 
THIS 

}; SPOT! 

Muenster 
Wholesale 

Beer 
Distributors' 

Gilbert Endres 
Urban Endres 
Clyde Fisher 

CONTEST RULES: 
1. Only one entry per person per week. Persons entering must be 12 years old or older. 
2. This page of schedules, results, predictions, pictures and the contest itself is supported by the 

advertisers appearing here. Each ad contains a scheduled high school, college or pro game 
for Friday, Saturday or Sunday of the week of publication. Read each ad and circle the 
winner. Entries on forms other than this newspaper page will not be accepted. 

3. In order to determine the prizewinners in case of ties, you must predict the score for the 
tie breaker game listed in the featured ad above. 

4. Print your name, address and phone number clearly in the space provided. 
5. Deliver the full contest entry to The Muenster Enterprise BEFORE 5 p.m. FRIDAY. 

the week of publication. Mailed entries will be accepted only if postmarked before 
Friday, 5 p.m. Address for mailing entries is P.O. Box 190, Muenster, Texas 76252. 

6. The featured ad is picked at random each week. It contains the tic-breaker listing and is 
one of the winner/loser picks. Winner will pick up their prizes at that business each 
week on or after Tuesday of that week. 

7. To be the grand prize winner, a contestant must enter every week. Contest will continue 
as long as either Muenster team remains in play. Winner of the S100.00 grand prize 
will be determined by the best winning percentage throughout the contest after the 
lowest score is thrown out. 

aamit, Teatourant 
Tampa bay vs. New Orleans 

Family Dining and 
catering for all occasions 

759-2973 

RT 
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Be a part 
of The Enterprise 
Football Contest! 

Dr 
op 

bar. 

;1;1.  

Texas vs. SMU 

759-2910 & 2984, Muenster 

Open Tues.-Sun. 

New 
Subscribers 

to the 
Muenster 

Enterprise. 
CALL 759-4311 

ASSOCIATED ,o 
MILK 

PRODUCERS, g 
INC. 	i;  

The DI One Stop 

convenience 
Houston Store 

vs. 

Arizona St. 759-4512 

Muenster. Texas 
Beer 	 Wine 

Deli 	Bakery  

Muenster 
Pharmacy 

Medical Center Building 

817 759 2833 

82 Liquor 
our Friendly Package Store" 

Ray and Kaye Wimmer 

Mark Klement 
Windthorst 

vs Chillicothe 	. . 
Muenster 
759-4343 

Automotive 

Center 

FORD 

Chicago vs. Detroit 

Decatur, Texas 

817-627-1101 



DECORATING WINDOWS 

SALE 

The impact 
is seitscitional! 

NIA, .1 

ch. m e Ifr 1 1 ntr icn11ll ,cvs 

fild.ly and 51st, 	sir 

Gown (Anne Alive. 

We'll help you select and 

nsi all new ■%1111.10w coverings. Come in 

and see stir vs ide select ion 
of st yles and colors. 

SAVE 30 010 to 50 0/o OFF 
Kirsch Vertical Blinds, Mini-Blinds, Pleated 

Shades, Woven Woods and Valances. 

Muenster 

759-4455 

NOTICE 

CITATION BY PUBLICATION 
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

TO: The Unknown Biological Father of Baby Girl Fiore, 
Respondent: 
GREETINGS: 

YOU ARE HEREBY COMMANDED to appear and 
answer before the Honorable 235th District Court, Cooke 
County, Texas, at the Courthouse of said County in 
Gainesville, Texas, at or before 10 o'clock a.m. of the 
Monday next after the expiration of 20 days from the date 
of service of this citation, then and there to answer the 
petition of Harry DeVrieze and Denise DeVrieze, 
Petitioners, filed in said Court on the 16th day of August, 
1989, against the Unknown Biological Father of Baby Girl 
Fiore, Respondent, and said suit being numbered 89-366 
on the docket of said Court, and entitled "In The Interest 
of Baby Girl Fiore, A Child," the nature of which suit is a 
request to adopt said child. 

Said child was born the 14th day of August, 1989, in 
Gainesville, Texas. 

A hearing has been set on the 9th day of November, 
1989, at 9 o'clock a.m. in the 235th District Court of Cooke 
County, Texas. 

The Court has authority in this suit to enter any 
judgment or decree in the child's interest which will be bin-
ding upon you, including the termination of the parent-
child relationship and the appointment of a conservator 
with authority to consent to the child's adoption. 

The officer executing this writ shall promptly serve the 
same according to requirements of law, and the mandates 
hereof, and make due return as the law directs. 

ISSUED AND GIVEN under my hand and the seal of 
said Court at Gainesville, Texas, this the 6th day of Sep-
tember, 1989, 

Bobbie Calhoun, Clerk, 
235th District Court 

Cooke County, Texas 
/5/ Joy Huddleston, Deputy 

9.22C-1-1 

North Texas Communications Co. 
c 	205 N. W70,, 

 d Accessories 

Muens:si759 2251 

Competent Professional Service 

- The People Who Know T elephones - 

FOR SALE 
NOW HANDLING CAR-
PET, vinyl, wood floors and 
ceramics, sales and service. 
New and used stock and 
equipment trailers. Wanner 
Sales, E. Hwy. 82, 665-8882, 
open 8:30 a.m. to 5 p.m., 5 
days a week. 9.22-3E 

FOR SALE: Cemetery 
monuments, all sizes 
Reasonably priced. See J.P 
Flusche or phone 759-2205. 

PIANO FOR SALE 
Wanted: Responsible party to 
take on small monthly 
payments on piano. See 
locally. Call manager at 800- 
635-7611 anytime. 9 22.1-EP 

TARPS 	FOR 	SNII 

Polycoat sky blue, low 
lightweight, 10 cents pet 
square foot at Community 
Lumber Co., Muenster, 759- 
2248. 	 4141 

FOR SALE: Wedding gown, 
off-white taffeta, long 
sleeves, train, size 8/10. 665-
7212. 15-44 

FOR SALE: Lincoln Town 
Car, excellent condition. Call 
Ted or Carol, 759-4280. 

e 4.X1- 

FOR SALE: Number one 
quality railroad ties and used 
power poles in stock at Com-
munity Lumber Co., Muen 
ster, 817-759-2248.. 4.4x1 

FOR SALE: '77 Pontiac Bon- 
neville, clean, good condition.  
Ca11759-2506. 	912X1 

Trailer Parts 
and Supplies 

Structural SteW 
and Pipe 

( omplete Line 
of Bolts and 

Miscellaneous 
Hardware 
METAL 
SALES, 

INC. 

MOBILE HOME FOR 
SALE: 2 bedroom, 2 bath, 
CH/A, woodburning heater, 
bay window dining area, fen-
ced yard, small storage 
building. DID NOT 
FLOOD!!! Call (817) 759-
4830 after 6 p.m. weekdays or 
come by corner of Fourth and 
Sylvan. 8.18-54P 

1987 YAMAHA 350 Warrior 
4-wheeler for sale. Good con-
dition. Call between 6-9 p.m. 
759-4950. s. 22-2E 

FOR SALE: Seed wheat and 
seed oats, certified, Collin and 
other varieties, all cleaned and 
in bulk. J.H. Bayer & Sons, 
817-759-2574, 8.4-XE 

HOLLYWOOD GARAGE 
Doors, residential and com-
mercial. Muenster Building 
Center. 6.1.XC 

FOR SALE: 14870 trailer 
house, CH/A, 3 bedroom, 
1 A bath. Day 759-2296; after 
6 p.m. 759-4273. s 25.XE 

FOR SALE: Matching couch 
and chair, 4 years old, in ex-
cellent condition. 3150.00. 
Call 759-4889 anytime. 913-XE 

FOR SALE: 130-volt light 
bulbs, rated to last longer than 
the standard bulb, for home 
or business. Community 
Lumber Co., Muenster, 817-
759-2248. 0.20-XE 

FOR SALE: Glass shower 
doors, tub enclosures, mirrors 
in all sizes. Installation 
available. Contact Ted Hen-
scheid, 759-4280, Muenster. 

REDUCE SAFE AND FAST 
with GoBese Capsules and E-
Vap "Water Pills" anytime a: 
Muenster Pharmacy. 

ROEBIC K-37 
6: %:,.... 1 Septic Tank 

Liquefier snot 
aeo 

L,0111rtlunify Lumber Co 

REAL ESTATE 

North Texas 
Sales Group 
Office 759.2900 

3-26-year-old doublewidr 
mobile home to be moved. 
in excellent condition. 
526,000. 

2-1 frame home on 1 acre 
in Ross ton-Era School 
District, 527,500. 

Joann Hess, 759-4782 

Margaret Watson, 665-5982 

FOR SALE: 614 acres 4 miles 
south of Muenster on Hwy 
373. Road frontage on ea, 
and south. Short-term ownci 
financing. Call 759-2257. 

4 2 TNI 

HOUSE FOR SALE: 5 
bedroom, 3 baths, 150'8140' 
lot, pool, 608 E. Fifth Sr . 
Muenster. We reserve the 
right to accept or reject any 
bids. Mail bids to: Eddie 
Ramsey, 608 E. Fifth St., 
Muenster, TX 76252. 9 i4E 

North Texas 
Sales Group 

Office 759-2900 
Great starter home, close 
to downtown Muenster, 

nice big yard. Make offer, 
Joann Hess 7594782 

Margaret Watson 665-5982 

Magna Homes 
5451 S. Stemmons Exp. 

Denton, TX 
Beautiful. new Palm 

Harbor mobile home. 
Doublewide. 3 BR. 
2 baths. loaded with 

extras. all for 8263.83 
per Mo 

Hurry! Cell Now 

817-497-2216 - 

FOR SALE: 

Dude's 
Chevron 
Station 

MUST SELL 
NOW! 

(817) 759-4440 
Muenster 

22 1E 

Magna Homes 
5451 S. Stemmons Exp. 

Benton. TX 
Bank 

Foreclosures! 
Huge selection of 

foreclosed mobile homes. 
Call today - 	- 

817-497-2216 

FOR SALE 1,11 OWNER: 
3 bedroom, 2 bath brick 

home, Falcon Head Resort. 
CH/A, double and single 
garages, 2700-sq.-ft. under 
roof. 405-276-9597. 9.15-2E 

RON HESS REAL ESTATE 
BROKER, land or residential. 
Phone 759-2232 or 759-4864. 

1.10.%E 

Magna Homes 
5451 S. Stemmons Exp. 

Denton. TX 

Amazing! 
Your own home - free and 

clear in only 4 years! 
3 bedroom, 2 bath mobile 
home with fireplace and 
air. Excellent condition. 

10% down plus 8261 per 
month for four years and 
it's paid for! 0.0 0 0 APR! 

Hurry! Call Howl 

817-497-2216 

IN STOCK 
Electrical - Plumbing 

Paneling • Roofing 
Hardware - Water Pumps 
Heating • Air Conditioning 

We can recommend an installer 

Muenster Building 
Center, Inc. 
Muenster, 759.2232 

Sewing 
Machines 

Vacuums 
Sales & Service 

All Makes 

Books & Brass 
and Gifts 	- 

209W, California 

Gainesville, Texas 	- 

665.2542 665-7445 

HELP WANTED 

ACCOUNTS PAYABLE 
BOOKKEEPER/ 
RECEPTIONIST: 

I year general bookkeeping 
experience and 2 semesters of 
basic and intermediate ac-
counting courses or 2 years 
general bookkeeping, 10-key 
by touch, computer entry, 
type 40 wpm accurately, good 
telephone and interpersonal 
skills a must. Contact 
Christina Smith, Texoma 
Council of Governments, 
10000 Grayson Drive, 
Denison, Texas 75020, 214-
786-2953. Applications will be 
accepted until 5 p.m. Wed-
nesday, Sept. 27, 1989. 
Minorities are encouraged to 
apply. E.O.E. 9. 221E 

JTPA SECRETARY: Two 
years general office experiem 
ce, knowledge of office prac-
tices and machines, good 
English, spelling and com-
putational skills, deal effec-
tively with public, ability to 
understand and follow oral 
and written instructions, type 
60 wpm accurately. Contact 
Christina Smith, Texorna 
Council of Governments, 
10000 Grayson Drive, 
Denison, Texas 75020. (214) 
786-2955. Applications will be 
accepted until 5 p.m. Mon 
day, Sept. 25, 1989. 
Minorities are encouraged to 
apply. E.O.E. 9.221E 

HELP WANTED: Shop 
helper. Apply in person at 
Gregg's Chevrolet, East 
Hwy. 82, Muenster, Texas. 

9 8-XE 

NEEDED IMMEDIATELY! 
Sewing machine operators. 
Good fringe benefits, pleasant 
working conditions. Apply in 
person between the hours of 8 
a.m. to 2 p.m. Monday 
through Friday. Frybrant, 120 
N. Sycamore, Muenster. 

2.17-XE 

WANTED: Full or part-lime 
cooks. Apply in person at The 
Center Restaurant. 	6.9-XE 

When, doggone 

you just eon 

liesp'ern ell 

Can for • 

Classified ad 
759 4311 

Saddlemans 
\ Boot Jeans 

Stretch Tex 

	

ss; 	Twill 
9 colors In stock 

Sizes 28 -46 Waist 
29 - 36 Length 

Commerce 
Street Store 

	

PeeBrisco 	Gainesville 

FOR HOME DELIVERY OF 
Fort Worth Star-Telegram, 

call Sandi Rowe Collect 
817-458-3384 

STATE INSPECTED meat 
processing plant. Bring in 
your animal Tuesday, Thur-
sday, Friday. Fischer's Meat 
Market, 759-4211 10.17-Xs 

Car Wash '' 
Septic Tank and 

Grease Traps Cleaning 
H & H Vacuum Service 

_,_759 4146 or 668 726E,_ 
-7r 	 0110 	 7C 

Schilling Fina 
Oil &Gas 
Diesel, Gasoline 

Oil and Grease 
Propane 

759-2522 

Muenster, TX 76252 

Eva Beaver's 
Machine Quilting 

I can quilt up to 
126 inches wide. 

Quilts For Sale. 

OC TUBER SPECIAl 
Have 2 Tops done for reg. price 

-3rd top for , pnc,. 

Amon Carter Lake Rd. - 
Bowie 

817-872-3402 

KNABE'S CABINETS, steel 
siding, vinyl siding, construc-
tion work and estimates. Call 
759-4559. 9.15.XE 

TENDER LOVING CARE 
Day Care Center, 759-4964. 

4.4XE 

Bob's Auto 
Service 

• Automatic Transmission 
Service 6 Overhaul 

• General Automotiue 
Repair 

Welterscheid 
323 N Main. Moonsler 

759-4474 or 759-2713 

CARPENTER WORK 
WANTED 

Also odd lobs 
Reasonable rates 
Ernie Martin, 759-4650 

WANTED 

WANT TO BUY: Small, used 

greenhouse. Call Dave Fette, 
759-4311. 	 NC 

WANT TO BUY: 10 acres in 
Muenster area. Call 759-4744 
after 6 p.m. 

WANTED: Used Boy Scout 
or Cub Scout uniforms. Also 
adult leader uniforms. Bring 
to or call The Hut 759-2911. 

I 29.XES 

ATTENTION! 

ATTENTION: Would the 
relatives of Ida B. Muller (ex-
pired March 14, 1915 at 
Russell, Montana) please 
claim her picture at The 
Muenster Enterprise/ Picture 
was apparently left in a tex-
tbook at Muenster Public 
School around 1980. NC 

MISCELLANEOUS 
SERVICES 

WRANGLER 

Shoes-Boots 

Work . Dress - Western 

J.R. ROCKER 
Men's & Boys' Store 

207 N. Commerce 

Gainesville 

■••■■•1 
BUSINESS 

OPPORTUNITIES 

RESPONSIBLE 
PERSON 

Wanted to own and operate 
high profit candy vending 
route. Nationally proven 
program since 1959 - includes 
training. Requires cash in- 
vestment of $4237 to 514,070. 
Call 1-800-328-0723. EAGLE 
INDUSTRIES, Since 1959. 
9.22.I-EP 

C•HOy 0 BRACK 
DISTRIBUTORSHIPS 

No Soiling-No Experience 
MARS BARS- FRITO LAY 

HERSHEY, ETC . 

CASH INVESTMENTS 

$2400 - SS0.000 
CALL 24 HOURS PER DAY 
4000-0434380 Ext. 07.8 

FOR RENT 

FOR RENT: Neat, clean six- 
room apartment, CH/A. 759- 
4949 or 759-4386. 	8.25.XE 

MOBILE HOME FOR 
RENT: 2 bedroom, fully fur-
nished, a block from school 
on N. Walnut. Phone 759-
2938, Jerome Pagel. a, ts-xt 

HOUSE FOR RENT: at 117 
N. Oak Street. Small 2 
bedroom for residence or 
office. Call (81 71759-4482. 

5 i i.xE 

U-Store & Lock 	I 
Mini Warehouses 

759-4621 = 
ATTENTION: Governrnen 
seized vehicles from 5100 
Fords, Mercedes, Corvettes 
Chevys. Surplus Buyers 
Guide. 1-602-838-8885 Ext. A 
10190. 9 22.I•EP 
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******** *************************************************** 
SCORE 13•I-G! 

in The Muenster 
Enterprise Classifieds! 

759-4311 
Deadline 

Wednesday Noon 

Rake in the Cash while you 
make a Clean Sweep of your 
closets and garages. 

Use the FREE 
personal Classifieds in 

the next Cooke County's 
Best Values! 

1 Deadline is 
5p.m. 

Thursday, 044 \ 
4 44\  

Sept. 28. 



ROOFING 
HELP 
We Can 

FIX YOU UP 
FuRCholceol shindies. TyDosandColors 

EspedencedProlesslonalinstallers 
Ears Neal and Clean 

COMMUNITY 
Lumber Company 

M tromf ler 	 7. 7201 

slchts  
LIFE 

'SAFETY! 

Independenl FMW Insurance 

INSURANCE AGENCY 

For all your insurance needs 

Drawer 0, 204 N. Main, Muenster, Texas 
817-759-4644 

New GMC's 
Pickups & Trucks 

Sales and Service 
See us f or expert 

Automotive Service and Truck Repair 

HOEDEBECK GMC 
216 N. Main, Muenster, 759-4336 

HAND MAPS 

!\,  

  

   

Malia•04 
	

9■4.4mnG 

James 
Boot & Shoe 

Repair 

110 N. Commerce 
Gainesville 
668.6461 

Soft Red winter Wheat Variety Trial 

Dallas, To 1988-89 

Ewirr Yield 
bufa 

	

TestueightHeading 	Height 
lb/bu 	day 	inches 

Freese 
damage
0-5 

Leaf 
51105 

% 

mildew 	Ores 
0-9 	0-9 

Compton 05.8 55 	110 2.2 100 2.0 

Caldwell 24.6 54 2.0 60 0.7 

Coker 747 21.3 53 	109 2.3 30 3.5 

Magnum 20.2 55 	104 1.5 10 4.3 

Coker 68-15 19.4 56 	108 3.2 25 .8 

Adder 19.2 53 	107 	25 at 0 4.5 

Tyler 17.4 50 	109 	31 2.5 100 1.5 

Ralson 16.7 53 	104 	29 2.8 10 2.8 

Coker 916 15.5 56 	107 	25 3.0 6.0 

Auburn 15.4 55 	117 	32 1.5 

900  
0.5 

Bredfofd 13.2 so 	100 	32 3.5 30 5.2 

Rosen 13.1 53 	109 	29 3.8 70 6.8 

Abe 12.8 54 	108 	30 1.7 3.7 

Coker 9766 
McNair 1003 

12 	4 
11.0 

48 	Ill 	30 

47 	112 	31 
3.8 
4.0 

10 
50 

6.2 
4.0 

Florida 303 8.9 50 	114 	31 4.8 50 2.7 

Florida 	102 0.0 51 	111 	27 4.5 30 2.0 

Keiaer 8.3 51 	110 	27 4.3 10 3.3 

Coker 983 6.1 57 	112 	29 4.8 4.8 

Hunter 5.9 55 	109 	26 5.0 0 5.5 

Saluda 5.2 53 	106 	30 3.8 2.5 

Coker 9323 4.8 52 	109 	25 5.0 

4: 
4./ 

Coker 9221 4.6 54 	 21 5.0 5.0 

Coker 9733 3.2 53 	116 	27 5.0 
1: 

4.3 

Coker 762 2.5 54 	114 	27 5.0 5.0 

Hard Red winter Wheab Variety 6.1.1 

Dallas, 	To 	1980-89 

Entry Yield Testueight 	heading 	Height Freeze Leaf Mildew 	BYER, 

bufa lb/bu 	day 	inches damage rust 0-9 	0-9 
0-5 % 

Chisholm 36.4 61 	106 1.3 100 3.5 

Sturdy 35.1 56 	100 2.0 60 3.6 

TAM 	 07 34.1 58 	107 1.5 100 3. 7  

Pioneer 2100 32.8 60 	106 1.8 15 2.8 

Pioneer 2172 30.4 57 	109 3.3 15 3.7 

Payne 29.5 50 	100 1.13 60 3.7 

Stallion 28.2 61 	 107 as 80 5.0 

Thunderbird 27.5 5/ 	112 	31 1.5 70 5.5 

TE 5221 26.B 58 	108 	24 1.6 40 4.3 

Century 26.0 56 	109 	29 1.5 100 3.5 

Pioneer 	2157 25.1 58 	108 	31 2.3 100 4.3 

Vona 24.9 57 	109 	26 1.2 100 4.2 

Pioneer 2165 24.5 59 	107 	27 2.2 30 4.3 

Aiken 23 	/ 56 	109 	30 2.8 70 5.3 

mesa 22.4 58 	110 	32 3.8 90 4.2 

Siouzlend 20.8 55 	109 	34 1.2 100 4.7 

Hawk 20 3 56 	115 	31 2.0 100 3.7 

19.5 58 	108 	28 2.3 100 5.7 

Ant  200 18.9 60 	111 	26 3.5 60 4.7 

TAM 106 18.0 113 	26 2.0 80 5.3 

TAM 108 17.2 50 	114 	30 1.3 100 3.8 

TAM 201 16.4 57 	109 	25 4.0 80 5.0 

TAM 105 14.2 53 	115 	26 1.8 100 ,.5 

Collin 13.7 59 	105 	25 4.3 

Mit 4.8 NES 	108 	28 4.8 5 4.8 

Probrand 812 1.9 DES 	113 	28 4.8 10 3.5 

The sad truth 

1 	They 
	CD's • • • 

y can't give you 8.55 01o` tax-deferred. 

1
I

A tax-deferred annuity from Prudential-Bache offers you 
the opportunity to watch your money grow without the 

	impact of current taxes. And tax-deferred annuities are the 
only investment that provide you with safety of principal 
and tax-deferred competitive yields, guaranteed by the 

1 	issuing company. 

Unlike other investments you pay no current income tax. 
Instead, your money is busy earning 8.55 ,10 interest, 

1  without being reduced by taxes. 

To find out more, just call or send in the coupon below. 

• Interest rate guaranteed by the issuing company only for a specified period. 

subject to change without notice. I 

Prudential-Bache Securities, P.O. Box 31600, Dallas, Texas 75211 

1

Attn: Richard L. Rogers, Vice President - Investments 
817-665-7612, In Muenster 817-759-2725 

❑ Please send additional information on tax-deferred annuities. 

Name 	 Address 

City 	 State 	Zip 	Phone ( 	I 

I 

Clients, please
ccoun 

give name and 
office of At Executive I 	

Prudential-Bache ' 

Securities' 
a waft, nwememaw. 	 Rock Solid. Market Wise 

..i■••■■■•■•••■•■••...■ 
it 19813 tlhuelentiaVEMChe Securities Member SiPC 

111Rom, 

EIS, steel 
construe- 

nate, c„,,, 

'C CARE 
594E64 

4,sr 

'Ito 
:e 
'Emission 
haul 
Ring 

11188/ 
toys  

1.2113 

I WORK 
ED 
lobs 

erases 
3594654 

fED 

Small,used 
Due Fette, 

sc 

10 acres in 
0159-4744 

I Boy Sono 
toms. Also 
arms. Bing 
set 7591911. 
, 4NB 

ION! 

Would th, 

I. Mullet let-
4, 1915 M 

MO please 
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diePirture 
eft inata. 
Wer Public 
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New bluebonnet colors now available 	County Agent's Report 
by Craig Rosenbaum, 

County Extension Agent 
Texas Agricultural Extension 

Service horticulturists in coopera-
tion with seed producers, bedding 
plant growers and vegetable 
farmers have domesticated the 
bluebonnet wildflower into a new 
multi-million dollar bedding 
plant. 

People often ask how did such a 
wonderful project begin and why 
hadn't it been done before. In 
1982, a terminally ill enterpreneur 
and Texas naturalist named Car-
roll Abbott, known to some as 
"Mr. Texas Bluebonnet," im-
planted in the mind of Extension 
horticulturists a dream of planting 
the design of our state flag com-
prised entirely of the state flower 
to celebrate the 1986 Texas Ses-
quicentennial. This seemingly sim-
ple proposal and the achievements 
required to make it a reality have 
involved thousands of people, 
created a multi-million dollar 
agricultural industry, generated 
tremendous publicity for Texas 
A&M, and is still producing new 
products and wildflower 
knowledge with no apparent end 
in sight. 

Since the beginning, develop-
ment of unusual bluebonnet types 
has been the main driving force of 
this project. All of the other 
developments including rapidly 
germinating, chemically-scarifed 
seed, bluebonnet transplants, 
commercial seed production and 
early-blooming plant types were 
all necessary ingredients needed to 
find and proliferate the colors re-
quired (blue, white and red) to 
plant the initial floral goal, a 
Texas state flag. 

BLUE: The blue bluebonnet 
was, of course, already available. 
The only thing needed to be done 
with this color was to enhance 
seed germination and formulate a 
commercial production technique 
which would ensure a dependable 
seed supply. 

WORTHINGTON BLUE: This 
is one of the most striking of all 
the bluebonnet colors. The color is 
best described as sky blue or the 
color of the sky on a clear day. 
This color strain was named for 
the Worthington Hotel in Fort 
Worth because of their continuing 
support for the bluebonnet 
development program. It makes a 
striking display whether planted 
alone or mixed with other colors. 

WHITE: The white strain of 
bluebonnet was familiar to most 
local botanists yet still unknown 
to the majority of Texans. 
Photographers always treasure the 
opportunity to find a rare white 
bluebonnet nestled among the 
blues to enhance their artistic at-
tempts. Consequently, many peo-
ple knew where white populations 
existed. 

ABBOTT PINK: The develop-
ment of a pink bluebonnet was 
thought to be an impossible task. 
Even Carroll Abbott considered 

z 

News of the Sick 
Mr. and Mrs. lack Berry are 

making daily visits to the hospital 
in Denton to visit their son, 
James, who is a patient there. 

Friends visit 
Mr. and Mrs. Will Payne and 

Troy of Arlington, accompanied 
by their friends Alford and two 
sons Carlos and Chat, and 
another friend, Bradley, spent the 
day Sunday visiting Mrs. Juanita 
Greanead, Mr. and Mrs. Ran 
Greanead and Matt. 

Atterberrys visit local relatives 
Mr. and Mrs. J.L. Atterberry of 

California arrived at DFW Tues-
day. After spending the night in 
Dallas with relatives, they came to 
Forestburg to visit Joy's mother, 
Mrs. Oma Wakeman, and other 
relatives in the area. 

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Wakeman of 
Wichita Falls visited Mrs. 
Wakeman and Joy and J.L. 
Thursday and Friday. The At-
terberrys plan to spend a month 
here. 

Maberrys visit in Daingerfield 
Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Maberry 

Sr. drove to Daingerfield Monday 
to visit their son, Marvin Jr., and 
granddaughter, Marla Bullard, 
and family. They returned home 
Wednesday. 

Weekend with grandparents 
Kenda Hutson of Saint Jo spent 

the weekend with her grand-
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Hutson. 

Personal 
Miss Lois Bewley and Clyde 

were in Gainesville Friday. 
• • • 

Harold Brown of Era visited his 
mother, Mrs. Evelyn Brown, 
Tuesday afternoon.  

• • • 

Donnie and Debbie Mask have 
moved into the old Jim Hall place 
in Leo.  

location, purification and pro-
liferation of the pink, and even-
tually red, bluebonnet a bit farfet-
ched. This great plantsman had 
roamed the fields of Texas his en-
tire life and had seen only three 
pink bluebonnet plants. Most of 
his native plant friends had never 
seen even one! 

In searching for the pink strain, 
the same criterion used to suc-
cessfully locate and purify the 
white bluebonnet strain was used. 
People were asked to collect only 
seed from pinks in large groups so 
that natural selection would have 
already bred some of the blue out 
of the pinks. However, the pinks 
were indeed so rare that only four 
locations throughout the entire 
state were reported. The "mother 
lode" of pinks was found within 
the city limits of San Antonio. 
Once a gene source was located, 
the pink and shades thereof were 
added to the bluebonnet color 
spectrum. 

Because the pink strain of 
bluebonnet was so rare and so 
special, it has been named after 
the mentor of this project. The 
'Abbott Pink' bluebonnet is now a 
reality. Its unique and subtle beau-
ty will always serve as a reminder 
of Carroll Abbott's dedication 
and inspiration to all who love and 
appreciate nature's rarities. 

OTHER COLOR STRAINS: 
Like Carroll Abbott himself, the 
pink bluebonnet is full of sur-
prises. The 'Abbott Pink' strain is 
providing wonderful "bonus" 
color hues which none could have 
initially imagined. The purifica-
tion of a pink bluebonnet strain 
will eventually lead to the creation 
of an entirely new color variant 
which will make the bluebonnet 
without a doubt the most revered 
state flower in history to a certain 
segment of the Texas population. 
Geneticists indicate that for every 
color in nature, there exist hues or 
shades of that colo•. For instance, 
within the pink bluebonnet there 
should exist a series of shades of 
darker pink and, eventually, red. 
Another spectrum of colors 
should exist when blue color 
shades are mixed with dark pink 
or red to create lavender or 
possibly even maroon. Now isn't 
there a group of Texans whose 
hearts and loyalties lie in College 
Station which might show a subtle 
interest in developing a maroon 
colored state flower? Sounds as if 
the Aggies may have done it 
again! 

Let me emphasize that these ad-
ditional colors of the state flower 
were not genetically created by 
man; these colors have existed for 
as long as bluebonnets have 
bloomed. The additional colors, 
which already existed in nature 
and have for hundreds of years, 
were simply isolated, purified and 
grown in large numbers. No plant 
breeding or genetic manipulation 
of bluebonnets has been done ex-
cept by God. All of these colors 

Guests of Mrs. Berry 
Mrs. Brenda Haverkamp of 

Gainesville had lunch with Mrs. 
Josephine Berry Sunday. Byron 
Berry of Denton visited Mrs. 
Berry Saturday. Then Sunday, 
Byron and son Colby visited Mrs. 
Berry. 

Blankenships attend funeral 
Mr. and Mrs. John C. Blanken-

ship of Lindsey, Oklahoma spent 
Wednesday and Thursday visiting 
Mrs. Louise Shults. They all at-
tended the funeral of Weldon 
Penton. 

Visiting and entertaining 
Mrs. Anna Lee Fortenberry and 

Mrs. Charlotte Fortenberry of 
Slidell spent Tuesday with Mrs. 
Becky Richardson, Chari and 
Laura. 

Thursday, Mr. and Mrs. Tom 
Richardson, Chari and Laura 
visited Mrs. Anna Lee 
Fortenberry at Slidell. Chari 
Richardson visited with her 
cousin, Ethan Fortenberry. 

Kim Richardson spent Sunday 
afternoon with Chari and Laura 
Richardson. 

Mrs. Edith Richardson of 
Gainesville visited Sunday after-
noon with Bill and Norma White, 
Tom and Becky Richardson, 
Chari and Laura. Other visitors 
were Mrs. Charlotte Fortenberry 
of Slidell and Don Richardson of 
Sherman. 

Personal 
Mrs. Laura Belle Jackson and 

Mrs. Jewel Dill were in Gainesville 
Monday. 

Bible Study continues 
The Bible Study in the home of 

Mr. and Mrs. Ted Jackson, spon-
sored by the Forestburg United 
Methodist Women, was well at-
tended Tuesday. Everyone seemed 
to enjoy the study of the Book of 
Ruth. Rev. Larry Kruger is the 
teacher. Refreshments were served 
after the study.  

have been developed to enhance 
the Texas state flower. ALL of 
these colors, by law, are legally the 
state flower. Now, for the first 
time in history, color patterns of 
the state flower can be planted and 
enjoyed. And, since these colors 
are all naturally occurring selec-
tions,chey complement each other 
perfectly, making design and color 
selection almost foolproof. There 
is nothing prettier than a mixed 
bed of pink, white and blue 
bluebonnets. Through working 
with Mother Nature, the Texas 
state flower can now be raised to 
new heights of beauty and 
enjoyment. 

A few hasten to add: "If a 
bluebonnet flower is white, it 
shouldn't be called a bluebonnet, 
it's a whitebonnet." The state 
flower is the bluebonnet, written 
as one word. A color variant of 
that flower would be properly 
described with the name of that 
color, PLUS the name of the 
flower. Consequently, the terms 
white bluebonnet, pink bluebon-
net, and maroon bluebonnet are 
correct. 

Be advised that from all packets 
of seed or flats of transplants of 
bluebonnet color strains such as 
white, 'Abbott Pink' or ' Wor-
thington Blue,' there will be some 
plants which will bloom with the 
standard blue color. The new col-
or strains are not 100 percent pure 
and thus will occasionally exhibit 
the ancestral blue and possibly 
other hues as well. Also, be advis-
ed that in bluebonnet stands which 
have been allowed to naturally 
reseed the mixing of blues with 
pinks or whites will, in several 
years, result in reversion to the 
blue color due to cross-pollination 
and the subsequent masking of the 
less dominant color strain. 

Now is a perfect time to pur-
chase and plant bluebonnets. 
While local nurseries have good 
supplies of transplants and 
chemically-scarified seed in blue, 
white and 'Abbott Pink,' an ill -
fated windstorm roared through 
the commercial planting of 'Wor-
thington Blue,' greatly reducing 
seed availability. Thus, for 1989, 
the only way to purchase seed of 
this newest of the new bluebonnet 
color strains is to attend the "Fall 
Is For Planting" seminar schedul-
ed for Saturday, Sept. 23, in the 
South Texas Room of the Will 
Rogers Memorial Center in Fort 
Worth. Sponsored by Region 5 of 
the Texas Association of 
Nurserymen, this free and very in-
teresting program will feature 
presentations on the new bluebon-
nets, as well as on native plants, 
fall bulbs, tree selection and fall 
lawn care. 

In addition to plant materials, 
your participating local nursery or 
garden center is offering free of 
charge the special Extension 
publication entitled "Texas 
Bluebonnets-Texas Pride" which 
tells all about proper cultural 
techniques, how to achieve winter 
-long color through interplanting 
and little known facts in the 
fascinating history of Texas 
bluebonnets. 

For a super Christmas or birth-
day gift for your gardening friends 
or for anyone who loves bluebon-
nets, you can also purchase but-
tons or T-shirts featuring the 
newly-created and very beautiful 
bluebonnet logo commemorating 
this breakthrough in bluebonnet 
culture. Your friends will love you 
for it! 

Wheat variety results 
The recent rains have made con- 

ditions ideal for fall plantings of 
small grains. Each year, Dr. David 
Marshall, Plant Breeder with the 
Texas Agricultural Experiment 
Station at Dallas, conducts some 

Market 
Report 

by Bill Hamer 

The sale of 524 cattle and 18 
hogs was reported last week by the 
Muenster Livestock Auction. 
Hogs were weak at $1.00 to $2.00 
lower; cows were strong at $.50 to 
$1.00 higher; stocker calves were 
strong and active; feeders were 
$1.00 to $2.00 lower; and bulls 
were strong at $.50 to $1.00 
higher. 

HOGS 
Good to Choice 

COWS 
Good to Choice 	$50 to $56 
Medium to Good 	$46 to $50 
Canners to Cutters 	$44 to $48 
Hard Kinds 	 $30 to $40 
Stocker Cows 	$48 to $65 
Cow w/Calf at Side.. $600 to $800 

STOCKER CALVES 
Steer Calves 	$90 to $134 
Steer Yearlings 	 $78 to $85 
Heifer Calves 	$75 to $105 
Heifer Yearlings 	 $70 to $82 
Heifer 	 2 yrs. $62 to $72 

BULLS 
Good to Choice 	$62 to $66 
Medium to Good 	$59 to $62 

Crop insurance 
and federal 
disaster 
prog. update 

by Craig Rosenbaum, 
County Extension Agent 

Monday, Sept. 25, several 
meetings will be held throughout 
the county to inform small grain 
producers of current information 
on Federal Crop Insurance. The 
final sign-up date for Wheat, 
Barley and Oats is Sept. 30, 1989 
for the 1990 crop. 

Ken Stokes, Economist with the 
Texas Agricultural Extension Ser-
vice, will update producers on the 
criteria and rules regarding 
Federal Crop Insurance. Tim 
Gilbert, County ASCS Manager, 
will be at the meetings to update 
producers on the new Federal 
Disaster Program. This week, Tim 
has been at meetings to get facts 
and figures for this program. 

The meetings will be held Mon-
day, Sept. 25, at the following 
times and locations: 7:30 a.m., 
W.B. Hudspeth, Inc. at Era; 9 
a.m., Cooke County Electric Co-
op at Muenster; and 11 a.m., 
Cooke County Fairgrounds at 
Gainesville.  

indepth demonstrations involving 
both hard and soft wheat varieties 
in the Blacklands. Yield data last 
year was varied due primarily to 
the susceptibility of some varieties 
to the late freeze conditions that 
existed in North Texas. Producers 
should take this into account and 
look at the other information 
presented in the following charts. 

One of the problems showing 
up in Cooke County in recents 
years has been the incidence of 
Barley Yellow Dwarf Virus 
(BYDV). This is a viral disease 
transmitted by insects, primarily 
greenbugs, during the fall and 
winter. Varieties are fairly selec-
tive as to their susceptibility to this 
disease. Therefore, producers can 

eliminate some of the problems 
through variety selection. 

Leaf rust is probably the most 
devastating disease attacking 
wheat today. This disease has the 
ability to mutate and attack 
varieties at varying degrees of 
severity. Again, producers can 
eliminate some of the disease pro-
blems through varietal selection. 
The variety data listed below is 
primarily for comparison and in-
formation. Again, the yield results 
from this '88-89 trial should be in-
terpreted in conjunction with the 
other problems associated with the 
varieties. 

If you have questions about any 
of these results, please contact the 
County Extension Office. 

by Craig Rosenbaum 

Country T uiclings N  
by R Smith  

180-275 lbs. 
	 $38 to $40 

Good Butchers 	 125-180 lbs. 
	 $30 to $33 



MARKET PACK FILLETS 

ORANGE ROUGHY 	LB 
$599 

Spaghetti Sauce 
32 oz. 

jar 

Leg I tip 1 O. or more 
additional purchase 

GREEN GIANT ASST EKC LeSEUR PEAS, BROC , SPRzS 

VEGETABLES 	
oo  $109 

BOOTH 

PERC H FILLETS 	I LB 8 2" 
MORTON 

	 TOT 2 FOR $ 
	0 0 

$1 ss  

$109 

1202. 69' 

	 10 OZ. 

	 1002 

ASSORTED

II 	POCKETS 
AUNT 
ASST. WAFFLES 
SHURFINE 

	JUICE 
PATIO ASST . 

BURRITOS 5 OZ 
FOP $ 1 0 0 
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LB 1 " 

L. 89' 

GROUND ROUND 
GRI AT FOR THEGRIIL FRESH 

LB 
$199 

MARKET PACK 
	

$ 1 " TURBOT FILLETS 
	

LB 

SCHOONER MARKET PACK BREADED 

FISH STICKS 
	

LB 1 1 9  

DECKER REGJLOW SALT 	

$ 1 3 9  SLICED BACON 	I LB. PKG 

DECKER JUMBO 
	

$ 1 3 9  MEAT FRANKS 	1LB. PKG 
WISCONSIN MARKET PACK LONGHORN 

	

$ 2 9  COLBY CHEESE 	. LB 
PILGRIM'S PRIDE BONELESS SKINLESS 

FRYER BREAST 	LB $ 3 29  

la all NUGGETS , 2 OT $ 1 " 

PIKE'S PEAK ROAST LB $ 1 99  
FISCHER'S 

SLICED BACON 	is $1 29 

FAMILY PACK 

 CHOPS 	 LB $149 
SILVER SPUR 

 

SLICED BACON 	 
SMALL PORK 

SPARE RIBS 	 LB.  

LB. 99e 
'1 19  

USDA Choice Beef 

Brisket 

Butt Pork Roast 
Lean & Tender Whole 

lb. „c 
Pack 

4"B lb. avg lb.  • % I  

[Nit* 11. tt4. —t/ 
T14' 

*44.0r/ir 

AFFILIATED  MEW 

LEAN & TENDEREAMILY PACK 

PORK STEAK 
WHOLE 
SMOKED PICNIC 

FISCHER'S 

TOP SIRLOIN 	L. $ 4 29  
ROUND STEAK 	LB $ 2 59 

 RUMP ROAST. LB . 

$ 1 9 9 

FOOD STONES 
FISCHER'S CENTER RIB 

PORK CHOPS 	LB 

FISCHER'S CENTER LOIN 

PORK CHOPS 	LB 

FISCHER'S FIRST CUT 

$2 29  PORK CHOPS 	LB $ 1 69  

LB. $ 1 

 

69 
FISCHER'S COUNTRY STYLE 

$ 2 43  SPARE RIBS 

White Cloud/Charmin 
Assorted 

Ragu 
Assorted 

COUNTY LINE COLRYIGHEDDAR 

HALFMOON CHEESE I LB $ 2 79  
SHURFRESH 

SOUR CREAM 	ROT 69' 
SHURFRESH 

HALF & HALF 	1602 CTN 69' 
SHURFINE 

	CHEESE 1 LD $ 2 19  
PILL SDUHv 

PIZZA CRUST 	1002 ROLL $1 19  

ORE IDA 

GOLDEN CRINKLES. 5 LB. $ 349 Limit 3 

Shurfine Flour 

— 	79c 
COCA-COLA 

2 LITER 99 
$ 1 

6 PK 

Neguler Jalapeno 

Wolf Plain Chili 

0 	— 	994 

Clocker, of the Sea 

Chunk Light Tuna 

V.Z-  — 	2/$1 
Old Fashioned/Quick 

Quaker Oats 

' 8— 	$ 1 19  bo, 

Med./Lg./EA Lg. 

49 	Dryers Diapers 
,a.aa 	 $ 799 

w,,,„„ 

Vegetable Oil 

,, 	$ 1 09  
Del Monte 	 Kellogg's 	 Sreaa's SPMM 

	

Tomato Ketchup 	Frosted Flakes 	Margarine 	, Shurfine Crackers 

, 	::. 	38c 

	

98C 	':::' 	5 249  ' r?n 	$1 49  ' 	- 
Delta Towels 

-,:-. 	215 1 

BLUE BELL ASSORTED 

ICE CREAM 

$299  

WiarkESERVES IN Ol $ 
129 

MORRISON S AS37 

POUCH MIXES 	SAL3to, $ 1 00 14 1212. SUITCASE 

users 

VIENNA SAUSAGE.2.. $ 1" 

WAFFLE SYRUP TH 02 $ " 

FlIFFED OLIVES 	naz. $ 1 29  

BUCK PEPPER 	 

FROSTED FLAKES .0. $ 2 39  

Clitig FLAKES 	UBE ° 149 
SUNLIGHT PRE IMICF0 NO TI HOOIDIPOWNEN 

 DISHWASHER DETERGENTso oz 'L"' 
PRE IMMO II II EI!HMASHING 

LIQUID LUX 
ili516 1311CKEN000011 	

10.e OZ 5 FOR $ 2 00  
PRICE 

	 IS OZ 45 0  
PCNIC6SAVili WA HAGS 	

9.39 0  
11101MORINIPS8SPRINGJ 

DISTILLED WATER DATED. $ 2 1 9  
F[166111' 

	...A, 99' 
SWUM! 

PORK & BEANS ,NOG 3 FOR 100 

100? $1
49 OAT THINS 

SHURFINE SUGAR NON 8 199 

(01510 HM1110318 RIMMISN 

CRUNCHY DILLS 	AIM, $ 1 99  
WISHNONf ASSI 

SALAD DRESSING 	89 0  
OFI MONTI 

TOMATO SAUCE 	4 101 101 
$1 00 

gaiariG 	„a 1 29  
CANNA IION ASS I 

BREAKFAST BARS 	$ 1" 
DOW AFRO001 

BATHROOM CLEANER,. $ 1 49  
CARUS OR IABLITS 

ADVIL 	le et He 4 3 99  

ciiiiii" PASTE 	4a44,4 1 49 

IIMISASOL ASV 

SHAVE CREAM 	11 00 99° 

24 12 07 SUITCASE 

MILLER LITE BEER 

$ 1 095  

OLD MILWAUKEE 
SR OLD MIL LIGHT 

'8'9  

21201 • 12 PACK SR DOT T LES 

BUDWEISER 
OR BUD LIGHT 

$ 1 0 95  

000, 99' 

NABISCO SPASMS 

-- 

Italidn 

Purple Plums 
lb. 	39< 

Caldorone 
Fancy Valencia 

Oranges 
lb. 	59 

Red Delicious 

Apples 
3 lb 
bag 	99 < 

  

resh 
.,,,,,,ere, 

White 
Mushrooms 

8 az pkg .  

99c 

U.S.No I 
East Texas 

Sweet 
Potatoes 

49 

  

Home Grown 
Okra 

Zucchini 
Squash 

  

    

Since 
1927 3fthri ► re,s flirat fillarltrt 

304 N Main, Muenster, 759.4211 	AFFILIATED 

DOUBLE COUPONS EVERY DAY! 
Prices Effective Sept. 25 thru Sept. 30 
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