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Jan . 8 at Follett

Gruver opens district
by Bob Bort

Gruver teams opened their 1991 
district season at Follett Tuesday, 
Jan. 8. The Greyhounds won 69-54 
and the Lady Hounds won 65-59. 
The JV girls also claimed a win, 
but the score was unavailable at 
press time.

Coach Mike Banks provided 
details of the exciting conclusion of 
the girls’ game.

Gruver led by five points with 30 
seconds to go, but Follett hit a 
3-pointer to cut the lead to two 
pcirfc w*th 21 <JOPnnds to an The

Lady Hounds got the ball in, and 
Anissa Ryan was fouled and hit the 
front end of a one-and-one.

Follett got the rebound off the se­
cond shot, but Ryan stole the ball 
and was fouled again. Again, she 
hit the front end of the one-and-one 
to give Gruver a four-point lead.

Follett rebounded the second 
Ryan free throw and threw a long 
pass but Traci Crawford stole it 
and threw it to Ryan, who hit Holly 
Venneman under the basket for the 
final two points.

Record falls to 7-13 . . .

Lynx drop two
The Lynx Varsity dropped to 7-13 

with a loss at Dalhart on Saturday 
and the loss to Stratford on Tues­
day.

Despite a 17 point effort by Brian 
Beck, who lead all scorers, the 
Lynx lost to Dalhart by a score of 
46-59. This game was postponed 
from Friday because of inclement 
weather.

On Tuesday the Lynx traveled to 
Stratford for their district opener. 
According to Lynx Coach Wendell 
Neff, the Elks played probably 
their best game to overcome the 
Lynx 47-53.

Neff went on to say that the Lynx 
team playltl very well and should 
have won tne game. The Lynx were 
trailing the Elks by only one point 
going into the fourth quarter, hav­

ing climbed out of a 9 point hole 
from the first quarter.

With about four minutes left in 
the fourth quarter, the Lynx team 
was hit with two technical fouls and 
a one on one personal foul. Out of a 
possible 8 points of free throws, the 
Elks converted 7. The Lynx were 
unable to close the gap during the 
rest of the game.

At Dalhart, Sat.
Score: Sprm: 46 - Dal. 59 

Scoring: Cody Pipkin-9, Brian 
Beck-15, Khris Kelp-4, Alan 
Howell-1, Tim Kizziar-4, Joel 
Shields-7, Shawn Ta|iner-7.

At StratforJ Tues.
Score: Sprm. *  - Stra. 53 

Scoring: Pipkin-9, Beck-15, 
Kelp-4, Howell-1, K izziar-4, 
Shields-7, Tanner-7.

S p e a rm a n  Lynx A la n  H o w e ll (32) caps o ff  a t>'i«*.®line d rive  
w ith  an u n d e rh a n d  la y u p  T im  Kizziar (40) an d  S h a w n  I d in e r  
(44) p rep are  to  c o v e r th e  re b o u n d

Lynxettes win
Truck accident results 

in city power outage

G e ro n im o  O rte g a  (24) p u lls  up on  a H o u n d  fa s t b re a k  and  
s in k s  a  10 fo o t ju m p  sh o t.

According to city manager . . .

The Varsity Lynxettes got their 
new year and district race off to 
good starts by winning their first 
two games of the new year.

The Lynxettes opened the new 
year with a 44-36 win over Dalhart 
on Saturday. The Lynxettes were 
lead in scoring by Joy Gafford and 
Tamri Townsen who both scored a 
game high 16 points.

On Tuesday, January 8, the 
Lynxettes traveled to Stratford for 
their district opener. Despite a slow 
start, the Lynxettes were able to 
overcome a 14-2 point deficit at the

end of the first quarter, to beat the 
Elks 44-37.

The Lynxettes were lead in scor­
ing by Jill Lusby with 13 points and 
I^aura Pearson with 12 points.

At Dalhart, Sat.
Score: Sprm. 44 - Dal. 36

Scoring: Bonnie Thompson-3, Jill 
Lusby-4, Gwen Benson-1, 
Gafford-16, Townsen-16, Kyla 
Nelson-4.

At Stratford, Tues.
Score: Sprm. 44 - Str. 37

Scoring: Lasater-2, Lusby-13,
Gafford-10. Townsen-7, Pearson-12.

A non injury truck accident Fri­
day, Jan. 4 caused a power outage 
for parts of Hansford County, in­
cluding most of Spearman.

According to Texas Department 
of Public Safety Trooper Ed 
Longoria, a truck knocked down 
two power poles 2.3 miles east of 
Spearman and disrupted electrical 
service to the area.

Longoria reported that Dwayne 
Kummell of Lahoma, Okla. fell 
asleep at the wheel of a 1988 Peter-

bilt tractor, pulling a grain trailer. 
The vehicle swerved off the road 
and as he tried to maneuver the 
truck back onto the road, the trailer 
struck two utility poles belonging to 
North Plains Electric. The poles 
were knocked down, resulting in an 
interruption of electrical power to 
parts of Hansford County.

According to Longoria, the acci­
dent occurred at 6:45 a.m. Friday. 
Power in Spearman went out at 
about the same time, but was 
restored about 7:35 a.m.

TNP rate increase would result in higher city service fees for residents
According to Jim Murray, Spear­

man city manager, if Texas-New 
Mexico Power Company is granted 
the rate increase for which it is ask­
ing, the City of Spearman will have 
to raise its taxes and its service 
fees.

Murray indicated that if TNP 
receives its requested $54.9 million 
rate increase, the city’s electric 
rate will increase by 20 percent. To 
recoup the proposed rate increase 
the city would have to raise taxes at 
least 1 cent per $100 evaluation. He 
went on to state that the rate in­
crease would also affect the city’s 
rate structure for sewer and water 
secvices.

Murray indicated that the pro­
posed rate increase for the Spear­
man wastewater plant would in­
crease the city’s cost of power by 
$4,600 per year. Furthermore, he 
stated, the city’s water production 
cost would increase by $11,400.

Sewer service rates would have 
to increase by 4 percent to recoup 
the proposed electric rate increase. 
Water service rates would have to 
increase by 2 percent to offset the 
rate increase.

According to the city’s news 
release the Public Utility Commis­
sion of Texas (PUCT) is meeting 
Wednesday, Jan. 19 to decide how 
much of a rate increase to grant 
TNP. Spearman is part of a 22-city 
coalition which is asking the PUCT 
to disallow the rate increase, or at 
least to reduce it.

In the news release Murray in­
dicated that citizens can join with 
the city governments in protesting 
this rate increase by contacting the 
commissioners on the PUCT in 
writing. Murray lists the following 
address for writing to the PUCT:
Public Utility Commission of Texas 
7800 Shoal Creek Blvd.
Suite 400N 
Austin TX 78757 
Re: Docket No. 9491

Murray later indicated that peo­
ple can FAX their feelings to the 
PUCT. Their FAX number is 
(512)475-3707.

Twenty-two cities that are served 
by Texas-New Mexico Power Com­
pany have joined forces and arc 
contesting the rate case. The City 
of Spearman is participating with 
the other cities in this rate case. 
The cities have employed the law 
firm of Butler & Casstevens, ac­

counting and management firm of 
Reed-Stowe & Co. and a rate of 
return expert in the firm of Diver­
sified Utility Consultants, Inc. 
These three firms have reviewed 
and investigated the information 
filed by TNP with the PUCT since 
April 1990.

The cities’ consultants have 
reported the following highlights of 
the rate case:

1) The Company is requesting ap­
proximately $54.9 million annual 
rate increase which is a 17.42 per­
cent increase. The reason for such 
a large rate increase is that the 
Company is requesting rate 
recognition for the TNP ONE Unit I 
plant. The TNP ONE Unit I plant is 
a lignite coal fired generating sta­
tion located in Robertson County, 
Texas. Company officials have 
stated that the Unit II plant will be 
included in a rate case in the very 
near future and that request is 
estimated to be about $48 million in 
addition to the Unit I case. The end 
result is that in the Unit I case the 
Company is proposing to charge 
the ratepayer 8 cents per Kwh to 
replace 3.5 cents per Kwh purchas­
ed power.

2) Consultants for the cities have 
taken the position in this case that 
rates should be reduced by approx­
imately $18.8 million. The reason 
for the rate reduction is that the 
Company does not own the TNP 
ONE facility. Therefore, TNP ONE 
Unit l should not be included in rate 
base. The Company is of the opi­
nion that even though its investors, 
i.e. stockholders and bondholders, 
have no investment in TNP ONE, 
they still should be allowed a return 
on this plant even though a sub­
sidiary of the Company, Texas 
Generating Company (“TGC” ) 
owns this facility. The cities have 
taken the position that inclusion of 
this facility in rate base is not ap­
propriate because Company in­
vestors do not have an investment 
in these facilities. The cities do not 
question that if and when Company 
investors do invest, this facility wiil 
lx* eligible for rate base inclusion.

3) The Company was required by 
law to apply for a certificate of con- 
wmonceand necessity (CCN) from 
PUCT before they started construc­
tion of TNP ONE Unit I. The CCN 
was granted by the PUCT. 
However, the PUCT decision was 
appealed to District Court in Travis

County and remanded by the court 
back to the PUCT. Cities are nor­
mally not participants in certifica­
tion cases because they have no 
jurisdiction over certificates. The 
cities were not a party in the 
original CCN hearings that were 
held in August 1987, but they did in­
tervene in the remanded case 
before the PUCT on August 30,1990. 
Despite all of the furor from the 
Commissioners about how bad the 
Robertson County Plant is for 
ratepayers, the Commission still 
voted to grant a CCN. The Commis­
sioners asserted that their hands 
were tied and they had no other 
choice because of the Commis­
sion’s decision to grant the CCN in 
1987.

The one dissenting Commis­
sioner, Peggy Resson, in the 1987 
CCN case wrote the following:

“ TNP did not give enough 
serious consideration to show that 
the cost of power from the proposed 
plant would be less than the cost of 
power purchased, TNP failed to 
demonstrate that it could generate 
power at a lower cost to its 
ratepayers than the cost of utility 
generated power ... the record does 
not support by a preponderance of 
the evidence the conclusion that 
TNP’s proposed plant is preferable 
to the available alternatives.”

“To fully appreciate the error 
committed by the majority in this 
case, one must recall the underly­
ing intent of the 1983 amendment to 
the Public Utility Regulatory Act. 
The clear intent of the Legislature 
was to encourage the utilization of 
conservation and alternative 
energy sources and to discourage 
massive capital outlays for poorly- 
conceived or unnecessary con­
structions, construction which 
would ultimately result in un­
necessary, and in some instances, 
intolerable, expense for a utility- 
audits ratepayers.”

4) Prudence issues: a) The 
prudence issue in this case that the 
cities support is that the decision to 
construct their facility was in fact 
imprudent and have recommended 
a disallowance of approximately 
$116 million for each of the two 
units. TNP can purchase power at 
3.5 cents per Kwh but is proposing 
to charge 8.0 cents per Kwh. If 
TNP’s proposed summer rate were 
in place at this time TNP would 
have the highest residential rates

per 1,000 Kwh of usage in Texas.
b) The most extensively litigated 

issue in this case was the issue of 
cost overruns for this project. 
When TNP originally filed for a 
CCN to construct TNP ONE Unit I 
it estimated that the cost of Unit I 
would be approximately $1,253 per 
Kw of capacity . What was 
established in this case is the cost 
of Unit I that the Company is re­
questing is not their estimated 
$1,253 per Kw of capacity but 
rather $2,397 per Kw of capacity. 
Thus, on a capacity basis the final 
plant cost is about 91 percent more 
costly than TNP estimated back in

1987. No documentation has been 
produced to explain this cost over­
run.

c) TNP ratepayers are being ask­
ed to pay for a generating plant 
which TNP does not even own. The 
plant is owned by another sub­
sidiary of TNP.

d) When the Company selected 
the contractor for the construction 
project it only received one quote 
for the proposed work. The con­
tract that was entered into was bas­
ed on a cost-plus concept.

e) TNP selected a fluidized bed 
technology to generate the power of

the Robertson County plant. The 
selected technology is not tried and 
proven in the United States. Cities 
maintain that this technology has 
only been proved in Europe and our 
ratepayers should not be forced to 
pay for proving the technology in 
the United States.

f) The customers of TNP in the 
Panhandle area would never 
receive one Kw out of the Robert­
son County plant. Our area grid 
system does riot have the capability 
to take power off the grid system 
where the power will be generated 
in Robertson County, Texas.

TN P Y P  questions figures
Jack Chamber, sector vice presi­

dent of revenue production for 
Texas-New Mexico Power Com­
pany, in a phone interview outlined 
the reasons why the company is 
asking for rate increase at this 
time.

In the sam e conversation  
Chamber took exception to some of 
the statements contained in a news 
release from Jim Murray, Spear­
man city manager.

Chamber began by saying that in 
1985 the decision to build the power 
plant in Robertson County was 
made based on two things. One was 
that power companies supplying 
electricity to the area had raised 
their rates 500 to 700 percent in the 
11 years prior to 1985.

The second was what TNP could 
do to ensure that enough electrical 
power would be available to meet 
the needs of its customers in the 
next 20 to 25 years.

Chamber said to ensure that TNP 
customers would have all the 
power they would need at a 
reasonable cost, the company 
decided that building its own 
genera ting  fac ilitie s  was 
necessary. They entered into a con- 
t ra c t  with H.B. Zackery , 
Westinghouse and Combustion 
Engineering to build four fossil fuel 
powered generating units in 
Robertson County. According to 
Chamber the contracts were in ef­
fect in 1986 to 1987.

The c o n tra c ts  w ere la te r  
modified to reduce the number of 
generating units to two. According

to Chamber, TNP took possession 
of the first unit in June 1990, and 
will take possession of the second 
unit in the summer of 1991.

As to the cost of construction of 
these two plants and their ability to 
supply power to the Panhandle 
area, Chamber takes exception to 
certain claims made by involved 
cities.

First of all, Chamber said he did 
not know where the city advisors 
got their figures, but the TNP 
original figures for construction 
costs per maximum kilowatt hour 
production was $1,700. He went on 
to say the TNP rate increase re­
quest only takes into account a 
$2,200 per kilowatt hour conduction 
cost.

He further stated that tests of the 
Unit 1 generator show it is capable 
of exceeding its guaranteed max­
imum kilowatt output by 25 per­
cent. This means that after the 
guarantee on the facility runs out, 
TNP will be able to run the plant at 
a higher production rate. This will 
reduce the construction cost per 
kilowatt hour ratio even more.

When asked if TNP had plans to 
reduce user rates in the fulure to 
reflect this reduction, Chamber 
said no formal plans had been 
made.

The other figure to which 
Chamber took exception was the 
cities’ comparisons of kilowatt cost 
for purchased power. He maintain­
ed the cities’ 3.5 cent figure 
represents the lowest possible 
figure, and not an average or the

highest it could be. He explained, 
saying the price of electrical power 
is based on the demand and 
availability of the power. The 3 5 
cents per kilowatt hour cost is only 
available during the lowest de­
mand periods. According to 
Chamber, these times do not occur 
very often.

Chamber did not have a kilowatt 
cost figure of his own but he did 
confirm the cities’ 8 cent figure for 
the Robertson County facilities.

As to the cities’ contention that 
the power generated by the Robert­
son County units could not be used 
by the Panhandle ratepayers, 
Chamber said this is not true. He 
said that for company accounting 
purposes the plants are listed 
separate from the Panhandle area, 
but when the power from the plants 
flows into the grid it is available to 
the entire system.

He went on to say that contracts 
with other power companies 
obligate those other companies to 
supply power to the Panhandle 
area based on the amount of power 
used from the Robertson County 
facilities.

Chamber summed up TNP’s 
position by saying that the cost of 
bringing new power plants on line 
is the highest expense a power 
company faces. Even though the 
rate increase being requested now 
will make the TNP rate one of the 
highest in Texas, it will come down 
in ranking as the other power com­
panies have to build new plants and 
bring them on line.
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At tile movies . . I Spiritually Speaking || |
Skate Night Winners in  L im b o  S a tu rd a y .  J a n  ia <  H j

“ Mr. Destiny” stars James 
Belushi as Larry Burrows, a man 
who on his 35th birthday is suffer­
ing from a nagging sense of failure.

He has a nice but unremarkable 
wife, a nice but unremarkable 
home, a nice but unremarkable 
best friend and a nice but 
unremarkable job. He can’t help 
reeling certain that his life should 
have been better.

And he can’t help feeling certain 
that his downward spiral began the 
moment he struck out in a crucial 
Little League baseball game 20 
years earlier.

Enter Mike (Michael Caine), a 
mysterious stranger who offers to 
show Larry how his life would have 
tur ned out if he had hit that ball. 
Now Larry is president of his com­
pany, wealthy beyond belief and

BLHNE ELECTRIC 
& CONSTRUCTION

Electrical Repairs 
& Handy Man Service 

Reasonable Rates

CALL 659-3404

married to the boss’s knockout 
daughter. And y e t ...

With Mike’s help, Larry figures 
out that in comparison, his life is 
really a good one after all.

The film is rated PG-13 for mild 
language.

Chucky the “Good Guy” doll, 
possessed by the sp ir it  of 
psychopathic strangler Charles 
Lee Ray, came to a bad end in 
“Child’s Play,” and no one was a 
bit sorry.

“Child’s Play 2” opens with 
Chucky’s resurrection by a team of 
technicians working for the 
manufacturers of Good Guy dolls. 
The salvage operation goes along 
with no problem until a pair of 
technicians replace Chucky’s eyes, 
only to be electrocuted in a freak 
accident(?)

Within hours Chucky is on the 
loose again, with just one thing on 
his mind: to find young Andy (Alex 
Vincent) and steal his soul so that 
he - the Charles I>ee Ray he, that is - 
can start life afresh in a new body.

“Child’s Play 2” contains some 
very effective scares. Chucky is a 
creepy thing, swearing, scurrying 
and reaching out from all those 
scary places (under the bed, 
beneath the stairs) to get you when 
you’re not looking. It’s even occa­
sionally genuinely clever.

The film is rated R.

Now Ploying At 
The Ljyric Theatre

i</h
Fri. - Tue. Nights 

Bargain Nights Mon. & Tue. All
Scrnn 1 - 8:00

Seats $3
Screen 2 - 7:45

Mr. Destiny
Starring Jim Belushi

I 13 M a in ,  S pearman

by Russ Gibbs 
Pastor, First Baptist Church

My wife is reading a book by Bar­
bara Johnson entitled Stick a 
Geranium in Your Hat and Be Haj>-
py! The title was intriguing so I 
picked it up and glanced at the 
Table of Contents. Some of the 
chapter titles 1 discovered were: 
“Pain Is Inevitable, but Misery Is 
Optional,” “It’s Always Darkest

Pringlp-
Morse

LUNCH
Monday, Jan. 14 - Teacher in-

service. No school.
Tuesday, Jan. 15 - Corn dogs or 

burritos, chili, french fries, broc­
coli and rice casserole, fruit, milk 

Wednesday, Jan. 16 - Turkey and 
gravy, mashed potatoes, corn, 
salad, hot rolls, apple pie, milk 

Thursday, Jan. 17 - Meat loaf, 
ravioli, buttered potatoes, green 
beans, raw vegetable tray, wheat 
rolls, jello/fruit, milk 

Friday, Jan. 18 - Pizza, tater tots, 
salad, fruit, ice cream, milk

BREAKFAST
Tuesday, Jan. 15 - Pancakes,

sausage, juice, milk 
Wednesday, Jan. 16 - Honey buns, 

toast, juice, milk 
Thursday, Jan. 17 - Muffins, 

cheese toast, juice, milk 
Friday, Jan. 18 - Biscuits & 

sausage, juice, milk

Just Before it Goes Totally Black,” 
“I Feel So Much Better Now That 
I’ve Given Up Hope,” “I Can Han­
dle Any Crisis - I’m a Mother,” and 
“Wrinkles Are God’s Little Way of 
Saying...‘I’m Stepping On Your 
Face.”

At first I thought this was another 
Erma Bombeck type book until I 
read a little closer. Mrs. Johnson is 
the survivor of four painful, 
devastating experiences. Her hus­
band was in a near-fatal accident 
and slowly recovered from severe, 
debilitating injuries. She lost one 
son in Vietnam, another son to a 
drunk driver and a third to the 
homosexual lifestyle. Plus, she was 
recently diagnosed with adult-onset 
diabetes. This is a woman who 
understands pain and suffering, yet 
she has found hope and joy through 
her faith in God.

The preface states “We can 
choose to gather to our hearts the 
thorns of disappointment, failure, 
loneliness, and dismay due to our 
present situation, or we can gather 
the flowers of God’s grace, unboun­
ding love, abiding presence, and 
unmatched joy. I choose to gather 
the flowers, and I hope you will, 
too.”

No one knows w hat c ir ­
cumstances and trials 1991 may br­
ing. My prayer for you is that you 
would face each crisis with the 
same spirit and faith expressed by 
the Psalmist...“ I would have lost 
heart, unless I had believed that I 
would see the goodness of the Lord. 
in the land of the living. Wait on the/ 
Lord: be of good courage, and He 
shall strengthen your heart; wait, 
say, on the Lord!” Psalm 27:13-14j

S k a te  N ig h t  W in n e r s  in  L im b o  S a tu rd a y .  J a n  r'  a ' '>'* ^
C e n te r  w e re  B r .a n n e  B u r k h a m m e ' a n d  N a ta s h a  B u rc h .  M a s o n  K u e M  w a s  th e
w in n e r  o f  a  f re e  p a ir  o f  s k a te s .

" H e a r t  a n d  /  V  is  th e  th e m e  fo r  th e  H a n s fo r d  C o u n ty  A m e r ic a n  H e a r t
Association’s anneal fundraising banquet, s e t  fo r  S a tu rd a y ,  J a n  a  p . .
in  th e  S p e a rm a n  H ig h  S c h o o l  c a fe te r ia  T h e  b a n q u e t  w i l l  c o n s is t  o f  a  s te a k  
d in n e r  p r e p a re d  b y  th e  S p e a rm a n  J .C  s. fo l lo w e d  b y  a n  a r t  a u c  io n  . o n a  
t io n  o f  $ 2 5  w i l l  b e  a c c e p te d  fo r  e a c h  t i c k e t  to  th e  f u n d r a is e r  F o r  m o r e  in f o r ­
m a t io n  o r  to  o b ta in  t i c k e t s ,  c a l l  J u n e  B a rk le y  a t 7 3 3 -2 5 9 2 , C a r la  G u m  o r y  a  
7 3 3 -2 0 5 0 . R o s e m a ry  B ro w n  a t 6 5 9  3 0 7 9 . o r  M ic h e le  D a v is  a t 6 5 9 -3 4 1 1 .

A n y o n e  in te r e s te d  in  a t te n d in g  a 3 0 -h o u r  h o s p ic e  p a t ie n t  c a re  v o lu n te e r
t r a in in g  c la s s  s h o u ld  c a l l  V e rn a  L e e  S h ir le y  a t 6 5 9 5 5 6 5  d u r in g  th e  d a y , 
6 5 9 -3 2 1 4  a t n ig h t ,  o r  C a r o ly n  H ic k s  a t 7 3 3 -2 3 3 5 .

Churn hpr Chatter
h\ Brett Whitford
We hope that everyone had a 

very Happy Holiday! Things are 
really getting busy here at the 
Chamber of Commerce. We are 
looking forward to a great 1991! 
1990 will be hard to beat but we can 
do it!

As you have read or heard, the 
nomination forms for 1990 Citizen 
of the Year and Citizen Over the 
Years are out. If you need one, 
please drop by the Chamber office 
and pick one up. These are due 
back in the office no later than Fri­
day, Jan. 18 at 5 p.m. Get your 
nomination in soon! We know that 
there have been many hard 
workers who need to be recognized 
in our community. Spearman is so 
lucky to have so many good people 
that are proud of their town and 
who will go the extra mile to do 
something to help! Thanks to 
everyone who does.

B U IL T -IN  E N E R G Y  F IT N E S S
ENHANCED INSULATION 

INHl T*A TION BARRIERS

EFFICIENT 
HEATING &
COOLING  

/  EQUIPMENT

*Compared to the same 
home built to current 
construction practices. 
Oa/90

A Good Cents home has special features built in to en­
sure that it’s Energy Fit ... so you can cut your energy 
use for heating and cooling by at least 30 percent. *

You’ll find high efficiency heating and cooling systems, 
well-insulated walls, attics and doors and specially 
designed windows all working in harmony to save you 
money. For more information about the comfort and 
savings of Good Cents, ask your builder or call your 
nearest Texas-New Mexico Power Company office.

N ew M exico
P ow er G xnpany.

Attend the Church of YOUR Choice!
Prim era M ission Bautista

502 E. 7th 659-3991 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m.
Pastor Jose Rauda Perez

First Assem bly of God
401 N. Bernice 659-2295 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 10:45 a.m.
Evening Worship 7 p.m. 
Wednesday Worship 7 p.m. 
Pastor Ray Cook

Church of Christ
1101 S. Bernice 659-2252 
(Faith Lutheran Church)
Sunday Bible Class 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 10:30 a.m.
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m.
Bible Study Wed. 7:30 p.m. 
KRDF Radio Program 
Living With Christ 7:50 a.m. M-F 
Minister John Scott

In Spearman
Fellow ship  Baptist

1102 S. Archer 659-2783 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship 7:30 p.m. 
Wed. Evening 7:30 
Pastor Ron Fox

First United M ethodis t Church
407 S. Haney 695-5503 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Worship 11:00 a.m.
Worship/Study 7:00 p.m.
Youth Wed. 7 p.m.& Sun. 6 p.m. 
Pastor Todd Dyess

Aposto lic  Faith Church
822 S. Dressen 659-2870 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6:30 p.m. 
Wed. Prayer Meeting 7 p.m. 
Pastor Lealand Grimmer

First Christian Church
Disciples of Christ 
29 S. Bernice 659-2036 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Worship 10:50 a.m.
Women’s Bible Study Wed. 2 p.m. 
Youth Wed. 6 p.m. k  Sun 5 p.m. 
Pastor LaVern Draper

Union Church
31 S. Endicott 659-2544 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 10:45 a.m.
Sun. Evening 6:30 
Interim Pastor Geo. Bollinger

Sacred Heart Catholic  Church 
901 Roland 659-2166 
Sat. Night Mass 7:00 p.m. 
Sunday Mass 9:30 a.m.
C.C.D. Sunday 10:30 a.m. 
Spanish Bible Study Fri. 8 p.m. 
Father Norbert Kieferle

Devotional
Ecclesiates 3:1-8 NIV

There is a season for everything 
and a season for everything under 
heaven:
a time to be born and a time to die, 
a time to plant and a time to uproot, 
a time to kill and a time to heal, 
a time to tear down and a time to 
build,
a time to weep and a time to laugh, 
a time to mourn and a time to 
dance
a time to scatter stones and a time 
to gather them,
a time to embrace and a time to 
refrain,
a time to keep and a time to throw 
away,
a time to be slient and a time to 
speak,
a time to love and a time to hate, 
a time for war and a time for
peace- |n M orse

First Baptist Church of M orse
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening Worship 7 p.m. 
Pastor Terry Austin

In G ru ver

Church of Christ
209 King 733-2760 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 10:20 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6:00 p.m. 
Wed. Eve. 7:30 p.m. 
Minister Harold Sneed

C om m unity  Bible Church  
(In terdenom inational)

Hwy. 15 733-2838 
Sunday School 10 a.m.
Worship 11 a.m.
Sunday Evening 6:30 
Wednesday 7 p.m.
Pastor Zane Gray

First Baptist Church
123 N. Bernice 659-5557 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m.
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
24 Hr. Prayer 659-2911 
Pastor Russ Gibbs

Faith Lutheran Church  
1021 Cotter 659-2033 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m.
KRDF Program Sun. 9 a.m. 
Pastor Rev. Samuel Steele

First Presbyterian Church  
| 1021 Cotter 659-2033 
i Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 11:00 a.m.
KRDF Program Sun. 9 a.m. 
Pastor Rev. Samuel Steele

I Word of Life C om m unity  Church 
(In terdenom inational)

11105 S. Roland 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Sun. Morning Service 10:45 a.m. 
Sun. Eve. Service 6:30 p.m.
Wed. Eve. Service 7 p.m.
Interim Pastor Merle Davis

Ifought to you by these Fine Hansford Businesses

Box w e ll Brothers  
Funeral D irectors

5 1 9  Evans 
S p ea rm an

Hagerman’s Service 
1213 Hwy. 15

553-5131

GRUVER STATE BANK

IU‘\ >imH

^ i/? lean ers
DAN DESIMONE OWNER

•  P.O.Box 1017 •  207 Main S».

Phono 659 3122 

SPEARMAN. TEXAS 79081

K e rry  L. H enton

/O S

7 S S - 2 M

I)r. L a u m u r  fM iney 
702 A Roland 
650-2846

l»r. Chart* Km*.
721 S. A rcher 

639-3395

«fier bourn 650-2535

Stand Firm 
Christian Book Store 
322 Main Gruver 

733-5124

H an sfo rd  C ounty  
Reporter-

S ta tesm an

First Christian Church
510 King 733-2960 
Sunday School 10 a.m. 
Worship 11 a.m.
Wed. Bible Study 7:30 p.m. 
Youth Wed. 6:30 p.m.
Pastor Gary Gumfory

First Baptist Church
402 E. Broadway 733-2411 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 10:50 a.m.
Disciple Training Sunday 6 p.m. 
unday Eve. 7 p.m.

Youth Happening Wed.6:30 p.m. 
Prayer Meeting Wed. 7 p.m. 
Pastor Larry Miller

O slo Lutheran Church  
(ELCA)

West of Gruver
On Hwy 15 & N. FM 1162
339-7709
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship 11 a.m.
Pastor Nate Hanson

First United M ethodis t Churchj
Broadway & Garrett 733-2651 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Worship 8:30 & 10:55 a.m.
Sun. Evening 6 p.m.
UMY 6 p.m.
Pastor Lewis Holland

I

The Chamber Banquet is fastly 
approaching. It is set for Saturday, 
Feb. 2 at the Spearman High School 
Cafeteria. Our featured speaker is 
Cowboy Jack otherwise known as 
Dr. Stan Cobb. We will also be 
entertained by our own Miss 
Hansford County, Misty Savage 
and the talents of our own Gwen 
Benson. Gwen is a talented young 
singer that has made a couple of 
records and has performed in 
Nashville. Tickets will go on sale 
this week. Call the Chamber office 
to get yours. Prices are $12.50 for 
Chamber members and $15.00 for 
non-members.

By the way, we would be more 
than happy to have you as a 
member of our Chamber, whether 
individual or business. Give me a 
call and I will be more than happy 
to visit with you about it! Join and 
support your Chamber, it works for 
you and Spearman. Remember, 
Spearman IS someplace special!

Hospital notes
ADMISSIONS

Thursday, Jan. 3: Edna Largent, 
Lester Slaten, Leland Cook 

Friday, Jan. 4: Will Douglas 
Saturday, Jan. 5: Viola George 
Sunday, Jan. 6: Marie Crawford 
Tuesday, Jan. 8: Owen Mon­

tgomery
DISMISSALS

Thursday, Jan. 3: Cindy Sasser, 
Tyler Rex, Mary Gillispie 

Friday, Jan. 4: Nova Foot, Edna 
Largent, Leland Cook 
Sunday, Jan. 6: Will Douglas 

Monday, Jan. 7: Viola George, 
Lelan Close, Bill Henderson 

Patients in the hospital are Marie 
Crawford, Mavis Collins, Donald 
Hartranft, Lester Slaten, Andrew 
Bort and Owen Montgomery

WEATHER
Day Hi Lo Precip

Fri 26 16 0.00
Sat 33 22 0.00
Sun 25 18 0.00
Mon 32 18 0.00
Tue 34 27 0.00
Wed — — 0.00
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J im m y  a n d  G a il V a n la n d in g h a m  o f S p e a rm a n  a n n o u n c e  th e  
e n g a g e m e n t an d  a p p ro a c h in g  m a rria g e  o f th e ir  d a u g h te r, 
K a th y , to  R o b e rt S te p h e n s o n  o f A m a rillo , so n  o f R o n  an d  
J e a n n e  S te p h e n s o n . T h e  b r id e -e le c t is th e  g ra n d d a u g h te r  of 
M r. a n d  M rs . J .C . V a n la n d in g h a m  a n d  M r. a n d  M rs . M .L . C o l­
lin s . S h e  a tte n d e d  P a n h a n d le  S ta te  U n iv e rs ity  a t G o o d w e ll, 
O k la . and  is p re s e n tly  a s tu d e n t a t W e s t T e x a s  S ta te  U n iv e rs i­
ty  a t C a n y o n . T h e  p ro s p e c tiv e  g ro o m ’s g ra n d p a re n ts  a re  M r. 
and  M rs . A n th o n  W o o d s  and  M rs . L o u is e  S te p h e n s o n . H e  a lso  
a tte n d e d  PSU an d  is p re s e n tly  a t te n d in g  W T S U . T h e  c o u p le  
p lan s  a M a rc h  16 w e d d in g , to  be  h e ld  at 3 p .m . in  th e  
A s s e m b ly  of G o d  C h u rc h  in S p e a rm a n . T h e y  w ill re s id e  in  C a ­
n yo n  fo llo w in g  th e ir  w e d d in g .

Club News
HEARTS & HANDS

Hansford County Hearts and 
Hands, an auxiliary for certified 
hospice patient care volunteers, 
held its monthly meeting Dec. 17 in 
the First State Bank Hospitality 
Room in Spearman.

Those attending the meeting 
from Gruver were Opal Wallin, 
Alice Peddy, Connie Gammill and 
Carolyn Hicks.

Also attending were Pearl 
Pierce, Jettie Davis, Travis and 
Lana Pattison, Cleo Denman, 
Carolyn Taylor, Jeanette Allen,

Obituary-----
Floyd Wesley Sheets

HOLLIS, Okla. - Floyd Wesley 
Sheets, 70, died Saturday, Jan. 5.

Mr. Sheets was born in Spear­
man. He was a resident of the 
Guymon, Okla. area from 1945 to 
1982, moving to Gould, Okla., 
where he w ?. custodian for the 
Gould schools. He m arried  
LaVerne Weatherford in 1942 at 
Guymon. He was a member of the 
Hollis Church of Christ. He was 
preceded in death by his parents, a 
brother, Leroy Sheets, and an in­
fant brother.

Survivors include his wife; four 
daughters, Gail Cansler of Gould, 
Winnell Whitehead of Dale, Okla., 
Luann Burford of Drummond, 
Okla. and Joyce Allen of Quanah; 
six brothers, Daniel Sheets, S.B.

We need you.

Altha Groves, Mable Wisian, 
Charla Roberts, Colene Brummett, 
Jack McWhirter, Edith Womble, 
Garland Hopper, Jo Linda Hut­
chison, Betty Pugh, Cyndi and 
David Pearson, Kim Sherlock, 
Brenda Wall, John Scott, Hazel 
Shieldknight, Betty Jean Davis, 
Eloise Renner, Verna Lee Shirley, 
and Charlette Jackson all from 
Spearman.

The next meeting will be held in 
the Gruver State Bank La Casita 
Room in Gruver Jan. 21 at 7:00 
p.m. All meetings are open to all in­
terested persons.

Sheets and Claude Sheets Jr., all of 
Spearm an, M artin Sheets of 
Bracketville, Branch Sheets of 
Happy and Willis Sheets of Raton, 
N.M.; four sisters, Frances Cudd of 
Spearman, Alice Johnson of Stin­
nett, Grace Harmon of Whorton 
and Zola Mitchell of Waco; and 10 
grandchildren.

Funeral services were conducted 
Tuesday, Jan. 8 in the Church of 
Christ at Hollis with Erman 
Croney, minister, and Gerald 
Stewart, minister of Guymon 
Church of Christ, officiating. Inter­
ment was in Gould Cemetery.

Morse 
Baptist 
Church sets 
film series

A six-part film series, “ From 
Christ to Constantine: The Trial 
and Testimony of the Early 
Church,” will be shown by Morse 
Baptist Church Sunday evenings, 
Jan. 20 through Feb. 24 at 7 p.m. 
For further information call 
733-2757.

The first two programs take a 
close look at how the early church 
began and how it spread in spite of 
overwhelming odds against it. Pro­
gram three examines the wide- 
ranging array  of accusations 
against the early believers - 
everything from atheism to lack of 
patriotism. The fourth program cx 
amines the repeated waves of 
persecution that were unleashed 
against. Christianity and why the 
Roman Empire considered this 
fledgling movement, with its motto 
of love, such a threat.

Program five takes up examples 
of noteworthy martyrs and how 
th e ir s to ries  were used to 
strengthen believers in times of 
duress. The final program looks at 
why the church survived and suc­
ceeded, eventually becoming the 
dominant faith of the Empire.

Each program is hosted by 
television journalist Sterift Bell, 
supported by three co-hjffts who 
arc professional al.ors W ykip in­
to various dramatic ro l^ fiac tin g  
major characters/und events of the 
times.

The programs were produced in 
consultation with an international 
team of scholars. Shooting took 
place at numerous original loca­
tions across the old Roman Empire 
where significant early church 
events occurred.

Producer Ken Curtis com­
mented, “The story of early Chris­
tianity is one of the great adventure 
stories of all time and it is par­
ticularly a story for our times 
because Christianity has had a pro­
found, and perhaps the most far- 
reaching, influence in shaping our 
Western civilization. Living in a 
time when we have so little 
perspective on our past, it is impor­
tant that we rediscover what the 
church was really like and what the 
central meaning of Christianity 
was in its earliest generations 
before it broke off into the multiple 
denominations that we have to­
day.”

The series features experts from 
v ario u s denom inational 
backgrounds and treats material 
shared by all of the major Christian 
traditions.

Volunteer.

v American Heart 
Association

American Heart 
Association

Area Eye Center
D r. B illy  N o w lin  

O p to m e tr is t  
2 0 6  M a in  6 5 9 -3 1 0 9

Hours: Tuesday 9-12 & 1-5 Friday 9-12
S elec tio n  o f F ram e s  a n d  con tact lenses  

s e rv in g  th is a re a  fo r  13 years .
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Among the Neighbors
•> Helen Fisher
In his column of January 3 in the 

Amarillo-News Globe. Bryan 
Painter featured Hadley Reed of 
Spearman.

Spearman folk have always had 
pride in Hadley, not only for his ac­
complishments on the rodeo cir­
cuit, high school, collegiate, and 
professional, but also his affability, 
modesty and exemplary character.

His friends and associates will be 
following his activities in the arena 
and wishing him the best of luck.
Hang in there, Hadley!*«*•*•*

Death touched several families 
in the county recently and sym­
pathy is extended to each. They 
were:

Ben Harris of Gruver, an early 
day settler in the county, survivors 
include many.

Leonard Latham of Perryton, 
brother of Albert Latham and uncle 
of Orville Latham.

Juanita Woodington of Pampa, 
mother of Tim Woodington,

Y.C. Lopez, Canadian, father of 
Anita Summers.

Jerald Scribner, long time resi­
dent of Spearman, many family 
member survivors.

Mona Reynolds, Sunray, many 
relatives in Gruver and a long time 
friend.

Floyd Sheets, whose obituary is 
carried elsewhere in this issue, 
brother of Frances Cudd, Daniel 
Sheets, S.B. Sheets and Claude 
Sheets, Jr. He died after heart 
surgery. Floyd was reared in this 
area and finished high school here 
in 1938 and has attended some 
school reunions.

Marie Beck, having lived here all 
her life, associates cold weather 
with Christmas but her daughter 
Shirley, having lived in the south 
for many years, prefers Christmas 
without cold weather. So for the 
first time since 1984, Shirley and 
Don Beggs and their two sons of 
Paris drove up to spend Christmas 
with her mother. The cold weather 
forced an early departure but they 
could not escape, finding freezing 
temperatures and sleet even at 
their home. Other guests of Marie’s 
for the holidays were Larry and 
Gloria Beck and son of San An­
tonio, Mr. and Mrs. Gail Beck of 
Amarillo and her children who live 
hare.

Helen and Chuck Harruff of 
Dalhart spent the weekei.d with 
their daughter, Karen and Buford 
Babitzke. They reached home safe­
ly though the icy roads and fog 
delayed them considerably.

In this column, as in the entire 
paper, special interest is in news of 
those Hansford County young peo­
ple in armed services

You are in v ite d  to  
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especially those in Saudi Arabia. 
Welcome would be any letters or 
news, and addresses will be carried 
in full for any who so desire.

Jim and Linda Beeson recently 
heard from their son, Alan, who 
was transferred from northern 
Germany near the Czeck border, to 
Saudi Arabia the early part of 
December.

Alan, grandson of Lena Beeson 
and brother of Kay, finds it a 
drastic change from the mountains 
to the deserts of Saudi Arabia. His 
parents feel that he is in good 
spirits. He refers to the country as 
“The Land of Sand.” His duties are 
in an armoured personnel carrier 
with an Armoured Cavalry Regi­
ment.

His address is: Pvt. Aian Beeson, 
458-49-8169, Operation Desert 
Shield, 3-A-1/2 ACR, APO New 
York 09759. *#*»*•*

The residents of Hansford Manor 
who had birthdays in December 
were honorees at a birthday party 
on the afternoon of December 14. 
They were Melba Williams, Edna 
Bayless, Bruce Sheets, Clara Con­
ley, Viola Hutton and Nellie 
McDonald.

Members of the Ladies Auxiliary 
who provided refreshments and ar­
rangements were Virginia Head,! 
Dorothy Haner, Mary Fern Terry 
aiai Alva Garner.

The Christmas party was held 
tm  afternoon of the 20th. Santa 

lius managed to make a pre- 
-istmas call with gifts for 

everyone. Refreshments concluded 
the festivities.

The residents were delighted that 
a number of groups of carolers call­
ed on them during the month with 
musical numbers.

New residents of the manor are 
George Graves, Corinne and Bob 
Fannin of Oklahoma, parents of 
Odell Fannin. Lucile Cook was » 
temporary resident and returned 1 
her home on Monday.

A welcome guest of Mr. and Mrs. 
Louis Lemons last week was his 
brother, Mason Lemons, of Booker. 
He had spent Christmas in Abilene 
and after leaving Spearman went 
to Harlingen. He will spend the 
winter there.

Friday ended a two week period 
of activity, hospitality and holiday 
sharing for Loree and Ira Harbour.

I r a ’s b ro thers and sis te rs  
gathered at the home of Monte and 
Marie Harbour on Friday. All but 
two were able to be present. In ad­
dition to Monte and Ira and wives, 
those attending were Leota and

l
Robin Giblin, Morse; May lee and 
I^eroy Smith, Perryton; and Avis 
and Glen Smith, Dimmitt.

During Christmas the inclement 
weather turned into a blessing, 
since outdoor activities were cur­
tailed, increased was the warmth 
and conviviality indoors. It provid­
ed wonderful companionship for 
the fam ily . The H arb o u r’s 
daughter, Ann and Russell Hind- 
marsh of Cortez, Colo, spent the 
week with them. They were 
especially pleased that their grand­
daughter, Amanda Sloan could be 
here for ten days. She is a medical 
student in Denver.

Other guests of the Harbours 
were Jean and Donnie Jones with 
Sherman, Morse; a friend Doug 
Johnson, San Diego; Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Chisum, Stinnett; Mr. and 
Mrs. Danny Chisum and children, 
Sunray; and Mr and Mrs. Curtis 
Harbour and family, Spearman.

One day Ira and Loree, with Ann, 
Russell and Amanda, spent a day in 
Forgan, Okla. with Loree’s sister, 
Ada Rose and Bob Phelps.

Then on Sunday the Harbours 
and Amanda visited in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Wood Farris in Well­
ington. They were joined by their 
son, Ted and his wife with Austin, 
Zada and Dalton of Rockwall, Tx.

Carla Woodington, District Court 
Administrator in the office of Judge 
Blackburn, will be handling her 
duties from home for several mon­
ths. Shf has had a forwarding 
telephone installed and with the 
cooperation of other officials, 
employees and associates, she 
feels that all will go well.

Carla and husband Tim were in 
Pampa due to the death of his 
mother. On Wedne: ’ay before the 
funeral, she was on an errand in 
front of the home and slipped on the 
ice. She was taken by ambulance to 
the hospital and on Thursday, 
surgery was performed on the 
ankle. It was a very complicated 
fracture, with breaks on the right 
side, left side and back of the ankle.

For about three weeks she will be 
practically bed fast, then a cast will 
be used but she won’t put weight on 
it for several months.

John and Virginia Trindle return­
ed between ice storms from Grand- 
bury where they had gone to take 
Connie, Abbe and Nathan Steger 
Sifter their Christmas visit. Dr. 
Doug had been with them here 
through Christmas but the family 
remained several days with the 
Trindles.

Many, many old friends were so 
pleased to welcome the Stegers in 
church Sunday morning and to note 
the progress Connie is making after 
her serious surgery.

Going Out 
Of Business!

The Country Peddler
(on ly )

50% Off Everything
Except c o n s ig n m e n t item s  

& Jo s This & That m e rc h a n d is e
Starts Monday, January 14th 

216 Main

THANK YOU
A very sp ec ia l th an ks  to  

a l l  o f  y o u  f o r  y o u r  
th o u g h ts , prayers, ca lls , 
cards, v is its , fo od  and  
flo w ers  as I recovered  
from  surgery.

M ay G od b less you as  
you have b lessed  m e.

Betty Porter
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by Joy Henderson
On these cold and icy, blustery 

evenings, one of the simplest of 
pleasures for us to enjoy is to pop a 
big bowl of popcorn and sip cocoa 
or a steamy mug of wassail. That 
simple pleasure has become one of 
the most precious acts of this new 
year.

You might say Gary and Diane 
Doty’s new year began last Oct. 26 
when they arrived back at their 
home in Hansford County.

Gary was critically injured when 
he suffered a fall at a grain 
elevator and for several weeks, it 
was touch and go at the very best.
By the laws of nature he wasn’t 
even supposed to be alive, much 
less able to walk in any form or 
fashion. But now he is at home, 
able to walk with the aid of a “quad 
cane” and move about.

Since arriving home, the Dotys’ 
schedule has been fast and furious. 
They had to adjust to his new sur­
roundings and begin trips back and 
forth to Dumas for rehabilitation 
therapy at the YMCA. If weather 
conditions permit they make the 
trip three times weekly.

The YMCA in Dumas has a pool 
and other types of therapy equip­
ment that Gary works out on. Since 
Dec. 14 he is able to walk to the 
gate, but a wheelchair is used some 
because he still tires easily and 
needs to conserve energy for work­
ing out. There are 10 kinds of equip­
ment that Gary uses and his condi­
tion continues to improve.

The Dotys will return to Craig

Rehabilitation Center near Denver, 
Colo, for re-evaluation in April. At 
that time a decision will be made to 
schedule another surgery, but the 
Dotys feel the “team doctors” will 
truly be amazed at Gary’s pro­
gress.

Gary is still on some medication 
which will probably be needed the 
rest of his life, but his goal is to be 
able to return to work sometime in 
the future.

It was good to visit with Diane 
over the phone. She called me to fill 
me in on the Optima Dam project 
and let me know that the feisty 
pioneer woman involved is indeed 
still living, at Dunaway Manor in 
Guymon. Delphine Etling, who is a 
distant relative of Altha Mae Jones, 
said she has failing eyesight, but 
her mind is still as sharp as it ever 
was. We are estimating that she is 
in her 90s.

Well, the new year is about to get 
back to normal and our church ac­
tivities and attendance is better. 
Howard By bee, former Church of 
Christ minister here in Gruver, 
along with his wife Doris, visited 
here briefly. The Bybees, who have 
spent considerable time in Italy, 
are back in Searcy, Ark. working 
with “ Avanti Italia” which is 
recruiting students from Harding 
College to commit some time to the 
mission field.

***♦
Vivian Green seems to stay busy 

playing hostess, but was especiallya I iv  L / o i / j  1 v v u i i .  v v  i J  o  •   r

jfjANUARY CLEARANCE
SALE»

i

January 15th thru 19th

80% OFF
Selected Jewelry

25% OFF
Selected Cosmetics

MERLE NORMAN COSMETICS
“ Try  B e fo re  Y o u  B u y"

3 0 0  M ain
S p e a rm a n , T X  7 9 0 8 1  

806-659-5219
ffiOOOOOOOQQQQQQQQQQQQQQQQQQQQQQQQQQQQflQMMJ

F o u n d a t i o n  O f  F in e  J e w u l r y

7 1 9  W e s t S e v e n th  

6 5 9 - 3 5 6 6

-Oa&t

You Are Invited to : “ Christmas House Geaning Sale44 

All Catalog Merchandise Priced to Clean Out. 

Date: Starts January 10th 1991 

Time: 9:00 to 5:30 

Terms: Cash , 6mo. layaway 

All Major Credit Cards

busy at Christmas. Those seen 
recently included John and 
Virginia Alley on their way to visit 
kids and grandkids in Roswell, 
N M. Also R.C. and his son Barry, 
along with Dale Blackburn, 
Weldon’s son-in-law, made a quick 
visit. If they came for the purpose 
of hunting, I’ll bet they found out 
that the nearest bed for a winter’s 
nap was better.

Others coming earlier for hun­
ting included Lucy Pittman’s dad, 
L.J. Norman, brother Capt. Lynn 
Norman of San Antonio and 
nephews Austin and Heath. Lucy 
reported they didn’t hurt the bird 
population much. However, a 
niece, Lindsay, 7 years old, receiv­
ed some scratches from gravel on 
the playground. Her brother Tony 
accused her of sorting tigers.

Enjoying the C hristm as 
festivities were Ted and Louise 
Evans, who had all their children 
and “grands” here. Those in atten­
dance were David, Nancy, Dean 
and Greg trom Winters; Tim Jen­
nifer, Jessica and Jason from San 
Angelo; Mike, Debbie, Joy and 
Pam from Amarillo; and David 
and Sharon Rosser from Gruver.

Visiting with grandparents Corky 
and Paula Kizzar were Charles 
Parrish and wife Shiloh, along with 
their baby.

****

Don and Peggy Dillow would like 
to announce the arrival of their new 
grandson, Zane Edgar Schiffner, 
born Dec. 30, 1990 at Harris 
Methodist Hospital in Ft. Worth. 
Zane arrived  at 10:01 a.m. 
weighing 6 lbs., 14 oz. and was 19 in­
ches long. Also welcoming Zane is 
big brother Jared, 7 years old, and 
parents Margaret and Danny Schif­
fner. Other grandparents are Paul 
and Helen Schiffner of Alva, Okla. 
and great-grandmother Echols, 
also of Alva.

****
Entertaining family during the 

holidays were Flvil and Josephine 
Ayers. Their daughter Shirley and 
husband Byron Nesbitt, their 
granddaughter Kisaundra from 
Borger, and later on Glen, with 
sons Scottie and Trevor, were able 
to spend a few days and help with 
some house remodeling. Quite a 
contrast in grandchildren for the 
Ayers - Kisaundra is now 16, a tall 
and lovely girl, and the two boys, 7 
and 5, are very active but still so 
loveable, giving hugs and kisses.

Holiday guests of Larry and Don­
na Ross included Lana Willoughby, 
E rv in  W illoughby, Jess 
Willoughby, Forrest and Gwen 
Music, all of Sheridan, Wyo.; J.W. 
Jeffress and Rossye Jeffress of 
Gillette, Wyo.; and John Jeffress of 
Auroroa, Colo.

Guests of the Dorsey Schads 
were Billie and Debbie Etheredge 
of Dumas; and Gerry, DeAnn, • 
Blythe and Katlin Chapman of 
Amarillo.

Visiting with Ed and Margaret 
Fry were LeeAnn and I^add Sheets 
from Lubbock and Steven and

Tischa Fry from Abilene. ’
Others who have been in Gruver 

recently were Larry and Sally 
Higbee of Lawrencevillc, Ga., 
guests cf Verna Flippin; Chuck and 
Karla Topp of Lubbock, guests of 
the Ernesto Zapatas; Sherri and 
Christopher Rasor of Amarillo, 
guests of the Aubery Rasors; 
Travis Bayless of Amarillo, guest 
of the Alfred Bayless; Terry Etling 
of Dallas, guest of the Ray Brand- 
viks; and Steven A. Schultz of 
Garden City, Mi., guest of the 
James Dormans.

Also Damion and Corey Horton of 
Van Alstyne, Texas, guests of the 
Larry Millers; Scott and Denise 
Miller of Amarillo, guests of the 
Gary Dotys; Ruby McCullough of 
Sunset, Texas, guest of the Larry 
Babbs; Rhonda Smith of London, 
England, guest of the Don Heddins; 
Pearl Davidson of Wilson, Texas, 
guest of the Fred Davidsons; and 
Jeff Thacker of Roaring Springs,
Texas, guest of the Jerry Overbeys.

» + »•
Those known in hospitals are Bill 

Henderson and Don Hartranft 
(pneumonia). Kenneth Irwin was a 
patient for a few days in Hansford 
Hospital, but is now at home and 
Dean McClenagan had “ balloon” 
surgery for heart problems, but is 
now at home.

****
College students who have been 

home recently were Steve Duncan, 
Brian McClenagan and Allan 
Taylor from the U.S. Navy, home 
on leave visiting in the home of 
parents Victor and Kathy Taylor.

Menu
January 15 - January 18 

No School Monday 
Tuesday: Crispie fish sticks, 

macaroni and cheese, green beans, 
fruit, hot rolls, milk 

Wednesday: Chili, carrot sticks, 
fruit, donuts, milk 

Thursday: Roast turkey, mashed 
potatoes with gravy, corn, jello, hot 
rolls, milk

Friday: Nachos, pinto beans, 
fruit, com bread, milk 

BREAKFAST 
Monday-no school 
Tuesday: Cereal, fruit or juice, 

muffins, milk
Wednesday: French toast sticks, 

peanuts, fruit, milk 
T hursday: Donuts, fru it, 

peanuts, milk
Friday: Toast, peanut butter and 

jelly, fruit, milk 
Salad bar Mon. Tue. and Wed. 
Nacho bar Mon. and Wed.
Potato bar Tue. and Thur.
Menu subject to change w/o 

notice.

D e rw in  a n d  L in d a  C o m e r  o f W e llin g to n  a n n o u n c e  th e  
e n g a g e m e n t an d  a p p ro a c h in g  m a rria g e  o f th e ir  d a u g h te r , 
R h e a n ita  L in , to  K e n n e th  T o d d  V ird e n , son  o f  J e rry  a n d  Judy  
V ird e n  o f  G ru v e r. T h e  b r id e -e le c t is a 1 9 8 9  g ra d u a te  of 
M a y s v ille , O k la . H ig h  S c h o o l a n d  a tte n d e d  A m a r il lo  C o lle g e .  
S h e  p re s e n tly  a t te n d s  W e s t T e x a s  S ta te  U n iv e rs ity , m a jo rin g  
in p s y c h o lo g y , a n d  is  e m p lo y e d  b y  P ru d e n tia l A d a  R e a lto rs . 
T h e  p ro s p e c tiv e  g ro o m  is  a 1 9 8 9  g ra d u a te  o f  G ru v e r  H ig h  
S c h o o l a n d  w a s  g ra d u a te d  fro m  th e  s u rg ic a l te c h n o lo g y  p ro ­
g ra m  a t A m a rillo  C o lle g e . H e  p re s e n tly  a t te n d s  W e s t T e x a s  
S ta te  U n iv e rs ity , m a jo r in g  in  b io m e d ic a l s c ie n c e s , a n d  is  a 
c e r t if ie d  s u rg ic a l te c h n o lo g is t  a t  S t. A n th o n y ’s H o s p ita l . T h e  
c o u p le  p la n s  a F e b . 9  w e d d in g  a t P a n fo rk  B a p tis t  E n c a m p ­
m e n t in  W e llin g to n .

Wirm student of month
by Gretchen Lewder

Cynthia Winn, daughter of Nelda 
and Bill Winn, 17 year old senior at 
Gruver High School, was recently 
chosen as student of the month for 
January.

Winn is an active and involved 
student at GHS who seems to find 
time for almost every activity. As a 
four year member of the Spanish 
Club, Winn not only speaks the 
language well but is a strong in­
fluence and support to the club by 
serving as its treasurer. She also 
participated in SADD (Students 
Against Driving Drunk), FHA 
(F u tu re  H om em akers of 
America), speech tournaments, 
One Act Play, All School Review, 
OM (Odyssey of the Mind) and 
UIL.

As a member of the GHS Band 
for four years Winn has been and 
continues to be one of its most 
valuable members. Her talent and

HENSON CHIROPRACTIC
410 S. Davis Spearman, TX 

Call For Appointment 659-5603 
Office Hours: Mon- Wed- Fri- 8:30-5:00

Tue., Thu. 8:30-11:30

perseverence have been important 
factors in the program.

Winn is also a member of the 
NHS (National Honor Society), one 
of the highest honors a student can 
receive. Although she is active in 
extracurricular activities, Winn 
says her grades come first.

After graduation, Winn plans to 
attend West Texas State University 
in Canyon and hopes to study 
advertising, photography and art.

Russ Chisum, speech teacher at 
GHS who nominated her for the 
award, says Winn has an excellent 
attitude toward school and goes the 
second mile on her assignments. 
“She is a pleasant and fun girl to be 
around,” said Chisum, “yet she 
takes her school work seriously.”

Winn says her school work is very 
important to her for many reasons. 
“ I was rewarded for doing well in 
younger grades and it just carried 
over into high school,” said Winn. 
“Grades also help build a solid 
foundation for my future in col­
lege,” she added.

Not only is Winn active and in­
volved in school, but she is also an 
important part of the community. 
She was named “ Outstanding 
Youth’ by the Kiwanis Club in 
Guymon, Okla. in October 1990, and 
is also a member of the Sunset 
l^ane Baptist Church there.

Winn is looking forward to a 
bright future and hopes her educa­
tion at GHS will further her oppor­
tunities outside the school. *

PALO DURO 
PLAYERS

Will have a general membership 
meeting Thursday, January 10 
at 7:30 p.m. at the Hansford 
County Activity Center.

All members are urged to 
attend.

New officers will be elected. 
Bring n friend  & 
any fresh ideas!

For more information call 
Iinda Butt at 659-2189,

Denise Schumann, 659^3508, 
or Ron Dunning, 733-2401

BETTER 
SERVICE Charlene 
FOR *,a,ockHeanng
YOUR Specialist

HEARING AID...

- . . M E A N S  B E T T E R  
H E A R IN G  F O R  Y O U .

Ask For 
FREE

Hearing Test
Be sure to visit our next 

Service Center. 
Thursday 

January 17, 1991
Hansford Manor 

707 S. Roland 
Speannan, Texas 

10:00 a.m .-12:00 Noon

<vS>
<5>,

O'
H earin g  Aid

F orm erly  B e lt
2 7 -b M edical 

A m a rillo  352-8

1



Hours: Mon. - Fri. 9 :00  - 3 :00 

Drive Up Mon. - Fri. 7 :30 - 4 :30

MR frf foiir rnwinii i' ~ r ~~ ftfWMwmfr ,fi '-f* J

at a glance
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come home and play Sunray for a 
second game, and then away to 
Stinnett to play the number one 
rated team in the district, West 
Texas.

Neff says a win early on the road 
puts the pressure on them to win 
later at your home gym. An early 
loss away can be made up with a 
home win later.

In looking at the district competi­
tion, Neff rates them as all being 
strong but with West Texas and 
Statford as being a little more con­
sistent.

According to Neff, West Texas 
will be the toughest to beat. “They 
(W.T.) have two super post kids, 
and a good shooter on the right 
wing,” he said. He also comented 
on the play of their point guard.

Stratford will be the Lynx’ next 
toughest competition, says Neff. 
They have good inside ball 
handlers and the best team  
defense . “ They w on’t bea t 
themselves,” he says.

Sunray plays up and down, says 
Neff. He goes on to say Sunray has 
two players who average 26-27 
points per game. On a given night 
they are capable of beating anyone.

Boys Ranch is the only district 
opponent Neff indicated he had not 
seen play. But he said he heard 
they (B.R.) are a streaky ball club.

Neff made two overall predic­
tions about the coming district 
race. The first is that he sees the 
Lynx competing very strongly for a 
playoff spot. The second is that the 
two most consistent teams will win 
those two spots.

Varsity Lynx

Alan Howell
Alan Howell wears number 32 

and plays wing for the Lynx basket­
ball team. He is 5’9%” and weighs 
150 pounds. He is a senior at SHS.

Alan’s parents are Neal Howell 
and Suzanne Dixon and he has one 
brother, Robert.

Alan’s other interests include 
church and physics.

Dallas Trosper
Dallas Trosper wears number 20 

and plays guard - forward for the 
Lynx basketball team. He is 6’1” 
and weighs 155 pounds. He is a 
junior at SHS.

Dallas’ parents are Larry and 
Janett Trosper.

Dallas’ other interests include 
the guitar, water skiing, football, 
and golf.

S C H E D U L E

Varsity Lynx
Jan. 4 Dalhart There 5:00
Jan. 8 Stratford There 4:00
Jan. 11 Sunray Here 5:00
Jan. 15 Boys Ranch Here 5:00
Jan. 18 Open Date
Jan. 22 West Tex. There 5:00
Jan. 25 Stratford Here 5:00
Jan. 29 Sunray There 4:00
Feb. 1 Boys Ran. There 6:00
Feb. 5 Guymon There 5:00
Feb. 8 West Tex. Here 5:00
Feb. 21-23 Boys Bi district 
Feb. 28-2 Boys Regional 
Mar. 7-9 Boys State Tourn.

Tim Kizziar
Tim Kizziar wears number 40 

and plays post for the Lynx basket­
ball team. He is 6’2” and weighs 189 
pounds. He is a junior at SHS.

Tim’s parents are Pew Wee and 
Ruth Kizziar. He has two brothers, 
Carl and Mike Kizziar, and two 
sisters, Joy Kizziar and Connie 
Holmes.

Tim’s interests include football, 
volleyball and golf.

Ross Jarvis
Ross Jarvis wears number 34 and 

plays guard for the Lynx basketball 
team. He is a senior at SHS.

Ross’ parents are Wesley and 
Cheri Jarvis and he has one sister, 
Holly, and one brother, Lee.

Ross’ many interests include 
music and choir.

Brian Beck
Brian Beck wears number 24 and 

plays pt. guard for the Lynx basket­
ball team. He is 5’10” and weighs 
135 pounds. He is a Junior at SHS.

Brian’s parents are Ronnie and 
Kathy Reck. He hay one sister, 
Melissa.

Brian’s other interests include 
fishing, skiing and hunting.

Shawn Tanner
Shawn Tanner wears number 44 

and plays center for the Lynx 
basketball team. He is 6’5” and 
weighs 185 pounds. He is a junior at 
SHS.

Shawn’s parents are Steve Tan­
ner and Vicki Fletcher.

Shawn’s other interests include 
basketball, hunting and fishing.

Joel Shields
Joel Shields wears number 42 and 

plays forward for the Lynx basket­
ball team. He is 6 feet tall and 
weighs 185 pounds. He is a senior at 
SHS.

Joel’s parents are Lonnie and 
LeAnn Shields. He has three 
brothers and five sisters. His 
brothers are Pat, Bob and Tobe and 
his sisters are Resa, Ruth, Melody, 
Kyna and Kali.

Joel’s other interests include 
football, snow and water skiiing, 
hunting and fishing.

Codv Pipkin
Cody Pipkin wears number 22 

and plays post for the Lynx basket­
ball team. He is 6’4” and weighs 168 
pounds. He is a sophomore at SHS.

Cody’s parents are Vernon and 
Marsha Pipkin. He has two sisters, 
Mika and Holly.

Cody’s other interest is track.

Khris Kelp
Khris Kelp wears number 30 and 

plays guard for the Lynx basketball 
team. He is 5’10” and weighs 145 
pounds. He is a junior at SHS.

Khris’ parents are Reagan and 
Beckee Baker. He has one brother, 
Lance, and two sisters, Kiiji and 
Lacie. {

Khris lists his interest as fo Jtball.

GO LYNX!

With its Jan. 8 game, the Lynx 
varsity basketball team begins 
competition for one of the two 
district spots in the state playoff 
tournament.

“I see us competing very strong­
ly for a playoff spot,” said first 
year Lynx head coach Wendell 
Neff. Neff supports this statement 
by pointing to the improving play of 
his Lynx team and what he feels is 
a goodfschedule.

Overfthe course of the 18 game 
pre-district season Neff has seen 
Iris teafi improve in both defensive 
and offensive play. “We set a goal 
before each game to hold the other 
team to less than 50 points,” Neff 
said. In their last three games the 
Lynx have accomplished this

twice. Only in their loss to Gruver 
in the finals of the Canadian Tour­
nament, 38-56, did Lynx opponents 
score more than 50 points. Accor­
ding to Neff, 56 is way below 
Gruver’s average point score.

On offense Neff points out pie im­
proved post play of the Lynx team. 
He mentions the ability of his big 
men to get position inside, and the 
Lynx guards’ and wings’ ability to 
get the ball into their hands. Neff 
says the inside play will be shared 
by four players: Cofy Pipkin, 
Shawn Tanner, Tim Kizziar and 
Dallas Trosper. Neff said players’ 
positions will depend on what 
defense they are playing and the 
foul situations.

In talking about the Lynx guard

and wing play Neff was pleased by 
their improvement in protecting 
the ball. Along with this Neff would 
like to see more improvement in 
the team’s outside shooting.

Reducing turnovers and making 
teams come out and play defense 
outside the paint will be the job of 
Alan Howell, Khris Kelp, Brian 
Beck, Ross Jarvis and Joel Shields. 
The outside shooters in this group 
are Beck and Jarvis, according to 
Neff. He also mentioned that 
Shields was developing “a nice out­
side touch.”

In looking at the schedule Neff 
liked the idea that the Lynx must 
play their two toughest district op­
ponents away early in the season. 
They open with Stratford away,

. V T I Yi - J  j  X I .A .  o l C H S

Name G 2-pt Pet 3-pt Pet FT Pet TP PPG Name Off
Rebounds
Def Tot Avg Asst Stls TO Blks OF

Cody 18 89-156 57 0-0 - 33-56 59 211 11.7 Joel 52 68 120 7.5 41 21 62 4 0
Shawn 18 60-135 44 0-0 - 14-31 45 134 7.4 Cody 47 70 117 6.5 10 22 27 20 1

Joel 16 43-105 41 1-2 50 35-79 44 124 7.8 Shawn 17 73 90 5.9 5 8 40 21 1

Brian 16 26-74 35 5-22 23 26-53 49 93 5.8 Brian 17 29 46 2.9 26 19 59 0 2

Tim 16 32-66 48 0-0 - 9-17 53 ' 73 4.6 Alan 4 33 37 2.1 44 19 92 0 1

Alan 18 20-58 34 0-5 0 25-35 71 65 3.6 Tim 6 28 34 2.1 7 5 13 3 0
Dallas 16 21-40 53 0-2 0 17-25 68 59 3.7 Dallas 7 26 33 2.1 1 9 27 2 n

Ross 14 6-16 38 5-11 45 9-11 82 36 2.6 Chris 7 17 34 4.9 3 t 1 0
Khris 11 12-38 32 0-1 0 8-15 53 32 2.9 Ross 4 18 22 1.6 7 8 22 1 o

Chris * 7 12-23 52 0-0 - 2-19 11 26 3.7 Khris 7 15 22 2.n 29 19 31 1 l

Darian 6 5-8 63 0-1 0 0-0 - 10 1.7 Darian 4 9 13 2.2 2 4 13 0 0
Chad 5 2-13 15 0-0 - 0-2 0 4 0.8 Russell 1 9 10 3.3 3 4 11 3 l

Russell 3 0-3 0 1-2 50 0-0 - 3 1.0 Chad 4 4 8 1.6 6 4 12 0 0

Mark 2 1-2 50 0-0 - 0-0 - 2 .0 Mark 1 3 4 2.0 1 0 5 0 0
Sherman 2 0.0 - 0-1 0 2-5 40 2 1.0 Sherman 1 0 1 05 0 1 3 0 0
Team 18 329-737 45 12-47 26 180-348 52 874 48.6

Lynx begin playoff competition



Bonnie Thompson KVla Nelson CindyMe,ton ljiura  Pearson

Bonnie Thompson wears number 
13 and plays guard for the Lynxet- 
tes basketball team. She is a senior 
at SHS.

Bonnie’s parents are Richey and 
Karen Thompson. She has one 
brother, Toby.

Bonnie’s other interests include 
snow skiing, being with friends and 
talking on the phone.

Mendy Lasater

Kyla Nelson wears number 45 
and plays post for the Lynxettes 
basketball team. She is a senior at 
SHS

Kyla’s parents are Dennis and 
Judy Nelson. She has one brother, 
Kevin, and one sister, Kim Ken­
nedy.

Kyla’s other interests include 
reading, cooking, shopping, and 
spending time with friends.

Michelle Garnett

Cindy Melton wears number 35 
and plays forward for the Lynxet­
tes basketball team. She is a senior 
at SHS.

Cindy’s parents are Rich and 
Helen Melton. She has one brother, 
James Whitaker, and one sister, 
Cliery 1 Whitefield.

Cindy's other interests include 
golf, skiing, reading, and being 
with friends and family.

Laura Pearson wears number 53 
and plays post for the Lynxettes 
basketball team . She is a 
sophomore at SHS.

Laura’s parents are Bob and 
Jackie Pearson. She has two 
sisters, Ginger and Carrie.

Laura’s other interests include 
shopping, being with friends, skiing 
and swimming.

Meet the 
Varsity

Tamri Townsen
Tamri Townsen wears number 51 

and plays post for the Lynxettes 
basketball team. She is a junior at 
SHS.

Tamri’s parents are Don and 
Barbara Townsen. She has two 
brothers, Clint and Jamie, and two 
sisters, Kimbre and Kara.

Tamri’s other interest is tennis.

Joy Gafford
Joy Gaffoid wears number 33 

and plays forward for the Lynufi 
tes basketball team. She is a junior
at SHS.

Joy’s parents are Ladd and 
Cathy Gafford. She has one 
brother, Matt.

Joy’s other interests include ski­
ing. track and cross country.

Melodie Schumann Jill Lusby
Mendy I^asater wears number 21 

and plays point-guard for the Lynx­
ettes basketball team. She is a 
junior at SHS.

Mendy’s parents are Butch and 
Mary Ann Lasater. She has one 
brother, Cass, and one sister, Laci.

Mendy’s other interests include 
church, spending time with friends, 
skiing, swimming and cross coun­
try.

Gwen Benson
Gwen Benson wears number 25 

and plays guard for the Lynxettes 
basketba ll team . She is a 
sophomore at SHS.

Gwen’s parents are Frank and 
Anna Benson. She has one brother, 
Keith, and one sister, Vonda.

Gwen’s other interests include 
water and snow skiing, singing, 
spending time with family and run­
ning cross country.

SCHEDULE
Varsity

Lynxettes
Jan. 4 Dalhart There 5:00
Jan. 8 Stratford There 4:00
Jan. 11 Sunray Here 5:00
Jan. 15 Boys. Ran. Here 6:30
Jan. 18 Open date
Jan. 22 West Tex. There 5:00
Jan. 25 Stratford Here 5:00
Jan. 29 Sunray There 4:00
Feb. 1 Vega There 6:30
Feb. 5 Guymon There 5:00
Feb. 8 West Tex. Here 5:00
Feb. 14 Girls Bi District
Feb. 21-23 Girls Reg
Feb. 28-2 Girls State Tourn.

Michelle Garnett wears number 
43 and plays forward for the Lynx­
ettes basketball team. She is a 
sophomore at SHS.

Michelle’s parents are Mike and 
Marti Garnett. She has three 
brothers, Jon, Mark, and J.

Michelle’s other interests include 
snow and water skiing, track and 
spending time with family and 
friends.

Lynxettes
District opens
The Lynxettes open district play 

Tuesday, Jan. 8 with an away game 
against Stratford. According to 
coach Jim Kirkland the team’s 
goal is that this will be. the first 
game toward winning the district 
and a spot in the state tournament.

Kirkland went on to outline the 
strengths of the Lynxettes that will 
enable them to get into the state 
tournament for a fourth straight 
year.

One of the strengths mentioned 
by Kirkland is the toughness of the 
Lynxettes’ pre-district schedule. 
As of press time the Lynxettes were 
12 and 7. Some of those 12 wins were 
over bigger schools. All of the 
seven losses were to 3A, 4A and 5A 
schools.

Kirkland next spoke of three 
qualities the Lynxette team has 
developed during the pre-district 
schedule. First, the Lynxettes have 
good depth. Kirkland says he has 
girls who can come off the bench 
and help during the critical times of 
a game. Secondly, the girls have a 
better understanding of what the 
coaches are trying to do. Finally, 
Kirkland said the girls are playing

with more intensity.
In looking at the Lynxettes’ 

district opponents Kirkland said, 
“All of the teams are quality 
teams.” He does not feel that the 
district schedule gives the Lynxet­
tes any advantage or disadvantage.

The first district opponent the 
Lynxettes will face is Stratford. Ac­
cording to Kirkland the Lady Elks 
are better than last year, and are 
more mature. Kirkland mentioned 
the play of Stratford’s two post 
players.

Sunray is the next district oppo­
nent for the Lynxettes. Kirkland 
says they (Sunray) are deceiving. 
Sunray is not very big but are 
quick. B e indicates they shoot well.

West Texas is the third team of 
the three-team district. According 
to Kirkland W.T. may well be the 
Lynxettes’ toughest district oppo­
nent. He says W.T. has its nucleus 
of last year’s starters back, and 
that they have good size.

As a closing statement Kirkland 
said that if the Lynxettes come 
together for their district games 
like they did to win the Canadian 
tournament, they will win district 
and maybe even more.

Supporting 
the Lynxettes 
all the way!

M elodie Schum ann w ears 
number 41 and plays post for the 
Lynxettes basketball team. She is a 
junior at SHS.

Melodie’s parents are Craig 
Schumann and Kari Russell. She 
has two brothers, Derrick Burnett 
and Josh Schumann, and two 
sisters, Melissa Sutterfield and 
Tashiana Schumann.

Melodie’s other interests include 
water and snow skiing, being with 
friends and talking on the phone.

Jill Lusby wears number 23 and 
plays guard for the Lynxettes 
b ask e tb a ll tea m . She is a 
sophomore at SHS.

Jill’s parents are Ronnie and 
Donita Lusby. She has one brother 
Michael, and one sister, Mandi.

Jill’s other interests include 
swimming, running cross country 
and track, shopping, snow skiing, 
going out with friends and UMY.

Lynxette stats
NAM E

2 P T  F I E L D  G O A L S  
A T T E M P  M A D E  P C T

3 F 'T  F I E L D  G O A L S  
A T T E M P  M A D E  P C T

S H T
P C T

F R E E
A T T E M P

T H R O W S  
M A D E  P C T

S C O R IN G  
T O T A L  AVE

TH O M P S O N 7 2 2 9 6 2 3 3 3 1 2 2 100 12 1 . 5
L A S A T E R 4 6 11 2 4 2 0 0 2 3 22 10 4 5 3 2 2 . 9
L U S B Y 3 7 8 22 10 3 3 0 2 3 20 1 3 6 5 3 8 3 . 5
R E N S E N 20 9 4 5 4 2 5 0 4 6 8 7 8 7 3 1 2.8
G A R N E T T 2 4 9 3 8 0 0 0 3 8 10 8 8 0 2 6 2 . 4
G A F F O R D 6 5 2 4 3 7 4 3 1 3 3 0 3 4 2 4 1 5 6 2 102 10.2
M E L T O N 11 4 3 6 4 1 2 5 3 3 4 1 ?er 12 1.2
S C H U M A N N 1 9 5 2 6 0 0 0 2 6 10 *f 5 0 1 5 1 . 5
T O W N S E N 102 4 5 4 4 0 0 0 4 4 3 3 2 4 6 3 1 1 4 1 & . 4
P E A .V S 0 N 7 2 3 1 4 3 0 0 o 4 3 3 6 1 3 3 6 7 5 6 .8
N E L S O N 4 6 12 2 6 0 0 0 2 6 2 4 1 6 6 7 4 0 3 . 6

T E A M  T O T A L 4 4 9 1 6 0 3 6 6 9 ‘1 3 0 3 5 1 9 8 1 1 4 5 8 4 9 7 4 5 . 2

0 P F  .  T O T A L 3 *  / 1 3 * 3 6 4 0 9 22 3 5 2 1 3 1 2 4 5 8 4 1 9 3 8 . 1=======================================;

N A M E G P
* * * * * *  R E B O U N D S  * * * * * * *  
O F F  A V E  D E F  A V E  T O T A L

G AM E
A V E

T U R N
O V E R S

B L O C K E D
S T E A L  A S I S T  S H O T S F O U L S

T H O M P S O N 8 0 0 5 .6 5. .6 8 5 1
L A S A T E R 11 3 . 3 5 . 5 8 . 7 1 8 1 4 1 8 1 Q
L U S B Y 11 12 1 .1 6 . 5 1 8 1 . 6 1 9 8 2 6 1*

iB E N S E N 1 ! 4 . 4 11 1 1 5 1 . 4 1 3 6 1 9 o
G A R N E T T 11 6 . 5 8 . 7 1 4 1 . 3 9 6 =i
G A F F O R D 10 9 . 9 2 9 2 . 9 3 8 3 . 8 1 3 1 3 1 9 2 3 0
M E L T O N 10 4 . 4 d .2 6 .6 5 2
S C H U M A N N 10 9 . 9 10 1 1 9 1 . 9 6 3
T O W N S E N 11 20 1 .8 2 7 2 . 5 4 7 4 . 3 1 8 9 7
P E A R S O N 11 21 1 . 9 2 8 2 . 5 4 9 4 . 5 1 3 7 A
N E L S O N 11 1 4 1 . 3 1 4 1 . 3 2 8 2 . 5 7 0 4 0 n c

T E A M  T O T A L 11 102 9 . 3 1 4 5 1 3 . 2 2 4 7 2 2 . 5 1 2 9 7 3 1 0 6 4 1 8 0

O F F .  T O T A L  
= = = = = = = = = = = =

11 5 2
=  =  =  = = :

4 . 7
= = = = =

1 7 6
= = = =

1 6
= = = = =

: .2 B
= = = = = II 

M
 

II 
O

 
II 

•
II II

1 7 4 4 6 5 6 3 0 1 5 9

Go lyn xettes!
Hours: Mon. - Fri. 7:.'iO - 3:00 

Thursday 4:00 - 6:00
/2 0  W. 7ch Spearman 

659-5544
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T h e  J .V . L y n x e tte s  a re  (fro n t row , l r )  A d ria n  
B la c k b u rn , K im b re  T o w n s e n , M ary  C o o k , 
S h e a  C ra w fo rd , S a ra  S a n d e rs , D o n e tte  C a te s ,

(b a c k  ro w , l-r) Lori L ie b , C a r la  G re e n e , H o lly  
J a rv is , T ra c y  T ig re tt  a n d  S o n y a  T in d e ll.

The F re s h m a n  L yn x  a re  (b a c k  ro w , !-r) C lin t  
S cnnell, J a s o n  S w in k , M a tt  A rc h e r, C lay  
Scribner, R o b e r t  H o w e ll, ( fro n t ro w , l-r) C h u c k

C o o k , T o b y  T h o m p s o n , C a s s  L a s a te r. R o b ert 
W o m b le  a n d  D e e  M a y f ie ld .

lynx J.V.

Win ogam

T h e  L yn x  8 th  g ra d e  te a m  in c lu d e s  J u s tin  
A rn o ld , 42; R a d a r G a rc ia , 44; A lv in  H a rb o u r, 
24; A la n  H u tc h is o n , 20; C h r is to p h e r  J e n k in s , 
32; C a m e ro n  K u n s e lm a n , 52; V a le n t in  M a c ia s , 
53; S h a w n  M o o re . 33; S tu a rt R ig g in s , 45; R o n ­

n ie  R in g , 54; O s c a r  R o ja s , 55; S c h a n e  
S c h n e id e r , 21; J o e l S ta rk , 43; J e re m y  S u tte r-  
f ie ld , 14; C h a d  W ilk e rs o n , 23; a n d  Jo sh  
W in e g a rn e r , 22 .

The Lynx J.V. continued their 
winning ways into the new year. 
They beat Dalhart 46-41 on Satur­
day and defeated Stratford, 41-37, 
on Tuesday.

The Lynx were lead in scoring by 
Chris Strawn. He lead all scorers in 
both games with 15 and 14 points 
respectively.

At Stratford, Tues.
Score: Sprm. 41 - Str. 37 

Scoring: Wes Dyess-5, Darian 
Hawkins-5, Sherman Jones-2, 
Strawn-14, Mark Eakin-4, Chad 
Higgins-4, Brady Reed-7.

At Dalhart, Sat.
Score: Sprm. 46 - Dal. 41 

Scoring: Justin Boyd-8, Dyess-4, 
Hawkins-6, Jones-4, Strawn-15, 
Eakin-4, Riggins-3, Reed-2.

Freshman Lynx
The Freshman Lynx started out 

the new year by defeating the West 
Texas Comanches 33-15. The Lynx 
scoring was very balanced. No 
Lynx broke double figures.

At West Texas, Monday 
Score: Spr. 33 - W.T. 15 

Scoring: Cook-2, Mayfield-6, 
Womble-4, Archer-4, Swink-1, 
Lasater-8, Varnon-8.

New program begins at 11.4.(,.
Wanda Archer of Spearman is 

the instructor for a new program 
called “ The Whole Body Class,” 
which began Monday, Jan. 7 at the 
Hansford County Activity Center.

The class combines a weight loss 
program with a physical fitness 
program. The exercise portion of 
the program consists of no- to low 
impact aerobics along with muscle, 
strength and flexibility training.

Archer commented, “ Regular 
exercise, along with a sensible low- 
fat, high-fiber eating program, will 
help lower the risk of heart disease. 
New research indicates exercise 
may also lower the risk of cancer.”

She added, “Strength training is 
an important part of maintaining 
overall health. It helps control body 
weight and adds muscle to burn 
calories quickly and efficiently. 
Strength training can help reduce 
the risk of osteoporosis and other 
diseases which cause bone loss. All 
the classes will use rubber bands

for strength training.”
Weigh-in is scheduled for each 

Monday at 5:30 p.m. Fat. percen­
tages and body measurements will 
be figured the first week of each 
month. Aerobics classes for women 
only will be held Monday, Wednes­
day and Friday at 4:30 p.m. Co-ed 
classes are scheduled for Tuesday 
and Thursday at 5:30 p.m.

Interested persons can join the 
weight loss program only or 
aerobics classes only. Cost for the 
weight loss program will be $5 per 
week without the aerobics classes, 
or $3 per week with the aerobics 
classes.

Cost for aerobics classes is $15 
per month, which includes a $5 Ac­
tivity Center membership and a $10 
charge for the classes.

Potential “Whole Body Class” 
members may begin at any time. 
Archer said those who become part 
of “The Whole Body Class” will 
receive a t-shirt after 25 classes

and the Presidential Physical 
Fitness Award after 50 classes.

Archer was a leader in a weight 
less program for four years, and

R e s e a r c h  w o r k s .
American Heart 

Association

Sp earm an  Lynx

Shane Srhneitler

1

Spearman Basket l>all 
Supported by

Schneider 
Welding Service

C  / ' ______ I I ____(Jniver Hwy. I  Go Spearman!
6E>9u3811

| \  24 Hr. Service - General Welding ^

S p e arm a n  Lynx

Brett Coats

Go Spearman!

Spearman Basketball 
Supported by

( & ( , Transmission
1421 Graver Hwy.

659-3724

n ra n m flP

Lynx Jr. High •••

Tournament postponed
The Jr. High Lynx teams were in 

action on Monday against West 
Texas. According to Coach Reed 
Cates there were no scores 
available. He did indicate that the 
7th grade A team won their game.

The Spearman 7th grade tourna­
ment got one day of games played 
on Thursday. Inclement weather 
forced the postponement of the rest 
of the tournam ent until the 
weekend of January 17, 18 and 19. 
The tournament will be completed

has been a certified fitness instruc­
tor for 12 years. Interested persons 
should contact her at 659-2954 for 
more information.

■v

in conjunction with the Spearman 
eighth grade tournament.

Tournament Games Completed 
Gruver Boys def. Dalhart 46-16 
Gruver Girls def. Dalhart 45-39 
Perryton Boys def. P. Morse 

43-39(O.T.)
P. Morse Girls def. Perryton

36- 30
Stratford Boys def. S. Fritch 36-20 
Stratford Girls def. S. Fritch

37- 18.

60 ! FIGHT! WIN!!

I
Lynx and Lynxettes!

Spearman Basketball 
Supported by

Northern Natural Gas Co.
an Enron Company

S p c a rm a r
L ynxettes

GO LYNXETTES!!
Carrie Pearson 

Laura Pearson

GO!

FIGHT!

WIN!!

Spearman Basketball , 
Supported by

Kids’ Stuff 
& Lady Fair

719 W. 7th

Go Spearman! i
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T h e  Lynx 7 th  g rad e  te a m  in c lu d e s  H e a th  A rc h e r, 13; Lucas  
B ig g s , 15; J e re m y  B lan , 10; D e rric k  B u rn e tt, 24; C o ry  B u tle r, 
13; D a v id  B re n t C o llin s , 40; M ic h a e l C o v in g to n , 10; G reg  
E ll io tt , 30; J e re m y  F re e m a n , 42; C arey  F u lc e , 12; M a tth e w  G af- 
fo rd , 23 ; J o n a th a n  G a rre tt, 52; C la y to n  H e rg e rt, 3; Jaso n

H o lto n , 35; L e e  J a rv is , 45; J o e  Jen k in s , 51; C o d y  M c L e o d , 5; 
C la y  N e ff ,  12; S h a d le y  O q u in , 21; S h a n n o n  O q u in , 2 0 ; M a rk  
P a rk e r, 30; B ill P it tm a n , 44; M artin  S a n d e rs , 14; P h illip  
S a n d e rs , 4 1 ; D a rre ll S c ro g g s , 25; J o s e  T a ra n g o , 40; C o yt  
T ig re tt , 31; C h r is to p h e r  V a re n h o rs t, 34; an d  J a s o n  V il lin e s , 33.

T h e  S p e a rm a n  m a s c o t, S h a n n a  D e A rm a n a , w iii b e  c h e e r in g  
th e  L y n x  a n d  L y n e tte s  te a m s  a ll th e  w a y  to  th e  s ta te  p la y o ffs .  
S h e  is  n o w  th e  o n ly  S p e a rm a n  m a s c o t.

Go Spearman!

Our PRIDE is Showing! 

We ARE PROUD of YOU

Spearman Basketball 
Supported by

Farm Bureau of Hansford County
307 W. Davis

639-3133

T h e  S p e arm a n  V a rs ity  C h e e r le a d e rs  
M a ry  C o o k, M e n d y  L a s a te r, L isa  L illa rd , R an  
d ie  R en n er, Kyla N e is o n  (c a p ta in ), M a rc i

a re  W o m b le , S u z a n n e  S a n d e rs  a n d  T r ix ie  P e a r­
son. T h e  J .V . L yn x  are  (b a c k  ro w , l-r) M ik e  H a g e r, 

D arian  H a w k in s , B ra d y  R e e d , K h ris  K e lp , Lan- 
j on  S w a n , M a rk  E a k in , C h a d  R ig g in s , B o b

4*
*

*
♦

*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*

*
+
*

*
*

*

P e a rs o n , B ra n d o n  R e x , K ev in  W il l ia m s , B rad  
B u tle r , J u s t in  B o y d , C l in t  T o w n s e n  a n d  
W e s  D y e s s . N o t  p ic tu re d  w a s  C h ris  S tra w n .

The J.V. Lynxettes split a pair of 
games this week. They lost to 
Dalhart on Saturday but turned it 
around on crushed Stratford, 35-8, 
on Tuesday.

Ifr  S h ie ld s , ( fro n t ro w , l-r) S h e rm a n  J o n e s , C u rt is

jgt Lvnxette J.V.
*

JSplit a pair o f gam es
*
*
*
*
*
*
%
*
*
♦
*
*
*
*
*
*
*
*

At Dalhart, Sat. 
Score: Sprm. 37 - Dal. 45 

Scoring: T. Pearson-2, 
P earson-2 , T. T ig re tt-1 , 
Crawford-4, K. Townsen-10, 
Lieb-5, C. Green-9, H. Jarvis-4. 

At Stratford, Tues.

C.
S.
L.

Score: Sprm. 35 - Stra. 8 
Scoring: Tigrett-2, Crawford-5, 

Townsen-2, Lieb-6, Gieene-4, 
Jarvis-9, Tindell-2, Cook-4.

Freshman Lynxettes 
The Freshman Lynxettes played 

host to the West Texas Comanches 
on Monday and came away with a 2 
point victory. The Lynxettes won 
29-27.

VS. West Texas, Mon.
Score: Sprm. 29 - W.T. 27 

Scoring: Lillard-7, Strawn-2, 
Latta-2, OQuin-7, C. Pearson-11.

SCHEDULE
JV  team s

Jan. 4 
Jan. 8 
Jan. 11 
Jan. 15 
Jan. 18 
Jan. 22 
Jan. 25 
Jan. 29 
Feb. 1 
Feb. 5 
Feb. 7-9 
Feb. 8

Dalhart There 
Stratford There 
Sunray Here 
Boys Ran. Here 
Open Date 
West Texas There 
Stratford Here 
Sunray There 
Boys Ran. There 
Guymon There 
W.D. Tour. There 
West Tex. Here

5:00
4:00
5:00
5:00

5:00
5:00
4:00
6:00
5:00
TBA
5:00

Go Soearman!

Spearman Basketball 
, Supported by

H a n co ck306

Lynxette J.H. •••

Win Two
The Jr. High Lynxettes won a 

pair from the West Texas Coman­
ches Monday night. The 8th grade 
defeated their ipponents 32-24. The 
7th grade defeated their opponents 
by scoring ttuee times as many 
points as the Comanches.

8th vs. West Texas 
Score: Sprm. 33-W.T. 24 

Scoring: Kiki Kelp-4, Ashly 
Shieldknight-13, Lyndee Cook-10, 
Traci Martin-3, Kristian Poole-2.

7th vs. West Texas 
Score: Sprm. 33 - W. T. 11 

Scoring: Lacie Baker-5, Carrie 
Burton-2, Kelly Shieldknight-1, 
K ara  Townsen-14, V irg in ia  
Barrera-4, Tiffany Bruning-7.

SCHEDULE 
9th grade Lynx

Jan. 7 West Tex. There
Jan. 14 Gruver There
Jan. 21 Boys Ran. Here
Jan. 24-25-26 W.T. Tour.There 
T B A
Jan. 28 Sunray There
Feb. 4 Panhandle Here

5:00
5:00
5:00

5:00
5:00

SCHEDULE 
7th & 8th Lynx

Jan. 7 West Tex. There 5:00
Jan. 14 Gruver There 5:00
J a n .17 Spr. Tour. Here TBA
Jan. 21 Boys Ran. Here 5:00
Jan. 24 Gruver Here 5:00
Jan. 28 Sunray There 5:00
Jan. 31 West Tex. Here 5:00
Feb. 4 Stratford Here 5:00



FIGHT!

Spearman Basketball 
Supported by

Five Star Equipment, Inc
Hwy. 15 West 
659-3743
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Spearman menu

A m a n d a  N o b le s  (m g r.), (b a ck  ro w , l-r) M e lis s a  
B a k e r, T o m m ie  L a tta , T e lie  O Q u in , C a rrie  
P e a rs o n  an d  B arb ara  R in g .

T h e  F re s h m a n  L y n x e tte s  a re  (fro n t ro w , l-r) 
R a in e y  W h itt in g to n  (m g r.), T r ix ie  P e arso n , 
N ik k i S tra w n , C h r is t ie  T a y lo r , L isa  L illa rd ,

T h e  8 th  g ra d e  L y n x e tte  te a m  in c lu d e s  K ik i K e lp , 10; K o rtn e y  
H e n to n , 11; M a n d i La ir, 2 1 ; M o lly  B la c k m a n , 2 2 ; A sh ly

_ i j i . _ • _t_» A n .  i _________i u o r .  x  M ar l in  H • U o a lk a r

R e im e r , 33 , M ik a  P ip k in , 41; Kristina P a  
J ill C le m e n t , 51; a n d  R o n d a  Renner, 53

T h e  7 th  g ra d e  L y n x e tte  te a m  in c lu d e s  K im  H e a le y , 11; 
C o u rtn e y  D o o le y , 12; C ry s ta l B o yd , 13; J e n n ife r  H u g h e s , 14; 
K a th e r in e  P ip k in , 15; L a c ie  B a k e r, 23; C a rrie  B u rto n , 25; K e lly

S h ie ld k n ig h t , 31; K ara  T o w n s e n , 33; S u m m e r R ig g in s , 35; 
R e g a n  B o x w e ll, 41; V irg in ia  B arrera , 53; T if fa n y  B ru n in g , 55; 
a n d  C h a y c i S h a v e r, 20.

SCHEDULE 
7th & 8th Lynxettes

SCHEDULE 
9th grade Lynxettes

Jan. 7 West Tex. Here 5:00 Jan. 7 West Tex. Here 5:00
Jan. 14 Gruver Here 5:00 Jan. 14 Panhandle Here 5:00
Jan. 17-18-19 Spr. Tour.Here TBA Jan. 24-25-26 W.T. Tour.There
Jan. 28 Sunray Here 5:00 TB A
Jan. 31 West Tex. Here 5:00 Jan 28 Sunray Here 5:00
Feb. 4 Stratford There 5:00 Feb. 4 Panhandle Here 5:00

Spearm an
Lynxettes

Spearman Basket I n i  II 
Supported by

Lusby Cats
W. Gruver Hwv. 

659-3766 *

January 15 - January 18 
Monday: NO SCHOOL 
Tuesday: Taco soup, grilled 

cheese sandwich, salad bar, peach 
rice cream, milk 

Wednesday: Country style fish 
sticks, new potatoes with cheese 
sauce, salad bar, fruit, hot rolls, 
butter, milk

Thursday: Baked chicken or 
smoked sausage, pinto beans, salad 
bar, cornbread, milk 
Friday: Hamburger, fries, salad 
bar, gingerbread, milk

Jr. High/Elementary 
January 15 - January 18 

Monday: NO SCHOOL ' 
Tuesday: Taco soup, grilled 

sandwich, dill spear, fruit, 
of raisins, milk

Wednesday: Country style fish

sticks, new potatoes with cheese 
sauce, cole slaw, fruit, hot rolls, 
butter, milk

Thursday: Sausage on a stick, 
pinto beans, potato salad, corn- 
bread, pudding, milk

Friday: Hamburger, fries, let­
tuce, tomato, pickle, onion, cookie, 
milk

r results 
you want* 
you want I  
classifieds S
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S p e a rm a n  Lynx  
and Ly n x e tte s

G O ! FIGHT! WES!!

Spearman Basketball 
Supported by

Caprock 2
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S p e a rm a n  Lynx  
and Ly n x e tte s

GO !

FIGHT!

WIN!!

Spearman Basketball 
Supported by

^earm an Jack & Jill
123 W. Kenneth

By Larry Butler 
SISb Superintendent

SI SI) S a y  so
I know of very few individuals in 

the state who cherish the thought of 
looking back at the campaigns and 
elections that took place in 
November, but perhaps it might 
create a spark of interest directed 
at limiting the terms or number of 
vears legislators can serve

My first thought is directed at the 
amount of money that is required 
for an individual to run for office. 
At a quick glance, one can readily 
assume that candidates must be 
blessed with an abundance of 
wealth, or have the backing of a 
|‘sugar daddy” with hopes of buy- 
*ng representation once an in­
dividual is elected. In either situa­
tion, the normal, sane citizen is

eliminated from the picture.
The question in my mind is why 

would anyone spend mega-bucks to 
be elected to a position that pays so 
little? I know some say they want to 
serve! Perhaps so in some in­
stances, but more often than not, it 
appears power, greed, or egotism 
could be the prime motivators for 
wanting the positions.

Once e s tab lish ed  in the 
legislative structure, politicians 
seem to garner strength and return 
session after session to wheel and 
deal in hopes of climbing the ladder 
of political recognition and power. 
In looking at the interstructure of 
both houses, you quickly find a 
handful of individuals who dictate 
the agenda and the vote of each bill 
that reaches the floor.

Action on the floor is something 
to behold! If you have never 
observed a session in full swing, do 
yourself a favor and attend. It is a 
totally entertaining event. It

resembles a well-orchestrated 
three-ring circus. You even find a 
few of the “old timers” catching a 
wink or two.

My entire synopsis of verbal 
rambling centers on limiting the 
number of years an individual can 
serve in the Texas Legislature. 
Prefiling began back on Nov. 12. 
And judging from the more than 70 
bills filed late in 1990, lawmakers’ 
wish lists were many.

Pay close attention to House 
Joint Resolution 7, by Represen­
tative Augie Ovard. Ovard’s resolu­
tion proposes a constitutional 
amendment to limit the number of 
years an individual can serve in the 
Texas Legislature. In many in­
stances it would give the people of 
our great state the opportunity to 
elect someone new and know that 
their newly elected politician could 
only damage the economy and 
society for a specified number of 
years.

Something to consider!
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T h e  G ru v e r G re y h o u n d s  ju n io r  v a rs ity  te a m  S h ip le y ,  4 4 ; H e a th  G a in e s ,  5 0 ; M a t t  
in c lu d e s  J e ffre y  P ric e , 30; T .J . B a y le ss , 32; E th e re d g e , 52; an d  C a re y  K a u ffm a n , 54 .
C o d y  B a rk le y , 34; C la y  G illis p ie , 40; Trevor

| Hounds JV,

C r u v c r
Greyhounds

a n d  La d y  ,
»

Greyhounds

G ru v e r  Basketball 
S upported  by

Gruver Lumber 
105 W. Broadway 733-2407

y°ur ACE Hardware Dealer

Junior High 
Schedule

GRUVER JV
Jan. 22 Booker Here 5:00
Jan. 25 Follett Here 5:00
Feb.7-8 W.D. Tour. -TBA 
Feb. 08 Booker There 4:00

GRUVER JUNIOR HIGH 
BOYS SCHEDULE 

Jan. 14 Spearman Here 5:00 
Jan. 17,18,19 Sprm Tm. 7B -TBA 
Jan. 21 Stratford There 5:00 
Jan. 28 Boys Ran. Here 5:00
Jan. 28 Morse 8B Here 5:00
Feb. 04 West T. There 5:00

GRUVER JUNIOR HIGH 
GIRLS SCHEDULE

Jan. 14 Spearman There 5:00
Jan. 17,18,19 Sprm Tm. 7G -TBA 
Jan. 21 Stratford Here 5:00 
Jan. 28 Morse 8G Here 5:00 
Feb. 04 West T. Here 5:00

We ARE PROUD of YOU!

Go Gruver!

G ru v e r  Basketball 
Supported  by

The Gruver Greyhounds varsity

Meet the Greyhounds
Trent Seagler

Trent Seagler wears number 30 
and plays post for the Gruver 
Greyhounds. He is 6’1” and weighs 
165 pounds. He is a junior at GHS.

Trent’s parents are Stan and 
Sharon Seagler. He has two 
brothers, Troy and Ty.

Trent’s other interest is football.

Luke Miller
Luke Miller wears number 42 and 

plays forward for the Gruver 
Greyhounds. He is 5’10” and weighs 
190 pounds. He is a junior at GHS.

Luke’s parents are Larry and 
Camille Miller. He has two sisters, 
Yvette and Lauren.

Luke’s other interests include 
golf and tennis.

Ryan Mathews
Ryan Mathews wears number 32 

and plays forward for the Gruver 
Greyhounds. He is 6’ and weighs 
140 pounds. He is a junior at GHS.

Ryan’s parents are Royce and 
Betty Mathews. He has two sisters, 
Raquel and Robbi.

Ryan’s other interest is football.

Kevin Spivey
>*■

Kevin Spivey wears number 12 
and plays guard for the Gruver 
Greyhounds. He is 5’11” and weighs 
145 pounds. He is a sophomore at 
GHS.

Kevin’s parents are Brad and 
Gyene Spivey. He has one brother, 
Chris, and one sister, Lexy.

Kevin’s other interests include 
playing football and playing pool.

Marty McCloy
Marty McCloy wears number 10 

and plays guard for the Gruver 
Greyhounds. He is 5’10” and weighs 
155 pounds. He is a junior at GHS.

Marty’s parents are Allen and 
Karen McCloy. He has one sister, 
Kelly.

Marty’s other interests include 
rodeoing, skiing and football.

Geronimo Ortega
Geronimo Ortega wears number 

24 and plays guard for the Gruver 
Greyhounds. He is 5’8” and weighs 
147 pounds. He is a senior at GHS.

Geronimo’s parents are Ramon 
and Alicia. He has three brothers, 
Ramon, Gilbert and Arthur. He has 
four sisters, Irma, Celia, Ana and 
Carmen.

Geronimo’s other interests in­
clude football, watching movies 
and reading the Bible.

Matthew Hoel
Matthew Hoel wears number 34 

and plays post for the Gruver 
Greyhounds. He is 6’1” and weighs 
180 pounds. He is a junior at GHS.

Matthew’s parents are Mack and 
Darlene Hoel. He has one brother, 
Brian.

Matthew’s other interests include 
football, tennis and hunting.

Shannon Pool
Shannon Pool wears number 22 

and plays forward for the Gruver 
Greyhounds. He is 6’1” and weighs 
150 pounds. He is a junior at GHS.

Shannon’s parents are Teddy and 
Angie Pool. He has one brother, 
Brady, and one sister, Josie.

Shannon’s other interests include 
football, track, hunting, girls and 
making money.

Rex Ralston
Rex Ralston wears number 52 

and plays post for the Gruver 
Greyhounds. He is 5’9” and weighs 
160 pounds. He is a junior at GHS.

Rex’s parents are Dan and Pen- 
nye Ralston. He has one sister, 
Tisha.

Rex’s other interests include 
football, golf and making and spen­
ding money.

Brady Pool
Brady Pool wears number 20 and 

plays guard for the G ruver 
Greyhounds. He is 5’10” and weighs 
140 pounds. He is a sophomore at 
GHS.

Brady’s parents are Teddy and 
Angie Pool. He has one brother, 
Shannon, and one sister, Josie.

Brady’s other interests include 
roping, riding saddle broncs, foot­
ball and track.

Will Evans
Will Evans is a filmer for the 

Gruver Greyhounds. He is 5’5” and 
weighs 105 pounds.

Will’s parents are Gary and Nelle 
Evans. He has one sister, Kristin.

Will’s other interests include 
hunting, fishing, and football.

District forecast. . .
by Bob Bort

The Gruver girls and boys varsi­
ty basketball teams have had some 
outstanding teams in the past, in­
cluding two boys teams which won 
state championships. But two years 
ago the Hounds and Lady Hounds 
accomplished a rare feat: they put 
it together at the same time for a 
double district championship.

Forecasters say it won’t happen 
again. “Yes” for the Hounds but 
“no” for the Lady Hounds.

The forecasters are down on the 
Lady Hounds, who are 4-12 going in-

Gruver
Greyhounds

a n d  L a d y  
G reyhounds

FIGHT!

to the Stratford Tournament and 
have a young team. One poll. Texas 
Association of Basketball Coaches, 
predicts: 1. Booker, 2. Follett, 3. 
Darrouzett, 4. Gruver, 5. Higgins. 
Another, of which Coach Mike 
Banks is a member, Texas Girls 
Coaches Association, predicts: 1. 
Booker, 2. Follett, 3. Gruver, 4. 
Darrouzett, 5. Higgins.

How good are the forecasters? 
No one last year picked the ladies 
from Darrouzett to win a playoff 
spot and then give Channing a royal 
scare in their bi-district game.

“We are capable of playing a lot 
better than what we’re doing,” said 
Coach Banks. “Everyone is a little 
disappointed - hopefully, we’ll get 
things together in district - get it 
rolling,” he added.

Those comments were made just 
prior to one of the Lady Hounds’ 
best games of the year, a 61-56 loss 
to the tough Lady Bulldogs of 
Borger. This team has been truly 
up and down this year, looking very 
strong against Canadian (a 20-point 
victory) and Borger but looking 
bad in the Canadian Tournament 
and earlier against teams like 
Wheeler and Vega, where they 
were the victims of first quarter ex­
plosions.

If they jell at some near point and 
play like they have when they have 
looked good, this team is without a 
doubt the darkhorse in district 1-A 
this year.

The Hounds should be big 
favorites in the district 1-A boys’ 
race following two successive 
regional qualifying teams, but 
Hounds coach Tim Garland has not 
seen a forecast yet. “It should be 
Follett as the main challenger, but 
the team that really scares me now 
since this year has begun is Hig­
gins,” says Garland. “They are 
playing very well, so it could be 
Higgins or Follett as our main 
challenger,” he explains.

The Hounds were 30-5 in 1988-89, 
284 in 1989-90, and are 10-5 this year 
against some really tough competi­
tion. “We have made progress,” 
says Coach Garland. “The good 
competition has benefitted us. We 
are playing very well defensively, 
and that is what we have to do. The 
kids are not relying on one or two 
people - everyone is chipping in. 
That is the brightest spot - 
everyone is capable ”
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The Gruver Lady Hounds varsity

Meet the Lady Hounds
The G ru ver Lady H o u n d s  ju n io r  vars ity  

team  in c lu d e s  M o n ic a  W a rd . 11; S h a n n a  J a r­
vis, 15; N a n c y  A lva rez , 13; A n g e la  S is tru n k , 33;

G in a  H o e l, 35; S h a rle t S lo u g h , 41; J a n e lle  
H a e fn e r , 43; S a ra  J o n e s , 45; K a s e y  D avis , 55; 
an d  A n d e e  S a lm a n s , 25 .

Jennifer Hart
Jennifer Hart wears number 10 

and plays wing for the Lady 
Hounds. She is a senior at GHS.

Jennifer’s parents are Jerry and 
Brenda Hart. She has one sister, 

[ Janyth.
Jennifer’s other interests include 

| cross country, listening to music, 
reading, cooking and being with 

[friends.

brothers, Clint, Charles Griffin and 
James Griffin.

Stacey’s other interests include 
gymnastics and spending time with 
family and friends.

Weslyn.
Wynn’s other interests include 

basketball, track and showing pigs.

Mika McLain
Cora Mever

Marci Roberts
Marci Roberts wears number 34 

ind plays post for the Lady 
founds. She is a senior at GHS. 
Marci’s parents are Jim and Bet­

ty Roberts and she has one brother, 
frey, and three sisters, Brooke, 
mber and Autumn.
M arci’s other interests are 

jading, sports (all), being with 
riends and cooking.

Cora Meyer wears number 3u and 
plays guard for the I,ady Hounds. 
She is a sophomore at GHS.

Cora’s parents are Robert and 
Evi Meyer. She has two sisters, 
Julie and Holly.

Cora’s other interests include 
running, reading and friends.

Holly Venneman

Mika McLain wears number 42 
and plays post for the Lady 
Hounds. She is a freshman at GHS.

Mika’s parents are Mike and 
Diane McLain. She has one 
brother, Buster, and one sister, 
Molly.

Mika’s other interests include 
horseback riding, talking with 
friends, family, friends, telephone, 
going places and shopping.

Ashley Wagner

Traci Crawford
Traci Crawford wears number 24 

Ihd plays guard for the I^ady 
founds. She is a sophomore at

|T raci’s parents are Scott and 
yle Crawford and she has one 
ter, Kalee.
raei’s other interests include 
ss country, reading, water ski- 
and NBA (Detroit Pistons).

Holly Venneman wears number 
54 and plays post for the I^ady 
Hounds. She is a sophomore at 
GHS.

Holly’s parents are Joe T. and 
Linda Venneman. She has one 
brother, Klint, and one sister, Kim.

Holly’s other interests include 
playing the piano, riding horses, 
4-H, writing books and spending 
time with family and friends.

Ashley Wagner is a manager for 
the Lady Hounds. She is a senior at 
GHS.

Ashley’s parents are Richard and 
Wanda Wagner. She has one 
brother, Brent, and one sister, 
Kimbo.

Ashley’s other interests include 
shopping, being with friends, talk­
ing on the telephone and listening to 
music.

The 7th  g ra d e  G ru v e r G re y h o u n d s  te a m -in -  
cludes T rav is  F e rg u s o n , 21; W y le e  M a u p in , 
25; Sam m y R e n te ria , 31; M ax  F ric k , 35; B a iley  
Barkley, 15; Ju an  A rre o la , 40; J a s o n  W a rd , 22;

D a n ie l B o rt, 14; D o u g  G u m fo ry , 11; R o b ert 
T e e l, 3; C h ris  M u s ic k , 51; A n d y  M o rr is , 53; an d  
E llis  M c M illa n , 55.

Wynn Maupin Amy Mounts

Amy Gumfory

Wynn Maupin wears number 40 
and plays post for the Lady 
Hounds. She is a freshman at GHS.

Wynn’s parents are Wesley and 
Micky Maupin and she has one 
brother, Wylee, and one sister.

Amy Mounts is a manager for the 
I^ady Hounds.

Amy’s parents are Bobby and 
Linda Mosier.

Amy’s other interests include 
volleyball and t.v.

GO
GRUVER!

wAmv Gumfory is manager for the 
■ d v Hounds. She is a sophomore 
at.GHS.

Amy’s parents are Gary and San­
dra Gumfory. She has one brother, 

lug.
Imy’s other interests include 
Ice, cooking, shopping, and talk- 

on the phone.

Anissa Ryan
Anissa Ryan wears number 12 
\d plays guard for the I^ady 

founds. She is a freshman at GHS. 
Anissa’s parents are Steve and 

Jessie Ryan. She has a sister, 
Li lee.

Eva Babbs

She

Eva Babbs wears number 22 and 
days guard for the Lady Hounds, 

is a senior at GHS.
Eva’s parents are Mike and Amy 

Babbs. She has one sister, Shell.
Eva’s other interests include 

playing basketball and being with 
friends and family.

G ru v e r ’s 8 th  g rad e  H o u n d s  te a m  in c lu d e s  
K yle  M c N e tt ,  5; J o h n  H o lla n d , 21; R yo n  A t ­
w o o d , 22; G ra n t O d o m , 24; R o m a  T o m lin s o n , 
35; J a c e  D a w s o n , 40; W ill E th e re d g e , 42; F a ­
b ia n  S a la za r , 44; C lin t W il lia m s , 4; J a k e  M c ­

C u llo u g h , 20; W e s le y  B a b b s , 23; J .D . C h ris ­
t ia n , 30; R o s a lio  A rreo la , 32; G a le n  S lo u g h , 34; 
J im m y  A c e ve d o , 41; R ic k y  O liv a , 43; R icard o  
S o to , 52; B rad y  T id w e ll, 54; Is a ia s  A rza te , 45; 
in d  K y le  D e e d s , 12.

G ru ver  
G reyhound s  

a n d  L a d y  
G reyhounds

G ru v e r  B asketball 
S upported  by

CaprocK 2 
FMZ387

SCHEDULE
GRUVER VARSITY

Stacey Williams
Stacey Williams wears number 

20 and plays wing for the Lady 
Hounds. She is a junior at GHS.

Stacey’s parents are Ronnie and 
Donna Williams and she has three

Jan.
Jan.
Jan.
Jan.

15
18
22
25

Jan. 29 
Feb. 01 
Feb. 05 
Feb. 8

Higgins Here 
Darrouzett There 
Booker Here 
Follett Here 
Charming Here 
Higgins There 
Darrouzett Here 
Booker There

6:30
6:30
5:00
5:00
6:30
6:30
6:30
4:00
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Gruver Basketball 
Supported by

HVaquero 
425 Main 
733-9407
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G ruver
Lad y

Greyhounds

Varsity Girls

Gruver Basketball 
Supported by 
Bort Agency Inc. 

510 Main 
733-2456

GO!
FIGHT!

WIN!

G ru v e r  B asketball 
S upported  by

Gruver Recli-Mix 
700 S. McCree 

733-2007

y
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T h e  G ru ver 8 th  g ra d e  Lady H o u n d s  te a m  in ­
c lu d e s  (fro n t row , l-r) M o n ic a  G a rc ia , Kaisi 
F o s te r , K im  V e n n e m a n , A n g e la  O verb ey , 
T ra c y  R o b in s o n , J a n y th  H a rt, J u lie  M eyer,

Gruver 
Greyhounds 

and Lady  
Greyhounds

(b a c k  ro w , l-r) C a rm e n  O rte g a , K im b e rly  
W a g n e r, M e lis s a  T h o m p s o n , S a n d y  R ich . 
L acy  B a rk ley , J o n a  B o ney, K a y c e  H a e n is c h , 
T is h a  R a ls to n  and W e n d y  R o d riq u e z .

__ 4 ' k
The G ru ver 7 th  g ra d e  L a d y  H o u n d s  te a m  in ­

c lu d e s  (fro n t row , l-r) R o x a n e  H o lt , J u lie  
A g u ila r, K ik i C a r th e l, M o lly  M c L a in , Tara  
S h ap ley , S h a n n o n  A c k e r, (s e c o n d  ro w , l-r) 
M yriam  A lv a re z , J o s ie  P o o l, M e m o ry  R o ss,

IihI

|  G ru v e r Basketball 
Supported by

1  
1  
1  
1

p]

isif

Gruver Body Shop 
104 W. 4tn 733-2941

Our PRIDE is Showing!

G ru v e r  B asketball 
S upported  by

P U R IN A

Orver-Agri ind. 
200 W. Broadway

733-5005

.  f  " , >A 'll
S o c o rro  O r te g a , J e n n ife r  S te v e n s , H a ile y  
L a m b , J a n e t M o ra le s , C h ris ty  M a rq u e z , (b a c k  
ro w , l-r) A m b e r  G ro s s , R o b b i M a tth e w s , E rica  
B lo u n t, Y uk i B o rt, J o n i H a rt, T e re s a  B e rn a l, 
C h ris ty  D u d le y  a n d  C o ri L o w e .

T h e  G ru v er 9 th  g ra d e  H o u n d s  team  in c lu d e s  K e n to n  O d o n  
12; T e k  F e rg u s o n , 22; L e e  S te d je . 30; H art D e r in g to n . 32; V :r  
to r L o p ez , 34; F re d d y  A g u illa r , 40: Ray C o o m e r. 42: an d  R o b o .i 
W h ita k e r , 44

B o o k k e e p e rs  a n d  m a n a g e rs  fo r  th e  v a rs ity  L a d y  H o u n d s  are  
(l-r) A m y  M o u n ts . A s h le y  W a q n e r  an d  A m y  G u m fo ry .

Mid-season stats reveal team effort
by Bob Bort

The mid-season statistics reveal 
that the Gruver Greyhounds and 
the Lady Hounds are playing team 
b asketba ll. Here a re  the 
cumulative stats for the two teams 
after the non-district season, going 
into the district opener with Follett.

Hounds (through 18 games):
In scoring average, Geronimo 

Ortega leads with an average of 
14.1 points per game, then comes 
Matthew Hoel at 10.8, Trent 
Seagler at 9.8 and Shannon Pool at 
8.7. In shooting percentage, Seagler 
leads with 56 percent, followed by 
Matthew Hoel at 48 percent and 
Kevin Spivey at 42 percent. Hoel 
has a fine 3-point shooting percen­
tage of 55 percent (6-11). Ortega 
leads in three-pointers with 36, 
followed by Spivey with 21.

From the free throw line, Luke 
Miller is shooting 69 percent, 
followed by Spivey at 65 percent, 
Ortega and Hoel at 64 percent, and 
Pool and Rex Ralston at 62 percent.

Pool and Seagler are virtually 
dead even in rebounding statistics. 
Pool has 130, for a game average of 
7.2, and Seagler has 129, for the 
same average. Hoel has 94 re­

bounds, for an average of 5.2. 
Seagler leads on the offensive 
boards and Pool on the defensive
boards.

Ortega has 58 steals, followed by 
Pool with 38, Marty McCloy with 36 
and Hoel with 34. Ortega also leads 
in assists with 45, followed by Mc­
Cloy with 44 and Pool with 41. 
Seagler has nine blocked shots and 
McCloy has five.

In team stats, Gruver is shooting 
40 percent while their opponents 
are shooting 42 percent. The 
Hounds are averaging 59.2 points 
per game, their opponents 50.7. 
Gruver has hit 71 three-pointers, 
while their opponents have hit only 
22 From the free throw line, 
Gruver is out-shooting their op­
ponents 57 percent to 55 percent, 
and they have hit 27 more free 
throws (203-176).

Gruver is outrebounding their op­
ponents 614-526, or an average of 
34.1 to 29.2 per game. Gruver has 
committed 321 turnovers, but they 
have forced their opponents to 
make 411. Fouls are virtually even - 
311 for the Hounds, 310 for their op­
ponents. Ryan Mathews and Brady 
Pool, though not mentioned, have 
played outstanding basketball off 
the bench.

Lady Hounds (through 19 games):
In scoring average, Anissa Ryan 

leads with an average of 10.9 points 
per game. She is followed by Holly 
Venneman at 8.6 and Wynn Maupin 
at 7.5. In shooting percentage, Ven­
neman leads at 49 percent, followed 
by Marci Roberts at 45 percent. 
Ryan has hit 28 three-pointers, 
Traci Crawford 11, Eva Babbs 
seven, Jennifer Hart six and Cora 
Meyer five.

From the free throw line, Ryan is 
hitting 78 percent, Babbs 71 per­
cent, Crawford 70 percent, Stacey 
Williams 64 percent and Maupin 
and Mika McLain 62 percent.

In rebounding statistics, Maupin 
leads with 123, an average of 6.5 per 
game, followed by Venneman (117, 
6.2) and McLain (111, 5.8). Roberts 
leads on the offensive boards, 
Maupin on the defensive boards.

Maupin has 44 steals, Babbs 35, 
Ryan 32 and Hart 30. Ryan and

Babbs have 58 assists each, follow­
ed by Meyer with 36 and Crawford 
with 28. McLain has nine blocked 
shots.

In team stats, the Lady Hounds 
are shooting 34 percent, and their 
opponents are shooting 42 percent. 
Gruver is averaging 51.8 points per 
game, while their opponents are 
averaging 55.5. Gruver has hit 58 
three-pointers, their opponents 10. 
From the free throw line, Gruver is 
out-shooting their opponents 61 per­
cent to 54 percent, but Gruver only 
has two more free throws than their 
opponents (281-279).

The Lady Hounds are outreboun­
ding their opponents 687-679, or an 
average of 36.2 per game to 35.7 per 
game. Gruver has committed 459 
turnovers to their opponents’ 455. 
One big statistic is that Gruver has 
committed 431 fouls, and their op­
ponents have been whistled only 392 
times.

For the Short of it

GO GREYHOUNDS

I rent Seagler

by Bob Bort
I thought I would pass along my 

predictions for 1991.
FEBRUARY

8 - Hounds and Lady Hounds 
reign as District 1-A champions.

MARCH
9 - The Gruver Greyhounds will 

defeat Moulton 67-66 for the 1991 
State Class A Basketball Cham­
pionship in Austin.

MAY
II - The Gruver I^ady Hounds 

track and field team will win the 
1991 State Class A Track and Field 
Championship in Austin. Brandy 
Shelton will win the 400 and 800 
meters, and all three relay teams 
(400, 800,1600) will place in the top 
three.

SEPTEMBER
6-27 - The Gruver Greyhounds 

will finish the month of September 
unbeaten at 4-0.

NOVEMBER
8 -The Gruver Greyhounds will 

reign as the 1991 District 1-A foot­
ball champs. '

A note: I have been asked twice 
since the Follett games why I was 
not in attendance. First, we don’t 
have a car. Second, I’m not suppos­
ed to drive at night. I would dearly 
love to attend the district road 
games and write them up. If so­
meone were to offer me a ride, I 
surely wouldn’t turn it down.

Anyone heading to Gruver road 
games, help!

I V 1 A 1 L 4

506 Main 733-5040

GO!

FIGHT!

WIN!
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Way to go Gruver Greyhounds

Boys & Girls

7th & 8th

Jr. Varsity & Varsity

From  your friend* at

Youth Happening

Everyone WELCOME 
to Youth H appening 

Wednesday Eve. 6 :3 0  p.m .

m m su «m ni d im fo  o o o tnnraoa irinnnnnnrtiB u »mn>mi 0 0 m m nrt

m
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= £ j l  Oil & Gas Report
w W M krw m  |  w f.f .k FM niM n ia n  3 Oil Well Comoletion

N O T IC E
D e a d lin e  to  p la c e  o r  c a n c e l 

c la s s i f ie d  lin e  a d s  is  T u esd ay  noon  
fo r  T h u rs d a y  in s e r t io n .

C L A S S IF IE D  RATE 
$4.00 f i r s t  in s e r t io n  

$3 .00 ea ch  a d d it io n a l in s e r t io n  
(30 w o rd s  o r  less)

13 ' e a ch  w o rd  o ve r 30 
L e g a l N o tic e s : 15* p e r w o rd

A d s  m u s t be  p a id  in  fu l l  in  cash  
b e fo re  p u b lic a t io n , u n le s s  a d v e rtis e r 
has  e s ta b lis h e d  c re d it  w ith  th e  
R e p o rte r-S ta te sm a n .

P a y m e n t  f o r  o u t  o f  s t a t e  
c la s s if ie d s  m u s t be  in  th e  fo rm  o f  a 
m o n e y  o rd e r  o r  c a s h ie r 's  c h e c k .

N o  t e a r s h e e t s  p r o v id e d  fo r  
c la s s i f ie d  ads.

T e a rs h e e ts  p ro v id e d  o n  re q u e s t fo r 
le g a l n o tic e s .

R IA L ESTATE
FOR SALE: 3 Bedroom, 2 bath home. 
Sunken living room, parquet floors, 
fireplace, covered patio, 2 car garage, 
sprinkler system, 2193 sq. ft. livin 
space, excellent location. Call 659-358 
or 659-5022.
S33-RTN
TWO LOTS for sale at 108 Wanda Drive in 
Spearman. Call 659-3445.
S43-ltcRTN

1111 S. HANEY - Nice 3 bdr, 1 ^  bath, 
covered patio, large storage building, new 
siding, new central heat/air unit. Call 
Jerry, 659-3585, or Joy, 665-4425. 
S ll-ltcR TN

622 S. ENDIC0TT - Cute 2 bdr, 1 bath, 
double car garage, corner lot. $19,000 or 
pay equity and take up payments. Call 
Jerry, 659-3585, or Joy, 665-4425. 
S ll-ltcR TN

MOBILE HOMES
12 x 60 NEWLY REMODELED trailer house 
with deck. Fenced in yard with carport. 
Can see at 119 N. Brandt, Spearman. Call 
659-5056 or 659-3487.
S l l - l t -

FOR RENT
HOUSE FOR RENT: 5 miles out on Per- 
ryton Hwy. 3 bdr, 2 baths, 2 acres land 
optional. $350 neg., $250 dep. Call 
659-2245 early mornings or after 8 p.m. 
S ll-ltcR TN

Count on the 
Classifieds 

to Do the Jobil
Qnfuifc

GOLDEN SPREAD REALTY
Janye Helton Pointer, Broker Owner, 

435 5444
Jennifer Nollner, Sales Associate 659-5243

Old Hansford U r ^ ^ t t A C ' - t y  home 
on a ' ^ l ) f c * .  • ud! Krice reduced!
821 Dressen - 5 /2 . lots of house for the 
money! Call today!
515 S. Bernice - 4 / 1 1*. extra large lot & 
close to school!
18 S. James«  -de base
m e n \ j M D ^ u u i id in g  in back!
605 Archer - 3 /2 , large rooms plus deck 
and hot tub!
101 E. 12th - 3 / 1 1'?, move-in condition 
Great location!
701 Collier - 4 / l ‘/j, affordable 3 year old 
home!
515 S. Haney - 3 /1  Don't miss this 
Farmer's Home house!
611 S. Evans - 3 / 1 * .  affordable!
118 Townsend 4 /2 ,  apartment included. 
Price slashed!
315*/, “  Bernice Lot »or sale'

I V l f  P K N W V T IY  IM N K D A N U O P E K

MISC. FOR SALE
EARL & ROSIE WAIDE Estate Sale. Jan 
11 13. 9 a m 5 pm ., 718 SW 15th, Per- 
ryton. TX. Many collectables and artist 
supplies. New and antique picture 
frames. Women's clothing, large sizes, 
many new. Lawn equipment, Avon bot­
tles, bell collection, bottle collection, 
china and china painting supplies, 
crystal, etc.
S ll- ltc 6 .3 7

FOR RENT: Private trailer house lot. Good 
neighborhood, nice yard, driveway. Call 
659-3657, leave message, or call 
659-2408. Located at 317 S. Endicott, 
Spearman. $65 per month.
S06-1 tpRTN

AUTOMOBILES

1988 RED CUTLASS Supreme, fully load 
ed; and 1984 red Camaio, low price, good 
school car. See at 1102 Linn Drive or call 
659-3402 after 4 p.m.
S Il-2 tp

^MOBILE CUTLASS Calais SSC, 
maiuon and grey. Like new condition, 
$14,000. Call 659-5056 or 659-3487. 
S l l - l t p

JAN’S ETC. NEW & USED 
& ANTIQUES TOO

Everything for home and family. Plains 
Shopping Center in Spearman. Open 
Monday - Saturday, 9:30 a.m. til 6:00 
p.m.
S16-RTN

PIANO FOR SALE: Wanted responsible 
party to take on small monthly payments. 
See locally. Trade-ins accepted. Credit 
manager 1 -800-233 8663.
S10-3tp

AUCTIONS
FOR SALE: 1- Flex King pickers for 7 x 6 
Sweep Plow: 1- JD model 900, 13 Shank 
Ripper w/fert. and Buster Bar attach­
ment. 1- 1965 IHC Truck Tractor, single 
axle; 1- 6 row cultipacker; 1-1979 Lincoln 
Town Car; 2 rims for early JD 4630 Trac­
tor; 1 ton Welding Truck, Miller Welder, 
Poles & e le c tr ic  w in c h . Call 
806-435-7279.
S l l - l t c

HELP WANTED
SECRETARY RECEPTIONIST

Call 733-5124 to set up appointment.
510- ltcRTN

URGENTLY NEED DEPENDABLE PERSON 
to work without supervision for Texas oil 
co. in Spearman area. We train. Write 
G.M. Dickerson. Pres., SWEPC0, Box 
961005, Ft. Worth, TX 76161
511- ltp

SITUATION WANTED
WILL DO BABYSITTING in my home. Call 
659-3299.
Sll-ltp

MATURE, DEPENDABLE WOMAN willing 
to work. Will do cleaning, babysitting or 
carirg for elderly homebound. Call Elaine 
Boyd. 659-3473 or 659-3684 
S l l - l tp

SPECIAL NOTICE

$ $  L O A N S  $ $

Personal/business 
From $1,000 to $1 

m illion.
V e n t u r e  c a p i »a I

available.
Immediate relief f 
all major credit ca* K  

Call 1-800-845-5598

NOTICE
Wallace Monument Co. 
Monuments, Curbing, 

Grave Covers 
1-800-999-9506 

Local Representative 
LEONARD JAMESON 

Spearman, Texas 
35s-rtn

OSGOOD
MONFMFiNT < O.

Amarillo. Texas
Dealers of Rock of Agos 
Granite, as well as .ill colored 
granites. marble and bron/.e 
menu rials.

r e p r e M ‘i i l e d  h v

BOX WFI I, BROS. 
FFNFR AI III IMF

5 I S. Fvons 
<>5<#-3802

House & Floor Leveling
CHILDERS BROTHERS 

Free Estimates 
1-800-299-9563 

Amarillo, Texas

CALL YOUR LOCAL used cow dealer for 7 
days a week dead stock removal. 
659-3544 or 1 800 692 4043. Serving 
cattlemen for the past 20 years.
G51-RTN

Are You A  Victim 
o f Physical Abuse ?

Call Toll Free

1-800-753-5308
T ra ined  counselors can  

help  you  on th e  roa d  to  an  
abuse-free life. W e also  
operate a  sa fe  p la c e  fo r  
victim s a n d  th e ir  ch ildren  
to  s ta y  in tim es o f  crisis.

Panhandle Crisis Center 
Serving Lipscomb, Hansford 
and Ochiltree Counties 

315 1 / 2  S. Main 
_  „ Perry ton, TX ._______

PUBLIC NOTICES
NOTICE Of APPLICATION FOR WASTE DISPOSAL 

PERMIT AMENDMENT

PALO DUR0 FEEDYARD. P 0  Box 1038. Gruver, 
Texas 79040 has applied to the Texas Water Com­
mission for an amendment to Permit No. 01546 in 
order to update the permit to include all feedlot ex­
pansion projects. The permit authorizes disposal of 
waste and watewater from a cattle feed yard with a 
maximum of 32,000 in confinement. Stormwater, 
washdown water and flushwater are retained in 
four storage ponds, where subsequently it is used 
for irrigation on 300 acres of agricultural land 
Manure/solids will be disposed of as fertilizer on 
agricultural land No discharge of pollutants into 
the waters of the State is authorized by this permit.

The cattle feedyard is on the northwest corner of 
the intersection of State Highway 136 and Farm-to- 
Market Road 520. approximately 10 miles south ol 
the City of Gruver in Hansford County. Texas This 
location is in the drainage area of the Palo Duro 
Creek in Segment No. 0100 of the Canadian River 
Basin.

The Executive Director of the Texas Water Com 
mission has prepared a draft permit based on the 
application submitted by the applicant and other 
information presently available.

Legal Authority Section 26.028 of the Texas 
Water Code and 31 TAC Chapter of the Rules of the 
Texas Water Commission.

No public hearing will be held on this application 
unless an affected person who has received notice 
of the application has requested a public hearing. 
Any such request for a public hearing shall be in 
writing and contain (1) the name, mailing address 
and phone number of the person making the re­
quest; and (2) a brief description of how the re­
quester, or persons represented by the requester, 
would be adversely affected by the granting ol the 
application. If the Commission determines that the 
request sets out an issue which is relevant to the 
application, or that a public hearing, would serve 
the public interest, the Commission shall conduct a 
public hearing, after the issuance of proper and 
timely notice of the hearing. If no sufficient request 
for heating is received within 30 days of the date of 
publication of the notice concerning the applica­
tion, the permit will be submitted to the Commis­
sion for final decision on the application.

Requests for a public hearing on this application 
should be submitted in writing to Claire P Aren 
son. Assistant Chief Hearings Examiner, Texas Water 
Commission, P0. Box 13087, Capitol Station,
Austin, Texas 78711, Telephone (512) 463 7905 
Information concerning any technical aspect of this 
application can be obtained by writing Randy 
Wilburn. Wastewater Permits Section, Texas Water 
Commission, P.0 Box 13087. Capitol Station,
Austin, Texas 7871 1, Telephone (512) 463 8201.

Issued this 18th day of December, 1990'
(Seal)

s Bienda W. Foster 
Chief Clerk 

Texas Water Commission
SI 1 ltc61 20

j |  Classifieds |£

Cold weather 
doesn't freeze
CLASSIFIED 

ADS ACTION

WEEK ENDING JAN. 3

Intentions to Drill
HANSFORD (WILDCAT & 

HUNTER Council Grove) Jones 
Energy, Afl-55 Holt (640 ac) 2570’ 
from South & 2568’ from West line, 
Sec. 155,45,H&TC, 1*2 mi SW from 
Hansford, PD 3700' (210 West Park 
Ave., Suite 2300, Okla. City, OK 
73102)

HANSFORD (WILDCAT & COD 
I.ARD 4880’) Jones Energy, #1 
Skinner Farms Unit (640 ac) 2225’ 
from South & 440’ from East line, 
Sec. 91,4-T,T&NO, 2 mi west from 
Spearman, PD 5250’.

IJPSCOMB (WILDCAT & S.W. 
LIPSCOMB Lower M orrow) 
Bracken Energy Co., 01-247 Tubb 
(640 ac) 1000’ from South & 467’ 
from West line, Sec. 247,43,H&TC, 
11 nil SW from Lipscomb, PD 11700’ 
(6106 North Western, Okla. City, 
OK 73118)

Application to Deepen 
GRAY (PANHANDLE) Rio 

Petroleum, Inc., 02 J.S. Morse ‘C’ 
(40 ac) 990’ from South & West line, 
Sec. 67,25,H&GN, 8 mi SE from 
I>efors, PD 2960’ (600 South Tyler, 
012013, Amarillo, TX 79101)

Application to Plug-Back
LIPSCOMB (WEST HIGGINS 

Tonkawa) Wolf Creek Exploration 
Co., 02 Cleveland (161 ac) 660’ from 
South & 1250’ from East line, Sec.
103.43, H&TC, 11 mi south from 
Lipscomb, PD 10918’ (Box 14002, 
Amarillo, TX 79101)

Application to Re-Enter 
OCHILTREE (WILDCAT & 

ELLIS RANCH Douglas) Taylor 
Energy Corp., 01-850 Duke (640 ac) 
660’ from North & East line, Sec.
850.43, H&TC, 9 mi south from 
Booker, PD 6648’ (Box 7587, 
Amarillo, TX 79114)

CLASSIFIED ADS < r* 
* *  PAY Off !  ^

Farm & Ranch 
And Commerc ial 

Property For Sale
6 0 0  a c . o f  la n d , s o u th e a s t o f  B o o k e r, 
4 0 0  a c re s  o f  c u lt iv a te d ,  2 0 0  a c re s  o f 
g ra ss la n d . O w n e r  w ill c a rry  s o m e  p a p e r. 
320 a c .  o f  ir r ig a te d  la n d . S o u th w e s t o f 
P e rry to n  o n  b la c k to p  roa d .
3 2 2  a c . Ir r ig a te d  la n d , lo c a te d  n e a r 
P e rry to n  w ith  a b u n d a n t i r r ig a te d  w a te r . 
P r ic e  h a s  b e e n  re d u c e d .
3 2 0  a c . I r r ig a te d  lo c a te d  S o u th w e s t o f 
P e rry to n . 1 ,0 0 0  g a llo n  p e r  m in u te  ir r i­
g a tio n  w e ll.
160 a c . d ry la n d  lo c a te d  s o u th w e s t o f 
P e rry to n . E x c e lle n t fa rm .
2 7 6  a c . fa rm la n d  lo c a te d  n o r th  o f  P e r ­
ry to n . V e ry  w e ll lo c a te d .
H o m e  a n d  4 4  a c r e s  o f  g ra s s . V e ry  
n ic e  h o m e  w ith  liv e s to c k  fa c ilit ie s .
3 2 0  a c .  I r r ig a te d  la n d  lo c a te d  
N o r th  o f  F a rn s w o r th .
4 8 0  a c .  D ry la n d  w h e a t  fa rm . 
S o u th  o f  B o o k e r .

C o m m e rc ia l
2 1 7  S .W . 3 rd  —  B e a u ty  s h o p  fo r s a le  
w ith  o r  w ith o u t  e q u ip m e n t. B u ild in g  is 
m u lt i - p u ip o s e  a n d  w o u ld  m a k e  an 
e x c e lle n t o f f ic e  o r  b o u tiq u e .

F A R M  & R A N C H  D IV IS IO N
N E A L  F L A T H E R S  

D E P T . M A N A G E R /S A L E S  A S S O C . 
P h o n e  8 0 6 -4 3 5 -7 0 1 5  

E v e n in g s  8 0 6 -6 5 8 -4 4 1 8  
B E T H  D E H T A N  

E v e n in g s  8 0 6 -6 5 8  9 3 5 8

O i tu o '
- i r S Z 7 r r 2 1

GOLDEN SPREAD REALTY
2 00  S. M a in  —  P a r ry lo n  

“135-5444

Oil Well Completion
LIPSCOMB (N.E.

HORSECREEK Tonkawa) PNG 
Operating Co., 01 Waters, Sec.
329,43,H&TC, elev. 2732 gr, spud
11- 12-90, drlg. compl 12-11-90, tested
12- 11-90, pumped 13 bbl. of 40 grav. 
oil +  7 bbls. water, GOR 3769, per­
forated 7024-7033, TD 11000’, PBTD 
7042’ -  Plug-Back

CORRECTED Oil Well Completion
HUTCHINSON (PANHANDLE) 

W.B.D. Oil & Gas Co., 0B-4 Charlie 
Johnson, Sec. 8,M-16,AB&M, elev. 
3325 gr, spud 10-13-90, drlg. compl 
10-19-90, tested 12-20-90, pumped 52 
bbl. of 41 grav. oil +  210 bbls. 
w ater, GOR 2769, perforated 
3125-3242, TD 3330’, PBTD 3261’ -

Corrected the test data, perfora­
tions & depth. (Shown on 12-27-90 
Report)

Gas Well Completions
HEMPHILL (HEMPHILL 

Granite Wash) UMC Petroleum 
Corp., 06-53 Arrington, Sec. 53,A-2, 
H&GN, elev. 2660 gr, spud 7-30-90, 
drlg. compl 8-31-90, tested 12-10-90, 
potential 39500 MCF, rock pressure 
2956, pay 10553-10733, TD 11100’, 
PBTD 11032’ -

OCHILTREE (SMITH PER­
RYTON Ixiwer Morrow) P.L.O., 04 
Holcomb, Sec. 9.4.GH&H, elev. 3003 
kb, spud 12-1-90, drlg. compl 12-4-90, 
tested 12-11-90, potential 1816 MCF, 
rock pressure 664, pay 7932-7940, 
TD 8100’, PBTD 7965’ -  Deepen

Oil & (was Reporting Service 
Box 2052 Pam pa* TX 79065

Providing the Oil & Gas Report 
fo r  Hansford County Readers

Doris Harrison Phone 665-5800

is Proud 
to Introduce

Panhandle 
Implement Co.

Your Joh n  D eere  and Full Line ZIAAMATIC 
Dealer in Guym an, O k lah om a

as this Area’s Complete Source 
for All of Your

ZIMMATIC
Sales & Service Needs!
They offer a fu ll line of
Z im m atic irriga tion  systems,
each ta ilo r made for your spec ific  needs

They a ls o  s to c k  a fu ll  in v e n to ry  o f  
G e n u in e  Z im m a tic  R e p la c e m e n t  P arts , 
a n d  h a ve  T ra in ed  P e rs o n n e l  
re a d y  to  take  c a re  o f  
y o u r  s e rv ic e  n e e d s !

F O R  T H E
“ H E A V Y  W E I G H T ’ ’

IN I R R I G A T I O N  E Q U I P M E N T  
& S E R V I C E  C A L L  

“ T H E  R A I N I N G  C H A M P I O N ”
P anhand le  Im p le m e n t Co.

G u y  men, O K  (4 0 5 )  3 3 & 8 5 1 1

L MEAL DEAL"!
SALE PRICE 
JANl ARY 7 thru 
JAM A R Y  27. 1991

W ith  the Full Meal Deal, you get a juicy. 
V* lb .1 Homestyle H ungr-Busterf 

golden fries, a  16 oz. soft d rink , 
and a 5 oz. Dairy Queen sundae.

Reg I I S  Pat I T m O I I  “Vm D O  C w p  • Rog U S  
Pat A Tm 1> D O  Op. C onn 1> D O  O n Coun 
P rices g o o d  a t p a rtic ipa ting  Oniry Qmrtv i s lo tn  

I  Pro • cnofcetl w oigM
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UIDE makes nutrition

NuTmoSGufijE Pink shelf tags—low in 
to ta l fat AND cholesterol

ir .m P P Jla
LOW/REDUCED CALORIE

lurni i  mjnM
REAP PRODUCT LABEL

LOW FW/CH0I.ESTER0LYellow shelf ta g s - lo w  
OR reduced in calories.

Green shelf tags— 
very low in  sodiumcmi*<

**AO«K>OUCT lA B U

®w£ caRDS
PRICES GOOD THRU TOES. JAN. 13TII

’ ’ rues Spearman Lynx 

LynxeHes

ACCEPT At United, we re proud to introduce NutriGuide' —a nutritional 
program that assists you in selecting products that are low in 
sodium, saturated fats, cholesterol and calories. Over the next 
few weeks we will begin making information available at our 
stores to help you identify and choose from a selection of over 
1300 items.

THiin

GOOD THRU JAN. 15
IN PERRYTON ONLY

Heinz
NuTTr.3EGE757

LOW EAT/ 
CHOU STE ROE

1 TOMATO*1 
KETCHUP

SflUEEiABlil

United Extra Lean 
Super Valu Pak

Round Steak
Center

Cut
Texsun

NOTlStGCTCT
vrriv iow 
SOOtUM USDA Choke 

Super Valu Pak
IOW EAT/ 

CHOLESTEROL

GraverRound

farmland Extra Tender 
Quarterloin

Pork Chops
A ssorted End J L  g

I - o J T  $ 1 6  iKER IT l;

Lady Hounds
Bakente

Shortening RM € FAITC j

COFFEE

Coupons
See Store for Details P erry ton

Supemaikei
IMu Ir Ioo UUIDE

VERY LOW SODIUM
IMUIN U*WUu** itWAt

READ PROOUCT LABEL

V


