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MEDITATIONS
By The Editor

THE LADY DOESN’T  
LIKE TEXAS

Just about the most prom­
inent topic of conversation 
we heard on the streets Mon­
day was about the lady who 
had aii article appearing in 
a daily newspaper last Sun­
day expressing “ contempt” 
for Texas.

To begin with we were 
surprised that so many peo- 
people saw the article. That 
paper must hold about a 
third place toi being as close­
ly read as The Success. Nev­
ertheless we have been sol­
icited to answer the letter 
in protecting the name of 
The Lone Star State.

To enter into a debate on 
the greatness of Texas’ vast 
acreage and resources would 
be useless. We have the Tex­
as Almanac to prove her su­
periority in that matter. The 
most irksome part of the let­
ter was about Texas young 
ladies “ who are big, raw- 
bone girls who have lived 
on a ranch all their lives, 
herding cattle and riding 
horses and that is all they 
will ever have sense to 
know.”

Our contention is that we 
had much rather see a Tex­
as lass on a horse with a tan 
of God’s sunlight on her face 
than to see someone who 
never gets the vitamin D 
direct and who has to sup­
plement at the expense of 
her old man with a lot of 
drug store cosmetics. Too, 
we had rather see her on a 
horse sitting a saddle, hold­
ing the reins in one hand 
and a lariat in the other 
than to see someone in a 
honkytonk sitting on a pad­
ded seat holding a cigarette 
in one hand and a glass of 
hooch in the other. We be­
lieve the Texas girl will 
come nearer to developing 
into a noble woman and rear 
a respected family, aside 
from herdin’ cattle, sheep 
and goats to supply the 
needed meats, wool and mo­
hair to give livelihood to 
those who might sit and at­
tempt to make fun of her 
chosen vocation. However, 
all Texas girls do not follow 
the ranch work calling. 
Many of them are the most 
brilliant educators, secretar­
ial workers, musicians, mis­
sionaries, and in fact, “ mo­
vie actresses,” and in other 

(Continued on Last Page

Lt. D. E. DeLong, Loses Life 
In Line of Duty; County’s First 
World War Two Fatality

Monday, sShortly a f  t e r 
noon, the hearts of Schleich­
er county citizens w e r e  
heavy with grief and flags 
were flying at half-mast af­
ter a cablegram was receiv­
ed here by Mr. and Mrs. D. 
E. DeLong, informing them 
that their son, Lt. D- E. De­
Long, Jr., 26, had lost his 
life in a plane crash while 
in line of duty in the service 
of his country.

The cablegram read:
“ Mr. and Mrs. D. E. De­

Long:
“ The Navy Department 

deeply regrets to inform 
you that your son, Lt. (jg) 
David Elworth D e L o n g ,  
USN, was killed, result of 
plane crash, 19 August, in 
the performance of his duty 
and in the service of his 
country. The Department 
extends to you its sincerest 
sympathy in your great loss. 
Body not recovered- If fur­
ther details are received you 
will be informed. To pre­
vent possible aid to our en­
emies please do not divulge 
the name of his ship or sta­
tion.

“ Rear Admiral Randall 
Jacobs,

“ Chief of Naval Person­
nel.”

No further word has been

heard from the personnel 
department at press time 
in regard to the body of the 
first Schleicher county man 
to lose his life in World 
War Two.

Lieutenant David Elworth 
DeLong was born let. 1, 
1917 and attended Eldora­
do schools, graduating from 
the local high school. He re­
ceived his B. A. degree fbom 
A. & M. June 1939. He vol 
unteered into the Air Corps 
in March, 1940, receiving 
his first primary training in 
Atlanta, Ga- Prior to enter­
ing the service he was asso­
ciated with his father in the 
ranching business.

Lieutenant DeLong was 
married to Miss Rita Young, 
of Jacksonville, Fla., Feb. 
17, 1942. Mrs. DeLong has 
been residing in Pomona, 
Calif., and is to arrive in El­
dorado the first of next 
week.

Survivors other than his 
wife and parents are: Mrs. 
Ruby Fuller, of Amarillo; 
Mrs. S- D. Harper, Jr., and 
Mrs. Lawrence Steen of El­
dorado; Mrs. Julian More- 
louse of San Diego, Califor­
nia; sisters; and one broth­

er, W. E. DeLong, who is in 
the Sea Bees and is at pres­
ent on high seas.

LONE STAR THEATRE 
DAMAGED BY FIRE

Fire orginating in the pro- 
 ̂A  jection booth of the Lone 
^  Star Theatre here Tuesday 

night about 9 o’clock did a 
small amount of damage to 
the equimpent, damaging 
the building and destroying 
film prints and wiring after 
a film in a re-winding 
machine was ignited in some 
manner that has not been 
definitely determined.

Hicks Hail, owner of the 
threare was here Wednes­
day and estimated the dam­
age at about $1,000. and 
expressed the opinion that 
the equipment and building 
would be repaired and again 
in use by tonight (Friday).

Quick, efficient work by 
the local fire department 
prevented the flames from 
spreading and further dam­
aging the building a n d  
equipment.

Schools To Open 
Here September 6
The Eldorado Schools will 

open for the 1943-44 session 
Monday morning, Sept. 6 in 
the high school auditorium 
with a general assembly at 
whch time new teachers 
will be introduced and final 
instructions will be given as 
to registration. At that time 
a short program will also be 
given-

Calendar for the opening 
days:

Sat. Sept. 4 10:00 A. M. 
General teachers meeting in 
high school English room.

Sat. Sept. 4, 1 :30 P. M.—  
Registration for senior class.

Monday, Sept. 6, 9:30 A. 
M. Opening exercises for 
both grade and high school 
in high school auditorium.

Monday, Sept. 6, 10:00 A. 
M.,— Registration for junior 
class.

Monday, Sept- 6, 1 :30 p. 
m- Registration of sopho­
more class.

Monday, Sept. 6, 6:30 P. 
M.— Registration of fresh­
man class.

Regular class work to be­
gin Tuesday morning, Sept. 
7 th.

Faculty Named
Following is the complete 

faculty for the Independent 
District, other than C. R. 
Brace’s position as high 
school principal- Brace re­
signed Monday.

C. A. Reynolds, superin­
tendent.

Mrs. Caroll Ratliff, Eng­
lish.

Miss Avis Deavers. com­
mercial.

Ernest Sutherland, coach, 
science and boys’ physical 
education.

Mrs. Willie Ruth Johnson, 
Spanish and history.

Mrs. Bill Sproul, home ec-

Bentley Speaks To 
Lions Club Here

Max Bentley, secretary 
of The West Texas Cham­
ber of Commerce, who lives 
in Abilene, was principal 
speaker to the local Lions’ 
club here Wednesday noon. 
Bentley, a former newspa­
per man was in Eldorado on 
official C. of C. business 
and accepted an invitation 
to appear before the club 
and delivered a very inter­
esting and informative talk.

Other visitors were Hicks 
Hall, Sonora; Lt. Wallace 
Cozzens, here on furlough 
from Roswell, N. M-; Ernest 
Sutherland, new high school

(Continued on Last Page)

Grass Fire Friday Last Week 
Caused Loss of Grass, Livestock

T o  C o n d u ct R eviva l

Shown is Rev. R. A. 
Matthews, San Antonio 
pastor who will conduct 
revival services here at 
Fundamental Bap t i s t 
Church next week-

onomics-
Miss Jewel Shelton, library 

and English.
Miss Doris Johnston, girls’ 

physical education.
E. A. McMillan, principal 

grade school, arithmetic and 
reading.

Miss Oma Ford, English, 
Eighth grade.

Miss Annie Herbert, Geo­
graphy, history, Seventh 
grade.

Miss Libby Faust, public 
school music, Sixth grade.

Miss Ima Lightsey, Fifth 
grade.

Mrs. Corrine Robinson, 
Fourth grade.

Mi-s- Bennie Watson, Third 
grade.

Mrs. Ruth Prince, Second 
grade, speech.

Miss Thelma Ellington, 
First grade.

Miss Ena Ford, Mexican 
school.

Mrs. E. A. McMillan, Mex­
ican school.

Mrs. Owena Johnston, 
Reynolds School.

Mrs- Royster, Alexander 
school.

Fundam ental Baptist 
a  urch T o  S tart R ev iva l

Rev. B- A. Jonas this week 
announced thar a revival 
meeting is to start a t - t h e  
Fundamento! Baptist church 
iere Sunday, August 29 

and continue through Sun­
day, Sept. 5.

Rev. R. A. Matthews, 
Director for Spanish Mission 
Work in the Southwest, and 
pastor of the Grace Mission 
Church, San Antonio, will 
arrive Monday and conduct 
services throughout t h e  
meeting.

Three services are an- 
niunced for the closing Sun­
day of the meeting and a 
dinner will be served at the 
church. Several visiting pas­
tors are expected to be pres­
ent on that occasion, the lo­
cal pastor stated. Services 
are to be held at 8:45 p. m., 
and 10 a- m., Rev. Jonas 
stated.

Some of the subjects an­
nounced by the Rev. Mat­
thews are as follows: “ Af­
ter 1900 Years;” “T h e  
Imagination of Man’s Heart 
Is Evil Continually;” “ There 
Fore We Ought to Give the 
More Earnest Heed to- the 
Things That We H a v e  
Heard;” “ Man Likes to be 
Deceived;” “ O That Thou 
Would Harken to my Com­
mandments;”  “ I Will Laugh 
W h e n  Y o u r  Calamity 
Comes:” “ What Shall be 
the End of These Things.”

An ad appearing else­
where in this issue of the pa­
per will give details of the 
meeting. Other advertising 
material will be distributed 
this week. ___

$219,000 QUOTA AS­
SESSED COUNTY IN 3rd 
W AR  LOAN CAMPAIGN 
TO START IN SEPT.

Information was released 
here this week that Schleich­
er county’s quota in the third 
War Loan would be $219,- 
000, and a plea is made that 
the county exert every ef­
fort to top the quota.

The August quota is re­
ported to be falling short 
unless buying is stimulated 
and the quota raised, both 
July and August assessments 
will have fallen short.

Stray bombs falling on the 
Ford Oglesby ranch early 
in the afternoon last Friday 
started another grass fire 
which caused heavy losses 
to Schleicher county ranch­
men before it was brought 
under control.

Approximately two sec­
tions of grass was lost on the 
Ford Oglesby ranch. The 
fire spread rapidly on into 
the Sam Oglesby r a n c h  
burning about 100 acres of 
grass w i t h  considerable 
fence post loss felt. The wire 
was damaged to such an ex­
tent that it will have to be 
replaced before long.

From the Sam Oglesby 
place the fire spread to the 
O L. Woodard ranch burn­
ing four sections of grass, a 
large stack of feed and some 
forty head of sheep. The fire 
continued to increase des­
pite the battle the ranchers 
and other citizens were wag­
ing to bring the fire under 
control.

The J. C. Crosby ranch 
was the next place in the 
path o f the fire. Practically 
all of his grass land was 
wiped out. The fire spread 
on to the Jack Boyd, Bill 
Adams and Aubrey DeLong 
ranches, burning quite a 
large acreage of grass and 
causing heavy fence post 
losses.

Total loss of grass in the 
country during this one fire, 
according to Sam Oglesby, 
was approximately between 
eight and 10 sections. This 
is the third loss suffered by 
grass fires by the Oglesby 
brothers.

Fire fighters did an ex 
cellent job of bringing the 
fire under control consider­
ing the equipment w i t h  
which they had to work. 
Should the county have been 
able to secure the fire fight­
ing equipment for which 
they tried to got some four 
weeks ago, the damage 
would have been less than 
half, according to the opin­
ion of local ranchers who 
have had losses. The losses 
suffered by these few men 
would have paid for the 
truck and equipment, it has 
been pointed out.

NEW COACH HERE
Mr- and Mrs. Ernest Suth­

erland and baby have moved 
to Eldorado to make their 
home. Mr. Sutherland has 
accepted the position with 
the local public school as 
Coach, science teacher and 
instructor of Boys Physical 
Education.

The Sutherlands are from 
Archer City. He is a gradu­
ate of N. T. S. T. C. and 
taught last year near Glade- 
water. They are at present, 
living in Mrs. Billie Eaton’s 
house in South part of town-

ROYSTER LEASES 
RITZ CAFE

D. C. Royster has leased 
the Ritz Cafe in the Lone 
Star Theatre building and 
is operating same now. Mr. 
Royster has been in the cafe 
business at various time for 
the past 10 years in Eldo­
rado, formerly operating the 
Roys:er Cafe in the Lawhon 
building.

\
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DOG POISONING 
PRACTICE MIGHT 
PROVE FATAL TO 
CHILDREN OF TOWN
• Citizens of Eldorado this 
week have brought to this 
office specimens of meats 
supposedly containing pois­
on that has been wholesale 
distributed over the town in 
recent days- Many dogs have 
died as the result. Some, no 
douot, tnat were molesting 
ranchers.

We are not attempting to 
tell anyone how to conduct 
their business, but in some 
instances the meat w a s  
found in yards where there 
were no dogs and the meats 
were accessible to infant 
children and was unknown 
to the parents until later 
discovered. T h i s  practice 
could cause no small tragedy 
and grief if continued. A 
child might come into poss­
ession of a poisoned “ goat 
kidney” and innocently suck 
the poison therefrom caus­
ing a horrible death.

Personally, we lost a dog 
to the poison for which we 
do not care, however, some 
persons do, but we would 
hate for someone to poison 
our child or any one else’s 
child on home premises. No 
more right is held to place 
poison on private town 
property by non-interested 
parties than non-interested 
parties have to place poison 
on ranches.

The matter could be hand­
led by promoting and en­
forcing an ordinance con­
trolling dogs, regardless of 
breed. Shoot them. Don’t 
risk poisoning i n n o c e n t  
children if cannines are to 
be killed wholesale.

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to express our 

I hanks and very deep ap­
preciation for the m a n y ,  
many kindnesses and help 
lee'eived from our friends- 
We shall never forget it.

Mr. and Mrs. Johnnie
Luedecke and Mickey, ltp

MRS MARY ELIZABETH 
ARMENTROUT PASSES

Services were held at the 
Graveside Saturday for Mrs. 
Mary Elizabeth Armentrout 
who passed away at her 
home in Eldorado Friday 
August 20 after a lingering 
illness. Rev. C. W. Richard 
of Santa Anna conducted 
the services.

The deceased was born 
Nov. 21, 1872 in Bell coun­
tv She was marv'.tu to G. W. 
Klutts in 1837. To this union 
was born one daughter, 
Mrs. Etta .Iron who resides 
it Ballinger. In 1897 she 

was married to W. G. Ar­
mentrout and to this union 

,s born two children, Mrs. 
Nettie Spurgers of Eldora­
do and Mrs. Mary Graves, 
of Dry Prong, La. Besides 
the above named children, 
the deceased is survived by 
t e n  grandchildren, five 
' great-grand-children, a n d  
one sister, Mrs- G. S. Bodine 
of San Antonio.

Pall bearers included Geo. 
Woods, Wade King, Thax- 
ter Faught, L. B. Kerr, C. 
C. McLaughlin and Fred 
Watson.

Interment was made in 
the Eldorado cemetery un­
der the direction of The 
Ratliff Funeral Home.

SON BORN
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Smith 

are the parents of a boy, 
born Friday August 20, at 
ten thirty a. m. The young 
fellow weighed 8 lbs- and 
has been named Allen Lee. 
Mother and baby are doing 
fine. Mr. Smith is employed 
on the J. C. Crosby ranch.

Hal Whitten, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Lewis Whitten, un­
derwent a tonsilectomy at 
a San Angelo hospital last 
Thursday. He is recovering 
nicely at his home here.

Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Blay- 
; lock and two daughters 
.Gearldine and Ebba Jean of 
Robert Lee visited Mrs. 
• Blaylock’s mother, M r s .  
Frank Spencer over the 
weekend.

BONOS OVER AMERICA * * *

Since 1865 Ameri­
can stockraisers 
have been taking 
their animals to 
the Union Stock- 
yards at Chicago, 
maintaining an in- 
s t i t u t i o n  th a t 
helped to make 
America great.

Entrance — Union Stockyards, Chicago

Keep
Our Traditions 
Buy More War Bonds

In Hitler’s, Europe 
the farmers are pro­
ducing too, but their 
product goes to Nazi 
Germany to feed the 
s o ld ie r s  w h o  are 
shooting thousands 
of prisoners who ob­
ject to this form of 
tyranny.

With Eldorado 
Churches

Church of Christ
(Divide and Louis Sts.)

Services each Lord’s Day 
U :00 A. M.

Everyone invited to each 
service. We especially urge 
all members to attend.

“ If ye love me, keep my 
commandments.”

Miss Ora Sproul of San 
Angelo and Mrs. Lewis Bru­
ton of Menard and Mrs. Hal 
Knight of Sterling City are 
visiting in the home of their 
mother, Mrs. C. T. Sproul.

CARD OF THANKS
Due to the fact that we are 

unable to contact each of 
you and thank yiu personal­
ly, we wnt to take this 
method to express our ap­
preciation to each any every 
person for any part they 
may have had in fighting the 
grass firse on our places- 

Ford and Sam Oglesby.
dtp-)

Mrs- W. C. Spurgers and 
daughter Freddye Jean of 
San Angelo have returned 
home after spending several 
days here in the R. C. Spur­
gers’ home.

i
j

Total Resources Over $1,000,000.00 * J

[  First National Bank
B U Y

M E A D ’ S
F I N E

B R E A D

paign or an enlargement 
campaign, and the first thing 
we want to do is to enlist 
every member that is on our 
church roll in Sunday school 
and the second thing we 
want to do is to get in at­
tendance all of the other 
possibilities we can find. 
Will you not help us with 
this worthy task? It will 
take everyone doling his or 
her best to accomplish the 
goal that we have.

O u r  services: Sunday 
school and preaching 10 and 
11 a. m. Training Union and 
preaching 8:00 and 9:00.

Mid-week services each 
Wednesday at 8 :80- We want 
all of our people to attend 
all of these services, and 
those who do not have a 
church home we cordially 
invite them to attend.

Presbyterian Church
J. Kelly Neal, Pastor

10 a. m. Sunday School, 
Sam Jones," superintendent.

11 a. m. Morning Worship. 
9 p. m. Evening worship.

First Baptist Church
“ The Church With A Friendly 

Welcome” .

J. M. Hays, Pastor

We are glad to announce 
that our Training Union 
Study Course is progressing 
with a good interest with an 
enrollment of 25. In the 
Study Course this week we 
have three classs for three 
separate groups: the adult, 
intermediate, and junior. I 
think the intermediate group 
has the smallest attendance 
which should not be so, but 
should have an average at­
tendance with the other two 
groups.

We have known a long 
time that the intermediates 
are the ones that are so easi­
ly neglected and seems so 
easy to let this group get 
away from the touch of the 
church and religious life. 1 
wonder if you will not be 
one as an older person to 
help get these intermediates 
in touch with church life and 
see if you cannot help to en­
courage them to attend the 
church groups.

Our Sunday school will 
soon start an expansion cam-

NOTICE TO LIVESTOCK 
OWNERS OF SCHLEICHER 

COUNTY
HOUSE BILL NO. 170 

passed by the recent Legis­
lature making it mandatory 
to re-register your marks 
and brands, becomes effec­
tive August 10th, 1943, but 
according to a recent ruling 
by the Attorney-General, 
his opinion 0-5358, you will 
not be allowed to register 
your brand until October 
1st, 1943, after which time 
the legal owner of a regis­
tered mark or brand will 
have two years from Oct. 
1st 1943 in which to exer­
cise his preferential right 
to re-record said brand. If 
this right is not exercised 
during the given time it will 
be forfeited and will become 
the property of the first 
person recording same.

The new Volume f o r  
Marks and Brands will be 
in the office of the County 
Clerk, Oct. 1st, 1943. The 
fee will be Twenty Five 
Cents for each mark or 
brand so registered.

Respt.
H. T. Finley,

(3c) County Clerk.

Fundamental Baptist 
Church

"T h e  G o in g  Church O f  T h e ^ C o m in g  L o rd ’l
B. A. Jonas, Pastor

Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Preaching: 11:00 a. m. 
Evening Service: 8:30; 

Wednesday Evening Pray­
er Service: 8:30

METHODIST CHURCH
10:00 A- M. the preach­

ing service sermon subject: 
‘Denied A Chance,”

11:00 A. M. S u n d a y  
School.

8:00 P. M. Methodist 
Youth Fellowship.

8:45 P. M. Evening Ser­
vice sermon subject: “ Miss­
ing The Mark.”

The reader is requested 
to take notice that next 
Sunday, August 29, being the 
fifth Sunday the preaching 
services will be at 10:00 
o’clock and the Sunday 
School at 11:00 o’clock on 
account of the all day ser­
vices at Rudd.

Mrs. Wilton Baggett and 
son returned to their home 
in Sonora after several days 
visit here with Mrs. Bag­
gett’s parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
R. C. Spurgers.

Miss Milta Hill who is in­
structor in the Fine Arts 
Department at Sul Ross 
State Teachers College at 
Alpine is visiting here .in the 
home of her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. D. C. Hill.

One-Way 
W ood W a x
A liquid wax polish for 

Furniture, Pianos, Linoleumi 
and Floors. It cleans, polish­
es and protects the finish. 
Removes Grease and Dirt— 

Brings out the luster in 
your woodwork.

Regular Seller $1.75 Qt. 
NOW —  $1.50

Regular Seller $1.00 Pt, 
NOW —  85c

Sulpho
for Chickens, Turkeys, Dogs 
and hogs. Put it in their 
drinking water. It is a good 
“blood sucker” repellent.

Hoover’s Drug 
Store

W e Specialize
in Car Greasing with
TEXACO CERTIFIED 

MARFAK LUBRICATION 
SYSTEM

“SERVICE OUR MOTTO”

Texaco Service Station
H. D. Mercer, Prop. . 

PHONE 95 I

“Hamburger Bill”
Makes

NICE — —  JUICY 
HAMBURGERS

j School Opens September 6th
Bring your Fall Cleaning in early so that we may 

give you our best service!

Let Us Make Your Old Garments Look 
Like New!

Coulter’s Man’s Shop

All Kinds of Feed

Burrus Texo
and

Purina Chows

Eldorado Wool Company
FEED DEPARTMENT

l I
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Because he scaled the walls of the fortification at Kasba-Mehdia, 
French Morocco, and from thatJhazr.rdous position diverted,the atten­
tion of the enemy with his rifle fire, enabling our troops to enter 
through the main gates of the fort, Pfc. C. L. Mohler was awarded 
the Distinguished Service* jCrq ŝ. He risked his life for you. How 
many more Bonds and Stamps can you afford, to help him? Figure 
it out yourself.

Turn in Tour Stamps—Buy Another Bond 

TO BACK AMERICAN HEROES . . .

The Eldorado Success, Texas, Friday, August, 27,

tne DistiflguiSftetrSefiwiceTkro.ss has been awarded Staff Sgt. Doyle 
Kimmery of Huntington, Texas, for manning a sub-machine gun and 
returning the fire of low-flying enemy planes during the Jap-attack 
on Hickam Field. When his ammunition was gone he ran from the 
cover of his truck to get more, and kept firing until the truck was 
bombed. He showed bravery beyond the call of duty. Figure out for 
yourself how much you can invest in War Savings beyond what you 
are doing now'.

Although wounded by a Jap’s vicious hooked bayonet in hand-to- 
hand combat on Guadalcanal, Marine Pfc. Harold Pazofsky of Brook­
lyn, N. Y., finally succeeded in cutting his opponent down with his 
machete. Our boys are willing to spend their lives. How much more 
can you afford to lend by increasing your Payroll Savings allotment? 
Take a pencil and figure it out.

The following firms and individuals are sponsoring this ad in the interest of the August War Loan Quota

City Grocery

Eldorado Wool Co.

Foxworth-Galbraith Lbr. Co.

Recreation Club and 
& Shine Parlor

Wright’s Cash Store

Wm. Cameron & Co. Inc.
r  '  ■»* * •'— - 1.

J Hazelwood Bros.

A. J.Roach
Furniture, Feed, & Produce

The Ratliff Store

ip Eldorado Ccffee Shop 

West Texas Utilities Co. 

Hoover Drug Store 

Coulter’s Man’s Shop 

Harris Gulf Service Station

City of Eldorado

Fricks Welding Shop, 
and Garage

Wheeler Grocery

Eldorado Motor Co.

R. T. Crain
Magnolia Agent

— — — — ■  — immmmm— —  ■ ■ i M  ■— — —  r *

iHeroes
Material by U. S. Treas.

skipper, Conulr. Arnold Ellsworth True, was rescued from the water 
and found to be supporting two enlisted men. He himself was se 
exhausted that he did not realize both men were dead. Coindr. True, 
who was awarded the Navy Cross and the Distinguished Service Medal 
for heroism, typifie? the spirit of our men in arms. They give to the 
limit of their endurance. Do YOUR part! Buy more War Bonds 
and Stamps!

t l
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S O C I E T Y ^
ENTERTAIN WITH  
PICNIC SUPPER

A picnic supper honoring 
Staff Sgt. Garland Williams 
of Hobbs, N. M., Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Williams and 
Mr. and Mrs. David Wil­
liams of Providence, It. I., 
was given Wednesday night 
at the home of the men’s 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. 
Tom Williams in the Rey­
nolds community-

Other guests included Mr. 
and Mrs. Cecil Williams 
and family of Eden; Mr. and 
Mrs. Martin Estes, Mr. and 
Mrs. James Williams and 
daughters, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bernard Williams and fam­
ily, Mr. and Mrs. Dee Love 
and son, Mr. and Mrs. Otis 
Harris and family, Mr- and 
Mrs. J. Tom Williams and 
children and the honored 
guests.

Again honoring the visit­
ors and also William Sauer 
S 2/e of Providence R. I., a 
community barbecue sup­
per was given Friday night 
at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Otto Sauer. William is 
a son of Mr. and Mrs. Sauer. 
Mrs. Lola Sparks of Cole­
man, mother of Mrs- David 
Williams was included as a 
guest at the supper.

Following the supper, the 
guests were entertained with 
games and a sing-song.

FORREST RUNGE’S 
HONOR NEPHEW 
W ITH BARBECUE

Honoring John Runge of 
Houston, Mr. and Mrs- For­
rest Runge entertained Fri­
day night with a barbecue, 
supper at their ranch home. 
John is a nephew of Mr. 
Runge.

Those present included 
Rev. and Mrs. Kelly Neal, 
Mr. and Mrs. John Wil­
liams, Mrs. J. L. Neill, Miss 
Virginia Ryan, Dorothy Jean 
Neill, Martha Dell, Stuart 
and Jack Williams, Howard 
Neal, Anita, May and Dick 
Runge, the honored guest 
and the hosts-

TO TEACH A T  
BAILEY RANCH
4 Mr. and Mrs. Tom Kent 

have accepted positions to 
teach the 1943-44 school 
term at Bailey Ranch. Mr. 
Kent was, prior to accepting 
this work, manager of the 
M-System Grocery Store in 
Mertzon. Mrs. Kent taught 
last year at Barnhart. She 
is the d a u g h t e r  of 
Mrs. Frank Spencer. The 
Kents were both reared in 
this county and have spent 
several years of their life in 
the community in which they 
are going to teach. Bailey 
Ranch is fortunate in secur­
ing the services of this cou­
ple.

Mr. and Mrs. C. R. Brace 
and baby are here for a few 
days visit with friends. Mr. 
Brace has accepted a posi­
tion as Superintendent of 
Schools at Eola.

W . M. S. CIRCLE MEETS
Members of the Dorcas 

Circle met on their regular 
meeting date at the home of 
Mrs. Jess Thompson.

Subject of the study for 
the afternoon was “ Building 
a Firm Foundation f o r  
Youth.”

The devotion was given 
by Mrs. J- A. Whitten. Mrs. 
Tom 'Johnson gave, “ Our 
Young People;” “ Youth 
Home Missions and the Fu­
ture,” by Mrs. F. B. Cal- 
cote; “ Mexican Youth A 
Potential Power,” by Miss 
Mary Bruton; “ David and 
the New Lafayette,” by 
Mrs. Tom Smith; “ Mission­
aries in Uniform,” by Mrs. 
R. C. Spurgers; and “ Post 
War World and Southern 
Baptists,” by Mrs. Roy Da­
vidson.

Frosted cokes were ser­
ved to the above and Mes- 
dames Buster Gunn, H. 
Mace, Jim Hays, and Payne 
Robinson.

WITH THE MEN IN SERVICE

33? ‘vgMm.' :,3“ -

YOUNG ADULT CLASS 
HONORED WITH  
WATERMELON FEAST

The men were hosts to a 
watermelon feast, honoring 
members of the Y o u n g  
Adult Bible Class of the 
Methodist Church Friday 
evening at the Roadside 
Park.

After the feast a sing­
song and spelling contest 
was enjoyed by Messers and 
Mms. Van McCormick, Bob 
Grady, Barney Jefferson, 
F- O. Prochaska, Sam Mc- 
Ginnes, W. I. Breedlove, 
Rev. and Mrs. F. B. Faust, 
Mms. Reuben Dickens, Ma­
bel Parker, Miss Sammie 
Lee Stewardson, Mary Lou 
Clark of Menard, J. B. 
K i d d ,  Floyd McGinnes, 
Howard Parker, Dick and 
Jeff Grady, Barney Lee 
Jefferson, Frank Otto and 
Charles Prochaska, Glenda 
and Paula Breedlove, Neill, 
Jonnie Lee and Carol Lynn 
Dickens.

GIFT TEA
Mrs. Barney Jefferson 

was honored with a layette 
shower Monday evening at 
the home of Mrs- Amos 
Shiver. Mrs. Shiver, Mrs. 
Reuben Dickens and Mrs. 
W. Irl Breedlove were host­
esses.

Refreshments iof s a n d ­
wiches, potato chips, cookies 
and punch were served and 
gifts were received from 
Agnes Wright, Mrs. F. O. 
Prochaska, Virginia Ryan, 
Mrs. Palmer West, Mrs. 
Ora Davis and Katherine, 
Mrs. Jess Walston, Mrs- A. 
H. Green and Ethlene, Mrs. 
Mabel Parker, Mrs. E. C. 
Hill, Mrs. L. B. Johnson, 
Mrs. F. B. Faust, Mrs- J. B. 
Christian, Mrs. Jack Welch, 
Mrs. Gene McCalla and the 
hostesses.

Mrs. H. C. Holcombe of 
Richland Springs, visited 
several days recently in the 
home of her daughter and 
son-in-law, Mr. and Mrs. R. 
T- Crain.

Remodeling Notice
To better serve our trade, we are enlarging our 
floor space, re-modeling our building front,, 
sanding our floor and will, in a few days be bet­
ter equipped than ever before to render to the 
people of this territory the most in dining service 
comfort.

E ld o rad o  C o ffee  Shop
C. M. WEATHERLY

Corporal Thomas W. Ba­
ker and wife and daughter 
Doris Elaine and Mr. and 
Mrs. L. D. Christian and son 
Maurice are enjoying an 
outing and fishing trip on 
Devil’s River this week.

Receives Commission As A  
Second Lieutenant

Wallace O. Cozzens son 
of Mrs. Mattie Cozzens re­
reived his Commission as a 
Second Lt. at the Roswell 
Army Air Field August 21st. 
Attending the graduation 
exercises were Sgt. and Mrs. 
Eugen R. Koy, Mrs- Koy re­
ceived the honor of pinning 
the Bombardier Wings on 
Lt. Cozzens. Lt. Cozzens is 
visiting friends and relatives 
in Eldorado Before resum­
ing duties at Boise, Idaho. 
Lt. Cozzens and Sgt. and 
Mrs. Koy are from Eldorado 
and Sgt. Koy is stationed at 
the Roswell Army Air Field 
as an airplane mechanic 
Mrs. Koy is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs- Tobe Whitley 
and Sgt. Koy is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jess Koy.

Special To The Success
Ernest Howard Sweatt of 

Eldorado-, Texas, the son of 
Ernest H. Sweatt, Sr. of El­
dorado, Texas has been pro­
moted to Corporal according 
to Colonel J. P. Bailey Com­
manding Officer of t h e  
Hobbs Army Air Field.

Cpl. Sweatt who is a grad­
uate of Eldorado High is 
with Hobbs Army Air Field, 
Hobbs, New Mexico-.

Pfc. Calvin C. Henderson 
of Ft. Knox Ky. is visiting 
his parents Mr. and Mrs, 
Lester Hendersin- Pfc. Hen­
derson has just completed a 
course at Radio Communi­
cations School and will re­
ceive his new commission 
soon.

— —
Included in the class of 183 

graduated from the Naval 
Training School for signal­
men at the University of 
Illinois, Urbana, 111-, is Nor­
ris L. Taylor, 17, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Tom Smith, of this 
place.

Taylor now awaits assign­
ment to active duty at sea, or 
s 'me naval shore station.

Upon gaining more prac­
tical experience he will be 
eligible for advancement to 
petty officer rating, third 
class.

— —Information reaching this 
office a few days ago con­
tained facts that gives to 
a former Eldorado boy high 
honors as a fighter, pilot and 
instructor.

Lieut. William (Bill) 
Springstun has been report­
ed to have served in the ca­
pacity as personal pilot to 
Anthony Eden, Foreign Sec­
retary of England, on many 
missions, or to many foreign 
points, as the case might 
have been. (Names of points 
visited are withheld) but 
covered several countries.

Daily papers recently car­
ried photographs showing 
The West Texas Lieutenant 
instructing high French of­
ficials in the use of Ameri­
can armament on Flying 
Fortresses.

Lieut. Springstun has re­
cently completed his allotted 
number of combat missions 
and has been advanced to 
the capacity of instructor in 
combat tactics. It is thought 
here that in all probability, 
he has been given the rating 
of captain. Many decorations 
have been bestowed upon the 
combat flier in the past-

Lieut. Springstun is the 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Gene 
Springstun of Big Lake. He

Special Attention to Ranch­
men’s printing.

resided here until he was 
about fourteen years of age. 
He is the nephew of Mrs. 
Jess Koy, Mrs. Ruth Dan- 
ford, Miss Georgia, Tom and 
Ernie Springstun of Eldora­
do, and Mrs. Pauline Adams 
of Santa Ana, Calif.

Mr. and Mrs. R. C. Spur­
gers have been notified that 
their sons, Lloyd and Floyd, 
have landed safely some­
where overseas. Their new 
address is USMC, Co. D. 
First Tank Bat. c/-o Fleet P. 
0-, San Francisco, Calif.

— fy)—
Mr. and Mrs. L. R. Dam­

ron have received word that 
their son, Sgt. Robert J., who 
is stationed at Camp Maxey, 
had the misfortune of get­
ting one of his fingers cut 
off. Reports are that the 
wound is healing nicely.

— $ —
Pfc. Arthur H. Ashmore 

has been transferred from 
Sheppard Field to Panama 
City, Florida.

— 0 —
J. T. Lawrence, Boats- 

man in the Merchant Mar­
ines, has returned to his du­
ties after a visit here with 
his wife. Mr- and Mrs. Law­
rence visited the formers 
mother, Mrs. Ora Lawrence, 
in San Antonio several days 
while he was here. Some of 
the overseas trips have car­
ried the ships on which 
Lawrence is serving, to Eng­
land twice, to Alaska twice, 
Attu and Adiak in the Al­
eutians, also to Dutch Har­
bor and to the Hawaiian 
Islands.

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to express to our 

friends and neighbors, our 
appreciation  o f  y m u r 
thoughtfulness and k i n d  
words of sympathy and for 
the floral offering during 
the illness and death of our 
dear mother Mrs- Elizabeth 
Armentrout. May God bless 
each of you.

Her Children and 
Grandchildren, ltc

Mrs. J. W. Swindle of 
Indian Gap is a guest in the 
home of Rev. and Mrs- Jim 
Hays. Mrs. Swindle and 
Mrs. Hays are sister-in-laws. 
Mrs. Swindle’s husband is 
in the service and is station­
ed in North Carolina. He 
is in the Air Corp.

Miss Kathryn Davis is va­
cationing this week with 
frends in Iraan.

Buckles covered, prices
reasonable.

Mrs. F. M. Bradley. 4tp

Mrs. C. C. West and 
daughter Mrs. W. C. Mund 
visited last week in San An­
tonio with Colonel and Mrs. 
Douglas H. Mebane and 
Douglas, Jr. Mrs. Mebane is 
Mrs. West’s daughter. Doug­
las Jr., returned to Eldorado 
with his grandmother and 
aunt where he expects to 
spend several days.

Mrs. Lois Wilson has re­
turned to her home here af­
ter spending several weeks 
with her parents-in-law, Mr. 
and Mrs. O. Wilson in Wy­
oming.

Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Walk­
er and son returned to their 
home in Plainview after a 
visit here with the latters 
parents Mr. and Mrs. D. C. 
Hill.

Mrs. G. H. Farrington of 
San Angelo is visiting this 
week in the home of her 
daughters and families, Mrs. 
Clyde Graves and Mrs. Rob- 
ert Sproul. v : J

ELDORADO 
LODGE 
No. 890 

A. F. & A . M .
Stated Meeting 

Second Saturday 
night in each month.
Visiting Brethern Welcome

CHOOSE THE

RIGHT SHOES
TO GO BACK TO SCHOOL

Favorite Styles 
for Boys and Girls

Sturdy school shoes designed 
with an eye to the comfort 
of growing feet. Bring your 
school age children in today 
for a pair of Peters School 

\ Shoes.

PRICED FROM

$1.49 to $3*SO
(ACCORDING TO SIZE)

QUALITY OXFORDS
Tough shoe which will last 
e en beyond the ration 
period. Rounded toe for 
additional comfort.

GIRLS’
SPORT SHOES

Heavy soled shoe for your 
daughter to wear to 
school and for play. 
Brown, Tan and Black

The RATLIFF STORE

\

T
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Want Ads
WE are prepared to do 

your sheep drenching. We 
have all kinds of drenches 
and medicines. Jess Wals­
ton, phone 199 or 49. (19tfc

FOR SALE— A bargain in a 
7 by 21 ft. trailor house, all 
built-in furniture, will take 
$ 200.00

J. I. Padgett 3tc

FOR your Sheep Drench­
ing call Jess Walston— phone 
199 or 49. 19tfc
FOUND— A tie clasp. Own­
er may have same for prop­
er description of article and 
paying for this ad.

Special attention paid to 
ranchmens’ printing by The 
Success.

Lost— A car license. No. of 
big 1942 lisense, 244 401; 
small tag (1943 license) 
83-49. Gordon McDonald.

(Itc.)
Gordon McDonald

FOR RENT— 2 room apart­
ment, all modem conven­
iences. Call

Mrs. Frank Spencer ltp

For Rent— Furnished bed­
room with kitchen privileges. 
Convenient to school. Mrs. 
C. T. Sproul, or phone 156.

(ltp)

R. H. Blaylock and son 
Bert were business visitors 
in Culberson and Jeff Davis 
Counties last week. They 
state that the grass is finest 
they have seen in a long 
time in both counties they 
visited.

FARMERS M AY SECURE 
LOANS FROM F. S. A.

Farmers i n Schleicher 
County who need govern­
ment financing with which 
to repair their home and 
farmstead water facilities 
or to install new equipment 
with which to produce food 
and care for livestock may 
obtain loans for these pur­
poses from the Farm Secur­
ity Administration, T. R. 
Andrus, rural rehabilitation 
supervisor announced this 
week.

Farm Security loans, Mr. 
Andrus advised, are now 
available to farmers who 
cannot obtain credit else­
where for farmstead and 
domestic water needs. Loans 
are open to both tenants 
and owners.

Drilling wells, windmills, 
stock tanks, storage tanks 
for home and farm supplies 
and for irrigating gardens 

i up to one acre are some of 
I the purposes for w h i c h  
!these loans will be made..

Mr. Andrus said these 
water facility loans are not 
to be confused with the 
FSA’s irrigation loans which 
are available only in certain 
approved areas. The water 
facility loans available now 
in Schleicher County will be 
made immediately to all 
qualified borrowers of this 
agency of the U. S- Depart­
ment of Agriculture.

Applications foV loans 
should be filed with Mr. 
Andrus at his office in the 
City Hall, Room 23, at San 
Angelo, Texas.

“Today, more than ever 
before, more food is needed 
in this country for use here 
at home and for shipment 
to our allies and to the peo­
ple in countries set free by

APPRECIATION
I wish to take this method 

of extending appreciation to 
the merchants and others of 
Eldorad,o who had any part 
in the donation of the pre­
minium which I received for 
bringing in the first bale of 
1943 cotton.
(Itc) L. KENT.

DAUGHTER BORN
Mr. and Mrs. Clem Sofge 

are the parents of a baby 
girl, born August ninth in a 
San Angelo hospital. The 
young lady weighed 5 pounds 
3 1/2 ounces, and has been 
named Winnie Jean.

Mrs- T. L. Reagan and 
two children, Betty Jo and 
Sonnie of Refugio are visit­
ing Mrs. Reagan’s brother, 
J. H. Hughes and family 
this week.

Mr. and Mrs. L. Kent and 
little grandson, Fred Thom­
as Gillespie, are visiting this 
week with their son and un­
cle, Mr- and Mrs. Otis Kent 
in Littlefield.

Mrs. E. A,. Corley of Dal­
las is a guest this week in the 
home of her sister, Miss Mol- 
lie Turner.
our armies,” said Mr. An­
drus. “The Federal Govern­
ment, through the Farm Se­
curity Administration, rec­
ognizes the importance of 
adequate water supplies on 
American farms and it is to 
meet this need that this 
agency’s w a t e r  facilities 
loans are being made acces- 
sable.”

Mr. Andrus invites farm­
ers to contact him at his 
office for complete further 
details or for making appli­
cation for a loan.

One Week
REVIVAL
Starting Sunday, August 29th 
and Closing Sunday, Sept. 5th

FUNDAMENTAL BAPTIST 
CHURCH LAWN

ELDORADO, TEXAS

SALE OF JUTE FOR 
BAGGING URGED

Schleicher County farm­
ers using cotton-bagging-for 
cotton-bales should profit 
under the War Food Admin­
istration’s sales program 
which was announced sev­
eral days ago, Joe B. Edens, 
chairman, County A A A  
Committee, said today.

Object if the sales pro­
gram is to supplement sup­
plies of jute available for 
covering the 1943 crop, he 
said and added that approx­
imately 88,000 bales of cot­
ton would go into the cotton 
bagging program.

The necessity for using 
more cotton bagging was 
occasioned by the war which 
has cut o ff normal imports 
of jute from foreign coun­
tries, and it also will be 
cheaper, he said.

Bought b y Commodity 
Credit Corporation f r o m  
Credit Corporation f r o m  
manufacturers and sold to 
purchasers at a lower price, 
the bagging will be sold in 
carlots at $1.07 per pattern, 
f. o. b., Houston, Texas and 
Memphis, Tenn., and at 
$1-05 per pattern f. o. b. 
cars at points of manufac­
ture at Rock Hill, S. C., An­
niston, Ala., and New Or­
leans, La. The price of less- 
than-carlots will be 3 cents 
per pattern higher than the 
carlot prices.

Explaining procedure for 
obtaining cotton bagging, 
Mr. Edens pointed out thaJ 
purchasers should send a 
certified check with the or­
der to Commodity Credit 
Corporation .M isoric Tem- 
T)e, New Orleans, I,a., of 
direct to the manufacturers 
of cotton bagging. Names of 
manufacturers may be ob­
tained from F. B Biggs, 
Regional Director, C o m ­
modity Credit Corporation, 
New Orleans-

When orders are filled, 
shipment will be m a d e  
freight rate collect to pur­
chasers.

Larry Robertson has re­
turned to his home in Den­
ver Colorado after a weeks 
visit in the home of his grand 
parents Mr. and Mrs. D- C. 
Hill. ________
Keep your plows in good 

repair. New parts are hard 
to get. Bring your sharpening 
work to us.

WhiteJey’s

FARMERS URGED 
TO REPORT 1943 
PERFORMANCE

Urgent warning is being 
sent to Schleicher County 
farmers by Joe B. Edens, 
Chairman, AAA Committee, 
to turn in 1943 acreage 
measurements to the coun­
ty office as quickly as pos­
sible and sign this year’s 
perfox-mance report.

Emphasizing the impor­
tance o f  filing acreage 
measurements immediiately, 
the Chairman said that pro­
ducers could not sign 1943 
applications for payment or 
place cotton in the loan un­
til individual reports are 
complete. At the same time 
soil-building practices car­
ried out under this year’s 
program.

“ We expect applications 
for payment right away and 
many will be submitted for 
approval about September 
1,” the Chairman said, and 
added that cotton loans had 
been in effect for several 
weeks.

Under the AAA Program, 
revised rates of payment, 
announced last week, in­
clude cotton, one cent per 
pound, and wheat, 8.5 cents 
per bushel-

Original rates announced 
earlier in the year placed 
the cotton payment at 1.1 
cents per pound and wheat 
at 9.2 cents per bushel. 
Payments are made on the 
normal production of the al­
lotted acreage.

Listing crops on which 
accurate measurements are 
required, Mr. Edens said 
figures were needed on cot­
ton and wheat, and only 
the estimated acreage of re­
maining crops is necessary 
in filing performance re­
ports.

According to AAA records, 
70 per cent of the farms in 
the county have been meas­
ured, 185 out of 266 farms.

Mrs. Joe Hext who has 
been visiting her parents, 
the Reverend and Mrs. Ber­
nard Guy who is pastor of 
the Baptist Church in Pecos, 
is here for a visit with her 
mother-in-law, Mrs- B e n  
Hext. She expects to join 
her husband in the near 
future.

FDR Aayd:
I hope Americans 

will figure out for 
them selves add i ­
tional payroll sav­
ings.

G IN
N O T I C E

REV. R. A. Matthews
of San Antonio, Texas

To Conduct Services Twice Daily

A Cordial Invitation Extended 
the Public to Attend!

DUE TO LABOR CONDITIONS AND CERTAIN 
GOVERNMENT REGULATIONS WE HAVE 

SET GIN HOURS THIS SEASON FROM 
8:00 A. M. TO 7:30 P. M.

Farmers Co-Operative Ginning 
& Marketing Ass’n

Eldorado Gin Company 
L. M. Moore & Son 

Bailey Ranch Gin
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The Premium Won’t Break You 

— The Loss May!
J A C K  R A T L I F F

G E N E R A L  IN S U R A N C E

TELEPHONE 163 

ELDORADO, TEXAS

LIONS’-------
(Continued from Page One)
coach, and J. B. Kidd, whose 
application for membership 
to the club was accepted.

In a business session, 
plans for conducting a bond 
rally was discussed and a 
committee to be appointed 
to function in securing en­
tertainment for the affair. 
Also the clean-up project 
was again brought up and a 
committee a p p o i n t e d  
to work on the much needed 
project.

Betty Mae Doyle, 8 year 
old daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. W- C. Doyle underwent 
a tonsillectomy Monday 
morning at a San Angelo 
hospital. She was returned 
to her home late Monday 
and was reported to be do­
ing fine.

Have a Treasure 
Hunt at Home

\:

Return M ILK  
BEVERAGE • BEER 
Bottles Promptly
* * * ■-*. ★  * * *

C onserve V ital M aterials 
__ It’ s a P atriotic D uty

NOTICE OF LEGION 
AUXILLIARY MEETING

Mrs. A. J. Mund will 
speak on, “ T h e  H o m e  
Front” at the Auxilliary 
meeting, Tuesday evening, 
August 31, at eight thirty 
o’clock at the Court House.

A request has been made 
by the president to the mem­
bers that they memorize 
the Preamble to the Consti­
tution by the next meeting 
night.

CARD OF THANKS
Last week a fire in our 

North pasture, supposedly 
set by hedge hopping train­
er planes, burned off about 
three fourths of a section 
of grass b e f o r e  i t  w a s  
brought under control by 
the help of neighbors and 
Joe Canales’ shearing crew. 
We wish to thank all who 
helped fight the fire.

Jim O’Harrow ltc

LONE STAR

Showing last times today

ANDY HARDY’S 
DOUBLE LIFE

with
Lewis Stone 

and
Mickey Rooney

Saturday

Philip Dorn 
Anna Sten 

in
CHETNIKS!

The Fighting Guerrillas
Sunday - Monday 

Cecil B. DeMille’s 
Greatest Spectacle

REAP THE WILD WIND
In Technicolor

MEDITATIONS—
(Continued from Page One)
professions Texas girls can 
be found.

As for Texas soldiers: 
Check the hero lists. Texas 
just about heads the list on 
all occasions. In number we 
are at a loss to give the ex­
act number of Texas men in 
military service, but they 
certainly would make one 
huge army: also one of grit 
and bravery. And we want 
the name and address of 
one that after seeing the 
rest of the world who will 
not come back to Texas.

As for a dirty, dusty dry 
climate making up Texas 
we will say that only a wee 
bit of Texas is like that. 
There are many thousands 
of other miles of the state 
with any kind of climate 
that one might want to live. 
As for our part we are in the 
wide open spaces where we 
prefer to live. Should we 
not like it we could go to 
the seashore, to the pine 
lands, swamps, or the most 
beautiful valley in the world, 
or to the beautiful mountain 
ranges where the grasses 
are reported to be the finest 
in the Southwest at the pres­
ent time, and mind you, all 
these places may be found 
in Texas.

Anyway, there are few 
occasions when people are 
forced to come to Texas. On 
the other hand there are 
several hundred trains and 
buses leaving daily if visit­
ors feel that they do not like 
us or our state. _____

John Sidney Williams, 
son of Mr. and Mrs. John 
Williams, received his dip­
loma from the San Angelo 
Business College, Friday, 
Aug.20. John Sidney will 
remain at home with his 
parents until he enters the 
sendee some time in Sept.

Tuesday-W ednesday
MY HEART BELONGS 

TO DADDY
with

Richard Carlson 
Martha O 'Driscoll

Thursday-Friday 
Program to be announced

Mrs. Dave Williamson 
who has b e e n  visiting 
friends here for the past 
ten days left this week for 
Austin where she will visit 
her sister, Miss Rachel Ford 
and her mother Mrs. Marvin 
Laughlin before returning 
to her husband who is sta­
tioned in Ft- Benning Ga.

Wright’s Cash Store
Notions — Groceries —  Shoes

School Days 

Are Here Again
•mil

We have a good supply of school supplies on hand 
for the opening of school and solicit your orders 
along this line, some items we were unable to get, 
but maybe we can get them before the opening-

We should save all we can on paper this year.

B U T T O N S :
We have received a new shipment of buttons this 
week and other items, such as socks and children’s 
anklets; also a shipment of All-Purpose Rit Dye.

Sugar, 5 lbs__________35c Laundry Soap, 6 bars 25c

Coffee, pure, lb .____20c Soap, White King-------5c

Pintos, the best____—8c Rex Jelly, 1/2 Gal. —55c

F E E D S :
We have chicken feed, mixed grain, pellets, egg 

mash, growing mash, maize —  and we want your 
eggs.

M E A T S :
Steak, Roast, Stews and Hamburger, Ribs, Goat, 

Pork, Pork Sausage and Lunch Meats.

NOTICE TO FEDERAL 
INCOME T A X  PAYERS

A Deputy Collector of In 
ternal Revenue will visit in 
Eldorado, September 10, at 
the Eldorado Hotel for the 
purpose of assisting Federal 
Taxpayers in the prepara­
tion of their “ Declaration of 
Estimated Income and Vic­
tory Tax Calendar Year 
1943.

Hicks Hall of Sonora was 
in Eldorado Wednesday on 
business and while here 
made a call to the Success 
office. It was a very pleas­
ant visit because the writer 
and wife have known Mr. 
Hall for, lo! these many 
years, back up in the “ old 
sand hills” of Haskell coun­
ty, at Rule. Come again, 
Hicks!

i

For printing of distinction 
Call No. 77. We know how! '

Phon your news of men in 
service to 77.

> Shortening eidbrand 73c

Y ^ Y 'Y  ( -. rS

$j?ij

F L O U R
R & W - E n r ic h e d !  E v e ry  Sack G u a ra n te e d
10 lbs. 50c; 25 lbs. $1.18
50 p o u n d s ....................... $2.18

Included are a few of our many Specials for the week-end. Listed are only a few of 
our Specials. Time and Space will not permit us to list them all.

We Have Cotton Pickers Bags 
and Binder Twine

COFFEE Red & "F2 *  S?of G~d Coffee! POUND
ClSARETTES, all popular brands Carton J$1.55

H P  C 1 A  Admiration, 1-2  lb. package A Q n
A-i /  Limit—1 per customer. . .

MATCHES Blue & White 
6 Boxes ______ 19c

Folger’s Coffee Glass Jar 
Pound 33c

Kremel Pie Filling Limit 2 per customer
e a c h ______ :______ 6c

Ayr*|| , Whips rich and creamy—
IV l l lK n O t  (Ration Free) Large Can 9c
Of c  A /^LJ No. “33” — Quart _ _ DLiH/W^n Hilex— Gallon

— ---------  _12c
_ _ _39c

WASHO—Large Box . . . . . .  23c
PREPARED MUSTARD-qt. . . . 10c
A Complete Variety

of Fresh
FRU ITS  L VEGETABLES

JAR LIDS N o . 63 T h rift to  fit C o ffeee  Jars—3 d o z e n . 29©

■ ■ ■

J


