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30 Producers 
In Hulldale
Area Today

Standard of Texas today was 
completing its second producer in 
the Hulldale field. Its No. 23 H. F. 
Thomson estate is a one-location 
south extension.

This will make a total of 22 pro­
ducers in the south Hulldale field, 
and a total of 30 in the area, as 
follows:
South Hulldale ________________22
North H ulldale_________________ 7
Mittel F ie ld ____________________ 1

Total _______________________ 30

Standard No. 2-2 Thomson was 
waiting on rotary, ■with 9 5/8-inch 
casing cemented on bottom at 1,- 
450 feet. Standard No. 2-1 Mc­
Whorter spudded Monday after­
noon and had passed 25 feet in 
caliche. It is 467 from the north, 
2,167 feet from the west line of 
section 70-TT-TCRR.

Ohio No. 15 iH. F. Thomson es­
tate on the east side of the field, 
prepared to swab on perforations 
below 5,676 feet, with a packer set 
at 5,660 and plugged back depth 
5,728 feet. Ohio No. 13 Thomson 
was waiting for cement to set on 
9 5/8-inch casing at 553 feet, with 
total depth 2,214 in lime. Ohio 
No. 9 Thomson was drilling at 
3,060 feet in lime and shale.

The Grey-Wolfe Co., No. 1 Mrs. 
W. F. Edmiston, southeast Schlei­
cher wildcat, encountered some oil, 
gas-cut mud and salt water in a 
drillstem test Tuesday at 4,820 
feet. They are drilling ahead.

G. W. Strake No. 1 Mrs. C. R. 
Judkins, southeastern Schleicher 
wildcat, is drilling below 5,913 feet 
in shale.

Standard No. 1-B Mittel, east 
offset to the opener of the Neva 
West field, was drilling below 2,- 
500 feet in shale. Pan American 

| No. 1-B Mittell, a southeast offset 
' to the onener of the same field, 
was drilling below 5,715 feet in 
shale.

Pan American No. 1 McWhorter, 
another test in the Hulldale field, 
was drilling at 2,004 feet in lime.

Houston officials of the Ameri­
can Republics Corp., toured the

Bazaar Saturday
The annual P l’A Bazaar— re­

ported in these columns last 
week—is scheduled to be held 
Saturday—this week, on the va­
cant lot next to the First Nat­
ional Bank,

Committees have been at work 
today soliciting contributions, 
and a wide variety of merchan­
dise will he available. Everyone 
is urged to give generous sup­
port to the Bazaar Saturday.

Lions Will Honor
Teachers Monday 
With Ladies’ Night

Pat Norwood, professor of edu­
cation and director of public rela­
tions at Southwest Texas State 
College at San Marcos, will be 
speaker Monday night when the 
Lions Club holds a ladies’ night 
banquet honoring local school tea­
chers. Carrol Ratliff, president, 
announced that the evening will 
get under way at 7:30 with the 
banquet, to be served in the Mem­
orial building, which will be fol­
lowed toy the program.

Rev. Clifford Nelson, Wayne 
Griffin and E C Peters have charge 
of arranging the room Monday for 
the occasion.

Lions were also looking forward 
this week to the Horaco Heidt 
show which will be in San Angelo 
next Wednesday evening to give 
two performances of their travel­
ing talent show, at 6:30 and 9:00 
p. on. Visiting Lions from San 
Angelo sold a number of tickets at 
the local Lions meeting yesterday. 
At the same meeting Rev. Rollo 
Davidson of Memphis, Texas, who 
is conducting a meeting this week 
at the Methodist church, spoke to 
the group.

DR. HOLCOMB’S FATHER 
DIES TUESDAY AT VIAN

Dr. and Mrs. M. G. Holcomb left 
Tuesday morning upon receipt of 
word that Dr. Holcomb’s father, 
Dr. John Holcomb, of Vian, Okla., 
had died early .that morning. He 
was a practising M. D. for many 
years at Vian, and had visited his 
son and his family here a number 
of times. Funeral services were 
held Wednesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Skeet Griffin and 
daughter Mrs. David Yavdley re­
turned Tuesday from Dallas..

Hulldale field yesterday. Houston 
officials of the Ohio Oil Co., were 
expecxed in Eldorado today.

FU N E R A L TODAY 
W O R D , 93-YEAR

Mrs. Josie Word, 93, died Wed­
nesday morning at 2:15, after sev­
eral weeks critical illness. She had 
been in failing health a number of 
years, and critically ill through .the 
latter part of the summer and early 
fall.

Funeral services are being held 
this afternoon at 2:00 at the El­
dorado First Methodist Church, 
the pastor. Rev. Roy Shilling of­
ficiating. Pallbearers are: W. A. 
Schuller, Palmer West, Edwin 
Childers, Gordon Hamm, Robert 
McWhorter and Jack Montgomery. 
Interment will be made in the 
Eldorado Cemetery.

Honorary pallbearers are: Jess 
Ashmore, R. J. Alexander, Tom 
Alexander, W. G. Godwin, Rev. J. 
M. Hays. D. C Hill, E. C. Hill, 
Heron Mace, J. B. Montgomery, 
Marvin McDonald, W. T. Parker, 
Fred Smith, J. E. Spencer, Fred 

■ Watson, W. T. Whitten.
Josie Hall was born to Mash 

and Liza Hall June 12, 1858 in 
Joplin, Missouri; when the mother 
was able to travel, the Halls and 
their new baby and two or three 
older children started for Texas, 
making the trip by wagon which 
was heavily loaded with household 
goods and drawn by four steers.

The family settled five miles 
from Farmersville, not far from 
Mrs. Hall’s relatives. Josie was 
reared in that neighborhood, re­
ceiving her schooling in the rural

f eas in which the family lived. 
Len she was ready to marry, her 
[her took her to Farmersville, 

five miles away, by wagon, driving 
his steers', carrying his own water 
supply along, and taking their food 
from home as there were no cafes 
in Farmersville. She was married 
to J. R. Word October 5, 1876, at 
her parents’ home; that was 75 
years ago.

A short time after their mar­
riage, the couple, who had rented 
from the folks the first year, 
bought a half section farm, on 
terms—paying $1.00 per acre, 3 
percent interest and 2% percent 
on the principal, 40 years to pay.

In 1889 they moved to Wilbarger, 
in 1898 to Sonora where the family 
lived in town and Mr. Word ran 
stock in the county, and in 1926 to

FOR MRS. JO SIE 
-OLD R E S I D E N T
Eldorado. Mr. Word, who was ten 
years older than his wife, died 
in 1918, on November 23, when the 
family were visiting at Kirkland, 
Texas.

In Eldorado she livqd with her 
son Bill Word, and continued to 
make her home with him through­
out the remainder of her life. In 
1946 they moved to Del Rio, in ’47 
to DeWitt County, and in 1950 
back to Eldorado.

Of the ten children born to the 
Words, six are living, .Mrs. B. F. 
Jones, Quanah; Bill Word, Eldor­
ado; Mrs. Liza Bridge, San An­
tonio; Mrs. Jud Brannon, Eldorado; 
Mrs. Charles Morris, Del Rio; and 
Mrs. D. J. Burows, Nordheim.

Four children preceded Mrs. 
Word in death. Orval, who was 
born in 1889, died at Brooks Gen­
eral Hospital on April 24, 1950; 
Frank, who was born in 1884, died 
in California four years ago. The 
couple lost a married daughter and 
an infant in 1895; Mrs. John Laney 
died in childbirth at the age of 18, 
and her son made his home with 
the Words until the father married 
again about five years later; Pad­
dy, age nearly 13 months, died also 
that year.

She is also survived by one sister 
Mrs. Zettie Neil of Ada, Okla., and 
a large number of grand children 
and great grand children.

For 87 years she had been a 
member of the Methodist Church, 
joining when she was a young girl, 
at a brush arbor revival in Collin 
County. The family had attended 
the revival according to the custom 
of the times—they made the trip 
to the arbor by wagon, camped out 
while they attended .the services, 
using water from the spring which 
was an essential requirement, the 
men taking turns herding the 
horses when the crowd was large. 
Only recently she asked someone, 
“ I wonder if there is anyone any­
where who has been a Methodist 
longer than I have!”

She was a member o f the East­
ern Star for many years, her hus­
band having joined the Masonic 
Lodge at Caddo Mills. She also 
joined the Maccabees near the turn 
of the century, keeping her mem­
bership until the chapter demised.

Mrs. Henry Mittel 
Dies Wednesday 
After Long- Illness j

Mrs. Henry Mittel, age 52, die|d 
early Wednesday morning in a 
San Angelo hospital, after a long 
illness. For the past three years 
she had spent much of her time in 
the hospital, undergoing treat­
ment for a bone disease; she was 
admitted to the hospital in May 
for the last time. She had been 
seriously ill throughout the sum­
mer and critically ill during the 
past several weeks.

Funeral services will be held at 
4:00 this afternoon at the Funda­
mental Baptist Church, the Rev. 
F. H. Pryor officiating, assisted 
by the Rev. M. M. Griggs, pastor 
of the Bethel Fundamental Baptist 
Church of San Angelo, and inter­
ment will be made in the Eldorado 
Cemetery. Nancy Posey, church 
pianist, will foe at the piano for the 
hymns, which will be sung by a 
choir from the church.

Mamie Smith was born in Cham­
bers County, near Ar.ahuac, Sep­
tember 20, 1899, the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Smith. In her 
early girlhood she moved with the 
family to Santa Maria, near Mer­
cedes, where she was reared, and 
received her elementary and high 
school education; she then attend­
ed college at Kingsville, after 
which she taught in the elementary 
grades at Santa Maria.

On June 15, 1927, she was mar­
ried to Henry Mittel of Sonora, 
and lived there until February 9, 
1928, when the family moved to 
Schleicher County, to make their 
home on a ranch 12 miles north of 
Eldorado, where the couple reared 
their children.

■She had been a Baptist since her 
girlhood ,and in the late 1930’s 
joined the Fundamental Baptist 
Church jn Eldorado.

She devoted her life to making 
a home for her family, and was 
known as an excellent wife and 
mother, and a consecrated Chris­
tian womgtn.

She is survived by her husband, 
five sons, Henry Jr., Air Force 
Cadet, stationed at Houston, How­
ard W., with the signal corps at 
Camp Gordon. Ga., and Raymond, 
Steven, and Dan, at home; two 
sisters and one brother, Mrs. A. P. 
Schwartz of Mercedes, Mrs. Cecil 
Penick of Anahuac, and Earl Smith 
of San Antonio.

One son, John D. Mittel, high 
school Freshman, died in a car 
accident in 1944, at the age of 13.

Among those who are expected 
at the funeral are Junior, who ar­
rived home late Wednesday, Mr. 
and Mrs. Howard Mittel, who will 
arrive here today, Mr. and Mrs. 
Thurman Penick and Curtis of 
Anahuac, who are coming bv plane 
and Mr. and Mrs. Willie Homann 
of San Antonio, and probably a 
sister and a brother and others.

Mr. and Mrs. Leslie Baker and 
Mr. and Mrs. John Williams at­
tended the State Fair at Dallas, 
and visited while there with Mr. 
and Mrs. Glenn Spann, at Irving. 
They were away from home from 
Friday to Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. M. J. Cunningham 
spent from Monday until today in 
Eldorado visiting the latter’s- par­
ents Mr. and Mrs. W. C. Doyle. Mr. 
Cunningham has completed a 
Church of Christ revival at Artesia, 
New Mexico, and left today for 
Mobeetie to start another meeting.

STATEMENT
of the ownership, management, and 
circulation required by the Act of 
Congress of August 24, 1912, as 
amended by the acts -of March 3, 
1933, and July 2, 1946 (39 USC 
233) showing the ownership, man­
agement, and circulation of the El­
dorado Success, published weekly 
at Eldorado, Texas for October, 
1951.

1. The names and addresses of 
the publisher, editor, managing ed­
itor, and business managers are:

Publisher, Fred Gunstead, Eldo­
rado, Texas.

Editor, Alice Gunstead, Eldorado, 
Texas.

2. The owner is: Fred Gunstead, 
Eldorado, Texas.

3. The known bondholders, mort­
gagees, and other security holders 
owning or holding 1 percent or 
more of total amount of bonds, 
mortgages, or other securities are: 
NONE.

5. The average number of copies 
of each issue o f this publication 
sold or distributed through the 
mails or otherwise, to paid sub­
scribers during the 12 months pre­
ceding the date shown above was 
915.

Fred Gunstead, Owner 
Sworn to and subscribed before me 
this 9th day o f October, L951. 

Margaret T. Tinning,
Notary Public 
Schleicher County, Texas

My commission expires June 1, 
1953.

Eagles Calmly Mow Melvin Down; 
First District Game Tomorrow Nite
Miss EHS Will Be 
Crowned Tomorrow

Miss Eldorado High School will 
be crowned h riday, October 12, in 
a special assembly program at 3 
p.m. in the scnool auditorium, it 
has been announced by school offi­
cials.

Candidates for Miss EHS and 
the clubs they represented were: 
Marianne Craig, Dramatics club; 
Sue Shilling, Student Council; Ru- 
thie Dee Harris, Band; Suzy Lin- 
thicum, Talon Staff; Retha Nell 
Lloyd, “ E”  Club; Diane Thomerson, 
F. H. A.; Esther Jones, Eagle 
Scratches; Fae Davis, Choral Club.

In the first vote Retha Nell 
Lloyd and Diane Thomerson were 
the two top winners. The winner 
between these two will be announc­
ed Friday at the coronation. The 
public is invited.

Accident Fatal To 
Latin Child Here

Adelaida Messa, age nearly two, 
was almost instantly killed late 
Wednesday afternoon, when she 
ran in front of a car near the Lum 
Davis Station within the city lim­
its of Eldorado on Highway 277.

The baby died within a few min­
utes of the accident, according to 
reports of those who witnessed the 
tragedy. N

The baby’s parents, Carlos and 
Orelia Rejel Hlessa, renters on the 
W. E. Bruton place, where they 
had been employed about 2% ye^rs, 
had been picking cotton this week 
at Ray Alexander’s. They had 
stopped near the Mikeska Gin, 
when the accident occurred. Ray 
Alexander had parked at the old 
Rock Station 2 building, and the 
parents had parked their 1940 Olds 
across the highway just north of 
the Davis Station. Both cars were 
off the highway.

The parents crossed the road to 
talk to Mr. Alexander about their 
cotton, leaving the child in the 
family car, in which it is under­
stood there were also several oth­
er people. The child suddenly 
started across the road toward 
her parents— Cleve Jones, driving 
south toward Sontora, saw the 
child and avoided striking her, but 
a pickup owned and driven by J. L. 
Neill, going north, struck her as 
she ran in its path. With the two 
cars parked off the highway, and 
two cars passing, apparently driv­
ing fairly slowly, it is understood 
that the accident was considered 
unavoidable by investigation auth­
orities, and no charges will be 
filed.

This is the county’s first traffic 
fatality for 1951.

Adelaida was born on the W. E. 
Bruton place, November 11, 1949. 
Her mother iwas reared here, and 
her father came from Old Mexico 
several years ago. The young par­
ents lost their younger child, a 
daughter a few weeks old, in Dec­
ember, and the baby was buried 
here.

Adelaida’s grandparents, th e  
Manuel Rejels, left Eldorado Sun­
day on a cotton picking trip, and 
had not been reached by phone as 
this paper goes to press this mor­
ning. There is also a great grand­
mother in the local Latin American 
community, and grandparents in 
Old Mexico.

Funeral services will be held at 
5:00 today, Thursday.

Oil Field Worker 
Is Badly Injured

Truman L. Teague, 21, of San 
Angelo, employee on the oil test 
on the Judkins Ranch about 25 
miles from Eldorado near the 
Menard Highway, was badly in­
jured at 7:00 Wednesday morning 
when he caught his left leg on the 
rotary table of the rig. He was 
brought to Eldorado and was given 
first aid attention by Dr. Robert 
Maginot, after which he was taken 
to San Angelo for hospitalization 
and an operation.

He is an oil field roughneck, who 
makes his home in San Angelo. In 
the accident his left leg received 
compound fractures, and he was 
thrown by the rotary table in such 
manner as to injure his head.

Visiting Capt. and Mrs. Thad 
Thomson this week have been 
Capt. and Mrs. F. A. L. Vossler 
of Monterrey, Calif. The two men 
were classmates at the Naval Aca­
demy and shot on the Naval rifle 
team.

The game here la sit Friday night 
was a spirited affair that gave the 
Eldorado Eagles their best work- 
out yet. While the score was some­
what lop-sided, the Melvin bovs 
were in there scrapping every min­
ute, and the Eagles were not Quite 
confident enough to run in a flock 
of their small Eaglets as they had 
done in the two previous games.

Melvin had a trick or two up 
their sleeve that enabled them to 
break out for a touchdown in the 
last minute of the game. Something 
of the same sort happened in the 
3rd quarter, when Melvin had the 
heart-breaking experience of hav­
ing a play called back after their 
runneir had crossed the goal line. 
In that case both sides were o ff­
side and flags were down before 
the run started. -

The Eagles were very much in 
charge of the ball game all the 
way, running up 21 points in the 
first half.

The game got under way with 
the Bulldogs kicking, and it was 
Eldorado’s ball on their own 27. 
Their first two plays were good 
for a 1st down. Two more plays 
and another 1st down. There were 
several plays, a penalty, and a 
pass from Nixon to Edmiston that 
put us down in pay territory, 
where Craig went through the line 
for a TD. Extra point good. 7-0.

Melvin brings ball up to their 
25 on our kick off. 3 plays for no 
gain. They kick out, Eagles fumble 
and Melvin recovers on- our 43. 
Melvin pulls 3 plays and kick out 
on the 4th. Eagles take over on 
their own 12.

Bight plays by the Eagles result 
in 4 first downs. Then they get 
bogged down—penalized for too 
much time— and ball goes over to 
Melvin. (Quarter.)

Melvin takes over on their own 
30, and make their first 1st down 
in the ball game. They fumble, we 
recover on their 30. Edmiston goes 
round end for a TD. Kick is good. 
Score 14-0.

Melvin receives our kick and 
brings ball back to their 38. They 
kick out on 4th play and' its El­
dorado’s ball on our own 18 yard 
line.

We run several plays and are 
penalized 15 yards, then pick up 
two 1st downs. Three more plays 
fail to get us anywhere and Nixon 
kicks out on the 4th. Melvin takes 
over on theii'l).

Melvin fumbles on first play. 
Eldorado recovers back of goal 
line. Good for TD, and Nixon’s 
kick is again good. Score 21-0.

Melvin’s ball on their own 29. 
On their 3rd play a long pass is 
intercepted. John Phillips is hurt 
and taken from the game and a 
few minutes later Logan is also 
injured.

Eldorado loses ground due to 
penalties and ball finally goes over 
to Melvin. Melvin tries one pijjss 
after the other and pick up three 
1st downs. Melvin player hurt and 
taken out of game. Half ends with 
Melvin in posession of the ball, 
but with no scores. (21-0)

Second Half
The second half starts with the 

Eagles kicking. Melvin’s ball on 
their own 28. The ball see-sews 
back and fotrh all through the third 
quarter. There are short passes 
and long passes, fumbles and pen­
alties, and the quarter ends with 
the same score it started with.

As play is resumed in the last 
quarter it is . Melvin'is- ball. They 
get off a nice pass. Then they 
fumble and the Eagles take over. 
We make two 1st downs, but after 
the next 4 plays ball goes back to 
Melvin on their 29. Three incom­
plete passes and they kick out.

Eldorado takes over on their own 
i 44. The Eagles steam-roller down 
the field taking a 1st down with, 
each two plays. They are finally 
down to Melvin’s  17, where Nixon 
goes through the lien for TD. 

i Again the kick is good and the 
J score is 28-0.

There was not too much time 
left in the ball game when Eldor­
ado kicked off to Melvin, but they 
took the ball—made a short pass, 
and suddenly a player broke out 
for a 55 ya/rd run and a TD. Their 
kick was good, and Melvin chalked 
up their 7 points in the last minute 
of the game.

Statistics
Melvin: First downs, 9; yards 

gained by scrimmage, 80; yards 
lost by scrimmage, 20; forward 
passes, 20; passes completed, 7; 
yards gained by passes, 136; for­
wards intercepted, 1; number of 
punts, 5; punts average, 32; run- 
back of punts, yds., 20; fumbles, 
4; own fumbles recovered, 1; pen­
alties, 1; yards lost on penalties, 5.

Eldorado: First downs, 19; yards 
gained by scrimmage, 289; yards 
lost by scrimmage, 6; forward 
passes, 16; passes completed, J; 
yards gained by passes, 81; for­
wards intercepted, 1; number of 
punts, 1; punts average, 44; run- 
back of punts, yds., -3; fumbles, 5; 
own fumbles recovered, 3; penal­
ties, 9; yards lost on penalties, 85.

Other'Games Friday
While Melvin was taking a beat­

ing here Friday night, other games 
in this area resulted as follows:

'Sonora beat the Angelo Kittens 
18-13.

Llano defeated Ozona 27-6.
Iraan beat Big Lake 46-0.
Menard defeated Rochelle 33-6.
Del Aio beat Junction 47-0.
Eden beat Mason 46-12.

About Menard
As the Eagjes prepared for the 

first conference tilt of the season 
against Menard here tomorrow 
night at 8:00, it was pointed out 
that the Menard team has lost two 
games so far, those against Ban­
dera and Melvin; and has won 
three: Rochelle, Fredericksburg,
and Mason.

Supt. T. E. Holcomb thanked the 
public for their cooperation with 
the ticket takers and traffic dir­
ectors so far in the season. He said 
that even better handling of the 
crowd could be accomplished if 
all football fans would have cor­
rect change ready at the gate.

Local Legionnaires 
At Mason Convention

American Legion District 21 held 
a weekend convention in Mason 
Oct. 6 and 7. The following officers 
were chosen to serve during the 
coming year: Earl Tate, Brown- 
wood, commander; Alfred Nuffen- 
dorf, Fredericksburg, vice comman­
der; Rev. J. Cochran, Brownwood, 
chaplain; Robert Lee, Mason, ad­
vocate judge, and Nick Mangen, 
San Angelo, ■sergeant-at-arms.

Bev McCormick Post 257, Eldo­
rado, was represented by Arthur 
Mund, vice commander, and Ber­
nard Carr. They report an interest­
ing program stressing American­
ism and the importance of a re­
newed interest in citizenship, and 
■an awakening to the threat of com­
munism facing Americans today. 
Principal speakers for the occasion 
were Rev. Lester Cochran and 
Sen. Jep. S. Fuller.

The next meeting will be held 
in Fredericksburg.

METHODIST REVIVAL TO CLOSE 
WITH MASS M EETING SUNDAY

A mass meeting at San Angelo’s 
Guinn Field 'Sunday evening at 
7:00 will bring to a climax the 
evangelistic services which have 
been under way in Methodist 
churches of the state. Methodists 
from an area surrounding San An­
gelo, south to Del Rio, west to 
MoCamey, north to 'Sterling City 
and east to Miles, will attend the 
mass meeting.

Methodists of Eldorado will ga­
ther at the church and go in cars, 
leaving the church at 5:00. All who 
are interested are urged to be 
there at that time—there will be 
transportation for those without 
cars. The speaker for the evening 
will be Rev. Walter Willis o f El 
Paso First Methodist Church. If 
weather does not permit the out- 

I of-door meeting the group will go

to the City Auditorium. A choir 
of 200 is expected to lead the song 
services, and the Eldorado choir 
is invited to be a part of this mass 
choir.

Meanwhile the revival is under 
way each night at the Methodist 
Church in Eldorado. A visitation 
committee will convene and call on 
various families of the city after 
6:00 and the regular service will 
open each night at 7:30. The Rev. 
R. Davidson, a Methodist pastor of 
Memphis, is bringing an inspira­
tional message each evening. There 
is no meeting Saturday but reg­
ular services Sunday morning.

Rev. Roy Shilling will go to 
Shamrock, in North Texas, the 
last of the month, to hold similar 
services there.

* •
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Pointers About Fire 
Prevention Given

COLLEGE STATION— Some 3,- 
500 lives and more than one hun­
dred million dollars in property 
losses -will be the toll for rural 
fires in the nation this year. The 
Texas Farm and Ranch Safety 
Committee, headed by president J. 
Walter Hammond o f the Texas 
Farm Bureau Federation and E. C. 
Martin, Texas Agricultural Exten­
sion Service, is urging all Texans 
not only to observe National Fire 
Prevention Week, October 7-13, but 
to practice fire prevention every 
day in the year.

The leaders report that eaah 
year there is a sharp drop in the

EDW. A. CAROE
217 S. Chadbourne St.

San Angelo, Texas

Complete Optical 
Service

Eyes Examined 
Glasses Fitted

25 YEARS in SAN ANGELO

«
number of fires during and im­
mediately following Fire Preven­
tion Week and cite this as evidence 
to prove that something can be 
done to prevent fires when people 
really work at the job. Rural fires 
occur at the rate of one every five 
minutes and records show that 90 
per cent are due to carelessness 
and ntegleet and are preventable.

They say one or more of the fol­
lowing hazards is usually respon­
sible for .most rural fires: defective 
stoves and furnaces; defective, 
clogged and poorly built chimneys: 
failure to protect buildings with 
lightning rods; improper, storage 
of gasoline and kerosene; sparks 
falling on flammable roofs; spon­
taneous ignition of hay; careless 
smoking habits; overloaded electri­
cal circuits and failure 'to replace 
worn electrical cords1 and defective 
electrial appliances and equipment.

The members of the Texas Com­
mittee point out that the big fire 
prevention job rests with the indi­
vidual farm family. Each member 
of the family should always be on 
the alert for fire hazards and when 
one is found, it should be removed 
immediately. Tomorrow, in this 
case, may be too late. But they are 
quick to add that other fire pre­
vention practices can best be car­
ried out on a community or neigh­
borhood basis. There should, they

Si?

Th e  Lady Knows 
W hat She W ants! :*S

Chances are she’s been want­
ing an IDEAL Corner Cabinet 
for a long time. What a won­
derful addition to the entrance 
hall, dining or breakfast room! 
Installed on easy terms.

IDEAL IRONING 
BOARD

Another popular 
home convenience. 
The swivel-type 
board folds into 
the wall, out of 
the way when not 
in use. Installed on 
easy terms.

TIME TO REPAINT YOUR HOME
Brighten your home, inside and out, with high 

quality Minnesota Paint. Material ahd labor on 

one bill. Up to 36 months to pay.

FOR YOUR HOME . . .  A CAMERON ROOF
Quality materials, expert workmanship, plus the depend­
able Cameron guarantee. Don't delay putting a Cameron 
roof on your home. Easy payments.

CAMSRONIZE YOUR PROPERTY NOW!
(C AM ERO N -IZE) To remodel, modernize, repair, re-/oof, repaint, 
repaper homes or other buildings; add rooms or porches; install 
attic fans, insulation, floor furnaces.

O N LY  1 0 %  D O W N . . .  Up to  3 6  MONTHS to  p a y .

See The New Ideal Kitchen Cabinet Display 

At Our Store.

You Can Install One In Your Kitchen 

On Easy Payment Plan

W m . C a m e r o n  &  Co.
HOME OF COM PLETE BU ILD IN G  SER V IC E

say, be provisions made in each 
community for pooling all fire 
fighting equpmeret. There are many 
fires such as grass, brush or trash 
fires that could ibe controlled be­
fore they get out of hand if assist­
ance and a few pieces o f equipment 
were available. The portable spray 
rigs or even hand sprayers can be 
used successfully. There is a great 
need for more fire fighting equip­
ment in most rural areas hut that 
on hand should always be serviced 
and ready for immediate use.

Keep several barrels of water at 
strategic spots 'about the farm­
stead1 or better, if water pressure 
is abailable, locate hydrants near 
the danger spots and see that suf­
ficient hose is on hand to reach all 
buildings. The committee recom­
mends that families hold fire drills 
occasionally. By doing this on a 
family and neighborhood basis, 
each individual will become famil­
iar with his assignment and fuller 
use of available equipment can be 
made in time of crisis.

The Committee urges every ru­
ral Texan, young and old, to make 
a complete survey of all farm 
buildings for fire hazards and then 
see that the necessary steps are 
taken to remove these hazards. A 
well kept farmstead with every­
thing in place and 'a place for ev­
erything will help keep fires away 
from your farm or ranch and will 
set an example for  others to fo l­
low.

Ralph Joseph Weds 
San Antoino Girl

Ralph Joseph, son of .Mrs. M. 
Baker of San Antonio, and grand­
son o f Mrs. Dena White of this 
city, was married Sunday morning 
in a church ceremony to Rebecca 
Whitt, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Homer Whitt of iSan Antonio. A f­
ter the ceremony the couple left on 
a trip to Colorado 'Springs and 
Denver, Colo.

The 'groom is in 'service and has 
been stationed in San Antonio.

A reception followed the wed­
ding, and was attended by a large 
number of relatives and friends. 
The couple received many wedding 
gifts, including a new car, the gift 
of the groom’s mother.

A friend took moving pictures 
of the wedding and reception.

EAGLETS LOSE TO SONORA
The Eldorado Eaglets lost to 

Sonora team by 15 to 33 last Thurs­
day night. The Eaglets meet Ozona, 
there, next week, Coach Miers 
Johnson announced.

ROBERT MASSIE 
FUNERAL HOME

Ambulance Service 
TELEPHONE 4444 

SAN ANGELO, TEXAS

RONNIE MITTEL 
IS HONORED ON 
14TH BIRTHDAY

Honoring their sor. Ronnie on 
his 14th birthday, Mr. and Mrs. Ar­
chie Mittel entertained with a 
party for his Freshman Class Sat­
urday night. Twenty-six young 
people attended, and the Mittels 
were assisted in entertaining and 
serving the group by Mrs. Dee 
Love and Mrs. T. E. Holcomb.

The Corral provided the meeting 
place for the young people, who 
played various directed games dur­
ing the evening, from 7:00 until 
10:00. Prizes were offered for the 
best gum sculpture, Jane Miller 
winning for the girls, with her 
mouse, and Montie Hill for boys, 
with his horse’s head.

Refreshments consisted of punch 
and cake.

Those present were: Bill Hol­
comb, Jim Steward, Sonny Moore, 
Dorothy Carrell, Donna McCor­
mick, Jonme Whitten, Barbara 
West, Sue Holmes, Kenneth Love, 
Gera'ld Wilson, Tony Kerr, Ronnie 
Mittel, Colleen Hicks, Bessie Thig­
pen, Jo Ann Trentham, Glo Wan’da 
Jeffrey, Jerry Lynn Pennington, 
Jean Kuykendall and Anna Re.no- 
bato. Others present were Mr. and 
Mrs. W. S. Carrell, Mr. .and Mrs. 
Houston Thigpen and Ruth Ann, 
and Mr. and Mrs. John Waldrum 
and Sandra

WOMAN’S CLUB
Mrs. Edwin Jackson presided ov­

er the regular meeting of the Eldo­
rado Woman’s club on Tuesday in 
the Memorial Building. Mrs. Keno 
Ogden was program leader for 
the day’s study. Roll call was an­
swered with the name of an out­
standing citizen.

Mrs. Archie Mittel’s topic for 
discussion was “ A 'Challenge to 
Parents.” She stated that citizen­
ship has no boundaries and that 
the home is the only foundation of 
workable citizenship. No place in 
the world is now more than 40 
hours distant.

In her report on International 
Relations Mrs. J. 'E. Tisdale said 
that in the matter of trustees the 
U. iS. has always astounded the 
world by her generosity.

Mrs. L. D. Ochsner served re­
freshments to 21 members. It was 
announced that the next meeting 
would he Oct. 23 in the club room 
with Mrs. R. J. Page as hostess.

Mrs. Charlie Robinson has been 
away from home nearly three weeks 
visiting relatives at Bowling Green, 
Kentucky, on her way home stop­
ping at Abilene for a visit. She has 
returned to her home in the Rudd 
Community.

Mrs. A. L. Ohlen'buiger of Mc- 
Camey and her children are here 
for an indefinite stay with Mr. and , 
Mrs. T. K. Jones, her parents, j 
Johnnie has entered sixth grade * 
of the Eldorado schools and Eddie 
the second. »

Mr. and Mrs. Ted Kirby and son 
of Crane, formerly of Eldorado, 
visited here Sunday with Mr. and 
Mrs. E. W. Craig and Mr. and Mrs. 
Earl Cathey.

Mr. and Mrs. T. W. Johnson vis­
ited last weekend in Midland and 
Kermit and brought their son E. 
T. back with them, for a several- 
day visit.

Better Built Homes
Delivered to your lot Built to suit you

Meet GI and FHA specifications 
Loans arrang-ed

See one of these houses under 
construction at

Mund Lumber Co. 804 No. Bell
San Angelo—Phone 21945

For more information see or call 
Mund Realty, Eldorado________ 25971

''W >

Help your cows produce a big Calf Crop
SUPPLEMENT RANGE WITH

PURINA RANGE CHECKERS
While a cow is carrying her calf, nutritional 
needs are high, much higher than can be 
normally supplied by grass alone. For this, 
reason, thousands of well-known ranchers 
supplement with Purina Range Checkers.
Checkers supply vitamins, minerals, carbo­
hydrates and a variety of protein. For big 
results— a big calf crop and lots of m ilk -  
feed Purina Range Checkers. The variety in 
Range Checkers makes a difference, all 
right!

ELDORADO WOOL COMPANY
■ ■ W .V .V .V bV .V .V .V .V .V .

SPROUL
REAL ESTATE & INSURANCE 

Ranch Loans
Your Business Appreciated 

Office Phone 25351 Res. 23141

)/ze //up unc/̂ ou//see

Longest of the Lot
Chevrolet looks longest, 
Chevrolet is longest . . .  a 
swank and sweeping 197% 
inches over-all that tops any 
other car in the low-price 
field. Size up Chevrolet’s 
greater length, and you’ll find 
it hard to settle for less.

M ost Road -H ugging 
W eight

Gives you more road-hugging, 
road-smoothing weight . . . 
a hefty 3140 pounds! in the 
model illustrated that no com­
parable car in the field can 
match. Get the feel of this 
big car, and you won’t settle 
for less. (tShipping weight.)

W idest Tread in Its Field
Here’s the steadiness of the 
widest tread in the field . . . 
58% inches between centers 
of rear wheels. Once you’ve 
known the better roadability 
of Chevrolet’s wider tread, 
you wouldn’t settle for less.

A m e rica ’s Largest 
and  Finest 

Low -Priced Car!

t

Finest
Comfort Features

Luxury  of Body by Fisher . . . 
cradled ease of unitized Knee 
Action . . . smooth Gontrol of 
Center-Point Steering!

Biggest Brakes of Any 
Low-Priced Car

Big, powerful Jumbo-Drum 
brakes—largest in the low-price 
field! Use the car’s own momen­
tum to increase stopping power.

The Styleline De Luxe 4-Door Sedan 
(Continuation of standard equipment and trim i!lut~ 
trated is dependent on availability of material.)

W ay Ahead with 
Valve-in-Head

The trend’s to valve-in-head. And 
Chevrolet’s had it for nearly 40 
years! Get sparkling perform­
ance and real over-all economy.

CHEVROLET

Join the Shift to No-Shift P O W E R  t / lc c f e  
A u to m at ic  T ra n sm is s io n *  t

Sensationally smooth! Excitingly easy! It’s a new experience 
in driving, the modern way to drive. Costs little more—or 
even less than many a car with standard gearshift!
*Combination of Powerglide Automatic Transmission and 105-h.p. 
Engine optional on De Luxe models at extra cost.

TISDALE CHEVROLET COMPANY
Phone 22981 - - Eldorado, Texas

---------------------- J-----------
. f

________ .______
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RECIPE OF THE WEEK 
Corn and Cheese Rarebit 

! i  cup chopped green pepper 
% teaspoon minced onion.
1 tablespoon butter.
% teaspoon salt.
Dash of pepper.
1/8 teaspoon paprika.
2/3 cup milk.
1 11-ounce tin cream style corn. 
% pound cheese, diced.
% teaspoon Worcestershire 

sauce.
2 eggs, beaten, 
toast.
Saute green pepper and onion in 

butter until soft; ’add seasonings, 
milk and corn, and simmer 10 min-' 
ukes. Place over boiling water and 
stir in cheese and Worcestershire 
sauce. When cheese is melted, stir 
in beaten eggs and cook two min­
ute’s longer. Serve on toast. Five 
servings.

Mr. and Mrs. Dee Love enter­
tained with a coffee fo.r about 50 
friends after the ball game Friday 
night at the Memorial building.

Mr. and Mrs. W. G. Godwin spent 
the weekend at Waco and attended 
the A&M and Oklahoma football 
game.

Mrs. Billy Whitley and baby of 
Sonora spent Sunday night here 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wyndell Hall.

Mr. and Mrs. Odes Jeffrey have 
had as guests^Mr. and Mrs. Ches- 
ton Jeffrey of Kerrville, who spent 
the day Sunday here. The men are 
brothers.

The Gordon Griggses of San An­
gelo, former Eldorado residents, 
visited friends here Sunday.

Pat Joiner has gone to Del Rio 
to enter Rena in the races, which 
will take place this weekend.

Mrs. Ray Jones spent a day last 
week in San Angelo with their son 
C. F. Jones and his family.

Mrs. Marvin Logan has been on 
the sick list.

Mr. and Mrs. Elton McGinnes 
spent the weekend with the Claude 
Dittmores in Tennyson.

Mr. and Mrs. Sam McGinnes 
soent Sunday in Eden with tneir 
daughter Mrs. Walter Lowe and 
her family.

Guests of Mr. and Mrs. Henry 
Moore last weekend were Mrs. 
Moore’s sister and her husband, 
Mr. and Mrs. LeRoy Alsak of Big 
Spring.

Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Jackson 
spent the weekend in Bertram and 
Austin.

Blake’ s Electric
HEADQUARTERS FOR

HOT POINT
APPLIANCES

SOLD TO ANYONE— ANYWHERE

R E A  Frigidaire Dealer
CONTRACT WIRING

See Us About Our Credit Plan 

FOR PROMPT SERVICE ON

WASHING 
AND GREASING

BRING YOUR CAR TO

Jeffrey Bros. Station
GULF PRODUCTS —  PHONE 94471

BRING OUT
H

IN

Y O U R  H A IR

Regular Care 
Does It!

Phone 21801 for Appointment

Ask for Fae or Ollie
/

Eldorado Beauty Shop

The Gospel And 
A Warning

“ I marvel that ye are so soon 
removed from him that called you 
into the Grace of Christ into an­
other gospel: which is not another. 
But there be some that trouble you 
and would pervert the Gospel of 
Christ.

“ But though we, or an angel 
from heaven, preach any other gos­
pel unto you than that which we 
love preached unto you, let him 
be accursed.”  Gal. 1:6, 7, 8.

This wonderful gospel that Paul 
preached to us is almost a forgot­
ten thing in these times. Though 
many preach, they preach as just 
quoted, “ another gospel.”

But notice also that it is not 
another gospel, for there can only 
be one gospel.

Notice in the seventh verse “ that 
some would pervert the Gospel so 
th’at anyone who does not preach 
this gospel is a pervert.”

In Galatians 1:4 it is plainly set 
forth what the Gospel of Christ is.
Who gave himself for our sins, 

that he nvieht deliver us from this 
present evil age according to the 
will of God and our father. To 
whom be glory forever and ever. 
Amen.

Have you heard this gospel? 
Have you been delivered from your 
sins? Does Jesus live in you?

—Rev. F. H. Prvor, pastor, Fund­
amental Baptist Church.

Mr. and Mrs. Arch Carson and 
Judy of Big Srvrine viisted Satur­
day night and .Sunday with the L. 
Moores.

Mrs. Jack Whitley of Ozona un­
derwent minor surgery recently at 
Holcomb 'Clinic.

I First Baptist News |
V---------------------------- ------------------- f

We welcome into the fellowship 
of our church the following: Miss 
Anna Baker, Miss Sue- Holmes, 
'Mrs. John W. Evans Jr., and Mr. 
and Mrs. Miers Johnson. We have a 
welcome for these new members 
and trust that if you are a Bap­
tist living in Eldorado and do not 
have a church home, you will con­
sider making our church your 
church.

This Sunday the First Baptist 
church will observe its golden anni­
versary. We wish to extend a wel­
come to all former members and 
friends to be with us on this day. 
There will be an all day service. 
Lunch will be served at the church 
at noon. Afternoon program will 
consist of song feast, testimonies, 
and viewing the history of the life 
of the church for its first 50 years. 
Evening service will be laymen's 
-night, as October 14th is laymen’s 
day all over the South. Come be 
with us on this very significant 
day.

Our goal for Sunday School at­
tendance for October is 195. We 
went six over the goal the first 
Sunday. Let us go over again on 
our Golden Anniversary day. Our 
■slogan by departments is, “ One 
More Than the Month Before.” The 
efficiency banner f o r  Sunday 
School in September was won by 
the Beginner department. M t s . 
Claudia Galbreath and her fine 
teachers have won it every month.

Our Training Union under Bro. 
Bill Rountree reached its highest 
attendance last Sunday night since 
March: 84. Our goal is 100. If each 
leader and member of each Union 
will work we can reach the goal. 
Let us work together for a greater 
Training Union.

The young people’s organiza­
tions of the W. M. S. were reorgan­
ized Monday afternoon. Mrs. L. D. 
-Mund and Mrs. Jack Montgomery 
have the Sunbeams. Every boy and 
girl ages 4 through 8 aTe invited 
to be in the Sunbeams. The G. A. 
group are under Mrs. Clifford Nel­
son and every girl of junior age is 
invited to attend. The Junior R. 
A.’s are under the leadership of 
Bro. Nelson and all Junior boys 
are invited to attend.

Get 2 At Same Time
COLLEGE STATION — The 

hornfly population of the state has 
reached the danger point. That’s 
the word from James A. Deer, as­
sociate Extension entomologist of 
Texas A&M College. He reports 
the weather of the past few weeks 
—repeated- ’showers with warm 
temperatures and above average 
humidity—has been responsible for 
the hornfly population increase.

Deer says cattle owners should

immediately take the necessary 
steps to rid their herds of these 
pests. Here’s why; a heavy infest­
ation will cause cattle to go into 
the winter in a weakened condition 
and if -they become heavily infested 
with lice during the winter, there’ll 
be more trouble. Horntflies and lice 
are 'both blood suckers and the re­
sult will be anemic cattle.

According to Deer, cattle treated
now for hornflies may also he 
treated for lice. This combination 
treatment will save time and labor

and is insurance aganst cattle go­
ing into the winter in a weak con­
dition. For the combination treat­
ment, Deer recommends that live­
stock producers spray (their ani­
mals with a solution containing 
four pounds of 50 per cent wettable 
DDT powder and four pounds of 
six per cent gamma wettable BHC 
powder to each 100 gallons of wa­
ter. Toxaphene may also he used. 
He recommends using a spray con­
taining only five-tenths of one per 
cent of this material.

The Eldorado Success
Entered as Second Class Matter at the 

*>ost office at Eldorado, Texas, under the 
\ct of March 3, 1887.

PUBLISHED EVERY THURSDAY 
At Eldorado. Texas

Fred Gunstead________ Publisher
Alice Gunstead___________  Editor
Bill Gunstead____Associate Editor

Any., erroneous reflection upon the char­
acter, standing or reputation of any person, 
firm or corporation which may appear In 
the columns of the Success will be gladly 
corrected upon same being brought to the 
attention of the publisher.

Notice of entertainments where a charge 
of admission is made, obituaries, cards of 
thanks, reso’ utions of respect, and all 
matters not news will be charged for *t 
the regular rates.

We are now prepared 
to handle your orders for

ENGRAVED
Wedding Invitations 
and announcements
as well as high class 

printed forms.

Eldorado Success

ANYTHING IN

STOVES
GAS STOVES
$5.75 to $28.00

GAS HOSE
2’ to 10’ lengths

\

GAS TUBING

GAS COCKS 
1-2, 3-4, automatic lock

HOSE ENDS

COPPER CONNECTORS

Order Radiants Early
OIL HEATER WICKS 

AND REPAIR

GAS BATHROOM 
HEATERS

WE HAVE IT!

WOOD HEATERS
Elbows 

Stove Pipes 
Dampers 

Tee Joints 
Taper Joints 
Metal Flues 
Flue Tops 
Flue Caps

Any kind of special metal 
work.

STOVE SHOVELS 
FLUE RINGS 

STOVE PIPE COLLARS

Eldorado Hardware
Eldorado, Texas— Phone 23351 

WE SERVICE ANYTHING WE SELL!

What’s the fastest-growing 
line of trucks in America?

IOOK around you— in cities, on farms, 
-j at terminals and loading docks — 

wherever goods are moved on wheels.

More and more, the pay load’s packed 
on a GMG.
You see those letters on medium and 
heavy Diesels, the most economical 
workers in their field. For GM C means 
first in Diesel power.
You see gasoline-powered G M C ’s 
front-running the highways of America 
-pace-setting delivery of the necessi­
ties of peace and war,
You see nimble bantamweights of the 
family—the highest-powered to 
2-tonners made—outpulling, outhauling 
every other truck in their class.

E ver wonder why GM G is gaining a 
greater percentage of the industry 
than any other truck-maker?
Ask the truck drivers themselves.
See the confident way they talk of

the power plants, the broad-shouldered 
chassis—the way a GMG handles.

A s k  about the tons they’ve hauled, 
the miles they’ve logged —the nip-and- 
tuck schedules they’ve licked time 
and again.
Ask these cost-wary haulers why they’ve 
made GMC the fastest-growing fleet in 
the land.
They’ ll tell you it’s because GM G is 
the finest motor truck made.
If you’ll come in, we’ll show you why 
we think they’re right.

’A  TO 2 0  TONS. . .

JONES MOTOR COMPANY
Phone 21591, Eldorado

You’ll do better on a used truck with your G M C  dealer



Mow Menard
EAGLES

I support the Eagles 100%.
I also sell gas and oil and ZEREX!

SEE YOU AT THE GAME!

—JACK ELDER
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COMPLETE STOCK OF

Sherwin Williams Paint 
Super Kem Tone 

Kem-Glo 
Textone

Texture Paint
Perf-a-tape & cement

JACK’S FURNITURE

'Largest and finest 
collection of Early American 

Glass and China 
in West Texas, also hundreds 

of lamps of all kinds.

SALLY’S ANTIQUES 
2605 N. Oh'adbourne 
San Angelo, Texas

Water Well 
Drilling

From 6 Iinch Holes 
Up to 16 Inch

FULLY INSURED

Wesley C. Young
Phone Collect No. 24661 

Sonora, Texas

Eldorado Lodge
No. 890 — A. F. & A. M. 
Stated Meeting 2nd Thurs­
day in each month.

Visiting Brethren Welcome.

WELDING
Electric & Acetylene 

Our -work speaks for itself!

Eldorado Welding
Vernon Carroll

SCRATCH PADS
Made of 16-pound white bond 
paper, with 100 sheets to the 
pad.

Size 3x5
2 Dozen Pads _________ $1.60

Size 4x6
1 Dozen P a d s ________  $1.20

Size 6x9
1 Dozen Pads _________ $3.00

THE SUCCESS OFFICE

ESTERBROOK fountain pens, $2. 
-—At the Success office.

Signs

FOR RENT
and

FOR SALE
Printed in 'black letters ZVs - 
inches high, on heavy white 
cards 7 x 914 in. Available at 
Success at 15c each.

Trade-In

CHARLIE TRIGG 
MOTORS

—Just received shipment 1952-3 
TEXAS ALMANACS. Latest on 
1950 census figures-, roads, etc. — 
at Eldorado Success for $1.25.
FLOOR SANDING and finishing. 
Expert carpet and linoleum laying. 
Linoleum and carpet samples 
shown by request. Write or phone. 
Ace Floor Covering Co., San An­
gelo. 38-39-40-41*
IRONING— $1 dozen, except shirts 
and pants for 30c a suit. Mrs. Cal­
vin Matthews, at 2-story Hum­
phrey apartment near schoolhouse.

38-41*
FOR SALE— one apartment house, 
3,000 feet floor space, five units 
and two cottages, close in, approx­
imately $325 per month income—- 
also four down-town business lots. 
Inquire Sproul Insurance and Real 
Estate.
m jrD E SK  SIZE blotting paper— 
yellow, red, blue, brown, green. 
Twenty cents. —Eldorado Success.
WE HAVE COMPLETE STOCK 
of Dearborn space heaters, large 
wall heaters, and floor furnaces.— 
Topliffe Gas & Electric Service.
WANTED: Sewing, alterations, 
button holes, and pearl snaps. 
Reasonable, at Mrs. Fay Poynter 
house.— Mrs. Clyde Pliant, phone 
24591. 40-41-42*

FOR RENT: Small three room 
house, furnished, close in, with or 
without linens or dishes.—Elder 
Station. ltc

OFFICE space for rent, on high­
way near business district. Phone 
91471. ltc
FOR SALE: New, never uncrated 
20-gallon gas hot water heater, 10 
year guarantee. Bargain price. — 
W. T. Fraker, phone 21821. 1*
ROOMS for rent, in Glendale. Pri­
vate bath and private entrance. 
Also have three heaters1 for sale. 
—Mrs. C. C. Henderson. ltc
2-ROOM furnished apartment for 
rent. Mrs. Rosa Owens. 1*

School Menus
_______________________________ j
Monday, Oct. 1: Vienna sausage, 

potato salad, cream peas-, cheese 
wedges, bread and butter, milk, 
cherry cobbler.

Tuesday, Oct. 2: Red beans, 
french fried potatoes, stewed toma­
toes, corn bread and butter, milk, 
peanut butter and graham crack­
ers. 7

Wednesday, Oct. 3: Swedish meat 
balls, buttered cabbage, black- 
eyed peas, bread and butter, milk, 
doughnuts.

Thursday, Oct. 4: Macaroni and 
cheese, mashed potatoes, english 
peas with' carrots, hot rolls and 
butter, milk, banana cake.

Friday, Oct. 5: Pork chops, can­
died s\veet potatoes', corn, bread 
and butter, milk, jello.

Mrs. J. R. Trentham served a 
family dinner Wednesday in cele­
bration of the Trentham’s 27th 
wedding anniversary

The E. E. Newlins have had as 
guests the A. A. Coopers of Big 
Spring and the C. C. Newlins of 
San Angelo.

Stapling 
Machines 

which 
use the 

standard 
£-inch 
staple. 

For Sale 
at

SUCCESS
OFFICE

BIRTHDAYS CELEBRATED
Celebrating the joint birthdays 

of George Williams and Patsy Hol­
den, the families were served a 
dinner Sunday at the Williams 
home. Present were the George 
Williams family, Mr. and Mrs. J. 
D. Holden and children, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Williams, Ab Williams, 
Mr. and Mrs. Woodie Ludwig, Mr. 
and Mrs. James Masey and son. 
There were a number of birthday 
gifts for the two who were honored, 
also a birthday cake.

PRESBYTERIAN WQMEN 
IN REGULAR SESSION

About 20 attended the women’s 
meeting Monday afternoon at the 
Presbyterian Church. The group 
opened in circles, Mrs. Bert Page 
and Mrs. Joe Edens taking charge 
of devotionals, after which Mrs. 
Charlie Robinson led the lesson for 
the entire group.

Two new members were enrolled. 
Mrs. Pete Ringle served refresh- 
mnts to 15 members and five visi­
tors. A set of pottery was pre­
sented to Mrs. Joe Edens at the 
close of the afternoon.

At Bauer’s

WITH
NATIONALLY
ADVERTISED

D I A M O N D  R I N G S

OHIO WOMEN 
LOSE ONCE AGAIN 
TO TEENAGERS

The Ohio women, still smarting 
from a bad defeat by the Teen­
agers the week before, almost won 
in a hotly contested baseball game 
Monday night at the' lighted park. 
The ‘score was 10 to 9 in favor of 
the Teenagers.

On the Ohio team were Mrs. 
Floyd Nunley, captain, and Mmes. 
Ernie Coppage, Rose Mary Uherek, 
Andy Kirby, Walter Warren, Merle 
Hatley, Wallace Gore, Dolores Col­
lins and Butch Klein.

The Teenager players were Car­
olyn Ratliff, captain, Charlene A t­
kinson, Esther Jones-, Lola Beth 
Ballew, 'Susie Linthicum, Juanita 
Phillips, -Colleen Hicks, Martha 
Dell William-s, a n d Marianne 
Craig, and- Margaret Ellen Edmis- 
ton substitute.

Couple Honored 
At Meador Home

Mrs. Edward Meador entertained 
with a dessert an-d bridge honor­
ing Edda Lou Meador and Russel 
Beach, her fiance, Saturday night.

The engaged couple were pre­
sented with a gift. High was won 
by A. G. McCormack, second high 
by John Miller, high canasta by 
Mr. and Mrs. Homer Wolfe, trav­
eling by Mrs. Elmer Peters, men’s 
bingo by Carroll 'Siproul, and wo­
men’s- by Mrs. Pete Williamson.

Ice cream arid cake was served.

O. E. S. MEETS
The Past Matrons and Past Pat*- 

rons of Eldorado Chapter No. 140 
and others- were honored with a 
program when the Eldorado Chap­
ter met in regular meeting Monday 
night. Phyllis Montgomery had 
charge of the -program. Flowers 
were presented to the twelve past 
matrons and past patrons.

Esther Schuller, -worthy matron, 
presided during the business ses­
sion. Mrs. Nan Montgomery was 
appointed delegate to attend the 
Grand Chapter meeting in -San An­
tonio Oct. 22. The worthy matron 
urged that all members 'be present 
for the initiation ceremony in No­
vember.

Refreshments were served to 26 
members by the hostesses, Mrs. 
Mae Tisdale, Mrs. Jessie Wheeler 
and Mrs. Faye Mace.

YOUTH MEETING
The students of the Eldorado 

Junior High School and the Sonora 
visitors were entertained in Cor­
ral room in the Memorial Bu’ lcung, 
Thursday night, October 4, after 
the Junior Football game. Between 
150 and 175 youngsters attended. 
Mrs. C. Wilkerson, Mrs. C. C. Mc­
Laughlin, Mrs. L. B. Sheffield, 
Mrs. Frank Prochaska, Mrs. Pal­
mer West, Mrs. Frank Reynolds, 
Miss Lottie Reynolds and Mrs. J.
E. Spencer were hostesses.

Mr. an-d Mrs. Lynn Alexander 
are visiting in Llano and Snyder.

Meeting at the home of Mrs. P.
F. Case on Monday, members of 
the Eldorado Guild of St. John’s 
Episcopal Church sewed articles 
to be s-old at the bazaar next month. 
The group will attend the monthly, 
auxiliary meeting at the rectory in 
Sonora next Wednesday.

Leonard Hight -and his family of 
San An-gelo spent 'Sunday here 
with -Leonard’s brother Wiley 
Hight and his family.

Mr. and Mrs. Stewart Davis 
were in San Antonio Wednesday.

-Mrs. D. E. DeLong had as- guests 
.recently Mis-s Addie B. Greeley of 
Houston, Mrs. W. A. Adams of 
Fort Stockton, and Mrs-. Ada Cha­
ney of Douglas, Arizona.

Members of the Eldorado Guild 
of St. John’s Episcopal Church will 
entertain Miss Edda Lou Meador, 
bride-elect of Russell Beach, at a 
coffee 'Saturday - morning, October
20, in the Memorial building. $75.00
Young daughters' of Guild mem­
bers will assist the hostesses.

Mrs. Jack Elder and Nancy Jo 
accompanied by E. H. Nixon, Jr., 
and Frank Edmiston were among 
the 50,000 fans attending the Texas 
and North Carolina game in Austin 
Saturday. Mrs. Elder, and Nancy. 
visited .with her daughter Rita Ann, j 
freshman student, and her brother J  • a  pin or finger-

$475.00

$175.00

Calvin Montgomery, senior student 
during the day. While there ar­
rangements for tickets and plans 
were made for the Jack Elders to 
attend the Texas-A&M game at 
College Station on Thanksgiving 
Day.

nail brings lock­
ing arm “out of 
hiding"

• Locking arm fits 
into slot at right 
angle at side of 
engagement ring

BAUER JEWELRY

Wright &  Hudgens
NORTHERN TISSUE— 3 Rolls___29c
SPAM —  C an____________________ 49c
Hormel Can Tamales, 2— 300 cans 59c 
Kimbell’s Orange Juice— no. 2 can_10e 
Kuners Sour or Dill Pickles— Quart 39c
Ready to Serve
Zesty Salad, 2— 8 oz. cans________29c
Sunshine Krisky Crackers, 1 Lb box 27c 
Chuck Wagon Beans, 2 No 303 cans 25c
Diamond Blackeye Peas, 3 cans____29c
Super Suds, Lge Box with coupon 25c
Blue White Starch— 4 boxes_______ 29c
Supreme Steel Wool— 6 Balls______10c
Swifts Jewel Shortening, 3 Lb Ctn__89c
Kimbells Corn Meal— 10 Lbs--------- 80c
Sniders Cocktail Sauce, Bottle____29c
Kimbell’s
Whole Sweet Potato, 2-| can______ _ 23c
Ronco Twist and Shell
MACARONI —  2— 8-oz. cello_____ 25c
Stokleys Lima Beans, 303 can_____ 29c
Dole Flat Sliced Pineapple, can 16c
Heinz Cooked Macaroni, 3— 6| oz. 29c 
Diamond Pork & Beans, 3— 303s 29c

Durkee’s Pound

M a r g a r i n e  3 2 c
PurAsnow 25 pounds

FLOUR 2.19
VEGETABLES

YAMS —  POUND______________   12c
ORANGES —  TWO D O Z E N ______ 49c
APPLES— Washington Del.— Lb__15c
TOKAY GRAPES —  POUND_____14c
Swifts Circle S Pound

P I C N I C S
Wilsons Hawkeye Bacon, Lb. 35c 
WIENERS — POUND 45c

Williams &  McW horter
Phone 25481 Eldorado, Texas

New and Used Cars
1951 GMC  ̂ T Pickup, long wheel base___New
1951 GMC 1 Ton P ick u p __________________New
1950 Chevrolet Club Coupe Del., R& H___$1495
1949 Nash Ambassador, radio, heater

Overdrive, 2 d o o r __________________ $1495
1950 Ford F-3 Pickup, H eater___________$1195
1948 Ford V8 Club Coupe, radio-heater__$ 895

WANTED USED CARS
We pay market price for good clean used cars.

Buy From Williams & McWhorter 
For Less and Bank the Rest

The First National Bank
Eldorado, Texas

OFFICERS AND EMPLOYEES
J. B. Christian---------------------------------President
J. E. Hill------------------------------- Vice President
W. O. Alexander-------------------Vice President
Leslie Baker_________________________ Cashier
Mrs. A. G. McCormack__________ Bookkeeper
Mrs. L. D. Ochsner----------------------Bookkeeper
Annie Neill Dickens_____________ Bookkeeper

BANKING HOURS
Week D aysl--------------9 :00 a. m. to 3:00 p m
Saturdays--------------------- 9 :00 a. m. to 12 Noon

Member Federal Deposit Ins. Corporation
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Announcing Wm. Cameron’s

W a ll Paper 
id Interior Decoration 

Demonstration
Wednesday, October 17— 3:30 to 5:00 p.m.

Memorial Building Club Room 

All Men and Women Interested Are Invited!

For those present we give 25c per person to 
designate which gets most votes!

Also valuable attendance prize to some lucky person

Demonstration mainly on wall papers and fabrics and 
other interior decoration problems.

Wm. Cameron & Co
ELDORADO
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PO S T-SC R IPT
Two thirds of the Eldorado Suc­

cess crew were out of town from 
Friday morning to Monday night, 
attending the State Fair. We were 
hack on the job Tuesday morning, 
both of us—late with our work, 
and still .tired, tout glad we’d gone.

We saw Guys and Dolls, the Ice 
Follies, and the Thrillcade. They’re 
all marvelous, and all completely 
different. We also saw all of the 
exhibits and made the grounds 
several .times over, including a few 
hours on the Midway.

Saturday was Press 'day—but as 
far as we were concerned it was 
just any day—we didn’t see a 
single newspaper .person we knew! 
It was also the day for agricul­
ture’s youth to take over, which 
■they did in a -big way—hundreds 
of busses unloading tihe young folks 
that morning from all over _ the 
state. We understand that they ate 
several tons of hamburger meat 
Saturday!

There are lots of interesting 
things to see— in case anyone read­
ing this intends to go. We were 
especially impressed with the dis­
tinct displays in the agriculture 
building, the Bell Telephone dem­
onstrations, the chance to appear 
on television (Just walk along and 
look and there you are) Dillinger’s 
car down in the .Midway, the show­
ings of old cars in the automobile 
building, and the trapeze artists!

That takes in just a few .things 
we liked.

Others we’ve learned of who at­
tended the Fair were Mr. and Mrs. 
Carl Stevens of Ozona, and Mr. 
and Mrs. A. J. Stevens of Eldorado, 
Mr. and Mrs. Grover Lee Johnson, 
Mr. and Mrs. Leslie Baker, Mr. 
and Mrs John Williams

Now we’ve been wondering how 
California is coming out on their 
state fair. Remember— last year 
they said they were going to chal­
lenge Texas’ claim to' the biggest 
state show.

Back from the city of Washing­
ton, D. C., are IMr. and Mrs. T. K. 

.’Jones, the only Texans who at­
tended the Washington Pilgrimage 

.'of American Churchmen.
They have a lot to report, and 

are especially enthusiastic over the 
many fine people they met and 
the good time they had. As may be 
expected, T. K. wore his usual wide 
brimmed hat and boots.—creating 
quite a stir among the delegation 
as the typical Texan, and the only 
person there thus garbed.
. They heard President Truman’s 
address to the group, tout were dis- 

k appointed that there was no recep- 
'  tion—-the president was well guard­

ed and left after his speech. The j 
night meeting always had some big 
drawing card like that— someone 
nationally known who talked to 
them.

Daytimes were most enjoyable, 
they state. At nine they would 
leave their hotel in chartered buss­
es, and make a big trip somewhere 
to interesting places. As is every­
one who makes the trip they were 
especially interested in Mount 
Vernon, which is as the original 
occupants left it—complete with a 
trundle bed, and a smoke house 
filled with hams! The group also 
yisited the Arlington Cemetery 
and placed a wreath on the tomb 
of the unknown soldier—and after­
wards had quite a little discussion 
about the segregated graves — 
white and colored being in separate 
places, they report!

Washington’s Christ Church was 
their church home on Sunday— 
they saw Washington’s original 
family pew there.

The Joneses state that they had 
a good trip, but it w'as dry all the 
way up there and all the way back, 
and that they have a lot of things 
to remember the rest of their lives 
for having been a part of this pil­
grimage.

A  very elaborate looking display 
truck was parked all day Tuesday 
on a lot opposite the Ohio Oil Co. 
office. The truck belonged to the 
Baker Tool Co., and carried a dis­
play of various kinds of oilfield 
tools.

—ps—
Mikeska Gin reported a total of 

189 bales toy Tuesday morning. 
Cotton has been coming in rather 
steadily, tout' there is not enough in 
the county to require much night 
work on the part o f the crews. As 
Moore’s Gin did not open this year, 
some is coming in from the Rey­
nolds neighborhood but the crop is 
unusually light due to the drouth.

— Ps—  iA. R. Parker is meeting with 
firemen of this district once each

•ek for five weeks, drilling them 
tihe latest in fire fighting.

He comes to Eldorado each Tues­
day night to meet with the boys. 
Tuesday’s lesson was on relaying 
water through several receptacles, 
to get it into a truck for fire fight­
ing use. He is from the state office.

Mr. and Mrs. W. R. Duncan and 
their grandsons, Shirl and Dan 
Gandy of Calf Creek spent the 
week end with the 0. B. (Bradshaw 
family, and other relatives^ from 
out o f town have also been visiting 
Mr. Bradshaw during his illness.

O. B. Bradshaw has returned 
from a three-weeks’ stay in Dallas 
where he had two operations. Mrs. 
Bradshaw and Mrs. Emma Brad­
shaw were with him.

Edda Lou Meador 
Is Shower Honoree

Honoring Edda Lou Meador, 
bride-elect of Russell Beach, the 
WSCS o f the Methodist Church 
entertained with a gift tea Satur­
day afternoon in the reception 
rooms of the church.

In the receiving line were Mrs. 
D. E. DeLong, (Mrs. Ralph Fowler, 
Mrs. S. D. Haiper, Mrs. Lawrence 
Steen, Mrs Edward Meador and tihe 
honoree and her mother Mrs. C. 
L. Meador, Jr.

Mrs. A. G. McCormack and Mrs. 
Bobby Barber of San Angelo serv­
ed the first hour and Miss Teena 
McMullen and Miss Joyce Burk 
the second. Mrs. Gerald Harbgraves 
and Mrs. Homer Wolfe of Falfurias 
were at the register.

The serving table was covered 
with a lace cloth, and centered 
with an arrangement of laven-dar 
glads. The white cake was topped 
with small purple flowers and the 
candles were white. Punch was 
ladled from a crystal bowl.

A large assortment of gifts was 
displayed on long tables in the re­
ception room.

Among the large number of 
callers were several from out of 
town, in addition to those mention­
ed above: Mrs. Harold Shertz of 
Sonora, Mrs. Max Hepry of Mc- 
Camey and Betty Wester of San 
Angelo, who will be one of the at­
tendants.

ATTENDANCE AWARDS MADE 
AT METHODIST S. S.

Ray Tisdale, superintendent of 
the Methodist Sunday school pre­
sented perfect attendance awards 
as follows Sunday morning during 
the Sunday school hour:

Mary Tisdale, four-year perfect 
attendance; Riedale West, Carol 
Tisdale, Sandra Holcomb, Martha 
Ann Topliffe, and Robbie Waldron, 
two-year pins; Doris Jane Orr, 
three months’ award.

Mr. and Mrs. John L. Barrows 
and son, Robert Lynn of San An­
gelo, visited over the week end 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Reuben Dickens and other rela­
tives.

Self-Employed Urged 
To Get SS Cards Now

Self-employed persons were urg­
ed by Social Security Administra­
tion aut'horitiiis to apply as soon 
as possible for social security 
cards, if they have not already done 
so. Under new SS regulations 
which became effective Jan. 1, 
1951, self-employed' persons were 
included in the coverage.

Many self-employed individuals, 
according to officials, 'still do not 
know that they are included in the 
benef.it program.

It was pointed out that the cov­
erage was compulsory and that 
many persons in the category may 
receive “ something of a shock” 
■when they pay their 1951 income 
tax and discover that an extra $50 
or $60 has been deducted.

Now is the slack season for the 
issuing of new cards, and it would 

■be advantageous to apply for the 
card before the Christmas rush 
when thousands of new workers 
are hired.

The self-employed are defined as 
individuals who have incomes from 
trades or businesses which they 
operate either .as sole owners or 
partners. Also covered are writer?, 
photographers-, appraisers, artists, 
sign painters and individuals with 
similar occupations who are not 
paid salary or commission by an 
employer.

Fanners, ranchers, doctors, den­
tists, lawyers, architects, engineers 
and ministers, and other profes­
sional men are not included in the 
coverage.

The Military ^
Major Q. Y. Miller of Ballinger 

and his wife and daughter Marg­
aret Jane spent a few days rec­
ently with his brother John Miller 
and his family. Major Miller had 
recently returned from Korea, and 
is now receiving new assignment 
to Travis Air Base near San Fran­
cisco.

G. -S. Cathey, brother of Mrs. A. 
J. Halbert, Mrs. Irene Rutland, and 
Mrs. Van O’Hara, received his 
discharge from service on October 
3 at Mineral Wells, and has return­
ed to his old job at a San Angelo 
grocery. He spent Saturday, Sun­
day and part of Monday here with 
his sisters and with Earl Cathey, 
on his way home.

He and his wife were involved 
in a car acciednt three weeks ago, 
in Which he received head and body 
injuries and his wife broken legs, 
the wreck occurring when his ve­
hicle hit the loose gravel at a turh 
in tihe highway. Bobh are doing 
well, relatives report, but the cars 
were -demolished.

Mr. and Mrs. A. F. Grelle re­
ceived a letter this week from their 
son, Harold, stating that he had 
landed in Japan September 29. His 
address is: »

Pfc Harold W. Greele 
US 54011828 
Prov. Co., 969 
%P. M. APO 613 
San Francisco, Calif.

AGRICULTURE SECRETARY 
TO SPEAK IN AUSTIN

Austin.— Secretary of Agricul­
ture Charles F. Brannan will be 
the principal speaker at the eighth 
annual convention of the Texas 
Social and Legislative Conference 
in Austin October 13-14, it was 
announced this week.

Conference Chairman Robert C. 
Eckhardt of Houston said the 
cabinet member had accepted an 
invitation to address the conven­
tion at 8 p. m. Saturday, October' 
13, at the Stephen F. Austin Hotel. 
He will be introduced by Texas 
Commissioner of Agriculture John 
C. White. This is an open meeting 
to which the public is invted.

—The Eldorado Success, $2.00 year.

Hyten, Den mother assistant, Mrs. 
G. W. Blair and Mrs. Lloyd John­
son. Boys attending, all new to 
Scouting except two, were Jerry 
D. Johnson, Jerry Nolen, Carl 
Dean Parker, Bob Blair, Junior 
Hyten, Alfred and Kenny Derrick 
and Billy Bates. The group elected 
Voy J. Mitchell as den chief and 
Alfred Derrick and Jerry Nolen 
denners. They worked on tie racks.

Den 3 met with the den mother 
Mrs. Burl Woodward, eight boys 
attending, four new to Scouting: 
Raymond Woodward, Joe and Allen 
Smith, Charles D. Prochaska, Ken­
neth Hicks, Stanley Badgett, Jim­
mie Durham and Eugene Bradshaw 
James Swain was elected den chief. 
Mrs. Prochaska, den mother’s as­
sistant, was present.

Refreshments were served, after 
they had worked on tie racks.

Pamela Cozzens of Midland is 
here to spend the week with her 
grandmother Mrs. Mattie Cozzens.

Mr. and Mrs. David Martin of 
San Antonio spent part of the 
weekend with Mrs. Martin’s sister, 
Mrs. Buster Dickens and her fam­
ily and went on to San Angelo to 
visit Mr. and Mrs. W. C. Evans.

Mrs. F. B. Gunn has gone to 
Duncan, Okla., to visit a sister, 
then will go to Dallas to meet her 
daughter-in-law from New York, 
who will be visiting relatives in 
Dallas.

Earl Edward Kissinger III is the 
name given the son born October 
1 to Mr. and Mrs. Earl Kissinger 
at Canyon City, Colorado. The 
mother is the former Frances Wil­
liams- and her husband is in ser­
vice. Grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. B. T. Williams- o f Cotapoxi, 
Colorado, and Mr. and Mrs. Earl 
Edward Kissinger of Canyon City. 
Great -grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Otto Sauer and Mr. J. Tom, 
Williams, of Schleicher county.

-Rev. and Mrs. Baltis Matthews 
of San Angelo visited Mr. and Mrs 
Vernon Hazelwood Sunday.

Mrs. Cecil Williams was called 
to Abilene to toe with her daughter 
Mrs. W. J. Davis of Lohn, who was 
ill.

Mr. and Mrs. Paul Page have 
moved to Eld-orado from Dallas, 
arriving here Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Stewart Davis and 
Jerry and- Carl Donaldson spent 
the week end in Junction with -rela­
tives of the Davises.

Mr. and Mrs. Milton Harris visit­
ed -Saturday and Sunday in Kerr- 
ville.

We Serve You
SEVEN DAYS A  WEEK

SCHOOL SUPPLIES
Meats Canned Goods

! Fresh Vegetables
McCORMlCK’S DRIVE-IN 
GROCERY AND STATION
At your service days, nights, Sundays

The -Cub Pack committee as set 
up for the coming year include1: 
Rev. Roy Shilling, Grover Johnson, 
Charles Gary, Frank ■ -Prochaska, 
Earl Parker, Lester Nixon, An­
drew Bogett, W. C. Hixon, Ray 
Boyer, John Stigler, and E. K. 
Bauer.

Den mothers will include: Mrs. 
W. 'C. Hixon, Mrs. I. J. Hyten, Mrs. 
Kogut, Mrs. R. L. Nolen, Mrs. 
Forrest Ruuge, Mrs. (ft B. Wood­
ward, -Mrs. W. C. Parks, Mrs. E.
B. Bates and Mrs. Lester Nixon.

Cub -Scout Den No. 2 met Tues­
day after school at the T. J. Kogut 
home for their first meeting of fh-j 
new year. Mrs. Sylvia Kogut will 
be den mother, Mrs. W. C. Parks, 
assistant den mother; and Mrs. W.
C. Hixon, assistant den mother; 
Cubs present were David Hixon, 
Jesse Hixon, Harvey Kogut, Reg­
inald Lagow, Gary Parks, Thomas 
Roach, James Runge, James L. 
Sallee ,and Jerry Swindale.

Dens are making tie racks as 
their first project.

Den 1 met this week with the 
Den mother, Mrs. R. L. Nolen, in 
charge, assisted by Mrs. I. J.

YEA, EAGLES — BEAT MENARD FRIDAY NIGHT — HERE!

WE THINK THE EAGLES ARE TOPS IN FOOTBALL------ AND WE KNOW YOU CAN WIN THIS
FIRST CONFERENCE GAME! WE THINK THAT JUST AS NATURALLY AS WE THINK THAT 
HUMBLE IS TOPS IN OIL! Drive in regularly for washing, greasing, gas and oil!

Wiedenmann’s Humble Station
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IN THE MATTER OF THE QUARTERLY REPORT OF

MRS. MABEL PARKER
TREASURER, SCHLEICHER COUNTY, TEXAS 

IN THE COMMISSIONERS’ COURT, SCHLEICHER COUNTY, TEXAS 

OCTOBER 8TH TERM, 1951

On this 8th day of October, A. D., 1951 in Regular Session of the Commissioners’ Court 
of Schleicher County, Texas, came on for examination the Quarterly Report of Mrs. 
Mabel Parker, Treasurer of Schleicher County, Texas, for the period beginning on the 
1st day of July A. D. 1951, and ending on the 30th day of September A. D. 1951, filed 
herein on the 4th day of October A. D. 1951 and the same having been compared and 
examined by the Court, and found to be correct, IT IS THEREFORE ORDERED by the 
Court that the same be and is hereby approved, and it appearing to the Court that 
during said time the said County Treasurer had received for account and credit of, and 
paid out of each of the several County funds, the amount set forth, and leaving balance 
to each of said funds, as follows, towit:

Amount balance to credit of the Jury Fund as per last report_____________  2184.68
Amount received since last report________________________________________  38.47

Total “ Cr.”  as shown by current report___________________________ 2223.15
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report____________________________ 181.59
Leaving and showing to credit of Jury Fund

on September 30, 1961, a balance of_______________________________  2041.56

Amount to credit of the Road and Bridge Fund as per last report---------------- 17.34
Amount received since last report_________________________________________ 3701.92

Total “ Cr.”  as shown by current report___________________________ 3719.26
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report------------------------------------------  3343.65
Leaving and showing to credit of R. and B. Fund

on .September 30, 1951, a balance of_______________________________  375.61

Amount to credit Schleicher Co. Park Imp. & Sink. Fund as per last report 7750.03
Amount received since last report_________________________________________ 18.47

Total “ Cr.” as shown by current report___________________________ 7768.50
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report____________________________ 2563.60
Leaving and showing to credit of Schleicher Co. Park Int. & Sink. Fund

on September 30, 1951, a balance of_______________________________  5204.90

Amount credit of Sch. Co. Rd. Bond Int. & Sink., Ser. 1950, as per last report 1815.23
Amount received since last report________ '___________ ____________________  27.77

Total “ Cr.”  as shown by current report___________________________ 1843.00
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report____________________________ None
Leaving and showing to credit of Sch. Co. Rd. Bond Int. & Sink., Series 1950

on .September 30, 1951, a balance of_______________________________  1843.00

Amount to credit of the Court House Improvement Fund as per last report- 651.00
Amount received since last report_________________________________________ None

Total “ Cr.”  as shown by current report___________________________ 651.00
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report____________________________ 404.15
Leaving and showing to credit of Court House Improvement Fund

on .September 30, 1951, a balance of_______________________________  246.85

Amount to credit of the General Fund as per last report___________________  5355.86
Amount received since last report_________________________________________ 561.56

Total “ Cr.” as shown by current rep ort__________________________  5917.42
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report____________________________  5865.03
Leaving and showing to credit of General Fund

on .September 30, 1951, h balance of_______________________________  52.39

Balance last report Schleicher Co. 1945 Road Bond, Int. & Sinking Fund____ 5835.60
Amount received since last report_________ _______________________________  55̂ 52

Total “ Cr.” as shown by current report___________________________ 5891.12
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report____________________________ None
Leaving and showing to credit of Sch. Co. 1945 Road Bond Int. & Sink. Fund

on September 30, 1951, a balance o f_______________________________ 6891.12

Amount to credit of Ct. House Imp. Bond Int. & Sink. Fund as per last report 1996.88
Amount received since last report_________________________________________ 36 98

Total “ Cr.”  as shown by current report__________________________  2033.86
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report____________________________ 162 50
Leaving and showing to credit of Ct. House Imp. Bond Int. & Sink. Fund”

on September 30, 1951, a balance o f_______________________________  1871.36

Amount to credit Schleicher Co. Fire Equipment Fund, as per last report___ None
Amount received since last report_________________________________________ 45 q27 08

Total “ Cr.” as shown by current report__________________________  15027!o8
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report____________________________ ’ None
Leaving and showing to credit of Schleicher Co. Fire Equipment Fund

on September 30, 1951, a balance of_______________________________  15,027.08

Amount to credit of the Permanent Improvement Fund as per last report___ 5521.24
Amount received since last report________________________________ _______ ; 213 20

, Total “ Cr.” as shown by current report___________________________ 5734A4
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report _______________________  5353 24
Leaving and showing to credit of Permanent Improvement Fund

on September 30, 1951, a balance o f_______________________________  381.20

\
Amount to credit of the Schleicher Co. Road Warrants Int. & Sink. Fund—  1374.77
Amount received since last report_________________________________________ 92 .57

Total “ Cr.”  as shown by current report___________________________ 1467 34
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report__________________________  g'p-j
Leaving to credit of Schleicher Co. Rd. Warrant & Sink. Fund

on September 30, 1951, a balance of_________ !_____________________  1459.33

Amount balance to credit Road & Bridge Special Fund as per last report__ 94 55
Amount received since last report_________________________________________ 142 42

Total “ Cr.” as shown by current report____________ ______________ 236A7
Amount transferred to other funds since last report____________________ __ •* g qq
Leaving and showing to credit of Road & Bridge Special Fund

on September 30, 1951, a balance o f_______________________________  228.91

Amount balance to credit of the Lateral Road Fund as per last report______ None
Amount received’ since last report____________________________ ________ ___ 44 444 44

Total “Cr.” as shown jby current reports_____________ — — I I —  14’411.44
Amount paid out and disbursed since last report_________________________ ~ 242o'33
Leaving and showing to credit o f Lateral Road Fund

on September 30, 1951, a balance of_________________________  _ 1199111

And that said amounts were received and paid out of each of the respective funds since 
the filing of the preceding Quarterly Report of said County Treasurer, and during the 
period above stated, and that the said separate amounts as therein shown are correct IT 
S’ THEREFORE, FURTHER ORDERED by the Court, that the said detailed report be, 

and the same is hereby, in all things approved, and the Clerk of this Court is hereby 
ordered to enter the said report, together with this order, upon the Minutes of the Com­
missioners Court of Schleicher County, Texas, and that the proper credits be made in 
the accounts of the County Treasurer in accordance with this order.

Witness our hand’s this 8th day of October, A. D. 1951.

E. W. CRAIG, County Judge 
A. J. HALBERT, Commissioner Precinct No. 1

L. G. EDMISTON, Commissioner Precinct No. 2

CARROL WHITE, Commissioner Precinct No. 3

H. A. BELK, Commissioner Precinct No. 4

Be Imaginative 
With Salads

COLLEGE STATION — Home­
makers wbo have an urge to try 
out their creative ability can do 
it right in their own kitchen. Fran­
ces Reasonover, foods and nutri­
tion specialist with the Texas Ag­
ricultural Extension Service, .says 
to “ jusit let t'he artist in you go to 
work”  when it’s, time to make a 
salad.

The first rule in making an at­
tractive salad, the specialist says, 
is to keep it simple. Second, fit it 
to the rest of the meal. Foods used 
in the rest of the menu should 
not be used in a salad. Colors and 
flavors should be in harmony and 
the salad as a whole should pro­
vide foods that are needed in the 
meal.

A 'third rule iis to keep the foods 
for cold salads cold, and those for 
hot salads, hot. Fourth, select a 
dressing that, suits the salad. Fifth, 
make the saald attractive. Miss 
Reasonover points out that the food 
used should be cut into pieces 
large enough that the food can be 
identified and small enough to 
handle with ease.

Other things to remember in­
clude keeping fruits fresh and 
bright in coolr and see that all 
foods used in a salad are well 
drained. Fix salad at the last pos­
sible moment, the specialist ad­
vises, and toss lightly. Do not over­
mix. Select the serving dish for the 
salad ’with ease. It should be large 
enough and of the right shape to 
“set off” tlTe salad, Miss Reason- 
over adds.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Bailey Mont­
gomery of San Antonio spent the 
weekend here with Mr. ana Mrs. 
J. B. Montgomery.

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Nunley and 
children spent the weekend in Ben­
jamin with relatives

San Angelo Office 
Handling Social 
Security Cards

Are you one of the millions of 
self-employed people newly covered 
under the Federal old-age and sur­
vivors insurance? If you are, you 
need a social security account- 
number card, according to George 
D. Clark, manager of the San An­
gelo social security office.

“ Self-employed people who were 
brought under the Social Security 
Act by last year’s changes in the 
law will report their net income 
from self-employment at the same 
time they make their Federal in­
come tax returns early each year,” 
Mr. Clark said.

Mr. Clark indicated that al­
though 'the numbers will not ac­
tually be needed until early next 
year, self-employed businessmen 
should apply for them in the near 
future. This will help avoid any 
delay when the numbers are need­
ed.

“ If you have ever had a social 
security number, that same number 
should be used,”  Clark said. “ If 
you’ve lost your card, we can get a 
copy of it for you bearing that 
same number.”

Both new and duplicate cards 
can 'be obtained through the San 
Angelo social security office. The 
address i»  307 Federal building, 
San Angelo. Mr. Clark asks ad 
self-employed people who have any 
questions about their coverage un­
der social security to get in touch 
with this office.

Mrs. Joab Campbell was dismiss­
ed this week from Holcomb Clinic.

Bill Sproul, proprietor of a Red 
and White store in Menard, was 'a 
visitor in Eldorado Tuesday.

Burgoyne 
Christmas Cards

Not a large stock 
but pretty cards.

Also boxes of nice assorted 
cards. Good quality all.

Eldorado Success

Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Joiner and 
Mrs. Perry Mittel and Gail spent 
Friday, Saturday and Sunday out 
of town. They spent the nights at 
San Saba, with L. L. Joiner, then 
the six went to San Antonio to 
visit L. L.’s don, and do some sight­
seeing in the city.

It Pleases Us 
To Please You!

Hank’s Gulf Station
Phone 93491 E. ,W. (Hank) Mund
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A  quick glance into the tele­
phone directory before call­

ing, often saves you a second 
call. For, when you leave 

numbers to your memory, it’s 
easy to make a mistake. Result: 

wasted time; wasted effort; wrong 
number. So unless you’re abso­

lutely sure of the number you’re 
calling, just check it for your­

self in the telephone direc­
tory. You’ll be helping your­

self to better telephone 
service as well.

The San Angelo 
TELEPHONE COMPANY

Select from our huge stocks of

Carpeting
Mr. A. C. Bourland of the carpeting department off
Sears in San Angelo will be in Eldorado Thursday 

6 to show in your home samples o f wool, cotton, and 
blended carpeting. Phone or write for an appoint­
ment.

Satisfaction Guaranteed 
Or Your Money Back S EA R S 113 W. Beauregard 

Ph. 7141, San Angelo

TRY OUR—

CREDIT P LA N
PAY WEEKLY OR MONTHLY WHILE YOU WEAR

•  Total Purchases Must Be Over $20.00.
•  Pay a Minimum of 10% Down When Purchased
•  A  Small Carrying Charge will be added on Balance.
•  Add On Privileges for Purchases of $10.00 or More.
•  Anyone with good paying habit can buy on this plan

30-DAY CHARGE ACCOUNT IF YOU LIKE

The RATLIFF STORE
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| News From 
Our Neighbors |

V------------------------------------------------ /
Businesses Sell

T. H. Ray, local merchant, an­
nounces the purchase of Cope’s 
Ready-toWear from Mrs. Earl 
Cope, the sale having become ef­
fective October 1. The business will 

e known as the Fashion Shop, and 
charge will be Mrs. Ben Feath- 

erston, an employee for the past 
three years in the Ray Dry Goods, 
and Mrs. Jack Rowe.

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond Summers 
became the owners of the Red & 
White Grocery this week, having 
purchased the sltore from Mr. and 
Mirs. J. J. Schiable. The new own­
ers will assume management of 
the business Monday of next week. 
—Big Lake Wildcat.

Antelope Hunting
Perfect weather, a little warm 

for the time of the year, greeted 
the 187 antelope hunters who were 
in the Alpine area Monday, Tues­
day and Wednesday and, judging 
by first reports, the hunt was high­
ly successful.

A  total of 143 antelopes were 
checked in the opening day, it was 
stated, in Brewster and Jeff Davis 
counties. The final count at the 
end of the three-day period was 
noit available at press time yester­
day.— Alpine Avalanche.

Hospital To Close
According to a statement made 

by Dr. Barney Grafa, on Tuesday,

the hospital unit of the Grafa 
Clinic and Hospital will be closed 
on Monday, October 15, due to 
the heavy expense of hospital 
maintenance, which has not been 
self-supporting for several months.

This is the only hospital in the 
county, and the area will suffer 
a great loss with its closing.—The 
Eden Echo.

3 Staff Members Quit at Hospital; 
Showdown Nears

Resignations of three important 
members of the Coke County Mem­
orial Hospital staff were accepted 
at a meeting of the Hospital trus­
tees here Tuesday. . . . There is 
strong talk that the people may 
employ an attorney to fepresent 
them next Monday, and make a 
forceful demand for a change in 
the hospital setup.— Robert Lee 
Observer.

Flowing Again
Two pumps being operated in 

Rooney Park were cut off Monday 
nigh/t by Pecos County Water Con­
trol and Improvement District No. 
1, and Comanche Chief and other 
springs in the park area soon re­
sumed flow in a volume nearly 
equal to the flow when pumps .were 
running. Mayor Walter Buenger’s 
recent prophecy that the Springs 
would flow again this fall appar­
ently has come to pass— Ft. Stock- 
ton Pioneer.
Buys Hospital

Announcement was made this 
week o f the sale of the Karen- 
Gayl hospital by J. M. (Mac)'Rip-

Dr. Donald Cumungham
i O P T O M E T R I S T  *

lye* Examined Classes Fitted

Next Door To Leddy's Boot Shop
Dial 6452 San Angelo, Texas22 S. Chadbourne

Advertisement
UtrS-.

From where I sit .. .l y  J oe  M arsh

Our Bank Says 
'Help Yourself"

People around here need lots of 
small change these days — what 
with candy, gum, cigarette and soft 
drink machines . . . pay phones . . . 
and those penny sales taxes.

Used to put a strain on our 
^ h ank . Changing money took up a 
\^P>t of time. Then the Chief Teller 

Happy Wilson, read about another 
bank using a “help yourself” 
change system. The directors de­
cided to see if it would work here.

They set out some big shallow 
bowls full of nickels, dimes and 
pennies with a sign saying “ m a k e  
y o u r  o w n  c h a n g e .”  Works fine,

too. At the end of the day the 
totals are never more than a 
couple of cents under—or over— 
the right amount.

From where I sit, folks every­
where are pretty much alike, al­
though they may seem different. 
Farmers and city folks, Republi­
cans and Democrats, those who en­
joy a glass of beer occasionally and 
those who prefer something else— 
we all usually try to live up to the 
trust others have in us.

Qoe
Copyright, 1951, United States Brewers Foundation

HOUSTON-CLARY MUSIC STORE
“ Business Built On Confidence”

Exclusive dealers for the following 
pianos: Steinway —  Wurlitzer —  
Krakauer— Everett—  Cable-Nelson 
— Chickering— Haddorff.

Musical Merchandise Complete Sheet Music Service
Telephone 5456 13 E. Twohig Ave., San Angelo, Texas

New Shipment Pot Plants
Begonias
Ferns

Paladium Chenille 
Christmas Cherries 

Mums
Lots of nice Devil’s Ivy and English 

Ivy, plain and variegated. Also 
cactus and succlents.

ELDORADO FLOWER SHOP
Mrs. 0. L. Woodward

DOC’S PLACE
Groceries Market

DOVE HUNTERS AMMUNITION
Standard Petroleum Products

Plenty of Trailer Spaces Available 
Apartments

Open from 7:00 till 9:00 Every Day 
Mr. and Mrs. Cramer Sofge, Owners 

Highway 151 Phone 21111

petoe to Dr. John R. Harris. It is 
expected that the deal will be 
closed in the next few days. The 
price paid for the hospital was not 
disclosed. Dr. Harris has had the 
hospital leased for some time. — 
Bronte Enterprise.

Veteran Physician Dies
Dr. W. B. Everitt, 84, long-time 

resident of Sterling County, died 
in the Sterling County Hospital on 
last Saturday night at 10:30.

Funeral services were held here 
Monday afternoon at 3:00 from the 
First Baptist Church. Burial fol­
lowed in the local cemetery.—The 
Sterling City Record.

Resigns From Hospital
I

At a. called meeting of the direc­
tors of the Lillian M. Hudspeth 
Memorial Hospital Monday, Wil­
liam Burge, administrator, an­
nounced that he was resigning 
effective October 15.

Burge said he has 'been appoint­
ed administrator of the Memorial 
Hospital of Union County, Marys­
ville, Ohio, a 50-bed hospital 
scheduled to open January 1, 1952.

Burge is to report there Nov. 1. 
— Devils River News.

REA Grant Ok’ed
The Rio Grande Electric Cooper­

ative, ‘ Inc., with headquarters in 
Bracke'tville, Texas, has final ap­
proval for funds to construct the 
rural distribution lines in parts 
of Crockett, Terrell, Pecos and 
Brewster counties. The lines to be 
constructed will served those peo- 
pole in these counties who have 
signed the required five year mini­
mum guarantee applications.—The 
Ozona Stockman.

Road Work___
Announcement was made • this 

week by members of the Upton 
County Commissioners Court that 
a public hearing would be held in 
the District Courtroom at the 
courthouse in Rankin on Monday, 
October 15 relative to the routes 
of the proposed road work antici­
pated in the county. —  McCamey 
News.

Cracking Down
•City officials have announced 

that the ordinance governing con­
nections to the water or sewer 
systems will be strictly enforced 
hereafter. This decision was beach­
ed when it 'was found that connec­
tions were being made to both 
systems without permits being se­
cured or without inspection.—The 
Mason County News.

Demonstration Agent
Miss Dorothy Harbin, of Guy- 

man, Okla., will assume duties as 
Home Demonstration agent of 
Garza County on Monday, October 
15, it has been announced by Co. 
Judge H. M. Snowden.

Miss Harbin replaces Mrs. Jew­
ell Strasner, who resigned to da 
graduate work at Baylor Univer­
sity.— Post Dispatch.

On the Job at Brady
Supt. C. A. Reynolds was the 

guest speaker as the North Ward 
Parent-Teacher Association met on 
Tuesday afternoon. Principal I. V. 
Pearson led the opening prayer 
and Mrs. T. H. Marsden, president, 
directed the business.— The Brady 
Standard.

To Provide Bounty
In a regular meeting of the 

Board of the Kimble County Wild­
life Federation last Friday after­
noon, in the County Court room, it 
was voted to assess all members 
of the organization one per cent 
per acre on land owned or con­
trolled in order to promote a 
bounty fund for the control of pre­
datory animals.— Junction Eagle.

Diamond Jubilee
The Community Chamber of 

Commerce will co-sponso<r the 
Diamond Jubilee celebration of 
Coleman County with the Coleman 
Board of Community Development. 
The Diamond Jubilee celebration 
will be held in the Coleman Park 
on Saturday, October 27, beginning 
at 2:00 p. m.— Santa Anna News.

Mr. and Mrs. J. E. Estes and 
the S. L. Stanford family bad as 
week-end guests Mrs. Dan Gay 
and 'daughter Dean, and Mrs. Jno. 
Gay and two children Johnny Lynn 
and Becky, all of Ruston, La. 
There was a get-together dinner 
on Sunday which also included the 
Clyde Estes family, recently re­
turned from Arkansas, the J. I. 
Padgett family of Lometa and the 
Odes Harris family of Eldorado.

TO ATTEND PTA MEET
Several from Eldorado will prob­

ably be in attendance when the 
Five-County Council of P-T groups 
meets Saturday in San Angelo.

AT PRESBYTERIAN MEETINGS 
Rev. and Mrs. Charles Bruce are 

attending the Presbyterian State 
Synod meetings from October 9 
through October 11. Mr. and Mrs. 
Edwin Jackson joined them Wed­

nesday, Mrs. Jackson representing 
the Eldorado church at Synodical, 
and Mr. Jackson the men at Synod, 
substituting for Leslie Baker, of­
ficial delegate from the men of the 
church

Hera's why Fordomatic 
puts them all in the past!
For the past year, autom otive writers, engineers and ow ners have been  

rav ing about a  new  kind of automatic driving  

and here’s w h y  you ge t it 

on ly  in Ford Cars:

All the power you need when you need it!

SomeautynaficshaveM
The automatic drive some cars offer you is a 
torque converter which multiplies torque with­
out the use of gears. Its advantage is a smooth 
flow of power. Its disadvantage is a smaller 
range of torque multiplication which requires 
more power from the engine and an uneco­
nomical axle ratio which increases costs.

&>mv automate AneiHs
Other cars offer an automatic drive that uses 
automatic gears (as illustrated in simplified 
form at right) instead of a torque converter. 
The advantage here is more "go,” more con­
trol and greater economy. The disadvantage 
is that this system is not as smooth, nor as 
jerk-free as a torque converter.

See our selection of |

USED CARS

It gives you instant "G O ”! 

It practically drives itself!

B uffonkm a te

haibotkYes, Fordomatic has a 
torque converter plus automatic 
gears. It brings you only the 
advantages of both drives.

Unlike cars with only a torque 
converter (which start and cruise 
all in one drive gear), Fordo­
matic starts fast and smooth in 
Intermediate Gear then shifts 
itself into Drive Gear.

Fordomatic Drive optional on V -8 models at extra cost. Equip­
ment, accessories and trim subject to change without notice. F.C.A.

CHARLIE TRIGG MOTORS
ELDORADO, TEXAS

tvasher does any 
kind of wash
automatically

p fS t is

s o i l W ^ J

\\\ I

O n ly  Frig ida ire  has L ive-W ater Action!

Live-Water Action provides surging, penetrating currents of 
hot, sudsy water that gets clothes really clean — gently! Clothes 
are in water all the time — not half in, half out. Live-Water 
Action also rinses twice, each time in clean, fresh water.

N e w  Sty ling  a n d  Convenience!

See how beautifully this new washer fits into kitchens— as 
well as utility rooms and laundries. Fits close to the wall. . .  
new high back-panel puts all controls in easy, safe reach.

Extra-H igh -Speed  Drying!

Frigidaire^ Rapidry-Spin gets clothes far drier than most 
Many clothes are re; 
to lift and carry.

other washers. Many clothes are ready to iron at once. All are 
lighter, easier

Porcelain Finish Inside an d  Out!

Exclusive with Frigidaire! Beautiful lifetime porcelain-on-steel 
finish protects against rust, soap or bleaches. Cleans as quickly, 
easily as a china plate!

E x c lu s iv e  F r ig id a ir e  S e le c t -O -D e a l!

Just pre-select the proper washing time on the Select- 
O-Dial — set it once and the Frigidaire Washer does 
all the rest. It even cleans itself and shuts off auto­
matically.

Yes M a 'a m  -

W e  c a n  d e l iv e r  y o u r  
n ew  Fr ig ida ire  Washer  
im m ed ia te ly  - I '// b e  '  

g lad  to take  o v e r  
y o u r  w ashday  
c h o re s .

R. K.

W estlexas Utilities 
> Com pany

_



VELVEETA 
CHEESE FOOD

2 LB. BOX

89c
MONARCH

COFFEE
Limited
POUND

75c

Prices Good Friday 
Oct. 12 Through 

Thursday, Oct. 18

Parker
Foods

Eldorado Success, October 11, 1951

FOLGER’S COFFEE POUND

CAN 157
Armours Star Slab By the piece—Lb. «r Fresh Pound

BACON 49c BRAINS 29c
Home made — Pure Pork ' Pound v  Choice Baby Beef Loin Pound

Sausage 49c i STEAKS 98c
Sliced Large Pound ■ Semi-Boneless—Pork Pound

Bologna 39c f ROAST 59c

SUGAR IMPERIAL
CANE

Limited

Small
Box__

Real American Breakfast

Aunt Jemima Pancakes
4  7 1*  S  Large S  Buckwheat A | [ f
JL #  t  M Box____ j J L  t  Jr LgeBox— y Q v

Delicious (Bushels) Pound

Apples - 9c
Fresh Garden Pound /  Yellow Baby Pound

Log Cabin Syrup 12 oz. 25c 24 oz. 49c I OKRA 19c Squash 15c

STAR-LAC 

Pkg. 39c

S M A

BABY FORMULA 

Can 26c

Country Gentleman 
CORN

R & W —No. 2 Can 
20c

FRESH
MUSTARD

GREENS
Bunch

7y2C

TOKAY POUND

Grapes 7ic

RED & WHITE 

CATSUP

14 Oz. Bottle

RED & WHITE 
PEAR HALVES 

BARTLETT

No. 2\ Can

LIBBYS 
FRUIT 

COCKTAIL 
No. 2| Can

SUN SPUN'  

PORK & BEANS 

No. 303 Can

LIBBYS
TOMATO

JUICE

No. 303 Can

ALL BRANDS 
POPULAR 

CIGARETTES

CARTON ^

25c 43c 43c 10c 10c $1.87
1 — — — — — —  M ' ■ ■■■ 1 1 ■ ■■■ ^  ■■ ■ •■ 1 1 — — —  - -  ■ ■-  ■ 1 ■— *  ■ — ■ 11 1 ■ ■ ■  1 .......... -  ................................... ■■■ ■ -■ ■■ — ■ -  1

Limit One 3 Lb. Can M Margarine Pound

CRISCO 79! SUN-SPUN 27‘


